CHAPTER 61G6-9

CONTINUING EDUCATION

61G6-9.001
Continuing Education for Reactivation

61G6-9.002
Criteria for Continuing Education for Reactivation of License

61G6-9.003
Definitions

61G6-9.004
Continuing Education Requirements for Renewal for Certificateholders and Registrants

61G6-9.005
Registration of Course Providers

61G6-9.006
Approval of Continuing Education Courses

61G6-9.007
Qualifications of Course Instructors

61G6-9.008
Course Syllabus (Repealed)
61G6-9.009
Required Records Maintained by Course Providers

61G6-9.0105
Proof of Completion by Certification Holders and Registrants (Repealed)
61G6-9.012
Advertising of Continuing Education Courses (Repealed)
61G6-9.013
Continuing Education Courses Required by Disciplinary Action (Repealed)
61G6-9.014
Fees

61G6-9.015
Continuing Education Exemption for Spouses of Military Personnel

61G6-9.001 Continuing Education for Reactivation.

As a condition to the reactivation of an inactive license, a licensee must submit proof of continuing education which meets the criteria set forth in Rule 61G6-9.002 or 61G6-9.004, F.A.C. 
(1) Certified and Registered Electrical Contractors must complete continuing education in the following areas: seven (7) hours technical to include: one (1) hour of an approved provider’s specialized or advanced module course, approved by the Florida Building Commission, on any portion of the Florida Building Code, relating to the contractor’s respective discipline; one (1) hour workers’ compensation, one (1) hour workplace safety, one (1) hour business practices, and one (1) hour of Florida laws and rules education. For certified electrical contractors engaged in alarm system contracting, two (2) hours on false alarm prevention which is designated as technical education. The continuing education credits needed for reactivation must be completed within two (2) years preceding reactivation.
(2) Certified and Registered Alarm and Specialty Contractors must complete continuing education in the following areas: seven (7) hours technical to include: one (1) hour of an approved provider’s specialized or advanced module course, approved by the Florida Building Commission, on any portion of the Florida Building Code, relating to the contractor’s respective discipline; one (1) hour workers’ compensation, one (1) hour workplace safety, one (1) hour business practices, one (1) hour of Florida laws and rules education and two (2) hours on false alarm prevention. The continuing education credits needed for reactivation must be completed within two (2) years preceding reactivation.
Rulemaking Authority 489.507(3), 489.519(3) FS. Law Implemented 489.519 FS. History–New 1-2-80, Amended 10-13-80, Formerly 21GG-9.01, Amended 2-20-89, Formerly 21GG-9.001, Amended 12-24-97, 12-27-00, 10-1-03, 4-10-05, 11-21-12, 2-5-15, 9-22-21.
61G6-9.002 Criteria for Continuing Education for Reactivation of License.

The following programs of continuing education may be used to satisfy the continuing education requirement provided that the licensee complies with the terms set forth herein:

(1) Courses for credit which are business, technical or safety courses, including alternative non-classroom courses relevant to the electrical contracting industry and which require a passing grade taken at an accredited college, university, or community college. The licensee must furnish an official transcript documenting the classroom hours attended and the receipt of a passing grade.

(2) Noncredited courses conducted by an accredited institution of higher learning, official governmental agency, the military, recognized national or state trade or civil organization, or Board approved alternative, non-classroom courses, provided the following conditions are met:

(a) The course must be business, technical or safety course relevant to the electrical contracting industry. For purpose of this rule the following lists are provided as guides for provider applicants in properly categorizing individual courses. Courses in the identified categories include, but are not limited to those listed.

1. Business courses include: (A) Bidding a Job, (B) Maintaining Cash Flow, (C) Interpretation of Contracts and Agreements Purchasing Control, (D) Contract Scheduling, (E) Obtaining Insurance and Bonding, (F) Complying with Contracting Laws and Rules, including Chapters 455 and 489, Part II, F.S. and rule Division 61G6, F.A.C., (G) Personnel Management, (H) Complying with Payroll and Sales Tax Laws, (I) Interpretation of Financial Statements and Reports, and (J) Management Accounting.

2. Technical courses include: (A) General Theory and Electrical Principles, (B) Plan and Specification Reading and Interpretation, (C) Wiring and Protection, (D) Wiring Methods and Materials, (E) Special Occupancies and Situations, (F) Life Safety and Americans with Disabilities Act, (G) Electrical Signs, Outline Lighting, and Structural Considerations, (H) Alarms/ Limited Energy, (I) Estimating, (J) False Alarm Prevention, and (K) Advanced Building Code modules.

3. Safety courses include: OSHA Safety, Procedure for Testing and Use of Tools and Equipment.

(b) The course must follow a written text, which must be submitted to the Board for approval on request.

(c) The instructor of the course must be a professional educator, certified electrical contractor or a similar authority in the field.

The licensee must submit a statement documenting the following:

1. Number of classroom hours attended.

2. Provider of the course.

3. Location of the course.

4. Date of the course.

5. Name of the instructor and his credentials.

6. Benefit received from the course.

(3) An instructor of any of the courses described in subsections (1) and (2) of this rule, may credit his classroom hours of the course toward completion of his continuing education requirement.

Rulemaking Authority 489.507(3), 489.517(3), 489.519(3) FS. Law Implemented 455.271(10), 489.517, 489.519(3) FS. History–New 1-2-80, Formerly 21GG-9.02, 21GG-9.002, Amended 12-27-00, 4-17-01, 4-30-19, 10-28-20.
61G6-9.003 Definitions.

When used in this rule, the following terms shall have the following meanings:

(1) “Board” means the Electrical Contractors’ Licensing Board.

(2) “Course” means any course, seminar or other program of instruction which has been approved by the Board for the purpose of complying with the continuing education requirements for electrical and alarm contractors.

(3) “Classroom Hour” means fifty minutes of instruction, exclusive of breaks, recesses, or other time not spent in instruction.

(4) “Course Provider” means the person or legal entity who is registered pursuant to this rule chapter and who is responsible for conducting a course approved pursuant to this rule chapter, maintaining records of those in attendance for four years. The course provider is responsible for maintaining records.

(5) “Person” means any natural person and does not include any corporation, partnership or other type of legal entity.

(6) “Homestudy Course” means a continuing education course approved pursuant to this rule chapter, that is offered as a correspondence course and requires a multiple-choice test at the end of the session with a minimum passing score of 75%.

(7) “Interactive Distance Education Course” means a competency based learning course presented through live, synchronous technology or through pre-recorded video coupled with a means for course attendees to ask questions of the instructor(s) and receive responses in a timely manner. Sucj courses may be presented through video conferencing technologies or interactive computer based applications. Courses shall provide for registration, evaluation, monitoring, and verification of continuing education, as well as require a multiple-choice test at the end of the session with a minimum passing score of 75%.

(8) “Interactive Distance Education Hour” means fifty minutes of approved instruction presented in an interactive distance education setting, exclusive of any breaks, recesses, or other time not spent in instruction.

Rulemaking Authority 455.2123, 489.507(3), 489.517(3) FS. Law Implemented 455.2123, 489.517(3) FS. History–New 11-30-94, Amended 1-3-96, 6-13-96, 1-4-01, 2-10-03, 8-10-05, 10-28-20.
61G6-9.004 Continuing Education Requirements for Renewal for Certificateholders and Registrants.

(1) Each person who is certified or registered by the Board must, as a condition of each renewal of the certificate or registration, provide proof of completion of continuing education in one or more courses approved by the Board.

(a) As part of the required eleven (11) hours of continuing education, Certified and Registered Electrical Contractors must complete one (1) hour business practices; one (1) hour workers’ compensation; one (1) hour work place safety; one (1) hour Florida laws and rules; and seven (7) hours on technical subjects which includes one (1) hour of an approved provider’s specialized or advanced module course, approved by the Florida Building Commission, on any portion of the Florida Building Code, relating to the contractor’s respective discipline practices. 
(b) In addition to the continuing education hours required by paragraph 61G6-9.004(1)(a), Certified and Registered electrical contractors engaged in alarm system contracting must also complete two (2) hours on false alarm prevention. 
(c) As part of the required seven (7) hours of continuing education, Certified and Registered Alarm and Specialty Contractors must complete one (1) hour business practices; one (1) hour workers’ compensation; one (1) hour work place safety; one (1) hour Florida laws and rules; two (2) hours on false alarm prevention; and one (1) hour of an approved provider’s specialized or advanced module course, approved by the Florida Building Commission, on any portion of the Florida Building Code, relating to the contractor’s respective discipline practices.
(2) A person who holds more than one certificate or registration issued by the Board is required to complete the continuing education requirements only once during each biennial period. Proof of completion by any such person must be submitted with each renewal application.

(3) A person certified or registered by the Board who is also certified under Chapter 468, Part XII, F.S., as a building official, inspector, or plans examiner shall be required to complete the continuing education requirements only once during each biennial period.

(4) For his or her initial license renewal, a Certified or Registered Electrical Contractor licensed 12 or more months prior to the end of the first biennial period is required to complete 5 hours of continuing education as a condition of renewal. The 5 hours of continuing education must include the following areas: 1 hour business, 1 hour worker’s compensation, 1 hour work place safety, and 1 hour laws and rules. For alarm system contractors and electrical contractors actively engaged in alarm contracting, the remaining 1 hour shall be in false alarm prevention.
(5) For his or her initial license renewal, a Certified or Registered Alarm Contractor licensed 12 or more months prior to the end of the first biennial period is required to complete 4 hours of continuing education as a condition of renewal. The 4 hours of continuing education must be in the following areas: 1 hour worker’s compensation, 1 hour work place safety, 1 hour laws and rules and 1 hour false alarm prevention.

(6) For his or her initial license renewal, a Certified or Registered Specialty Contractor licensed 12 or more months prior to the end of a biennial period is required to complete 4 hours of continuing education as a condition of renewal. The 4 hours of continuing education must be in the following areas: 1 hour business; 1 hour worker’s compensation; 1 hour work place safety; and 1 hour laws and rules.

(7) For his or her initial license, a person licensed for less than 12 months prior to the end of the first biennial period need not complete any continuing education as a condition of renewal.
(8) A licensee may obtain a maximum of four (4) hours of continuing education credits by taking a home study course. A minimum passing score of 75% must be obtained to receive the required CE credits.

(9)(a) One of the required technical classroom hours of continuing education must be obtained by completing an approved provider’s specialized or advanced module course, approved by the Florida Building Commission, on any portion of the Florida Building Code, relating to the contractor’s respective discipline.

(b) One of the required classroom hours of continuing education shall be in the area of the laws and rules related to electrical and alarm contracting in the State of Florida. For the purposes of this rule, the laws and rules governing the practice of electrical and alarm contracting are Chapters 455 and 489, Part II, F.S., and rule Division 61G6, F.A.C.
(10) During any biennial period, a licensee may obtain credit for taking a particular approved continuing education course only once.

Rulemaking Authority 455.2124, 489.507(3), 489.517(6) FS. Law Implemented 455.2124, 489.517(3), (6) FS. History–New 11-30-94, Amended 4-22-01, 8-15-04, 1-30-05, 8-10-05, 8-15-06, 3-27-13, 2-5-15, 4-30-19, 9-22-21.
61G6-9.005 Registration of Course Providers.

(1)(a) Each course provider must register with the Board prior to submitting any continuing education courses to be conducted by a course provider to the Board for approval.

(b) A university or college which is regionally accredited by an accrediting agency recognized by the United States Department of Education (USDOE); and which university or college offers courses in the contracting areas specified in Part II, Chapter 489, F.S., and pursuant to rule Chapter 61G6-9, F.A.C., will be approved as a course provider upon submitting an application to the Board.

(2) The application for registration must be submitted on the ECLB Continuing Education Provider Approval Application, form number, DBPR ECLB 11, 07/10/2012, with instructions, which is incorporated by reference in subsection 61-35.012(11), F.A.C., copies of which are provided by the Board upon request and must include the name, address, phone number and facsimile number of the course provider. The registration must also include the name and address of each person or entity who has an ownership interest in the course sponsor or who is entitled to receive any portion of the revenues from the course provider. A course provider making an application to offer interactive distance education must submit evidence of the following:

(a) That the course contains a high level of interactivity which promotes student involvement, and demonstrates that the program measures learning and assesses mastery of content at regular intervals.

(b) That the course provider will be able to monitor student enrollment, participation, and course completion.

(c) That the course provider can demonstrate that stated course hours are consistent with the actual hours it takes to complete the course.

(d) That the course provider has qualified instructor(s) available to answer questions and provide the students with the necessary assistance during the duration of the course.

(e) That the student shall be required to complete and submit a statement at the end of the course that he/she has personally completed each module of instruction.

(3) The course provider registration is valid for four (4) years and expires on May 31st of every other odd numbered year.

(4) The course provider must submit to the Board, in writing, notice of any changes in the information provided in the initial application for registration of the course sponsor. The notification must be made within 30 days following the date the change is effective.

(5) The Board shall maintain a list of all course providers registered with the Board.

(6) The Board shall deny registration of, suspend, or revoke the registration of any course provider if any of the following acts or omissions occur:

(a) Obtaining or attempting to obtain registration or course approval through fraud, deceit, false statements, or misrepresentation of material facts, whether such statements or misrepresentations are made knowingly or negligently.

(b) Failing to provide complete and accurate information in the initial application for registration or in any notification of change in information.

(c) Failing to notify the Board of a change in the information required in subsection (4) for registration of course providers.

(d) Falsifying of any records regarding the continuing education courses conducted by the course provider or the persons who attended the courses.

(e) Failing to maintain any required records regarding the continuing education courses conducted by the course provider or the persons who attended the courses, including the failure to report the names and license numbers of all persons who attended any approved courses.

(f) Failing to train the staff responsible for taking attendance at any approved course or completing the attendance forms.

(g) Failing to provide the Board with copies of any document or other information required to be maintained by the course provider pursuant to this rule.

(h) Advertising that a course has been approved by the Board prior to the date the approval is granted.

(i) Participating in any activity designed or intended to circumvent or evade the requirements of Section 489.517, F.S., or the rules adopted by the Board to implement that section.

(j) Failing to identify the number of approved continuing education hours in any course brochures, advertisements, or course completion certificates.

(k) Failure to provide the attendee list to the Department in an electronic format or otherwise violate provisions in Section 455.2178(1), F.S.

(7) In the event of suspension or revocation of a course provider’s registration, the Board shall require the course provider to cancel the scheduled courses and refund all fees collected by the course provider in connection with any scheduled course.

(8) The Board shall deny approval of, suspend, or revoke the registration of any course provider if any person or entity required to be disclosed in the registration was also disclosed (or was required to be disclosed) in the registration of any course provider who has been suspended or revoked by the Board.

(9) The provider must comply with the requirements stated in Section 455.2178, F.S., as a condition of approval as a course provider.

(10) The course provider shall not offer any continuing education courses if the provider status is in a delinquent or expired status.

Rulemaking Authority 455.2178, 455.2179, 455.227, 489.507(3) FS. Law Implemented 455.2178, 455.2179, 489.533 FS. History–New 11-30-94, Amended 6-13-96, 10-20-96, 12-25-96, 3-24-99, 11-2-00, 9-4-01, 2-10-03, 10-1-03, 6-6-19, 8-5-19.
61G6-9.006 Approval of Continuing Education Courses.

(1)(a) Any registered course provider may submit an application, on a form provided by the Department, for approval of a continuing education course. Copies of which may be obtained from the Board office.

(b) Those courses offered by a university or college which is regionally accredited by an accrediting agency recognized by the United States Department of Education (USDOE); and which university or college offers courses in the contracting areas specified in Chapter 489, Part II, F.S., and pursuant to rule Chapter 61G6-9, F.A.C., shall be approved upon receipt of a completed course application and the Board shall not charge a fee for such approval.

(2) Upon receipt of a course application and the appropriate fee, the Board shall approve any, seminar or conference in the electrical or alarm system contracting area provided by any university, community college, vocational-technical center, public or private school, firm, association, organization, person, corporation, or entity which meets the criteria provided in this rule.

(3) Any course approved for the continuing education requirements for persons certified under Chapter 468, Part XII, F.S., shall be accepted for continuing education for renewal under this rule, for persons who are certified under Part XII and who are certified or registered under this part.

(4) The application shall include the total number of classroom hours, the course syllabus, a detailed outline of the contents of the course, including the amount of time planned for each topic, the name and qualifications of all instructors known at the time of the application and the minimum qualifications of any instructors not known at the time of application.

(5) The Board shall approve continuing education courses which appropriately relate to the general business skills or the technical skills required of certificateholders or registrants, and which is taught by qualified instructors.

(6) A continuing education course which addresses specific technical materials or trade knowledge shall be approved if applicable to a specific category or categories of contractor as defined in Section 489.505, F.S.

(7) Continuing education course approval is valid until May 31st of odd numbered years, provided no substantial change is made in the course. 

(8) The Board shall approve or deny any application for a continuing education course at the next regularly scheduled Board meeting, provided the application is filed with the agency within forty five (45) days of that meeting. If the application is denied, the Board shall identify the specific reasons for the denial in writing.

(9) A course which has been denied may be resubmitted to the Board with modifications.

(10) The Board shall not deny nor withdraw approval for any course on the basis that another course provider is conducting the same or similar course approved by the Board.

(11) A licensee may earn one (1) laws and rules hour credit and one (1) business hour credit by attending a meeting of the Board wherein disciplinary cases are considered. Licensees must attend the meeting for at least two (2) hours and be present for the complete disciplinary case agenda to receive the continuing education hours. The licensee must check in with the Board staff prior to the beginning of disciplinary proceedings. A licensee may receive continuing education credit for attending the Board meeting only if he or she is attending on that date solely for continuing education credit; he or she may not receive continuing education credit if appearing at the Board meeting for any other purpose, including as a party to a disciplinary action.

(12) The Board shall grant a maximum of seven (7) continuing education credits to any licensee who participates in examination development with the approval of the Board upon submission of documentation of such participation by the Department or a testing provider under contract with the Department. The licensee shall use such credits for the current renewal cycle and provide documentation of participation at least ninety days prior to the end of the renewal cycle.

(13) Providers shall use the following prefixes to designate the number of approved hours in each of the four statutorily mandated categories: “T” for technical subjects, “C” for workers’ compensation, “S” for workplace safety, and “B” for business practices.

(14) The Board shall grant a maximum of four (4) continuing education credits to any licensee who participates as a member of any technical advisory committee to the Florida Building Code Commission. The licensee shall use such credits for the current renewal cycle and provide documentation of participation at least ninety days prior to the end of the renewal cycle.
(15) Board members may receive three (3) hours of continuing education credit per biennium for participation at Board meetings.

Rulemaking Authority 489.507(3), 489.517(3) FS. Law Implemented 489.517(3) FS. History–New 11-30-94, Amended 6-13-96, 10-20-96, 12-25-96, 10-6-97, 3-24-99, 5-6-99, 11-2-00, 9-4-01, 10-17-05, 7-17-11, 4-30-19, 4-29-21, 12-5-21.
61G6-9.007 Qualifications of Course Instructors.

(1) All course instructors shall be qualified, by education or experience, to teach the course, or parts of a course, to which the instructor is assigned.

(2) Any person with a four year college degree or graduate degree is qualified to teach any course in their field of study.

(3) Any certified or registered contractor with at least five years experience may teach any technical course regarding contracting within the scope of the contractor’s license.

(4) A course provider may request approval by the Board regarding the qualifications of a particular instructor for a particular course.

(5) A qualified course instructor may count the assigned credit hours of a course taught toward the required hours of biennial continuing education credit for the biennium in which the course was taught. A maximum of seven (7) hours per biennium may be awarded under this subsection.

Rulemaking Authority 455.2179, 489.507(3) FS. Law Implemented 455.2179 FS. History–New 11-30-94, Amended 6-13-96, 12-3-00, 10-28-20.
61G6-9.008 Course Syllabus.

Rulemaking Authority 489.507(3) FS. Law Implemented 489.517(3) FS. History–New 11-30-94, Repealed 12-26-11.
61G6-9.009 Required Records Maintained by Course Providers.

Each course provider must maintain the following records with respect to each course:

(1) The time, date and place each course is conducted.

(2) The name, address and qualifications of each instructor who teaches any portion of the course.

(3) The name, address and certificate or registration number of each person who registered for the course.

(4) The original sign-in sheet used at the site of the course to register persons who attend each course. The sign-in sheet shall require all attenders to print their name, list their contractor’s license number, and sign their name.

(5) The course syllabus used for each course.

(6) The attendance forms.

(7) Each person who completes an approved course shall be issued a certificate of completion by the course provider. The certificate of completion shall contain the name and the license number of the person who completed the course, the course number and letter prefix, the sponsor number, the date of course completion, and the number of approved continuing education hours in the course. The course provider shall maintain a list of the name and license number(s) of each person who completes each course conducted by the course provider.

(8) The records must be maintained for at least four years following the date the course is completed.

(9) Each course provider shall provide the Board with copies of any of these required records, upon request by the Board.

Rulemaking Authority 455.2178(6), 489.507(3) FS. Law Implemented 455.2178 FS. History–New 11-30-94, Amended 6-13-96, 12-25-96, 3-24-99, 11-9-00, 4-30-19.
61G6-9.0105 Proof of Completion by Certification Holders and Registrants.

Rulemaking Authority 489.507(3), 489.509, 489.517 FS. Law Implemented 489.517 FS. History–New 9-23-99, Repealed 1-19-12.
61G6-9.012 Advertising of Continuing Education Courses.

Rulemaking Authority 489.507(3) FS. Law Implemented 455.2179, 489.517(3) FS. History–New 11-30-94, Amended 11-9-00, Repealed 4-30-19.
61G6-9.013 Continuing Education Courses Required by Disciplinary Action.

Rulemaking Authority 489.507(3) FS. Law Implemented 489.517(3) FS. History–New 11-30-94, Repealed 12-26-11.
61G6-9.014 Fees.

(1) The fee for registering each continuing education provider shall be one hundred and ninety-six dollars ($196.00).

(2) The fee for reviewing each continuing education course approval application shall be twenty-five ($25.00) per credit hour, not to exceed one hundred dollars ($100.00) per course.

Rulemaking Authority 455.2179(3), (4), 489.507(3), 489.509 FS. Law Implemented 455.219(3), 489.517(3), 455.2179(3), 489.509 FS. History–New 11-30-94, Amended 4-30-19, 9-28-21.
61G6-9.015 Continuing Education Exemption for Spouses of Military Personnel.

A licensee who is the spouse of a member of the Armed Forces of the United States and was caused to be absent from the State of Florida because of the spouse’s duties with the armed forces shall be exempt from all licensure renewal provisions under these rules during such absence. The licensee must show proof to the Board of the absence and the spouse’s military status.

Rulemaking Authority 455.02(2), 489.507(3) FS. Law Implemented 455.02(2) FS. History–New 4-3-01.
