CHAPTER 61G19-6

CERTIFICATION, EXAMINATION, APPLICATION, CERTIFICATE RENEWAL, INACTIVE STATUS

61G19-6.002
Certification for Multiple Inspection Classes

61G19-6.0035
Application for Provisional and/or Standard Certification

61G19-6.0036
Application for Certification Review Procedure

61G19-6.004
Abandonment of Applications (Repealed)
61G19-6.005
Information Required on Certificates (Repealed)
61G19-6.006
Changes in Application and Certificate Information (Repealed)
61G19-6.007
Standard Certificates; In General (Repealed)
61G19-6.008
Reexamination

61G19-6.0085
Florida Principles and Practice

61G19-6.010
Other Methods of Qualification for Standard Certification (Repealed)
61G19-6.011
Limited Certificates (Repealed)
61G19-6.012
Provisional Certificates

61G19-6.014
Reactivate a Delinquent License

61G19-6.015
Inactive Status

61G19-6.016
Voluntary Certification Categories

61G19-6.017
Residential Inspector Certification

61G19-6.018
Exemption of Spouses of Members of Armed Forces from Licensure Renewal Provisions
61G19-6.019
Null and Void
61G19-6.002 Certification for Multiple Inspection Classes.

The Board shall issue a single certificate valid for multiple inspection classes to:

(1) Persons holding multiple certificates under one of the voluntary certification programs defined in Rule 61G19-6.016, F.A.C.;

(2) Persons holding multiple certificates under a voluntary certification program not defined in Rule 61G19-6.016, F.A.C., which has been accepted for endorsement by the Board; and

(3) Persons qualifying by examination for multiple inspection classes under the provisions of this part.

Rulemaking Authority 468.606 FS. Law Implemented 468.607, 468.609 FS. History–New 5-23-94, Amended 11-28-95, 9-26-01.

61G19-6.0035 Application for Provisional and/or Standard Certification.

(1) Each individual who wishes to obtain a provisional and/or standard certificate in any certificate category shall submit the following to the Board:

(a) A completed application form for the category in which certification is sought. The form that shall be used for this purpose shall be provided by the Department and available on the Department’s website.

(b) An attestation describing in detail each separate period of work experience listed in the application form, signed by a licensed architect, engineer, contractor, fire marshal, or building code administrator who has knowledge of the applicant’s duties and responsibilities during the period indicated. The form that shall be used for this purpose shall be provided by the Department and available on the Department’s website. The form sought is adopted and incorporated by reference in Rule 61-35.008, F.A.C. Each attestation must include the name and address of the applicant’s employer during the work experience period, the dates of employment, and a description of the applicant’s duties and responsibilities during the employment including any supervisory responsibilities, in sufficient detail to enable the Board to determine whether or not the applicant has the experience required for certification.

(c) Each applicant for certification as an inspector or plans examiner shall demonstrate that he or she has at least one (1) year of hands-on experience in the category of certification sought, with the exception of Residential inspector. For Residential inspector certification, refer to the specific requirements in Rule 61G19-6.017, F.A.C.

(d) Each applicant seeking to qualify for certification through a combination of postsecondary education and work experience shall submit an official copy of all college or university transcripts which document the applicant’s education in addition to all required attestations of work experience.

(e) Each applicant who is not employed by a local government agency having responsibility for building code inspection, building construction regulation, and enforcement of building, plumbing, mechanical, electrical, gas, fire prevention, fire safety, energy, accessibility, and other construction codes at the time of the application shall submit payment of all applicable application, examination and certification fees as specified in Chapter 61G19-10, F.A.C.

(f) For the purposes of this section, any unlicensed activity shall not be recognized for the purposes of providing required experience.

(2) In addition to all other required items, each applicant for an inspector or plans examiner certificate shall submit with the application a statement from the applicant’s current employer which shall indicate the applicant’s present status with the employer. Each applicant employed by a local government agency having responsibility for building code inspection, building construction regulation, and enforcement of building, plumbing, mechanical, electrical, gas, fire prevention, fire safety, energy, accessibility, and other construction codes at the time the application is submitted must include on the statement the signature and license number of the building code administrator, building official, or fire marshal for the applicant’s employing agency.

(3) In addition to all other required items, each applicant for a building code administrator certificate shall submit with the application a statement from the applicant’s current employer which shall indicate the applicant’s present status with the employer.
(4) The Board shall reciprocate license certifications from another state provided the applicant obtained the out-of-state certification by successfully passing an examination administered by the International Code Council and the applicant has passed the Florida Principles and Practice Exam and has met the requirements of Section 468.609(2), F.S.

(5) The board shall approve an application for Standard Certification by endorsement compliant with Section 468.613, Florida Statutes when an applicant holds a building code administrator, inspector, or plans examiner license/certification issued by another state for at least 10 years before the date of application; and has successfully passed an applicable examination administered by the International Code Council. Such application must be submitted for Board review when the license/certification from the other state is active or within 2 years of the license/certification being active. 

Rulemaking Authority 468.606, 468.609 FS. Law Implemented 468.609, 468.613 FS. History–New 11-28-95, Amended 10-1-97, 2-23-99, 6-3-03, 2-6-07, 10-4-07, 12-17-12, 9-20-17, 2-14-18, 7-21-21.
61G19-6.0036 Application for Certification Review Procedure.

(1) Applications which are determined to be complete will first be reviewed by the Department. If the application clearly demonstrates qualification for the certification sought by holding an equivalent experience standard certification issued by the Board, except as provided in subsection (2), the Department shall preliminarily approve the application. A list of all applications preliminarily approved by the Department will be distributed to the Board on a monthly basis. Within ten (10) calendar days after distribution of the list of preliminarily approved applications, any Board member may request that any application on the list be submitted to the Board for review in accordance with this rule. All applications on the preliminarily approved list not selected for review shall be approved by the Department.

(2) All applications seeking certification for licensure as a provisional or standard building code administrator, licensure as a provisional inspector or plans examiner, licensure in any voluntary certification category, or licensure in any category by endorsement shall be submitted to the Board for review in accordance with this rule. Applications will also be referred to the Board if the Department determines that the applicant has not clearly demonstrated qualification for the certification sought.
(3) Applications referred to the Board will first be reviewed by the Board Members tasked with the Application Review. The Application Review shall be conducted by a minimum of three (3) Board members who are licensed building code administrators, inspectors, or plans examiners, architects, engineers, or contractors, appointed by the Chair. The Chair, if otherwise qualified, may also perform the Application Review.

(4) The Board members performing the Application Review shall review all applications for certification not otherwise approved and shall determine by majority vote whether to recommend approval or denial of each such application to the Board.

(5) The recommendations of the Board members performing the Application Review shall be provided to the Board for final action. Any Board member may request that any application for certification be pulled for discussion and/or individual determination by the Board.

Rulemaking Authority 455.203, 468.606 FS. Law Implemented 455.203, 468.606, 468.609 FS. History–New 2-21-10, Amended 10-6-10, 3-5-17, 10-21-20.

61G19-6.004 Abandonment of Applications.

Rulemaking Authority 468.606 FS. Law Implemented 468.607, 468.609 FS. History–New 5-23-94, Repealed 3-4-12.

61G19-6.005 Information Required on Certificates.

Rulemaking Authority 468.606 FS. Law Implemented 468.607, 468.609 FS. History–New 5-23-94, Repealed 9-29-15.
61G19-6.006 Changes in Application and Certificate Information.

Rulemaking Authority 468.606 FS. Law Implemented 468.607, 468.609 FS. History–New 5-23-94, Repealed 11-16-15.
61G19-6.007 Standard Certificates; In General.

Rulemaking Authority 468.606 FS. Law Implemented 468.609(4) FS. History–New 5-23-94, Amended 3-17-98, Repealed 3-4-12.

61G19-6.008 Reexamination.

All applicants who have taken and failed the licensure examination for a standard certificate and who wish to apply for reexamination in that certificate category shall submit the following to the Department:

(1) A completed application form for reexamination in the category in which certification is sought. The form that shall be used for this purpose shall be provided by the Department and available on the Department’s website.

(2) Those individuals who are not employed by a local government agency having responsibility for building code inspection, building construction regulation, and enforcement of building, plumbing, mechanical, electrical, gas, fire prevention, energy, accessibility, and other construction codes at the time of their application for reexamination shall submit payment of the applicable reexamination fees as specified in Chapter 61G19-10, F.A.C.

Rulemaking Authority 455.217, 468.606 FS. Law Implemented 455.213, 455.217, 468.607, 468.609(5), 468.627(4) FS. History–New 5-23-94, Amended 11-21-95, 5-6-96, 10-1-97, 2-23-99, 8-17-03, 10-7-15, 8-8-19.
61G19-6.0085 Florida Principles and Practice.

An applicant for licensure under this part shall satisfactorily complete the Florida laws and rules (Principles and Practice) exam with a passing grade of 70% or higher. An applicant shall not have to take that exam again provided the applicant has maintained continuous employment in one of the licensure categories of Chapter 468, Part XII, F.S., or Chapter 471 or 481, F.S., active licensure and continuing education.

Rulemaking Authority 468.606 FS. Law Implemented 455.217(7), 468.609(5) FS. History–New 1-15-96, Amended 6-10-02, 1-16-03.

61G19-6.010 Other Methods of Qualification for Standard Certification.

Rulemaking Authority 468.606 FS. Law Implemented 468.609(7), 468.613 FS. History–New 5-23-94, Amended 11-28-95, 10-1-97, Repealed 11-16-15.
61G19-6.011 Limited Certificates.

Rulemaking Authority 468.606 FS. Law Implemented 468.609(5) FS. History–New 5-23-94, Amended 5-21-95, 8-6-97, Repealed 3-4-12.

61G19-6.012 Provisional Certificates.

(1) The Board shall issue a provisional certificate to any newly employed or newly promoted building code administrator, subject to the provisions of Section 468.609, F.S., and the provisions of this rule. The board shall issue a provisional certificate to any building code inspector or plans examiner who meets the eligibility requirements subject to the provisions of Section 468.609, F.S., and the provisions of this rule.
(2) Provisional inspector or plans examiner certificates shall only be issued to applicants who demonstrate at the time of their application that they possess all of the standards and eligibility requirements for standard certification as set forth in Section 468.609(2), F.S. Provisional building code administrator certificates shall only be issued to applicants who demonstrate at the time of their application that they possess all of the standards and eligibility requirements for standard certification as set forth in Section 468.609(3), F.S.

(3) Provisional certificates shall only be issued to persons employed or contracted by an agency of government and the authority of the certificate shall be limited to the jurisdiction of the government agency with which the applicant was employed at the time the provisional certificate was originally issued.

(4) Provisional certificates for building code inspectors or plans examiners may be issued for the duration of a sponsored internship with a maximum length of four years. When an internship is partially completed and the intern wishes to change employers, the intern must, within thirty days of change in employment, submit an application to the Board identifying the new employer and requesting the continuance of the provisional certificate with the new building official.
(5) The Board shall restrict provisional certificate holders by limiting their work, when such restrictions are determined by the Board’s evaluation of the facts of each application to be necessary to protect the public health, safety and welfare.

(6) Following the submission of an application for provisional certification as either an inspector or plans examiner, the applicant shall be eligible to perform duties in the category for which the application has been submitted for up to a maximum of one hundred twenty (120) days from the date the application is submitted, and subject to the following conditions:

(a) Prior to beginning the performance of duties under this rule, the building code administrator for the agency employing the applicant shall have determined that the applicant possesses the qualifications for a provisional certificate.

(b) All duties performed by the applicant under this exception shall be performed under the direct supervision of the building code administrator for the agency employing the applicant. The building code administrator shall hold a current, valid standard certificate as a building code administrator at all times when he or she is supervising the applicant. However, direct supervision may be provided by a building code administrator who holds a limited or provisional certificate in any county with population of less than 75,000 and in any municipality located within such a county. 

(c) Prior to beginning the performance of duties under this exception, applicants for plans examiner and inspector shall provide the building code administrator for the agency which employs them a copy of the completed application for provisional certification submitted to the Board by the applicant.

(d) Upon being notified that he or she has been determined by the Board to be not qualified for a provisional certificate in the category sought, an applicant shall immediately cease performing duties as a plans examiner or building code inspector under this exception.

Rulemaking Authority 468.606, 468.609(7) FS. Law Implemented 468.609(7) FS. History–New 5-23-94, Amended 5-21-95, 8-28-95, 12-6-95, 1-3-96, 2-23-99, 4-30-01, 1-10-07, 1-16-08, 10-7-12, 2-14-18.
61G19-6.014 Reactivate a Delinquent License.

A certificate that becomes delinquent for failure to renew may be reactivated by paying the original renewal fee plus additional delinquency fees as described in subsection 61G19-10.001(2), F.A.C., and by filing a complete application that is defined to include the certificateholder’s name, address, other active licenses held, where employed and proof of completion of continuing education requirements.

Rulemaking Authority 455.271, 468.606 FS. Law Implemented 455.271, 468.627 FS. History–New 5-23-94, Amended 2-9-98.

61G19-6.015 Inactive Status.

(1) Any licensee that is in an inactive status shall not engage in building code administration, inspection or plans examination.

(2) Certificate holders may place their certification on inactive status by paying a fee as prescribed in subsection 61G19-10.001(2), F.A.C.

(3) Certificate holders on inactive status may reactivate their certificates by submitting a written request, the regular renewal fee pursuant to Rule 61G19-10.001, F.A.C., and proof of completion of fourteen (14) hours of continuing education for the immediately preceeding inactive biennium.

(4) A licensee’s election of inactive status cannot be used to circumvent disciplinary action against the licensee.

Rulemaking Authority 455.271, 468.606 FS. Law Implemented 468.627, 455.271(1) FS. History–New 5-23-94, Amended 11-21-95, 8-6-97, 12-17-12.
61G19-6.016 Voluntary Certification Categories.

The following voluntary certification categories are created.

(1) Residential Pool Inspector. Residential Pool Inspector means a person who is qualified to inspect a pool on the property of one and two family dwellings. In order to obtain this voluntary certification the Board will require the State certified pool contractor license and in addition, the applicant must hold certification as a building or electrical inspector.

(2) Commercial Pool Inspector. Commercial Pool Inspector means a person who is qualified to inspect a pool located on any property other than one and two family dwellings. In order to obtain this voluntary certification the Board will require the state certified pool contractor license and in addition, the applicant must hold certification as a building, plumbing, mechanical, or electrical inspector.

(3) Roofing Inspector. Roofing Inspector means a person who is qualified to inspect residential and commercial roofs. In order to obtain this voluntary certification the Board will require either: four (4) years of roofing experience with passage of the standardized roofing inspectors’ examination as approved by the board; state certification as a roofing contractor or a state certified general contractor who was certified prior to 1974.

(4) Modular Inspector. This license is required for inspection of all modular buildings constructed to the Florida Building Code and administered under Chapter 553, Part I, F.S., unless otherwise provided for in Florida Statutes. 

(a) Modular Inspector means a person who is authorized to inspect any manufactured (modular) building and systems incorporated therein designed and built to comply with the Florida Building Code pursuant to Part I, Chapter 553, F.S. In order to obtain this voluntary certification, the Board will require the applicant to pass the standardized modular inspectors’ examination and the applicant must have three (3) years experience as an inspector with local government and/or state government or three years experience as an inspector with an independent inspection/plans review agency under contract with a state agency or three (3) years experience as a registered or certified state general, building, or residential contractor or job superintendent, project manager or quality control manager, the latter as provided for in Chapter 61-41, F.A.C., in a supervisory capacity that included operational control and direction of building, mechanical, electrical and plumbing personnel or subcontractors on residential or commercial projects.
(b) Responsibilities: Verify the state approved plans are in the factory. Assure the buildings being manufactured comply with the approved plans and the applicable Florida Building Code. Compare the approved plans to the modular building and identify any deviations. Determine the reason for the deviations and investigate repetitive deviations in other buildings. Discuss the deviations with the in-plant quality control supervisor and establish a procedure to resolve the deviations. Verify the appliances and equipment installed in the building are consistent with those identified in the quality control manual. Verify the data plates have all the information as required in Chapter 61-41, F.A.C. Assure the state insignia is affixed to the correct building. The modular inspector shall monitor quality control procedures to verify the in-plant quality control personnel are conducting quality control reviews at the proper times. The modular inspector shall notify the Department of Community Affairs contracted inspection agency of any problems with the in-plant quality control procedures. The inspector shall follow-up on quality control procedures to verify that the in-plant quality control inspector is making the inspection of the buildings at the proper time. Persons qualified as Residential may also inspect family, two family, and three family modular residences regulated under Chapter 61-41, F.A.C. Persons qualified as Standard Building Inspectors in all four disciplines of building, electrical, mechanical and plumbing may also inspect all modular buildings regulated under Chapter 61-41, F.A.C.

(5) Modular Plans Examiner. This license is required for plans reviews of all modular buildings constructed to the Florida Building Code and administered under Chapter 553, Part I, F.S., unless otherwise provided for in Florida Statutes.
(a) Modular Plans Examiner means a person who is authorized to review plans for any manufactured (modular) building and systems incorporated therein designed and built to comply with the Florida Building Code pursuant to Part 1, Chapter 553, F.S. In order to obtain this voluntary certification, the Board will require the applicant to pass the standardized modular plans inspectors’ examination and the applicant must have three (3) years experience as a plans examiner with local and/or state government. As an alternative, the applicant must have three (3) years experience as a plans examiner with an independent inspection/plans review agency under contract with a state department or three (3) years experience as a registered or certified state general, building, or residential contractor or job superintendent, project manager or quality control manager, the latter as provided for in Chapter 61-41, F.A.C., in a supervisory capacity that included operational control and direction of building, mechanical, electrical and plumbing personnel or subcontractors on residential or commercial projects.

(b) Responsibilities: Examine building construction plans for compliance with the applicable Florida Building Code. Assure compliance with Florida’s Manufactured Buildings Act, Chapter 553, Part I, F.S., along with Chapter 61-41, F.A.C. Resolve code problems with the local personnel on behalf of the agency’s clients. Research the code changes upon adoption of the current edition of the codes. Review the proposed amendments to Chapter 61-41, F.A.C., and provide input accordingly. Persons qualified as Residential plans examiner may also review and approve plans for one and two family modular residences regulated under Chapter 61-41, F.A.C. Persons qualified as Standard Building Plans Examiners in all four disciplines of building, electrical, mechanical and plumbing may also review all modular buildings regulated under Chapter 61-41, F.A.C. 

(6) Residential Plans Examiner means a person who is qualified to determine that the plans submitted for the purpose of obtaining building and other permits, for one and two family dwellings and accessory structures, comply with the building, plumbing, mechanical, electrical, gas, fire prevention, energy, accessibility, and other applicable building codes. In order to obtain this voluntary certification, the applicant must hold standard certification Residential inspector; must have passed the State principles and practices examination; and holds certification as an International Code Council (ICC) Residential Plans Examiner.

Rulemaking Authority 468.606, 468.609(10) FS. Law Implemented 468.609(10) FS. History–New 7-5-95, Amended 7-7-96, 8-6-97, 6-25-98, 12-28-00, 2-28-02, 4-7-03, 9-3-03, 3-7-06, 6-13-07, 11-21-07, 6-24-09, 3-9-21.
61G19-6.017 Residential Inspector Certification.

(1) Provisional certification may be obtained in the category of Residential inspector, provided the Building Code Administrator of the jurisdiction holds standard certification pursuant to Chapter 468, Part XII, F.S.

(2) Applicants for standard or provisional certification in this category must meet the eligibility requirements according to one of the following criteria:

(a) Five years’ experience as a registered or certified state general, building, or residential contractor in a supervisory capacity that included operational control and direction of building, mechanical, electrical, and plumbing personnel or subcontractors on residential projects, or

(b) Five years’ experience as a job superintendent or project manager in a supervisory capacity that included operational control and direction of building, mechanical, electrical, and plumbing personnel or subcontractors on residential projects, or

(c) Five years’ experience including two years of hands-on electrical experience, two years of hands-on building experience, and one year of hands-on experience in either mechanical or plumbing, or

(d) Standard certification as an inspector in any of the categories listed in Section 468.603(6), F.S., plus at least six months’ hands-on experience in each of the following areas in which the applicant does not hold standard certification: building, plumbing, electrical, and mechanical, or

(e) A combination of postsecondary education in the field of construction or a related field and experience in the category sought which totals four years, with at least one year of such total being experience in the category sought in construction, building code inspection, or plans review, or

(f) A combination of technical education in the field of construction or a related field and experience in the category sought which totals four years, with at least one year of such total being experience in the category sought in construction, building code inspection, or plans review, or

(g) Standard certification as an inspector in any of the categories listed in Section 468.603(6), F.S., plus satisfactory completion of a Residential inspector training program of not less than 500 hours.
(h) Standard certificate/license as a firesafety inspector issued pursuant to Chapter 633, F.S. with Four years verifiable full-time experience conducting firesafety inspections plus satisfactory completion of a Residential inspector training program of not less then 500 hours.
Rulemaking Authority 468.606 FS. Law Implemented 468.609(2), (7) FS. History–New 2-28-02, Amended 12-11-07, 3-5-17, 10-21-20.

61G19-6.018 Exemption of Spouses of Members of Armed Forces from Licensure Renewal Provisions.

A licensee who is the spouse of a member of the Armed Forces of the United States and was caused to be absent from the State of Florida because of the spouse’s duties with the armed forces shall be exempt from all licensure renewal provisions under these rules during such absence. The licensee must show proof to the Board of the absence and the spouse’s military status. Such proof shall consist of copies of the military orders requiring the change of duty station and must be sent to the Board office in order to qualify for the exemption.

Rulemaking Authority 455.02(2), 468.606 FS. Law Implemented 455.02(2) FS. History–New 4-12-04.
61G19-6.019 Null and Void.

Any person desiring licensure from Null and Void status shall submit a completed Form BCAIB 9, Application to Reinstate Null and Void Certification, effective July 2012, adopted and incorporated by reference herein and available at https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-12571.

Rulemaking Authority 455.271(6)(a) FS. Law Implemented 455.271(6)(a) FS. History–New 1-28-21.
