CHAPTER 59A-5

AMBULATORY SURGICAL CENTER LICENSURE

59A-5.002
Definitions

59A-5.003
Licensure Procedure

59A-5.004
Validation, Licensure, & Life Safety Inspections and Complaint Investigations

59A-5.005
Governing Board
59A-5.0065
Patient Rights

59A-5.007
Organized Medical Staff

59A-5.0085
Departments and Services

59A-5.011
Surveillance, Prevention, and Control of Infection

59A-5.012
Medical Records

59A-5.016
Physical Plant Maintenance

59A-5.017
Fire Control

59A-5.018
Comprehensive Emergency Management Plan

59A-5.019
Quality Assessment and Improvement

59A-5.021
Plans Submission and Fee Requirements

59A-5.022
Physical Plant Requirements for Ambulatory Surgical Centers

59A-5.002 Definitions.

In addition to definitions contained in Chapters 395, Part I and 408, Part II, F.S. the following definitions shall apply specifically to ambulatory surgical centers.
(1) “Administrator” means a person who is delegated the responsibility of carrying out the policies and programs established by the governing board. 

(2) “Agency” means the Agency for Health Care Administration.
(3) “Anesthesiologist” means a person currently licensed to practice medicine or osteopathy pursuant to Chapters 458 or 459, F.S., and who has completed an approved residency in the field of anesthesiology.
(4) “Anesthesiologist Assistant” means a person currently licensed pursuant to Chapters 458 or 459, F.S. as an anesthesiologist assistant.
(5) “Center” means an ambulatory surgical center.
(6) “Certified Registered Nurse Anesthetists” means a person currently licensed and certified pursuant to Chapter 464, F.S, and certified by the Council on Certification of Nurse Anesthetists.
(7) “Dentist” means a person currently licensed to practice dentistry pursuant to Chapter 466, F.S.
(8) “F.A.C.” means the Florida Administrative Code.
(9) “Governing board” means an individual owner, partnership, corporation or other legally established authority in whom the ultimate authority and responsibility for management of the ambulatory surgical center is vested.

(10) “Licensed Practical Nurse” means a person currently licensed as defined in Section 464.003(16), F.S.
(11) “Operating room” means a room designated and equipped for performing surgical operations that requires a restricted environment.
(12) “Operating room technician” means a person with specialized training in operation room techniques and considered by the governing board qualified to serve as part of the operating room staff.
(13) “Medical Staff” means a formal organization of physicians, dentists, podiatrists, or other health professionals, who are appointed by the governing board to attend patients within the ambulatory surgical center.
(14) “Patient” means a person admitted to the ambulatory surgical center.
(15) “Pharmacist” means a person currently licensed pursuant to Chapter 465, F.S.
(16) “Physician” means a person currently licensed to practice medicine or osteopathy pursuant to Chapters 458 or 459, F.S.
(17) “Podiatrist” means a person currently licensed to practice podiatric medicine pursuant to Chapter 461, F.S.
(18) “Procedure Room” means a room designated for the performance of special procedures that do not require a restricted environment but may use sterile instruments or equipment.
(19) “Recovery Bed” means an accommodation with support services used for post-operative recovery in an ambulatory surgical center.
(20) “Registered Professional Nurse” means a person currently licensed as defined in Section 464.003(22), F.S.
Rulemaking Authority 395.1055 FS. Law Implemented 395.1055 FS. History–New 6-14-78, Formerly 10D-30.02, Amended 2-3-88, 5-5-92, Formerly 10D-30.002, Amended 11-13-95, 9-17-14.
59A-5.003 Licensure Procedure.

(1) In addition to the licensure requirements contained in Chapters 395, Part I and 408, Part II, F.S., all centers shall comply with the following:

(2) All persons requesting licensure for the operation of a center under the provisions of Chapter 395, F.S., shall make application to the Agency on Health Care Licensing Application, Ambulatory Surgical Centers, AHCA Form 3130-2001 July 2014, which is incorporated by reference. The form is available at: http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04452 and available from the Agency for Health Care Administration, 2727 Mahan Drive, Mail Stop #31, Tallahassee, Florida 32308, or at the web address at: http://ahca.myflorida.com/HQAlicensureforms. The center must obtain a standard license prior to the acceptance of patients for care or treatment.
(3) Each center applying for a license shall be designated by a distinctive name, and the name shall not be changed without first notifying the Agency and receiving approval in writing. Duplication of an existing center’s name is prohibited.

(4) In addition to the requirements found in Chapter 408, Part II, F.S., the following documents shall accompany the initial application:

(a) Proof of fictitious name registration if applicable;
(b) Articles of Incorporation or similarly titled document registered by the applicant with the Florida Department of State; and,
(c) The center’s Zoning Certificate or proof of compliance with zoning requirements.

(5) The following documents shall be available for inspection at the center by the Agency area office at the initial licensure inspection:

(a) The governing board bylaws, rules and regulations, or other written organizational plan;

(b) Medical staff bylaws, rules and regulations;

(c) Roster of medical staff members;

(d) Nursing procedure manual;

(e) Roster of registered nurses and licensed practical nurses with current license numbers;

(f) The center’s fire plan; and,
(g) The Comprehensive Emergency Management Plan pursuant to Rule 59A-5.018, F.A.C.

(6) In addition to the requirements found in Chapter 408, Part II, F.S., all applications for a change of ownership shall include;

(a) A signed agreement with the Agency to correct physical plant deficiencies listed in the most recent licensure inspection that conforms to Florida Building Code;

(b) A copy of the closing documents, which must include an effective date and the signatures of both the buyer and the seller;

(c) Articles of Incorporation or similarly titled document registered by the applicant with the Florida Department of State;
(d) Proof of fictitious name registration if applicable;
(e) Evidence of payment of, or arrangement to pay, any liability to the state pursuant to Section 395.003(3), F.S.

(7) A license fee of $1,679.82 for the operation of a center as established by Chapter 395, F.S., shall accompany an application for an initial, renewal or change of ownership license. The license fee shall be made payable to the Agency for Health Care Administration. No license shall be issued without payment of the requisite fee.

(8) All permanent additions to the constructed center’s operating room capacity occurring after the issuance of the initial license shall require a new application for licensure.

(9) Each license shall specifically state the number of operating rooms, procedure rooms, and recovery beds in the center.

(10) There shall not be multiple ambulatory surgical center licenses for the same premises.

(11) Each center licensed under Chapter 395, F.S., shall establish an internal risk management program pursuant to Chapter 59A-10, F.A.C., as a part of its administrative function.

(12) Upon receipt of the required information in subsections (1) through (4) above, the Agency shall conduct a licensure inspection to determine compliance with Chapter 395, Part I, F.S. and Rules 59A-5.002 through 59A-5.022, F.A.C.

(13) When a center is in compliance with Chapters 395, Part I and 408, Part II, F.S. and Rules 59A-5.002 through 59A-5.022, F.A.C., and has received all approvals required by law, the Agency shall issue, a single license which identifies the licensee and the name and location of the center.
(14) Separate licenses shall not be required for separate buildings on the same grounds when used by the same center.

(15) A license issued to a center shall be revoked or denied by the Agency in any case where the Agency finds there has been substantial failure to comply with provisions of Chapter 395, Part I, F.S. or Chapter 59A-5, F.A.C.

(16) A licensee shall notify the Agency of impending closure of a center not less than 30 days prior to such closure. The center shall be responsible for advising the Agency as to the disposition of medical records.

Rulemaking Authority 395.1055, 408.819 FS. Law Implemented 395.003, 395.004, 395.0161, 395.1055, 408.806, 408.809, 408.811 FS. History–New 6-14-78, Formerly 10D-30.03, Amended 2-3-88, Formerly 10D-30.003, Amended 11-13-95, 9-17-14.
59A-5.004 Validation, Licensure, & Life Safety Inspections and Complaint Investigations.

(1) Inspections. The Agency shall conduct periodic inspections of ambulatory surgical centers in order to ensure compliance with all licensure requirements in accordance with Section 395.0161, F.S.

(2) Non-accredited ambulatory surgical centers. Centers which are not accredited by an accrediting organization shall be subject to a scheduled annual licensure inspection. The fee for conducting a licensure inspection shall be $400.00.

(3) Accredited ambulatory surgical centers. The Agency shall accept the report of an accrediting organization in lieu of an annual licensure inspection for accredited centers and for centers seeking accreditation, provided that the standards used by the accrediting organization are determined by the Agency to incorporate comparable state licensure requirements, found in Chapters 395 and 408, F.S. and Chapters 59A-5 and 59A-35, F.A.C., and the center does not meet the criteria specified under subparagraphs (c)1. and 2.

(a) Upon receipt of the accrediting organization’s report, the Agency will review the findings to determine if the center is in compliance with state licensure requirements.

(b) The Agency shall notify the center within 60 days of the receipt of the accrediting organization’s report regarding the Agency’s determination of the center’s compliance or non-compliance with state licensure requirements.
(c) Accredited centers shall be subject to an annual licensure inspection under the following circumstances:

1. The center has been denied accreditation or has received a provisional or conditional accreditation from an accrediting organization on its most recent accreditation report, and has not submitted an acceptable plan of correction to the accrediting organization.

2. The center has received full accreditation, but has not authorized the release of the report to the Agency or has not ensured that the Agency received the accrediting organization’s report prior to the Agency’s scheduled inspection.

(d) The fee for an annual licensure inspection shall be $400.00 for any accredited center subject to inspection pursuant to paragraph (c).

(4) Life safety inspection fee. A separate fee of $40.00 shall be assessed for a life-safety inspection, except when conducted as part of a licensure or a Centers for Medicare and Medicaid Services certification inspection.

(5) Validation inspection. Each year, the Agency shall conduct validation inspections on a minimum of five percent of those centers that have undergone an accreditation inspection from an accrediting organization, to determine ongoing compliance with state licensure requirements.

(a) Upon completion of a validation inspection, the Agency will send a copy of its findings to the center. For those centers determined not to be in compliance with state licensure requirements the notification will include a statement of deficiencies.

(b) If the Agency determines, based on the results of validation inspection findings, that an accredited center is not in compliance with licensure requirements, the Agency shall report its findings to the accrediting organization and shall conduct a full licensure inspection on that center during the following year.

(c) The fee for conducting a licensure validation inspection shall be $400.00. A separate fee for a validation inspection will not be assessed when conducted in conjunction with a Centers for Medicare and Medicaid Services certification inspection.

(6) Complaint investigations. The Agency shall conduct investigations of complaints regarding violations of licensure, and life-safety standards in accordance with Sections 395.0161 and 408.811, F.S. Complaint investigations will be unannounced. An entrance conference shall be conducted upon arrival, by Agency personnel investigating the complaint, to inform the center’s administrator about the nature of the complaint investigation and to answer questions from the center’s staff. An exit conference shall be provided at the conclusion of the on-site investigation to inform the center of the scope of the investigation and to receive any additional information that the center wishes to furnish.

(a) Upon receipt of a complaint, the Agency shall review the complaint for allegations of non-compliance with licensure requirements, and shall take the following actions:

1. Complaints involving any center shall be reviewed and sent to the appropriate Agency local office for investigation, if it is determined that the allegations could constitute a violation of state licensure or federal certification;

2. If allegations are more appropriately addressed by another state agency or entity, the complaint will be referred accordingly.

(b) Upon a determination that investigation of a complaint is warranted, the Agency shall conduct an investigation.

(7) Conformance with accreditation standards. In all centers where the Agency does not conduct an annual licensure inspection, by reason of the center’s accreditation status, the center shall continue to conform to the standards of accreditation throughout the term of accreditation, or shall notify the Agency of the areas of non-conformance. Where the Agency is notified of non-conformance, it shall take appropriate action as specified under subsection (3).

(8) Sanctions. The Agency shall impose penalties pursuant to Section 395.1065, F.S., on those centers which fail to submit an acceptable plan of correction or implement actions to correct deficiencies identified by the Agency or an accrediting organization which are specified in an approved plan of correction or as identified as a result of a complaint investigation.

Rulemaking Authority 395.1055, 395.0161, 48.819 FS. Law Implemented 395.003, 395.0161, 395.1065, 408.811 FS. History–New 6-14-78, Formerly 10D-30.04, 10D-30.004, Amended 11-13-95, 9-17-14.
59A-5.005 Governing Board.

(1) The center’s organization shall have an effective governing authority responsible for the legal and ethical conduct of the center. The governing board in fulfilling its responsibility shall be organized under approved written bylaws, rules and regulations which shall:

(a) State the qualifications for governing board membership, and the method of selecting members as well as the terms of appointment or election of members, officers and chairmen of committees. Where legally permissible, physicians who are members of the medical staff shall be eligible for, and should be included in, full membership of the centers’ governing board and its action committees in the same manner as are other knowledgeable and effective individuals. Also, any other member of the medical staff shall be considered eligible for membership of the governing board.

(b) Provide for the designation of officers, their duties, and for the organization of the governing board into essential committees with the number and type consistent with the size and scope of the center’s activities.

(c) Coordinate through an executive committee or the governing board as a whole, the policies and activities of the center and special committees established by the governing board.

(d) Specify the frequency of meetings, at regular stated intervals, with a majority of the members constituting a quorum and with the requirement that minutes be recorded and made available to all members of the governing board.

(e) Establish the position of administrator, the incumbent of which shall be responsible for operation and maintenance of the center as a functioning institution, and define the methods established by the governing board for holding such designated person responsible.

(f) Provide for the appointment, reappointment, or dismissal of members of the medical staff through a credentialing committee or its equivalent and a procedure for hearing and appeal. No action on appointment, reappointment or dismissal shall be taken without prior referral to the credentialing committee for their recommendation, provided that the governing board may suspend an medical staff member pending final determination of any reappointment or dismissal. The governing board shall only appoint members of the medical staff as recommended by the credentialing committee.

(g) Provide for the approval of the bylaws, rules and regulations of the medical staff.

(h) Require that every patient shall be admitted by and remain under the care of a member of the medical staff.

(i) Require that all medications, treatments and procedures shall be administered upon specific orders of a member of the medical staff.

(j) Require that all attending medical staff members who do not have admitting privileges at an acute care general hospital document a written agreement with a physician who has staff privileges with one or more acute care general hospitals licensed by the state to accept any patient who requires continuing care; or

(k) Ensure that there is a written center agreement, with one or more acute care general hospitals licensed by the state, which will admit any patient referred who requires continuing care.

(l) Provide for a formal and official means of liaison among the medical staff, the governing board, and the administrator to provide a channel for administrative advice.

(m) Specify the classification of services to be provided in the center and list authorized surgical procedures.

(2) Where a physician serves as the licensee and governing board, the articles of incorporation or other written organizational plan shall describe the manner in which the licensee executes the governing board responsibility.

Rulemaking Authority 395.1055 FS. Law Implemented 395.0191, 395.1055 FS. History–New 6-14-78, Amended 3-3-80, Formerly 10D-30.05, 10D-30.005, Amended 11-13-95, 9-17-14.
59A-5.0065 Patient Rights.

Each center shall develop and adopt policies and procedures to ensure the protection of patient rights; which shall include those patient rights specified in Sections 381.026, 395.301 and 395.3025, F.S.

Rulemaking Authority 395.1055 FS. Law Implemented 395.301, 395.1055, 395.3025 FS. History–New 11-13-95, Amended 2-23-16.
59A-5.007 Organized Medical Staff.

(1) Each center shall have an organized medical staff organized under written bylaws approved by the governing board and responsible to the governing board of the center for the quality of all medical care provided to patients in the center and for the ethical and professional practices of its members.

(2) Committees – The structure of committee organization shall be determined by the organized medical staff provided the following required committee functions are carried out with sufficient periodicity to assure that objectives are achieved by separate committee, combined committees, or committee of the whole:

(a) Approval of the policies, procedures, and the activities of all departments and services.

(b) Interim decision making for the organized medical staff between staff meetings, under such limitations as shall be set by the medical staff.

(c) Follow-up and appropriate disposition of all reports dealing with the various staff functions.

(d) Review of all applications for appointment and biennially review reappointment of all categories of medical staff pursuant to Sections 395.0191 and 395.0193, F.S.

(e) Medical records currently maintained describing the condition, treatment, and progress of patient in sufficient completeness to assure comprehension of transfer of patient information at any time.

(f) Clinical evaluation of the quality of medical care provided to all categories of patients on the basis of documented evidence.

(g) Review of center admissions with respect to need for admission, discharge practices and evaluation of the services ordered and provided.

(h) Surveillance of the center’s infection potentials and cases and the promotion of a preventive and corrective program designed to minimize these hazards.

(i) Surveillance of pharmacy policies and procedures, and standards of practice are maintained, including review of at least monthly on-site consultant pharmacist visits, and proper disposal of outdated prescription and controlled drugs in accordance with Rules 64B16-28.702, 64B16-28.110, 64B16-28.303, F.A.C. and Chapters 465 and 893, F.S.

Rulemaking Authority 395.1055 FS. Law Implemented 395.0191, 395.0193, 395.1055 FS. History–New 6-14-78, Formerly 10D-30.07, Amended 2-3-88, Formerly 10D-30.007, Amended 11-13-95, 2-23-16.
59A-5.0085 Departments and Services.

(1) Surgical department. This department shall be organized under written policies and procedures relating to surgical staff privileges, anesthesia, functioning standards, staffing patterns and quality maintenance of the surgical suite.

(a) A qualified person designated by the administrator shall be responsible for the daily functioning and maintenance of the surgical suite.

(b) A surgery record shall be maintained on a current basis that contains the following information:

1. Patient’s name, patient number, pre-operative diagnosis, post-operative diagnosis, surgical procedure, anesthetic, and complications, if any; and,
2. Name of each member of the surgical team, including the surgeon, first assistant, anesthesiologist, nurse anesthetist, anesthesiologist assistant, circulating nurse and operating room technician.
(c) Each center shall ensure, prior to any surgery being performed, that the signed informed consent for the procedure, verification of the identity of patient, operative site, and operative procedure to be performed are in the patient’s medical record.

(d) All infections of surgical cases shall be recorded and reported to the governing board or its designee and a procedure shall exist for the investigation of such cases.

(e) Emergency equipment shall be provided as needed commensurate with the services of the center, maintained in functional condition, and capable of providing and maintaining cardiorespiratory functioning.
(f) Written procedures in implementation of policies shall relate specifically to the functional activities of the surgical suite and include the following:

1. Surgical asepsis: preparation, handling, and maintenance of sterile equipment and supplies.

2. Medical asepsis: patients, staff, equipment, traffic, and equipment flow patterns.

3. Sterilization and disinfection standards and controls; equipment and supplies.

4. Housekeeping.

(2) Anesthesia service. This service shall be organized under written policies and procedures relating to anesthesia staff privileges, the administration of anesthesia, and the maintenance of strict safety controls.

(a) All anesthesia shall be administered by an anesthesiologist, a credentialed and privileged physician, certified registered nurse anesthetist or anesthesiologist assistant, except for local anesthesia administered by a podiatrist, and except for local anesthesia administered by a dentist, and such other anesthesia administered by a dentist in accordance with Section 466.017, F.S. and Chapter 64B5-14, F.A.C.

(b) An anesthesiologist or other physician or a certified registered nurse anesthetist under the on-site medical direction of a licensed physician or an anesthesiologist assistant under the direct supervision of an anesthesiologist, shall be in the center during the anesthesia and post-anesthesia recovery period until all patients are cleared for discharge.

(c) At least one registered professional nurse shall be in the recovery area during the patient’s recovery period.

(d) Prior to the administration of anesthesia, patients shall have a history and physical examination including laboratory analysis when indicated.

(e) Written policies and procedures relative to the administration of anesthesia shall be developed by the anesthesia service, approved by the medical staff and the governing board, and be reviewed annually, dated at time of each review, revised as necessary, and enforced.

(f) Anesthetic safety regulations shall be developed, posted and enforced. Such regulations shall include the following requirements:

1. All operating room electrical and anesthesia equipment shall be inspected on no less than a semi-annual basis, and a written record of the results and corrective actions be maintained;

2. Flammable anesthetic agents shall not be employed in centers;

3. Electrical equipment in anesthetizing areas shall be on an audiovisual line isolation monitor, with the exception of radiologic equipment and fixed lighting more than 5 feet above the floor;

4. Each anesthetic gas machine shall have pin-index system or equivalent safety system and a minimum oxygen flow safety device; and,
5. All reusable anesthesia equipment in direct contact with the patient shall be cleaned or sterilized as appropriate after each use;

6. The following monitors shall be applied to all patients receiving conduction or general anesthesia:

a. Blood pressure cuff;

b. A continuous temperature device, readily available to measure the patient’s temperature;

c. Pulse Oximeter; and,
d. Electrocardiogram.

e. An Inspired Oxygen Concentration Monitor and a Capnograph shall be applied to all patients receiving general anesthesia.

(3) Nursing service. This service shall be organized under written policies and procedures relating to patient care, establishment of standards for nursing care and mechanisms for evaluating such care, and nursing services.

(a) A registered professional nurse designated by the administrator shall be responsible for coordinating and supervising all nursing services.

(b) There shall be a sufficient staffing pattern of registered professional nurses to provide quality nursing care to each surgical patient from admission through discharge. Such additional trained nursing service personnel shall be on duty as may be needed commensurate with the service of the center.

(c) A registered professional nurse shall be assigned as the circulating nurse for one patient at a time for the duration of the surgical procedure for any procedure performed in the center.

(d) A registered professional nurse shall be present in the recovery area at all times when a patient is present.

(e) A record shall be currently maintained of all nursing personnel and include regular and relief as well as full-time and part-time staff. The record shall include the current license number of each licensed person.

(f) A current job description delineating duties and responsibilities shall be maintained for each nursing service position.

(g) Written procedures in implementation of policies and to assure quality nursing care shall relate specifically to the functional activities of nursing service and include the following:

1. Patient admission;

2. Pre- and Post-Operative care;

3. Medical orders from physicians and other members of the medical staff;

4. Standing orders with required signatures;

5. Medications; storage and administration;

6. Treatments;

7. Surgical asepsis;

8. Medical asepsis;

9. Sterilization and disinfection;

10. Documentation: medical records and center records;

11. Patient discharge;

12. Patient transfer;

13. Emergency measures;

14. Isolation measures;

15. Incident reports;

16. Personnel orientation;

17. Inservice education record;

18. Equipment and supplies: availability and maintenance; and,
19. Visitors.

(4) Laboratories. Clinical Laboratory – Each center shall provide on the premises or by written agreement with a laboratory licensed under Chapter 483, F.S. and Chapter 59A-7, F.A.C., a clinical laboratory to provide those services commensurate with the center’s needs and which conform to the provisions of Chapter 483, F.S. and Chapter 59A-7, F.A.C.

(5) Radiolocical services. Each center shall provide within the institution, or through arrangement, radiological services commensurate with the needs of the center.

(a) If radiological services are provided by center staff, the service shall be maintained free of hazards for patients and personnel.

(b) New installations of radiological equipment, and subsequent inspections for the identification of radiation hazards shall be made as required by Chapter 64E-5, F.A.C.

(c) Personnel monitoring shall be maintained for each individual working in the area of radiation. Readings shall be on at least a monthly basis and reports kept on file and available for review.

1. Personnel – The center shall have a licensed practitioner, as defined in Section 468.301(11), F.S., to supervise the service and to discharge professional radiological services.

2. A technologist shall be on duty or on call at all times when there are patients within the center.

3. The use of all radiological apparatus shall be limited to appropriately licensed personnel; and use of fluoroscopes shall be limited to appropriately licensed, credentialed and privileged personnel.

(d) If provided under arrangement with an outside provider, the radiological services must be directed by a qualified radiologist and meet the standards as required by Chapter 64E-5, F.A.C.

(6) Housekeeping service. The Housekeeping Service shall be organized under effective written policies and procedures relating to personnel, equipment, materials, maintenance, and cleaning of all areas of the center.
Rulemaking Authority 395.1055 FS. Law Implemented 395.009, 395.1055, 395.1011 FS. History–New 12-12-96, Amended 9-28-14.
59A-5.011 Surveillance, Prevention, and Control of Infection.

(1) Each center shall establish an Infection Control Program involving members of the medical staff, nursing staff, other professional and administrative staff as appropriate. The program shall provide for:

(a) The surveillance, prevention, and control of infection among patients and personnel;

(b) The establishment of a system for identification, reporting, evaluating and maintaining records of infections;

(c) Ongoing review and evaluation of aseptic, isolation and sanitation techniques employed by the center; and,
(d) Development and coordination of training programs in infection control for all center personnel.

(2) Each center shall have written policies and procedures reflecting the scope of the infection control program outlined in subsection (1). The written policies and procedures shall be reviewed at least every two years by the infection control program members, dated at the time of each review, revised as necessary, and enforced.

(3) The policies and procedures devised by the infection control program shall be approved by the governing board, and shall contain at least the following:

(a) Specific policies for the shelf life of all stored sterile items.

(b) Specific policies and procedures related to occupational exposure to blood and body fluids.

(c) Specific policies related to the handling and disposal of biomedical waste in accordance with Chapter 64E-16, F.A.C. and, OSHA 29 CFR Part 1910.1030, Bloodborne Pathogens.
(d) Specific policies related to the selection, storage, handling, use and disposition of disposable items.

(e) Specific policies related to decontamination and sterilization activities performed at the center, including but not limited to a requirement that steam, gas (ETO) and hot air sterilizers be tested with live bacterial spores at least weekly.

(f) Specific policies regarding the indications for universal precautions, body substance isolation, CDC isolation guidelines, or equivalent and the types of isolation to be used for the prevention of the transmission of infectious diseases.

(g) A requirement that soiled linen be collected in such a manner as to minimize microbial dissemination into the environment.

(h) A requirement that all cases of communicable diseases as set forth in Chapter 64D-3, F.A.C., be promptly and properly reported in accordance with the provisions of that rule;

(4) The individuals involved in the infection control program shall meet at least quarterly, shall maintain written minutes of all meetings, and shall make a report at least annually to the quality assurance committee and the governing board.

(5) Each center shall establish an employee health policy to minimize the likelihood of transmission of communicable disease by both employees and patients. Such policies shall include, but not be limited to, work restrictions for an employee whenever it is likely that communicable disease may be transmitted, until such time as a medical practitioner certifies that the employee may return to work.

Rulemaking Authority 395.1055 FS. Law Implemented 395.1055 FS. History–New 6-14-78, Formerly 10D-30.11, Amended 2-3-88, Formerly 10D-30.011, Amended 11-13-95, 2-23-16.
59A-5.012 Medical Records.

(1) Each center shall establish processes to obtain, manage, and utilize information to enhance and improve individual and organizational performance in patient care, management, and support processes. Such processes shall:

(a) Be planned and designed to meet the center’s internal and external information needs;

(b) Provide for confidentiality, integrity and security;

(c) Provide education and training in information management principles to decision-makers and other center personnel who generate, collect, and analyze information; and,
(d) Provide for information in a timely and accurate manner;

(2) Each center shall have a medical records service, patient information system or similarly titled unit with administrative responsibility for medical records.

(3) The administrator shall appoint in writing a qualified person responsible for the medical records service. This person shall meet the qualifications established for this position, in writing, by the governing board.

(4) A current job description delineating duties and responsibilities shall be maintained for each medical records service position.

(5) The medical records service shall:

(a) Maintain a system of identification and filing to ensure the prompt location of a patient’s medical record. Patient records may be stored on electronic medium such as computer, microfilm or optical imaging;

(b) Maintain a current and complete medical record for every patient admitted to the center.

(c) All clinical information pertaining to the patient’s medical treatment shall be centralized in the patient’s medical record.

(d) Ensure that each medical record shall contain the following, as appropriate to the service provided:

1. Identification data;

2. Chief complaint;

3. Present illness;

4. Past personal history;

5. Family medical history;

6. Physical examination report;

7. Provisional and pre-operative diagnosis;

8. Clinical laboratory reports;

9. Radiology, diagnostic imaging, and ancillary testing reports;

10. Consultation reports;

11. Medical and surgical treatment notes and reports;

12. The appropriate informed consent signed by the patient;

13. Record of medication and dosage administered;

14. Tissue reports;

15. Physician orders;

16. Physician and nurse progress notes;

17. Final diagnosis;

18. Discharge summary; and,
19. Autopsy report, if appropriate.

(e) Ensure that:

1. Operative reports signed by the surgeon shall be recorded in the patient’s record immediately following surgery or that an operative progress note is entered in the patient record to provide pertinent information; and,
2. Postoperative information shall include vital signs, level of consciousness, medications, blood or blood components, complications and management of those events, identification of direct providers of care, discharge information from post-anesthesia care area.

(f) Index, and maintain on a current basis, all medical records according to surgical procedure and physician.

Rulemaking Authority 395.1055 FS. Law Implemented 395.1055, 395.3025 FS. History–New 6-14-78, Formerly 10D-30.12, 10D-30.012, Amended 11-13-95, 9-17-14.
59A-5.016 Physical Plant Maintenance.

(1) Each ambulatory surgical center shall establish written policies and procedures designed to maintain the physical plant and overall ambulatory surgical center environment in such a manner that the safety and well-being of patients is assured. The building and mechanical maintenance program shall be under the supervision of a qualified person.

(2) All mechanical and electrical equipment shall be maintained in working order, and shall be accessible for cleaning and inspection.

Rulemaking Authority 395.1055 FS. Law Implemented 395.001, 395.1055 FS. History–New 6-14-78, Formerly 10D-30.16, 10D-30.016, Amended 11-13-95.

59A-5.017 Fire Control.

(1) Each ambulatory surgical center shall provide fire protection through the elimination of fire hazards; the installation of necessary safeguards such as extinguishers, sprinkling devices, and fire and smoke barriers as described in Rule 59A-5.022, F.A.C., to insure rapid and effective fire control; and the adoption of written fire control plans rehearsed four (4) times a year by all personnel. To safeguard patients, the ambulatory surgical center shall have:

(a) Written evidence of regular inspection by local fire control agencies.

(b) Stairwells kept closed by fire doors equipped with self-closing devices.

(c) Annual check of fire extinguishers for type, replacement, and renewal dates.

(d) “No Smoking” signs prominently displayed in those areas where smoking is not permitted.

(e) Fire regulations and evacuation route prominently posted for each floor and department.

(2) Written fire control plan approved by the appropriate local fire authority shall contain provisions for prompt reporting of all fires; extinguishing fires; protection of patients, personnel and guests; evacuation; and cooperation with fire fighting authorities.

(3) There shall be rigidly enforced written rules and regulations governing proper routine methods of handling and storing oxidizing, combustible, and flammable explosive agents.

Rulemaking Authority 395.1055 FS. Law Implemented 395.001, 395.1055 FS. History–New 6-14-78, Formerly 10D-30.17, Amended 2-3-88, Formerly 10D-30.017, Amended 11-13-95.

59A-5.018 Comprehensive Emergency Management Plan.

(1) Each center shall develop and adopt a written comprehensive emergency management plan for emergency care during an internal or external disaster or emergency which it shall review and update annually.

(2) The emergency management plan shall be developed in conjunction with other agencies and providers of health care services within the local community pursuant to Section 252.32(2), F.S., and in accordance with the “Emergency Management Planning Criteria for Ambulatory Surgical Centers”, AHCA FORM 3130-2003 July 94, which is incorporated by reference. The form is available at: http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04454 and available from the Agency for Health Care Administration at:

http://ahca.myflorida.com/MCHQ/Health_Facility_Regulation/Hospital_Outpatient/forms/ASC_CEMP_Reconstructed_122104.pdf
The plan shall include:

(a) Provisions for internal and external disasters, and emergencies;

(b) A description of the center’s role in a community wide comprehensive emergency management plan;

(c) Information about how the center plans to implement specific procedures outlined in its comprehensive emergency management plan;

(d) Precautionary measures, including voluntary cessation of center operations, to be taken by the center in preparation and response to warnings of inclement weather, including hurricanes and tornadoes, or other potential emergency conditions.

(e) Provisions for the management of patients, including the discharge or transfer of patients and staff to a hospital or subacute care facility, at the direction of the center’s administrator, in the event of an evacuation order, or when a determination is made by the Agency that the condition of the center is sufficient to render it a hazard to the health and safety of patients and staff, pursuant to Chapter 59A-5, F.A.C. Such provisions shall address the role and responsibility of the physician in the decision to move or relocate patients;

(f) Provisions for coordinating with hospitals that would receive patients to be transferred;

(g) Provisions for the management of staff, including the distribution and assignment of responsibilities and functions, and the assignment of staff to accompany patients to a hospital or subacute care facility;

(h) A provision that a verification check will be made to ensure patients transferred to a hospital arrive at the designated hospital;

(i) A provision that ensures that copies of medical records and orders accompany patients transferred to a hospital;

(j) Provisions for the management of patients who may be treated at the center during an internal or external disaster or emergencies, including control of patient information and medical records, individual identification of patients, transfer of patients to hospital(s) and treatment of mass casualties;

(k) Provisions for contacting relatives and necessary persons advising them of patient location changes. A procedure must also be established for responding to inquiries from patient families and the press;

(l) A provision for educating and training personnel in carrying out their responsibilities in accordance with the adopted plan;

(m) Identification of mutual aid agreements or statements of understanding for services; and,
(n) Provisions for coordination with designated agencies.
(3) The plan, including appendices, as required by the “Emergency Management Planning Criteria for Ambulatory Surgical Centers”, shall be submitted annually to the county emergency management agency for review and approval. A fee may be charged for the review of the plan as authorized by Sections 252.35(2)(m) and 252.38(1)(e), F.S.

(a) The county emergency management agency has 60 days upon receipt of the plan, in which to review and approve the plan, or advise the center of necessary revisions. If the county emergency management agency advises the center of necessary revisions to the plan, those revisions shall be made as authorized by Section 395.1055(1)(c), F.S., and the plan shall be resubmitted to the county emergency management agency within 30 days of notification by the county emergency management agency.

(b) The county emergency management agency shall be the final administrative authority for emergency management plans developed by centers.

(4) The center shall test the implementation of the emergency management plan semiannually, either in response to an emergency or in a planned drill, and shall evaluate and document the center’s performance. This documentation must be on file at the center and available for inspection by the county emergency management agency and the Agency.

(5) The emergency management plan shall be available for immediate access by the staff.

(6) If a center evacuates during or after an emergency, the center shall not be reoccupied until a determination is made by the center’s administrator that the center can meet the needs of the patients. A center with significant structural damage shall not be reoccupied until approval is received from the Agency’s Office of Plans and Construction that the center can be safely occupied as required by the Florida Building Code.

(7) A center that must evacuate the premises due to a disaster or an emergency condition, shall report the evacuation to the Agency’s local area health facility regulation office within 24 hours or as soon as practical. The names and destination of patients relocated shall be provided to the county emergency management agency or its designee having responsibility for tracking the population at large. The licensee shall inform the Agency’s local area office of a contact person who will be available 24 hours a day, seven days a week, until the center is reoccupied.

Rulemaking Authority 395.1055 FS. Law Implemented 395.1055 FS. History–New 6-14-78, Formerly 10D-30.18, 10D-30.018, Amended 12-28-94, 9-17-14.
59A-5.019 Quality Assessment and Improvement.

(1) General Provisions. Each ambulatory surgical center shall have an ongoing quality assessment and improvement system designed to objectively and systematically monitor and evaluate the quality and appropriateness of patient care, and opportunities to improve its performance to enhance and improve the quality of care provided to the public.

(a) Such a system shall be based on the mission and plans of the organization, the needs and expectations of the patients and staff, up-to-date sources of information, and the performance of the processes and their outcomes.

(b) Each system for quality assessment and improvement, which shall include utilization review, must be defined in writing, approved by the governing board, and enforced, and shall include:

1. A written delineation of responsibilities for key staff;

2. A policy for all members of the organized medical staff, whereby staff members do not initially review their own cases for quality assessment and improvement program purposes;

3. A confidentiality policy;

4. Written, measurable criteria and norms;

5. A description of the methods used for identifying problems;

6. A description of the methods used for assessing problems, determining priorities for investigation, and resolving problems;

7. A description of the methods for monitoring activities to assure that the desired results are achieved and sustained; and,
8. Documentation of the activities and results of the program.

(2) Each center shall have in place a systematic process to collect data on process outcomes, priority issues chosen for improvement, and the satisfaction of the patient. Processes measured shall include:

(a) Appropriate surgical procedures;

(b) Preparation of patient for the procedure;

(c) Performance of the procedure and monitoring of the patient;

(d) Provision of post-operative care;

(e) Use of medications including administration and monitoring of effects;

(f) Risk management activities;

(g) Quality assessment and improvement activities including clinical laboratory services and radiology services;

(h) Results of autopsies if needed.

(3) Each center shall have a process to assess data collected to determine:

(a) The level and performance of existing activities and procedures,

(b) Priorities for improvement, and,
(c) Actions to improve performance.

(4) Each center shall have a process to incorporate quality assessment and improvement activities in existing ambulatory surgical center processes and procedures.

Rulemaking Authority 395.1055 FS. Law Implemented 395.1055 FS. History–New 11-13-95, Amended 2-23-16.
59A-5.021 Plans Submission and Fee Requirements.

(1) No construction work, including demolition, shall be started until prior written approval has been given by the Office of Plans and Construction. This includes all construction of new facilities and any and all additions, modifications, renovations, or refurbishment of the site, building, equipment or systems of all existing facilities. Approval to start construction will be granted by the Agency when the design complies with all applicable codes and standards as evidenced by a thorough examination of the documents submitted to the Agency as required for Stage III construction documents.

(2) Approval to start construction limited to demolition, site work, foundation, and building structural frame may be obtained prior to the approval of Stage III construction documents when the following is submitted for review and approval:
(a) A Preliminary Stage II approval letter from the Office of Plans and Construction granted by the Agency when the design complies with applicable life safety code requirements, flood requirements and the layout will accommodate all required functional spaces as evidenced by a thorough examination of the documents submitted to the Agency as required in this rule for Stage II preliminary plans.

(b) Construction documents, specifications and construction details for all work to be undertaken.
(c) A letter from the facility holding the agency harmless for any changes that may occur to the project as a result of the final construction document review.
(d) An infection control risk assessment (ICRA) and a life safety plan indicating temporary egress and detailed phasing plans indicating how the area(s) to be demolished or constructed is to be separated from all occupied areas shall be submitted when demolition or construction in and around occupied buildings is to be undertaken. Submissions that fail to provide an ICRA or depict the safety measures prescribed by the ICRA will not be approved.

(3) Construction must commence within 12 months of receiving approval from the Office of Plans and Construction to begin construction. Once construction begins construction activities should be continuous until the completion of the project. Failure to commence construction within 12 months of plan approval or periods of construction inactivity exceeding 12 months following commencement of construction will result in termination of the project. Restarting a terminated project will require resubmission of the construction documents accompanied by a new plan review application and will be subject to all fees prescribed by Section 395.0163, F.S. Projects which have not received approval to begin construction will be considered abandoned following 12 months of inactivity and the project will be terminated.
(4) When construction is planned, either for new buildings or additions, alterations or renovations to existing buildings, the plans and specifications shall be prepared and submitted to the Office of Plans and Construction for approval by the appropriate Florida-registered design professionals as required by the Florida Building Code, Chapters 471, and 481, F.S. All architecture or engineering firms not practicing as a sole proprietor shall also be registered as an architecture or engineering firm with the Florida Department of Business and Professional Regulation.
(5) The initial submission of plans to the Office of Plans and Construction for any new project shall include a completed Application for Plan Review, AHCA Form 3500-0011, June 2014, incorporated by reference and available at https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-05456, and a valid Certificate of Need if required by the agency. This information shall accompany the initial submission. Projects requiring a Certificate of Need will not be approved to begin construction without a valid Certificate of Need. Applications for Plan Review are available from the Agency for Health Care Administration, Office of Plans and Construction, 2727 Mahan Drive, Mail Stop #24, Tallahassee, Florida 32308, or at the web address at: http://ahca.myflorida.com/MCHQ/HQALicensureForms/index.shtml
(6) Plans and specifications submitted for review shall be subject to plan review fees prescribed by Section 395.0163, F.S. All fees shall be payable to the Agency for Health Care Administration and shall annotate the Office of Plans and Construction and the facility log number. Fees are not refundable.
(7) Plans and specifications may be submitted for review at any of the three stages of development described in this rule. 

(8) For each stage of submission, a program or scope of work shall be submitted. It shall consist of a detailed written description of all contemplated work and any required phasing and shall identify the types of medical services to be provided. 
(9) For projects involving only equipment changes or system renovations, only Stage III, construction documents will be accepted. These documents shall include the following:

(a) Life safety plans showing the fire/smoke compartments in the area of renovation.

(b) Detailed phasing plans indicating how the new work will be separated from all occupied areas.

(c) Engineering plans and specifications for all of the required work.

(10) Stage I, Schematic Plans.  
(a) The following shall be incorporated into the schematic plans:
1. Single-line drawings of each floor that indicates the relationship of the various activities or services to each other and the room arrangement in each.
2. The function of each room or space shall be noted in or near the room or space.
3. The proposed roads and walkways, service and entrance courts, parking, and orientation shown on either a small plot plan or on the first floor plan.
4. A simple cross-section diagram showing the anticipated construction.
5. A schematic life safety plan showing smoke and fire compartments, exits, exit passageways and gross areas of required smoke and fire compartments. 
6. Indicate which areas are sprinklered, both new and existing.
(b) If the proposed construction is an addition or is otherwise related to existing buildings on the site, the schematic plans shall show the facilities and general arrangement of those buildings.
(c) If the project involves increasing, decreasing, relocating or transferring licensed beds, a schedule showing the total number of beds, types of bedrooms and types of ancillary spaces must be provided.
(11) Stage II, Preliminary Plans.
The following shall be incorporated into the preliminary plans.
(a) A Vicinity Map. For new ambulatory surgery center construction, provide a vicinity map showing the major local highway intersections.
(b) Site Development Plans.
(c) Plans depicting existing grades and proposed improvements.
(d) Building location dimensions.
(e) Location of the fire protection services water source to the building.
(f) Architectural Plans.
1. Floor plans, 1/8-inch scale minimum, showing door swings, windows, case work and mill work, fixed equipment and plumbing fixtures. Indicate the function of each space.
2. Typical large-scale interior and exterior wall sections to include typical rated fire and fire/smoke partitions and a typical corridor partition.
3. All exterior building elevations.
(g) Equipment which is not included in the construction contract that requires mechanical or electrical service connections or construction modifications shall be identified to assure coordination with the architectural, mechanical and electrical phases of construction.

(h) If the project is located in an occupied facility, preliminary phasing plans indicating how the project is to be separated from all occupied areas.
(i) Life Safety Plans.
1. Life safety plans must include the following: 
a. Single-sheet floor plans depicting required fire and smoke compartmentation, all means of egress and all exit signs. If smoke compartmentation is required, depict and provide the dimension for the longest path of travel in each smoke compartment to the door(s) accessing the nearest adjoining smoke compartment, calculate the total area of the smoke compartment in square feet, and tabulate exit inches.
b. All sprinklered areas.

c. All fire extinguishers.

d. All fire alarm devices and pull station locations.

2. If the project is an addition, or conversion of an existing building, fully developed life safety plans must be submitted.
3. If the project is a renovation in an existing building, life safety plans of the floor being renovated and the required exit egress floor(s) must be submitted.
4. When demolition or construction in and around occupied buildings will be undertaken, a life safety plan indicating temporary egress, and detailed phasing plans indicating how the area(s) to be demolished or constructed will be separated from all occupied areas must be submitted. 
(j) Mechanical Engineering Plans.

1. Single-sheet floor plans with a one-line diagram of the ventilating system with relative pressures of each space. Provide a written description and drawings of the anticipated smoke control system, passive or active, and a sequence of operation correlated with the life safety plans.
2. The general location of all fire and smoke dampers, all duct smoke detectors and fire stats.

3. If the building is equipped with fire sprinklers, indicate the location of the sprinkler system risers and the point of connection for the fire sprinkler system. State the method of design for the existing and new fire sprinkler systems.
4. The locations of all plumbing fixtures and other items of equipment requiring plumbing services and/or gas services.
5. The locations of any fume, radiological or chemical hoods.

6. The locations of all medical gas outlets, piping distribution risers, terminals, alarm panel(s), low pressure emergency oxygen connection, isolation/zone valve(s), and gas source location(s). 
7. The locations and relative size of major items of mechanical equipment such as chillers, air handling units, fire pumps, medical gas storage, boilers, vacuum pumps, air compressors and fuel storage vessels.

8. The locations of hazardous areas and the volume of products to be contained therein.

9. The location of fire pump, stand pipes, and sprinkler riser(s).
(k) Electrical Engineering Drawings.
1. A one-line diagram of normal and essential electrical power systems showing service transformers and entrances, switchboards, transfer switches, distribution feeders and over-current devices, panel boards and step-down transformers. The diagram shall include a preliminary listing and description of new and existing, normal and emergency loads, preliminary estimates of available short-circuit current at all new equipment and existing equipment serving any new equipment, short-circuit and withstand ratings of existing equipment serving new loads and any new or revised grounding requirements.
2. Show fire alarm zones and correlate with the life safety plan.

(l) Outline Specifications. Outline specifications must include a general description of the construction, including construction classification and ratings of components, interior finishes, general types and locations of acoustical material, floor coverings, ventilating equipment, plumbing fixtures, fire protection equipment, medical gas equipment and electrical equipment.
(m) Whenever an existing building is to be converted to a health care facility, the general layout of spaces of the existing structure shall be submitted with the preliminary plans for the proposed facility.

(n) Whenever an addition, alteration, renovation or remodeling to an existing facility is proposed, the general layout of spaces of the existing facility shall be submitted with the preliminary plans.
(12) Stage III, Construction Documents.
The Stage III, construction documents shall be an extension of the Stage II, preliminary plan submission and shall provide a complete description of the contemplated construction. Construction documents shall be signed, sealed and dated and submitted for written approval to the Office of Plans and Construction by a Florida-registered architect and Florida-registered professional engineer. These documents shall consist of work related to civil, structural, mechanical, and electrical engineering, fire protection, lightning protection, landscape architecture and all architectural work. In addition to the requirements for Stage II submission, the following shall be incorporated into the construction documents:

(a) Site and civil engineering plans indicating building and site elevations, site utilities, paving plans, grading and drainage plans and details, locations of the two fire hydrants utilized to perform the water supply flow test, and landscaping plans.

(b) Life safety plans for the entire project. Projects located on floors above or below the exit discharge level must also include life safety plans for the exit discharge serving the project area.
(c) Architectural Plans.
1. Typical large-scale details of all typical interior and exterior walls and smoke walls, horizontal exits and exit passageways.

2. Comprehensive ceiling plans that show all utilities, lighting fixtures, smoke detectors, ventilation devices, sprinkler head locations and fire-rated ceiling suspension member locations where applicable.

3. Floor/ceiling and roof/ceiling assembly descriptions for all conditions.
4. Details and other instructions to the contractor on the construction documents describing the techniques to be used to seal floor construction penetrations necessary to prevent smoke migration from floor to floor during a fire.

(d) Structural engineering plans, schedules and details.
(e) Mechanical engineering plans including fire and smoke control plans. Include all equipment that requires mechanical utilities. Provide a clear and concise narrative control sequence of operations for each item of mechanical equipment including but not limited to air conditioning, heating, ventilation, medical gas, plumbing, and fire protection and any interconnection of the equipment of the systems. Mechanical engineering drawings shall depict completely the systems to be utilized, whether new or existing, from the point of system origination to termination. Provide a tabular schedule giving the required air flow (as computed from the information contained on the ventilation rate table) in cubic feet per minute (cfm) for supply, return, exhaust, outdoor, and ventilation air for each space, as applicable, shown on the architectural documents. The schedule shall also contain the HVAC system design air flow rates and the resulting space relative pressures. The schedule or portion of the schedule as applicable shall be placed on each floor plan drawing sheet containing the spaces depicted on the drawing.
(f) Fire protection system layout documents as defined by the Department of Business and Professional Regulation in Rule 61G15-32.002, F.A.C., where applicable, that shall include the existing system as necessary to define the new work. These documents shall be signed and sealed by a Florida-registered professional engineer.

(g) Electrical engineering plans describing complete power, lighting, alarm, communications and lightning protection systems and power system study. 
(h) A power study that shall include a fault study complete with calculations to demonstrate that over-current devices, transfer switches, switchboards, panel boards, motor controls, transformers and feeders are adequately sized to safely withstand available phase-to-phase and phase-to-ground faults. The study shall also include an analysis of generator performance under fault conditions and a coordination study resulting in the tabulation of settings for all over-current device adjustable trips, time delays, relays and ground fault coordination. This must be provided for all new equipment and existing equipment serving any new equipment. Power studies for renovations of existing distribution systems shall include only new equipment and existing equipment upstream to the normal and emergency sources of the new equipment. Renovations involving only branch circuit panel boards without modifications to the feeder do not require a full power study; instead, the power study shall be limited to the calculation of new and existing loads of the branch circuit panel.
(13) A complete set of specifications for all work to be undertaken. 
(a) All project required contractor supplied testing and/or certification reports shall be submitted in writing, on standard forms, reviewed and accepted by the Engineer of Record prior to presenting to the agency for review.

(b) The specifications shall require a performance verification test and balance air quantity values report with the specified air filters installed for each air handling unit system operating in the minimum pressure drop condition (clean filter state) and at the maximum pressure drop condition (dirty filter state).

(14) All construction documents shall be coordinated to provide consistency of design intent throughout the documents and phasing plans shall be clear and provide continuity of required services. It is specifically required that in the case of additions to existing institutions, the mechanical and electrical, especially existing essential electrical systems and all other pertinent conditions shall be a part of this submission.
(a) All subsequent addenda, change orders, field orders and other documents altering the above shall also be signed, sealed and dated and submitted in advance to the Office of Plans and Construction for review. The Agency will either approve or disapprove the submission based on compliance with all applicable codes and standards and shall provide a listing of deficiencies in writing.
(b) All submissions will be acted upon by the agency within 60 days of the receipt of properly executed construction documents and the initial payment of the plan review fee. The Agency will either approve or disapprove the submission and shall provide a listing of deficiencies in writing. All deficiencies noted by the agency must be satisfactorily corrected before final approval will be provided from the Agency.
(15) Additions or revisions that increase the scope of the project work greater than fifty percent or change the original scope of the project more than fifty percent will be required to be submitted as a new project.
(16) Record Drawings. Within 60 days after final approval of the project has been obtained from the agency, the Office of Plans and Construction shall be provided with a complete set of legible record drawings showing all of the construction, fixed equipment and the mechanical and electrical systems as installed. These drawings shall include the life safety plans. Record drawings may be submitted electronically in Portable Document Format (PDF). If record drawings are not received within this time frame specified in this section, only the construction document and project file will be retained. 
Rulemaking Authority 395.1055 FS. Law Implemented 395.0163, 471.025, 481.221, 553.73, 633.033 FS. History–New 6-14-78, Formerly 10D-30.21, Amended 2-3-88, 5-6-92, Formerly 10D-30.021, Amended 11-12-96, 7-9-15.
59A-5.022 Physical Plant Requirements for Ambulatory Surgical Centers.

(1) The Agency provides technical assistance to the Florida Building Commission and the State Fire Marshal in developing and maintaining standards for the design and construction of ambulatory surgery centers. These standards are included in the following:
(a) The building codes in Rule 61G20-1.001, F.A.C.; as adopted by the Florida Building Commission.

(b) The fire codes in Chapter 69A-60, F.A.C.; as adopted by the State Fire Marshal.

(c) The handicap accessibility standards in Chapter 553, Part V, F.S. and Rule 61G20-4.002, F.A.C; as adopted by the Florida Building Commission.

(2) No building shall be converted to a licensed ambulatory surgery center unless it complies with the standards and codes in effect when the building is converted.
(3) Local codes which set more stringent standards or add additional requirements shall take precedence over these standards and requirements as set forth in this section. Contact the Office of Plans and Construction when conflicts occur.
Rulemaking Authority 395.1055 FS. Law Implemented 395.1055 FS. History–New 6-14-78, Formerly 10D-30.22, Amended 2-3-88, Formerly 10D-30.022, Amended 6-11-97, 7-9-15.
