Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

Section |
Notice of Development of Proposed Rules
and Negotiated Rulemaking

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Pharmacy

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

64B16-28.607  Automated Pharmacy System — Long-Term
Care, Hospice, and Prison

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes the rule

amendment to update language regarding security

requirements.

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Automated

Pharmacy System — Long Term Care, Hospice, and Prison.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 465.005, 465.022 FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 465.019, 465.022, 465.0235 FS.

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE

REGISTER.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Jennifer

Wenhold, Executive Director, Board of Pharmacy, 4052 Bald

Cypress Way, Bin C08, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258.

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE

DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE FROM

THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE.

Section 11
Proposed Rules

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
Division of Air Resource Management

RULE NO.: 62-204.800

RULE TITLE  Federal Regulations Adopted by Reference
PURPOSE, EFFECT AND SUMMARY: The proposed rule
amendments update the Department’s adoption by reference of
air pollution regulations promulgated by the U.S.
Environmental Protection Agency (EPA) at Title 40, Code of
Federal Regulations (C.F.R.), to incorporate requirements of
the Department's federally approved and delegated air pollution
programs. These rule amendments include deletion of obsolete
and unnecessary federal regulations that the Department had
previously adopted by reference and streamlines adoptions by
reference where appropriate.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY:: 403.061, 403.8055, FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 403.061, 403.087, 403.8055, FS.

THIS RULEMAKING IS UNDERTAKEN PURSUANT TO
SECTION 403.8055, F.S. WRITTEN COMMENTS MAY BE
SUBMITTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS
NOTICE TO: Terri Long, Division of Air Resource
Management, 2600 Blair Stone Road, MS 5500, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-2400, or Terri.Long@dep.state.fl.us.
SUBSTANTIALLY AFFECTED PERSONS MAY WITHIN
14 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS NOTICE, FILE AN
OBJECTION TO THIS RULEMAKING WITH THE
ENVIRONMENTAL  REGULATION  COMMISSION,
ADMINISTRATIVE ASSISTANT, DEP, MS 35, 3900
COMMONWEALTH BOULEVARD, TALLAHASSEE,
FLORIDA 32399-3000. THE OBJECTION SHALL SPECIFY
THE PORTIONS OF THE PROPOSED RULE TO WHICH
THE PERSON OBJECTS AND THE SPECIFIC REASONS
FOR THE OBJECTION.

62-204.800 Federal Regulations Adopted by Reference.
All federal regulations cited throughout the air pollution rules
of the Department are adopted and incorporated by reference in
this rule. The purpose and effect of each such federal regulation
is determined by the context in which it is cited. Procedural and
substantive requirements in the incorporated federal regulations
are binding as a matter of state law only where the context so
provides. Copies of the reference materials may be obtained by
writing to the Department of Environmental Protection,
Division of Air Resource Management, 2600 Blair Stone Road,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400, or by calling (850) 717-9000.

(1) Title 40, Code of Federal Regulations, Part 50, National
Primary and Secondary Ambient Air Quality Standards.

(@) The provisions of 40 C.F.R. Part 50, §850.1 through
50.1950-18, revised as of July 1, 2016
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
08863), are adopted and incorporated by reference.

(b) Appendices A-1 through UF of 40 C.F.R. Part 50,
revised as of July 1, 2016
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
08863), are adopted and incorporated by reference.

(2) No change.

(3) Title 40, Code of Federal Regulations, Part 52,
Approval and Promulgation of Implementation Plans. The
following subparts of 40 C.F.R. Part 52, are adopted and
incorporated by reference:

(a) No change.

(b) 40 C.F.R. Part 52, Subpart K, Florida; revised as of July
1, 2017
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
09693); amended July 3, 2017, at 82 FR 30749
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
08898); amended July 3, 2017, at 82 FR 30767
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
08897); amended July 21, 2017, at 82 FR 33807

2959


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=307
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B16-28.607
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=465.005
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20465.022%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=465.019
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20465.022
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20465.0235%20FS.
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08863
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08863
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08863
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08863
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09693
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09693
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08898
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08898
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08897
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08897

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
08899); amended August 10, 2017, at 82 FR 37310
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
08902), amended October 6, 2017 at 82 FR 46682
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
08900); amended October 16, 2017 at 82 FR 47983
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
09804); amended April 2, 2018 at 83 FR 13875
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
09802); amended April 18, 2018 at 83 FR 17081
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
09803); amended September 11, 2018 at 83 FR 45836 (link);
amended September 25, 2018 at 83 FR 48387 (link); amended
April 11, 2019 at 84 FR 14615 (link); amended May 24, 2019
at 84 FR 17085 (link).

(4) through (7) No change.

(8) Title 40, Code of Federal Regulations, Part 60,
Standards of Performance for New Stationary Sources.

(@) Definitions. For the purposes of subsection 62-
204.800(8), F.A.C., the definitions contained in the various
provisions of 40 C.F.R. Part 60 adopted herein shall apply,
except that the term “Administrator,” when used in any
provision of 40 C.F.R. Part 60 that is delegated to the
Department by the U.S. Environmental Protection Agency,
shall mean the Secretary or the Secretary’s designee.

(b) through (c) No change.

(d) Appendices Adopted. The following appendices of 40
C.F.R. Part 60, revised as of July 1, 20172009, or later as
specifically indicated, are adopted and incorporated by
reference:

1. through 8. No change.

9. 40 C.F.R. Part 60, Appendix B, Performance
Specifications;  revised as of July 1, 2017
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
09711); amended Awugust 7, 2017, at 82 FR 36688
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
09805); amended September 17, 2017 at 82 FR 44106 (link).

10. through 12. No change.

(9) Title 40, Code of Federal Regulations, Part 60,
Emission Guidelines and Compliance Times. This subsection
contains regulatory language that implements EPA’s Emission
Guidelines for various source categories. These regulations
have been submitted to EPA as Clean Air Act Section 111(d)
State Plans. EPA’s approvals of Florida’s 111(d) State Plans are
codified at 40 C.F.R. Part 62, Subpart K which are hereby
adopted and incorporated by reference, revised as of July 1,
2017 (http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-

(10) Title 40, Code of Federal Regulations, Part 61,
National Emission Standards for Hazardous Air Pollutants.

(a) No change.

(b) Standards Adopted. The following National Emission
Standards for Hazardous Air Pollutants contained in 40 C.F.R.
Part 61, revised as of July 1, 20172001, or later as specifically
indicated, are adopted and incorporated by reference:

1. 40 C.F.R. Part 61, Subpart C, Beryllium; revised as of
July 1, 2017 (link) amended—l;ebruapy—y—z@M—lg—FR—]r}zZZ
04926).

2. 40 C.F.R. Part 61, Subpart D, Beryllium Rocket Motor
Firing;_revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) amended-February27;

n
2014 79 ER 11227
204 t 2L

04926)

3.40 C.F.R. Part 61, Subpart E, Mercury; revised as of July
1, 2017 (link) amended—February 272014, 79 FR 11227
04926).

4. 40 C.F.R. Part 61, Subpart F, Vinyl Chloride; revised as
of July 1, 2017 (link) exeept—that-theSecretary—is—not-the

Administrator for the purposes-0f 40-C.F-R. §61.66.
5. 40 C.F.R. Part 61, Subpart J, Equipment Leaks (Fugitive

Emission Sources) of Benzene; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link),

6. 40 C.F.R. Part 61, Subpart K, Radionuclide Emissions
From Elemental Phosphorous Plants; revised as of July 1, 2017
(link).

7. 40 C.F.R. Part 61, Subpart L, Benzene Emissions from
Coke By-Product Recovery Plants; revised as of July 1, 2017
(link), exceptthatthe-Secretary-is-not-the-Administratorforthe
purposes-of 40-C.F.R.§61.136(d).

8. 40 C.F.R. Part 61, Subpart M, Asbestos; revised as of

July 1, 2017 (link); amendedéep&en%er—%—zges—at—%—FR

09694).

(@) through (h) No change.

)—Designated—Faeility Plan—Florida’s—state—plan—for
mplementing—the—Emission—Guidelines—as—approved-by—the

2960

§61—L49{e}€29—49—€—|'=R—§61—159{a}(®—49—€—|;R—§61—15}(e}



http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08899
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08899
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08902
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08902
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08900
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08900
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09804
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09804
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09802
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09802
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09803
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09803
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09711
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09711
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09805
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09805
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09694
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09694
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

§61.155(a);-and except that DEP Form Number 62-257.900(1)
shall be used in lieu of the form identified as Figure 3 in 40
C.F.R. §61.145.

9. 40 C.F.R. Part 61, Subpart N, Inorganic Arsenic
Emission From Glass Manufacturing Plants; revised as of July
1, 2017 (link) amended—February27.2014 79 FR-11227
04926).

10. 40 C.F.R. Part 61, Subpart O, Inorganic Arsenic
Emissions From Primary Copper Smelters; revised as of July 1,
2017 (link).

11. 40 C.F.R. Part 61, Subpart P, Inorganic Arsenic
Emissions From Arsenic Trioxide and Metallic Arsenic
Production Facilities; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link).

12. 40 C.F.R. Part 61, Subpart V, Equipment Leaks
(Fugitive Emissions Sources) ; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link).

13.40 C.F.R. Part 61, Subpart Y, Benzene Emissions From
Benzene Storage Vessels; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)

07789): are adopted and incorporated by reference; except for
40 C.F.R. 861.08 and—except-that-the Secretaryis—hot-the
Administrator-for-the purposes-of 40-C-F-R-861.0440-C-FR-
§61411and40-CFR. §61-18. In lieu of the process set forth in
40 C.F.R. 861.08, the Department will follow the permit
processing procedures of rule 62-4.055, F.A.C.

(e) Appendices Adopted. Fhefollewing Aappendices A, B
and C of 40 C.F.R. Part 61, revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)
2001, or later as specifically indicated; are adopted and
incorporated by reference:

: ; g or_t!

14. 40 C.F.R. Part 61, Subpart BB, Benzene Emissions

From Benzene Transfer Operations; revised as of July 1, 2017

(link):-exeeptthat-the-Secretary-is-not the-Administratorfor- the
15. 40 C.F.R. Part 61, Subpart FF, Benzene Waste
Operations; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) amended

(c) The National Emission Standards for Hazardous Air
Pollutants adopted by reference in this rule shall be controlling
over other standards in the air pollution rules of the Department,
except that any emissions limiting standard contained in or
determined pursuant to the air pollution rules of the Department
which is more stringent than one contained in a National
Emission Standard, or which regulates pollutants or emissions
units not regulated by an applicable National Emission
Standard, shall apply.

(d) General Provisions Adopted. The general provisions of
40 C.F.R. Part 61, Subpart A, revised as of July 1, 2017 (link);

(11) Title 40, Code of Federal Regulations, Part 63,
National Emission Standards for Hazardous Air Pollutants for
Source Categories.

(a) No change.

(b) Standards Adopted. The following National Emission
Standards for Hazardous Air Pollutants contained in 40 C.F.R.
Part 63, revised as of July 1, 20172009, or later as specifically
indicated, are adopted and incorporated by reference:

1. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart F, Organic Hazardous Air
Pollutants From the Synthetic Organic Chemical
Manufacturing Industry; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) except

; : - , 5

2. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart G, Organic Hazardous Air

Pollutants From the Synthetic Organic Manufacturing Industry
for Process Vents, Storage Vessels, Transfer Operations, and
Wastewater; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) amended-February

27 2014 79 [ ] 11227
Z15 Iy L~ LI —

3. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart H, Organic Hazardous Air
Pollutants for Equipment Leaks; revised as of July 1, 2017

(link) exeept-that-the-Secretary—is—not-the-Administratorfor

2961


https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02487
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02487
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04925
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04925
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07789
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07789
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07789
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07789
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

through-(4).

4. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart I, Organic Hazardous Air
Pollutants for Certain Processes Subject to the Negotiated
Regulation for Equipment Leaks; revised as of July 1, 2017
(link) except-that-the-Secretary—is—not-the-Administratorfor
purposes-of the authoritiescited—at 40-C.F-R.8863.193(c)}{1)
through-(4}.

5. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart J, Polyvinyl Chloride and
Copolymers Production; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) execept

& Secrer 58 E ;; EEFIEE;?;“E

6. 40 C.F.R. Part 63 Subpart L, Coke Oven Batteries;
revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) execept-thatthe-Secretary-is-not
the-Administrator—for-purposes—of the-authoritiescited-at-40

7. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart M, Perchloroethylene Dry

Cleaning Facilities; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) except-that
5 . | - ‘ £ 1l

8. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart N, Chromium Emissions

From Hard and Decorative Chromium Electroplating and
Chromium Anodizing Tanks; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)

through-(4}.
13. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart T, Halogenated Solvent
Cleaning; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) except-that-the
| YIS ) G.F.R.§563.470(c)1) I n
14. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart U, Group | Polymers and

Resins; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) amended—Ap#H—%l—

2011 at 76 22666
££909

[\~ = ot | \

15. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart W, Epoxy Resins
Production and Non-Nylon Polyamides Production; revised as

of July 1, 2017 (link) exeept—that-theSecretary—is—not-the
Administratorfor-purposes-of-the-authorities-cited-at- 40- CFR-
§863-529(e)(1)-through-{4).

16. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart X, Secondary Lead
Smelters; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)

2012 at 77 ER

A~ F 5 T u

()‘)..

9. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart O, Ethylene Oxide Emissions
Standards for Sterilization Facilities; revised as of July 1, 2017

17. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart Y, Marine Tank Vessel
Loading Operations; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) amended

Anrll ‘71 2041 at 76 ER 22506
at 200

va.a.

(link) amended—February 272014 79 FR 11227
04925): ; - -
through-(4}.
10. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart Q, Industrial Process
Cooling Towers; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) exeeptthat
E . I - : :

11. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart R, Gasoline Distribution

Facilities (Bulk Gasoline Terminals and Pipeline Breakout
Stations); revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) except-that-the
12. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart S, Pulp and Paper Industry;

revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) amended-September11,-2012;
at 77 FR 55698

2962

18. through 19. No change.
20. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart CC, Petroleum Refineries
revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) amended-June-30,-2010,at75

37730
Oo9



http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02487
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02487
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02487
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02487
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04927
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04927
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07798
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07798
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03498
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03498
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07798
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07798
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07799
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07799

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

through-(4).
21. No change.
22. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart EE, Magnetic Tape
Manufacturing Operations; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)
| : . \dmini :

23. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart GG, Aerospace

Manufacturing and Rework Facilities; revised as of July 1, 2017

24. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart HH, Oil and Natural Gas
Production Facilities (Includes Appendix to Subpart HH);

revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) amended-August-16;2012,at

ik ER 490489
G4I40Y

LI By

25. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart Il, Shipbuilding and Ship
Repair (Surface Coating); revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)

26. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart JJ, Wood Furniture
Manufacturing Operations; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)

27.40 C F.R. Part 63, Subpart KK, Printing and Publishing
In dustry revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) amended-April2L;
20

at ER 220A6
76 =< ££969

28. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart LL, Primary Aluminum
Reduction Plants; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) except-that
5 - | - ‘ -

29. No change.
30. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart OO, Tanks-Level 1; revised

as of July 1, 2017 (link) exeept—tha{—theéeeretapy—ls—net—the
§863-908(c)(1)-through-(4}.

31. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart PP, Containers; revised as
of Julv 1, 2017 (link) exeept—tha{—theéeepetapy—is—net—the
§863-929(c)(1)-through(4).

32.40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart QQ, Surface Impoundments;
revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) except-thatthe-Secretary-is-not
the-Administratorfor-purposes-of-the-authorities—cited-at-40

33. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart RR, Individual Drain
Systems; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) except-that-the
: N — ‘ ‘

34. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart SS, Closed Vent Systems,

Control Devices, Recovery Devices and Routing to a Fuel Gas
System or a Process; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) exeept

: : ; e : :

35. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart TT, Equipment Leaks —

Control Level 1; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) exceptthatthe

; - : ,

36. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart UU, Equipment Leaks —

Control Level 2 Standards; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)

: . | - "
o).

37. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart VV, Oil-Water Separators
and Organic-Water Separators; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)

. I - :

“.

38. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart WW, Storage Vessels
(Tanks) — Control Level 2; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)

E . | - "
5}

39. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart XX, Ethylene
Manufacturing Process Units: Heat Exchange Systems and
Waste Operations; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) exeept-that
| . | trnini F :

40. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart YY, Generic Maximum

Achievable Control Technology Standards; revised as of July

1, 2017 (link) exceptthatthe-Secretary-is-notthe-Administrator
for—purposes—of —the —authorities—cited—at—40—C.FR.
§863-1114(b)(1)through+(5).

2963


https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07809
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07809
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07810
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07810
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02487
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02487
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

41. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart CCC, Steel Pickling — HCL
Process Facilities and Hydrochloric Acid Regeneration Plants;

revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) amended-September-19,2012;

at 77 [ ] 582190
LA QUL

42. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart DDD, Mineral Wool
Production; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) amended—luly—%&

at 80 ER

IOy T

43. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart EEE, Hazardous Waste

Combustors; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) execept-that-the
. - F :

44. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart GGG, Pharmaceuticals

Production; revised as of July 1, 2017 (Ilnk) amended-Apri-21;

2011 at 76 226566
(S-F Z£900

<

45, 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart HHH, Natural Gas

Transmission and Storage Facilities {(tacludes—Appendix—to
Subpart—HHH); revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) amended
Avgust——16— 2042 at—— 77— FR— 49489
) I - —_ :
through-(4}.
46. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart Ill, Flexible Polyurethane
Foam Production; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) execeptthat

) - , :

47.40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart JJJ, Group IV Polymers and

Resins; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) amended-March-27;

2014 at 7Q ER 17339
LTIy at L) =< TooY

48. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart LLL, Portland Cement
Manufacturing Industry; revised as of July 1, 2017
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
09699); amended August 22, 2017, at 82 FR 39671

2964

(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
09809); amended July 25, 2018, at 83 FR 35122 (link);
amended August 3, 2018, at 83 FR 38036 (link).

49. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart MMM, Pesticide Active
Ingredient Production; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)

50. No change.
51. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart OOO, Manufacture of
Amino/Phenolic Resins; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) except

52. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart PPP, Polyether Polyols

Production; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) amended-March

at 79 ER 17330
1< ooY

L5 o [\~ o T

53. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart QQQ, Primary Copper

Smelting; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) except-that-the
- — ‘ ¢

54. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart RRR, Secondary Aluminum

Production; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) amended-February

27 2014 79 ER 11227

ULy

55. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart TTT, Primary Lead
Smelting; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) amended-November

15 20141 at 76 ER 70834
05 1< oOo4

[\~ = ot 1O T

1720): : - trnini ‘
through-(4).

56. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart UUU, Catalytic Cracking
Units, Catalytic Reforming Units, and Sulfur Recovery Units;
revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) amended-Becember1,-2015,at

0 ER 75178
oY =< oo



http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02487
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02487
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07811
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07811
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02487
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02487
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04932
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04932
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09699
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09699
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09809
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09809
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04932
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04932
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04932
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04932
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07814
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07814
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07798
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07798
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07799
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07799

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

through-(5).

57. No change.

58. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart XXX, Ferroalloys
Production: Ferromanganese and Silicomanganese; revised as

69. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart MMMM, Surface Coating

of Miscellaneous Metal Parts and Products; revised as of July
1,2017 (Imk)exeepuhauhe%eem&awmmhe%mm&rate;

of July 1, 2017 (link) revised—as—ef—July—1—2016

59. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart AAAA, Municipal Solid
Waste Landfills; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) exceptthatthe
: . A o ‘ ‘

60. No change.

61. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart DDDD, Plywood and

Composite Wood Products; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)
| . rmini F
.

62. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart EEEE, Organic Liquids
Distribution (Non-Gasoline); revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)
4.

63. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart FFFF, Miscellaneous
Organic Chemical Manufacturing; revised as of July 1, 2017
(link) exeept—that—theéeepetapy—m—net—the—Admwstrater—fer
through-(4).

64. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart GGGG, Solvent Extraction
for Vegetable Oil Production; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)

| é . trnini "
&)

65. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart HHHH, Wet-Formed

Fiberglass Mat Productions; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)
| . trrini F
.

66. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart Illl, Surface Coating of

Automobiles and Light-Duty Trucks; revised as of July 1, 2017

§863.3980(c)(1)-through-(4).

70. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart NNNN, Surface Coating of
Large Appliances; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) except-that
he S - he Admini ‘ ‘

71. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart OOOO, Printing, Coating,

and Dyeing of Fabrics and Other Textiles; revised as of July 1,

2017 (link) exeept—that—the%eeretapy—rsﬂet—the—Adﬂmmstram
§863.4370{c){1)through(4).

72. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart PPPP, Surface Coating of

Plastic Parts and Products; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)

: . | - "
4.

73. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart QQQQ, Surface Coating of
Wood Building Products; revised as of July 1, 2017
(Lk)exeept—that—the%eeretary—rs—net—the—Admmsfcrater—fer
through-(4).

74. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart RRRR, Surface Coating of
Metal Furniture; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) exceptthatthe

: — . i

75. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart SSSS, Surface Coating of

Metal Coil; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) execept-that-the

: . g . .

76. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart TTTT, Leather Finishing
Operations, revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) except-that-the
: . - : .

77. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart UUUU, Cellulose Products

Manufacturing; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) amended

( |nk)exeep{—that—theéeeretapy—+s4et—the—Adm+mstra¥er—fe¥
through-(4).

67. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart JJJJ, Paper and Other Web
Coating; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) execept—that-the

68. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart KKKK, Surface Coating of

Metal Cans; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) except-that-the

78. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart VVVV, Boat
Manufacturing, revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) exceptthatthe
. - ﬁ :

79. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart WWWW, Reinforced

Plastic Composites Production; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)

2965


http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08881
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08881
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08908
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08908
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

I . rnini ‘
“.

80. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart XXXX, Rubber Tire
Manufacturing; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) exceptthat-the

. e : ;

81. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart YYYY, Stationary

Combustion Turbines; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) exeept

: : - , :

82. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart ZZZZ7, Stationary

Reciprocating Internal Combustion Engines; revised as of July
1, 2016 (link) amended—March—3,—2010—at75FR-9648

83. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart AAAAA, Lime
Manufacturing Plants; revised as of July 1, 2016 (link) except
he S . - ‘ ‘

84. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart BBBBB, Semiconductor

Manufacturing; revised as of July 1, 2016 (link) exceptthatthe
. -~ ‘ :

85. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart CCCCC, Coke Ovens:

Pushing, Quenching, and Battery Stacks; revised as of July 1,

07815).
87. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart EEEEE, Iron and Steel
Foundries; revised as of July 1, 2016 (link) exeept-that-the

88. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart FFFFF, Integrated Iron and

Steel Manufacturing Facilities; revised as of July 1, 2016 (link)
. I - ,
4.
89. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart GGGGG, Site Remediation;
revised as of July 1, 2016 (link) except-thatthe-Secretary-is-hot
the-Administratorfor-purposes—of-the-authorities—cited-at-40

90. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart HHHHH, Miscellaneous

Coating Manufacturing; revised as of July 1, 2016 (link) except
| : . | - : A

91. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart 11111, Mercury Emissions

from Mercury Cell Chlor-Alkali Plants; revised as of July 1,
2016 (link) exeept—that—the%eeretapy—rsrnet—the—Admmrstrater
§863.8264(c){1)through-(4).
92. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart JJJJJ, Brick and Structural
Clay Products Manufacturing; revised as of July 1, 2016 (link)

93. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart KKKKK, Clay Ceramics
Manufacturing; revised as of July 1, 2016 (link) amended

2016 (link) exeept—that—the%eeretapy—mm—the—Adﬂmms#ate;
5863.7351{c)}{L) - through{(6).

86. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart DDDDD, Industrial,
Commercial, and Institutional Boilers and Process Heaters;

revised as of July 1, 2016 (link) execept-thatthe-Secretary-is-not

2966

94. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart LLLLL, Asphalt Processing
and Asphalt Roofing Manufacturing; revised as of July 1, 2016
(link) exeept—that—theéeeretapy—ls—net—the—Adrntuﬂﬁtrater—fw
through-(4).

95. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart MMMMM, Flexible
Polyurethane Foam Fabrication Operations; revised as of July

1, 2016 (link) exceptthatthe Secretary-is-notthe-Administrator



http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01720
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03483
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03483
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03497
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03497
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04926
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03495
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03495
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03496
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03496
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07815
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07815
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07816
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07816
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07816
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07816
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07817
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07817

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

§863.8828(c)(1)- through-(4).
96. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart NNNNN, Hydrochloric
Acid Production; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) except-that

97. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart PPPPP, Engine Test

Cells/Stands; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) execept-that-the

: e : :

98. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart QQQQQ, Friction Materials

Manufacturing Facilities; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)
| : . Admini ‘
“.
99. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart RRRRR, Taconite Iron Ore
Processing; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) except-that-the
. - F :

100. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart SSSSS, Refractory

Products Manufacturing; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)

through-(4}.

106. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart EEEEEE, Primary Copper
Smelting Area Sources; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) exeept
; . ; - , ‘

107. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart FFFFFF, Secondary

Copper Smelting Area Sources; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)
4.

108. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart GGGGGG, Primary
Nonferrous Metals Area Sources-Zinc, Cadmium, and
Beryllium; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) except-that-the

| ..5 ted 555§§§|| 5).
{e)(L)-through-(4).

109. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart JJJJJJ, Industrial,
Commercial, and Institutional Boilers, revised as of July 1,
2017 (link) revised——as—of —Juby—— 12015

| . mini ,
4.
101. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart TTTTT, Primary
Magnesium Refining; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) except
he S . _ ‘ )

102. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart UUUUU, Coal and Oil-

Fired Electric Utility Steam Generating Units; revised as of July
1, 2017  (link)revised——as—of —July —1— 2016
08907); amended July 2, 2018, at 83 FR 30879 (link).

103. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart YYYYY, Area Sources:
Electnc Arc Furnace Steelmaking Facilities; revised as of July

1, 2017 (link) exeep%thaptheéeeretaw&nemwmms#m

5863.10691(c)}{1 ) -through(6).

104. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart ZZZZZ, Iron and Steel
Foundries Area Sources; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) except

he . - ‘ ‘

105. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart DDDDDD, Polyvinyl

Chloride and Copolymers Production Area Sources; revised as

of Julv 1, 2017 (link) amended—Ap#H—l—?—ZQéZ—at—?—?—FR—zzw

L Hi i i L
. ) ‘ ' ) : . |
§863.11236(c)(1)-through+(5}).
110. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart LLLLLL, Acrylic and
Modacryllc Fibers Production Area Sources; revised as of July

2017(Imk)exeepnhauhe§eere%awm+e%t¥m%mamsm
5863-11399(b}{ 1) through-(4).

111. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart MMMMMM, Carbon

Black Production Area Sources; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)

E . I - "
4.

112. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart NNNNNN, Chemical
Manufacturing Area Sources: Chromium Compounds; revised

as of Julv 1, 2017 (link) exeept—tha{—theéeepetapy—is—net—the
5863.11413(b){ L) through-(4).

113. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart OOO0OO0O, Flexible
Polyurethane Foam Production and Fabrication Area Sources;

revised as of July 1, 2017 (link) exeeptthat-the-Secretary-is-not
the-Administratorfor-purpeses—of the-authorities—cited-at-40

114. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart PPPPPP, Lead Acid

Battery Manufacturing Area Sources; revised as of July 1, 2017
(link) exeept—that—theéeeretapy—ls—net—the—Adrwnﬁtrater—fer
through({4).

2967


http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08880
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08880
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08907
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-08907
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02487
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02487
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-06262
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-06262
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07818
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-07818

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

115. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart QQQQQQ, Wood

Preserving Area Sources; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)
| : . Admini ‘

4

116. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart RRRRRR, Clay Ceramics

Manufacturing Area Sources; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)
| . rmini :

4

117. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart SSSSSS, Glass

Manufacturing Area Sources; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link)
| E . \dmini "

4

118. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart TTTTTT, Secondary
Nonferrous Metals Processing Area Sources; revised as of July

1, 2017 (link) exceptthatthe-Secretary-is-notthe-Administrator
8863-11473(c){ ) through-{4).

(c) The National Emission Standards for Hazardous Air
Pollutants adopted by reference in this rule shall be controlling
over other standards in the air pollution rules of the Department,
except that any emissions limiting standard contained in or
determined pursuant to the air pollution rules of the Department
which is more stringent than one contained in a National
Emission Standard, or which regulates pollutants or emissions
units not regulated by an applicable National Emission
Standard, shall apply.

(d) General Subparts Adopted. The following general
subparts of 40 C.F.R. Part 63, revised as of July 1, 20172009,
or later as specifically indicated, are adopted and incorporated
by reference:

1. No change.

2. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart B, Requirements for Control
Technology Determinations for Major Sources in Accordance
with Clean Air Act Sections, §8112(g) and 112(j); revised as of

5. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart E, Approval of State
Programs and Delegation of Federal Authorities; revised as of
July 1, 2017 (link) Seetion-63-90,Program-Overview only.

(e) Appendices Adopted. The following appendices of 40
C.F.R. Part 63, revised as of July 1, 20172009, or later as
specifically indicated, are adopted and incorporated by
reference:

1. No change.

2. Appendix B, Sources Defined for Early Reduction
Provisions; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link).

3. Appendix C, Determination of the Fraction Biodegraded
(Fbio) in a Biological Treatment Unit; revised as of July 1, 2017
(link).

4. Appendix D, Alternative Validation Procedure for EPA
Waste and Wastewater Methods;_revised as of July 1, 2017
(link).

5. Appendix E, Monitoring Procedure for Nonthoroughly
Mixed Open Biological Treatment Systems at Kraft Pulp Mills
Under Unsafe Sampling Conditions; revised as of July 1, 2017
(link).

(12) Title 40, Code of Federal Regulations, Part 64,
Compliance Assurance Monitoring; revised as of July 1, 2017

(13) through (22) No change.

(23) Title 40, Code of Federal Regulations, Part 81,
Designation of Areas for Air Quality Planning Purposes.;

(a) The provisions of 40 C.F.R., §81.49, §881.68, 881.91,
881.95, §881.96, and 881.97, revised as of July 1, 2018 (link),
are adopted and incorporated by reference.

(b) The provisions of 40 C.F.R. Part 81, §81.310, revised

as of July 1, 2018 (link); Subparts B C;-and-D-0f 40-C.FR;

July 1, 2017 (link) is-adopted-and-incorporated-byreference,
subject to the following provisions:

a. through f. No change.

3. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart C, List of Hazardous Air
Pollutants, Petitions Process, Lesser Quantity Designations,
Source Category List; revised as of July 1, 2017 (link).

4. 40 C.F.R. Part 63, Subpart D, Compliance Extensions
for Early Reductions of Hazardous Air Pollutants, revised as of

09818)- amended August 9, 2018 at 83 FR 39369 (link);
amended September 11, 2018 at 83 FR 45836 (link), amended

July 1, 2017 (link); except any notice required to be published
by the Department shall be prepared by the Department and
published by the applicant with proof of publication submitted
to the Department.

2968

April 24, 2019 at 84 FR 17085 (link); are adopted and
incorporated by reference.

(c) The provisions of 40 C.F.R. Part 81, Subpart D, revised
as of July 1, 2018 (link), are adopted and incorporated by
reference.

(24) through (26) No change.



http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09702
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09702
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09815
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09815
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09813
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09813
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09814
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09814
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09816
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-09816

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

Rulemaking Authority 403.061, 403.8055 FS. Law Implemented
403.031, 403.061, 403.087, 403.0872, 403.8055 FS. History—New 3-
13-96, Amended 6-25-96, 10-7-96, 10-17-96, 12-20-96, 4-18-97, 6-
18-97,7-7-97, 10-3-97, 12-10-97, 3-2-98, 4-7-98, 5-20-98, 6-8-98, 10-
19-98, 4-1-99, 7-1-99, 9-1-99, 10-1-99, 4-1-00, 10-1-00, 1-1-01, 8-1-
01, 10-1-01, 4-1-02, 7-1-02, 10-1-02, 1-1-03, 4-1-03, 10-1-03, 1-1-04,
4-1-04, 7-1-04, 10-1-04, 1-1-05, 4-1-05, 7-1-05, 10-1-05, 1-1-06, 4-1-
06, 7-1-06, 9-4-06, 9-6-06, 1-8-07, 1-31-07, 4-2-07, 5-31-07, 7-2-07,
10-1-07, 2-1-08, 7-1-08, 10-1-08, 10-6-08, 12-1-08, 11-18-09, 6-11-
10, 7-1-10, 10-1-10, 12-30-10, 12-1-11, 12-1-12, 5-22-13, 12-17-13,
1-24-14, 1-14-15, 1-7-16, 10-23-16, 1-13-17, 12-21-17, 9-25-

18 .

Section Il
Notice of Changes, Corrections and
Withdrawals

DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE
Division of Child Support Enforcement

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:

12E-1.030 Administrative Establishment of Child
Support Obligations

12E-1.036 Administrative Establishment of Paternity
and Support Obligations

12E-1.039 Request for Services

NOTICE OF CHANGE
Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been
made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph
120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in VVol. 45 No. 111, June 7, 2019
issue of the Florida Administrative Register.
The following changes are made in response to written
comments received from the staff of the Joint Administrative
Procedures Committee.

12E-1.030 Administrative Establishment of Child Support
Obligations.

(1) through (3) No change.

(4) Obtaining Cooperation from the Petitioner.

(@ If a case is eligible for establishment of an
administrative support order the Department must obtain
cooperation from the petitioner before serving notice on the
respondent. To obtain cooperation, the Department mails the
petitioner Form CS-ES96, Request for Information
Administrative Support Action, incorporated herein by
reference, effective XXIXX,
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref- );
the Financial Affidavit Administrative Proceeding (CS-OA11);
the Parent Information Form (CS-OA12); and the Title 1V-D
Standard Parenting Time Plan (CS-OA250), except as provided
by paragraph (6)(a). Forms CS-OAl1l and CS-OA12 are
incorporated by reference in Rule 12E-1.036, F.A.C. Form CS-
OA250 is available at
www.floridarevenue.com/childsupport/parenting_time_plans.

The petitioner has 20 days after the mailing date of the forms to
complete and return them._If the action was requested by
another state’s Title IV-D agency, the petitioner has 45 days
after the mailing date of the forms to complete and return them.

(b) and (c) No change.

(5) through (14) No change.

(15) Termination of an Administrative Support Order.

(a) through (d) No change.

(e) When the Department begins a proceeding to terminate
an Administrative Support Order, the Department shall notify
the parents or caregiver by regular mail at the address of record
for each party using Form CS-OA160, Notice of Intent to
Terminate Final Administrative Support Order, hereby
incorporated by  reference,  effective = 09/19/2017,
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
08627). If the notice is not contested the Department shall
render Form CS-OA178, Final Order Terminating
Administrative Order—Ferminating Support Order, hereby
incorporated by reference, effective XXIXX,
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-

).
(16) through (18) No change.

Rulemaking Authority 61.13(1)(b)7., 61.14(1)(d), 409.2557(3)(p),
409.2563(7)(e), 409.2563(16), 409.25633(9) FS. Law Implemented
409.2563, 409.25633 FS. History—New 9-19-17, Amended 1-17-18, 9-
17-18, .

The Department revises the incorporated material, form CS-
OA140R, as follows:

Added Option 12 and corrected references to selection A, B and
C in Option 14.1 and 14.2.

12E-1.036 Administrative Establishment of Paternity and
Support Obligations.

(1) through (6) No change.

(7) Notice of Proceeding to Establish Paternity and Order
to Appear for Genetic Testing.

(a) No change.

(b) Proceeding in Circuit Court.

1. through 2. No change.

3. The Department then sends the petitioning parent Form
CS-P0O31, Family Law Financial Affidavit (Short Form),
hereby incorporated by reference, effective xx/xx,
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref- ).
Form CS-PO31 instructs the petitioning parent to contact the
Department by phone to request a Family Law Financial
Affidavit (Long Form), Form CS-PO30, if the individual’s
gross income is mere-than $50,000_or more per year. Form CS-
PO30 is hereby incorporated by reference, effective xx/xx,
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-___ ).

2969


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=12
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=37
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=12E-1.030
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=12E-1.036
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=12E-1.039

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

The Department will send the CS-PO30 to the petitioning
parent upon request.

4. through 6. No change.

(8) through (21) No change.
Rulemaking Authority 409.2557(3)(p), 409.256(17), 409.25633(9) FS.

Law Implemented 409.256, 409.2563, 409.25633 FS. History—New 4-
5-16, Amended 9-19-17, 1-17-18, 9-17-18, .

The Department revises the incorporated material, form CS-
PO31, as follows:

Removed first paragraph under special notes on page 1.

The Department revises the incorporated material, form CS-
PO30, as follows:

Replaced the Family Law Rule of Procedure form 12.902(b),
effective 09/12 with version 12.902(c), effective 01/15.

The Department revises the incorporated material, form CS-
OA140R, as follows:

Added Option pages to the form.

The Department revises the incorporated material, form CS-
OA40, as follows:

Corrected character spacing in Option 9 and corrected
references to selection A, B and C in Option 14.1 and 14.2.

The Department revises the incorporated material, form CS-
0X40, as follows:

Corrected character spacing in Option 9 and corrected
references to selection A, B and C in Option 14.1 and 14.2.

12E-1.039 Request for Services.

(1) through (4) No change.

(5) Supporting documents; additional requirements.

(@) An individual who applies for services under subsection
(4) or who receives public assistance must:

1. through 2. No change.

3. Provide a paternity declaration for each child who does
not have a legal father.

a.{h The Department uses the Paternity Declaration, Form
CS-P0O34, for the mother. Form CS-P0O34,
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref- ), is
incorporated herein by reference effective xx/xx.

b.{HH The Department uses the Paternity Statement by
Non-Parent, Form CS-P0O102, for the non-parent caregiver.
Form CS-P0O102,

2970

(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
08655), is incorporated herein by reference effective
09/19/2017.

c.{Hb The Department uses the Paternity Statement by
Alleged Father, Form CS-PO103 for the alleged father. Form
CS-P0103,
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
08656), is incorporated herein by reference effective
09/19/2017.

4. Provide a separate completed Additional Alleged
Fathers form (CS-ES119) for each alleged father named on the
paternity declaration. Form CS-ES119,
(http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
08661), is hereby incorporated by reference, effective
09/19/2017.

54. Provide the Department proof of health insurance if the
child(ren) is insured.

65. Inform the Department of any changes in information
for himself or herself, the child(ren) or other parent(s). This
includes addresses, employment, phone numbers, and where
the child(ren) resides.

76. Voluntarily submit to personal jurisdiction in Florida.

8%. Cooperate with the Department as required by Rule
12E-1.008, F.A.C.

(6) Application and Referral Review.

(a) No change.

(b) No change.

1. through 2. No change.

09/19/201 7.

34. The Department will notify the Department of Children
and Family Services in accordance with Section 409.2572, F.S.,
if the public assistance recipient fails to provide all required
information.

Rulemaking Authority 409.2557(3)(h), (i) FS. Law Implemented
409.2567 FS. History—New 9-19-17, .

The Department revises the incorporated material, form CS-
PO34, as follows:

Revised instructions on page 1 to clarify that the applicant must
provide the Department a completed Additional Alleged
Fathers form (CS-ES119) for each alleged father named on the
paternity declaration.



Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:

62-296.500 Reasonably Available Control Technology
(RACT) - Volatile Organic Compounds
(VOC) and Nitrogen Oxides (NOx) Emitting
Facilities

62-296.600 Reasonably Available Control Technology

(RACT) - Lead
NOTICE OF CHANGE
Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been
made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph
120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in VVol. 45 No. 95, May 15, 2019
issue of the Florida Administrative Register.

62-296.500 Reasonably Available Control Technology
(RACT) — Volatile Organic Compounds (VOC) and Nitrogen
Oxides (NOx) Emitting Facilities.

(1) Applicability.

(@) The specific emission limiting standards and other
requirements of Rules 62-296.500 through 62-296.516, F.A.C.,
shall apply to each stationary VOC-emitting stationary
emissions unit in Broward, Duval, Hillsborough, Miami-Dade,
Orange, Palm Beach, or Pinellas County, except for any
emission unit which has been or would be subject to Prevention
of Significant Deterioration review or Preconstruction Review
for Nonattainment Areas, pursuant to 40 C.F.R. 52.21, as
adopted and incorporated by reference in Rule 62-204.800,
F.A.C., or Rule 17-2.17 (repealed), 17-2.500 (transferred), 17-
2.510 (transferred), 62-212.400 or 62-212.500, F.A.C.

(b) In addition to the applicable requirements of this rule,
the specific emission limiting standards and other requirements
of Rule 62-296.570, F.A.C., shall apply in Broward, Dade, and
Palm Beach counties to major VOC-emitting facilities not
regulated in whole under Rules 62-296.501 through 62-
296.516, F.A.C., and major NOx-emitting facilities, except
those new and modified major VOC- and NOx-emitting
facilities which have been or would be subject to Prevention of
Significant Deterioration review or Preconstruction Review for
Nonattainment Areas, review pursuant to 40 C.F.R. 52.21, as
adopted and incorporated by reference in Rule 62-204.800,
F.A.C., or Rule 17-2.17 (repealed), 17-2.500 (transferred), 17-
2.510 (transferred), 62-212.400, or 62-212.500, F.A.C.

(2) Permit, Recordkeeping, and Compliance Reporting
Requirements.

(a) No change.

(b) Recordkeeping.

1. through 3. No change.

4. The Department may accept, instead of the coating
analysis  methods required under paragraphs 62-
296.500(2)(b)2. and 3., F.A.C., a certification by the coating
manufacturer of the composition of the coating if it is supported

by actual batch formulation records. The manufacturer’s
certification shall be consistent with EPA’s document number
450/3-84-019, titled, “Procedures for Certifying Quantity of
Volatile Organic Compounds Emitted by Paint, Ink, and Other
Coatings,” effective December 1984, herein adopted and
incorporated by reference (link).

5. No change.

(c) No change.

(3) through (6) No change.
Rulemaking Authority 403.061 FS. Law Implemented 403.021,
403.031, 403.061, 403.087 FS. History—Formerly 17-2.650(1) — (1)(f),

Amended 2-2-93, 3-17-94, Formerly 17-296.500, Amended 11-23-94,
1-1-96, 3-11-10 .

62-296.600 Reasonably Awvailable Control Technology
(RACT) — Lead.

(1) Applicability. Any lead processing operation that is
located in the area of Hillsborough County encompassed_within
a radius of 5 kilometers centered at UTM coordinates 364.0
East, 3093.5 North, zone 17 (in city of Tampa), designated as
unclassifiable for the 1978 Lead National Ambient Air Quality
Standard (NAAQS) in 40 C.F.R. Part 81, 881.310, as adopted
and incorporated by reference in Rule 62-204.800, F.A.C.,
herein-adopted-and-incorporated-byreference-{hnk): or within
50 kilometers outside the boundary of such an area, shall limit
the emission of lead through the application of reasonably
available control technology (RACT) as specified in Rules 62-
296.601 through 62-296.605, F.A.C.

(2) through (6) No change.

Rulemaking Authority 403.061 FS. Law Implemented 403.021,

403.031, 403.061, 403.087 FS. History—New 8-8-94, Formerly 17-
296.600, Amended 1-1-96, 3-13-96, 7-10-14 .

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Pharmacy
RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
64B16-27.797  The Standards of Practice for Compounding
Sterile Products
NOTICE OF CHANGE
Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been
made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph
120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 45 No. 82, April 26,
2019 issue of the Florida Administrative Register.
The change is in response to written comments submitted by the
staff of the Joint Administrative Procedures Committee and a
public hearing on the rule held on June 17, 2019. The board
voted at the public board meeting held June 18, 2019, to amend
the rule. The rule shall now read as follows:
64B16-27.797 The Standards of Practice for Compounding
Sterile Products.
The purpose of this section is to assure positive patient
outcomes through the provision of standards for 1)

2971


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=62-296.500
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=62-296.600
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=307
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B16-27.797

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

pharmaceutical care; 2) the preparation, labeling, and
distribution of sterile pharmaceuticals by pharmacies, pursuant
to or in anticipation of a prescription drug order; and 3) product
quality and characteristics. These standards are intended to
apply to all sterile pharmaceuticals, notwithstanding the
location of the patient (e.g., home, hospital, nursing home,
hospice, doctor’s office, or ambulatory infusion center).

(1) through (4) No change.

(5) The board finds that the production of sterile
compounded products prepared with a process that includes the
lyophilization of the sterile product may not be adequately
regulated under the provisions of subsection (1). Sterile
compounded products prepared using a process that includes
lyophilization shall, in addition to all applicable provisions of
USP Chapter <797>, be subject to the following additional
requirements:

(@) through (b) No change.

(c) The pharmacy shall, initially and after any change to the
cleaning process or agents, validate a high-level disinfection
process for the lyophilizer. For the purposes of this rule,
validation means that the high-level disinfection process shall
be proven with validation studies performed with the 5 aerobic
bacterial and fungal ATCC organisms referenced in USP
Chapter <71>. The validation studies must be performed by an
external vendor or by an internal laboratory fellowing-proper
protecols: A pharmacy with an internal laboratory shall be
separated from the compounding area and the work area to
prevent contamination in the pharmacy. Documentation of
validation shall be readily available for inspection.

(d) through (k) No change.

(1) Laboratory testing.

1. No change.

2. Finished product testing for all batches shall include
sterility testing with methods described in USP Chapter <71>
unless an alternative method has been validated and shown to
be equivalent or better. Diluents for reconstituting the vials for
testing shall be preservative free. Lyophilized products
released with beyond use dates within USP Chapter <797>
guidelines shall, in lieu of sterility testing, conduct viable air,
surface, and personnel (gloves and sleeves) sampling for each
batch.

3. No change.

4. Endotoxin testing for all lyophilized batches shall be
performed in accordance with USP Chapter <85> and
confirmed to fall within the set limits. This shall be documented
on the batch record.

5. through 6. No change.

(6) No change.

2972

Rulemaking Authority 465.005, 465.0155, 465.022 FS. Law
Implemented 465.0155, 465.022 FS. History—New 6-18-08, Amended
1-7-10, 10-1-14, 12-18-16, .

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Jennifer Wenhold, Executive Director,
Board of Pharmacy, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C08,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258.

Section IV
Emergency Rules

NONE

Section V
Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Rule
Variance or Waiver

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Hotels and Restaurants

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61C-5.001 Safety Standards

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on July 1, 2019, the
Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division
of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received
a petition for Escambia County Judicial Center at 190 W
Government St, Pensacola, FL. Petitioner seeks an emergency
variance of the requirements of ASME A17.3, Section 3.11.3,
as adopted by Rule 61C-5.001, Florida Administrative Code
that requires upgrading the elevators with firefighters’
emergency  operations which  poses a  significant
economic/financial hardship. Any interested person may file
comments within 5 days of the publication of this notice with
Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety,
2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013 (VW
2019-127).

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained
by contacting: Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of
Elevator Safety, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-1013. dhr.elevators@myfloridalicense.com.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Hotels and Restaurants

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61C-5.001 Safety Standards

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on July 1, 2019, the
Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received
a petition for Sheriff’s Administrative Building at 1700 W
Leonard St, Pensacola, FL. Petitioner seeks an emergency
variance of the requirements of ASME A17.3, Section 3.11.3,
as adopted by Rule 61C-5.001, Florida Administrative Code
that requires upgrading the elevators with firefighters’
emergency  operations  which poses a significant
economic/financial hardship. Any interested person may file
comments within 5 days of the publication of this notice with
Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety,
2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013 (VW
2019-128).

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained
by contacting: Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of
Elevator Safety, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-1013. dhr.elevators@myfloridalicense.com.

PLACE: Conference Call Number: 1(888)585-9008 and Code
(873574258)

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Florida Rehabilitation Council - General Business

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Roy
Cosgrove at (850)245-3317 or at roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Roy Cosgrove at (850)245-3317 or at
roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
For more information, you may contact: Roy Cosgrove at
(850)245-3317 or at roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org.

Section VI
Notice of Meetings, Workshops and Public
Hearings

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

The Florida Rehabilitation Council announces a public meeting
to which all persons are invited.

DATES AND TIMES: October 24, 2019, 9:00 a.m. — 5:30 p.m.
ET (or until concluded); October 25, 2019, 9:00 a.m. — 1:00
p.m. ET (or until concluded)

PLACE: Hyatt Regency Jacksonville, 225 East Coastline Drive,
Jacksonville, Florida and Conference Line Number 1(888)585-
9008 and Code (873574258).

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Florida Rehabilitation Council - General Business

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Roy
Cosgrove at (850)245-3317 or at roycosgrove@vr.fldoe.org.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Roy Cosgrove at (850)245-3317 or at
roycosgrove@vr.fldoe.org. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
For more information, you may contact: Roy Cosgrove at
(850)245-3317 or at roycosgrove@vr.fldoe.org.

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

Florida’s Office of Early Learning

The Early Learning Advisory Council-Committee on Strategic
Planning & Rules Committee announces a telephone
conference call to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, July 11, 2019, 8:30 a.m. — 9:00
a.m. or until the conclusion of business, whichever is earlier
PLACE: Via Conference call; 1(888)585-9008; PIN
191237985#

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
General business of the Strategic Planning & Rules Committee
A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting:
shana.beiro@oel.myflorida.com.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: shana.beiro@oel.myflorida.com. If you are hearing
or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

The Florida Rehabilitation Council announces a telephone
conference call to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: December 12, 2019, 4:00 p.m. — 6:30 p.m.
ET (or until concluded)

DEPARTMENT OF LAW ENFORCEMENT

Criminal Justice Standards and Training Commission

The Criminal Justice Standards and Training Commission
announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited.
DATES AND TIMES: August 5 — 8, 2019

August 5, 2019, 5:00 p.m. — 7:00 p.m., New Training Center
Directors Orientation

August 6, 2019, 8:30 a.m. — 5:00 p.m., Field Services Staff
Meeting

August 6, 2019, 8:30 a.m. — 12:00 Noon, Florida Criminal
Justice Educators Association Meeting

August 6, 2019, 10:30 a.m. — 11:30 a.m., Training Center
Director Scholarship Committee Meeting (Members Only)

2973


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1044
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=11
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=20

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

August 6, 2019, 11:30 a.m. — 1:00 p.m., Training Center
Director Executive Board Committee Meeting (Members Only)
August 6, 2019, 1:00 p.m. — 3:00 p.m., Training Center Director
Steering Committee Meeting (Members Only)

August 6, 2019, 3:00 p.m. —4:00 p.m., Training Center Director
Basic Recruit Committee Meeting

August 6, 2019, 3:00 p.m. —4:00 p.m., Training Center Director
Advanced/Specialized Training Committee Meeting

August 6, 2019, 3:00 p.m. —4:00 p.m., Training Center Director
High Liability Committee Meeting

August 6, 2019, 3:00 p.m. —4:00 p.m., Training Center Director
Rules Committee Meeting

August 6, 2019, 4:00 p.m. —5:30 p.m., Training Center Director
Open Forum

August 7, 2019, 8:30 a.m. — 12:00 Noon, Training Center
Directors Association Business Meeting
August 7, 2019, 10:00 a.m. — Open,
Determination Hearings

August 7, 2019, 10:00 a.m. — 11:00 a.m., Regional Criminal
Justice Selection Center Directors Association

August 7, 2019, 3:00 p.m. — 5:00 p.m., Commission Workshop:
Proposed Rules and Forms Revisions; and Commission
Hearing Procedures

August 8, 2019, 8:30 am. — 5:00 p.m., Criminal Justice
Standards & Training Commission Business Meeting

August 8, 2019, 10:00 a.m. — 5:00 p.m., CIST Commission
Officer Discipline Hearings

PLACE: Sawgrass Marriott Golf Resort & Spa, 1000 PGA Tour
Boulevard, Ponte Vedra Beach, FL 32082. Front Desk
Telephone: (904)285-7777, Ext 6699; Reservation Number:
1(800)457-4653; Fax Number: (904)285-0906; Guestroom
Rate: $125.00/night plus applicable taxes for a single or double;
Available from August 4 — 8, 2019; extra 2 days before/after is
based on availability. Check-in: 4:00 p.m. and Check-out: 11:00
a.m.; Cancellation Policy: Cancellations made within 72 hours
prior to arrival will forfeit one night's room and tax. Group
Name: FDLE - Criminal Justice Standards & Training
Commission Meeting; Reservation website: TBD; Reservation
Deadline: July 15, 2019 by 3:00 p.m.; Parking: Self-Parking
Fee included in Resort Fee; Valet Fee Discounted to $10.00.
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The
above meetings are held to discuss issues relating to standards,
training, examinations, certification, de-certification, record
management for law enforcement, correctional, and
correctional probation officers, trust fund issues, Commission
rules, officer discipline penalty guidelines, and certification and
recertification of criminal justice training schools.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Joyce
Gainous-Harris at (850)410-8615 or e-mail at JoyceGainous-
Harris@fdle.state.fl.us if you have questions about the above
meetings.

Probable Cause

2974

If you have questions about the Officer Discipline Agenda,
please contact Sissy Beggs at (850)410-8632 or by e-mail at
sissybeggs@fdle.state.fl.us.

If you have questions about hotel accommodations, please
contact Cheryl Taylor at (850)410-8657 or e-mail at
cheryltaylor@fdle.state.fl.us.

The Commission packet can be viewed or downloaded after

July 23, 2019, at:
http://www.fdle.state.fl.us/CISTC/Commission/CISTC-
Home.aspx.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Joyce Gainous-Harris at (850)410-8615 or e-mail at
JoyceGainous-Harris@fdle.state.fl.us. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

The Florida Transportation Commission (FTC) announces a
public meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIMES: July 10, 2019, 11:00 a.m. (FTC
workshop); 2:00 p.m. (FTC meeting)

PLACE: Hyatt Regency Coconut Point, 5001 Coconut Rd.,
Bonita Springs, FL 34134

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
General FTC issues/ business.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: the
Florida Transportation Commission, 605 Suwannee Street,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)414-4105.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: the Florida Transportation Commission, 605
Suwannee Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)414-4105.
If you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency
using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact:
Transportation ~ Commission, 605  Suwannee
Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)414-4105.

the Florida
Street,

REGIONAL PLANNING COUNCILS

North Central Florida Regional Planning Council

The North Central Florida Regional Planning Council
announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: July 10, 2019, 6:00 p.m.

PLACE: City of Valdosta City Hall Annex, Multi-Purpose
Room, 300 North Lee Street, Valdosta, Georgia


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=14
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=29
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=59

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To
conduct a Joint Workshop between the Middle and Lower
Suwannee River and Withlacoochee River Task Force and the
City of Valdosta City Council.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: North
Central Florida Regional Planning Council, 2009 NW 67th
Place, Gainesville, Florida 32653-1603.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 2 business days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: (352)955-2200. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

regulatory and non-regulatory matters. Staff may recommend
approval of external amendments which affect the adopted
budget.

NOTE: One or more Governing Board members may attend and
participate in the meetings by means of communications media
technology.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: St. Johns
River Water Management District, Attention Andrea Dzioba,
4049 Reid Street, Palatka, FL 32177, or by phone at (386)643-
1915, or by visiting the District's website at sjrwmd.com.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Civil Rights Coordinator at (386)329-4500. If you
are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using
the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

REGIONAL PLANNING COUNCILS

Apalachee Regional Planning Council

The Apalachee Regional Planning Council announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, July 18, 2019, 10:00 a.m. ET
PLACE: N FL Research & Education Center, 155 Research
Road, Quincy, FL 32351

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To
hold the Regular Bi-Monthly Meeting of the Apalachee
Regional Planning Council

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Janice
Watson, ARPC, 2507 Callaway Road, Suite 200, Tallahassee,
FL 32303, (850)488-6211 x 103, JWatson@thearpc.com.

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS

St. Johns River Water Management District

The St. Johns River Water Management District announces a
public meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, July 9, 2019; Committee
Meetings will begin at 10:15 a.m. followed by the Governing
Board meeting scheduled to begin at 11:00 a.m. or following
the Committee Meetings whichever is later.

PLACE: District Headquarters, 4049 Reid Street (Hwy 100
West), Palatka, FL 32177

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Discussion and consideration of District business including

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS

Southwest Florida Water Management District

The Southwest Florida Water Management District
(SWFWMD) announces a public meeting to which all persons
are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, July 23, 2019, 9:00 a.m.
PLACE: SWFWMD, 2379 Broad Street, Brooksville, FL
34604

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Note: Change of Place. Governing Board Meeting, Committee
Meetings and Public Hearing: Consider SWFWMD business
including adoption of proposed District millage rate for fiscal
year 2020. All or part of this meeting may be conducted by
means of communications media technology in order to permit
maximum participation of Governing Board members.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting:
WaterMatters.org —  Boards, Meetings &  Event
Calendar;1(800)423-1476 (FL only) or (352)796-7211.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: SWFWMD Human Resources Office Chief at
1(800)423-1476 (FL only) or (352)796-7211, x4703; TDD (FL
only) 1(800)231-6103; or email to
ADACoordinator@swfwmd.state.fl.us. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the

2975


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=29
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=68
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=122
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=123

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact:
Lori.Manuel@watermatters.org; 1(800)423-1476 (FL only) or
(352)796-7211, x4606 (Ad Order EXE0685).

DEPARTMENT OF ELDER AFFAIRS

Division of Volunteer and Community Services

The Department of Elder Affairs announces a public meeting to
which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, July 25, 2019, 9:00 a.m.
PLACE: Senior Resource Alliance, 988 Woodcock Rd,
Orlando, FL 32803 or by conference call 1(888)585-9008,
conference room number 600513360#

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: In
accordance with 430.501, Florida Statutes, the Alzheimer’s
Disease Advisory Committee (ADAC) will be holding a
quarterly meeting in order to fulfill its duties in advising the
Department of Elder Affairs in the performance of its duties
under this act regarding legislative, programmatic, and
administrative matters that relate to those who are affected by
Alzheimer’s disease.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Pete
Cohen at (850)414-2034 or cohenp@elderaffairs.org.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting:  Pete  Cohen at  (850)414-2034  or
cohenp@elderaffairs.org. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
For more information, you may contact: Pete Cohen at
(850)414-2034 or cohenp@elderaffairs.org.

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: Leon Simmonds,
(850)921-0041.

DEPARTMENT OF MANAGEMENT SERVICES

The Department of Management Services E911 Board
announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: July 17, 2019, 9:00 a.m.

PLACE: DoubleTree Suites by Hilton located at 12200
Tamiami Trail North, Naples, FL 34110

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
General matters relating to the Florida E911 Board.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Leon
Simmonds, State of Florida 911 Coordinator, (850)921-0041.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Leon Simmonds, (850)921-0041. If you are hearing
or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida

2976

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Construction Industry Licensing Board

The Construction Industry Licensing Board announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATES AND TIMES: Wednesday, September 11, 2019, 12:00
Noon; Thursday, September 12, 2019, 8:30 a.m.; Friday,
September 13, 2019, 8:30 a.m.

PLACE: Hutchinson Island Marriott, 555 NE Ocean Blvd.,
Stuart, FL 34996, (772)225-3700.

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
General Business, disciplinary and committee meetings of the
Board

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Donald
Shaw, Senior Management Analyst Supervisor, 2601 Blair
Stone Rd., Tallahassee, FL 32399-1039, (850)717-1983.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Donald Shaw, Senior Management Analyst
Supervisor, 2601 Blair Stone Rd., Tallahassee, FL 32399-1039,
(850)717-1983. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please
contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-
8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: Donald Shaw, Senior
Management Analyst Supervisor, 2601 Blair Stone Rd.,
Tallahassee, FL 32399-1039, (850)717-1983.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Construction Industry Licensing Board

The Construction Industry Licensing Board announces a
telephone conference call to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, September 10, 2019, 10:00 a.m.
PLACE: Telephone conference number: 1(888)585-9008,
participant code: 564 952 647


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=58
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=530
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=60
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=274
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=274

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
CE/Exams/Public Awareness Committee of the Board.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Donald
Shaw, Senior Management Analyst Supervisor, 2601 Blair
Stone Rd., Tallahassee, FL 32399-1039, (850)717-1983.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Donald Shaw, Senior Management Analyst
Supervisor, 2601 Blair Stone Rd., Tallahassee, FL 32399-1039,
(850)717-1983. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please
contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-
8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: Donald Shaw, Senior
Management Analyst Supervisor, 2601 Blair Stone Rd.,
Tallahassee, FL 32399-1039, (850)717-1983.

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Board of Accountancy

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61H1-38.002Fifth Year of Accounting Education Program
The Board of Accountancy announces a telephone conference
call to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: August 21, 2019, 10:00 a.m.

PLACE: Teleconference: 1(888)585-9008, Conference Room
Code: 970-111-382

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The
Clay Ford Scholarship Council will meet to consider
applications for minority scholarships.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Trencia
Jenkins, Regulatory Consultant or Karan Lee, Management
Review Specialist, 240 NW 76 Drive, Suite A, Gainesville,
Florida 32607.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 2 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Trencia Jenkins or Karan Lee. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Board of Accountancy

The Board of Accountancy announces a public meeting to
which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: July 22, 2019, 3:00 p.m., until all business
is concluded.

PLACE: Conference Call dial in number 1(888)585-9008; Pass
code number 683213166

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The
Budget Task Force will meet to discuss the board's quarter
financials.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Missy
Williams, (352)333-2505.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 2 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: If you are hearing or speech impaired, please
contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-
8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
Beaches and Coastal Systems
RULE NOS.:RULE TITLES:

62B-41.005 Policy and Eligibility Criteria for Coastal
Construction Permits
62B-41.008 Information Regarding Permit Application

Requirements and Procedures

The Department of Environmental Protection announces a
hearing to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: July 25, 2019, 9:00 a.m. — 11:00 a.m.
PLACE: Department of Environmental Protection, Conference
Room 609, 2600 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-
2400. The public may attend this hearing in person, or via
webinar.  To attend via  webinar, register at
https://attendee.gotowebinar.com/register/1659576862492874
242. After registering you will receive a confirmation email

2977


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=280
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61H1-38.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=280
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=288
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=62B-41.005
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=62B-41.008

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

containing information about joining the webinar. You may join
using the provided call-in information or by using your
computer audio. Those attending via webinar will have the
opportunity to ask questions or provide comments. They may
do so by typing them into the webinar software or using the
webinar audio features.

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The
Department will hold a rule adoption hearing pursuant to
subsection 120.54(3), F.S., to hear public testimony and to
explain the proposed amendments to the above-cited rules, and
respond to questions or comments regarding the amendments.
The Notice of Proposed Rule for this rulemaking was published
on December 13, 2018, in Vol. 44/241, of the Florida
Administrative Register. A Notice of Correction for this
rulemaking was published on December 14, 2018, in Vol.
447242, of the Florida Administrative Register. The Notice of
Correction corrected the Statement of Estimated Regulatory
Cost and Legislative Ratification information. The proposed
amendments will address the requirements that applicants
seeking a Joint Coastal Permit will need to provide information
that, for activities to be conducted that are associated with an
inlet, including management activities, demonstrates that the
proposed project or activity will comply with the requirements
of Section 161.142, Florida Statutes.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Greg
Garis, Program Administrator, Beaches, Inlets and Ports
Program, 2600 Blair Stone Road, MS 3544, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399, (850)245-8280, or email
Gregory.Garis@floridadep.gov.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Greg Garis, Program Administrator, Beaches, Inlets
and Ports Program, 2600 Blair Stone Road, MS 3544,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)245-8280, or email
Gregory.Garis@floridadep.gov. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
For more information, you may contact: Greg Garis, Program
Administrator, Beaches, Inlets and Ports Program, 2600 Blair
Stone Road, MS 3544, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)245-
8280, or email Gregory.Garis@floridadep.gov.

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
Beaches and Coastal Systems

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
62B-49.005 Application
Procedures.

Requirements and  Processing

2978

The Department of Environmental Protection announces a
hearing to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: July 25, 2019, 11:00 a.m. — 12:00 Noon
PLACE: Department of Environmental Protection, Conference
Room 609, 2600 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-
2400. The public may attend this hearing in person, or via
webinar.  To attend via  webinar, register at
https://attendee.gotowebinar.com/register/8263149140917052
674. After registering you will receive a confirmation email
containing information about joining the webinar. You may join
using the provided call-in information or by using your
computer audio. Those attending via webinar will have the
opportunity to ask questions or provide comments. They may
do so by typing them into the webinar software or using the
webinar audio features.

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The
Department will hold a rule adoption hearing pursuant to
subsection 120.54(3), F.S., to hear public testimony and to
explain the proposed amendment to the above-cited rule and
respond to questions or comments regarding the amendment.
The Notice of Proposed Rule for this rulemaking was published
on December 13, 2018, in Vol. 44/241, of the Florida
Administrative Register. A Notice of Correction for this
rulemaking was published on December 14, 2018, in Vol.
44/242, of the Florida Administrative Register. The Notice of
Correction corrected the Statement of Estimated Regulatory
Cost and Legislative Ratification information. The proposed
amendment will revise the application form for a Joint Coastal
Permit that is adopted by reference in the above-cited rule,
consistent with rule amendments proposed for Rules 62B-
41.005 and .008, F.A.C.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Greg
Garis, Program Administrator, Beaches, Inlets and Ports
Program, 2600 Blair Stone Road, MS 3544, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399, (850)245-8280, or email
Gregory.Garis@floridadep.gov.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Greg Garis, Program Administrator, Beaches, Inlets
and Ports Program, 2600 Blair Stone Road, MS 3544,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)245-8280, or email
Gregory.Garis@floridadep.gov. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
For more information, you may contact: Greg Garis, Program
Administrator, Beaches, Inlets and Ports Program, 2600 Blair
Stone Road, MS 3544, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)245-
8280, or email Gregory.Garis@floridadep.gov.



https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=288
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=62B-49.005

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Podiatric Medicine

The Department of Health, Board of Podiatric Medicine,
announces a CORRECTION as to the Board Office contact
needed to obtain any meeting material or special
accommodations for the official Board meeting which was
published in the Florida Administrative Register on October 24,
2018 in volume 44/208.

DATE AND TIME: July 19, 2019, 9:00 a.m. ET

PLACE: Four Points Sheraton Suites, 4400 W. Cypress Street,
Tampa FL, 33607, 1(813)873-8675

PURPOSE: To conduct general board business.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by visiting
www.floridaspodiatricmedicine.gov. If a person decides to
appeal any decision made by the Board with respect to any
matter considered at this meeting, he/she will need to ensure
that a verbatim record of the proceeding is made, which record
includes the testimony and the evidence upon which the appeal
is to be made. Those who are hearing impaired, using TDD
equipment, can call the Florida Telephone Relay System at
(800)955-8771. Persons requiring special accommodations due
to disability or physical impairment should contact the Board
Office at least one week in advance by phone to (850)245-4292.

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES

Family Safety and Preservation Program

The Department of Children and Families announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: July 10, 2019, 3:30 p.m. — 4:30 p.m.
PLACE: Disney's Coronado Springs Resort, 1000 Buena Vista
Drive, Orlando, FL 32830, Room: Coronado T

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Funding Model Project — Draft Report Presentation

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: There is
no agenda for this meeting.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 2 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Donna Ford. Donna can be reached at (850)717-
4159 or donna.ford@myflfamilies.com. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Podiatric Medicine

The Department of Health, Board of Podiatric Medicine,
announces a CORRECTION as to the Board Office contact
needed to obtain any meeting material or special
accommodations for the official Board meeting which was
published in the Florida Administrative Register on October 24,
2018 in volume 44/208.

DATE AND TIME: October 25, 2019, 9:00 a.m. ET

PLACE: Hilton Garden Inn Orlando at Sea World, 6850
Westwood Blvd, Orlando FL, 32821, (407)354-1500
PURPOSE: To conduct general board business.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by visiting
www.floridaspodiatricmedicine.gov. If a person decides to
appeal any decision made by the Board with respect to any
matter considered at this meeting, he/she will need to ensure
that a verbatim record of the proceeding is made, which record
includes the testimony and the evidence upon which the appeal
is to be made. Those who are hearing impaired, using TDD
equipment, can call the Florida Telephone Relay System at
1(800)955-8771. Persons requiring special accommodations
due to disability or physical impairment should contact the
Board Office at least one week in advance by phone to
(850)245-4292.

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES

Refugee Services

The Palm Beach Area Refugee Task Force announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Friday, July 19, 2019, 10:00 a.m. — 12:00
Noon

PLACE: West Palm Beach City Hall, 401 Clematis street, West
Palm Beach, FL 33401

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The
purpose of the Palm Beach Area Refugee Task Force meeting
is to increase awareness of the refugee populations, share best
practices, spot trends in refugee populations, build
collaborations  between agencies, help create good
communication among service providers, get informed about
upcoming community events, and discuss refugee program
service needs and possible solutions to meeting those needs.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Miriam
Rosario at (561)227-6722 or David Draper at (407)317-7335.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: If you are hearing or speech impaired, please
contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-
8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Miriam Rosario at
(561)227-6722 or David Draper at (407)317-7335.

2979


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=342
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=528

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

ORANGE COUNTY RESEARCH AND DEVELOPMENT
AUTHORITY

The Orange County Research and Development Authority
announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: July 18, 2019, 10:30 a.m.

PLACE: Central Florida Research Park, 12424 Research
Parkway, Suite 100, Orlando, FL 32826

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
General Business Meeting

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Joe
Wallace, (407)282-3944.

INFINITE SOURCE COMMUNICATIONS GROUP, LLC
The Florida Department of Transportation (FDOT) District Six
announces a hearing to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, July 16, 2019, 6:00 p.m. — 8:00
p.m.

PLACE: City of Miami Gardens Council Chambers, 18605 NW
27 Avenue, Miami Gardens, FL 33056

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The
Florida Department of Transportation (FDOT) District Six will
hold a Public Hearing for roadway and safety improvement
projects along State Road (SR) 860/NW 183 Street/Miami
Gardens Drive from east of NW 57 Avenue to west of NW 27
Avenue, in Miami-Dade County. The project identification
numbers are 427518-2-32-01/02/03.

The Public Hearing will be an open house format from 6 p.m.
to 8 p.m., with a formal presentation starting at 6:30 p.m.
Graphic displays will be shown and FDOT representatives will
be available to discuss the project and answer questions.
Public participation is solicited without regard to race, color,
national origin, age, sex, religion, disability or family status.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting:
Community Outreach Specialist Gerdy St. Louis at (305)573-
0089, email: gerdy@iscprgroup.com.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Hong Benitez, P.E. at (305)470-5219 or in writing
at FDOT, 1000 NW 111 Avenue, Miami, FL 33172 or by email
at: Hong.Benitez@dot.state.fl.us. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
For more information, you may contact: Community Outreach
Specialist Gerdy St. Louis at (305)573-0089, email:
gerdy@iscprgroup.com.

RS&H - JACKSONVILLE

The Jacksonville Transportation Authority announces a hearing
to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: July 16, 2019, 5:30 p.m. — 6:30 p.m.
PLACE: Lakeshore United Methodist Church, 2246 Blanding
Blvd., Jacksonville, FL 32210.

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The
Jacksonville Transportation Authority invites you to a public
hearing for driveway modifications at 3603 Blanding
Boulevard, Duval County, Florida.

The proposed access management change consists of installing
sidewalks, curbs and gutters that would reshape the driveway
access at 3603 Blanding Blvd., Jacksonville, Florida 32210
(Cedar Hills Animal Hospital). Drop by between 5:30 and 6:30
to view displays and discuss the project with JTA and project
staff. A presentation and public comment period will begin at
6:00 p.m.

All interested persons or groups are encouraged to attend and
participate. Public participation is solicited without regard to
race, color, religion, gender, age, national origin, disability or
familial status. This meeting is ADA and transit accessible.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Cheryl
Riddick at (904)632-5522 or email criddick@jtafla.com.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Cheryl Riddick at (904)632-5522 or email
criddick@jtafla.com. If you are hearing or speech impaired,
please contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service,
1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Cheryl Riddick at
(904)632-5522 or email criddick@jtafla.com.

2980

QUEST CORPORATION OF AMERICA, INC.

The Florida Department of Transportation (FDOT) District
Five announces a public meeting to which all persons are
invited.

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, July 11, 2019, Open house, 5:30
p.m.—7:30 p.m.

PLACE: First Baptist Church of Leesburg, Southern Campus,
25900 U.S. Highway 27, Leesburg, Florida 34748

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Financial Project ID Number: 439139-1

Project Description: State Road (S.R.) 25/U.S. 27 from south of
Arlington Ridge Blvd. to north of County Road (C.R.) 33, Lake
County, Florida


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=582
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=582
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1035
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1070
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1102

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

The Florida Department of Transportation (FDOT) invites all
persons to an informational open house for a resurfacing project
on S.R. 25/U.S. 27 from south of Arlington Ridge Blvd. to north
of C.R. 33 in portions of the City of Leesburg and
unincorporated regions of Lake County.

The intent of this project is to mill and resurface the existing
pavement to extend the life of the roadway. Resurfacing
improvements include travel lanes, shoulders, auxiliary lanes,
and median crossovers. The project also includes operational
and maintenance improvements such as extending turn lanes in
some areas, constructing a new southbound directional median
opening with a left turn lane at the First National Bank driveway
just south of Pelican Isle Drive, new signs and pavements.
Intersection improvements at C.R. 33 include eliminating the
continuous green arrow/through lane along northbound S.R. 25
and providing dual left turn lanes from C.R. 33 to northbound
S.R. 25 to improve intersection safety. Various safety
enhancements are included to comply with current Americans
with Disabilities Act (ADA) and FDOT standards regarding
pedestrian features, including adding crosswalks at C.R. 48.
This project will not require additional right-of-way.

The open house will be 5:30 p.m. — 7:30 p.m., Thursday, July
11, 2019, at the First Baptist Church of Leesburg, Southern
Campus, 25900 U.S. Highway 27, Leesburg, FL 34748.
Interested persons may attend at any time during those hours to
view a looping video presentation and project exhibits, speak
with project team members, and provide input on the design.
Public participation is solicited without regard to race, color,
national origin, age, sex, religion, disability or family status.
Persons wishing to express their concerns relative to FDOT
compliance with Title VI may do so by contacting Jennifer
Smith, FDOT District Five Title VI Coordinator at
jennifer.smith2@dot.state.fl.us.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Sarah Van
Gundy, FDOT project manager, by email at
sarah.vangundy@dot.state.fl.us or by phone at (386)943-5551.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least seven (7) days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Sarah Van Gundy, FDOT project manager, by email
at sarah.vangundy@dot.state.fl.us or by phone at (386)943-
5551. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the
agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771
(TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Sarah Van Gundy,
FDOT project manager, (see contact information above).
Information about this project is also available online at
www.cflroads.com. Simply type 439139-1 in the search box,
and click on the project name in the search results.

Section VII
Notice of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding Declaratory Statements

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Florida Department of
Corrections has issued an order disposing of the petition for
declaratory statement filed by inmate Melvin Perez, DC#
X11781 on May 2, 2019. The following is a summary of the
agency's disposition of the petition: As an inmate of the Florida
Department of Corrections, Melvin Perez, DC# X11781, may
only participate in administrative proceedings that are brought
pursuant to paragraph 120.54(3)(c) and subsection 120.54(7),
Florida Statutes. Pursuant to subsection 120.81(3), Florida
Statutes, the Petitioner lacks standing to bring a Petition for
Declaratory Statement, and the Department lacks jurisdiction to
issue a declaratory statement in this case.

A copy of the Order Disposing of the Petition for Declaratory
Statement may be obtained by contacting: Shaveon Nelson, 501
South  Calhoun  Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399,
shaveon.nelson@fdc.myflorida.com, (850)717-3605.

DEPARTMENT OF MANAGEMENT SERVICES

Division of Retirement - Local Retirement

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Department of
Management Services has issued an order disposing of the
petition for declaratory statement filed by Town of Palm Beach
on October 15, 2018. The following is a summary of the
agency's disposition of the petition: Department of
Management Services, Division of Retirement, has issued an
order disposing of the petition for declaratory statement filed by
the Town of Palm Beach on October 15, 2018. The following is
a summary of the agency’s disposition of the petition: A Final
Order on the Petition for Declaratory Statement was issued on
July 1, 2019. The Department dismissed the petition based on
the Town of Palm Beach filing a notice of withdrawal on June
21, 20109.

A copy of the Order Disposing of the Petition for Declaratory
Statement may be obtained by contacting: Diane Wint, Agency
Clerk, Department of Management Services, Office of the
General Counsel, (850)414-7603.

Please refer all comments to: Diane Wint, Agency Clerk,
Department of Management Services, Office of the General
Counsel, (850)414-7603.

2981


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=33
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=60
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=240

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares and Mobile
Homes

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Division of Florida
Condominiums, Timeshares, and Mobile Homes, Department
of Business and Professional Regulation, State of Florida, has
received the petition for declaratory statement from Harold
Fellman, In Re: Mission Viejo Condominium Association, Inc.,
Docket No. 2019032253The petition seeks the agency's opinion
as to the applicability of 718.111 as it applies to the petitioner.
Whether the Board of Mission Viejo Condominium Association
may promote the private business known as Crystal Palms
Apartment Homes on any Mission Viejo common area property
pursuant to section 718.111, Florida Statutes.

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be
obtained by contacting: the Department of Business and
Professional Regulation, Division of Florida Condominiums,
Timeshares, and Mobile Homes, 2601 Blair Stone Road,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1030, (850)488-1631;
Iscmhpublicrecords@myfloridalicense.com.

Please refer all comments to: Nick DuVal, Chief Attorney,
Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division
of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares, and Mobile Homes,
2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2202.

Professional Regulation, Division of Florida Condominiums,
Timeshares, and Mobile Homes, 2601 Blair Stone Road,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1030; (850)488-1631;
Iscmhpublicrecords@myfloridalicense.com.

Please refer all comments to: Nick DuVal, Chief Attorney,
Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division
of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares, and Mobile Homes,
2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2202.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares and Mobile
Homes

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Division of Florida
Condominiums, Timeshares, and Mobile Homes, Department
of Business and Professional Regulation, State of Florida, has
received the petition for declaratory statement from Tonya
Raschke and lvan Hernandez, In Re: Cannongate Property
Owners Association, Inc., Docket No. 2019028883The petition
seeks the agency's opinion as to the applicability of subsection
61B-80.122(2), F. A. C., as it applies to the petitioner.

1. That the Division address legal arguments advanced by a
Party in its untimely-filed Motion for Rehearing in a separate
and distinct Arbitration case. 2. Whether the votes of previous
board members that have been neither nominated nor elected
are legally valid when making decisions for the association. 3.
Whether petitioners are entitled to a deferral of any attorney’s
fees and costs levied by the Division until the conclusion of a
motion for rehearing pursuant to subsection 61B-80.122(2),
Florida Administrative Code.

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be
obtained by contacting: the Department of Business and

2982

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Florida Building Commission

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that The Florida Building
Commission has received the petition for declaratory statement
from Robert Sheppard, a plans examiner with the City of
Marathon. The petition seeks the agency's opinion as to the
applicability of section R311.1 of the Florida Building Code,
Building, 6th Edition (2017), as it applies to the petitioner.
The petitioner seeks clarification as to how the means of egress
provisions of section R311.1, Florida Building Code,
Residential, 6th Edition (2017), apply to the two-family
dwellings described in the petition.

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be
obtained by contacting: Agency Clerk’s Office, Department of
Business and Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)921-0342,
AGC filing@myfloridalicense.com.

Please refer all comments to: Mo Madani, Building Codes and
Standards Office, Department of Business and Professional
Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399,
(850)487-1824, mo.madani@myfloridalicense.com; or W.
Justin Vogel, Office of the General Counsel, Department of
Business and Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)717-1795,
wjustin.vogel@myfloridalicense.com.

RESPONSES, MOTIONS TO INTERVENE, OR REQUESTS
FOR A HEARING MUST BE FILED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF
THIS NOTICE.

Section VIII
Notice of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding the Validity of Rules

Notice of Petition for Administrative Determination has been
filed with the Division of Administrative Hearings on the
following rules:

NONE



https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=248
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=248
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=248
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=248
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

Administrative
Division of

Notice of Disposition of Petition for
Determination has been filed with the
Administrative Hearings on the following rules:

NONE

Section IX
Notice of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding Non-rule Policy Challenges

NONE

Section X
Announcements and Objection Reports of
the Joint Administrative Procedures
Committee

NONE

Section XI
Notices Regarding Bids, Proposals and
Purchasing

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

DISTRICT BOARD OF TRUSTEES

MIAMI DADE COLLEGE

PUBLIC ANNOUNCEMENT

REGARDING SOLICITING APPLICATIONS

FOR

Request for Qualifications

NORTH CAMPUS FIRE AND WATER LOOP -
DESIGN/BUILD

2019-RB-40

Pursuant to Sections 255.0525, 255.20 Florida Statutes the
District Board of Trustees of Miami Dade College (the
"Board") is soliciting applications for North Camus Fire and
Water Loop — Design/Build

Application Packet: Interested parties can obtain application
materials by visiting Miami Dade College Purchasing website
on or after June 18, 2019. at
http://www.mdc.edu/purchasing/bids.asp or by contacting the
Purchasing Department at (305)237-2402.

Please direct questions to: Ramon S. Bristol Castrillon, CPPO,
FCCN, Assistant Purchasing Director, Facilities/Plant
Maintenance, Tel: (305)237-0011, Email: rbristol@mdc.edu.

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

DISTRICT BOARD OF TRUSTEES

MIAMI DADE COLLEGE

11011 S.W. 104th STREET

MIAMI, FL 33176-3393

Responses to the Request for Proposals (RFP) listed below will
be accepted in the PURCHASING DEPARTMENT, Room
9254, by 3:00 p.m. on July 26, 2019.

Prospective proposers may obtain the RFP solicitation at the
College’s Purchasing Department website,
http://www.mdc.edu/purchasing/bid-posting.aspx, or by calling
(305)237-2402.

BID NUMBER: 2019-RM1-42, BID TITLE: Mental Health
Counseling Services

Direct questions regarding this Bid to: Roman Martinez —
rmartin9@mdc.edu, Group Director - Purchasing Department,
Miami Dade College, 11011 SW 104th Street, Miami, FL
33176, (305)237-0012.

If a person decides to appeal any decision with respect to any
matter considered at the above cited meeting, you will need a
record of the proceedings, and for such purpose you may need
to ensure that a verbatim record of the proceedings is made,
which record includes the testimony and evidence upon which
the appeal is to be based. A copy of the agenda may be obtained
by writing to: Miami Dade College, Office of the Purchasing
Director, 11011 S.W. 104 Street, Miami, FL 33176 or by
calling (305)237-2402.

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

DISTRICT BOARD OF TRUSTEES

MIAMI DADE COLLEGE

11011 S.W. 104th STREET

MIAMI, FL 33176-3393

Responses to the Invitation To Bid (ITB) listed below will be
accepted in the PURCHASING DEPARTMENT, Room 9254,
by 3:00 p.m. on July 24, 2019

Prospective proposers may obtain the ITB solicitation at the
College’s Purchasing Department website,
http://www.mdc.edu/purchasing/bid-posting.aspx, or by calling
(305)237-2402.

BID NUMBER: 2019-RM-43, BID TITLE: Miami Culinary
Institute Uniforms & Knives

Direct questions regarding this Bid to: Rossella Montejo —
rmontejo@mdc.edu, Purchasing Department, Miami Dade
College, 11011 SW 104th Street, Miami, FL 33176, (305)237-
0009.

2983


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
http://www.mdc.edu/purchasing/bids.asp
mailto:rbristol@mdc.edu
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

If a person decides to appeal any decision with respect to any
matter considered at the above cited meeting, you will need a
record of the proceedings, and for such purpose you may need
to ensure that a verbatim record of the proceedings is made,
which record includes the testimony and evidence upon which
the appeal is to be based. A copy of the agenda may be obtained
by writing to: Miami Dade College, Office of the Purchasing
Director, 11011 S.W. 104 Street, Miami, FL 33176 or by calling
(305)237-2402.

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
BDC38-18/19: Bahia Honda State Park - Sandspur Day Use
Area and Sandspur Campground

NOTICE OF INVITATION TO BID: The Florida Department
of Environmental Protection, Bureau of Design and
Construction is soliciting formal, competitive, sealed bids from
contractors for bid number BDC38-18/19, Bahia Honda State
Park — Sandspur Day Use Area and Sandspur Campground.
More info @ https://tinyurl.com/yxdg8oza.

Section XIlI
Miscellaneous

DEPARTMENT OF STATE

Index of Administrative Rules Filed with the Secretary of State
Pursuant to subparagraph 120.55(1)(b)6. — 7., F.S., the below
list of rules were filed in the Office of the Secretary of State
between 3:00 p.m., Wednesday, June 26, 2019 and 3:00 p.m.,
Tuesday, July 2, 2019.

Rule No. File Date Effective

Date
12ER18-06 6/27/2019 7/1/2019
40C-1.004 7/1/2019 7/21/2019
40C-1.135 7/1/2019 7/21/2019
40C-1.603 7/1/2019 7/21/2019
40C-1.706 7/1/2019 7/21/2019
40C-1.1004 7/1/2019 7/21/2019
40C-1.1005 7/1/2019 7/21/2019
40C-1.1007 7/1/2019 7/21/2019
40C-1.1008 7/1/2019 7/21/2019
40D-8.624 6/27/2019 7/17/2019
53ER19-41 6/27/2019 6/27/2019
53ER19-42 6/27/2019 6/27/2019

2984

53ER19-43 6/27/2019 6/27/2019
53ER19-44 6/27/2019 6/27/2019
53ER19-45 6/27/2019 6/27/2019
53ER19-46 6/27/2019 6/27/2019
55A-7.010 7/1/2019 7/21/2019
55A-7.0111 7/1/2019 7/21/2019
55A-7.013 7/1/2019 7/21/2019
59G-4.002 6/27/2019 7/17/2019
59E-2.024 6/28/2019 7/18/2019
60S-4.007 6/28/2019 7/18/2019
61J1-6.001 6/27/2019 7/17/2019
61J1-10.003 6/27/2019 7/17/2019
62-730.020 6/26/2019 6/26/2019
62-730.021 6/26/2019 6/26/2019
62-730.030 6/26/2019 6/26/2019
62-730.160 6/26/2019 6/26/2019
62-730.170 6/26/2019 6/26/2019
62-730.180 6/26/2019 6/26/2019
62-730.181 6/26/2019 6/26/2019
62-730.183 6/26/2019 6/26/2019
62-730.185 6/26/2019 6/26/2019
62-730-.220 6/26/2019 6/26/2019
64B8ER19-1 6/27/2019 6/27/2019
64B8-41.001 6/27/2019 7/17/2019
64B15ER19-1 6/27/2019 6/27/2019
68-1.003 6/27/2019 7/17/2019

LIST OF RULES AWAITING LEGISLATIVE
APPROVAL SECTIONS 120.541(3), 373.139(7)
AND/OR 373.1391(6), FLORIDA STATUTES

Rule No. File Date Effective

Date
60FF1-5.009 7/21/2016 Fk [k [k kK
64B8-10.003 12/9/2015 Fk [k [k



https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=1

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 45, Number 129, July 3, 2019

69L-3.009 12/5/2018 Fk [k [k

Section XIlI
Index to Rules Filed During Preceding
Week

NOTE: The above section will be published on Tuesday
beginning October 2, 2012, unless Monday is a holiday, then it
will be published on Wednesday of that week.

2985



