
Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

491 

 

Section I 

Notice of Development of Proposed Rules 

and Negotiated Rulemaking 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

Florida’s Office of Early Learning 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

6M-4.500 Child Attendance and Provider 

Reimbursements 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To clarify the procedures for child 

attendance and provider reimbursements. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: School Readiness 

Program Child Attendance and Provider Reimbursements. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1001.213(2), FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1002.82(2)(c), 1002.82(2)(f)1.a.(III), 

1002.82(2)(p), 1002.87(8), (9), FS. 

A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD 

AT THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW: 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, February 15, 2017, 9:30 a.m. 

to 10:30 a.m. EST or until business is concluded, whichever is 

earlier.  

PLACE: via GoToWebinar only. To register for the webinar, 

please visit: 

http://www.floridaearlylearning.com/statewide_initiatives/law

s_and_rules/proposed_rules.aspx 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Katerina Maroney, School Readiness Policy 

Supervisor, (850)717-8614. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: via 

GoToWebinar only. To register for the webinar, please visit: 

http://www.floridaearlylearning.com/statewide_initiatives/law

s_and_rules/proposed_rules.aspx 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS: 

Not currently available. It will be made available on the Office 

of Early Learning website prior to the date of the rule 

development workshop at: 

http://www.floridaearlylearning.com/statewide_initiatives/law

s_and_rules/proposed_rules.aspx 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

Florida’s Office of Early Learning 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

6M-9.115 Procedures and Criteria for Approval of 

School Readiness Plans 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To revise the procedures and 

criteria for approval of early learning coalitions’ school 

readiness plan. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Procedures and 

criteria for approval of early learning coalitions’ school 

readiness plan. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1001.213(2), 1002.85(1), FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1002.85, FS. 

A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD 

AT THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW: 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, February 15, 2017, 11:00 

a.m. to 12:00 p.m. EST or until business is concluded, 

whichever is earlier. 

PLACE: via GoToWebinar only. To register for the webinar, 

please visit: 

http://www.floridaearlylearning.com/statewide_initiatives/law

s_and_rules/proposed_rules.aspx 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Katerina Maroney, School Readiness Policy 

Supervisor, (850)717-8614. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: 

Katerina Maroney, 250 Marriott Drive, Tallahassee, FL 

32399, (850)717-8614 or email 

Katerina.Maroney@oel.myflorida.com. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS:  

Not currently available. A copy will be made available on the 

Office of Early Learning website prior to the date of the rule 

development workshop. It will be posted at:  

http://www.floridaearlylearning.com/statewide_initiatives/law

s_and_rules/proposed_rules.aspx 

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION 

Health Facility and Agency Licensing 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

59A-4.200 Definitions 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Agency proposes to revise 

subsection 59A-4.200, F.A.C., to merge all Gold Seal criteria 

and requirements in one rule. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1044
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6M-4.500
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1001.213(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1002.82(2)(c)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201002.82(2)(f)1.a.(III)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201002.82(2)(p)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201002.87(8)
http://www.floridaearlylearning.com/statewide_initiatives/laws_and_rules/proposed_rules.aspx
http://www.floridaearlylearning.com/statewide_initiatives/laws_and_rules/proposed_rules.aspx
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1044
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6M-9.115
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1001.213(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201002.85(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1002.85
http://www.floridaearlylearning.com/statewide_initiatives/laws_and_rules/proposed_rules.aspx
http://www.floridaearlylearning.com/statewide_initiatives/laws_and_rules/proposed_rules.aspx
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=186
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-4.200


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

492 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: The Agency 

proposes to amend rule 59A-4.200, F.A.C., to merge all Gold 

Seal criteria and requirements in Rules 59A-4.200, 59A-4.201, 

59A-4.2015, 59A-4.202, 59A-4.203, 59A-4.204 and Rule 

59A-4.206, F.A.C. in one rule to simplify, consolidate and 

provide easier access to requirements for the Gold Seal 

Award. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 400.235, FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 400.235, FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD AT THE 

DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW: 

DATE AND TIME: February 16, 2017, 9:30 a.m. - 11:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Agency for Health Care Administration, 2727 Mahan 

Drive, Building 3, Conference Room B, Tallahassee, Florida 

32308 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Agency for Health Care Administration, 2727 

Mahan Drive, Mail Stop #33, Tallahassee, Florida 32308 If 

you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency 

using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Jacquie 

Williams, Agency for Health Care Administration, 2727 

Mahan Drive, Mail Stop #33, Tallahassee, Florida 32308 or 

via email at LTCStaff@AHCA.myflorida.com. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE 

FROM THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE. 

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES 

Agency for Persons with Disabilities 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

65G-2.008 Staffing Requirements 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of this rulemaking is 

to amend the existing rule to allow licensed facilities to hire 

direct service providers without the experience requirements 

as described within this section, if during their first 90 days of 

employment such direct service providers are under the direct 

supervision of another direct service provider that possesses 

the required experience as described within this section. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Qualifications for 

exception to experience requirements of direct service 

providers. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 393.501, 393.067, FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 393.0655, 393.067, FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Michele 

Lucas, Agency Clerk, Agency for Persons with Disabilities, 

4030 Esplanade Way, Suite 335K, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, 

(850)921-3779, michele.lucas@apdcares.org. 

 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS: 

 

65G-2.008 Staffing Requirements 

“Prior to beginning employment, direct service providers 

must have at least one year experience in psychiatric, nursing 

or childcare setting or working with person with a 

developmental disability. Successfully completed college, 

vocational or technical training equal to 30 semester hours, 45 

quarter hours, or 720 classroom hours in special education, 

mental health, counseling, guidance, social work or health and 

rehabilitative services can substitute for the required 

experience. Direct service providers hired by the licensee prior 

to the adoption date of this rule shall be exempt from this 

requirement. Licensees may allow direct service providers to 

begin their employment without the experience requirements 

described within this section if such direct service providers 

spend their first 90 days of employment working directly 

under the supervision or oversight of another direct service 

provider who does possess the required experience 

requirements. If such arrangements will be made for a direct 

service provider, the licensee shall provide written notification 

to the Regional Office, to include the name of the direct 

service provider and the facility in which he or she will be 

working, within five business days of the direct service 

provider’s employment. The licensee shall conduct a 

performance evaluation of any direct service provider, 

working under this section’s exception to the experience 

requirement, within 120 days of his or her employment. 

Documentation of this performance evaluation shall be 

maintained within the personnel file of the direct service 

provider and made available to the Agency upon request. A 

violation of this paragraph shall constitute a Class III 

violation.” 

Rulemaking authority 393.501, 393.067 FS. Law Implemented 

393.0655, 393.067, FS. History-New 7-1-14, Amended_____. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=400.235
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=400.235
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=560
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-2.008
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=393.501,%20393.067,%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=393.0655,%20393.067,%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-2.008


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

493 

 

Section II 

Proposed Rules 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

Division of Community Development 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

73C-42.005 Notices, Agenda, Conduct of Proceedings 

73C-42.008 General Requirements 

73C-42.013 Designation or Non-Designation of 

Proposed Development by Reviewing 

Entities 

73C-42.020 Duties of Review Board Staff 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To streamline the procedures and 

practices pertaining to Florida Quality Developments by 

repealing unnecessary and/or duplicative rules. Rules 73C-

42.005, .008 and .013, Fla. Admin. Code (F.A.C.) are 

duplicative of language set forth in other rules within Chapter 

73C-42, F.A.C. and/or within Section 380.061(5), Florida 

Statutes. Rule 73C-42.020, F.A.C., has been determined to be 

unnecessary and sets forth duties not required by statute. 

SUMMARY: The rules to be repealed are not necessary as 

they are already defined within the rule chapter, Florida 

Statutes, or are unnecessary. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION:  

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse 

impact on small business or likely increase directly or 

indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the 

aggregate within one year after the implementation of the rule. 

A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency.  

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 380.032(a), 380.061, 

380.061(6)(d), FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 380.061, 380.061(6)(a),(8)b), FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE 

DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW (IF NOT 

REQUESTED, THIS HEARING WILL NOT BE HELD):  

DATE AND TIME: February 21, 2017; 9:30 a.m. 

PLACE: Department of Economic Opportunity, Caldwell 

Building, 107 E. Madison Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, 

Conference Room 110, and by teleconference by calling: 

1(888)670-3525; Passcode: 9633615989 then #. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: M. Linville Atkins, Office of General 

Counsel, Department of Economic Opportunity, 107 East 

Madison Street, MSC 110, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, 

(850)245-7150, Linville.atkins@deo.myflorida.com. 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

73C-42.005 Notices, Agenda, Conduct of Proceedings. 

Rulemaking Authority 380.032(2)(a), 380.061(8)(b) FS. Law 

Implemented 380.061 FS. History–New 1-23-90, Amended 3-1-01, 

Formerly 9J-28.005, Repealed _______. 

 

73C-42.008 General Requirements. 

Rulemaking Authority 380.061(8)(b) FS. Law Implemented 380.061 

FS. History–New 1-23-90, Formerly 9J-28.008, Repealed _______. 

 

73C-42.013 Designation or Non-Designation of Proposed 

Development by Reviewing Entities. 

Rulemaking Authority 380.061(8)(b) FS. Law Implemented 380.061 

FS. History–New 1-23-90, Formerly 9J-28.013, Repealed 

_________.  

 

73C-42.020 Duties of Review Board Staff. 

Rulemaking Authority 380.032(2)(a), 380.061(6)(d), (8)(b) FS. Law 

Implemented 380.061, 380.061(6)(a) FS. History–New 1-23-90, 

Amended 3-1-01, Formerly 9J-28.020, Repealed ________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

M. Linville Atkins 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Cissy Proctor 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: 1/3/17 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

Division of Community Development 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

73C-42.006 Application Forms 

73C-42.010 Preapplication Conferences 

73C-42.011 Filing the Application for Development 

Designation 

73C-42.023 Florida Quality Development Orders 

73C-42.024 Substantial Change 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: Chapter 380, Florida Statutes, 

provides for land and water management policies to guide 

responsible planning, growth, and development within the 

State of Florida that will be protective of natural resources and 

the environment and creates the Florida Quality Developments 

program. The Department seeks to combine Rules 73C-42.010 

and .011, Fla. Admin. Code (F.A.C.), as both set forth 

procedures and practices for developers related to filing 

applications for development designation. The form for 

making application which is set forth in Rule 73C-42.006, 

F.A.C., is proposed to be moved into the text of the amended 

rule and this rule repealed. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1066
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-42.005
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-42.008
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-42.013
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-42.020
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=380.032(a)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20380.061
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20380.061(6)(d)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=380.061
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20380.061(6)(a)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1066
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-42.006
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-42.010
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-42.011
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-42.023
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73C-42.024


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

494 

To streamline and clarify for developers, the Department seeks 

to combine Rules 73C-42.023 and .024, F.A.C., as both rules 

address development orders issued by the Department. 

SUMMARY: The proposed changes to Rules 73C-42.010 and 

.011, F.A.C., address applications for development 

designation. The proposed changes to Rules 73C-42.023 and 

.024, F.A.C., address development orders issued by the 

Department. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION:  

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse 

impact on small business or likely increase directly or 

indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the 

aggregate within one year after the implementation of the rule. 

A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency.  

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: The agency has previously performed a review of the 

statutory requirements and determined that Rules 73C-42.006, 

.010, .011, .023, and .024, F.A.C., have no adverse impact or 

regulatory costs which exceed any of the criteria established in 

Section 120.541(2)(a), Florida Statutes. Specifically, the 

amended rules will contain the text of the repealed rules such 

that there is no change impacting regulatory costs. These rules 

are therefore expected be able to take effect without the need 

of being ratified by the Legislature. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 189.017 and 189.018, FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 189.018, 189.061, and 189.064, FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE 

DATE,TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW(IF NOT 

REQUESTED, THIS HEARING WILL NOT BE HELD):  

DATE AND TIME: February 21, 2017; 9:30 a.m. 

PLACE: Department of Economic Opportunity, Caldwell 

Building, 107 E. Madison Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, 

Conference Room 110, and by teleconference by calling: 

1(888)670-3525; Passcode: 9633615989 then #. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: : M. Linville Atkins, Office of General 

Counsel, Department of Economic Opportunity, 107 East 

Madison Street, MSC 110, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, 

(850)245-7150, Linville.atkins@deo.myflorida.com. 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

73C-42.006 Application Forms. 

Rulemaking Authority 380.032(2)(a), 380.061(4), (8)(b) FS. Law 

Implemented 380.061, 380.061(4) FS. History–New 1-23-90, 

Amended 3-1-01, Formerly 9J-28.006, Repealed __________. 

 

73C-42.010 Preapplication and Application Procedures 

Conferences 

(1) Preapplication Conferences. 

(a) through (b) No change. 

(c) Upon the request of the developer, the regional 

planning agency, the local government, or the Department, 

other affected state, regional, or local agencies shall 

participate in conference proceedings and shall identify the 

types of permits issued by the agencies, the level of 

information required, and the permit issuance procedures as 

applied to the proposed development. Such information shall 

be provided for initial project planning and coordination and 

shall not constitute a binding agency commitment to a course 

of action on an application for development designation or 

permit review unless so established in an agreement between 

the agency and the developer, pursuant to Rule 73C-42.007, 

F.A.C., of this rule. 

(d) through (e) No change. 

(f)(2) No change. 

(2) Filing the Application for Development Designation. 

(a) In accordance with subsection 380.061(5), F.S., the 

developer shall simultaneously file completed copies of an 

application for development designation with the Department, 

the regional planning council, and the local government with 

jurisdiction using DEO-BCP-ADA-1, Development of 

Regional Impact Application for Development Approval, 

identified in subsection (3) of this rule.  

(b) Pursuant to Sections 380.061(5) and 120.60, F.S., the 

Department and the local government shall make a 

determination as to the completeness of the information 

contained in the application. The regional planning council 

may provide completeness comments to the Department and 

the local government. 

1. Within 30 days after receipt of an application, the 

Department and the local government shall notify the 

applicant of any apparent errors or omissions and request any 

additional information. Failure to correct an error or omission 

or to supply additional information shall not be grounds for 

denial of the application unless the reviewing entity timely 

notified the applicant within this 30-day period. 

2. The Department and the local government shall provide 

copies of their requests for additional information to the 

applicant, the regional planning council, and each other. The 

applicant shall submit the additionally requested information 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=189.017%20and%20189.018
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=189.018
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20189.061


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

495 

 

to the Department, the local government, and the regional 

planning council. 

3. The application for development designation shall be 

approved or denied by the Department within 90 days after 

receipt of the original complete application or receipt of the 

timely requested additional information or correction of errors 

or omissions which determine the application complete. The 

90 day time limitation prescribed by Section 120.60, F.S., for 

the approval or denial of license applications is subject to 

waiver by the applicant. The Department shall consider any 

report and recommendations made by the regional planning 

council which are received within 50 days after receipt of the 

complete application. In preparing its report and 

recommendations, the regional planning council should 

identify regional issues based on the criteria pursuant to 

Section 380.06(12), F.S. If the applicant chooses to appeal the 

completeness review for the FQD, the 90 day period will be 

tolled by the initiation of proceedings under Section 120.569, 

F.S., and will resume 10 days after the final order is issued by 

the Department, with copies provided to the local government, 

the applicant, and other parties. 

4. Upon the effective date of the development order, the 

developer shall have the right to use for the Development the 

certification mark registered with the Secretary of the Florida 

Department of State for Developments designated as FQDs 

under Section 380.061, F.S. The use of this certification mark 

shall be restricted to promotional, informational or advertising 

purposes in order to identify this Development as a 

development approved and designated under Section 380.061, 

F.S. A development designated as an FQD shall be exempt 

from development-of-regional-impact review under Section 

380.06, F.S. 

(3) Forms.  The following forms shall be used in carrying 

out the activities required under this rule and may be obtained 

without cost from the regional planning council or from the 

Department at the following address:  Department of 

Economic Opportunity, Division of Community Development, 

107 East Madison Street, Tallahassee, FL 32399. 

(a) Form Number DEO-BCP-ADA-1, Developments of 

Regional Impact Application for Development Approval, 

effective 11-20-90 (revised 10-1-11); 

(b) Form Number DEO-BCP-AGENCIES-1, Report of 

Agency Participation in Development of Regional Impact 

Preapplication Conferences, effective 11-20-90 (revised 10-1-

11); 

(c) Form Number DEO-BCP-PREAPP INFO-1, 

specifying the minimum information to be supplied by the 

applicant at the preapplication conference, effective 11-20-90 

(revised 10-1-11); 

(d) Form Number DEO-BCP-EFFECTIVE RULES-1, 

Notification to be Bound By Rules Adopted Pursuant to 

Chapters 403 and 373, F.S., In Effect When the Development 

Order Is Issued, effective 11-20-90 (revised 10-1-11). 

Rulemaking Authority 380.032(2)(a), 380.061(5) and (8)(b) FS. Law 

Implemented 380.031, 380.061(5)(b), (6) FS. History–New 1-23-90, 

Formerly 9J-28.010, Amended____. 

 

73C-42.011 Filing the Application for Development 

Designation. 

Rulemaking Authority 380.032(2)(a), 380.061, 380.061(8)(b) FS. 

Law Implemented 380.061, 380.061(5)(b), (6) FS. History–New 1-

23-90, Amended 3-1-01, Formerly 9J-28.011, Repealed ________. 

 

73C-42.023 Florida Quality Development Orders. 

(1) This rule provides the form, manner of rendition, and 

contents for Chapter 380, F.S., development orders issued by 

the Department of Economic Opportunity for developments 

designated as an FQD and review of substantial deviations to 

an FQD development order under Section 380.061, F.S. An 

FQD development order shall: 

(a) through (d) No change. 

(2) Without an effective Chapter 380, F.S., FQD 

development order, the developer shall not have authorization 

to commence development on any portion of the development 

covered by the application for development designation unless 

the developer has entered into a preliminary development 

agreement with the Department of Economic Opportunity 

pursuant to Section 380.06(8), F.S., and Rule 73C-42.007, 

F.A.C. 

(3) No change. 

(4) Requirements for an FQD development order: 

(a) The copy of any FQD development order rendered to 

the local government with jurisdiction, the regional planning 

agency, and the developer shall: 

1. through 3. No change 

4. Contain the signature of the Executive Director 

Secretary of the Department or his or her designee and shall be 

certified by the agency clerk as being a complete and accurate 

copy of the development order. 

(b) No change. 

(5) Complete copies of any development orders issued 

pursuant to Section 380.061, F.S., including any amendments 

to a previously issued development order, shall be transmitted 

by the Secretary of the Department to the local government 

with jurisdiction, to the appropriate regional planning council, 

and to the owner or developer of the property subject to such 

order within 30 days of the Secretary’s issuance. A 

development order shall take effect upon transmittal to the 

above parties unless a later effective date is specified in the 

order. The effectiveness of a development order shall be 

stayed by the filing of a notice of appeal pursuant to Section 

380.07(5) 380.061(7)(b), F.S.  



Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

496 

(6) The development order shall specify the requirements 

for an annual report. The annual report shall be submitted by 

the developer to the Department, the regional planning 

agency, the local government, and any other entity so 

identified in the development order, on Department of 

Economic Opportunity form Number DEO-BCP-BIENNIAL 

REPORT-1, Biennial Status Report, effective 6-1-03 (revised 

10-1-11), which is incorporated herein by reference and 

available without cost from the Department by making a 

written request to:  Division of Community Development, 107 

East Madison Street, MSC 160, Caldwell Building, 

Tallahassee, FL 32399. the form specified by the Department 

of Economic Opportunity. Every development order shall 

require the annual report to include the following: 

(a) through (d) No change. 

(e) Identification and intended use of any lands 

purchased, leased, or optioned to purchase by the developer 

which are physically proximate, as defined under paragraph 

73C-42.0275(2)(a), F.A.C., to the FQD site since the 

development order was issued; 

(f) No change. 

(7) No change. 

(8) Any proposed change to a previously designated FQD 

which creates a reasonable likelihood of any additional 

regional impacts not previously reviewed by the Department, 

the local government and the regional planning council or a 

change involving any of the FQD designation criteria pursuant 

to the provisions of Section 380.061(3), F.S., shall constitute a 

substantial change and shall cause the development to be 

subject to further FQD review. 

(9)(a) Whenever the developer of a designated FQD 

proposes a change in its plan of development or to conditions 

of the FQD development order, it shall submit its proposed 

change to the Department, the local government, and the 

regional planning council. Within 30 days of receipt of the 

proposed change, the Department shall notify the developer 

whether or not the change is a substantial change and, if the 

change is determined to be nonsubstantial, whether a 

modification of the FQD development order is needed. 

(b) If the Department and the local government, in 

consultation with the regional planning council, determine that 

the proposed change is not a substantial change and does not 

require a modification of the development order, the developer 

may proceed with the change, subject to applicable regulatory 

requirements. 

(c) If the Department and the local government, in 

consultation with the regional planning council, determine that 

the proposed change is not a substantial change, but may 

require a modification of the development order, the 

Department shall, subject to the approval of the local 

government modify the development order within 60 days of 

the receipt of the proposed change to the Department or shall 

notify the developer in writing that it will not modify the 

development order. 

(d) If the Department or the local government, in 

consultation with the regional planning council, determines 

that the proposed change is a substantial change, the change 

shall require the review and approval of the reviewing entities 

prior to commencing such development activity. This review 

and approval shall follow the procedures and timetables used 

for the designation of a development as an FQD as set forth in 

Section 380.061, F.S., and Rule 73C-42.011, F.A.C., with 

such review commencing on the date the decision is made that 

a proposed change needs to undergo further FQD review. 

Following approval of a substantial change by the reviewing 

entities, the Department shall modify the development order to 

incorporate that approved substantial change. 

(e) If the Department or the local government, in 

consultation with the regional planning council, determines 

that the developer has made or is making an alteration to the 

plan of development which they believe may be a change, they 

shall require the developer to submit information on that 

alteration for review under this rule section. 

(f) Prior to the determination by the Department and the 

local government, in consultation with the regional planning 

council, of whether a proposed change is a substantial change, 

whether the proposed change requires an amendment of the 

FQD development order, or whether the agencies approve of 

the change under provisions of subsection (9) within this rule 

section, the developer may not proceed with such 

development. 

(10) A “substantial change” shall mean either: 

(a) Any deviation in the carrying out of a condition, 

commitment, or agreement set forth and recited in the FQD 

development order which so alters the condition, commitment, 

or agreement that it can be fairly said to change the intent or 

result of the condition, commitment, or agreement. 

(b) Other similar deviations in the construction of the 

Development or the alignment of roads which alter 

significantly the commitments or agreements of the developer 

or which represent a significant departure from the plan of 

development or the conditions of the FQD development order. 

(c) Any proposed change that meets or exceeds 150 

percent of the criteria specified in Section 380.06(19)(b), F.S., 

shall be presumed to be a substantial change. However, the 

developer may rebut this presumption by demonstrating that 

the proposed change is not substantial under the criteria 

pursuant to paragraphs (10)(a) and (10)(b) of this rule. 

(d) Any proposed change that meets or is less than 200 

percent of the criteria in Section 380.06(19)(b)9., F.S., shall be 

presumed not to be a substantial change; provided that the 

change involves the addition of residential units and that the 



Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

497 

 

developer guarantees that 25 percent of the units will be 

affordable to very low- or low-income households. 

(11) A “substantial change” shall not include proposed 

alterations that do not affect the plan of development or the 

conditions or commitments expressed in the FQD 

development order. “Substantial change” shall not include 

such modifications as the following: 

(a) Architectural or landscape architectural changes 

necessitated by the soil, topography, or other onsite 

conditions; 

(b) Reduction of the amount of impervious surface area; 

and, 

(c) Reduction in open space due to governmental 

requirements for transportation improvements. 

(12) The amended development order will be submitted to 

the local government and the regional planning council 

pursuant to subsection (5) of this rule. 

(13) Development within a previously approved FQD 

may continue, as approved, during the review of a substantial 

change as decided under paragraph (9)(d) of this rule. Also, 

those portions of the FQD which are not affected by the 

proposed substantial change may continue to be developed. 

Rulemaking Authority 380.032(2)(a), 380.061(8)(b) FS. Law 

Implemented 380.061, 380.061(5)(d) FS. History–New 1-23-90, 

Amended 3-1-01, Formerly 9J-28.023, Amended_____. 

 

73C-42.024 Substantial Change. 

Rulemaking Authority 380.061(8)(b) FS. Law Implemented 380.061 

FS. History–New 1-23-90, Formerly 9J-28.024, Repealed _______. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

M. Linville Atkins 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Cissy Proctor 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: 1/3/17 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: 1/23/17 

Section III 

Notice of Changes, Corrections and 

Withdrawals 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

State Board of Education 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

6A-1.09951 Requirements for the Florida Seal of 

Biliteracy Program 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 43 No. 16, January 25, 

2017 issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

(1) The Florida Seal of Biliteracy Program is established 

to recognize a high school graduate who has attained a high 

level of competency in listening, speaking, reading, and 

writing in one or more foreign world languages in addition to 

English by the award of a silver or gold seal on a standard 

high school diploma. 

(2) Definitions. 

(a) No change. 

(b) “Foreign World language” means a language other 

than English and includes American Sign Language, classical 

languages, and indigenous languages. 

(3) Criteria for Eligibility. Beginning with the 2016-2017 

school year, the Gold Seal of Biliteracy or the Silver Seal of 

Biliteracy shall be awarded to a high school student who has 

earned a standard high school diploma and who has satisfied 

one of the following criteria for eligibility: 

(a) Silver Seal of Biliteracy. 

1. Has earned four (4) foreign world language course 

credits in the same foreign world language with a cumulative 

3.0 grade point average or higher on a 4.0 scale; 

2. through 3. No change. 

(b) Gold Seal of Biliteracy. 

1. Has earned four (4) foreign world language course 

credits in the same foreign world language with a cumulative 

3.0 grade point average or higher on a 4.0 scale and Level 4 or 

higher on the Grade 10 English Language Arts (ELA) Florida 

Standards Assessment (FSA); 

2. through 3. No change. 

(4) Criteria for the award of credit. A high school student 

who did not enroll in, or complete, foreign world language 

courses, shall be awarded four (4) foreign three (3) world 

language high school course credits, upon attaining at least the 

minimum score or performance level set forth in subparagraph 

(3)(a)2. for the Silver Seal of Biliteracy. 

(5) through (7) No change. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=195
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6A-1.09951


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

498 

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION 

Health Facility and Agency Licensing 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

59A-9.019 Definitions 

59A-9.020 Licensure Procedures 

59A-9.021 Investigations and License and Validation 

Inspections 

59A-9.022 Physical Plant Requirements for Abortion 

Clinics When Providing Second Trimester 

Abortions 

59A-9.0225 Clinic Supplies and Equipment Standards 

for Second Trimester Abortions 

59A-9.023 Clinical Personnel 

59A-9.024 Clinic Policies and Procedures for Second 

Trimester Abortions 

59A-9.025 Medical Screening and Evaluation of 

Patients Receiving Second Trimester 

Abortions 

59A-9.026 Second Trimester Abortion Procedure 

59A-9.027 Recovery Room Standards for Second 

Trimester Abortions 

59A-9.028 Post Procedure Follow-up Care for Patients 

Receiving Second Trimester Abortions  

59A-9.029 Abortion Clinic Incident Reporting for 

Second Trimester Abortions  

59A-9.030 Disposal of Fetal Remains 

59A-9.031 Clinical Records 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 42 No. 216, November 

4, 2016 issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

On the Abortion Clinic Incident Report Form, AHCA Form 

3130-1003, July 2016, the following changes have been made: 

the request for patient identifier in section 2 and the provider 

examples in section 3.C. have been removed. 

 

On the Refusal to Permit Administration of Rh(D) 

Immunoglobulin, AHCA Form 3130-1002, July 2016, the 

following change will be made: all references to Rh(D) 

immunoglobulin will be changed to Rho(D) immune globulin. 

 

The following sections of the proposed rule will be changed to 

read: 

 

59A-9.019 Definitions. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 390.012 FS. Law Implemented 390.011, 

390.012 FS. History–New 6-13-90, Amended 4-17-91, Formerly 

10D-72.019, Amended 8-24-94, 9-25-06, 1-6-15, ___________. 

 

59A-9.020 Licensure Procedures. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 390.012, 390.014(3), 408.033, 408.819 FS. 

Law Implemented 390.012, 390.014, 390.015, 408.033, 408.805, 

408.806, 408.809, 408.810, 408.815 FS. History–New 6-13-90, 

Amended 4-17-91, 10-9-91, Formerly 10D-72.020, Amended 8-24-

94, 9-25-06, 1-6-15, ___________. 

 

59A-9.021 Investigations and License and Validation 

Inspections. 

(1) No change. 

(2) The Agency shall conduct an unannounced licensure 

inspection of all abortion clinics. 

(2)(3) Representatives of the Agency shall conduct 

licensure inspections with the least possible disruption to 

clinic activities and in a manner considerate of the privacy and 

confidentiality of any patient who is present therein. 

Rulemaking Authority 390.012, 408.819 FS. Law Implemented 

390.012, 408.811 FS. History–New 6-13-90, Amended 4-17-91, 10-

9-91, Formerly 10D-72.021, Amended 9-25-06, 1-6-15, _________. 

 

59A-9.022 Physical Plant Requirements for Abortion 

Clinics When Providing Second Trimester Abortions. 

The following are minimum standards of construction and 

specified minimum essential physical plant requirements 

which must be met when providing second trimester abortions. 

(1) through (3) No change. 

(4) Private procedure room(s) with adequate light and 

ventilation for abortion procedures; 

(5) through (6) No change. 

(7) Cleaning and sterilizing area(s) adequate for the 

cleaning and sterilizing of instruments; 

(8) Adequate and Ssecure storage area(s) for the storage 

of medical records and necessary equipment and supplies; and, 

(9) No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 390.012(1) FS. Law Implemented 

390.012(3)(a) FS. History–New 9-25-06, Amended _________. 

 

59A-9.0225 Clinic Supplies and Equipment Standards for 

Second Trimester Abortions. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 390.012(1) FS. Law Implemented 

390.012(3)(b) FS. History–New 9-25-06, Amended _______. 

 

59A-9.023 Clinic Personnel. 

Abortions shall be performed only by a licensed physician 

who has admitting privileges at a hospital within reasonable 

proximity to the clinic. Physician admitting privileges are 

optional if the clinic has a written transfer agreement with a 

hospital within reasonable proximity. At the time of transfer to 

the clinic shall provide to the receiving hospital a copy of the 

patient’s medical records related to the pregnancy being 

terminated. specifying the patient’s complete medical record 

held by the clinic and physician shall accompany any patient 

transferred to the hospital. Each abortion clinic providing 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=186
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-9.019
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-9.020
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-9.021
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-9.022
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-9.0225
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-9.023
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-9.024
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-9.025
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-9.026
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-9.027
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-9.028
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-9.029
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-9.030
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-9.031


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

499 

 

second trimester abortions shall have a staff that is adequately 

trained and capable of providing appropriate service and 

supervision to the patients. The clinic will have a position 

description for each position delineating duties and 

responsibilities and maintain personnel records for all 

employees performing or monitoring patients receiving a 

second trimester abortion.  

(1) through (5) No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 390.012 FS. Law Implemented 390.0111(2), 

390.012 FS. History–New 6-13-90, Amended 4-17-91, Formerly10D-

72.023, Amended 9-25-06, ____________. 

 

59A-9.024 Clinic Policies and Procedures for Second 

Trimester Abortions. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 390.012(1) FS. Law Implemented 390.012 FS. 

History–New 9-25-06, Amended _______. 

 

59A-9.025 Medical Screening and Evaluation of Patients 

Receiving Second Trimester Abortions. 

(1) through (3) No change. 

(4) Rh blood type D. Rh testing shall be performed on all 

patients, unless results of previous testing is available and 

documented in the medical record reliable written 

documentation of blood type is available. 

(5) through (6) No change. 

(7) If a person who is not a physician performs an 

ultrasound examination, that person shall have documented 

evidence that he or she has completed a course in the 

operation of ultrasound equipment. Such documentation shall 

be retained on file at the clinic. 

(8) No change. 

(9) Each abortion clinic must be in compliance with 

Section 390.0111, F.S. 

Rulemaking Authority 390.012(1) FS. Law Implemented 390.0111, 

390.012(3)(d) FS. History–New 9-25-06, Amended 1-2-14, 

__________. 

 

59A-9.026 Second Trimester Abortion Procedure. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 390.012(1) FS. Law Implemented 

390.012(3)(e) FS. History–New 9-25-06, Amended ____________. 

 

59A-9.027 Recovery Room Standards for Second 

Trimester Abortions. 

Each abortion clinic which is providing second trimester 

abortions shall comply with the following recovery room 

standards when providing second trimester abortions. 

(1) through (2) No change. 

(3) A physician shall discuss Rho Rh(D) immune globulin 

with each patient for whom it is indicated and will ensure that 

it is offered to the patient in the immediate postoperative 

period or that it will be available to the patient within 72 hours 

following completion of the abortion procedure. If the patient 

refuses the Rho Rh(D) immune globulin, refusal shall be 

documented on Refusal to Permit Administration of Rho 

Rh(D) Immune Globulin Immunoglobulin, AHCA Form 

3130-1002, July 2016 which is incorporated by reference. The 

form can be obtained at 

https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-

07598 and from the Agency for Health Care Administration, 

Hospital and Outpatient Services Unit, Mail Stop #31, 2727 

Mahan Drive, Tallahassee, Florida 32308 or on the Agency 

website at: http://ahca.myflorida.com/HQAlicensureforms. 

The form shall be signed by the patient, physician, and a 

witness, and shall be included in the patient’s medical record.  

(4) through (5) No change. 

 Rulemaking Authority 390.012(1) FS. Law Implemented 

390.012(3)(f) FS. History–New 9-25-06, Amended _________. 

 

59A-9.028 Post Procedure Follow-up Care for Patients 

Receiving Second Trimester Abortions. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 390.012(1) FS. Law Implemented 

390.012(3)(g) FS. History–New 9-25-06, Amended _________.  

 

59A-9.029 Abortion Clinic Incident Reporting for Second 

Trimester Abortions. 

This section shall apply to incidents involving patients 

receiving second trimester abortions in any abortion clinic 

providing second trimester abortions. An abortion clinic shall 

maintain a record of each incident that results in serious injury 

as defined in Section 390.012(3)(h)1., F.S. to a patient or a 

viable fetus. 

(1) No change. 

(2) The report must be submitted on the Abortion Clinic 

Incident Report Form, AHCA Form 3130-1003, July 2016, 

which is hereby incorporated by reference. The form can be 

obtained at 

https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-

07599 and from the Agency for Health Care Administration, 

Hospital and Outpatient Services Unit, Mail Stop #31, 2727 

Mahan Drive, Tallahassee, Florida 32308 or on the Agency 

website at: http://ahca.myflorida.com/HQAlicensureforms. 

(3) If a patient death occurs the abortion clinic shall report 

the death to the Department and the appropriate regulatory 

board not later than the next workday. The report to the 

Department shall be filed as required by Rule 64V-1.0061, 

F.A.C. 

Rulemaking Authority 390.012(1) FS. Law Implemented 

390.012(3)(h) FS. History–New 9-25-06, Amended _________. 

 

59A-9.030 Disposal of Fetal Remains. 

Fetal remains shall be disposed of in a sanitary and 

appropriate manner and in accordance with standard health 



Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

500 

practices and Chapters 381 and 390, F.S. and Chapter 64E-16, 

F.A.C. 

(1) No change. 

(2) Packages or containers of fetal remains shall be 

labeled to include: 

(a) No change. 

(b) Medical record number or other identifier of the 

patient; 

(b)(c) One of the following phrases: Biomedical Waste, 

Biohazardous Waste, Biohazard, Infectious Waste or 

Infectious Substance;. 

Rulemaking Authority 390.012 FS. Law Implemented 381.0098, 

390.0111 390.011, 390.012 FS. History–New 6-13-90, Amended 4-

17-91, Formerly 10D-72.030, Amended 9-25-06, ____________. 

 

59A-9.031 Clinical Records. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 390.012 FS. Law Implemented 390.012 FS. 

History–New 6-13-90, Amended 4-17-91, Formerly 10D-72.031, 

Amended 9-25-06, _________. 

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES 

Family Safety and Preservation Program 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

65C-22.008 School Age Child Care 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 42 No. 225, November 

18, 2016 issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

65C-22.008 School-Age Child Care. 

(1) Application for licensure. Application for a license or 

for renewal of a license to operate a school-age child care 

program must be made on CF-FSP Form (insert number) , 

(insert date), Application for a License to Operate a School-

Age Child Care Facility, which is incorporated by reference. 

CF-FSP Form (insert number) may be obtained from the 

Department’s website at www.myflfamilies.com/childcare or 

from the following link (insert link). 

(2) Licensing:  A school-age child care program must be 

licensed prior to operation and for continued operation, unless 

the program demonstrates that it is exempt pursuant to 

subsection (3), below.  The license is issued in the name of the 

owner. The owner may be an individual, partnership, 

association, company or corporation, and the license must be 

posted in a conspicuous location where the school-age child 

care program is operating. 

(3) Exemptions: A school-age child care program is not 

required to be licensed as long as the program complies with 

the minimum background screening requirements provided in 

ss.402.305 and 402.3055, Florida Statutes and if the program 

demonstrates that conditions of one of the following 

criteria outlined in subsections a-e below are met:.A school-

age program exempted under subsection (3)(a),(c) or (d) 

below may become licensed if it chooses to meet all of the 

applicable licensing standards in subsection (4) below. 

(a) Programs on School Sites.  The program is located on 

a public/nonpublic school site and: 

1. Is operated and staffed directly by that school or 

through a formal agreement, such as a contract, between the 

school (or school district, when the latter reserves authority for 

such agreements) and a provider which names the 

school/school district as the responsible party for the operation 

of the program. A lease for space or user agreement, with or 

without the endorsement of the program by the school/school 

district, does not meet the formal agreement requirement. 

2. Serves only the school-age children attending the 

school during the school day. The program may provide 

services during any out-of-school time, including before 

school, after school, on teacher planning days, holidays, and 

intercessions that occur during the school district’s academic 

calendar year. 

3. Follows the standards set forth by the Florida Building 

Code State Requirements for Public Educational Facilities 

pursuant to section 402.305(5), F.S., programs operated in 

public school facilities, regardless of the operator. 

(b) Instruction/Tutorial Programs.  The program is not 

designated as a Gold Seal Quality Care provider andhas a 

single instructional/tutorial purpose and that purpose is the 

only service that the program provides. Some examples of 

these programs include, but are not limited to, tutoring; a 

computer class; a ballet class; a karate class; baseball 

instruction or other sport; the program cannot provide any 

service beyond the instructional and tutorial/academic activity 

and: 

1. Does not cater, serve, or prepare meals. The 

program may choose to provide drinks and ready-to-

eat snacks that are individually pre-packaged and do 

not require refrigeration. 

2. Does not advertise or otherwise represent that 

the program has attributes of child care, as defined in 

s. 402.302(1), F.S.; 

3. Enrollment information shall clearly define the 

duration of the instructional sessions. Session time 

may not exceed two hours. If tutoring is provided in 

multiple academic areas, the total combined session 

times cannot exceed three hours per day. 

4. Does not contract to deliver a school readiness 

program pursuant to section 1002.88, F.S. 

(c) Open Access Programs. The program is not 

designated as a Gold Seal Quality Care provider and 

meets all of the following criteria: 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=342
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-22.008
http://www.myflfamilies.com/childcare


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

501 

 

1.Operates/Serves children for less than four 

hours per day; however, the program may provide 

services during any out-of-school time, including 

before school, after school, on teacher planning days, 

holidays, and intercessions that occur during the 

school district’s official academic calendar year; 

2. Does not advertise or otherwise represent that 

the program is an afterschool child care program or 

that the program offers supervision; 

3. Allows children to enter and leave the 

program at any time without permission, prior 

arrangements, or supervision, and the program does 

not assume responsibility for supervision; 

4. Does not provide transportation, directly or 

through a contract or agreement with an outside 

entity, during the hours of operation for the purposes 

of field trips;, and 

5.Does not serve or prepare any meals, except 

those provided through the USDA Afterschool Meal 

Program (AMP) administered by the Florida 

Department of Health, pursuant to Section 

402.305(1)(c), F.S. Programs not participating in the 

AMP may choose to provide drinks and ready-to-eat 

snacks that are individually pre-packaged and do not 

require refrigeration. 

6. Does not contract to deliver a school readiness 

program pursuant to section 1002.88, F.S. 

(d) Any program that is not designated as a Gold Seal 

Quality Care provider and is providing care for school aged 

children that is operated by, or in affiliation with a national 

membership non-profit or not for profit organization 

that  certifies membership organizations, as of February 1, 

2017,  meeting the terms of section 402.301, F.S., in at least 

ten states, that was created for the purpose of providing 

activities that contribute to the development of good character 

or good sportsmanship or to the education or cultural 

development of minors in this state youth services and youth 

development, that charges a membership fee for children and 

may receive grant funding for services.  Such is certified by its 

national association as complying with the association’s 

purposes, procedures, minimum standards and mandatory 

requirements for all of its before school, after school or out of 

school time programs. The program must notify the 

Department prior to operating and annually, thereafter, of any 

operation of before school, after school or out of school time 

programs, provide verification of certification and good 

standing by its national association for all of its before school, 

after school or out of school time programs, and complete an 

annual attestation for compliance with background screening 

requirements. Failure by a program to comply with such 

reporting, providing required verifications, and screening 

requirements shall result in the loss of the program’s 

exemption from licensure. 

(e) The program is not designated as a Gold Seal Quality 

Care provider and provides child care exclusively for children 

in grades six and above. 

(4) School-Age Child Care Standards. School age child 

care programs must follow the standards found in the “School-

Age Child Care Licensing Handbook, February 2016, 

incorporated herein by reference.  The handbook may be 

obtained from the Department’s website at 

www.myflfamilies.com/childcare or from the following link 

(insert link). 

(5) Definitions for terms used in this rule are contained in 

the “School-Age Child Care Licensing Handbook”(insert 

date), 

(6) The following documents and forms are also 

incorporated by reference as part of this rule: 

(a) CF-FSP Form 5270, April 2006, Florida Child Care 

Professional Credential Certificate. A copy may be obtained 

from the department’s website 

at www.myflfamilies.com/childcare. 

(b) N-050-06 Child Care Food Program Meal Pattern for 

Children (CCFP), September 30, 2019. Copies may be 

obtained from the following link: 

http://www.floridahealth.gov/programs-and-

services/childrens-health/child-care-food-

program/nutrition/_documents/meal-pattern-for-children-9-

16.pdf. 

(c) USDA MyPlate. A copy may be obtained from the 

following 

link:http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-

03036. 

(d) Center for Disease Control guidelines. A copy may be 

obtained from the following link: 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03037. 

(e) CF-FSP Form 5268, July 2012, Child Care In-Service 

Training Record. A copy may be obtained from the 

following link: 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-

03033 . 

(f) CF-FSP 5337, March 2009, Child Abuse & Neglect 

Reporting Requirements. A copy may be obtained at the 

department’s website at www.myflfamilies.com/childcare. 

(g) CF-FSP 5217, July 2012, Volunteer 

Acknowledgement. A copy may be obtained at the following 

link: http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-

03032 

(h) CF Form 1649A, July 2012, Child Care Affidavit of 

Good Moral Character. A copy may be obtained from the 

following link: 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03027. 

http://www.myflfamilies.com/childcare
http://www.myflfamilies.com/childcare
http://www.floridahealth.gov/programs-and-services/childrens-health/child-care-food-program/nutrition/_documents/meal-pattern-for-children-9-16.pdf
http://www.floridahealth.gov/programs-and-services/childrens-health/child-care-food-program/nutrition/_documents/meal-pattern-for-children-9-16.pdf
http://www.floridahealth.gov/programs-and-services/childrens-health/child-care-food-program/nutrition/_documents/meal-pattern-for-children-9-16.pdf
http://www.floridahealth.gov/programs-and-services/childrens-health/child-care-food-program/nutrition/_documents/meal-pattern-for-children-9-16.pdf
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03036
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03036
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03037
http://following/
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03033
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03033
http://www.myflfamilies.com/childcare
http://following/
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03032
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03032
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03027


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

502 

(i) CF/PI 175-24, October 2007, Know Your Child Care 

Facility. A copy can be obtained from the department’s 

website at www.myflfamilies.com/childcare. 

(j) CF/PI 175-70, June 2009, Influenza Virus, Guide to 

Parents. A copy may be obtained from the department’s 

website at www.myflfamilies.com/childcare. 

(k) CF-FSP 5219, March 2009, Child Care Application 

for Enrollment. A copy may be obtained from the 

department’s website at www.myflfamilies.com/childcare. 

(l) CF-FSP Form 5131, July 2012, Background Screening 

and Personnel File Requirements. A copy may be obtained 

from the following link: 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03030. 

(m) CF-FSP Form 5290, March 2009, Florida Child Care 

Director Credential and Renewal Application. A copy may be 

obtained from the department’s website at www. 

myflfamilies.com/childcare. 

(n) CF-FSP Form 5252, April 2006, Florida Director 

Certificate. A copy may be obtained from the department’s 

website at www. myflfamilies.com/childcare. 

Section IV 

Emergency Rules 

NONE 

Section V 

Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Rule 

Variance or Waiver 

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS 

Southwest Florida Water Management District 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

40D-22.201 Year-Round Water Conservation Measures 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on January 30, 2017, the 

Southwest Florida Water Management District received a 

petition for a variance or waiver. 

Petitioner’s Name: Wellington at Seven Hills Homeowners 

Association, Inc. 

Rule No.: 40D-22.201 

Nature of the rule for which variance or waiver is sought: 

Lawn and landscape irrigation 

The Petition has been assigned tracking No. 17-4246. 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be 

obtained by contacting: Lois Sorensen, 7601 US Highway 

301, Tampa, Florida 33637, (813)985-7481, ext. 2298, 

water.variances@watermatters.org. Any interested person or 

other agency may submit written comments within 14 days 

after the publication of this notice. (R2017011). 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001 Safety Standards 

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety 

hereby gives notice: 

On January 30, 2017, the Division issued an order. The Final 

Order was in response to a Petition for an emergency 

permanent Variance from Bliss Condominium, filed January 

19, 2017, and advertised on January 23, 2017, in Vol. 43, No. 

14, of the Florida Administrative Register. No comments were 

received in response to the petition. The Final Order on the 

Petition for Variance grants the Petitioner a variance from 

Chapter 3007.7.1, 2014 Florida Building Code and Chapter 

3007.7.4, 2014 Florida Building Code that requires the fire 

service access elevator lobby having direct access to an exit 

enclosure and a lobby size of 150 square feet because the 

Petitioner has demonstrated that the purpose of the underlying 

statute has been met and that Petitioner would suffer a 

substantial hardship if required to comply with this rule 

(VW2017-007). 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be 

obtained by contacting: Michelle Comingore, Division of 

Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 2601 Blair 

Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013, 

dhr.elevators@myfloridalicense.com. 

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

62-701.300 Prohibitions 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on January 25, 2017, the 

Department of Environmental Protection received a petition 

for waiving a potable water well setback requirement from 

Friends Recycling, LLC. The petition requested a waiver from 

paragraph 62-701.300(2)(b), F.A.C., which states that no 

person shall store or dispose of solid waste within 500 feet of 

an existing or approved potable water well. Three potable 

water wells located off-site are less than 500 feet from the 

C&D facility. The activity is located at 2350 NW 27 Avenue, 

Ocala, in Marion County. Tthe petition has been assigned File 

No. SWVA 17-01 and OGC File No. 17-0048. 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be 

obtained by contacting: Department of Environmental 

Protection, Solid Waste Section, Mail Station 4565, 2600 Blair 

Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400, Attn: Cory 

Dilmore, (850)245-8735, cory.dilmore@dep.state.fl.us during 

normal business hours, 8:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m., Monday 

through Friday, except legal holidays. Written comments must 

http://www.myflfamilies.com/childcare
http://www.myflfamilies.com/childcare
http://www.myflfamilies.com/childcare
http://following/
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03030
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=123
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40D-22.201
mailto:water.variances@watermatters.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
mailto:dhr.elevators@myfloridalicense.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=62-701.300
mailto:cory.dilmore@dep.state.fl.us


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

503 

 

be received by the Department of Environmental Protection no 

later than 14 days from the date of publication of this notice. 

Section VI 

Notice of Meetings, Workshops and Public 

Hearings 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Administration 

The Florida Agricultural Museum announces a public meeting 

to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, February 15, 2017, 10:00 

a.m. 

PLACE: Florida Agricultural Museum, 7900 Old Kings Road 

North, Palm Coast, FL 32137 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

This is a meeting of the Board of Trustees to discuss general 

business. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Kara 

Hoblick at (386)446-7630. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 2 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Kara Hoblick at (386)446-7630. If you are hearing 

or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Marketing and Development 

The Florida Department of Agriculture and Consumer 

Services announces a telephone conference call to which all 

persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, February 14, 2017, 9:30 a.m. 

PLACE: Conference call: 1(888)670-3525, call-in code: 

9078980736 # 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Advisory Council meeting to discuss Committee Reports, 

Report on the Viticulture Trust Fund Collections, and Election 

of Officers. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Melissa 

Hunt, (850)841-0086. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Melissa Hunt, (850)841-0086. If you are hearing 

or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Melissa Hunt, 

(850)841-0086. 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Agricultural Water Policy 

The Polk Soil and Water Conservation District announces a 

workshop to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: February 7, 2017, 6:30 p.m. 

PLACE: USDA / NRCS office, 1700 HWY 17 South, Suite 2, 

Bartow, FL 33830 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

1. Call to order. 

2. Workshop on review of NRCS files. 

3. Discussion of NRCS Agreement (handed out at last 

meeting) 

4. Discussion and vote for location and day of meetings. 

5. Discuss and vote on another workshop day to figure out 

what direction we want our board to go with projects. 

6. Open floor for discussion. 

7. Adjournment. 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Agricultural Water Policy 

The Nassau Soil and Water Conservation District announces 

public meetings to which all persons are invited. 

DATES AND TIMES: February 14, 2017, 5:00 p.m.; March 

14, 2017, 5:00 p.m.; April 11, 2017, 5:00 p.m.; May 9, 2017, 

5:00 p.m.; June 13, 2017, 5:00 p.m.; July 11, 2017, 5:00 p.m.; 

August 15, 2017, 5:00 p.m.; September 12, 2017, 5:00 p.m.; 

October 10, 2017, 5:00 p.m.; November 14, 2017, 5:00 p.m.; 

December 12, 2017. 5:00 p.m. 

PLACE: 542560 US Highway 1, Callahan, FL 32011 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Items for discussion include general business pursuant to 

responsibilities under Chapter 582, F.S., and any new business 

that is brought up by District supervisors. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Nassau 

Soil and Water Conservation District at (904)879-3372. 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Agricultural Water Policy 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=161
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=168
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=173
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=173
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=173


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

504 

The Tupelo Soil and Water Conservation District announces 

public meetings to which all persons are invited. 

DATES AND TIMES: February 9, 2017, 6:30 p.m.; March 9, 

2017, 6:30 p.m.; April 13, 2017, 6:30 p.m.; May 11, 2017, 

6:30 p.m.; June 8, 2017, 6:30 p.m.; July 13, 2017, 6:30 p.m.; 

August 10, 2017, 6:30 p.m.; September 14, 2017, 6:30 p.m.; 

October 12, 2017, 6:30 p.m.; November 9, 2017, 6:30 p.m.; 

December 14, 2017, 6:30 p.m. 

PLACE: 232 East Lake Avenue, Wewahitchka, FL 32465 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Items for discussion include general business pursuant to 

responsibilities under Chapter 582, F.S., and any new business 

that is brought up by District supervisors. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Tupelo 

Soil and Water Conservation District at (850)674-8271. 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Agricultural Water Policy 

The Wakulla Soil and Water Conservation District announces 

public meetings to which all persons are invited. 

DATES AND TIMES: February 9, 2017, 5:00 p.m.; March 9, 

2017, 5:00 p.m.; April 13, 2017, 5:00 p.m.; May 11, 2017, 

5:00 p.m.; June 8, 2017, 5:00 p.m.; July 13, 2017, 5:00 p.m.; 

August 10, 2017, 5:00 p.m.; September 14, 2017, 5:00 p.m.; 

October 12, 2017, 5:00 p.m.; November 9, 2017, 5:00 p.m.; 

December 14, 2017, 5:00 p.m. 

PLACE: 84 Cedar Avenue, Crawfordville, FL 32327 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Items for discussion include general business pursuant to 

responsibilities under Chapter 582, F.S., and any new business 

that is brought up by District supervisors. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Wakulla 

Soil and Water Conservation District at (850)997-4058. 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Agricultural Water Policy 

The Hamilton Soil and Water Conservation District announces 

public meetings to which all persons are invited. 

DATES AND TIMES: February 9, 2017, 7:00 p.m.; March 9, 

2017, 7:00 p.m.; April 13, 2017, 7:00 p.m.; May 11, 2017, 

7:00 p.m.; June 8, 2017, 7:00 p.m.; July 13, 2017, 7:00 p.m.; 

August 10, 2017, 7:00 p.m.; September 14, 2017, 7:00 p.m.; 

October 12, 2017, 7:00 p.m.; November 9, 2017, 7:00 p.m.; 

December 14, 2017, 7:00 p.m. 

PLACE: 1143 US Highway 41 NW, Jasper, FL 32052 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Items for discussion include general business pursuant to 

responsibilities under Chapter 582, F.S., and any new business 

that is brought up by District supervisors. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

Hamilton Soil and Water Conservation District at (386)362-

2622. 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

The Florida Prepaid College Board announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, February 8, 2017, 2:00 p.m., 

ET 

PLACE: The Hermitage Centre, Everglades Room, 1801 

Hermitage Blvd., Tallahassee, Florida 32308 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The Negotiation Team will recommend contract award(s) for 

Invitation to Negotiate ITN 16-03, Actuarial Services for the 

Stanley G. Tate Florida Prepaid College Program. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

ITNinfo.PrePaid@MyFloridaPrepaid.com or by calling 

(850)488-8514. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by calling: 

(850)488-8514. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please 

contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

REGIONAL PLANNING COUNCILS 

Tampa Bay Regional Planning Council 

The Tampa Bay Regional Planning Councils Executive 

Budget Committee announces a public meeting to which all 

persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: February 13, 2017, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: 4000 Gateway Centre Blvd., Ste. 100, Pinellas Park, 

Florida 33782 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

conduct the regular business of the Executive Budget 

committee. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Wren 

Krahl, Wren@tbrpc.org. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 4 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Wren Krahl, Wren@tbrpc.org. If you are hearing 

or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Wren Krahl, 

Wren@tbrpc.org. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=173
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=173
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=47
mailto:ITNinfo.PrePaid@MyFloridaPrepaid.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=29
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=64
mailto:Wren@tbrpc.org
mailto:Wren@tbrpc.org
mailto:Wren@tbrpc.org


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

505 

 

REGIONAL PLANNING COUNCILS 

Tampa Bay Regional Planning Council 

The Tampa Bay Regional Planning Council announces a 

public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: February 13, 2017, 10:00 a.m. 

PLACE: 4000 Gateway Centre Blvd., Ste. 100, Pinellas Park, 

Florida 33782 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

conduct the regular business of the Tampa Bay Regional 

Planning Council. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Wren 

Krahl, Wren@tbrpc.org. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 4 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Wren Krahl, Wren@tbrpc.org. If you are hearing 

or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Wren Krahl, 

Wren@tbrpc.org. 

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS 

Northwest Florida Water Management District 

The Northwest Florida Water Management District announces 

a public meeting to which all persons are invited.  

DATE AND TIME: March 1, 2017, 2:00 p.m., Eastern Time 

PLACE: District Headquarters, 81 Water Management Drive, 

Havana, FL 32333 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: In 

accordance with the timeframe set forth in section 120.525, 

Florida Statutes, a public meeting for opening of sealed bids is 

hereby noticed within the timeline for the Invitation to Bid 

(ITB) 17B-008 Well Construction and Aquifer Performance 

Testing of the Claiborne Aquifer, Jackson County, Florida 

Other Meetings for ITB 17B-008 

Mandatory Pre-Bid Conference for Prospective Respondents: 

DATE AND TIME: February 13, 2017, 10:00 a.m. – 12:00 

Noon, Eastern Time 

PLACE: Northwest Florida Water Management District 81 

Water Management Drive, Havana, FL 32333 

(U.S. Hwy 90, 10 miles west of Tallahassee) 

PURPOSE: To answer any technical or administrative 

questions regarding the bid package and the work to be 

performed. 

Any additional public meetings will be noticed on the Vendor 

Bid System and the District website. A copy of the agenda 

may be obtained by contacting: Elaine McKinnon at (850)539-

5999 or Elaine.McKinnon@nwfwater.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 72 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Wendy Dugan at (850)539-5999. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS 

St. Johns River Water Management District 

The St. Johns River Water Management District announces a 

public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIMES: Tuesday, February 14, 2017, 9:00 a.m., 

Committee Meetings, followed by the Governing Board 

meeting scheduled to begin at 11:00 a.m. or following the 

Committee Meetings whichever is later. 

PLACE: District Headquarters, 4049 Reid Street (Hwy 100 

West), Palatka, FL 32177 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Discussion and consideration of District business including 

regulatory and non-regulatory matters. Staff may recommend 

approval of external amendments which affect the adopted 

budget. 

NOTE: One or more Governing Board members may attend 

and participate in the meetings by means of communications 

media technology. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: St. 

Johns River Water Management District, Attention Lori 

Griffith, 4049 Reid Street, Palatka, FL 32177, by phone at 

(386)329-4470 or by visiting the District's website at 

sjrwmd.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: District Clerk at (386)329-4500. If you are hearing 

or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS 

South Florida Water Management District 

The South Florida Water Management District announces a 

public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, February 8, 2017, 2:00 PM 

Project & Lands Committee Meeting and Thursday, February 

9, 2017, 9:00 AM Governing Board Meeting 

PLACE: Seminole Tribe of Florida Hollywood Seminole 

Indian Reservation Headquarters, 6300 Stirling Road, 

Hollywood, FL 33024. There is no parking at this location. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=29
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=64
mailto:Wren@tbrpc.org
mailto:Wren@tbrpc.org
mailto:Wren@tbrpc.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=120
mailto:Elaine.McKinnon@nwfwater.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=122
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=124


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

506 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Governing Board to discuss and consider District business, 

including regulatory and non-regulatory matters; and 

Governing Board to consider a budget amendment to the 

District’s Fiscal Year 2016-2017 budget in the amount of 

$350,000 from General State Revenues for a bridge design 

project in the City of Clewiston. 

PUBLIC PARKING: Seminole Tribe Administration 

Building, 5700 Stirling Road, Hollywood, FL. A free shuttle 

will pick-up at Shuttle-Stop at the front of Building and 

provide transportation to and from the meeting site. 

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION: Map of area showing 

parking and shuttle route available on the SFWMD’s website: 

https://www.sfwmd.gov/event/february-governing-board-

monthly-business-meeting 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Brenda 

Low, 561-682-6805 or at https://www.sfwmd.gov, seven days 

prior to the meeting. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: District Clerk, 561-682-6805. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Brenda Low at 561-

682-6805 or BLow@sfwmd.gov. 

DEPARTMENT OF MANAGEMENT SERVICES 

E911 Board 

The Department of Management Services, Division of 

Telecommunications announces a public meeting to which all 

persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, February 28, 2017, 9:30 a.m. – 

5:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Betty Easley Conference Center, 4075 Esplanade 

Way, Room 152, Tallahassee, FL 32399; call-in number: 

1(888)670-3525, participant code: 6395414829 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The Joint Task Force (JTF) Board of the Statewide Law 

Enforcement Radio System (SLERS) will meet to discuss 

matters pertaining to the network. 

The agenda and handouts will be made available closer to the 

date of the meeting at the following web address: 

http://www.dms.myflorida.com/business_operations/telecomm

unications/radio_communications_services/statewide_law_enf

orcement_radio_system_slers/upcoming_joint_task_force_me

etings. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Gloria 

Watford at (850)921-4204 or 

Gloria.Watford@dms.myflorida.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Gloria Watford at (850)921-4204 or 

Gloria.Watford@dms.myflorida.com. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Gloria Watford at 

(850)921-4204 or Gloria.Watford@dms.myflorida.com. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

The Florida Department of Health, Biomedical Research 

Section announces a telephone conference call to which all 

persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: March 7, 2017, 2:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Conference call: 1(888)670-3525, participant code: 

5311418626 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The Biomedical Research Advisory Council will hold a 

conference call to plan and prepare for the fiscal year 2017-

2018 grant funding cycle. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Teresa 

Mathew at Teresa.Mathew@flhealth.gov. 

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES 

The Department of Children and Families announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, February 15, 2017, 1:30 p.m. 

PLACE: Pasco Sheriff’s CPID Office, 7601 Little Road, First 

Floor Conference Room, New Port Richey, FL 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Ongoing Pasco Alliance business. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

Stephanie Allen at (727)373-7842. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Stephanie Allen at (727)373-7842. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=60
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=958
http://www.dms.myflorida.com/business_operations/telecommunications/radio_communications_services/statewide_law_enforcement_radio_system_slers/upcoming_joint_task_force_meetings
http://www.dms.myflorida.com/business_operations/telecommunications/radio_communications_services/statewide_law_enforcement_radio_system_slers/upcoming_joint_task_force_meetings
http://www.dms.myflorida.com/business_operations/telecommunications/radio_communications_services/statewide_law_enforcement_radio_system_slers/upcoming_joint_task_force_meetings
http://www.dms.myflorida.com/business_operations/telecommunications/radio_communications_services/statewide_law_enforcement_radio_system_slers/upcoming_joint_task_force_meetings
mailto:Gloria.Watford@dms.myflorida.com
mailto:Gloria.Watford@dms.myflorida.com
mailto:Gloria.Watford@dms.myflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
mailto:Teresa.Mathew@flhealth.gov
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

507 

 

the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES 

The Department of Children and Families announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: February 1, 2017 meeting is rescheduled 

for March 24, 2017, 9:00 a.m., Central Time 

PLACE: 160 West Government Street, Room 101, Pensacola, 

Florida 32502 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The purpose of this meeting is to negotiate the potential terms 

and conditions for the Circuit 1 Community Based Care Lead 

Agency contract to be executed pursuant Exceptional Purchase 

as noticed on the Vendor Bid System # ITN-01FS18001. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Randy 

Fleming, (850)483-6621, Randy.Fleming@myflfamilies.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 2 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Randy Fleming, (850)483-6621, 

Randy.Fleming@myflfamilies.com. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Randy Fleming, 

(850)483-6621, Randy.Fleming@myflfamilies.com. 

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES 

Refugee Services 

The SWFL Refugee Task Force announces a public meeting to 

which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, February 22, 2017, 1:30 p.m. 

– 3:30 p.m. 

PLACE: CareerSource SWFL, Conference Room, 3050 

Horseshoe Dr., Naples, FL 34104 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The purpose of the Southwest Florida Refugee Task Force 

meeting is to increase awareness of the refugee populations, 

share best practices, spot trends in refugee populations, build 

collaborations between agencies, help create good 

communication among service providers, get informed about 

upcoming community events, and discuss refugee program 

service needs and possible solutions to meeting those needs. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Janet 

Blair at (813)545-1716 or Taddese Fessehaye at (407)317-

7335. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Janet Blair at (813)545-1716 or Taddese 

Fessehaye at (407)317-7335. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Janet Blair at 

(813)545-1716 or Taddese Fessehaye at (407)317-7335. 

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES 

Refugee Services 

The Department of Children and Families, Refugee Services 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, February 21, 2017, 2:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Tallahassee, Florida 32399; telephone conference: 

1(888)670-3525, participant code: 4471182592# 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Public Meeting #1. 

Title: Solicitation Conference Call for Adult Education 

Services for Refugees and Entrants in Duval County (ITN# 

01K17BS1). 

Description: As provided for in Sections 2.5, 2.6, and 2.7 of 

this ITN which was published to the Vendor Bid System 

(VBS) on January 27, 2017. The VBS can be accessed at 

http://www.myflorida.com/apps/vbs/vbs_www.main_menu. 

The purpose of the Solicitation Conference Call is to review 

the ITN with interested Vendors so that areas of 

misunderstanding or ambiguity are clarified. The Department 

encourages all prospective Vendors to participate in the 

solicitation conference, during which Vendors may pose 

questions. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

David.Draper@myflfamilies.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Lisa Stephany, Lisa_Stephany@myflfamilies.com, 

(850)717-4557. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please 

contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: 

David.Draper@myflfamilies.com. 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

The Department of Economic Opportunity announces public 

meetings to which all persons are invited. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
mailto:Randy.Fleming@myflfamilies.com
mailto:Randy.Fleming@myflfamilies.com
mailto:Randy.Fleming@myflfamilies.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=528
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=528
http://www.myflorida.com/apps/vbs/vbs_www.main_menu
mailto:David.Draper@myflfamilies.com
mailto:Lisa_Stephany@myflfamilies.com
mailto:David.Draper@myflfamilies.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

508 

DATES AND TIMES: February 7, 2017, 9:30 a.m., ET: Non-

Mandatory Pre-Response Conference; March 2, 2017, 3:00 

p.m., ET: Public Opening of Responses 

DEO will hold Negotiation Team Meetings at a date and time 

to be determined later, and advertised in the Vendor Bid 

System, as set forth below. The Negotiation Team Meetings 

will not be open to the public, but each Negotiation Team 

Meeting will be recorded and released in accordance with 

Section 286.0113, Florida Statutes. 

PLACE: Caldwell Building, 107 East Madison Street, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0950 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: In 

accordance with Section 120.525, Florida Statutes, public 

meetings for Request for Application 18-RFA-001-VM, 

Florida Defense Reinvestment Grant Program are hereby 

noticed. DEO’s Request for Application seeks applications for 

grants to support activities related to the Florida Defense 

Reinvestment Grant Program, as set forth and defined in 

Section 288.980, Florida Statutes. The Department reserves 

the right to issue amendments, addenda, and changes to this 

timeline and specifically to the meeting notices listed above. 

Notice of any change will be posted within the Vendor Bid 

System (VBS) in accordance with Section 287.042(3), Florida 

Statutes, and will not be re-advertised in the Florida 

Administrative Register (FAR). The VBS can be accessed at 

http://vbs.dms.state.fl.us/vbs/main_menu. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Sonja 

Strickland at (850)245-7472, 

sonja.strickland@deo.myflorida.com or Vince McKenzie at 

(850)245-7463, vincent.mckenzie@deo.myflorida.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Sonja Strickland at (850)245-7472, 

sonja.strickland@deo.myflorida.com or Vince McKenzie at 

(850)245-7463, vincent.mckenzie@deo.myflorida.com. If you 

are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the Department 

using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

The Department of Economic Opportunity announces public 

meetings to which all persons are invited. 

DATES AND TIMES: February 7, 2017, 11:00 a.m., ET: 

Non-Mandatory Pre-Response Conference; March 2, 2017, 

3:00 p.m., ET: Public Opening of Responses 

DEO will hold Negotiation Team Meetings at a date and time 

to be determined later, and advertised in the Vendor Bid 

System, as set forth below. The Negotiation Team Meetings 

will not be open to the public, but each Negotiation Team 

Meeting will be recorded and released in accordance with 

Section 286.0113, Florida Statutes. 

PLACE: Caldwell Building, 107 East Madison Street, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0950 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: In 

accordance with Section 120.525, Florida Statutes, public 

meetings for Request for Application 18-RFA-002-VM, 

Florida Defense Infrastructure Grant Program, are hereby 

noticed. DEO’s Request for Application seeks applications for 

grants to support activities related to the Florida Defense 

Infrastructure Grant Program, as set forth and defined in 

Section 288.980, Florida Statutes. The Department reserves 

the right to issue amendments, addenda, and changes to this 

timeline and specifically to the meeting notices listed above. 

Notice of any change will be posted within the Vendor Bid 

System (VBS) in accordance with Section 287.042(3), Florida 

Statutes, and will not be re-advertised in the Florida 

Administrative Register (FAR). The VBS can be accessed at: 

http://vbs.dms.state.fl.us/vbs/main_menu. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Sonja 

Strickland at (850)245-7472, 

sonja.strickland@deo.myflorida.com or Vince McKenzie at 

(850)245-7463, vincent.mckenzie@deo.myflorida.com. 

POLK STATE COLLEGE 

The Polk State College, Center for Public Safety, KCTIPS 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, February 16, 2017, 2:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Polk State College, Center for Public Safety, 

Kenneth C Thompson Institute of Public Safety, 1251 Jim 

Keene Blvd., 2nd Floor, Room 207, Winter Haven, FL 33880 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

1. Approve Minutes from August 18, 2016 meeting 

2. Old Business 

3. New Business 

4. Training Issues 

5. Other Issues 

6. Adjournment 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Debbie 

Bull, Secretary at the Polk State College address listed above. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 24 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Debbie Bull, Secretary, (863)669-2908. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

http://vbs.dms.state.fl.us/vbs/main_menu
mailto:sonja.strickland@deo.myflorida.com
mailto:vincent.mckenzie@deo.myflorida.com
mailto:sonja.strickland@deo.myflorida.com
mailto:vincent.mckenzie@deo.myflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
http://vbs.dms.state.fl.us/vbs/main_menu
mailto:sonja.strickland@deo.myflorida.com
mailto:vincent.mckenzie@deo.myflorida.com


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

509 

 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Debbie Bull, 

Secretary, (863)669-2908. 

GULF CONSORTIUM 

The Gulf Consortium Board of Directors announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: February 8, 2017, 2:00 p.m., ET 

PLACE: Frederick Karl Center, 601 E. Kennedy Boulevard, 

26th Floor, Conference Rooms A & B, Tampa, Hillsborough 

County, Florida 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The Board of Directors of the Gulf Consortium will meet to 

discuss the progress of the state expenditure plan; grant 

management and administration; officer elections for 2017; 

the permanent manager RFP; and, conduct other business. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Ginger 

Delegal at gdelegal@fl-counties.com, (850)922-4300 or 

www.FACRestore.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Ginger Delegal at gdelegal@fl-counties.com or 

(850)922-4300. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please 

contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Ginger Delegal at 

gdelegal@fl-counties.com or (850)922-4300. 

ENTERPRISE FLORIDA, INC. 

The Florida Defense Support Task Force announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, February 16, 2017, 9:00 a.m., 

ET – 10:30 a.m., ET 

PLACE: Conference call: phone number: 1(800)501-8979, 

access code: 1869945 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

This meeting will discuss proposed actions that will assist in 

preserving, protecting and enhancing Florida’s military 

installations and missions. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Michelle 

Griggs, (850)298-6640, mgriggs@enterpriseflorida.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 1 day before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Michelle Griggs, (850)298-6640, 

mgriggs@enterpriseflorida.com. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Terry McCaffrey, 

(850)878-4578, tmccaffrey@enterpriseflorida.com. 

COUNCIL OF COMMUNITY COLLEGE PRESIDENTS 

The Florida College System Council of Presidents announces 

a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: February 9, 2017, 6:00 p.m. 

PLACE: The Edison, 470 Suwannee Street, Tallahassee, FL 

32301 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Issues pertaining to the Florida College System. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting Tina 

Ingramm, (850)222-3222. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting Tina Ingramm. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact Michael Brawer, 113 

East College Avenue, Tallahassee, FL 32301. 

COUNCIL OF COMMUNITY COLLEGE PRESIDENTS 

The Florida College System Council of Presidents announces 

a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: February 10, 2017, 8:30 a.m. 

PLACE: TCC Capitol Center, 300 W Pensacola St., 

Tallahassee, FL 32301 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Issues pertaining to the Florida College System. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Tina 

Ingramm, (850)222-3222. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least three days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Tina Ingramm. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Michael Brawer, 113 

East College Avenue, Tallahassee, FL 32301. 

COUNCIL OF COMMUNITY COLLEGE PRESIDENTS 

The Florida College System Trustees announce a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: February 8, 2017, 10:00 a.m. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1089
mailto:gdelegal@fl-counties.com
http://www.facrestore.com/
mailto:gdelegal@fl-counties.com
mailto:gdelegal@fl-counties.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=680
mailto:mgriggs@enterpriseflorida.com
mailto:mgriggs@enterpriseflorida.com
mailto:tmccaffrey@enterpriseflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=740
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=740
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=740


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

510 

PLACE: 101 South Adams Street, Tallahassee, FL 32301 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Issues pertaining to the Florida College System Trustees. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Tina 

Ingramm, (850)222-3222. 

For more information, you may contact: Michael Brawer, 113 

East College Avenue, Tallahassee, FL 32301. 

FLORIDA WORKERS' COMPENSATION JOINT 

UNDERWRITING ASSOCIATION, INC. 

The FWCJUA Investment Committee announces a telephone 

conference call to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: March 9, 2017, 10:00 a.m. (ET) 

PLACE: Contact Kathy Coyne at (941)378-7408 to 

participate. 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Agenda topics include an investment marketplace update; 

portfolio compliance review; investment policy & guidelines 

review, and investment manager engagement. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Kathy 

Coyne or at www.fwcjua.com. 

Section VII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Declaratory Statements 

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION 

Health Facility and Agency Licensing 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Agency for Health 

Care Administration has received the petition for declaratory 

statement from Homecare Registry Solutions, LLC on January 

23, 2017. The petition seeks the agency's interpretation of 

Chapter 400, Part III, Florida Statutes and Chapter 59A-18, 

Florida Administrative Code regarding nurse registries. 

A copy of the Petition may be obtained by contacting Richard 

J. Shoop, Agency Clerk, Agency for Health Care 

Administration, 2727 Mahan Drive, Mail Stop 3, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32308, Richard.Shoop@ahca.myflorida.com, 

(850)412-3671. Persons other than the original parties to a 

pending proceeding whose substantial interests will be 

affected by the disposition of the declaratory statement and 

who desire to become parties may file a motion to intervene 

with the Agency. The motion should be filed with the Agency 

Clerk at the above address within twenty one (21) days of 

publication of this notice. Any petition for leave to intervene 

must comply with the requirements set forth in Fla. Admin. 

Code R. 28-105.0027. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares and Mobile 

Homes 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Division of Florida 

Condominiums, Timeshares, and Mobile Homes, Department 

of Business and Professional Regulation, State of Florida, has 

declined to rule on the petition for declaratory statement filed 

by Mark D. Friedman, Esq., In Re: The Imperial House, Inc., 

Docket No. 2016053900, on November 22, 2016. The 

following is a summary of the agency’s declination of the 

petition: 

The Division declined to issue a statement because it cannot 

issue a statement stating an agency policy with general 

application; or interpret the meaning and intent of parties to a 

contract. The order was filed with the Agency Clerk on 

January 26, 2017. 

A copy of the Order Declining of the Petition for Declaratory 

Statement may be obtained by contacting: Danielle Walker, 

Administrative Assistant II, at Department of Business and 

Professional Regulation, Division of Florida Condominiums, 

Timeshares, and Mobile Homes, 2601 Blair Stone Road, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1030; (850)717-1539; 

Danielle.Walker@myfloridalicense.com. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares and Mobile 

Homes 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Division of Florida 

Condominiums, Timeshares, and Mobile Homes, Department 

of Business and Professional Regulation, State of Florida, has 

declined to rule on the petition for declaratory statement filed 

by Donald H. Johnson, owner, In Re: Wells Landing 

Homeowners Association, Docket No. 2016055382, on 

November 23, 2016. The following is a summary of the 

agency’s declination of the petition: 

The Division declined to issue a statement because it cannot 

issue a statement without sufficient facts and competent, 

substantial evidence; or when the Petitioner does not clarify 

whether he is filing as a unit owner or as a qualified 

representative. The order was filed with the Agency Clerk on 

January 26, 2017. 

A copy of the Order Declining of the Petition for Declaratory 

Statement may be obtained by contacting: Danielle Walker, 

Administrative Assistant II, at Department of Business and 

Professional Regulation, Division of Florida Condominiums, 

Timeshares, and Mobile Homes, 2601 Blair Stone Road, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1030; (850)717-1539; 

Danielle.Walker@myfloridalicense.com. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=757
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=757
http://www.fwcjua.com/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=186
mailto:Richard.Shoop@ahca.myflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=248
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=248
mailto:Danielle.Walker@myfloridalicense.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=248
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=248
mailto:Danielle.Walker@myfloridalicense.com


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

511 

 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Real Estate Commission 

The Florida Real Estate Commission hereby gives notice of 

the issuance of an Order regarding the Petition for Declaratory 

Statement, filed on November 8, 2016, by Robert Borr. The 

Notice of Petition for Declaratory Statement was published in 

Vol. 42, No. 221, of the November 14, 2016 Florida 

Administrative Register. The Commission considered the 

Petition at a duly-noticed public meeting on December 13, 

2016. The Petitioner sought the Commission’s interpretation 

of Section 475.01(1)(a), F.S., and further sought an opinion on 

whether a “wholesale buyer”, as described in his petition, falls 

under the definition of a “broker” provided in said Section. 

The Commission denies the petition because: Rule 28-

105.001, F.A.C., provides that a declaratory statement is not 

the appropriate means for determining the conduct of another 

person. 

A copy of the Commission’s Order may be obtained by 

contacting: Lori Crawford, Executive Director, Division of 

Real Estate, 400 West Robinson Street, Suite N801, Orlando, 

Florida 32801. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Real Estate Commission 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that The Florida Real Estate 

Commission has declined to rule on the petition for 

declaratory statement filed by Gustavo Serrano on October 6, 

2016. The following is a summary of the agency’s declination 

of the petition: 

The Notice of Petition for Declaratory Statement was 

published in Vol. 42, No. 201, of the October 13, 2016 Florida 

Administrative Register. The Commission considered the 

Petition at a duly-noticed public meeting on November 15, 

2016. The Petitioner sought the Commission’s interpretation 

of Section 475.01(a), F.S., and further sought an opinion on 

whether the activities outlined in the petition require one to 

have an active Florida broker or sales associate license. The 

Commission declines to answer the petition for declaratory 

statement. 

A copy of the Order Declining of the Petition for Declaratory 

Statement may be obtained by contacting: Lori Crawford, 

Executive Director, Division of Real Estate, 400 West 

Robinson Street, Suite N801, Orlando, Florida 32801. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Real Estate Commission 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that The Florida Real Estate 

Commission has issued an order disposing of the petition for 

declaratory statement filed by the St. Petersburg Housing 

Authority on November 7, 2016. The following is a summary 

of the agency’s disposition of the petition: 

The Notice of Petition for Declaratory Statement was 

published in Vol. 42, No. 221, of the November 14, 2016 

Florida Administrative Register. The Commission considered 

the Petition at a duly-noticed public meeting on December 13, 

2016. The Petitioner sought the Commission’s interpretation 

of Section 475.011(2), F.S., and further sought an opinion on 

whether they qualify for an exemption under said Section, for 

the leasing and management of Jordan Park Apartments, a 

public housing and low income Tax Credit property. The 

Commission grants the petition for declaratory statement, 

finding that under the facts and circumstances outlined by the 

Petitioner in its request for a declaratory statement, the 

Petitioner qualifies for the exemption set forth in Section 

475.011(2), F.S. 

A copy of the Order Disposing of the Petition for Declaratory 

Statement may be obtained by contacting: Lori Crawford, 

Executive Director, Division of Real Estate, 400 West 

Robinson Street, Suite N801, Orlando, Florida 32801. 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Finance 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that The Florida Office of 

Financial Regulation has received the petition for declaratory 

statement from Opencambio.com LLC. The petition seeks the 

agency’'s opinion as to the applicability of Chapter 560, 

Florida Statutes as it applies to the petitioner. 

Opencambio.com LLC is a software and technology provider 

that would offer Florida residents and foreigners located in 

other countries a check “converting” service and foreign 

currency exchange. The Petitioner’s technology eliminates the 

use of physical currency, i.e., bills or coins. The services 

involve exchanging checks or foreign currency for Debit 

Cards with a unique PIN containing the balance of the 

transaction minus the commission agreed. The Debit Cards do 

not have ATM privileges, as per the issuer bank. So physical 

money would never be obtained or delivered out of the 

services provided by the Petitioner. The petition seeks a 

declaratory statement from the Office on whether a money 

services business license pursuant to Chapter 560, Florida 

Statutes would be required. 

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be 

obtained by contacting: Agency Clerk, Office of Financial 

Regulation, P.O. Box 8050, Tallahassee, Florida 32314-8050, 

(850)410-9784, Agency.Clerk@flofr.com. 

Please refer all comments to: Agency Clerk, Office of 

Financial Regulation, P.O. Box 8050, Tallahassee, Florida 

32314-8050, (850)410-9784, Agency.Clerk@flofr.com. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=283
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=283
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=283
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=524
mailto:Agency.Clerk@flofr.com
mailto:Agency.Clerk@flofr.com


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

512 

Section VIII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding the Validity of Rules 

Notice of Petition for Administrative Determination has been 

filed with the Division of Administrative Hearings on the 

following rules: 

NONE 

Notice of Disposition of Petition for Administrative 

Determination has been filed with the Division of 

Administrative Hearings on the following rules: 

NONE 

Section IX 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Non-rule Policy Challenges 

NONE 

Section X 

Announcements and Objection Reports of 

the Joint Administrative Procedures 

Committee 

NONE 

Section XI 

Notices Regarding Bids, Proposals and 

Purchasing 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Request For Quote 

The State Board of Administration of Florida (SBA) is 

soliciting competitive responses from qualified licensed 

independent Certified Public Accounting firms with sufficient 

resources that will be selected to conduct SBA’s network 

security penetration assessment. The Request for Quote (RFQ) 

will be available on February 1, 2017, and may be obtained 

from the SBA website 

at www.sbafla.com/fsb/DoingBusinesswiththeSBA/Vendors.a

spx under “Open Competitive Solicitations". The deadline for 

submitting responses is 4:00 p.m. ET on March 1, 2017. A 

meeting will be held on March 23, 2017, to discuss and 

evaluate the responses received. Oral interviews, if conducted, 

will be completed by March 31, 2017. If needed, a meeting 

will be held by April 3, 2017, to select a firm to provide the 

requested services to the SBA. The SBA reserves the right to 

reject any or all competitive responses and to cancel any 

RFQs. 

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 

BDC44-16/17, Delnor-Wiggins Pass State Park – ADA 

Boardwalk Improvements 

NOTICE OF INVITATION TO BID: The Florida Department 

of Environmental Protection, Bureau of Design and 

Construction is soliciting formal, competitive, sealed bids 

from contractors for bid number BDC44-16/17, Delnor-

Wiggins Pass State Park – ADA Boardwalk Improvements. 

More info is available at http://tinyurl.com/BDC44-16-17. 

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 

BDC45-16/17, Gasparilla Island State Park – Lighthouse 

Pavilion Boardwalk 

NOTICE OF INVITATION TO BID: The Florida Department 

of Environmental Protection, Bureau of Design and 

Construction is soliciting formal, competitive, sealed bids 

from contractors for bid number BDC45-16/17, Gasparilla 

Island State Park – Lighthouse Pavilion Boardwalk. More info 

@ http://tinyurl.com/BDC45-16-17. 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

18-RFA-001-VM FLORIDA DEFENSE REINVESTMENT 

GRANT PROGRAM 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

DEO SOLICITIATION NO. 18-RFA-001-VM, 

REQUESTING APPLICATION PROPOSOLS FOR 

GRANTS TO SUPPORT ACTIVITIES RELATED TO THE 

FLORIDA DEFENSE REINVESTMENT GRANT 

PROGRAM, AS SET FORTH AND DEFINED IN SECTION 

288.980, FLORIDA STATUTES. 

NOTICE OF REQUEST FOR APPLICATIONS: On behalf of 

the Florida Department of Economic Opportunity, the 

Procurement Office is soliciting formal, competitive, sealed 

applications for solicitation number 18-RFA-001-VM, for 

grants to support activities related to the Florida Defense 

Reinvestment Grant Program, as set forth and defined in 

Section 288.980, Florida Statutes. The Department will post 

notice of any changes or additional meeting(s) on the Vendor 

Bid System (VBS) in accordance with Section 287.042(3), 

Florida Statutes, and will not re-advertise any notice in the 

Florida Administrative Register (FAR). Access the VBS at 

http://vbs.dms.state.fl.us/vbs/main_menu. 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

18-RFA-002-VM FLORIDA DEFENSE 

INFRASTRUCTURE GRANT PROGRAM 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
http://www.sbafla.com/fsb/DoingBusinesswiththeSBA/Vendors.aspx
http://www.sbafla.com/fsb/DoingBusinesswiththeSBA/Vendors.aspx
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62
http://tinyurl.com/BDC44-16-17
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62
http://tinyurl.com/BDC45-16-17
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
http://vbs.dms.state.fl.us/vbs/main_menu
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

513 

 

DEO SOLICITIATION NO. 18-RFA-002-VM, 

REQUESTING APPLICATION PROPOSOLS FOR 

GRANTS TO SUPPORT ACTIVITIES RELATED TO THE 

FLORIDA DEFENSE INFRASTRUCTURE GRANT 

PROGRAM, AS SET FORTH AND DEFINED IN SECTION 

288.980, FLORIDA STATUTES. 

NOTICE OF REQUEST FOR APPLICATIONS: On behalf of 

the Florida Department of Economic Opportunity, the 

Procurement Office is soliciting formal, competitive, sealed 

applications for solicitation number 18-RFA-002-VM, for 

grants to support activities related to the Florida Defense 

Infrastructure Grant Program, as set forth and defined in 

Section 288.980, Florida Statutes. The Department will post 

notice of any changes or additional meeting(s) on the Vendor 

Bid System (VBS) in accordance with Section 287.042(3), 

Florida Statutes, and will not re-advertise any notice in the 

Florida Administrative Register (FAR). Access the VBS at 

http://vbs.dms.state.fl.us/vbs/main_menu. 

BRASFIELD & GORRIE, LLC 

UF 608 - PARKING GARAGE XIV 

INVITATION TO BID 

Brasfield & Gorrie will now be taking sealed bid proposals for 

the Structural Precast trade package for the University of 

Florida Parking Garage XIV project in Gainesville, FL. 

Please contact Chris Evans at Brasfield & Gorrie 

(cevans@brasfieldgorrie.com, (407)562-4500) for additional 

information on the project and proposal requirements. 

Sealed proposals are due by no later than noon on March 6, 

2017. Sealed proposals must either be hand delivered or 

mailed to the following address: 

Brasfield & Gorrie, LLC 

c/o Chris Evans 

941 West Morse Blvd., Suite 200 

Winter Park, FL 32789 

Section XII 

Miscellaneous 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

Index of Administrative Rules  

Filed with the Secretary of State 

Pursuant to Section 120.55(1)(b)6. – 7., F.S., the below list of 

rules were filed in the Office of the Secretary of State between 

8 a.m. Wednesday January 25, and 3 p.m. Tuesday, January 

31, 2017. An improved electronic publication system is 

forthcoming on the Florida Administrative Rules website, 

FLRules.org, which will accommodate complete publication 

of rules filed for adoption in the previous 7 days, including 

rules awaiting legislative action. 

Rule No. File Date Effective  

Date 

5N-1.116 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

6A-1.099814 1/31/2017 2/20/2017 

6A-4.0021 1/31/2017 2/20/2017 

6A-4.008 1/31/2017 2/20/2017 

6A-4.0081 1/31/2017 2/20/2017 

6A-6.0334 1/31/2017 2/20/2017 

6A-6.0525 1/31/2017 2/20/2017 

6M-4.620 1/27/2017 2/16/2017 

19B-4.001 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

19B-16.003 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

19B-18.003 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

25-30.425 1/30/2017 2/19/2017 

25-30.455 1/30/2017 2/19/2017 

33-601.101 1/27/2017 2/16/2017 

33-601.105 1/27/2017 2/16/2017 

40D-8.624 1/30/2017 2/19/2017 

40D-8.624 1/30/2017 2/19/2017 

59G-4.125 1/30/2017 2/19/2017 

64-1.011 1/30/2017 2/19/2017 

64B8-51.006 1/27/2017 2/16/2017 

64B8-52.004 1/26/2017 2/15/2017 

64B8-53.001 1/26/2017 2/15/2017 

64B8-53.002 1/26/2017 2/15/2017 

64B8-53.003 1/26/2017 2/15/2017 

64B8-55.002 1/26/2017 2/15/2017 

64B8-56.002 1/26/2017 2/15/2017 

64B9-15.0035 1/27/2017 2/16/2017 

64B15-12.003 1/31/2017 2/20/2017 

64B15-12.005 1/31/2017 2/20/2017 

64B15-12.010 1/31/2017 2/20/2017 

http://vbs.dms.state.fl.us/vbs/main_menu
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1219
mailto:cevans@brasfieldgorrie.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=1


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

514 

64B15-12.011 1/31/2017 2/20/2017 

64B17-3.002 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

64B17-3.006 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

64B17-3.007 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

64K-1.001 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

73A-3.002 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

73A-3.003 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

73A-3.004 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

LIST OF RULES AWAITING LEGISLATIVE 

APPROVAL SECTIONS 120.541(3), 373.139(7) AND/OR 

373.1391(6), FLORIDA STATUTES 

Rule No. File Date Effective  

Date 

40B-9.021 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 

40B-9.041 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 

40B-9.126 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 

40B-9.131 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 

40B-9.1381 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 

40B-9.1411 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 

40B-9.142 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 

40B-9.145 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 

40B-9.123 12/9/2016 **/**/**** 

60FF1-5.009 7/21/2016 **/**/**** 

64B8-9.009 6/15/2016 **/**/**** 

64B8-10.003 12/9/2015 **/**/**** 

69L-7.100 12/19/2016 **/**/**** 

69L-7.501 12/19/2016 **/**/**** 

 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Fruit and Vegetables 

NOTICE OF INTENT TO GRANT CERTIFICATES OF 

EXEMPTION 

FROM THE PEANUT MARKETING ORDER 

The Florida Department of Agriculture and Consumer 

Services gives notice of its intent to grant Certificates of 

Exemption from the Peanut Marketing Order pursuant to 

Section 573.1201, Florida Statutes, to the following 

petitioners: 
 

Petitioner  Address 

 
Tillis Farms, LLC P.O Box 1669 Chiefland, FL 32644 

 
Karen Tillis P.O Box 1669 Chiefland, FL 32644 

 
Murray Tillis P.O Box 1669 Chiefland, FL 32644 

 
Harold Tillis P.O Box 1669 Chiefland, FL 32644 

 
Sanchez Farms, LLC 479 NE 446th Street Old Town, FL 32680 

 
Herman Sanchez, Jr. 479 NE 446th Street Old Town, FL 32680 

 
Virginia Sanchez 479 NE 446th Street Old Town, FL 32680 

 
Herman Sanchez, III 479 NE 446th Street Old Town, FL 32680 

 
Kelby Sanchez 479 NE 446th Street Old Town, FL 32680 

 
Jason Raulerson 23748 NW 142nd Ave. High Springs, FL 32643 

 Townsend Brothers Ag. 

Enterprises, LLC 5608 County Road 249 Live Oak, FL 32060 

 
Harold Land II Farm 13038 161st Road Live Oak, FL 32060 

 
S + K Barrington Farms 606 SW Freedom Road Mayo, FL 32066 

 
R Moore Farms, Inc 15869 SR 51 Live Oak, FL 32060 

 
Shaw Farms Partnership P.O Box 357 Mayo, FL 32066 

 
Erwin Stansel 5553 164th Street Wellborn, FL 32094 

 
Dwight Stansel 5553 164th Street Wellborn, FL 32094 

 
Gwinn Bros Farm LLC 17233 99th Dr Mcalpin, FL 32062 

 
83 Farms LLC 6510 N US Hwy 129 Bell, FL 32619 

 
Rachelle Philman 6510 N US Hwy 129 Bell, FL 32619 

 
Keith Philman 6510 N US Hwy 129 Bell, FL 32619 

 
Rodney Watson 3952 SW CR 18 Ft White, FL 32038 

 
Rhett Watson 3952 SW CR 18 Ft White, FL 32038 

 
Keri VanAernam PO Box 54 Bell, FL 32619 

 
Frankie VanAernam PO Box 54 Bell, FL 32619 

 
Heath Carlisle 7200 SE 30th St Trenton, FL 32693 

 
Trent Pridgeon 7220 NW 22nd Ct Bell, FL 32619 

 
David Mikell 3219 SW CR 232 Bell, FL 32619 

 
Kelly Philman 6510 N US Hwy 129 Bell, FL 32619 

 

The above petitioners applied for a Certificate of Exemption 

from the Peanut Marketing Order pursuant to Section 

573.1201, Florida Statutes, for the 2016 peanut harvest season, 

and alleged funds from the marketing order had been used in a 

manner detrimental to their interests as Florida peanut 

growers. Based on the allegations made and supporting 

documentation submitted by the petitioners, the Department 

has found that the petitioners have been adversely affected by 

reason of the Peanut Marketing Order. The certificates exempt 

the petitioners from paying two of the three dollars assessed 

and is only valid for the 2016 peanut harvest season. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=167


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 21, February 1, 2017 

 

515 

 

To obtain a copy of the proposed Final Order Granting a 

Certificate of Exemption from the Peanut Marketing Order, 

please contact: LaSharonte Williams-Potts, 407 S. Calhoun 

St., Ste. 520, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)245-1000, 

Lasha.Williams@FreshFromFlorida.com. 

A person whose substantial interests are affected by the 

Department’s proposed action may petition for an 

administrative proceeding (hearing request) under Sections 

120.569 and 120.57, F.S., and may be represented by counsel 

or other qualified representative. Pursuant to Rule 28-106.201, 

F.A.C., a request for an administrative hearing must contain 

the following information: (a) The name and address of each 

agency affected and each agency’s file or identification 

number, if known; (b)The name, address, and telephone 

number of the petitioner; the name, address, and telephone 

number of the petitioner’s representative, if any, which shall 

be the address for service purposes during the course of the 

proceeding; and an explanation of how the petitioner’s 

substantial interests are or will be affected by the agency 

determination; (c) A statement of when and how the petitioner 

received notice of the agency decision; (d) A statement of all 

disputed issues of material fact. If there are none, the petition 

must so indicate; (e) A concise statement of the ultimate facts 

alleged, including the specific facts that the petitioner 

contends warrant reversal or modification of the agency’s 

proposed action; 

(f) A statement of the specific rules or statutes that the 

petitioner contends require reversal or modification of the 

agency’s proposed action, including an explanation of how the 

alleged facts relate to the specific rules or statutes; and (g) A 

statement of the relief sought by the petitioner, stating 

precisely the action that the petitioner wishes the agency to 

take with respect to the agency’s proposed action. 

The hearing request must be filed (received by the 

Department) with the Department at 407 South Calhoun 

Street, Tallahassee, Florida, 32399-0800 within 21 days of 

publication of this notice (February 22, 2017). Also, a copy 

of the hearing request shall be mailed to the petitioners at the 

addresses indicated above at the time of filing. 

Mediation is not available as an alternative remedy. Failure to 

file a hearing request within 21 days of publication of this 

notice will constitute a waiver of your right to an 

administrative hearing, and a Certificate of Exemption will be 

issued to the applicants listed above. 

Section XIII 

Index to Rules Filed During Preceding 

Week 

NOTE: The above section will be published on Tuesday 

beginning October 2, 2012, unless Monday is a holiday, then it 

will be published on Wednesday of that week. 

mailto:Lasha.Williams@FreshFromFlorida.com

