
Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 20, January 31, 2017 

 

475 

 

Section I 

Notice of Development of Proposed Rules 

and Negotiated Rulemaking 

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS 

Southwest Florida Water Management District 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

40D-8.624 Guidance and Minimum Levels for Lakes 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose is to amend Rule 

40D-8.624 F.A.C., to delete the previously adopted guidance 

levels, and adopt new minimum and guidance levels for Lake 

Jackson and Little Lake Jackson located in Highlands County. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Establish guidance 

and minimum levels for Lake Jackson and Little Lake Jackson 

pursuant to Section 373.042, F.S. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 373.044, 373.113, 373.171 

F.S. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 373.036, 373.042, 373.0421, 

373.086, 373.709 F.S. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: SWFWMD Human Resources Director, (352)796-

7211, ext. 4702; 1(800)423-1476 (FL only), ext. 4702 or email 

to ADACoordinator@swfwmd.state.fl.us. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Doug 

Leeper, MFLs Program Lead, SWFWMD, 7601 U.S. 

Highway 301 North, Tampa, FL 33637, (813)985-7481 (ext. 

4272). A2016063-3 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE 

FROM THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE. 

Section II 

Proposed Rules 

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS 

Southwest Florida Water Management District 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:  

40D-8.624 Guidance and Minimum Levels for Lakes 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of this rulemaking is 

to adopt revised minimum and guidance levels for Big Fish 

Lake located in Pasco County. The effect of the rule is to 

support the District’s water supply planning, water use 

permitting, and environmental resource permitting programs. 

SUMMARY: Section 373.042, F.S., requires the District to 

establish minimum flows and levels for lakes, wetlands, rivers 

and aquifers within the District’s boundaries. Section 

373.0421(3), F.S., further requires the District to periodically 

reevaluate and revise adopted minimum flows and levels. This 

rulemaking is necessary to delete the previously adopted 

levels, and adopt new guidance and minimum levels for Big 

Fish Lake located in Pasco County. The establishment and 

periodic evaluation of minimum levels is required by statute to 

ensure that the minimum hydrologic requirements of the water 

resources and ecology of this lake are maintained. The revised 

minimum and guidance levels for Big Fish Lake are being 

developed using previously peer-reviewed, Governing Board 

adopted methods. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION:  

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse 

impact on small business or likely increase directly or 

indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the 

aggregate within one year after the implementation of the rule. 

A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency.  

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: The District conducted an economic review of the 

revisions to the rule and determined that the impact or 

regulatory cost, if any, of the revisions will not exceed any one 

of the economic analysis criteria in a SERC as set forth in 

Section 120.541(2)(a), F.S. The revised minimum levels for 

this lake is unlikely to constitute an additional significant 

regulatory constraint on groundwater or surface water 

withdrawals in the area due to existing resource conditions and 

regulatory constraints in the basin. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=123
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40D-8.624
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=373.044
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.113
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.171%20F.S.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.171%20F.S.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=373.036
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.042
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.0421
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.086
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.709%20F.S.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=123
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40D-8.624


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 20, January 31, 2017 

 

476 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 373.044, 373.113, 373.171, 

FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 373.036, 373.042, 373.0421, 

373.086, 373.709, FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Doug Leeper, MFL Program Lead, 

SWFWMD, 2379 Broad Street, Brooksville, FL 34604, 

(352)796-7211, ext. 4272. A2016073-2 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

40D-8.624 Guidance and Minimum Levels for Lakes. 

(1) through (11) No change. 

(12) Levels for lakes established during or after August 7, 

2000, are set forth in the following table. After the High 

Minimum Lake Level and Minimum Lake Level elevation for 

each lake is a designation indicating the Method used, as 

described in subsection 40D-8.624(8), F.A.C., to establish the 

level. Compliance with the High Minimum and Minimum 

Lake Levels is determined pursuant to paragraphs (6)(b) and 

(7)(b) above. Guidance Levels established prior to August 7, 

2000, are set forth in Table 8-3 in subsection 40D-8.624(13), 

F.A.C., below. 

 
Table 8-2 Minimum and Guidance Levels Established During or After August 7, 2000. Levels are 

elevations,  

in feet above the National Geodetic Vertical Datum of 1929. 

Location by 

County and 

Basin 

Name of 

Lake and 

Section, 

Township 

and 

Range 

Informati

on 

High 

Guidance 

Level 

High 

Minimum 

Lake 

Level 

Minimum 

Lake 

Level 

Low 

Guidance 

Level 

(a) 

through (p) 

No 

change. 

          

(q)  

   In Pasco 

County 

Within the 

Coastal 

Rivers 

Basin 

          

  Big Fish 

Lake 

S-21, T-

24, 

R-19E 

76.6’76.0

5'  

  

75.4’75.6

5'  

(CAT 3) 

72.8’73.05

’  

(CAT 3) 

70.2’71.7

5'  

  Crews, 

Lake 

S-20, T-

24S, 

R-18E 

through 

Unnamed 

Lake 

No. 22 

S-27, T-

24S, 

R-18E No 

change. 

        

(r) 

through 

(cc) 

No 

change. 

          

 

(13) No change. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=373.044
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.113
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.171
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=373.036
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.042
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.0421
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.086
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.709


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 20, January 31, 2017 

 

477 

 

Rulemaking Authority 373.044, 373.113, 373.171 FS. Law 

Implemented 373.036, 373.042, 373.0421, 373.086, 373.709 FS. 

History–New 6-7-78, Amended 1-22-79, 4-27-80, 10-21-80, 12-22-

80, 3-23-81, 4-14-81, 6-4-81, 10-15-81, 11-23-81, 1-5-82, 3-11-82, 5-

10-82, 7-4-82, 9-2-82, 11-8-82, 1-10-83, 4-3-83, 7-5-83, 9-5-83, 10-

16-83, 12-12-83, 5-8-84, 7-8-84, 12-16-84, 2-7-85, 5-13-85, 6-26-85, 

11-3-85, 3-5-86, 6-16-86, Formerly 16J-8.678, Amended 9-7-86, 2-

12-87, 9-2-87, 2-18-88, 6-27-88, 2-22-89, 3-23-89, 9-26-89, 7-26-90, 

10-30-90, 3-3-91, 9-30-91, 10-7-91, 7-26-92, 3-1-93, 5-11-94, 6-6-

96, 2-23-97, 8-7-00, 1-8-04, 12-21-04 (13), 12-21-04 (13), 6-5-05, 5-

2-06, 1-1-07, 2-12-07, 1-10-08, 2-18-08, 4-7-08, 5-20-08, 5-10-09, 4-

13-11, 3-12-12, 11-25-12, 2-21-13 (12)(f), 2-21-13(12), (13), 9-3-13, 

1-7-15, 7-1-15, 9-21-15, _______. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Southwest Florida Water Management District 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Southwest Florida Water Management 

District Governing Board 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: August 30, 2016 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: December 21, 2016 

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS 

Southwest Florida Water Management District 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:  

40D-8.624 Guidance and Minimum Levels for Lakes 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of this rulemaking is 

to adopt revised minimum and guidance levels for Lake 

Clinch located in Polk County. The effect of the rule is to 

support the District’s water supply planning, water use 

permitting, and environmental resource permitting programs. 

SUMMARY: Section 373.042, F.S., requires the District to 

establish minimum flows and levels for lakes, wetlands, rivers 

and aquifers within the District’s boundaries. Section 

373.0421(3), F.S., further requires the District to periodically 

reevaluate and revise adopted minimum flows and levels. This 

rulemaking is necessary to delete the previously adopted 

levels, and adopt new guidance and minimum levels for Lake 

Clinch located in Polk County. The establishment and periodic 

evaluation of minimum levels is required by statute to ensure 

that the minimum hydrologic requirements of the water 

resources and ecology of this lake are maintained. The revised 

minimum and guidance levels for Lake Clinch are being 

developed using previously peer-reviewed, Governing Board 

adopted methods. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION:  

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse 

impact on small business or likely increase directly or 

indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the 

aggregate within one year after the implementation of the rule. 

A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency.  

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: The District conducted an economic review of the 

revisions to the rule and determined that the impact or 

regulatory cost, if any, of the revisions will not exceed any one 

of the economic analysis criteria in a SERC as set forth in 

Section 120.541(2)(a), F.S. The revised minimum levels for 

this lake is unlikely to constitute an additional significant 

regulatory constraint on groundwater or surface water 

withdrawals in the area due to existing resource conditions and 

regulatory constraints in the basin. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 373.044, 373.113, 373.171, 

FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 373.036, 373.042, 373.0421, 

373.086, 373.709, FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Doug Leeper, MFL Program Lead, 

SWFWMD, 2379 Broad Street, Brooksville, FL 34604, 

(352)796-7211, ext. 4272. A2015038-4 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

40D-8.624 Guidance and Minimum Levels for Lakes. 

(1) through (11) No change. 

(12) Levels for lakes established during or after August 7, 

2000, are set forth in the following table. After the High 

Minimum Lake Level and Minimum Lake Level elevation for 

each lake is a designation indicating the Method used, as 

described in subsection 40D-8.624(8), F.A.C., to establish the 

level. Compliance with the High Minimum and Minimum 

Lake Levels is determined pursuant to paragraphs (6)(b) and 

(7)(b) above. Guidance Levels established prior to August 7, 

2000, are set forth in Table 8-3 in subsection 40D-8.624(13), 

F.A.C., below. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=123
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40D-8.624
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=373.044
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.113
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.171
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=373.036
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.042
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.0421
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.086
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.709


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 20, January 31, 2017 

 

478 

 
Table 8-2 Minimum and Guidance Levels Established During or After August 7, 2000. Levels are 

elevations,  

in feet above the National Geodetic Vertical Datum of 1929. 

Locati

on by 

Count

y and 

Basin 

Name of 

Lake and 

Section, 

Townshi

p and 

Range 

Informat

ion 

High 

Guidan

ce 

Level 

High 

Minim

um 

Lake 

Level 

Minim

um 

Lake 

Level 

Low 

Guidan

ce 

Level 

(a

) through 

(y) 

N

o change. 

          

(z

)     In 

Polk 

County 

Within 

the Peace 

River 

Basin 

          

  Annie, 

Lake 

S-3, T-

29S, 

R-27E 

through 

Bonnie, 

Lake 

S-31, T-

29S, R-

28E  

No 

change. 

        

  Clinch, 

Lake 

S-31, T-

31S,R-

28E 

  

106.5 

105.5’ 

  

105.7 

105.5’ 

 (CAT 3) 

103.2  

104.4’ 

 (CAT 3) 

102.3 

103.1’ 

  

  Crooked 

Lake 

S-01, T-

31S, R-

27E 

through 

Wales 

Lake 

S-01, T-

30S, 

R-27E 

No 

change. 

        

(a

a) 

through 

(cc) 

N

o change. 

          

 

(13) No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 373.044, 373.113, 373.171 FS. Law 

Implemented 373.036, 373.042, 373.0421, 373.086,373.709 FS. 

History–New 6-7-78, Amended 1-22-79, 4-27-80, 10-21-80, 12-22-

80, 3-23-81, 4-14-81, 6-4-81, 10-15-81, 11-23-81, 1-5-82, 3-11-82, 5-

10-82, 7-4-82, 9-2-82, 11-8-82, 1-10-83, 4-3-83, 7-5-83, 9-5-83, 10-

16-83, 12-12-83, 5-8-84, 7-8-84, 12-16-84, 2-7-85, 5-13-85, 6-26-85, 

11-3-85, 3-5-86, 6-16-86, Formerly 16J-8.678, Amended 9-7-86, 2-

12-87, 9-2-87, 2-18-88, 6-27-88, 2-22-89, 3-23-89, 9-26-89, 7-26-90, 

10-30-90, 3-3-91, 9-30-91, 10-7-91, 7-26-92, 3-1-93, 5-11-94, 6-6-

96, 2-23-97, 8-7-00, 1-8-04, 12-21-04 (13), 12-21-04 (13), 6-5-05, 5-

2-06, 1-1-07, 2-12-07, 1-10-08, 2-18-08, 4-7-08, 5-20-08, 5-10-09, 4-

13-11, 3-12-12, 11-25-12, 2-21-13 (12)(f), 2-21-13(12), (13), 9-3-13, 

1-7-15, 7-1-15, 9-21-15, _______. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Southwest Florida Water Management District 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Southwest Florida Water Management 

District Governing Board 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: December 15, 2015 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: December 21, 2016 

DEPARTMENT OF MANAGEMENT SERVICES 

E911 Board 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:  

60FF1-5.011 Text to 911 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The new rule is to incorporate 

form to distribute Text to 911 funds. 

SUMMARY: To incorporate new form for funds. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION:  

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse 

impact on small business or likely increase directly or 

indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the 

aggregate within one year after the implementation of the rule. 

A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency.  

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: : During discussion of the economic impact of this rule 

at its Board meeting, the Board concluded that this rule change 

will not have any impact on licensees and their businesses or 

the businesses that employ them. The rule will not increase 

any fees, business costs, personnel costs, will not decrease 

profit opportunities, and will not require any specialized 

knowledge to comply. This change will not increase any direct 

or indirect regulatory costs. Hence, the Board determined that 

a Statement of Estimated Regulatory Costs (SERC) was not 

necessary and that the rule will not require ratification by the 

Legislature. No person or interested party submitted additional 

information regarding the economic impact at that time. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 365.172(6)(a)11, FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 365.172(6)(a)3.b.,(e), FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=60
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=958
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=60FF1-5.011
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=365.172(6)(a)11,%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=365.172(6)(a)3.b.,(e),%20FS


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 20, January 31, 2017 

 

479 

 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Heath Beach, Chairman, E911 Board, 

4030 Esplanade Way, Suite 135F, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-

0950. 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

60FF1-5.011  Text to 911. 

(1) Counties may request funding for “Text to 911” by 

completing and submitting “Text-to-911 Funding Request 

Form 1T,” revised  12/16, which is incorporated herein by 

reference and may be obtained from the E911 Board office at 

the following address: 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=/ref-   or 

State of Florida E911 Board, Attn:  Administrative Assistant, 

4050 Esplanade Way, Building 4030 – Suite135, Tallahassee, 

FL 32399-0950. 

(2) Should a request be granted, no additional funding for 

Text to 911 shall be dispersed to the recipient for 365 days 

from the date of the prior disbursement. 

Rulemaking Authority 365.172(6)(a)11. FS. Law implemented 

365.172(6)(a)3.b.,(e), FS. History–New,_______. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

E911 Board 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: E911 Board 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: December 15, 2016 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: November 30, 2016 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Board of Professional Engineers 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

61G15-32.002 Definitions 

61G15-32.008 Design of Fire Alarms and Detection 

Systems 

61G15-32.009 Design of Fine Water Spray (Mist) Fire 

Suppression and Control Systems 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of the amendments is 

to update the Board’s rules regarding professional 

responsibilities of Engineers designing Fire Protection 

Systems. 

SUMMARY: Proposed responsibilities of Engineers regarding 

designing Fire Protection Systems. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION:  

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse 

impact on small business or likely increase directly or 

indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the 

aggregate within one year after the implementation of the rule. 

A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency.  

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: During discussion of the economic impact of this rule 

at its Board meeting, the Board, based upon the expertise and 

experience of its members, determined that a Statement of 

Estimated Regulatory Costs (SERC) was not necessary and 

that the rule will not require ratification by the Legislature. No 

person or interested party submitted additional information 

regarding the economic impact at that time. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 471.008. 471.033(2) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 471.015(7), 471.033, 471.033(2) FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Zana Raybon, Executive Director, 

Board of Professional Engineers, 2639 North Monroe Street, 

Suite B-112, Tallahassee, FL 32303; (850)521-0500. 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

61G15-32.002 Definitions. 

(1)  through (6) No change. 

(7) Codes and Standards: Those nationally recognized 

codes and standards adopted directly or by reference in 

Chapter 633, F.S., Fire Prevention and Control; the Florida 

Building Code; (2007) and the Florida Fire Prevention Code. 

set forth in Chapter 69A-60, F.A.C. The Florida Building 

Code and The Florida Fire Prevention Code are incorporated 

in reference in Rule 61G15-18.011, F.A.C. Applicable codes 

and standards also include those promulgated by State and 

local authorities having jurisdiction. In the event the codes and 

standards fail to cover or address a specific protection 

requirement, alternative research, test results, and engineering 

data may be utilized, relying on the Engineer of Record for 

Fire Protection to make an informed engineering decision. 

This definition is not intended to preclude the use of new 

technologies when said technology has been demonstrated to 

provide equivalent or improved protection above that of 

published National Fire Protection standards. 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=/ref-
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=267
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G15-32.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G15-32.008
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G15-32.009
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=471.008.%20471.033(2)%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=471.015(7),%20471.033,%20471.033(2)%20FS


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 20, January 31, 2017 

 

480 

(8) through (10) No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 471.008, 471.033(2) FS. Law Implemented 

471.005(7), 471.033(2) FS. History–New 5-19-93, Formerly 21H-

32.002, Amended 4-2-00, 6-26-01, 3-26-09, 10-11-10,                      . 

 

61G15-32.008 Design of Fire Alarms and Detection 

Systems. 

(1) No change. 

(2) The design specifications shall be based on the Florida 

Building Code (2007), the Florida Fire Prevention Code, or as 

required by the local authority having jurisdiction. The Florida 

Building Code and the Florida Fire Prevention Code are 

incorporated by reference in Rule 61G15-18.011, F.A.C. 

(3) No change. 

(4) To ensure minimum design quality of Fire Alarm and 

Detection Systems Engineering Documents, said documents 

shall include as a minimum the following information when 

applicable: 

(a) The documents plans shall be clear, with a symbols 

legend, system riser diagram showing all initiation and 

notification components, and cabling requirements. The 

documents shall iIndicate locations where fire ratings are 

required as determined by the system’s survivability 

requirements,. and shall identify the general occupancy of the 

protected property, and for each room and area unless it is 

clear from features shown. 

(b) through (c) No change. 

(d) Identify the Class and Style of circuits as listed in the 

NFPA 72, which is contained within and incorporated into the 

Florida Fire Prevention Code. 

(e) through (h) No change. 

(i) The documents plans shall include a site plan of the 

immediate area around the protected building, structure or 

equipment when alarm devices are required outside the 

structure. 

(j) No change. 

(k) For fFire detection systems utilizing smoke detection 

in situations where smoke stratification is anticipated, the 

design shall provide the necessary criteria to mitigate the 

detection problems. 

(l) Systems designed using Performance Based criteria 

shall be identified and referenced to design guides or standards 

approved by the local authority having jurisdiction consistent 

with standards adopted by the Florida Fire Prevention Code 

and the Florida Building Code (2007). 

(m) The system design must indicate if the system is to 

provide a general evacuation signal or a zoned evacuation for 

all high-rise buildings or multi-tenanted properties as defined 

in section 2 of the Florida Building Code, Building (2007). 

(n) through (o)  No change. 

(5) through (7) No change. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 471.008, 471.033(2) FS. Law 

Implemented 471.033 FS. History–New 5-19-93, Formerly 21H-

32.008, Amended 3-26-09,                    . 

 

61G15-32.009 Design of Fine Water Spray (Mist) Fire 

Suppression and Control Systems. 

(1) Fine water spray (mist) systems include water based 

fire suppression and control systems based on National Fire 

Protection Association (NFPA) Standard 750, which is 

contained within and incorporated into the Florida Fire 

Prevention Code. 

(2) through (3) No change. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 471.008, 471.033(2) FS. Law 

Implemented 471.005(6), 471.033(2) FS. History–New 4-2-00,     .  

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Board of Professional Engineers 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Board of Professional Engineers 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: December 8, 2016 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: January 13, 2017 

Section III 

Notice of Changes, Corrections and 

Withdrawals 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Nursing Home Administrators 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

64B10-11.001 Application for Licensure 

64B10-11.003 Reexamination 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 42 No. 215, November 

3, 2016 issue of the Florida Administrative Register.  

The changes are in response to written comments submitted by 

the staff of the Joint Administrative Procedures Committee 

and discussion and subsequent vote by the board at a public 

meeting held January 13, 2016.  The changes are as follows: 

 

64B10-11.001 Application for Licensure. 

Any person desiring to be licensed as a nursing home 

administrator shall apply to the Board of Nursing Home 

Administrators. The application shall be made on the 

Application for Nursing Home Administrators Examination 

and Endorsement/Temporary, form DH-MQA-NHA002, 

(01/17 09/16), hereby adopted and incorporated by reference, 

which can be obtained from 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G15-32.008
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=301
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B10-11.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B10-11.003


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 20, January 31, 2017 

 

481 

 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-         

04504; or the Board’s website at 

http://floridasnursinghomeadmin.gov/applications/application-

licensure-nha.pdf. 

Rulemaking Authority 468.1685(1), (2), 468.1695(1) FS. Law 

Implemented 456.013, 456.0635, 468.1685(2), 468.1695(1), 

468.1705 FS. History–New 12-26-79, Formerly 21Z-11.01, Amended 

1-18-87, 10-2-88, 3-5-89, 3-15-90, 12-3-90, 11-3-92, Formerly 21Z-

11.001, 61G12-11.001, Amended 12-4-95, 9-4-96, 7-21-97, Formerly 

59T-11.001, Amended 5-15-00, 1-7-04, 2-15-06, 11-9-08, 10-24-10, 

2-6-13, 9-10-14,              . 

 

The following changes have been made to incorporated form 

DH-MQA-NHA002, 01/1709/16: 

Page 1, Number 3:  References to the Candidate Information 

Booklet (CIB) have been deleted.  

Page 1, Number 5:  The word “relevant” has been deleted. 

Page 2, Number 8:  Reference to Rule 64B16-1.016 has been 

deleted. 

 

64B10-11.003 Reexamination. 

(1) An applicant must obtain passing scores on both 

examinations required for licensure as specified in subsection 

64B10-11.002(1), F.A.C., within one (1) year of the date of 

application. Any applicant desiring to retake one (1) or both of 

the required examinations must reapply to the Board and pay 

the fee required by subsection 64B10-12.0001(2)12. 006(2), 

F.A.C. 

(2) Application for reexamination shall be made on the 

Application for Nursing Home Administrators Re-

Examination, Form DH-MQA 1129, (01/17 09/16), hereby 

adopted and incorporated by reference, and which can be 

obtained from 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-           

05469 or the Board’s website at 

http://floridasnursinghomeadmin.gov/applications/app-

reexam-nha.pdf. 

(3) If the applicant fails to achieve passing scores on both 

examinations within the stated one (1)-year period, the 

applicant must reapply for licensure as specified in Rule 

64B10-11.001, F.A.C., pay all required fees, and meet all 

then-current licensing requirements. 

Rulemaking Authority 456.017(2), 468.1685(1) FS. Law 

Implemented 456.017(2), 456.0635 FS. History–New 12-26-79, 

Amended 3-1-82, 6-14-82, Formerly 21Z-11.03, Amended 3-5-89, 8-

19-92, Formerly 21Z-11.003, 61G12-11.003, Amended 6-2-96, 

Formerly 59T-11.003, Amended 5-15-00, 11-6-02, 2-15-06, 4-22-09, 

10-11-10, 2-6-13, 9-10-14, 7-8-15,                  . 

 

The following changes have been made to incorporated form 

DH-MQA- 1129, 01/1709/16: 

Page 1, Number 3:  References to the Candidate Information 

Booklet (CIB) have been deleted. 

Page 1, Number 5:  The word “relevant” has been deleted. 

Page 2, Number 8:  Reference to Rule 64B-1.016 has been 

deleted. 

 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Anthony B. Spivey, Executive 

Director, Board of Nursing Home Administrators, 4052 Bald 

Cypress Way, Bin # C07, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3257. 

Section IV 

Emergency Rules 

NONE 

Section V 

Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Rule 

Variance or Waiver 

NONE 

Section VI 

Notice of Meetings, Workshops and Public 

Hearings 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

Division of Historical Resources 

The Bureau of Historic Preservation, Florida National Register 

Review Board announces a public meeting to which all 

persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: February 9, 2017, 1:30 p.m. until 

conclusion 

PLACE: R.A. Gray Building, Room 307, 500 South Bronough 

Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0250 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Review and approval of five National Register nomination 

proposals plus the delisting of one National Register-listed 

resource. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Ruben 

A. Acosta, 1(800)847-7278, 

Ruben.Acosta@dos.myflorida.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Ruben A. Acosta, 1(800)847-7278, 

Ruben.Acosta@dos.myflorida.com. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-%20%20%20%20%20%20%20%20%2004504
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-%20%20%20%20%20%20%20%20%2004504
http://floridasnursinghomeadmin.gov/applications/application-licensure-nha.pdf
http://floridasnursinghomeadmin.gov/applications/application-licensure-nha.pdf
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-%20%20%20%20%20%20%20%20%20%20%2005469
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-%20%20%20%20%20%20%20%20%20%20%2005469
http://floridasnursinghomeadmin.gov/applications/app-reexam-nha.pdf
http://floridasnursinghomeadmin.gov/applications/app-reexam-nha.pdf
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=1
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1
mailto:Ruben.Acosta@dos.myflorida.com
mailto:Ruben.Acosta@dos.myflorida.com


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 20, January 31, 2017 

 

482 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Ruben A. Acosta, 

1(800)847-7278, Ruben.Acosta@dos.myflorida.com. 

DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE 

Corporate, Estate and Intangible Tax 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

12C-1.0196 Research and Development Tax Credit 

The Department of Revenue announces a public meeting to 

which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: February 7, 2017, during a regular 

meeting of the Governor and Cabinet, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Cabinet Meeting Room, Lower Level - 03, The 

Capitol, Tallahassee, Florida 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Approval of the proposed rules listed below. 

The following proposed rule was noticed in the December 20, 

2016 (Vol. 42, No. 245, pp. 5658-5660), issue of the Florida 

Administrative Register: 

Rule 12C-1.0196, F.A.C. – Research and Development Tax 

Credit 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

Kimberly Berg at (850)717-7082 or referring to the Cabinet 

agenda posted to the Department’s website at 

http://dor.myflorida.com/dor/rules/. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Rebecca Avrett at (850)717-6799. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

REGIONAL PLANNING COUNCILS 

Treasure Coast Regional Planning Council 

The Treasure Coast Regional Planning Council announces a 

public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: February 17, 2017, 9:30 a.m. 

PLACE: Indian River State College, Wolf High Technology 

Center, 2400 SE Salerno Road, Stuart, FL 34997 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The Treasure Coast Regional Planning Council will hold its 

monthly board meeting. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Liz 

Gulick at (772)221-4060 or lgulick@tcrpc.org. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Liz Gulick at (772)221-4060 or lgulick@tcrpc.org 

If you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the 

agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 

(TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Liz Gulick at 

(772)221-4060 or lgulick@tcrpc.org. 

REGIONAL PLANNING COUNCILS 

Apalachee Regional Planning Council 

The Apalachee Local Emergency Planning Committee 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, February 14, 2017, 10:00 a.m., 

ET 

PLACE: Capital Area Chapter of the American Red Cross, 

1115 Easterwood Drive, Tallahassee, FL 32311 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The regular quarterly meeting of the Apalachee Local 

Emergency Planning Committee (LEPC). 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Gina 

Mendicino, ARPC, 2507 Callaway Road, Suite 200, 

Tallahassee, FL 32303, GMendicino@thearpc.com, (850)488-

6211, ext. 107 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS 

Northwest Florida Water Management District 

The Northwest Florida Water Management District announces 

a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: February 9, 2017, Resource Management 

Committee Meeting at 11:00 a.m., Lands Committee Meeting 

at 11:30 a.m., Governing Board Meeting at 1:00 p.m., Public 

Hearing on Consideration of Regulatory Matters at 1:05 p.m., 

Public Hearing on Consideration of Florida Forever 2017 

Five-Year Work Plan for Land Acquisition at 4:10 p.m. 

PLACE: District Headquarters, 81 Water Management Drive, 

Havana, Florida 32333 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

District business. 

mailto:Ruben.Acosta@dos.myflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=12
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=35
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=12C-1.0196
http://dor.myflorida.com/dor/rules/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=29
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=67
mailto:lgulick@tcrpc.org
mailto:lgulick@tcrpc.org
mailto:lgulick@tcrpc.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=29
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=68
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=120


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 20, January 31, 2017 

 

483 

 

NOTE: One or more Governing Board members may attend 

and participate in the meetings by means of communications 

media technology. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

Savannah White. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 72 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Wendy Dugan. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS 

St. Johns River Water Management District 

The St. Johns River Water Management District announces a 

public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: CANCELLED: Tuesday, January 31, 

2017, 3:00 p.m. 

PLACE: New York Avenue, 0.2 miles west of Wickham 

Road, Melbourne, FL 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

**This event has been cancelled** 

Celebration of the Eau Gallie River muck dredging project. 

This celebration marks a milestone for community residents 

who formed The EGRET (Eau Gallie River Environment is 

Threatened) Project and raised awareness to improve the 

conditions of the Eau Gallie River. The project will remove at 

least 625,000 cubic yards of muck sediment from the Eau 

Gallie River, a tributary of the lagoon. 

Note: This event may be attended by one or more members of 

the St. Johns River Water Management Governing Board. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: St. 

Johns River Water Management District, Attention: Ed 

Garland at egarland@sjrwmd.com, 1(321)676-6612. 

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS 

St. Johns River Water Management District 

The Harris Chain of Lakes Restoration Council announces a 

public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Friday, February 10, 2017, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Lake County Administration Building, Second Floor, 

County Commission Meeting Room, 315 West Main Street, 

Tavares, FL 32778 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Discussion, review and evaluation of various issues and topics 

having specific reference to the Harris Chain of Lakes in Lake 

County. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: The St. 

Johns River Water Management District, Attn: Susan Davis, 

4049 Reid Street, Palatka, FL32177, sdavis@sjrwmd.com 

(407)659-4838 or by visiting the Council’s website at 

harrischainoflakescouncil.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: The District Clerk at (386)329-4500. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Board of Pilot Commissioners 

The Board of Pilot Commissioners announces a telephone 

conference call to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: February 9, 2017, 10:30 a.m. 

PLACE: 1(888)670-3525, participant code: 7004064007# 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

General Board Business. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Board of 

Pilot Commissioners, 2601 Blair Stone Rd., Tallahassee, FL 

32399, (850)717-1982. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Board of Pilot Commissioners, 2601 Blair Stone 

Rd., Tallahassee, FL 32399, (850)717-1982. If you are hearing 

or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Board of Pilot 

Commissioners, 2601 Blair Stone Rd., Tallahassee, FL 32399, 

(850)717-1982. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=122
mailto:egarland@sjrwmd.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=122
mailto:sdavis@sjrwmd.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=266


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 20, January 31, 2017 

 

484 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Board of Professional Engineers 

The Florida Board of Professional Engineers Continuing 

Education Rules Committee announces a telephone 

conference call to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: February 14, 2017, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Florida Board of Professional Engineers, 2639 North 

Monroe St., Building B-112, Tallahassee, FL 32303 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

General business of the committee. If you would like to 

participate in the call, please contact: Rebecca Sammons at 

(850)521-0500, ext. 114, at least 10 days prior to the date of 

the meeting. The call-in number is: 1(888)392-4560 (you will 

need to contact Ms. Sammons for the participant code). 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Rebecca 

Sammons. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 10 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Rebecca Sammons. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Rebecca Sammons, 

rsammons@fbpe.org. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Division of Emergency Preparedness and Community Support 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

64J-2.006 Trauma Registry and Trauma Quality 

Improvement Program 

The Florida Department of Health announces a hearing to 

which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, February 14, 2017, 1:00 p.m., 

ET 

PLACE: 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Tallahassee, Florida, Room 

301, telephone conference: 1(888)670-3525, participant code: 

1043560135, then # 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The Department will consider changes and updates to the 

Florida Trauma Registry, Data Dictionary. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Michael 

Leffler, email: Michael.Leffler@flhealth.gov, 4052 Bald 

Cypress Way, Bin #A-22, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, 

telephone: (850)245-4440, ext. 2760. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Michael Leffler as shown above. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES 

The Department of Children and Families announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: January 31, 2017 meeting is rescheduled 

for March 23, 2017, 9:00 a.m., Central Time 

PLACE: 160 West Government Street, Room 101, Pensacola, 

Florida 32502 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The purpose of this meeting is to negotiate the potential terms 

and conditions for the Circuit 1 Community Based Care Lead 

Agency contract to be executed pursuant Exceptional Purchase 

as noticed on the Vendor Bid System #ITN-01FS18001. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Randy 

Fleming, (850)483-6621, Randy.Fleming@myflfamilies.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 2 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Randy Fleming at (850)483-6621 or 

Randy.Fleming@myflfamilies.com. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Randy Fleming at 

(850)483-6621 or Randy.Fleming@myflfamilies.com. 

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES 

Refugee Services 

The Department of Children and Families, Refugee Services 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, February 14, 2017, 2:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Tallahassee, Florida 32399; conference call: number: 

1(888)670-3525, participation code: 4471182592# 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Public Meeting #1. 

Title: Solicitation Conference Call for Citizenship and 

Immigration Related Employability Services for Refugees and 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=267
mailto:rsammons@fbpe.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=832
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64J-2.006
mailto:Michael.Leffler@flhealth.gov
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
mailto:Randy.Fleming@myflfamilies.com
mailto:Randy.Fleming@myflfamilies.com
mailto:Randy.Fleming@myflfamilies.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=528


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 20, January 31, 2017 

 

485 

 

Entrants in Hillsborough and Pinellas Counties (ITN# 

SNR1718RS001). 

Description: As provided for in Sections 2.5, 2.6, and 2.7 of 

this ITN which was published to the Vendor Bid System 

(VBS) on January 24, 2017. The VBS can be accessed at 

http://www.myflorida.com/apps/vbs/vbs_www.main_menu. 

The purpose of the Solicitation Conference Call is to review 

the ITN with interested Vendors so that areas of 

misunderstanding or ambiguity are clarified. The Department 

encourages all prospective Vendors to participate in the 

solicitation conference, during which Vendors may pose 

questions. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

David.Draper@myflfamilies.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Lisa Stephany, Lisa_Stephany@myflfamilies.com 

or (850)717-4557. If you are hearing or speech impaired, 

please contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: 

David.Draper@myflfamilies.com. 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

Division of Workforce Services 

The Reemployment Assistance Appeals Commission 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: February 8, 2017, 9:30 a.m. 

PLACE: Reemployment Assistance Appeals Commission, 101 

Rhyne Building, 2740 Centerview Drive, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-4151 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Deliberation for cases pending before the Reemployment 

Assistance Appeals Commission that are ready for final 

review and the Chairman's report. No public testimony will be 

taken. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

Reemployment Assistance Appeals Commission, 101 Rhyne 

Building, 2740 Centerview Drive, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-

4151, (850)487-2685. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 24 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Reemployment Assistance Appeals Commission, 

101 Rhyne Building, 2740 Centerview Drive, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-4151, (850)487-2685. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Reemployment 

Assistance Appeals Commission, 101 Rhyne Building, 2740 

Centerview Drive, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-4151 (850)487-

2685. 

Section VII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Declaratory Statements 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares and Mobile 

Homes 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Division of Florida 

Condominiums, Timeshares, and Mobile Homes, Department 

of Business and Professional Regulation, State of Florida, has 

declined to rule on the petition for declaratory statement filed 

by Scott J. Wortman, Esq., In Re: Forest Hill Gardens East 

Condominium Association, Inc., Docket No. 2016058371, on 

December 23, 2016. The following is a summary of the 

agency’s declination of the petition: 

The Division declined to issue a statement because it cannot 

issue a statement without sufficient facts and competent, 

substantial evidence; or when the issue is not within the 

statutory authority of the Division. The order was filed with 

the Agency Clerk on January 26, 2017. 

A copy of the Order Declining of the Petition for Declaratory 

Statement may be obtained by contacting: Danielle Walker, 

Administrative Assistant II, at Department of Business and 

Professional Regulation, Division of Florida Condominiums, 

Timeshares, and Mobile Homes, 2601 Blair Stone Road, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1030; (850)717-1539; 

Danielle.Walker@myfloridalicense.com. 

Section VIII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding the Validity of Rules 

Notice of Petition for Administrative Determination has been 

filed with the Division of Administrative Hearings on the 

following rules: 

NONE 

Notice of Disposition of Petition for Administrative 

Determination has been filed with the Division of 

Administrative Hearings on the following rules: 

NONE 

http://www.myflorida.com/apps/vbs/vbs_www.main_menu
mailto:David.Draper@myflfamilies.com
mailto:Lisa_Stephany@myflfamilies.com
mailto:David.Draper@myflfamilies.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1065
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=248
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=248
mailto:Danielle.Walker@myfloridalicense.com


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 20, January 31, 2017 

 

486 

Section IX 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Non-rule Policy Challenges 

NONE 

Section X 

Announcements and Objection Reports of 

the Joint Administrative Procedures 

Committee 

NONE 

Section XI 

Notices Regarding Bids, Proposals and 

Purchasing 

DEPARTMENT OF MANAGEMENT SERVICES 

Division of Building Construction 

Environmental Continuing Contract-Northeast 

STATE OF FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF MANAGEMENT 

SERVICES 

DIVISION OF REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT AND 

MANAGEMENT 

PUBLIC ANNOUNCEMENT FOR PROFESSIONAL 

SERVICES 

CONTINUING CONTRACTS FOR ASBESTOS, LEAD, 

INDOOR AIR QUALITY, MOLD 

AND INDUSTRIAL HYGIENE CONSULTING SERVICES 

NORTHEAST FLORIDA REGION 

January 31, 2017 

Project Number: N/A 

Project Name: Continuing Contracts for Asbestos, Lead, 

Indoor Air Quality, Mold and Industrial Hygiene Consulting 

Services 

Project Location: Northeast Florida Region 

The State of Florida, Department of Management Services 

(DMS), Division of Real Estate Development and 

Management, requests qualifications from asbestos licensed 

consulting firms that are also accredited to provide lead, 

indoor air quality, mold and industrial hygiene consulting 

services primarily in the Northeast Florida Region. These 

services may be used for projects anywhere in the State of 

Florida, however, it is anticipated that the firms selected 

during this process will be activated for projects in the 

Northeast part of the State. The Northeast Region is defined as 

all counties north of and including Levy, Marion and Volusia 

and east of Taylor and Madison. Projects will vary in size up 

to $2,000,000.00 for (construction) and up to $200,000.00 for 

(planning or study fees). Firms considered for selection must 

have a licensed Professional Engineer and Certified Industrial 

Hygienist (CIH) on staff to do business in Florida. 

Response Due Date:  Monday, March 6, 2017 by 4:00 p.m., 

Eastern Standard Time 

Please visit the Department’s website 

http://www.myflorida.com/apps/vbs/vbs_www.main_menu 

and click on “Search Advertisements” – “Division of Real 

Estate Development and Management” Look for 

“Opportunities for Design and Construction Firms” and click 

on link. 

FISH AND WILDLIFE CONSERVATION COMMISSION 

REQUEST FOR STATEMENT OF QUALIFICATIONS FOR 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

The Florida Fish and Wildlife Conservation Commission 

(FWC) is soliciting Statements of Qualifications (SOQ) from 

qualified design, surveying and mapping, engineering, 

landscape architecture and architectural firms in accordance 

with Section 287.055, Florida Statutes. 

BID NO: FWC 16/17-71 

TITLE: REQUEST FOR STATEMENT OF 

QUALIFICATIONS FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

FOR: A wide range of projects. 

SEALED BIDS WILL BE RECEIVED, PUBLICLY 

OPENED AND READ ALOUD ON: 

DATE & TIME: February 22, 2017 @ 2:00 P.M., EST 

PLACE: Fl. Fish and Wildlife Conservation Commission 

 Purchasing Office, Suite 100 

 2590 Executive Center Circle 

 Tallahassee, Florida 32301 

 Phone: (850)488-6551 

BID DOCUMENTS: Can be downloaded from the Vendor 

Bid System at the link below: 

http://www.myflorida.com/apps/vbs/vbs_www.main_menu 

Search by bid number FWC 16/17-71 

PURCHASING MANAGER: (Direct questions to the 

following) 

Bryan Tucker, Procurement Manager 

Florida Fish & Wildlife Conservation Commission 

Tallahassee Purchasing Office 

2590 Executive Center Circle East, Suite 100 

Tallahassee, Florida 32301 

Phone: (850)617-9614 

bryan.tucker@myfwc.com 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=60
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=225
http://www.myflorida.com/apps/vbs/vbs_www.main_menu
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=68
mailto:bryan.tucker@myfwc.com


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 20, January 31, 2017 

 

487 

 

Section XII 

Miscellaneous 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

Index of Administrative Rules Filed with the Secretary of 

State 

Pursuant to Section 120.55(1)(b)6. – 7., F.S., the below list of 

rules were filed in the Office of the Secretary of State between 

8 a.m. Tuesday January 24, and 3 p.m. Monday, January 30, 

2017. An improved electronic publication system is 

forthcoming on the Florida Administrative Rules website, 

FLRules.org, which will accommodate complete publication 

of rules filed for adoption in the previous 7 days, including 

rules awaiting legislative action. 

Rule No. File Date Effective  

Date 

6M-4.620 1/27/2017 2/16/2017 

19B-4.001 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

19B-16.003 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

19B-18.003 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

25-30.425 1/30/2017 2/19/2017 

25-30.455 1/30/2017 2/19/2017 

33-601.101 1/27/2017 2/16/2017 

33-601.105 1/27/2017 2/16/2017 

59G-4.125 1/30/2017 2/19/2017 

64-1.011 1/30/2017 2/19/2017 

64B4-3.0075 1/24/2017 2/13/2017 

64B8-51.006 1/27/2017 2/16/2017 

64B8-52.004 1/26/2017 2/15/2017 

64B8-53.001 1/26/2017 2/15/2017 

64B8-53.002 1/26/2017 2/15/2017 

64B8-53.003 1/26/2017 2/15/2017 

64B8-55.002 1/26/2017 2/15/2017 

64B8-56.002 1/26/2017 2/15/2017 

64B9-15.0035 1/27/2017 2/16/2017 

64B17-3.002 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

64B17-3.006 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

64B17-3.007 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

64K-1.001 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

73A-3.002 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

73A-3.003 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

73A-3.004 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 

LIST OF RULES AWAITING LEGISLATIVE 

APPROVAL SECTIONS 120.541(3), 373.139(7) AND/OR 

373.1391(6), FLORIDA STATUTES 

Rule No. File Date Effective  

Date 

40B-9.021 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 

40B-9.041 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 

40B-9.126 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 

40B-9.131 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 

40B-9.1381 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 

40B-9.1411 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 

40B-9.142 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 

40B-9.145 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 

40B-9.123 12/9/2016 **/**/**** 

60FF1-5.009 7/21/2016 **/**/**** 

64B8-9.009 6/15/2016 **/**/**** 

64B8-10.003 12/9/2015 **/**/**** 

69L-7.100 12/19/2016 **/**/**** 

69L-7.501 12/19/2016 **/**/**** 

REGIONAL PLANNING COUNCILS 

West Florida Regional Planning Council 

Agency Regulatory Plan Letter 

The West Florida Regional Planning Council has posted the 

2015 and 2016 regulatory plan letters to the WFRPC website. 

The letters can be found at http://www.wfrpc.org/who-we-

are/council/documents. 

FISH AND WILDLIFE CONSERVATION COMMISSION 

Vessel Registration and Boating Safety 

AVAILABILITY OF GRANT FUNDS FOR LOCAL 

GOVERNMENTS 

The Florida Fish and Wildlife Conservation Commission 

(FWC) announces the anticipated availability of grant funds 

under the Florida Boating Improvement Program (FBIP). 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=1
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=29
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=57
http://www.wfrpc.org/who-we-are/council/documents
http://www.wfrpc.org/who-we-are/council/documents
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=68
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=350


Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 20, January 31, 2017 

 

488 

Eligible projects include construction and repair of boating 

access facilities, uniform waterway markers, derelict vessel 

removal, and other local boating-related activities. County 

governments, municipalities and other governmental entities 

of the State of Florida are eligible to apply. Applications for 

grant funding for fiscal year 2017-18 will be accepted 

beginning February 1, 2017. Applications must be received by 

FWC before close of business on April 4, 2017. Applications 

received after the deadline will be ineligible for consideration. 

Program guidelines and application forms may be downloaded 

from the web site http://www.myfwc.com/boating/grant-

programs/fbip/. For more information, email: 

FBIP@MyFWC.com or call (850)488-5600. 

Section XIII 

Index to Rules Filed During Preceding 

Week 

INDEX TO RULES FILED BETWEEN  

JANUARY23, 2017 AND JANUARY 27, 2017 

 
Rule No.  File Date  Effective  Proposed  Amended 

       Date  Vol./No . Vol./No. 

 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRCULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Consumer Services 

5J-26.001 1/23/2017 2/12/2017 42/219 

 

Division of Licensing 

5N-1.116 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 42/226 

 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

Florida’s Office of Early Learning 

6M-4.620 1/27/2017 2/16/2017 42/228  42/246 

 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

19B-4.001 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 42/210 

19B-16.003 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 42/210 

19B-18.003 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 42/210 

 

DEPARTMENT OF CITRUS 

20-100.004 1/23/2017 2/12/2017 42/223 

 

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS 

33-601.101 1/27/2017 2/16/2017 42/225 

33-601.105 1/27/2017 2/16/2017 42/225 

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS 

Southwest Florida Water Management District 

40D-8.624 1/23/2017 2/12/2017 42/238 

40D-8.624 1/23/2017 2/12/2017 42/238 

40D-8.624 1/23/2017 2/12/2017 42/238 

 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Physical Therapy Practice 

64B17-3.001 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 42/237 

64B17-3.002 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 42/237 

64B17-3.006 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 42/237 

64B17-3.007 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 42/237 

 

Board of Clinical Social Work, Marriage and Family 

Therapy and Mental Health Counseling 

64B4-3.0075 1/24/2017 2/13/2017 42/248 

 

Board of Medicine 

64B8-51.006 1/27/2017 2/16/2017 42/167  42/243 

64B8-52.004 1/26/2017 2/15/2017 42/167  42/243 

64B8-53.001 1/26/2017 2/15/2017 42/175  42/243 

64B8-53.002 1/26/2017 2/15/2017 42/175  42/243 

64B8-53.003 1/26/2017 2/15/2017 42/175  42/243 

64B8-54.001 1/23/2017 2/12/2017 42/179  42/243 

64B8-55.002 1/26/2017 2/15/2017 42/167  42/243 

64B8-56.002 1/26/2017 2/15/2017 42/167  42/243 

 

Board of Nursing 

64B9-15.0035 1/27/2017 2/16/2017 42/220 

 

Prescription Drug Monitoring Program 

64K-1.003 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 42/243 

 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

Division of Strategic Business Development 

73A-3.002 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 42/243 

73A-3.003 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 42/243 

73A-3.004 1/25/2017 2/14/2017 42/243 

 

LIST OF RULES AWAITING LEGISLATIVE 

APPROVAL PURSUANT TO SECTION 120.541(3), 373.139(7) 

AND 373.1391(6), FLORIDA STATUTES 

 

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS 

Suwannee River Water Management District 

40B-9.021 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 42/221 

40B-9.041 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 42/221 

40B-9.123 12/9/2016 **/**/**** 42/221 

40B-9.126 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 42/221 

40B-9.131 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 42/221 

40B-9.1381 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 42/221 

40B-9.1411 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 42/221 



Florida Administrative Register Volume 43, Number 20, January 31, 2017 

 

489 

 

40B-9.142 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 42/221 

40B-9.145 12/21/2016 **/**/**** 42/221 

 

DEPARTMENT OF MANAGEMENT SERVICES 

E911 Board 

60FF1-5.009 7/21/2016 **/**/**** 42/105 

 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Medicine 

64B8-9.009 6/15/2016 **/**/**** 42/89 

64B8-10.003 12/9/2015 **/**/**** 39/95 41/49 

 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Divsion of Worker's Compensation 

69L-7.100 12/19/2016 **/**/**** 42/191 42/218 

69L-7.501 12/19/2016 **/**/**** 42/191 42/218 

 
NOTE: The above section will be published on Tuesday 

beginning October 2, 2012, unless Monday is a holiday, then it 

will be published on Wednesday of that week. 

 


