Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

Section |
Notice of Development of Proposed Rules
and Negotiated Rulemaking

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Impaired Practitioners Program

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
64B31-10.001  Impaired Practitioners Committee's Policies
& Guidelines

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of this rulemaking is
to eliminate rule language that is not required by statute and to
address how the Department designates approved impaired
practitioner programs.

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Approved impaired
practitioner programs.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 456.004(5), 456.076(1) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.076(1) FS.

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
REGISTER.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Diane
Dennin, (850)245-4025, Diane.Dennin@flhealth.gov

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

Section Il
Proposed Rules

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER
SERVICES

Florida Forest Service

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:

51-7.002 Definitions

51-7.004 Application Procedures and Requirements

51-7.007 Ranking, Review and Approval of Priority
Acquisition List

51-7.009 Appraisal Procedures, Report Requirements
and Determining Maximum Amounts

51-7.012 Closing

51-7.014 Compliance, Monitoring and Enforcement

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: Refine and correct oversights in the
original rule making the rule more streamlined and user friendly
for applicants to the program and for the agency.

SUMMARY:: Qualification and prioritization of applicants of
the Rural and Family Lands Protection Program.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF
REGULATORY COSTS AND

ESTIMATED
LEGISLATIVE

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will not
have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase
directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in
the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the
rule. A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency.

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: The Department’s economic analysis of the adverse
impact or potential regulatory costs of the proposed rule did not
exceed any of the criteria established in Section 120.541(2)(a),
Florida Statutes. As part of this analysis, the Department relied
upon the fact that participation in the program is voluntary and
there are no fees associated with Rule Chapter 51-7, F.A.C., or
with the proposed change. Any costs are minimal and
undeterminable. Additionally, no interested party submitted
additional information regarding the economic impact.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 570.07(23),
259.105, 259.105(3)(i) FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 570.70, 570.71, 259.105, 259.04(1)(c)
FS.

IFREQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS
NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Jennifer Reed, Land Program
Coordinator, Florida Forest Service, Land Administration
Section, The Conner Building, 3125 Conner Boulevard, Room
237, Tallahassee, FL 32399-1650, (850)681-5828, (850)681-
5801 Fax, Jennifer.Reed@FreshFromFlorida.com

570.71(10),

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

51-7.002 Definitions.

(1) through (10) No change.

(11) “Division” means the Florida Forest Service Bivision
of Forestry in the Department of Agriculture and Consumer
Services.

(12) through (18) No change.

(19) “Supplemental Standards” means the Supplemental
Appraisal Standards for Board of Trustees Land, which
contains appraisal requirements that establish public policy and
add to the standard appraisal procedures and practices of the
appraisal profession for the development and reporting of all
appraisal services, including those outlined in Chapters 253 and
259, F.S., which is incorporated by reference in subsection 18-

63


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=324
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B31-10.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=456.004(5),%20456.076(1)%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=456.076(1)%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=169
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5I-7.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5I-7.004
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5I-7.007
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5I-7.009
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5I-7.012
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5I-7.014
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=570.07(23)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20570.71(10)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20259.105
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20259.105(3)(i)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=570.70
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20570.71
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20259.105
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20259.04(1)(c)

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

1.002(27), F.A.C. adopted-by-the Board-of Trustees—of the

(20) “Uniform Standards of Professional Appraisal
Practices (USPAP)” means the generally accepted and
recognized standards of real property appraisal practice in the
United States promulgated by the Appraisal Foundation and
used by state and federal agencies and others, which is

(2)(4) When an application review cycle is initiated by the
Department, Not-less-than-enceperyear the Department shall
publish a Notice of Application Review Cycle with a date by
which new alt applications must be received. All notices shall
be published in the Florida Administrative Register, and

available on the internet at: http://www.
flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref- hitp i

no less than 45 days prior to the application review cycle
deadline.

(3) All projects on the existing priority list will be carried
over without submission of a new application, unless the
landowner notifies the Department in writing that the project is

incorporated by reference in Rule 61J1-9.001, F.A.C. and

(21) through (22) No change.
Rulemaking Authority 570.07(23), 570.71(10), 259.105(3)(i) FS. Law
Implemented 570.70, 570. 71(10) 259.105(3)(i) FS. History—New 11-
3-08, Amended

51-7.004 Application Procedures and Requirements.

(1) For purposes of Sections 259.105(3)(i), 570.70(5) and
570.71, F.S., anyone submitting an application for
consideration of a project under this rule shall utilize Form
FDACS-11207, Rural & Family Lands Protection Program
Application RURAL—& FAMILY-LANDS PROTECTION
PROGRAM—ASSOCIATION, Rev. 5/13 08/08, hereby
incorporated by reference. Copies are immediately available on
the internet at: http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.
asp?No=Ref- hitphasonw-t-dofcomiHorest—
management/rural—familylands—index-html or by sending a

request to: Florida Department of Agriculture and Consumer

Services, Florida Forest Service Division—ofForestry, 3125
Conner Boulevard, Suite “J4”, Tallahassee, FL 32399-1650.

64

withdrawn from the list. Landowners with property on the
existing priority list shall submit descriptions of any changes to
use or conditions on the property by the deadline for submission
of new applications published in the Notice of Application
Review Cycle. If the project no longer meets the program
criteria_set forth in subsection 51-5.007(3), F.A.C., due to
changes to use or conditions on the property, Division staff shall
recommend to the Rural and Family Lands Selection
Committee that the project be deemed ineligible. All new and
existing projects will either be ranked or re-ranked in
accordance with Rule 51-7.007, F.A.C.

(4)65) Each acquisition project application received shall,
within 30 days of receipt, be reviewed by Division staff to
verify sufficiency of information and that on its face is eligible
for further review and evaluation in accordance with this
section.

(@) Incomplete applications shall be returned to the
applicant with a letter stating every deficiency, for completion
and resubmission. If the supplemental information is not
received by the application review cycle deadline, the entire file
will be returned to the applicant.

(b) Applications determined to be ineligible shall be
returned to the applicant with an explanation of the reason that
the project was determined to be ineligible.

(c) Applications received after the application review cycle
deadline shall not be considered in the next group of projects.

(5) Requests for a project boundary modification of
currently approved projects for acreage additions or reductions
of 15% or less of the total approved project area shall be
submitted by the landowner prior to the application review
cycle deadline and shall be considered for approval by the Rural
and Family Lands Selection Committee with the next group of
new projects. Should the Committee approve the modification,
a_new total project acreage would be established. If the
modification will be in excess of 15% of the total approved
project area, the landowner must submit a new application.



http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference
http://www.fl-dof.com/forest_
http://www/

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

(6) If the landowner contemplates a division of the
property, the size and scope of such division shall be specified
in the application and must go before the Selection Committee
for approval. No division of the property will be allowed after
the approval and ranking of the project. The division must not
result in any parcel being below the median size of farms in the
county, as determined by the Median Size of Farms by County
Table, Version September 2014, hereby incorporated by
reference _and immediately available on the internet at:
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
Rulemaking Authority 570.07(23), 570.71(10), 259.105(3)(i) FS. Law

Implemented 570.70, 570.71, 259.105(3)(i) FS. History—New 11-3-08,
Amended .

51-7.007 Ranking, Review and Approval of Priority
Acquisition List.

(1) through (3) No change.

(4) The Rural and Family Lands Selection Committee shall
consider the list of projects at a public meeting conducted
pursuant to Section 120.525, F.S. The purpose of the meeting
shall be to receive public comment, consider the eligibility of
new applications and projects on the existing priority list, and
by majority vote adopt a list of projects in tiered priority order
that qualify for acquisition under the Program.

(5) No change.

(6) Following review by the Council, the Department shall
present the priority list to the Board for approval, along with
supporting information outlined in subsection (7) below. The
Board is authorized to remove projects from the list, but may
not add projects or change project rankings, as provided in
Section 259.105(15)04{1)}¢), F.S.

(7) through (11) No change.

Rulemaking Authority 570.07(23), 570.71(10), 259.105, 259.105(3)(i)

FS. Law Implemented 570.70, 570.71, 259.105, 259.04(1)(c) FS.
History—New 11-3-08, Amended

51-7.009 Appraisal Procedures, Report Requirements and
Determining Maximum Amounts.

(1) The Department shall only use appraisers and review
appraisers from the list of approved appraisers undercontracts
developed and maintained pursuant to subsections 18-1.007(1)
and (2), F.A.C. The Department is authorized to contract
directly with qualified appraisers and review appraisers or
coordinate through the Department of Environmental
Protection, Division of State Lands for review appraisal
services.

(2) through (5) No change.

(6) The development and reporting of all appraisal services
by the appraiser and review appraiser shall be consistent with
the Uniform Standards of Professional Appraisal Practices
(USPAP), Supplemental Standards, this chapter and the specific

assignment. The—Supplemental—Standards—identified—in

reference:

(7) through (14) No change.
Rulemaking Authority 570.07(23), 570.71(10), 259.105(3)(i) FS. Law
Implemented 570.70, 570.71, 259.105(3)(i) FS. History—New 11-3-08,
Amended .

51-7.012 Closing.

(1) The Department shall have the authority to modify the
purchase instrument previously approved by the Board to
extend the time for option exercise, closing date, submittal
deadlines or any other time limit relating to such agreement,
provided the total extension of time for closing does not exceed
180 calendar days after the date contemplated in the purchase
instrument approved by the Board. The Department shall also
have the authority to execute or modify all documents necessary
for the implementation of Board action, including without
limitation the purchase instrument, legal descriptions, deeds,
assignments, title policies and other miscellaneous agreements
and affidavits, provided the modification does not change the
substance or the scope of Board approval, and provided the
document executed or modified was either approved by the
Board or contemplated by Board approval. Any increase
changes in the purchase price to be paid to the seller not
contemplated by the terms of the purchase instrument must be
approved by the Board. An extension or modification may only
be made under the terms of the purchase instrument, or with the
seller’s agreement.

(2) through (4) No change.

Rulemaking Authority 570.07(23), 570.71(10), 259.105(3)(i) FS. Law

Implemented 570.70, 570.71, 259.105(3)(i) FS. History—New 11-3-08,
Amended .

51-7.014 Compliance, Monitoring and Enforcement.

(1) through (3) No change.

(4) The Department shall monitor all perpetual easements
utilizing Form FDACS-11208, Rural & Family Lands
Protection Program Easement Monitoring Form, 12/14 08/08,
hereby incorporated by reference and immediately available on

the internet at:
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-
hitpthnanans -

dot-comforest—managementirural—famiy—lands—index-html or
by sending a request to: the Florida Department of Agriculture
and Consumer Services, Florida Forest Service Division—of
Forestry, 3125 Conner Boulevard, Suite “J4”, Tallahassee, FL
32399-1650.

(5) No change.

(6) The Department shall review all monitoring reports for
compliance with monitoring specifications and consistency
with terms and conditions of the perpetual easement utilizing
Form FDACS-11208 11209, Rural & Family Lands Protection

65



Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

Program Easement Monitoring Form Rewview, 12/14 08/08;

Falahassee, FL-32399-1650.

Rulemaking Authority 570.07(23), 570.71(10), 259.105(3)(i) FS. Law
Implemented 570.70, 570.71, 259.105(3)(i) FS. History—New 11-3-08,
Amended .

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Jim Karels, Director, Florida Forest Service

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: Adam H. Putnam, Commissioner, Florida
Department of Agriculture and Consumer Services

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: December 8, 2014

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAR: December 23, 2014

WATER MANAGMENT DISTRICTS
Southwest Florida Water Management District

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:

40D-3.037 Rules, Publications and Agreements
Incorporated by Reference

40D-3.041 Permits Required

40D-3.045 Water Use Permit Required

40D-3.060 General Permit for Monitoring Wells

40D-3.492 Violations of Permits

40D-3.507 Casing and Liner Pipe Standards

40D-3.517 Grouting and Sealing

40D-3.531: Abandoned Well Plugging

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of this rulemaking is
to update the District’s water well regulation rules to reflect
recent statutory amendments for water well contractor
licensing, incorporate by reference updated versions of related
rules adopted by the Department of Environmental Protection
(DEP), directly incorporate by reference certain materials that
are already incorporated into DEP’s well construction rules and
adopt a new general permit for certain environmental
monitoring wells. The effect of these amendments will be to
make the District’s water well regulations consistent with
DEP’s related rules and with recent statutory changes for water
well contractor licensing, and reduce costs associated with
certain environmental monitoring wells that are part of a
contaminated site assessment, remedial action plan or pilot
study approved by the DEP pursuant to Chapter 62-780, F.A.C.
SUMMARY: Rule 40D-3.037, F.A.C., is amended to
incorporate updated versions of related DEP water well rules in
Chapters 62-524, 62-528, 62-531, 62-532, and 62-555, F.A.C.
The Water Well Construction Disciplinary Guidelines and

66

Citations Dictionary adopted by DEP in June 2014 is also
incorporated by reference. To address concerns raised in earlier
rulemaking by the Joint Administrative Procedures Committee,
publications that are identified in DEP’s related rules will now
be directly incorporated into the District’s well regulation rules.
These materials are already contained in DEP rules and do not
represent new requirements for water well contractors.
Amendments also incorporate updated versions of the District’s
Application for Water Well Contractor License and Renewal
License Application forms, to reflect recent statutory changes.
Rule 40D-3.041, F.A.C., is amended to reflect the fact that
under a new general permit rule, certain monitor wells will not
require application for a well construction permit. Rule 40D-
3.045, F.A.C., is amended to limit the rule’s requirement to
wells for which an individual water use permit is required, in
recognition that the District’s water use permitting rules now
allow for general water use permits by rule. Rule 40D-3.060,
F.A.C., establishes a new general permit for the construction,
repair, modification or abandonment of certain monitoring
wells that are part of an environmental site assessment,
remedial action plan or pilot study approved by DEP pursuant
to Chapter 62-780, F.A.C. Rule 40D-3.492, F.A.C., is amended
to make more complete the list of actions, omissions or conduct
that constitute violations of Chapter 40D-3, F.A.C. Rules 40D-
3.507 and 40D-3.517, F.A.C., are amended to correct a citation
to DEP rules. Rule 40D-3.531, F.A.C., is amended to adopt a
revised version of the District’s Well Grouting/Abandonment
Form.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will not
have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase
directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in
the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the
rule. A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency.

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: There are no costs to the regulated public as a result of
the proposed amendments. There will be some cost savings
resulting from the new general permit for certain environmental
monitoring wells. Therefore, this rulemaking will not result in
any adverse economic impacts or regulatory cost increases that
require legislative ratification.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=123
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40D-3.037
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40D-3.041
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40D-3.045
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40D-3.060
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40D-3.492
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40D-3.507
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40D-3.517
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40D-3.531

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 373.044, 373.113, 373.118,
373.171, 373.309, 373.337 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 373.046, 373.103, 373.106, 373.118,
373.206, 373.207, 373.209, 373.306, 373.308, 373.309,
373.313, 373.316, 373.323, 373.324, 373.333, 373.342 FS.
IFREQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS
NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: SWFWMD Human Resources Director, (352) 796-
7211, ext. 4702; 1-800-423-1476 (FL only), ext. 4702; or to
ADACoordinator@swfwmd.state.fl.us.. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Natalia Santiago, SWFWMD, 7601
Highway 301 North, Tampa, FL; 33637-6759, (813) 985-7481
(4657) (OGC #2014032)
THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:
40D-3.037 Rules, Publications and
Incorporated by Reference.

(1) The regulations promulgated by the Department
governing the construction of water wells as set forth in Chapter
62-532, F.A.C. (2-16-12) {3-28-82), the construction of water
wells in delineated areas as set forth in Chapter 62-524, F.A.C.
(2-16-12) (6-27-093, the licensing requirements for Water Well
Contractors as set forth in Chapter 62-531, F.A.C. (6-22-14)
£1-25-07), and the construction of public supply water wells
as set forth in Chapter 62-555, F.A.C. (5-5-14) 4-17-05), and
underground injection control as set forth in Chapter 62-528,
F.A.C. (2-16-12) are hereby incorporated by reference and
made a part of this rule and shall apply to all water wells
constructed, repaired, modified or abandoned in the District.
The regulations can be obtained from the Department’s website
at: www.dep.state.fl.us or the Department’s Division of Water
Resource Management, 2600 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-2400.

(2) The Department’s Water Well Construction
Disciplinary Guidelines and Citations Dictionary (6-22-14) is
2002)-are hereby incorporated by reference and made a part of
this rule. This document is available from the Department’s
website at: www.dep.state.fl.us or Beth—documents can be

Agreements

obtained from the Department’s Division of Water Resource
Management, 2600 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-2400 or from the District upon request.

(3) through (4) No change.

(5) The Application for Water Well Contractor’s License,
Form No._LEG-R.003.02 (9/14) LEG-R-003-01-{4/09} and

Application for Renewal of a Water Well Contractor’s License,
Form No. LEG-R.004.03 (9/14) LEG-R.004.02(4/09) are
hereby incorporated by reference and are available from the
District’s website at www.watermatters.org or from the District
offices.

(6) The Department’s Water Well Contractor Continuing
Education Program Manual (6-22-14), incorporated by
reference in subsection 62-531.300(2), F.A.C., a copy of which
may be obtained from the Department’s Division of Water
Resource Management, 2600 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee,
FL 32399-2400, or from the District’s website at
www.watermatters.org or District offices.

(7) The following publications referenced in Chapter 62-
532, F.A.C., are also incorporated by reference herein:

(a) American Society for Testing and Materials (ASTM)
A53/A53M-99b (1999); A135-01 (2001), A252-98 (1998), and
A589-96 (1996), incorporated by reference in paragraph 62-
532.500(1)(a), F.A.C. Copies of these copyrighted standards
may be obtained from the American Society for Testing and
Materials, 100 Barr Harbor Drive, P. O. Box C700, West
Conshohocken, PA 19428-2959;

(b) American Petroleum Institute (API) 5L-2000 (2000),
incorporated by reference in paragraph 62-532.500(1)(a),
F.A.C. Copies of this copyrighted standard may be obtained
from the American Petroleum Institute, 1220 L Street N.W.,
Washington, DC 20005-4070;

(c) ANSI/ASME B36. 10M-2000, incorporated by
reference in paragraph 62-532.500(1)(a), F.A.C. Copies of this
copyrighted standard may be obtained from the American
National Standards Institute, 1819 L Street N.W., Washington,
DC 20036;

(d) Schedule 10S and Schedule 40 of the ANSI/ASME
B36. 19M-1985, incorporated by reference in paragraph 62-
532.500(1)(d), F.A.C. Copies of this copyrighted standard may
be obtained from the American National Standards Institute,
1819 L Street N.W., Washington, DC 20036;

(e) 2008 NSF International Standard/American National
Standard NSF/ANSI 14-2008e, Plastics Piping System
Components and Related Materials; NSF International
Standard/American National Standard NSF/ANSI 61-2008,
Drinking Water System Components — Health Effects,
incorporated by reference in paragraph 62-532.500(1)(a),
F.A.C. Copies of these copyrighted standards may be obtained
from NSF International, P. O. Box 130140, Ann Arbor, Ml
48113-0140;

67


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=373.044
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.113
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.118
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.171
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.309
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.337
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=373.046
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.103
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.106
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.118
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.206
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.207
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.209
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.306
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.308
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.309
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.313
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.316
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.323
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.324
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.333
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20373.342
http://www.watermatters.org/

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

(f) Closed-Loop/Geothermal Heat Pump Systems Design
and Installation Standards, Revised Edition 2008, published by
the International Ground Source Heat Pump Association,
Oklahoma State University; Closed-Loop/Ground-Source Heat
Pump Systems Installation Guide, 1988, Oklahoma State
University, incorporated by reference in subsection 62-
532.500(2), F.A.C. Copies of these copyrighted materials may
be obtained from the International Ground Source Heat Pump
Association, Oklahoma State University, 374 Cordell South,
Stillwater, OK 74078-8018;

(a) Appendix C of American Water Works Association
(AWWA) Standard A100-97 (1997), AWWA Standard for
Water Wells, incorporated by reference in subparagraph 62-
532.500(3)(i)6., F.A.C. Copies of these copyrighted,
recommended practices and methods may be obtained from the
American Water Works Association, 6666 West Quincy
Avenue, Denver, CO 80235;

(h) Vertical Geothermal Heat Pump Systems Engineering
Design and Field Procedures Manual, published by the
International Ground Source Heat Pump Association, First
Edition 2000, Oklahoma State University, incorporated by
reference in subparagraph 62-532.500(3)(i)6., F.A.C. Copies of
these copyrighted, recommended practices and methods may be
obtained from the International Ground Source Heat Pump
Association, Oklahoma State University, 374 Cordell South,
Stillwater, OK 74078-8018.

Rulemaking Authority 373.044, 373.113, 373.309 FS. Law
Implemented 373.046, 373.103, 373.308, 373.309, 373.323, 373.324,
373.333 FS. History—New 7-1-90, Amended 12-31-92, 4-11-94, 6-27-
94, 9-22-94, 7-5-95, 10-19-95, 7-15-99, 6-23-03, 1-8-04, 8-19-08, 1-
5-09, 8-30-09, 11-2-09, 6-7-10

40D-3.041 Permits Required.

(1) Unless expressly exempted by statute or District rule, a
permit must be obtained from the District prior to construction,
repair, modification or abandonment of any water well,
including:

(a) through (e) No change.

(f) Monitor wells_not authorized pursuant to a general
permit under Rule 40D-3.060, F.A.C.

(9) Injection wells identified as Class V, Group 1, pursuant
to paragraph 62-528.600(2)(a), F.A.C., effective 11-20-2002,
incorporated herein by reference
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02252.

(h) through (i) No change.

(2) No change.

Rulemaking Authority 373.044, 373.113, 373.171, 373.309, 373.337
FS. Law Implemented 373.106, 373.306, 373.308, 373.309, 373.313,
373.316 FS. History—New 10-5-74, Amended 12-31-74, 12-1-77, 2-4-
79, 11-8-82, Formerly 16J-3.06(2)-(5), 16J-3.10, Amended 7-1-90, 9-
30-91, 12-31-92, 2-7-13 .

68

40D-3.045 Water Use Permit Required.

(1) Permits for construction, repair, modification or
abandonment of wells for which an individual a water use
permit is required under Chapter 40D-2, F.A.C., shall not be
issued prior to issuance of the water use permit authorizing such
water use withdrawals.

(2) through (3) No change.

Rulemaking Authority 373.044, 373.113, 373.171, 373.309, 373.337

FS. Law Implemented 373.309 FS. History—New 7-1-90, Amended 9-
30-91, 12-31-92, 3-30-93, 8-10-93

40D-3.060 General Permit for Monitoring Wells.

(1) A general permit is hereby granted for the construction,
repair, modification or abandonment of a piezometer or
monitoring well authorized as part of site assessment activities
approved pursuant to paragraphs 62-780.600(5)(h)-(i), F.A.C.;
a_remedial action plan approved pursuant to subsection 62-
780.700(3), F.A.C.; or as part of a pilot study approved pursuant
to subsection 62-780.700(2), F.A.C., provided all of the
following conditions are met:

(a) Work is conducted by a licensed water well contractor
or under the supervision of a licensed water well contractor;

(b) The nominal casing size shall be no larger than 4 inches
in diameter;

(c) Total well borehole depth does not exceed 150 feet;

(d) Work complies with all applicable construction,
location, casing and grouting requirements set forth in Chapter
40D-3, F.A.C.; and

(e) A State of Florida Well Completion Report, signed by
the licensed water well contractor who conducted or supervised
the work is submitted to the District in accordance with the
requirements of Rule 40D-3.411, F.A.C., for each well
authorized by this general permit.

(2) The State of Florida Well Completion Report, Form
No. LEG-R.005.02 (6/10) is incorporated by reference in Rule
40D-3.411, F.A.C. Copies may be obtained from the District’s
website at www.watermatters.org or from District offices.

Rulemaking Authority 373.044, 373.113, 373.171, 373.309, 373.337
FS. Law Implemented 373.118, 373.306, 373.308, 373.309, 373.313,
373.316 FS. History—New .

40D-3.492 Violations ef-Permits.

(1) In_addition to those violations set forth in Section
373.336, F.S., and Rule 62-531.450, F.A.C., aActions,
omissions, or conduct that shall be considered a violation of this
chapter include the following part-are:

(a) through (d) No change.

(e) Failure to provide a field log upon request to a District
representative at the drilling site during times when work is in

progress urless-a-fieldHog-is-netavatable-atthesite.
(f) through (h) No change.



http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02252
http://www.watermatters.org/

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

(i) Failure to notify the District 24 hours prior to the
placement of grout in the annular space of any public supply
well; plugging of an abandoned well that is greater than two
inches in diameter, or that is more than 20 feet in depth; or the

40D-3.531 Abandoned Well Plugging.

(1) through (4) No change.

(5) The “Well Grouting/Abandonment Form,” Form No.
LEG-R.041.01 (9/14) LEG-R.041.00 (4/09) incorporated

construction of any well under a permit issued with special
grouting conditions.

(j) No change.

(k) Failure to have the well construction permit available at
the well site during construction, repair, modification or
abandonment.

(1) _Failure to produce upon request to the District a record
of the well construction within the allowable time provided in
paragraph 40D-3.411(1)(c), F.A.C.

(2) No change.

Rulemaking Authority 373.044, 373,113, 373.171 FS. Law
Implemented 373.308, 373.309, 373.342 FS. History—New 7-10-13,
Amended

40D-3.507 Casing and Liner Pipe Standards.

(1) through (2) No change.

(3) Telescoped casings may be used provided that casings
of different diameters are joined with an appropriate overlap
and any annular space including the overlapped section shall be
grouted in accordance with subsection subparagraph 62-
532.500(3) 62-532500(2(H4-, F.A.C. To prevent interchanges
of water when multiple aquifers or zones are penetrated, grout
shall extend from the bottom of the casing to the top of the
innermost casing. The use of lead packers for this purpose is
prohibited.

(@) through (b) No change.

(4) through (5) No change.

Rulemaking Authority 373.044, 373.113, 373.171, 373.309, 373.337

FS. Law Implemented 373.306, 373.308, 373.309 FS. History—New 7-
1-90, Amended 9-30-91, 12-31-92, 2-19-04 .

40D-3.517 Grouting and Sealing.

Wells shall be grouted and sealed in accordance with subsection
62-532.500(3) paragraph—62-532.500(21H, F.A.C., and this
section, to protect the water resource from degradation caused
by movement of waters along the well annulus either from the
surface to the aquifer or between aquifers, and to prevent loss
of artesian pressure in artesian aquifers.

(1) All wells that are constructed in a manner which creates
an annular space between the casing and the naturally occurring
geologic formations shall be grouted and sealed in accordance
with the methodologies listed in subsection 62-532.500(3)
paragraph-62-532.500(2(f), F.A.C., and this section. The use
of lead packers for this purpose is prohibited.

(2) through (3) No change.

Rulemaking Authority 373.044, 373.113, 373.171, 373.309, 373.337

FS. Law Implemented 373.306, 373.308, 373.309 FS. History—New 7-
1-90, Amended 9-30-91, 12-31-92, 12-12-11 .

herein by reference, will be used to document the well
abandonment. Copies of this form can be obtained at the
District’s website at www.watermatters.org or from District
offices.

Rulemaking Authority 373.044, 373.113, 373.171, 373.309, 373.337
FS. Law Implemented 373.206, 373.207, 373.209, 373.306, 373.308,
373.309 FS. History—New 7-1-90, Amended 9-30-91, 12-31-92, 7-2-
98, 9-26-02, 2-26-07, 8-19-08, 8-30-09

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Martha A. Moore

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: Southwest Florida Water Management
District Governing Board

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: December 16, 2014

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAR: October 30, 2014, December 17, 2014

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Barbers’ Board

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61G3-19.011 Barbershop Requirements

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To clarify requirements for fire
extinguishers.

SUMMARY': Clarify requirements for fire extinguishers.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION: The agency has determined that this will not
have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase
directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in
the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the
rule. A SERC has not been prepared by the agency. The agency
has determined that the proposed rule is not expected to require
legislative ratification based on the statement of estimated
regulatory costs or if no SERC is required, the information
expressly relied upon and described herein: The proposed rule
amendment codifies existing practices.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 476.064(4), 476.184 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 476.184 FS.

IFREQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS
NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE ANNOUNCED IN THE

69


http://www.watermatters.org/
file://OAGNT53/gateway/department.asp%3fid=61
file://OAGNT53/gateway/department.asp%3fid=61
file://OAGNT53/gateway/organization.asp%3fid=273

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

NEXT AVAILABLE
REGISTER.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Robyn Barineau, Executive Director,
Barbers’ Board, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, FL
32399-0783, (850)921-0038

FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE

THE TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

61G3-19.011 Barbershop Requirements.

(1) through (2)(b) No change.

(c) Maintenance of at least one portable and operational fire
extinguishers-type—placementand-numberrequired-needed-to
protect-the-public-and-property;-shall-be-in-compliance-with-the
F-AC: in each shop. The fire extinguisher shall be located so
that it is visible to the public and barbers. Access to the fire
extinguisher shall be unimpeded. Inspections of the fire
extinguisher shall be kept current;

(d) through (22)(f) No change.

Rulemaking Authority 476.064(4), 476.184 FS. Law Implemented
476.184 FS. History—New 4-27-86, Amended 9-24-86, 12-28-86, 5-
10-88, 7-15-91, Formerly 21C-19.011, Amended 1-12-94, 10-4-94, 5-
21-95, 2-14-96, 5-1-96, 3-21-00, 11-6-00, 8-17-06 .

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Barbers’ Board

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: Barbers’ Board

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: November 3, 2014

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAR: December 8, 2014

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Barbers’ Board

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61G3-21.009 Citations

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To eliminate ambiguities in
enforcement of the rule.

SUMMARY': Eliminate ambiguities in enforcement of the rule.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION: The agency has determined that this will not
have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase
directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in
the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the
rule. A SERC has not been prepared by the agency. The agency
has determined that the proposed rule is not expected to require
legislative ratification based on the statement of estimated
regulatory costs or if no SERC is required, the information

70

expressly relied upon and described herein: This rule will have
no economic impact on properly-licensed barbershops.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 455.224, 476.064(4) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 455.224, 476.204 FS.
IFREQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS
NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE ANNOUNCED IN THE
NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
REGISTER.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Robyn Barineau, Executive Director,
Barbers’ Board, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, FL
32399-0783, (850)921-0038

THE TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

61G3-21.009 Citations.

(1) through (3)(a) No change.

(b) Operating a barber shop with a an-iractive license that
has been expired for up to one year, in violation of Section
476.194(1)(d)1., F.S., shall result in a fine of $50 per month to
the maximum fine allowed by law;

(3)(c) through (7) No change.

Rulemaking Authority 455.224, 476.064(4)7476-204(2); 4770265 FS.
Law Implemented 455.224, 476.204 4770265 FS. History—New 1-19-
92, Amended 3-22-92, 2-18-93, Formerly 21C-21.009, Amended 6-
16-94, 9-22-94, 8-21-95, 2-14-96, 11-6-97, 5-13-01, 9-20-05, 12-2-
09

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Barbers’ Board

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: Barbers’ Board

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: November 3, 2014

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAR: December 8, 2014

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Certified Master Social Workers

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

64B25-28.010  Application Fee for Inactive Status
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of this rulemaking is
to eliminate language that is in conflict with statute and no
longer necessary.

SUMMARY: Rule 64B25-28.010, F.A.C., states that the
application fee for inactive status with regards to a Certified
Master Social Worker shall be $150.00. Section 491.008(1),
F.S., provides that the inactive status fee is $50.00.


file://OAGNT53/gateway/department.asp%3fid=61
file://OAGNT53/gateway/department.asp%3fid=61
file://OAGNT53/gateway/organization.asp%3fid=273
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=317
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B25-28.010

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will not
have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase
directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in
the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the
rule. A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 491.015 FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 491.008 FS.

IFREQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS
NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Sue Foster, Sue.Foster@flhealth.gov,
(850)245-4460

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

64B25-28.010 Application Fee for Inactive Status.
Rulemaking Speeific Authority 491.015 FS. Law Implemented
491.008 FS. History—New 12-10-90, Formerly 21-28.010, 61-28.010,
59FF-28.010, Repealed

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Alysson Bradley, Esqg.

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: John H. Armstrong, MD, FACS, Surgeon
General and Secretary

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: December 17, 2014

Section Il
Notice of Changes, Corrections and
Withdrawals

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION
Health Facility and Agency Licensing

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:

59A-26.001 Definitions

59A-26.002 Licensure Procedure, Fees and Exemptions
59A-26.003 Classification of Deficiencies

59A-26.004 Responsibilities for Operation

59A-26.005 Fiscal Standards

59A-26.006 Admission Policies and Requirements
59A-26.007 Personnel Standards

59A-26.008 Training, Habilitation, Active Treatment
Professional, and Special Programs and
Services

59A-26.009 Dietary Services

59A-26.010 Dental Services

59A-26.011 Psychological Services

59A-26.012 Drugs and Pharmaceutical Services

59A-26.013 Administration of Medications to ICF/DD
Residents by Unlicensed Medication
Assistants

59A-26.014 Training and Validation Required for
Unlicensed Medication Assistants

59A-26.015 Plant Maintenance and Housekeeping

59A-26.016 Fire Protection, Life Safety, Systems Failure
and External Emergency Communication

59A-26.017 Plans Submission and Fees Required

59A-26.018 Physical Plant Codes and Standards for
ICF/DD

59A-26.019 Construction and Physical Environment
Standards

59A-26.020 Disaster Preparedness

NOTICE OF CORRECTION
Notice is hereby given that the following correction has been
made to the proposed rule in Vol. 40, No. 247, December 23,
2014 issue of the Florida Administrative Register.
The following sections of the Notice should be corrected to
read:
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will
have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase
directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in
the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the
rule. A SERC has been prepared by the Agency.
Statements of estimated regulatory costs have been prepared for
proposed rule revisions in Rules 59A-26.002, 59A-26.007 and
59A-26.019, F.A.C., and are available from the person listed
below. The following is a summary of the SERCs:

For proposed Rule 59A-26.002, F.A.C., license fees are
increased by the Consumer Price Index pursuant to Section
408.805(2), F.S. The biennial license fee will increase by
$21.88 per bed. Based on the number of currently licensed
facilities, the total regulatory impact for a 5 year period is
$159,286.40.

For proposed rule Rule 59A-26.007, F.A.C., subsection (7)
requires the licensee to ensure that 50% of its staff on duty at
all times are certified in cardio-pulmonary resuscitation (CPR)
and received basic first aid training. Section 483.420(d)(3),
C.F.R., mandates the staffing ratio for ICF is 1 to 3.2 residents.
The average number of beds in an ICF is 28 beds; this averages
out to 9 staff per ICF of which 50% or 5 staff that must receive

71


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=491.015,%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=491.008,%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=186
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-26.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-26.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-26.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-26.004
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-26.005
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-26.006
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-26.007
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-26.008
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-26.009
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-26.010
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-26.011
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-26.012
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-26.013
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-26.014
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-26.015
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-26.016
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-26.017
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-26.018
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-26.019
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-26.020

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

training. The CPR/First Aid training is $58.00 for a two-year
certification so the average cost is $290 per facility. Based on
the number of currently licensed facilities, the total regulatory
impact for a 5 year period is $73,225.

For proposed Rule 59A-26.019, F.A.C., construction and
physical environment standards for intermediate care facilities
for the developmentally disabled are being updated to bring the
requirements for any newly constructed facilities or changes in
current facilities in line with the standards for nursing homes
which are a similar facility type housing similar residents that
receive chronic, skilled/acute nursing or medical care.
subparagraph 59A-26.019(2)(h)2., F.A.C., increases area
required for each bed by 25 square feet and subparagraph 59A-
26.019(7)(b)5., F.A.C., requires exterior units to be impact-
rated according to the high velocity hurricane zone (HVHZ).
The cost to comply with the new standards is $168,000.

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: A SERC has been prepared by the agency for Rules
59A-26.002, 59A-26.007 and 59A-26.019, F.A.C. For rules
listed where no SERC was prepared, the Agency prepared a
checklist for each rule to determine the necessity for a SERC.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Division of Medical Quality Assurance

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:
64B-1.004 Conduct at Test Site
64B-1.009 Pre-hearing Review Request

NOTICE OF WITHDRAWAL
Notice is hereby given that the above rule, as noticed in Vol.
39, No. 237, December 9, 2013 issue of the Florida
Administrative Register has been withdrawn.

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILY
SERVICES

Family Safety and Preservation Program

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:
65C-38.001 Definitions
65C-38.002 Child Abuse, Abandonment and Neglect

Record Check

72

NOTICE OF CORRECTION
Notice is hereby given that the following correction has been
made to the proposed rule in Vol. 41, No. 3, January 6, 2015
issue of the Florida Administrative Register.

65C-38.001 Definitions.
The following definitions are to be used for Chapter 65C-38,
F.A.C.

113

; . P £

. ) . .

- . ! for ol f o child. g

(2)63) “Verified Maltreatment Finding” means a finding by

the child protective investigator that a preponderance of
credible evidence exists to support the allegations of abuse,
neglect or abandonment. A verified maltreatment finding
includes an out-of-state finding of “substantiated.”

65C-38.002 Child Abuse, Abandonment and Neglect
Record Check.

(2) Out-of-state child welfare background checks shall be
conducted on any household member 18 years of age or older
who has resided outside the state of Florida within the past five
years. In states that do not use a centralized intake or state
automated child welfare system (SACWIS) the Florida child
welfare professional is required to contact the county
administered child protection program to complete the record
check.

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY
Division of Workforce Services
RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:
73B-1.014 Regional Workforce Board/One-Stop JS and
MSFW Complaint and Resolution
Procedures
NOTICE OF CHANGE
Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been
made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph
120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 40, No. 232, December
2, 2014 issue of the Florida Administrative Register.
73B-1.014 Regional Workforce Board/Career Center and
Migrant and Seasonal Farm Workers Complaint and Resolution
Procedures.

(1) Complaints related to Wagner Peyser (WP) and
Migrant and Seasonal Farm Workers (MSFW) are handled by
the Career Center Manager/Complaint Specialist. The
Manager/Complaint Specialist will maintain a separate file for
each complaint and enter the complaint on the Complaint Log.


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=299
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B-1.004
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B-1.009
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=342
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-38.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-38.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1065
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73B-1.014

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

The local Regional Workforce Board (RWB) will attempt to
resolve all WP and MSFW related complaints.

(2) No change.

(3) If resolution has not been achieved to the satisfaction of
the complainant within 15 working days after receipt of the
complaint, or 5 working days with respect to complaints filed

by or on behalf of MSFWs H-the-\WPR-complaintis-notreselved
within—fifteen—{15)business—days, then the complaint and

associated file documents shall be forwarded to the Agency
Clerk, Department of Economic Opportunity, Office of General
Counsel, 107 E. Madison Street, MSC 110, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-4128. However, if the Career Center
Manager/Complaint Specialist for the local RWB has made a
written request for information related to the complaint then
these time periods shall not apply until the complainant’s
response is received.
(4) through (8) No change.
Rulemaking Authority 445.004(5)(c) 20-60-120.54(6)-445.003(4) FS.

Law Implemented 445.004(5)(b) 3120-54(6)—445.023—445.025;
445.028,-445.029,-445.030-445.031,-445.032 FS. History—New 4-3-

02, Formerly 60BB-1.014, Amended

A copy of the Order or additional information may be obtained
by contacting: the Board of Medicine, 4052 Bald Cypress Way,
Bin #C03, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3053.

Section IV
Emergency Rules

NONE

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Medicine

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

64B8-4.009 Applications

The Board of Medicine hereby gives notice that on December
23, 2014, an Order was filed on the Petition for Waiver or
Variance. The Petition for Waiver or Variance was filed by
Maher Fahim Habashi, M.D., on October 23, 2014, seeking a
waiver or variance from Rule 64B8-4.009, F.A.C., with regard
to the requirement for submission of documentation of medical
education directly from Petitioner’s medical school. The Notice
was published in Volume 40, No. 208, of the Florida
Administrative Register, on October 24, 2014. The Board, at its
meeting held on December 5, 2014, voted to grant the Petition
for Waiver finding that the Petitioner demonstrated a
substantial hardship; that application of the rule would violate
the principles of fairness; and that the purpose of the underlying
statute has been met.

A copy of the Order or additional information may be obtained
by contacting: the Board of Medicine, 4052 Bald Cypress Way,
Bin #C03, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3053.

Section V
Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Rule
Variance or Waiver

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Medicine

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

64B8-4.009 Applications

The Board of Medicine hereby gives notice that on December
23, 2014, an Order was filed on the Petition for Waiver or
Variance. The Petition for Waiver or Variance was filed by
Martin Bazi, M.D., on October 28, 2014, seeking a waiver or
variance from Rule 64B8-4.009, F.A.C., with regard to the
requirement for submission of documentation of medical
education directly from Petitioner’s medical school. The Notice
was published in Vol. 40, No. 211, of the Florida
Administrative Register, on October 29, 2014. The Board, at its
meeting held on December 5, 2014, voted to grant the Petition
for Waiver finding that the Petitioner demonstrated a
substantial hardship; that application of the rule would violate
the principles of fairness; and that the purpose of the underlying
statute has been met.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Medicine

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

64B8-4.009 Applications

The Board of Medicine hereby gives notice that on December
23, 2014, an Order was filed on the Petition for Waiver or
Variance. The Petition for Waiver or Variance was filed by
Johnson Thottam, M.D., on November 5, 2014, seeking a
waiver or variance from Rule 64B8-4.009, F.A.C., with regard
to the requirement for submission of documentation of medical
education directly from Petitioner’s medical school. The Notice
was published in Volume 40, No. 217, of the Florida
Administrative Register, on November 6, 2014. The Board, at
its meeting held on December 5, 2014, voted to grant the
Petition for Waiver finding that the Petitioner demonstrated a
substantial hardship; that application of the rule would violate
the principles of fairness; and that the purpose of the underlying
statute has been met

A copy of the Order or additional information may be obtained
by contacting: the Board of Medicine, 4052 Bald Cypress Way,
Bin #C03, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3053.

73


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=331
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B8-4.009
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=331
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B8-4.009
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=331
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B8-4.009

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Medicine

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

64B8-4.009 Applications

The Board of Medicine hereby gives notice that on December
23, 2014, an Order was filed on the Petition for Waiver or
Variance. The Petition for Waiver or Variance was filed by
Mohamed Yahya Al Sawaf, M.D., on November 3, 2014,
seeking a waiver or variance from Rule 64B8-4.009, F.A.C.,
with regard to the requirement for submission of documentation
of medical education directly from Petitioner’s medical school.
The Notice was published in Vol. 40, No. 215, of the Florida
Administrative Register, on November 4, 2014. The Board, at
its meeting held on December 5, 2014, voted to grant the
Petition for Waiver finding that the Petitioner demonstrated a
substantial hardship; that application of the rule would violate
the principles of fairness; and that the purpose of the underlying
statute has been met.

A copy of the Order or additional information may be obtained
by contacting: the Board of Medicine, 4052 Bald Cypress Way,
Bin #C03, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3053.

PLACE: Mission San Luis,
Tallahassee, FL 32304
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The
Friends of Mission San Luis will hold a meeting for the
purposes of conducting Friends' business and assisting the
Division of Historical Resources in caring out the purposes,
duties, and responsibilities of the division.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Diane
Ogorzaly with the Division of Historical Resources at
Diane.Ogorzaly@DOS.MyFlorida.com or at (850)245-6388.

2100 W. Tennessee St.,

Section VI
Notice of Meetings, Workshops and Public
Hearings

DEPARTMENT OF STATE

Division of Historical Resources

The Friends of Mission San Luis announces a public meeting to
which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, January 22, 2015, 5:30 p.m.,
Finance and Investment Meeting
PLACE: Mission San Luis,
Tallahassee, FL 32304
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The
Friends of Mission San Luis will hold a meeting for the
purposes of conducting Friends' business and assisting the
Division of Historical Resources in carrying out the purposes,
duties, and responsibilities of the division.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Diane
Ogorzaly with the Division of Historical Resources at
Diane.Ogorzaly@DOS.MyFlorida.com or at (850)245-6388.

2100 W. Tennessee St.,

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER
SERVICES

Division of Administration

The Florida Agricultural Museum announces a public meeting
to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIMES: Thursday, January 15, 2015, 10:00 a.m.
and 11:00 a.m.

PLACE: Palm Coast Holding, 145 City Place, Palm Coast, FL
32164

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
10:00 am Finance and Insurance Committee

10:00 a.m. Events Committee

11:00 a.m. Board of Directors

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Andy
Morrow, (386)446-7630.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 2 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Andy Morrow, (386)446-7630. If you are hearing
or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

DEPARTMENT OF STATE

Division of Historical Resources

The Friends of Mission San Luis, Inc. announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, January 22, 2015, 6:00 p.m.,
Board of Directors’ Meeting

74

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER
SERVICES

Division of Consumer Services

The Department of Agriculture and Consumer Services
announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: February 4, 2015, 10:00 a.m.

PLACE: Equestrian Pavilion, Florida State Fairgrounds, 4800
US Highway 301, Tampa, Florida

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: This
is a regularly scheduled meeting to discuss industry-related
issues.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Michelle
Faulk, Bureau of Fair Rides Inspection, Department of
Agriculture and Consumer Services, 2005 Apalachee Parkway,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1600, (850)410-3838.


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=331
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B8-4.009
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=1
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=1
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=161
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=170

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Michelle Faulk, (850)410-3838. If you are hearing
or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(\Voice).

contacting: Cathy  Schroeder at (850)245-9661 or
cathy.schroeder@fldoe.org. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (\Voice).
For more information, you may contact; Cathy Schroeder at
(850)245-9661 or cathy.schroeder@fldoe.org.

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

State Board of Education

The State Board of Education announces a public meeting to
which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: January 14, 2015, 8:30 a.m.

PLACE: Highlands County School Board Office, 426 School
Street, Sebring, Florida 33870

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The
meeting agenda will consist of approval of minutes of the State
Board meeting held November 18, 2014. Updates will be
provided on the Communications Plan, Digital Learning, and
by Wally Cox, Superintendent Highlands County Schools on
behalf of the Florida Association of District School
Superintendents and President Jim Henningsen on behalf of the
Council of Presidents. Items for consideration include action
relating to the following: Amendment to Rule 6A-1.09422,
Florida Comprehensive Assessment Test and End-of-Course
Assessment  Requirements (Civics Cut Scores Only);
Amendment to Rule 6A-5.066, Approval of Teacher
Preparation Programs; Amendment to Rule 6A-10.0342, Career
and Technical Education Program Performance Reporting;
Amendment to Rule 6A-1.094222, Standards for Mid-Year
Promotion of Retained Third Graders; Amendment to Rule 6A-
6.053, K-12 Comprehensive Research-Based Reading Plan;
New Rule 6M-4.610, Statewide Provider Contract for the
School Readiness Program; and Amendment to Rule 6M-8.400,
VPK Class Sizes; Blended Classes; Multi Class Groups. Other
items for consideration include: Approval of AAA Scholarship
Foundation — Florida, LLC as Scholarship Funding
Organization for 2015-16; Approval of Step Up For Students,
Inc. as Scholarship Funding Organization for 2015-16; and
Consideration of Mandate from District Court of Appeal of the
State of Florida Second District, RE: School Board of Polk
County v. Renaissance Charter School, Inc., et al.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Cathy
Schroeder at (850)245-9661 or cathy.schroeder@fldoe.org or
by visiting the Department’s website at:
http://www.fldoe.org/board/meetings/.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least seven days before the workshop/meeting by

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

The Florida Transportation Commission announces a telephone
conference call to which all persons are invited.

DATES AND TIME: January 15, 2015 and January 29, 2015,
February 12, 2015 and February 26, 2015, March 12, 2015 and
March 26, 2015, April 9, 2015 and April 23, 2015, May 7, 2015
and May 21, 2015, June 4, 2015 and June 18, 2015, 10:00 a.m.
until Conclusion of Business

PLACE: Florida Transportation Commission, 605 Suwannee
Street, Room 176, Tallahassee, Florida 32399

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Standing Bi-Weekly Teleconference to discuss FTC business.
A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Lisa O.
Stone at (850)414-4959.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Lisa O. Stone at (850)414-4959. If you are hearing
or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Florida Transportation
Commission, 605 Suwannee Street, MS 9, Room 176,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399 or phone: (850)414-4105.

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

The Florida Transportation Commission announces a telephone
conference call to which all persons are invited.

DATES AND TIMES: July 2, 2015, July 16, 2015 & July 30,
2015, August 13, 2015 & August 27, 2015, September 10, 2015
& September 24, 2015, October 8, 2015 & October 22, 2015,
November 5, 2015 & November 19, 2015, December 3, 2015,
December 17, 2015 & December 31, 2015, 10:00 a.m. - Until
Conclusion of Business

PLACE: Florida Transportation Commission, 605 Suwannee
Street, Room 176, Tallahassee, Florida 32399

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Standing Bi-Weekly Teleconference to discuss FTC business.
A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Lisa O.
Stone at (850)414-4959.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by

75


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=195
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=14
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=14

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

contacting: Lisa O. Stone at (850)414-4959. If you are hearing
or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(\Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Florida Transportation
Commission, 605 Suwannee Street, MS #9, Room 176,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399 or phone: (850)414-4105.

For more information, you may contact: Rosanne Gervasi, tel.:
(850)413-6224 or e-mail: rgervasi@psc.state.

PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION
RULE NOS.:RULE TITLES:

25-4.0665 Lifeline Service
25-4.113 Refusal or Discontinuance of Service by
Company

The Florida Public Service Commission announces a workshop
to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, January 21, 2015, 1:30 p.m.
PLACE: Room 105, Gunter Building (Internal Affairs Rm),
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd., Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Whether Rule 25-4.0665, F.A.C., should be amended to require
eligible telecommunications carriers to comply with subscriber
eligibility determinations and certifications as contained in CFR
8854.407, 54.409, 54.410, and 54.416, except as to obtaining
and providing valid certification and re-certification forms, to
eliminate Link-Up, to update Forms PSC/TEL 157 and 158, to
require that a subscriber's Lifeline local service may not be
discontinued because of nonpayment of charges for non-basic
services and toll charges, to eliminate quarterly reporting
requirements, and to clarify telecommunications carrier
responsibilities regarding record retention, resale of Lifeline
lines, and advertising, including developing outreach materials
for specific consumer groups and outreach strategies.
Consistent with the 2011 changes made to Ch. 364, .FS., Rule
25-4.113, F.A.C., would be repealed.

Undocketed.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: A copy
of the agenda and materials for the workshop will be posted on
the Commission’s website, www.floridapsc.com on January 14,
2015. One or more Commissioners may be in attendance and
participate in the workshop.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: the Office of Commission Clerk at 2540 Shumard
Oak Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-
8770 (Voice).

76

EXECUTIVE OFFICE OF THE GOVERNOR

Division of Emergency Management

The Local Emergency Planning Committee (LEPC),
Chairpersons and Staff Contacts for the State Emergency
Response Commission for Hazardous Materials announces a
public meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: January 20, 2015, 1:30 p.m.

PLACE: Daytona Beach Hilton Resort/Ocean Walk Village,
100 North Atlantic Avenue, Daytona Beach, FL 32118
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To
discuss the activities and goals of the Local Emergency
Planning Committee in implementing the Emergency Planning
and Community Right-To-Know Act, also known as Title 111 of
the Superfund Amendments and Reauthorization Act of 1986.
A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Division
of Emergency Management, State Emergency Response
Commission for Hazardous Materials, Capital Circle Office
Center, Sadowski Building, 2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard,
Tallahassee, FL 32399-2100, (850)413-9970.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Division of Emergency Management at (850)413-
9970. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the
agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771
(TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

EXECUTIVE OFFICE OF THE GOVERNOR

Division of Emergency Management

The State Emergency Response Commission for Hazardous
Materials (SERC) announces a public meeting to which all
persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: January 21, 2015, 10:00 a.m.

PLACE: Daytona Beach Hilton Resort/Ocean Walk Village,
100 North Atlantic Avenue, Daytona Beach, FL 32118
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To
discuss the requirements of the Emergency Planning and
Community Right-To-Know Act, also known as Title 111 of the
Superfund Amendments and Reauthorization Act of 1986.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Division
of Emergency Management, State Emergency Response
Commission for Hazardous Materials, Capital Circle Office
Center, Sadowski Building, 2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard,
Tallahassee, FL 32399-2100, (850)413-9970.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=25
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=25-4.0665
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=25-4.113
mailto:rgervasi@psc.state
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=27
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1072
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=27
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1072

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

contacting: Division of Emergency Management at (850)413-
9970. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the
agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771
(TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

EXECUTIVE OFFICE OF THE GOVERNOR

Division of Emergency Management

The State Emergency Response Commission for Hazardous
Materials Training Task Force (TTF) announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: January 20, 2015, 9:30 a.m.

PLACE: Daytona Beach Hilton Resort/Ocean Walk Village,
100 North Atlantic Avenue, Daytona Beach, FL 32118
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To
discuss the activities and goals of the Training Task Force and
other hazardous materials training issues.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Division
of Emergency Management, State Emergency Response
Commission for Hazardous Materials, Capital Circle Office
Center, Sadowski Building, 2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard,
Tallahassee, FL 32399-2100, (850)413-9970.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Division of Emergency Management at (850)413-
9970. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the
agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771
(TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

(850)414-2184, email: Hodgesm@elderaffairs.org. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-
8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Mary Hodges,
Department of Elder Affairs, 4040 Esplanade Way,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-7000, telephone: (850)414-2184,
email: Hodgesm@elderaffairs.org.

DEPARTMENT OF ELDER AFFAIRS

The Department of Elder Affairs, No Wrong Door System
Planning Project announces a public meeting to which all
persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: January 21, 2015, 10:00 a.m. — 11:00 a.m.
PLACE: Webinar:
https://meet.lync.com/fldoea/hodgesm/4GG4HR96;
Conference call:  1(888)670-3525, participant
3960876812

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Discussion of the No Wrong Door System Planning Project
Initiatives.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Mary
Hodges, Department of Elder Affairs, 4040 Esplanade Way,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-7000, telephone: (850)414-2184,
email: Hodgesm@elderaffairs.org.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 72 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Mary Hodges, Department of Elder Affairs, 4040
Esplanade Way, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-7000, telephone:

code:

DEPARTMENT OF MANAGEMENT SERVICES
Commission on Human Relations

The Florida Commission on Human Relations announces a
telephone conference call to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, January 27, 2015, 9:00 a.m., EST
PLACE: Call 1(888)670-3525 and when prompted, enter
passcode: 9988442611, followed by the # key

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: This
meeting will be held to discuss the daily functions and activities
of the Commission.

ACCESS POINT: The Florida Commission on Human
Relations office at 4075 Esplanade Way, Room 110,
Tallahassee, FL 32399, will serve as an access point for this
meeting. Interested persons wishing to attend this meeting may
also do so by appearing in person at this designated access
point.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Casey
Snipes at (850)904-6785 or casey.snipes@fchr.myflorida.com.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting:  Casey  Snipes at  (850)904-6785  or
casey.snipes@fchr.myflorida.com. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
For more information, you may contact; Casey Snipes at
(850)904-6785 or casey.snipes@fchr.myflorida.com.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Board of Pilot Commissioners

The Board of Pilot Commissioners/Pilotage Rate Review
Committee announces a public meeting to which all persons are
invited.

DATES AND TIMES: Thursday, January 22, 2015, 1:00 p.m.,
CST (2:00 p.m., EST); Friday, January 23, 2015, 9:00 a.m.,
CST (10:00 a.m., EST)

PLACE: Wyndham Bay Point Resort, 4114 Jan Cooley Drive,
Panama City Beach, FL 34208, (850)236-6000

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Reconsideration of Repeal of Rule 61G14-22.012, F.AC., &
consideration of Motion filed by Port Everglades Pilot

77


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=27
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1072
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=58
https://meet.lync.com/fldoea/hodgesm/4GG4HR96
mailto:Hodgesm@elderaffairs.org
mailto:Hodgesm@elderaffairs.org
mailto:Hodgesm@elderaffairs.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=60
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=245
mailto:casey.snipes@fchr.myflorida.com
mailto:casey.snipes@fchr.myflorida.com
mailto:casey.snipes@fchr.myflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=266

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

Association on recusal of Committee members from
participation in the rate hearing on the application for a pilotage
rate change for Port Everglades, submitted by the Florida-
Caribbean Cruise Association.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Board of
Pilot Commissioners, 1940 N. Monroe St., Tallahassee, FL
32399, (850)717-1981

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Board of Pilot Commissioners, 1940 N. Monroe St.,
Tallahassee, FL 32399, (850)717-1981. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: Board of Pilot
Commissioners, 1940 N. Monroe St., Tallahassee, FL 32399,
(850)717-1981.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Florida Building Commission

The Florida Building Commission announces a public meeting
to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, January 22, 2015, 10:00 a.m.
PLACE: Meeting to be conducted using communications media
technology; you must access webinar for video only and
teleconference number for audio. The “voice-over-internet-
protocol” feature will not be used for this meeting and you must
dial in using the telephone number indicated below. To access
the webinar go to
https://global.gotomeeting.com/join/716194317. You may call
in to participate by audio only or in conjunction with the
webinar. Use the following numbers to call in using your
telephone:

United States: +1(213)493-0008

Access Code and Meeting ID: 716-194-317

Audio PIN: Shown after joining the meeting

Public point of access: 1940 North Monroe Street, Room 90,
Tallahassee, Florida

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To
review recommendations made by the Commission’s Education
Program Oversight Committee at its meeting of January 14,
2015, and take up such additional items in accordance with the
Commission’s agenda.

78

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Jim
Richmond, Building Codes and Standards Office, Division of
Professions, Department of Business and Professional
Regulation, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-0772, (850)717-1823, fax: (850)414-4836.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 10 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Ms. Barbara Bryant, Building Codes and Standards
Office, Division of Professions, Department of Business and
Professional Regulation, 1940 North Monroe Street,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0772, telephone: (850)717-1838,
fax: (850)414-4836. If you are hearing or speech impaired,
please contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service,
1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (\Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: Jim Richmond,
Building Codes and Standards Office, Division of Professions,
Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 1940
North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0772,
(850)717-1823, fax: (850)414-4836.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Florida Building Commission

The Florida Building Commission Education Program
Oversight Committee announces a public meeting to which all
persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, January 14, 2015, 10:00 a.m.
PLACE: Meetings to be conducted using communications
media technology; you must access webinar for video only and
teleconference number for audio. The “voice-over-internet-
protocol” feature will not be used for this meeting and you must
dial in using the telephone number indicated below.

To access the webinar go to
https://global.gotomeeting.com/join/534721661. You may call
in to participate by audio only or in conjunction with the
webinar. Use the following numbers to call in using your
telephone

United States: +1(626)521-0016

Access Code and Meeting ID: 534-721-661

Public point of access: 1940 North Monroe Street, Room 90,
Tallahassee, Florida

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Discuss  “accreditor” and “course” applications for


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

recommendation to the Florida Building Commission and other
matters in accordance with the meeting agenda.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Jim
Richmond, Building Codes and Standards Office, Division of
Professions, Department of Business and Professional
Regulation Affairs, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-0772 or call (850)487-1823 or by accessing the
Commission website:
https://floridabuilding.org/c/default.aspx.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 10 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Ms. Barbara Bryant, Building Codes and Standards
Office, Division of Professions, Department of Business and
Professional Regulation, 1940 North Monroe Street,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0772, (850)487-1824 or fax:
(850)414-8436. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please
contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-
8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: Jim Richmond,
Building Codes and Standards Office, Division of Professions,
Department of Business and Professional Regulation Affairs,
1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0772 or
call (850)487-1823 or by accessing the Commission website:
https://floridabuilding.org/c/default.aspx.

made, which record includes the testimony and evidence upon
which the appeal is to be made.

Those who are hearing impaired, using TDD equipment can call
the Florida Telephone Relay System at 1(800)955-8771.
Persons requiring special accommaodations due to disability or
physical impairment should contact Sue Foster at (850)245-
4474 at least one week prior to the meeting.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Clinical Social Work, Marriage and Family Therapy
and Mental Health Counseling

The Board of Clinical Social Work, Marriage and Family
Therapy and Mental Health Counseling announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, January 29, 2015, 12:00 Noon
PLACE: Omni Orlando Resort at ChampionsGate, 1500
Masters Boulevard, Orlando, FL 33896, (407)390-6664
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
General Board Meeting.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Sue
Foster, Executive Director, Department of Health, Board of
Clinical Social Work, Marriage and Family Therapy and
Mental Health Counseling 4052 Bald Cypress Way, BIN #C08,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258.

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting, he/she
will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the proceeding is

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Division of Children's Medical Services

The Genetics and Newborn Screening Program Advisory
Council announces a public meeting to which all persons are
invited.

DATE AND TIME: Friday, February 6, 2015, 10:00 a.m. — 3:00
p.m.

PLACE: Florida Department of Health, Bureau of Laboratories
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The
Genetics and Newborn Screening Advisory Council will meet
on February 6 to discuss the Florida Newborn Screening
Program.

For more information, or if you plan to attend, please contact
Whitney G. Jones at (850)245-4672.

*Adjournment time is approximate, depending on completion
of the advisory council business.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Whitney
G. Jones, (850)245-4672.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Whitney G. Jones, (850)245-4672. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-
8770 (Voice).

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILY SERVICES
Agency for Persons with Disabilities

The Agency for Persons with Disabilities announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, January 14, 2015, 10:00 a.m.
—11:00 a.m.

PLACE: Kelly Recreation Center 404
Lakeland, Florida 33803

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Monthly Family Care Meeting.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting:
Manyvonne Champavannarath, (863)640-5936.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 72 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Manyvonne Champavannarath, (863)640-5936. If

Imperial Blvd.,

79


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=327
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=327
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=333
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=560

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency
using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.
For more information, you may contact:
Champavannarath, (863)640-5936.

Manyvonne

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY

The Reemployment Assistance Appeals Commission
announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: January 14, 2015, 9:00 a.m.

PLACE: Reemployment Assistance Appeals Commission, 101
Rhyne Building, 2740 Centerview Drive, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-4151

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Deliberation for cases pending before the Reemployment
Assistance Appeals Commission that are ready for final review
and the Chairman's report. No public testimony will be taken.
A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting:
Reemployment Assistance Appeals Commission, 101 Rhyne
Building, 2740 Centerview Drive, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-
4151, (850)487-2685.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 24 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Reemployment Assistance Appeals Commission,
101 Rhyne Building, 2740 Centerview Drive, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-4151, (850)487-2685. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Reemployment
Assistance Appeals Commission, 101 Rhyne Building, 2740
Centerview Drive, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-4151, (850)487-
2685.

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: This
meeting will discuss proposed actions that will assist in
preserving, protecting and enhancing Florida’s military
installations and missions.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Marcy
Sanders, (850)878-4566, msanders@eflorida.com.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 1 day before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Marcy Sanders, (850)878-4566,
msanders@eflorida.com. If you are hearing or speech impaired,
please contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service,
1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Bruce Grant,
(850)878-0826, bgrant@eflorida.com.

ENTERPRISE FLORIDA, INC.

The Enterprise Florida, Inc. and the Florida Defense Support
Task Force announces a public meeting to which all persons are
invited.

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, January 15, 2015, 9:00 a.m.,
EST - 11:45a.m., EST

PLACE: DoubleTree by Hilton Tallahassee, 101 S Adams
Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32301

80

QUEST CORPORATION OF AMERICA, INC.

The Florida Department of Transportation announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, January 15, 2015, 5:30 p.m. —
7:00 p.m.; 6:00 p.m., presentation

PLACE: Lakeside Community Center, 1999 City Center Circle,
Port Orange, FL 32129

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Interstate 95 (1-95) Widening from North of State Road (SR) 44
to North of US 92 (International Speedway Boulevard),
Including the Reconstruction of the Interstate 4 (1-4) and US 92
Systems Interchange; Financial Management No.: 242715-2-
52-01.

The Florida Department of Transportation (FDOT) is
conducting a public information meeting for the 1-95 Widening
and Systems Interchange Reconstruction Design-Build project
from north of SR 44 to north of US 92 in Volusia County. The
purpose of this project is to widen 1-95 to six lanes from north
of SR 44 to north of US 92. The 13.85-mile construction project
is scheduled to begin in spring of 2015.

The purpose of the meeting is to present the construction plans
of this Design-Build project to the public. Project maps,
drawings and other pertinent information will be on display for
public review. FDOT staff and others associated with the
project will be available to discuss the project and answer
questions.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: a flyer
will be distributed at the meeting.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Katie Widdison at Katie.Widdison@dot.state.fl.us
or by telephone: (386)212-0449. If you are hearing or speech


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=680
mailto:msanders@eflorida.com
mailto:msanders@eflorida.com
mailto:bgrant@eflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1102
mailto:Katie.Widdison@dot.state.fl.us

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Bradley Bauknecht,
FDOT Project Manager at (386)740-3519 or by email:
Bradley.Bauknecht@dot.state.flLus. You may also contact
Katie Widdison, Public Involvement Coordinator, at her contact
information listed above. An additional source for information
is just a click away. Visit our website at www.cflroads.com.

Section VII
Notice of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding Declaratory Statements

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Department of Business
and Professional Regulation has received the petition for
declaratory statement from Doug Hoffman on December 30,
2014. The petition seeks the agency’s opinion as to the
applicability of Sections 468.84(1)(c) and 468.48(2)(c), F.S., as
they apply to the petitioner.

Petitioner asks for an interpretation of the meaning of “directly
supervised” as this is used in Sections 468.84(1)(c) and
468.84(2)(c), F.S.

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be
obtained by contacting: Department of Business and
Professional Regulation, Agency Clerk’s Office, 1940 North
Monroe Street, Suite 92, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2202,
(850)921-0342, AGC.Filing@myfloridalicense.com.

Please refer all comments to: Brittany B. Griffith, Assistant
General Counsel, 1940 North Monroe Street, Suite 42,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2202, (850)488-0062.

Except for good cause shown, motions for leave to intervene
must be filed within 21 days of this notice.

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be
obtained by contacting: Agency Clerk’s Office, Department of
Business and Professional Regulation, 1940 North Monroe
Street, Suite 92, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2203, (850)921-
0342, AGC.Filing@myfloridalicense.com.

Please refer all comments to: Mo Madani, Building Codes and
Standards Office, Department of Business and Professional
Regulation, Suite 90A, 1940 North Monroe, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399, (850)487-1824,
mo.madani@myfloridalicense.com. OR April L. Hammonds,
Office of the General Counsel, Department of Business and
Professional Regulation, 1940 North Monroe Street,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1000, (850)487-1824,
april.hammonds@myfloridalicense.com. Responses, motions
to intervene, or requests for a hearing, §120.57(2), Fla. Stat.,
must be filed within 21 days of this notice.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Florida Building Commission

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61G20-3.001 Scope

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Florida Building
Commission has received the petition for declaratory statement
from Euramax International Inc. The petition seeks the
agency’s opinion as to the applicability of Rule 61G20-3.001,
as it applies to the petitioner.

Petitioner seeks clarification as to whether its exterior rotating
louver roof system is within the scope for Florida Product
Approval.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Florida Building Commission

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Florida Building
Commission has received the petition for declaratory statement
from All Aboard Florida. The petition seeks the agency’s
opinion as to the applicability of Sections 102.2(b), 202, and
105, Florida Building Code, Building (2010), as it applies to the
petitioner.

Petitioner seeks clarification as to whether its proposed multi-
county, express, intercity passenger rail system, including the
facilities associated with the system, are exempt from the
Florida Building Code and all its permitting requirements.

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be
obtained by contacting: Agency Clerk’s Office, Department of
Business and Professional Regulation, 1940 North Monroe
Street, Suite 92, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2203, (850)921-
0342, AGC.Filing@myfloridalicense.com.

Please refer all comments to: Mo Madani, Building Codes and
Standards Office, Department of Business and Professional
Regulation, Suite 90A, 1940 North Monroe, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399, (850)487-1824,
mo.madani@myfloridalicense.com. OR April L. Hammonds,
Office of the General Counsel, Department of Business and
Professional Regulation, 1940 North Monroe Street,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1000, (850)487-1824,
april.hammonds@myfloridalicense.com. Responses, motions
to intervene, or requests for a hearing, 8120.57(2), Fla. Stat.,
must be filed within 21 days of this notice.

81


mailto:Bradley.Bauknecht@dot.state.fl.us
http://www.cflroads.com/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
mailto:AGC.Filing@myfloridalicense.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-3.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

Section VIII
Notice of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding the Validity of Rules

Notice of Petition for Administrative Determination has been
filled with the Division of Administrative Hearings on the
following rules:

NONE

Notice of Disposition of Petition for Administrative
Determination has been filled with the Division of
Administrative Hearings on the following rules:

NONE

Section IX
Notice of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding Non-rule Policy Challenges

NONE

Section X
Announcements and Objection Reports of
the Joint Adminstrative Procedures
Committee

NONE

Section XI
Notices Regarding Bids, Proposals and
Purchasing

NONE

Siting Application No. PA 03-45E, OGC Case N0.14-0510. On
September 16, 2014, the Department received a petition to
modify the Conditions of Certification for Turkey Point Plant
Units 3-5 from FPL pursuant to Section 403.516(1)(c), Florida
Statutes, specifically to install up to six new production wells,
modify associated consumptive use, and reallocate existing
authorized water use.

A copy of the proposed modification may be obtained by
contacting Justin Green, Department of Environmental
Protection, 2600 Blair Stone Rd., M.S. 5500, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-2400, (850)717-9000. Pursuant to Section
403.516(1)(c)2., Florida Statutes, parties to the certification
proceeding have 45 days from issuance of notice to such party’s
last address of record in which to object to the requested
modification. Failure of any of the parties to file a response will
constitute a waiver of objection to the requested modification.
Any person who is not already a party to the certification
proceeding and whose substantial interest is affected by the
requested modification has 30 days from the date of publication
of this public notice to object in writing. The written objection
must be filed (received) in the Office of General Counsel of the
Department at 3900 Commonwealth Boulevard, M.S. 35,
Tallahassee, Florida, 32399-3000. A Final Order approving the
modification shall be issued by the Department if no objections
are received. If objections are raised and agreement cannot be
reached, then pursuant to Rule 62-17.211, Florida
Administrative Code, the applicant may file a petition for
modification seeking approval of those portions of the request
for modification to which written objections were timely filed.
Mediation is not available in this proceeding.

Section XIlI
Miscellaneous

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
Siting Coordination Office
NOTICE OF INTENT TO ISSUE PROPOSED
MODIFICATION OF POWER PLANT CERTIFICATION

The Florida Department of Environmental Protection
(Department) hereby provides notice of an intent to modify the
Power Plant Conditions of Certification issued pursuant to the
Florida Electrical Power Plant Siting Act, Chapter 403.501 et
seq., Florida Statutes, concerning: Florida Power and Light
Company (FPL) Turkey Point Plant Units 3-5, Power Plant

82

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Nursing

Notice of Emergency Action
On January 5, 2015, State Surgeon General issued an Order of
Emergency Suspension of Certificate with regard to the
certificate of Shannon M. Snider, C.N.A., Certificate #: CNA
257176. This Emergency Suspension Order was predicated
upon the State Surgeon General’s findings of an immediate and
serious danger to the public health, safety and welfare pursuant
to Sections 456.073(8) and 120.60(6), Florida Statutes (2012-
2013). The State Surgeon General determined that this
summary procedure was fair under the circumstances, in that
there was no other method available to adequately protect the
public.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Nursing

Notice of Emergency Action
On January 5, 2015, State Surgeon General issued an Order of
Emergency Restriction of License with regard to the license of
Misty Gayle Roth, R.N., License #:RN 9214131. This


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=332
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=332

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 41, Number 4, January 7, 2015

Emergency Restriction Order was predicated upon the State
Surgeon General’s findings of an immediate and serious danger
to the public health, safety and welfare pursuant to Sections
456.073(8) and 120.60(6), Florida Statutes. (2014). The State
Surgeon General determined that this summary procedure was
fair under the circumstances, in that there was no other method
available to adequately protect the public.

procedure was fair under the circumstances, in that there was
no other method available to adequately protect the public.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Nursing
Notice of Emergency Action

On January 5, 2015, State Surgeon General issued an Order of
Emergency Restriction of Certification with regard to the
certificate of Cedrah D. Boykins, C.N.A., Certification #:
CNA99965. This Emergency Restriction Order was predicated
upon the State Surgeon General’s findings of an immediate and
serious danger to the public health, safety and welfare pursuant
to Sections 456.073(8) and 120.60(6), Florida Statutes. (2014).
The State Surgeon General determined that this summary

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Pharmacy

Notice of Emergency Action
On January 5, 2015, State Surgeon General issued an Order of
Emergency Suspension of License with regard to the license of
Michael P. Fulghum, R.Ph., License #: PS 34183. This
Emergency Suspension Order was predicated upon the State
Surgeon General’s findings of an immediate and serious danger
to the public health, safety and welfare pursuant to Sections
456.073(8) and 120.60(6), Florida Statutes. (2014). The State
Surgeon General determined that this summary procedure was
fair under the circumstances, in that there was no other method
available to adequately protect the public.

Section XIlI
Index to Rules Filed During Preceeding
Week

NOTE: The above section will be published on Tuesday
beginning October 2, 2012, unless Monday is a holiday, then it
will be published on Wednesday of that week.

83


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=332
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=307

