
Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 29,  Number  51,  December 19, 2003

Section II - Proposed Rules   4965

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
Pursuant to Chapter 2003-145, Laws of Florida, all notices for
the Department of Environmental Protection are published on
the Internet at the Department of Environmental Protection’s
home page at http://www.dep.state.fl.us/ under the link or
button titled “Official Notices.”

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Psychology
RULE TITLE: RULE NO.:
Rule Governing Time Limits and 

Conditions for Maintenance of an 
Active Application File 64B19-11.007

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes to review the
existing rule to determine whether changes are necessary.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Time limits
governing conditions for maintenance of an active application
file.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 490.004 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 490.005 FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
WEEKLY.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Kaye
Howerton, Executive Director, Board of Psychology/MQA,
4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C05, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-3253
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

Section II 
Proposed Rules

DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY AFFAIRS
Florida Building Commision
RULE CHAPTER TITLE: RULE CHAPTER NO.:
Florida Building Commission – 

Building Code Training Program 9B-70
RULE TITLE: RULE NO.:
Building Code Training Program 9B-70.001
PURPOSE, EFFECT AND SUMMARY: The purpose and
effect of this rule development is to delete obsolete core
courses from the rule and make provisions for the core
curriculum in the future accommodating courses created by or
at the direction of staff to the Florida Building Commission,

and those offered from private sources. The rule will also
incorporate voluntary accreditation of advanced continuing
education courses regarding the Florida Building Code.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: None.
Any person who wishes to provide information regarding the
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or to provide a
proposal for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in
writing within 21 days of this notice.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 553.841(2) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 553.841 FS.
A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE TIME, DATE AND
PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
TIME AND DATE: 9:05 a.m., January 13, 2004
PLACE: Adams Mark Hotel, 1500 Sand Lake Road, Orlando,
Florida
Any person requiring special accommodations at the workshop
because of a disability of physical impairment should contact
Ila Jones, Community Program Administrator, Department of
Community Affairs, 2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Sadowski
Building, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100, (850)487-1824, at
least seven days prior to the date of the workshop using the
Florida Dual Party Relay System, 1(800)955-8770 (Voice) or
1(800)955-9771 (TDD).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Ila Jones, Community Program
Administrator, Department of Community Affairs, 2555
Shumard Oak Boulevard, Sadowski Building, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-2100, (850)487-1824

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

9B-70.001 Building Code Training Program.
The purpose of the Building Code Training Program is to
educate licensed building department personnel, contractors,
and design professionals through required core curriculum
courses or equivalency examination that addresses the Florida
Building Code.

(1) The Core Curriculum:
(a) The Core Curriculum is comprised of the Basic Core

Course that emphasizes the administrative, enforcement and
procedural aspects of the Florida Building Code and updates
and amendments thereto five (5) Technical Code Training
courses that emphasize comparison between the existing codes
and the Florida Building Code. Licensees regulated under
Chapters 468, Part XII, 481, and 489, Parts I and II, F.S., shall
at a minimum complete one course by June 1, 2003 or within
two (2) years of initial certification or registration, whichever
is later. Licensees regulated under Chapter 471, F.S., are
required to complete one core course only if the licensee
actively participates in designing buildings, structures, or
facilities covered by the Florida Building Code.



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 29,  Number  51,  December 19, 2003

4966   Section II - Proposed Rules

(b) The Core Course shall be delivered pursuant to the
approval of providers by the board, or by the department, if
there is no board. Licensees will receive four (4) hours of
continuing education credit for each core course completed.

(c) No change.
(d) The core courses shall be delivered through

customized instructor-led training at multiple sites, Internet, or
CD-ROM supported interactive multimedia training materials
as provided by the appropriate licensing board in their
continuing education rules.

(e) The Department of Business and Professional
Regulation Florida Building Commission shall assign generic
course numbers which must be used by all providers when
reporting completion of the core courses by electronic means
to the Department of Community Affairs and Department of
Business and Professional Regulation.

(f) The core courses shall be effective until the adoption of
the new edition of the Florida Building Code every third year,
at which time the curriculum will be updated to reflect
amendments and changes to the unified code. The licensee
shall only be required to complete a core course one time.

(2) Equivalency examination:
(a) through (f) No change.
(3) Voluntary Accreditation of Advanced Building Code

Training Courses.
(a) The Commission shall approve individual persons to

serve as accreditors of advanced building code training
courses. Individuals desiring to be accreditors shall apply using
Form FBCED-2003-001 adopted herein by reference and
available from the Building Code Information System at
www.floridabuilding.org. Applications shall be accompanied
by an application fee of $100.00. Applications shall be
approved by the Commission if the applicant has demonstrated
sufficient expertise in the field for which approval is sought.

(b) Accreditors shall review courses submitted by
developers to determine if the course contains the following:

1. Goals and measurable objectives;
2. Topical outline of the course components in order of

presentation;
3. Teaching methods (can include one or more, but not

limited to: exercises, quizzes, discussion groups, reading
assignments, projects, simulations, and presentations; and

4. Teaching resources and course references cited in the
course materials.

(4)(3) The Florida Building Commission shall have the
authority to contract for the purpose of administering the core
courses and equivalency examination.
Specific Authority 553.841(2) FS. Law Implemented 553.841 FS. History–
New 4-20-00, Amended 10-14-01, ________.

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: Ila
Jones, Community Program Administrator, Department of
Community Affairs, 2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Sadowski
Building, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100, (850)487-1824
NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Janice Browning, Director, Division
of Housing and Community Development, 2555 Shumard Oak
Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100
DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: December 8, 2003
DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: June 6, 2003

DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY
Florida Building Commission
RULE CHAPTER TITLE: RULE CHAPTER NO.:
Product Approval 9B-72
RULE TITLES: RULE NOS.:
Local Product Approval Generally 9B-72.030
Approval of Product Evaluation Entities 

Product Validation Entities, Testing 
Laboratories, Certification Agencies, 
Quality Assurance Agencies 
and Accreditation Bodies 9B-72.100

Equivalence of Standards 9B-72.180
PURPOSE, EFFECT AND SUMMARY: This rule amendment
clarifies products to which the rule applies for local jurisdiction
approval, adds the International Evaluation Services to the list
of approved product evaluation entities and recognizes certain
alternative product evaluation standards as equivalent to
standards identified in the Florida Building Code.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: None.
Any person who wishes to provide information regarding the
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or to provide a
proposal for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in
writing within 21 days of this notice.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 553.842(1),(9) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 553.842(1),(2),(5),(6),(8),(9) FS.
A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE TIME, DATE AND
PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
TIME AND DATE: 9:00 a.m., January 13, 2004
PLACE: Adams Mark Hotel, 1500 Sand Lake Road, Orlando,
Florida
Any person requiring special accommodations at the workshop
because of a disability of physical impairment should contact
Ila Jones, Community Program Administrator, Department of
Community Affairs, 2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Sadowski
Building, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100, (850)487-1824, at
least seven days prior to the date of the workshop using the
Florida Dual Party Relay System, 1(800)955-8770 (Voice) or
1(800)955-9771 (TDD).



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 29,  Number  51,  December 19, 2003

Section II - Proposed Rules   4967

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULES IS: Ila Jones, Community Program
Administrator, Department of Community Affairs, 2555
Shumard Oak Boulevard, Sadowski Building, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-2100, (850)487-1824

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULES IS:

9B-72.030 Local Product Approval Generally.
All products are subject to approval by the authority having
jurisdiction or building official. Products listed in subsections
9B-72.060(1)-(8), F.A.C., and revisions to an existing product
approval shall be approved according to the provisions of this
rule.
Specific Authority 553.842(1) FS. Law Implemented 553.842(5),(6),(8) FS.
History–New 5-5-02, Amended 9-4-03, ________.

9B-72.100 Approval of Product Evaluation Entities,
Product Validation Entities, Testing Laboratories, Certification
Agencies, Quality Assurance Agencies and Accreditation
Bodies.

(1) Approved Product Evaluation Entities. Approval by
the Commission is limited to the scope of accreditation
established by Section 553.842, F.S. approved accreditation
entities.

(a) The following entities recognized in Section
553.842(9)(a), F.S., are approved evaluation entities:

1. through 3. No change.
4. The Southern Building Code Congress International

Evaluation Services (PST ESI); and
5. The Miami-Dade County Building Code Compliance

Office Product Control Division (MDCBCCOPD); and.
6. The International Code Council, International

Evaluation Services (IES).
(b) through (c) No change.
(2) through (6) No change.

Specific Authority 553.842(9) FS. Law Implemented 553.842(9) FS. History–
New 5-5-02, Amended 9-4-03, ________.

9B-72.180 Equivalence of Standards.
(1) Equivalence of product standards. Where conformance

to the Code is based on standards, then product evaluation shall
rely on national and international consensus standards
referenced in the Code. Other standards which meet or exceed
standards referenced by the Code and, as determined by the
Commission, may be recognized as equivalent for determining
Code compliance are:.

(a) ASTM E 330-97 equivalent to ASTM E 330-84;
(b) ASTM E 330-02 equivalent to ASTM E 330-84;
(c) ANSI/AAMA/NWWDA 101/I.S.2/NAFS-02

equivalent to ANSI/AAMA/NWWDA 101/I.S.2-97;
(d) DASMA 108-02 Standard Method for Testing

Sectional Garage Doors equivalent to ASTM E 330-84, ASTM
E 330-97, and ASTM E 330-02; and

(e) ANSI 250.13 Testing and Rating of Severe
Wind-Storm Resistant Components for Swinging Doors
Assemblies equivalent to ASTM E 330-84, ASTM E 1886-97
and ASTM E 1996-99 except for the High Velocity Hurricane
Zone (HVHZ).

(2) No change.
(3) Organizations:
(a) ANSI – American National Standards Institute;
(b) AAMA – American Architectural Manufacturers

Association;
(c) ASTM – American Society of Testing and Materials;
(d) DASMA – Door Access Systems Manufacturers

Association; and
(e) NWWDA – National Wood Window and Door

Association.
Specific Authority 553.842(1) FS. Law Implemented 553.842(2) FS. History–
New 5-5-02, Amended ________.

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: Ila
Jones, Community Program Administrator, Department of
Community Affairs, 2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Sadowski
Building, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100, (850)487-1824
NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Janice Browning, Director, Division
of Housing and Community Development, 2555 Shumard Oak
Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100
DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: December 8, 2003
DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: October 31, 2003

BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE INTERNAL 
IMPROVEMENT TRUST FUND 
Pursuant to Chapter 2003-145, Laws of Florida, all notices for
the Board of Trustees of the Internal Improvement Trust Fund
are published on the Internet at the Department of
Environmental Protection’s home page at http://www.dep.
state.fl.us/ under the link or button titled “Official Notices.”

PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION
DOCKET NO. 030970-EI
RULE TITLES: RULE NOS.:
Records and Reports in General 25-6.014
Location and Preservation of Records 25-6.015
Annual Reports 25-6.135
Cost Allocation and Affiliate Transactions 25-6.1351
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To amend the rules to reflect the
most recent versions of the Code of Federal Regulations, Title
18, Subchapter C, Part 101, Uniform System of Accounts for
Public Utilities and Licensees for Major Utilities and the
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission’s regulations, Title
18, Subchapter C, Part 125, Code of Federal Regulations,
Preservation of Records of Public Utilities and Licensees; to



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 29,  Number  51,  December 19, 2003

4968   Section II - Proposed Rules

set forth six exceptions to the retention periods set forth in Part
125 of the Code of Federal Regulations; to include a definition
for “good cause” for extensions of time in Rule 25-6.135,
F.A.C.; and revise Commission Form PSC/ECR 101 to include
revised 2002 FERC Form No. 1.
SUMMARY: Rule 25-6.014, F.A.C., would be amended to
refer to the 2002 version of the Code of Federal Regulations,
Title 18, Subchapter C, Part 101, Uniform System of Accounts
for Public Utilities; Rule 25-6.015, F.A.C., would be amended
to refer to the 2002 version of the Federal Energy Regulatory
Commission’s regulations, Title 18, Subchapter C, Part 125,
Code of Federal Regulations, Preservation of Records of
Public Utilities and Licensees and to set forth six exceptions to
the retention periods set forth in Part 125; Rule 25-6.135,
F.A.C., would be amended to update the reference to
Commission Form PSC/ECR 101, entitled Annual Report of
Major Electric Utilities to include revised 2002 FERC Form
No. 1 as well as three schedules that were eliminated from the
revised 2002 FERC Form 1; Rule 25-6.135, F.A.C., would be
amended include a definition of “good cause” for extensions of
time; Rule 25-6.1351, F.A.C., would be amended to reflect the
revised effective date of Form PSC/ECR 101.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No statement of estimated regulatory
cost was prepared.
Any person who wishes to provide information regarding the
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or to provide a
proposal for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in
writing within 21 days of this notice.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 366.05(1), 350.127(2) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 350.115, 366.02(2), 366.04(2)(a),
366.04(2)(f), 366.041(1), 366.05(1), 366.05(2), 366.05(9),
366.05(11), 366.06(1), 366.08, 366.093(1) FS.
WRITTEN COMMENTS OR SUGGESTIONS ON THE
PROPOSED RULE MAY BE SUBMITTED TO: FPSC,
Division of the Commission Clerk and Administrative
Services, within 21 days of the date of this notice for inclusion
in the record of the proceeding.
IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAW.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULES IS: Samantha Cibula, Florida Public
Service Commission, 2540 Shumard Oak Blvd., Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-0862, (850)413-6202

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULES IS:

25-6.014 Records and Reports in General.
(1) Each investor-owned electric utility shall maintain its

accounts and records in conformity with the Uniform System
of Accounts (USOA) for Public Utilities and Licensees as
found in the Code of Federal Regulations, Title 18, Subchapter

C, Part 101, for Major Utilities as revised April 1, 2002 1995,
which is hereby incorporated by reference into this rule, and as
modified below. All inquiries relating to interpretation of the
USOA shall be submitted to the Commission’s Division of
Economic Regulation in writing.

(2) through (5) No change.
(6) The Commission prescribes the Uniform System of

Accounts for Public Utilities and Licensees, as found in the
Code of Federal Regulations, Title 18, Subchapter C, Part 101,
for Major Utilities as revised April 1, 2002 2000, to be used by
Rural Electric Cooperative and Municipal Electric Utilities
operating within the State. All inquiries relating to
interpretations of the Uniform System of Accounts shall be
submitted to the Commission’s Division of Economic
Regulation in writing.
Specific Authority 366.05(1), 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 350.115,
366.02(2), 366.04(2)(a), 366.04(2)(f), 366.05(1), 366.08 FS. History–
Amended 7-29-69, 2-4-76, 8-21-79, 1-2-80, 11-18-82, Formerly 25-6.14,
Amended 10-1-86, 11-02-87, 7-20-89, 12-27-94, 4-22-96, ________.

25-6.015 Location and Preservation of Records.
(1) through (2)(b)2. No change.
(3) All records shall be preserved in accordance with the

Federal Energy Regulatory Commission’s regulations, Title
18, Subchapter C, Part 125, Code of Federal Regulations,
entitled “Preservation of Records of Public Utilities and
Licensees” as revised, April 1, 2002 1994, which is hereby
incorporated by reference into this rule, with the exception of
the records listed in paragraph (3)(a) of this rule. Item 64
(Records of predecessors and former associates) of the
Schedule of records and periods of retention contained in Title
18, Subchapter C, Section 125.3, Code of Federal Regulations.
Instead, utilities shall retain records listed in paragraph (3)(a)
of this rule for the periods indicated. of acquired companies
until permission for disposal is petitioned for and approved by
the Florida Public Service Commission.

(a) The Code of Federal Regulations items listed below are
exceptions to the Schedule of Records and Periods of
Retention contained in Title 18, Subchapter C, Section 125.3,
Code of Federal Regulations:

1. Item 2(a), minute books of stockholders’, directors’, and
directors’ committee meetings, earlier of 20 years or
termination of the corporation’s existence;

2. Item 6(a)(1), general ledgers, 20 years;
3. Item 6(a)(2), ledgers: subsidiary or auxiliary, 20 years;
4. Item 7, journals: general and subsidiary, 20 years;
5. Item 8(a), journal vouchers and journal entries, 20

years; and
6. Item 20(a), appraisals and valuations made by the

company of its properties or investments or of the properties or
investments of any associated companies (includes all records
essential thereto), 10 years after appraisal.



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 29,  Number  51,  December 19, 2003

Section II - Proposed Rules   4969

(b)(a) However, all source documents retained as required
by Title 18, Subchapter C, Part 125, Code of Federal
Regulations shall be maintained in their original form for a
minimum of three years, or for any lesser period of time
specified for that type of record in Title 18, Subchapter C, Part
125, Code of Federal Regulations, after the date the document
was created or received by the utility. This paragraph does not
require the utility to create paper copies of documents where
the utility would not otherwise do so in the ordinary course of
its business. The Commission may waive the requirement that
documents be retained in their original form upon a showing
by a utility that it employs a storage and retrieval system that
consistently produces clear, readable copies that are
substantially equivalent to the originals, and clearly reproduces
handwritten notations on documents.

(c)(b) The utility shall maintain written procedures
governing the conversion of source documents to a storage and
retrieval system, which procedures ensure the authenticity of
documents and the completeness of records. Records
maintained in the storage and retrieval system must be easy to
search and easy to read.
Specific Authority 366.05(1), 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented
366.05(1),(9),(11), 366.08, 366.093(1) FS. History–Amended 7-29-69,
7-19-72, 1-11-76, 9-28-81, 11-18-82, Formerly 25-6.15, Amended 10-1-86,
11-02-87, 6-23-93, 11-13-95, ________.

25-6.135 Annual Reports.
(1) Each investor-owned electric utility shall file annual

reports with the Commission on Commission Form
PSC/ECR/101 ( / ) (12/00) which is incorporated by reference
into this rule. Form PSC/ECR/101, entitled “Annual Report of
Major Electric Utilities”, may be obtained from the
Commission’s Division of Economic Regulation. These
reports shall be verified by a responsible accounting officer of
the utility making the report and shall be due on or before April
30 for the preceding calendar year. A utility may file a written
request for an extension of time with the Division of Economic
Regulation no later than April 30. One extension of 31 days
will be granted upon request. A request for a longer extension
must be accompanied by a statement of good cause and shall
specify the date by which the report will be filed. “Good
cause” means a demonstration that the company has worked
diligently to prepare the report and that the additional time
period requested to complete and submit the report is both
reasonable and necessary given the company’s particular
circumstances.

(2) No change.
Specific Authority 366.05(1), 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 350.115,
366.04(2)(a),(f), 366.05(1),(2)(a) FS. History–New 12-27-94, Amended
12-11-00, ________.

25-6.1351 Cost Allocation and Affiliate Transactions.
(1) through (4) No change.
(5) Reporting Requirements. Each utility shall file

information concerning its affiliates, affiliate transactions, and
nonregulated activities on Form PSC/ECR/101 ( / ) (12/00)
which is incorporated by reference into this rule. Form
PSC/ECR/101, entitled “Annual Report of Major Electric
Utilities,” may be obtained from the Commission’s Division of
Economic Regulation.

(6) No change.
Specific Authority 366.05(1), 350.127(2) FS. Law Implemented 350.115,
366.04(2)(a),(f), 366.041(1), 366.05(1),(2),(9), 366.06(1), 366.093(1) FS.
History–New 12-27-94, Amended 12-11-00, ________.

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
John Slemkewicz
NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Florida Public Service Commission
DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: December 2, 2003
DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: Vol. 29, No. 32, August 8, 2003

PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION
DOCKET NO. 031029-EI
RULE TITLES: RULE NOS.:
Investor-Owned Electric Utility Minimum 

Filing Requirements; Commission Designee 25-6.043
Interim Rate Relief 25-6.0435
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Minimum Filing
Requirements (MFRs) have been streamlined by significantly
reducing both the requirements of, and the number of,
schedules that must be filed by electric utilities in rate
proceedings. Rule 25-6.0435, F.A.C., is amended to
incorporate the latest revision of the MFRs. Paragraph (2) has
been amended to clarify the calculation of interim rates.
SUMMARY: Rule 25-6.043, F.A.C., is amended to
incorporate the latest revision of Commission Form
PSC/ECR/011-E, entitled “Minimum Filing Requirements for
Investor-Owned Electric Utilities.” Schedules are added to
report security costs and hedging costs.
Rule 25-6.0435, F.A.C., incorporates the latest revision of
“Minimum Filing Requirements for Investor-Owned Electric
Utilities” and outdated requirements are deleted.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: None.
Any person who wishes to provide information regarding the
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or to provide a
proposal for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in
writing within 21 days of this notice.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 366.05(1),(2), 366.06(3) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 366.06(1),(2),(3),(4), 366.04(2)(f),
366.071 FS.



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 29,  Number  51,  December 19, 2003

4970   Section II - Proposed Rules

WRITTEN COMMENTS OR SUGGESTIONS ON THE
PROPOSED RULE MAY BE SUBMITTED TO: FPSC,
Division of the Commission Clerk and Administrative
Services, within 21 days of the date of this notice for inclusion
in the record of the proceeding.
IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAW.
If any person decides to appeal any decision of the
Commission with respect to any matter considered at the
rulemaking hearing, if held, a record of the hearing is
necessary. The appellant must ensure that a verbatim record,
including testimony and evidence forming the basis of the
appeal is made. The Commission usually makes a verbatim
record of rulemaking hearings.
Any person requiring some accommodation at this hearing
because of a physical impairment should call the Division of
the Commission Clerk and Administrative Services,
(850)413-6770, at least 48 hours prior to the hearing. Any
person who is hearing or speech impaired should contact the
Florida Public Service Commission by using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULES IS: Christiana T. Moore, Florida Public
Service Commission, 2540 Shumard Oak Blvd., Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-0862, (850)413-6199

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULES IS:

25-6.043 Investor-Owned Electric Utility Minimum Filing
Requirements; Commission Designee.

(1) General Filing Instructions
(a) The petition under Section 366.06 and Section

366.071, F.S. Florida Statutes, for adjustment of rates must
include or be accompanied by:

1. The information required by Commission Form
PSC/ECR/011-E EAG/l1 ( / ) (3/90), entitled “Minimum Filing
Requirements for Investor-Owned Electric Utilities” which is
incorporated into this rule by reference. The form may be
obtained from the Commission’s Division of Economic
Regulation.

2. through 3.(b) No change.
(c) Each schedule shall be cross-referenced to identify

related schedules as either supporting schedules and/or recap
schedules.

(d) through (i) No change.
(2) Commission Designee: The Director of the Division of

Economic Regulation shall be the designee of the Commission
for purposes of determining whether the utility has met the
minimum filing requirements imposed by this rule. In making
this determination, the Director shall consider whether
information that would have been provided in a particular

schedule required by this rule has been provided to the same
degree of detail in another required schedule that the utility
incorporates by reference.
Specific Authority 366.05(1),(2), 366.06(3) FS. Law Implemented
366.06(1),(2),(3),(4), 366.04(2)(f), 366.071 FS. History–New 5-27-81,
Formerly 25-6.43, Amended 7-5-90, 1-31-00, ________.

25-6.0435 Interim Rate Relief.
(1) Each electric utility petitioning for interim rate relief

pursuant to s. 366.071, F.S., shall file the data required by in
Schedules 2 through 14, 17, and 23, in paragraph
25-6.043(1)(a). In addition, a schedule shall be submitted
calculating the interim relief in accordance with s. 366.07, F.S.,
and allocation factors by functional group approved in the
company’s last rate case.

(2)(a) The requested interim increase in base rate revenues
shall be divided by interim test year base rate revenues to
derive a percentage increase factor. The percentage increase
factor shall be applied uniformly to all existing base rates and
charges to derive the interim base rates and charges. Interim
rates shall apply across the board based on base rate revenues
for the test period less embedded fuel revenue by rate schedule.
The resulting dollar amount shall be divided by base rate
revenues per rate schedule to determine the percent increase
applied to each rate schedule.

(b) In determining the interim increase, the following data
shall be provided: KWH sales; base rate revenue less base fuel
revenue; base fuel revenues; total base rate revenue; fuel
adjustment revenue; total revenue. The interim increase shall
be shown by dollar amount and percentage by rate schedule in
the following manner:
I. Requested Interim Amount Across the board

base rate revenue less = percentage constant
base fuel revenue

II. Percentage x base rate revenue less = Dollar increase
Constant base fuel revenue to rate schedule

III. Dollar Increase = Percent increase applied
total base rate revenue to rate schedule
(3) Interim rate relief collected is subject to refund

pending final order in the permanent rate relief request. Such
increase shall be subject to a corporate undertaking or under
bond as authorized by the Commission and any refund shall be
made with an interest factor determined by using the 30-day
commercial paper rate for high-grade, unsecured notes, sold
through dealers by major corporations in multiples of $1,000
as regularly published in the Wall Street Journal. The annual
rate as published on the first day of the current business month
would be added to the rate as published on the first day of the
subsequent business month and halved to obtain the simple
average rate to be applied in that month. This rate of interest
would be applied to the refund amount for that month. The
amount of interest calculated would be added to the beginning
balance of the following month so as to accomplish the
compounding of the interest feature of the refund provision.



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 29,  Number  51,  December 19, 2003

Section II - Proposed Rules   4971

Specific Authority 366.05(1) FS. Law Implemented 366.04(2)(f), 366.06,
366.071 FS. History–New 5-27-81, Formerly 25-6.435, Amended ________.

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
John Slemkewicz
NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Florida Public Service Commission
DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: December 2, 2003
DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: Vol. 29, No. 9, February 28, 2003
(25-6.043) and Vol. 29, No. 42, October 17, 2003 (25-6.0435)

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
RULE TITLE: RULE NO.:
Special Management Meal 33-602.223
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of the
proposed rule is to allow use of the special management meal
at all correctional institutions.
SUMMARY: The proposed rule allows use of the special
management meal at all correctional institutions by removing
the exception for youthful offender institutions.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: None.
Any person who wishes to provide information regarding the
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or to provide a
proposal for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in
writing within 21 days of this notice.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 20.315, 944.09 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 20.315, 944.09 FS.
IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAW.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Perri King Dale, Office of the General
Counsel, Department of Corrections, 2601 Blair Stone Road,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2500

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

33-602.223 Special Management Meal.
(1) No change.
(2) Requirements for Utilization of Special Management

Meal.
(a) through (e) No change.
(f) The special management meal is authorized for use

shall be utilized at all institutions with the exception of those
designated for youthful offenders. The Bureau of Food
Services shall provide orientation in the preparation and
service of the special management meal. The Director of
Security and Institutional Support Services, based on

documentation from the administrator of the food services
section, shall certify to the Assistant Secretary of Institutions,
the warden, and the contractor food service director the
successful completion of special management meal preparation
and service training. Certification is required before the
institution is authorized to utilize the special management
meal. The special management meal will then be authorized
for use on a case-by-case basis at those institutions as provided
in this rule.

(3) through (8) No change.
Specific Authority 20.315, 944.09 FS. Law Implemented 20.315, 944.09 FS.
History–New 1-11-88, Amended 3-4-92, 5-27-97, 11-25-98, Formerly
33-3.0085, Amended 8-1-00, 1-2-02, 11-3-03, ________.

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Michael Rathmann
NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: James V. Crosby, Jr.
DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: December 2, 2003
DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: November 14, 2003

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 
REGULATION
Electrical Contractors’ Licensing Board
RULE TITLE: RULE NO.:
Requirement for Certified Qualifying 

Agent Applicant 61G6-5.004
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes to revise the
existing rule to address requirements for certified qualifying
agent applicant.
SUMMARY: A rule will be amended to address requirements
for certified qualifying agent applicant.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated
Regulatory Cost was prepared.
Any person who wishes to provide information regarding the
statement of estimated costs, or to provide a proposal for a
lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing within
21 days of this notice.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 489.507(3), 489.515(1), 489.521
FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 489.515(1), 489.521, 489.522 FS.
IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAW.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: John Knapp, Executive Director,
Electrical Contractors’ Licensing Board, 1940 North Monroe
Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0750



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 29,  Number  51,  December 19, 2003

4972   Section II - Proposed Rules

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

61G6-5.004 Requirement for Certified Qualifying Agent
Applicant.
In order that the Board may carry out its statutory duty to
investigate the financial responsibility, credit, and business
reputation of an applicant for qualifying agent status, an
applicant shall be required to forward the following to the
Department for review by the Board:

(1) No change.
(2) A reviewed comprehensive financial statement

prepared by a certified public accountant reflecting the
financial condition of the business entity in its previous fiscal
year; provided, however, that the statement be prepared within
12 months of the date of filing of the application.
The financial statement shall include the following: balance
sheet; income statement; capital statement; and statement of
cash flow. Unless prepared by a certified public accountant, the
financial statement shall be signed, in the presence of a notary,
by a responsible officer of the business entity as representing
the financial condition of the business entity for the period
reflected in the statement. The financial statement must
indicate a minimum net worth as indicated below for the
following categories:

(a) through (5) No change.
Specific Authority 489.507(3), 489.515(1), 489.521 FS. Law Implemented
489.515(1), 489.521, 489.522 FS. History–New 1-20-80, Amended 4-17-80,
4-30-81, 1-11-84, Formerly 21GG-5.04, Amended 2-3-86, 11-23-86, 8-27-87,
12-24-87, 11-26-90, 7-8-91, Formerly 21GG-5.004, Amended 3-20-94,
11-30-94, 5-2-96, 2-13-97, 11-23-97, 4-14-98, ________.

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Electrical Contractors’ Licensing Board
NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Electrical Contractors’ Licensing
Board
DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: November 21, 2003
DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: October 10, 2003

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 
REGULATION
Electrical Contractors’ Licensing Board
RULE TITLE: RULE NO.:
Violations and Penalties 61G6-10.002
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes the
development of a rule to address additional violations and
penalties.
SUMMARY: A rule will be amended to address additional
violations and penalties.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated
Regulatory Cost was prepared.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding the
statement of estimated costs, or to provide a proposal for a
lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing within
21 days of this notice.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 455.2273, 489.507(3) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 455.2273 FS.
IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAW.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: John Knapp, Executive Director,
Electrical Contractors’ Licensing Board, 1940 North Monroe
Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0750

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

61G6-10.002 Violations and Penalties.
In imposing disciplinary penalties upon licensees, the board
shall act in accordance with the following disciplinary
guidelines and shall impose a penalty corresponding to the
violations set forth below absent aggravating and mitigating
circumstances and subject to the other provisions of Chapters
455 and 489, Part II: The cited statutory language is intended
to provide a description of the violation and is not a complete
statement of the violation; the complete statement may be
found in the statutory provision cited following the violation
description.

(1) through (15)(f) No change.
(g) Employing a burglar alarm system agent in violation of

Section 489.518, F.S., or employing a fire alarm system agent
in violation of Section 489.5185, F.S. First violation: $500 fine
to $1,000 fine plus proof of compliance; repeat violation:
$1,000 fine to $2,500 fine plus probation or suspension and
proof of compliance.

(16) through (21) No change.
Specific Authority 455.2273, 489.507(3) FS. Law Implemented 455.2273 FS.
History–New 12-10-86, Amended 2-26-89, Formerly 21GG-10.002, Amended
12-24-97, 2-18-99, 10-4-99, _______.

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Electrical Contractors’ Licensing Board
NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Electrical Contractors’ Licensing
Board
DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: November 21, 2003
DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: June 13, 2003

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
Pursuant to Chapter 2003-145, Laws of Florida, all notices for
the Department of Environmental Protection are published on
the Internet at the Department of Environmental Protection’s
home page at http://www.dep.state.fl.us/ under the link or
button titled “Official Notices.”



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 29,  Number  51,  December 19, 2003

Section II - Proposed Rules   4973

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Division of Medical Quality Assurance
RULE TITLES: RULE NOS.:
Definitions 64B-5.001
Approved Providers – Initial Provider and 

Course Application and Renewal, 
Submission of Course Information, 
Submission of Licensee Course 
Completion Data, Address 64B-5.002

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: Section 456.025(7), Florida
Statutes, provides a mandate to the Department of Health to
implement an electronic continuing education (CE) tracking
system for each biennial licensure renewal cycle for which
electronic renewals are implemented, and to integrate such
system into the department’s existing licensure and renewal
systems. All approved continuing education providers are
required by statute to provide information on course attendance
to the department necessary to implement the electronic CE
tracking system, and the department by rule is to specify the
form and procedures by which such information is to be
submitted. The purpose and effect of proposed new Rules
64B-5.001 and 5.002, F.A.C., is to implement the Legislature’s
mandate codified in this subsection of Florida Statutes.
SUMMARY: Proposed new Rule 64B-5.001, F.A.C.,
establishes definitions necessary to implement the electronic
CE tracking system rule. Proposed new Rule 64B-5.002,
F.A.C., establishes the form and procedures for provider and
course initial application and renewal, and provider submission
of course information and licensee course completion data.
Finally, addresses are provided for the submission of such
required information.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated
Regulatory Cost was prepared.
Any person who wishes to provide information regarding the
statement of estimated costs, or to provide a proposal for a
lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing within
21 days of this notice.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 456.004(5), 456.025(7) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.013(9), 456.025(7) FS.
A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE TIME, DATE AND
PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
TIME AND DATE: 1:00 p.m. – 5:00 p.m., Monday, January
12, 2004
PLACE: Betty Easley Conference Center, 4075 Esplanade
Way, Room 166, Tallahassee, Florida 32399
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Jim Knepton, Department of Health,
4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C00, Tallahassee, Florida
32399

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

CONTINUING EDUCATION
64B-5.001 Definitions.

For the purposes of this rule chapter, the following definitions
will apply:

(1) “Approved provider” means a person, firm, institution
of higher learning, partnership, company, corporation, society
or association deemed approved by statute, or approved by rule
or action of the board or the department when there is no
board, to provide continuing education courses. This definition
includes providers accredited by national organizations
approved by statute or approved by the appropriate licensing
board.

(2) “Continuing education (CE) tracking system” means
the designated electronic system through which approved
providers submit necessary information on course attendance.

(3) “Course” means a class, seminar, or other program of
instruction including self-study, offered for the purpose of
complying with continuing education requirements. For the
purposes of the CE tracking system, “course” also includes
hours approved by the board or the department when there is
no board, for licensee attendance at and use of videocassette
courses, on-line courses, pro bono services, residency hours,
transcripts indicating earned college credits and risk
management hours obtained in compliance with s. 456.013(6),
F.S.

(4) “Electronically” refers to the submission of
information and data via the Internet.
Specific Authority 456.004(5) FS. Law Implemented 456.013(9), 456.025(7)
FS. History–New ________.

64B-5.002 Approved Providers – Initial Provider and
Course Application and Renewal, Submission of Course
Information, Submission of Licensee Course Completion Data,
Address.
For the purposes of implementing and maintaining the CE
tracking system, the following requirements apply:

(1) Initial provider and course application and renewal. All
continuing education providers applying to a board, or the
department when there is no board, for initial application or
renewal as an approved provider or for approval of a course of
continuing education, shall submit their application
electronically through the CE tracking system. Required
information for course approval includes the name of the
course, when the course is being offered, the amount of credit
hours for which the provider is seeking approval and all
information that is required for approval by board or
department rule. Required information for provider approval
includes all information that is required for approval by board
or department rule.



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 29,  Number  51,  December 19, 2003

4974   Section II - Proposed Rules

(2) Submission of course information.
(a) Beginning January 1, 2004, all approved providers

must electronically submit course information through the CE
tracking system by the first day of the renewal period for the
profession or professions for which their courses are approved.
For example, if the biennial renewal period for profession x
begins June 1, 2004, approved providers for profession x will
submit course information for courses offered on or after June
1, 2004 by June 1, 2004.

(b) The course information includes the provider name,
the name of the course, when the course is being offered and
the amount of credit hours to be earned by the licensee.

(3) Submission of licensee course completion data.
(a) Beginning January 1, 2004, all approved providers

shall submit licensee course completion data beginning the
first day of the renewal period for the profession or professions
for which their courses are approved. For example, if the
biennial renewal period for profession x begins June 1, 2004,
approved providers for profession x will only submit
completion data for courses offered on or after June 1, 2004.

(b) All approved providers shall submit licensee course
completion data electronically through the CE tracking system
within thirty (30) days of course completion. Required
information includes the course name, the number for the
course assigned by the CE tracking system, the date the course
was offered, and the names and license numbers of licensees
that attended the course.

(c) Such licensee course completion data shall be
submitted electronically through the CE tracking system by
using either the designated excel format, the designated text
file format, entering the data directly to the CE tracking
system, or through submission of a scan card completed and
signed by the licensee.

(4) Address. All information and data required by this rule
shall be submitted electronically to the following Internet
address: https://www.cebroker.com, except for the completed
and signed scan card which must be mailed to the Department
of Health, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C00, Tallahassee, FL
32399-3250.
Specific Authority 456.004(5), 456.025(7) FS. Law Implemented 456.013(9),
456.025(7) FS. History–New ________.

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Amy Jones, Director, Division of Medical Quality Assurance
NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Amy Jones, Director, Division of
Medical Quality Assurance
DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: December 10, 2003
DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: October 10, 2003

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Clinical Laboratory Personnel
RULE TITLE: RULE NO.:
Trainee Registration 64B3-4.001
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes to update the
existing rule text.
SUMMARY: This amendment clarifies that trainee
registration is not renewed, but may be extended beyond its
expiration date under certain circumstances. A website address
is provided and grammatical corrections are made.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated
Regulatory Cost was prepared.
Any person who wishes to provide information regarding the
statement of estimated costs, or provide a proposal for a lower
cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing within 21 days
of this notice.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 483.805(4) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 483.809(3), 483.811(2),(3),(4),
483.825, 483.827 FS.
IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAW.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Joe Baker, Jr., Executive Director,
Board of Clinical Laboratory Personnel, 4052 Bald Cypress
Way, Bin #C07, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3257

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

64B3-4.001 Trainee Registration.
(1) All trainee applicants shall be enrolled in a clinical

laboratory training program approved according to Chapter
64B3-3, F.A.C.

(2)(1) An applicant for trainee registration shall apply to
the Department on forms DH 1083 (10/97), Clinical
Laboratory Trainee Application, effective 2-15-01, which is
incorporated by reference herein and which can be obtained
from the Department or at www.DOH.state.fl.us/mqa.

(3)(2) No change.
(4)(3) Trainee registration may not be extended beyond its

expiration date renewed except upon recommendation of the
program director and approval by the Department Board based
upon one of on the following circumstances:

(a) Approved training program failed to commence start
on the date indicated in the training program’s application for
approval.

(b) No change.
(c) Training If the approved training program ceases to

operate after trainee’s registration.



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 29,  Number  51,  December 19, 2003

Section II - Proposed Rules   4975

(d) No change.
(4) through (5) renumbered (5) through (6) No change.
(6) All trainee applicants shall be enrolled in a clinical

laboratory training program approved according to Chapter
64B3-3, F.A.C.
Specific Authority 483.805(4) FS. Law Implemented 483.809(3),
483.811(2),(3),(4), 483.825, 483.827 FS. History–New 7-20-93, Formerly
21KK-4.001, 61F3-4.001, Amended 4-10-96, 7-3-97, Formerly 59O-4.001,
Amended 3-19-98, 2-15-01, 3-24-02, ________.

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Board of Clinical Laboratory Personnel
NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Board of Clinical Laboratory
Personnel
DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: October 24, 2003
DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: November 21, 2003

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Psychology
RULE TITLES: RULE NOS.:
Application and Examination Fee for 

Licensure by Examination; Review Fee 64B19-12.002
Reexamination Fee 64B19-12.003
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes to amend the
existing rule to address laws and rules examination fees; and
also the Board proposes to address the laws and rules fee for
reexamination.
SUMMARY: Application and Examination Fees for Licensure
by examination and reexamination fee.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated
Regulatory Cost was prepared.
Any person who wishes to provide information regarding the
statement of estimated costs, or to provide a proposal for a
lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing within
21 days of this notice.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 456.013(2), 456.017(2),
490.004(4), 490.005(1)(a) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.013(2), 456.017(2),
490.005(1)(a) FS.
IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAW.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULES IS: Kaye Howerton, Executive Director,
Board of Psychology/MQA, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin
#C05, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3253

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULES IS:

64B19-12.002 Application and Examination Fee for
Licensure by Examination; Review Fee.

(1) The application fee for licensure by examination is
$ 500.00.

(2) When the board certifies the applicant to sit for the
examination, it is the applicant’s responsibility to complete the
examination process with the national vendor.

(3)(2) In addition to the application fee specified above,
each applicant for certification for examination shall submit
the laws and rules examination fee of $80.00. The examination
fee for both parts of the examination is $ 500.00. An applicant
who is certified as exempt from the EPPP shall be required to
pay an examination fee of $ 120.00, and the remainder of the
full fee submitted will be returned to the applicant.

(4)(3) An applicant who fails to take the laws and rules
examination for which the applicant is initially scheduled shall
remit the examination fee required by Rule 64B19-12.003,
F.A.C. again before being allowed to sit for the next
subsequent examination.

(5)(4) An applicant who wishes to review the applicant’s
own Florida laws and rules examination shall remit a fee of
$75.00 $30.00.
Specific Authority 456.013(2), 490.004(4), 490.005(1)(a) FS. Law
Implemented 456.013(2), 490.005(1)(a) FS. History–New 2-22-82, Amended
7-2-84, Formerly 21U-12.02, Amended 11-21-88, 8-12-90, 1-16-92, Formerly
21U-12.002, Amended 10-12-93, 6-14-94, Formerly 61F13-12.002, Amended
1-7-96, 6-26-97, Formerly 59AA-12.002, Amended 12-3-98, 6-28-00, 8-8-01,
_________ .

64B19-12.003 Reexamination Fee.
(1) The reexamination fee for taking both parts of the

licensure examination is $ 500.00.
(2) The reexamination fee for only the EPPP is $ 500.00.
(3) The reexamination fee for only the Florida laws and

rules examination is $80.00 $120.00. Additional fees will be
required by the examination vendor.
Specific Authority 456.013(2), 490.004(4) FS. Law Implemented 456.013(2)
FS. History–New 2-22-82, Amended 7-11-84, Formerly 21U-12.03, Amended
7-18-88, 8-12-90, 1-16-92, Formerly 21U-12.003, Amended 10-12-93,
Formerly 61F13-12.003, Amended 1-7-96, Formerly 59AA-12.003, Amended
12-3-98, 1-10-01, 8-8-01, _________.

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Board of Veterinary Medicine
NAME OF SUPERVISOR OR PERSON WHO APPROVED
THE PROPOSED RULE: Board of Psychology
DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: November 14, 2003
DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAW: September 19, 2003


