
Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 27,  Number  25,  June 22, 2001

Section I - Notices of Development of Proposed Rules and Negotiated Rulemaking   2901

Section I 
Notices of Development of Proposed Rules 

and Negotiated Rulemaking

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 
SERVICES
Office of Agricultural Water Policy
RULE CHAPTER TITLE: RULE CHAPTER NO.:
Agricultural Interim Measures and 

Best Management Practices in 
the Lake Okeechobee Watershed 5M-3

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of this notice is to
initiate the process of rule development regulating the use of
animal waste on agricultural lands within the Lake
Okeechobee watershed pursuant to Section 373.4595, F.S. This
rule is expected to address technical standards governing the
rate of manure application to cow/calf operations, vegetable
row crops, citrus production, nurseries, and sod farms within
the Lake Okeechobee watershed.
Multiple rule development workshops are planned and will be
noticed separately in the Florida Administrative Weekly as
those dates are established. A preliminary draft rule will be
made available two weeks prior to each workshop and may be
obtained by contacting the Department at the address below.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: The subject to be
addressed is the development of standards regulating the
application of animal wastes to agricultural lands as provided
in Section 373.4595, F.S.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 373.4595(3)(c)6. FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 373.4595, 597.07(23) FS.
RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOPS WILL BE
SCHEDULED AND NOTICED IN THE FLORIDA
ADMINISTRATIVE WEEKLY AS THOSE DATES ARE
ESTABLISHED:
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: John
Folks, Environmental Administrator, Office of Agricultural
Water Policy, Florida Department of Agriculture and
Consumer Services, 1203 Governor’s Square Boulevard, Suite
200, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1650, Telephone
(850)488-6249
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE TWO WEEKS PRIOR
TO EACH WORKSHOP AT NO CHARGE FROM THE
CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE.

DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY AFFAIRS
Division of Housing and Community Development
RULE CHAPTER TITLE: RULE CHAPTER NO.:
Florida Building Commission 

Operational Procedures 9B-3
RULE TITLES: RULE NOS.:
Commission Organization and Operations 9B-3.004
Statewide Amendments 9B-3.050
Local Amendments 9B-3.051
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of the
proposed rule is to provide for Commission organization and
committee structure, voting requirements, procedures for
processing statewide amendments to the Florida Building Code
by the Commission and its technical advisory committees, and
procedures for transmittal, review and incorporation of local
amendments to the Florida Building Code.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Florida Building
Commission Procedures.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 553.73(3),(6)-(7), 553.77 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 553.73(3),(6)-(7), 553.77 FS.
A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE TIME, DATE AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
TIME AND DATE: 9:00 a.m., Monday, July 9, 2001
PLACE: Rosen Plaza Hotel, 9700 International Drive,
Orlando, Florida
Any person requiring special accommodation at the hearing
because of a disability or physical impairment should contact
Ila Jones, Community Program Administrator, Department of
Community Affairs, 2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Sadowski
Building, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100, (850)487-1824 at
least seven days before the date of the hearing. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the Department of
Community Affairs using the Florida Dual Party Relay System
which can be reached at 1(800)955-8770 (Voice) or
1(800)955-9771 (TDD).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT IS: Ila Jones, Community
Program Administrator, Department of Community Affairs,
2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Sadowski Building,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY AFFAIRS
Division of Housing and Community Development
RULE CHAPTER TITLE: RULE CHAPTER NO.:
Florida Building Commission: 

Operational Procedures 9B-3
RULE TITLE: RULE NO.:
State Building Code Adopted 9B-3.047



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 27,  Number  25,  June 22, 2001

2902   Section I - Notices of Development of Proposed Rules and Negotiated Rulemaking

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of the
proposed rule amendment is to update the Florida Building
Code adopted by reference in the identified rule to implement
statutory changes, rule amendments and to delete
programmatic requirements, retaining the construction
standards appropriately retained in the Building Code.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Florida Building
Code.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 553.73(2) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 553.73(2) FS., Chs. 98-287,
2000-141, and 2001-186, L.O.F.
A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE TIME, DATE AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
TIME AND DATE: 9:00 a.m., Wednesday, July 11, 2001
PLACE: Rosen Plaza Hotel, 9700 International Drive,
Orlando, Florida
Any person requiring special accommodation at the hearing
because of a disability or physical impairment should contact
Ila Jones, Community Program Administrator, Department of
Community Affairs, 2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Sadowski
Building, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100, (850)487-1824 at
least seven days before the date of the hearing. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the Department of
Community Affairs using the Florida Dual Party Relay System
which can be reached at 1(800)955-8770 (Voice) or
1(800)955-9771 (TDD).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND TO OBTAIN A
COPY OF THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT IS: Ila Jones,
Community Program Administrator, Department of
Community Affairs, 2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Sadowski
Building, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100.
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY AFFAIRS
Division of Housing and Community Development
RULE CHAPTER TITLE: RULE CHAPTER NO.:
Florida Building Commission 

Building Code Training Program 9B-70
RULE TITLE: RULE NO.:
Building Code Training Program 9B-70.001
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of the
proposed rule amendment is to provide for specialized training
courses focusing on transition from the state minimum
building codes to the Florida Building Code as elements of the
core curriculum.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Florida Building
Code training and education.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 553.841 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 553.841 FS.

A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE TIME, DATE AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
TIME AND DATE: 8:45 a.m., Wednesday, July 11, 2001
PLACE: Rosen Plaza Hotel, 9700 International Drive,
Orlando, Florida
Any person requiring special accommodation at the hearing
because of a disability or physical impairment should contact
Ila Jones, Community Program Administrator, Department of
Community Affairs, 2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Sadowski
Building, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100, (850)487-1824 at
least seven days before the date of the hearing. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the Department of
Community Affairs using the Florida Dual Party Relay System
which can be reached at 1(800)955-8770 (Voice) or
1(800)955-9771 (TDD).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT A COPY OF THE
PRELIMINARY DRAFT IS: Ila Jones, Community Program
Administrator, Department of Community Affairs, 2555
Shumard Oak Boulevard, Sadowski Building, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-2100.
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY AFFAIRS
Division of Housing and Community Development
RULE CHAPTER TITLE: RULE CHAPTER NO.:
Product Approval 9B-72
RULE TITLES: RULE NOS.:
Definitions 9B-72.010
Local Product Approval Generally 9B-72.030
Product Evaluation for Local Approval 9B-72.040
Approval by Local Jurisdiction 9B-72.050
Statewide Product Approval Generally 9B-72.060
Product Evaluation for Statewide Approval 9B-72.070
Validation of Evaluation for Statewide Approval 9B-72.080
Statewide Approval by Building Commission 9B-72.090
Approval of Entities to Perform Evaluation, 

Validation Testing, Certification and 
Quality Assurance 9B-72.100

Criteria for Certification of Independence 9B-72.110
List of Approved Entities 9B-72.120
Forms 9B-72.130
Revocation or Modification of Product 

Approval and Approval of Entities 9B-72.160
Investigation 9B-72.170
Equivalence of Standards 9B-72.180
Reference Standards 9B-72.190
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of the
proposed rule is to create a system of product approval to be
implemented in conjunction with the Florida Building Code.
The system allows for approval of products at the local level
for use in a particular jurisdiction and approval by the



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 27,  Number  25,  June 22, 2001

Section I - Notices of Development of Proposed Rules and Negotiated Rulemaking   2903

Commission for use statewide. The rule provides definitions
and a procedure for approval of entities to perform functions
related to product approval and approval of products for use in
construction.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Product Approval.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 553.842 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 553.842 FS.
A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE TIME, DATE AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
TIME AND DATE: 1:30 p.m., Tuesday, July 10, 2001
PLACE: Rosen Plaza Hotel, 9700 International Drive,
Orlando, Florida
Any person requiring special accommodation at the hearing
because of a disability or physical impairment should contact
Ila Jones, Community Program Administrator, Department of
Community Affairs, 2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Sadowski
Building, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100, (850)487-1824 at
least seven days before the date of the hearing. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the Department of
Community Affairs using the Florida Dual Party Relay System
which can be reached at 1(800)955-8770 (Voice) or
1(800)955-9771 (TDD).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT IS: Ila Jones, Community
Program Administrator, Department of Community Affairs,
2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Sadowski Building,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY AFFAIRS
Division of Housing and Community Development
RULE CHAPTER TITLE: RULE CHAPTER NO.:
Prototype Plan Approval 9B-74
RULE TITLES: RULE NOS.:
Definitions 9B-74.010
Administration; Fees 9B-74.020
Plan Review Procedure 9B-74.030
Applicable Standards 9B-74.040
Alteration to Approved Plans 9B-74.050
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of the
proposed rule amendment is to provide for a system of plan
review and approval of plans for structures intended for
repetitive, site-built construction.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Prototype Plan
Review and Approval.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 553.77(6) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 553.77(6) FS.
A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE TIME, DATE AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
TIME AND DATE: 9:00 a.m., Monday, July 9, 2001

PLACE: Rosen Plaza Hotel, 9700 International Drive,
Orlando, Florida
Any person requiring special accommodation at the hearing
because of a disability or physical impairment should contact
Ila Jones, Community Program Administrator, Department of
Community Affairs, 2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Sadowski
Building, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100, (850)487-1824 at
least seven days before the date of the hearing. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the Department of
Community Affairs using the Florida Dual Party Relay System
which can be reached at 1(800)955-8770 (Voice) or
1(800)955-9771 (TDD).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT IS: Ila Jones, Community
Program Administrator, Department of Community Affairs,
2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Sadowski Building,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF ELDER AFFAIRS
Federal Aging Programs
RULE CHAPTER TITLE: RULE CHAPTER NO.:
Adult Day Care 58A-6
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: This rules chapter is being
amended to incorporate language from SB 1202 which requires
in Ch. 400, Part V, Adult Day Care Centers, F.S., the
development of components of a comprehensive emergency
management plan, developed in consultation with the
Department of Health, the Agency for Health Care
Administration, and the Department of Community Affairs and
to update other areas if necessary.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Adult Day Care
standards and regulations.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: Ch. 400, Part V FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: Ch. 400, Part V FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULES
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD AT THE
TIME, DATE AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
TIME AND DATE: 10:00 a.m. – 4:00 p.m., Tuesday, July 10,
2001
PLACE: Conference Room 225F, 4040 Esplanade Way,
Tallahassee, FL
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT IS: Pat Dunn, Office of
the General Counsel, or Sharlene Davis, Statewide
Community-Based Services, Department of Elder Affairs,
4040 Esplanade Way, Tallahassee, FL 32399-7000, Telephone
(850)414-2000
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 27,  Number  25,  June 22, 2001

2904   Section I - Notices of Development of Proposed Rules and Negotiated Rulemaking

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION
Certificate of Need
RULE TITLES: RULE NOS.:
Projects Subject to Review 59C-1.004
Exemptions 59C-1.005
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: Section 15 of Chapter 2001-104
Laws of Florida creates an exemption from certificate of need
(CON) review for a proposal to convert hospital based distinct
part skilled nursing unit (SNU) beds to acute care beds. The
proposed rule amendments reflect this change and establish
requirements for the exemption.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: A new exemption
from CON review.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 408.15(8), 408.034(5) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 408.036(3) FS., Chapter 2001-104,
Laws of Florida.
A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE TIME, DATE AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
TIME AND DATE: 2:00 p.m., July 10, 2001
PLACE: Agency for Health Care Administration, 2727 Mahan
Drive, Building 3, Conference Room C, Tallahassee, Florida
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT IS: John Davis,
Certificate of Need, 2727 Mahan Drive, Building 1,
Tallahassee, Florida

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS:

59C-1.004 Projects Subject to Review.
(1) No change.
(2) Projects Subject to Expedited Review. Unless

exempted under subsection 408.036(3), F.S., tThe following
projects are subject to expedited review, and will be reviewed
in accordance with procedures set forth in subsection
59C-1.010(4), F.A.C.:

(a) through (f) No change.

Specific Authority 408.034(5), 408.15(8) FS. Law Implemented
408.036(1),(2) FS. History–New 1-1-77, Amended 11-1-77, 9-1-78, 6-5-79,
4-25-80, 2-1-81, Formerly 10-5.04, Amended 11-24-86, 11-17-87, 1-31-91,
1-1-92, Formerly 10-5.004, Amended 9-9-92, 1-9-95, 11-4-97, 12-12-00,
________.

59C-1.005 Exemptions.
(1) Request for Exemption. Certain projects are subject to

exemption from certificate of need review pursuant to
subsections 408.036(3) and 408.036(4), F.S., provided the
conditions specified in this rule are met. To receive an
exemption, the applicant shall file a request for exemption with
the agency and provide documentation to justify the request. A
request for exemption may be submitted at any time, and must
be submitted to:

Agency for Health Care Administration
Certificate of Need
2727 Mahan Drive, Building 1
Tallahassee, Florida 32308
(2) General Requirements. In the case of any applicant

applying for an exemption from certificate of need review, the
request shall include:

(a) The type of exemption requested, with reference to the
authorizing paragraph in s. 408.036(3), F.S. Except as provided
in paragraphs (6)(a) or (b) of this rule, an exemption request
must be limited to a single type of exemption.

(b) The name of the health care facility or hospice
involved, and the name of the licensee. A request for
exemption affecting an existing licensed health care facility or
hospice must be submitted by the current licensee.

(c) The location of the project.
(d) The costs of the project. 
(e) The gross square footage of the project, if applicable.
(f) The proposed licensed bed capacity of the health care

facility, if applicable.
(g) A non-refundable fee of two hundred and fifty dollars

($250) payable to the Agency for Health Care Administration
in accordance with s. 408.036(4), F.S. Exemption requests
shall not be accepted by the agency at the time of receipt unless
accompanied by the $250 fee. Checks that are returned by the
bank for insufficient funds will be processed consistent with
the procedures for expedited review applications specified in
s. 59C-1.008(3)(c)1., F.A.C.

(h) The applicable project specific information required by
subsection (6) of this rule.

(3) through (5) No change.
(6) Project Specific Exemption Requests. In addition to

meeting the requirements of subsections (1) and (2) of this
rule, requests for exemption of certain projects must meet the
additional requirements specified below:

(a) through (h) No change.
(i) Conversion of skilled nursing beds to acute care beds.

A request for exemption of a proposed conversion of
hospital-based distinct part skilled nursing unit (SNU) beds to
acute care beds shall certify that:

1. The conversion will utilize or modify physical space
that exists at the time of the exemption request, without
construction of new facilities.

2. The acute care beds will be located at the same premises
as the SNU beds.

3. The conversion will not increase the total licensed bed
capacity of the hospital.

Specific Authority 408.034(5), 408.15(8) FS. Law Implemented 408.036(3),
408.036(4) FS. History–New 1-1-77, Amended 6-5-79, 2-1-81, Formerly
10-5.05, Amended 11-17-87, 3-23-88, 1-31-91, Formerly 10-5.005, Amended
7-13-98, 4-2-01, ________.



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 27,  Number  25,  June 22, 2001

Section I - Notices of Development of Proposed Rules and Negotiated Rulemaking   2905

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 
REGULATION
Board of Professional Surveyors and Mappers
RULE TITLE: RULE NO.:
Re-examination 61G17-4.007
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes to review the
text of this rule to determine if any changes are necessary.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Re-examination.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 455.217(2), 472.013 FS. 
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 455.217(2), 472.013 FS. 
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE SCHEDULED
AND ANNOUNCED IN THE NEXT AVAILABLE ISSUE
OF THE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE WEEKLY.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Sherry
Landrum, Executive Director, Board of Professional Surveyors
and Mappers, Northwood Centre, 1940 N. Monroe Street,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0750
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 
REGULATION
Building Code Administrators and Inspectors Board
RULE TITLE: RULE NO.:
Certification for Multiple Inspection Classes 61G19-6.002
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes to update the
existing rule text.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Certification for
Multiple Inspection Classes.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 468.606 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 468.607, 468.609 FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE SCHEDULED
AND ANNOUNCED IN THE NEXT AVAILABLE ISSUE
OF THE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE WEEKLY.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Anthony
Spivey, Executive Director, Building Code Administrators and
Inspectors Board, Northwood Centre, 1940 N. Monroe Street,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0750
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
DOCKET NO.: 01-29R
RULE CHAPTER TITLE:  RULE CHAPTER NO.:
Stationary Sources – General 

Requirements 62-210
RULE TITLES: RULE NOS.:
Definitions 62-210.200
Permits Required 62-210.300
Notification Forms for Air General Permits 62-210.920
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Department is proposing to
amend Florida Administrative Code Chapter 62-210 to make
the existing state incinerator rules accommodate the recently
adopted U.S. Environmental Protection Agency’s incinerator
rules. The rulemaking may also include development of a
general permit for portable air curtain incinerators.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: The amendments
relate to the control of air pollution from incinerators.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 403.061, 403.0872 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 403.061, 403.0872 FS.
A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE TIME, DATE AND PLACE SHOW BELOW:
TIME AND DATE: 10:00 a.m. – 4:00 p.m., Thursday, July 12,
2001
PLACE: The Ballroom, Holiday Inn Capital View, 1355
Apalachee Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: John
Glunn (850)921-9548, email: John.Glunn@dep. state.fl.us)
and Venkata Panchakarla (850)921-9556, email:
Venkata.Panchakarla@dep.state.fl.us) Department of
Environmental Protection, Division of Air Resource
Management, 2600 Blair Stone Road, M.S. 5500, Tallahassee,
FL 32399-2400
If accommodation for a disability is needed to participate in
this activity, please notify the Personnel Services Specialist in
the Bureau of Personnel, (850)487-1855 or 1(800)955-8771
(TDD), at least seven days before the meeting.

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
DOCKET NO.: 01-30R
RULE CHAPTER TITLE: RULE CHAPTER NO.:
Open Burning and Frost 

Protection Fires 62-256
RULE TITLES: RULE NOS.:
Definitions 62-256.200
Prohibitions 62-256.300
Land Clearing 62-256.500
Open Burning Allowed 62-256.700



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 27,  Number  25,  June 22, 2001

2906   Section I - Notices of Development of Proposed Rules and Negotiated Rulemaking

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Department is proposing to
amend Florida Administrative Code Chapter 62-256 to make
the existing state air curtain incinerator rules accommodate the
recently adopted U.S. Environmental Protection Agency’s
incinerator rules.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: The amendments
relate to the control of air pollution from air curtain
incinerators.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 403.061, 403.0872 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 403.061, 403.0872 FS.
A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE TIME, DATE AND PLACE SHOW BELOW:
TIME AND DATE: 10:00 a.m. – 4:00 p.m., Thursday, July 12,
2001
PLACE: The Ballroom, Holiday Inn Capital View, 1355
Apalachee Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: John
Glunn (850)921-9548, email John.Glunn@dep.state.fl.us) and
Venkata Panchakarla (850)921-9556, email: Venkata.
Panchakarla@dep.state.fl.us), Department of Environmental
Protection, Division of Air Resource Management, 2600 Blair
Stone Road, M.S. 5500, Tallahassee, FL 32399-2400
If accommodation for a disability is needed to participate in
this activity, please notify the Personnel Services Specialist in
the Bureau of Personnel, (850)487-1855 or 1(800)955-8771
(TDD), at least seven days before the meeting.

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
DOCKET NO.: 01-14R
RULE CHAPTER TITLE: RULE CHAPTER NO.:
Stationary Sources – 

Emission Standards 62-296
RULE TITLES: RULE NOS.:
Purpose and Scope 62-296.100
General Pollutant Emission Limiting Standards 62-296.320
Incinerators 62-296.401
Waste-to-Energy Facilities 62-296.416
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Department is proposing to
amend Florida Administrative Code Chapter 62-296 to make
the existing state incinerator rules accommodate the recently
adopted U.S. Environmental Protection Agency’s incinerator
rules. The rulemaking may also include amendments to the
existing state crematory rules.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: The amendments
relate to the control of air pollution from incinerators.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 403.061, 403.0872 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 403.061, 403.0872 FS.
A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE TIME, DATE AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
TIME AND DATE: 10:00 a.m. – 4:00 p.m., Thursday, July 12,
2001

PLACE: The Ballroom, Holiday Inn Capital View, 1355
Apalachee Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, ARE: John
Glunn (850)921-9548, email: John.Glunn@dep.state.fl.us) and
Venkata Panchakarla (850)921-9556, email: Venkata.
Panchakarla@dep.state.fl.us) Department of Environmental
Protection, Division of Air Resource Management, 2600 Blair
Stone Road, M.S. 5500, Tallahassee, FL 32399-2400
If accommodation for a disability is needed to participate in
this activity, please notify the Personnel Services Specialist in
the Bureau of Personnel, (850)487-1855 or 1(800)955-8771
(TDD), at least seven days before the meeting.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Medicine
RULE TITLE: RULE NO.:
Fees 64B8-41.001
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes to update the
existing rule.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Fees.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 456.036, 468.507, 468.508 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.036, 456.065, 468.508 FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
WEEKLY.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT IS: Kaye Howerton,
Executive Director, Dietetics and Nutrition Practice Council,
4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C05, Tallahassee, Florida
32399
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Medicine
RULE TITLES: RULE NOS.:
Disciplinary Guidelines 64B8-44.003
Citations 64B8-44.005
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes to update the
existing rules.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Disciplinary
Guidelines; Citations.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 456.079, 458.309, 468.507,
456.077 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.079, 468.517, 468.518(2),
456.077, 468.518 FS.



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 27,  Number  25,  June 22, 2001

Section I - Notices of Development of Proposed Rules and Negotiated Rulemaking   2907

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
WEEKLY.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT IS: Kaye Howerton,
Executive Director, Dietetics and Nutrition Practice Council,
4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C05, Tallahassee, Florida
32399
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Medicine
RULE TITLES: RULE NOS.:
Continuing Education Approval 64B8-45.002
Performance of Pro Bono Services 64B8-45.005
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes to update the
existing rules.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Continuing
Education Approval; Performance of Pro Bono Services.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 468.507, 456.013(8) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 468.514, 468.515 FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
WEEKLY.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT IS: Kaye Howerton,
Executive Director, Dietetics and Nutrition Practice Council,
4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C05, Tallahassee, Florida
32399
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Medicine
RULE TITLE: RULE NO.:
Organization 64B8-50.002
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes to update the
existing rule.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Organization.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 456.011, 478.43(1) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.011 FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
WEEKLY.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT IS: Kaye Howerton,
Executive Director, Electrolysis Council, 4052 Bald Cypress
Way, Bin #C05 , Tallahassee, Florida 32399
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Medicine
RULE TITLE: RULE NO.:
Inactive Licensure Status; Reactivation 

of Licensure, Delinquent Renewal 64B8-54.002
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes to update the
existing rule.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Inactive Licensure
Status; Reactivation of Licensure Delinquent Renewal.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 456.036, 478.43(1),(4), 478.50 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.036 FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
WEEKLY.
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT IS: Kaye Howerton,
Executive Director, Electrolysis Council, 4052 Bald Cypress
Way, Bin #C05, Tallahassee, Florida 32399
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Physical Therapy Practice
RULE TITLE: RULE NO.:
Licensure Examination Subjects and Passing 

Score; Additional Requirements 
After Third Failure 64B17-3.002

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes to provide the
applicant with greater flexibility in preparing to re-take the
examination for the fourth time.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Licensure
Examination Subjects and Passing Score; Additional
Requirements After Third Failure
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 456.017, 486.025, 486.051 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.017, 486.051 FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED AT
THE TIME, DATE AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
TIME AND DATE: 4:00 p.m., June 30, 2001
PLACE: The Embassy Suites Hotel, 1100 S. E. 17th Street, Ft.
Lauderdale, FL 33316



Florida Administrative Weekly Volume 27,  Number  25,  June 22, 2001

2908   Section II - Proposed Rules

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT IS: Kaye Howerton, Executive
Director, Board of Physical Therapy Practice, 4052 Bald
Cypress Way, Bin #C05, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3259

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS:

64B17-3.002 Licensure Examination Subjects and Passing
Score; Additional Requirements After Third Failure.

(1) through (2) No change.
(3) An applicant must reapply in order to retake the

examination. If an applicant wishes to take the examination for
the fourth time, the applicant must submit to the Board for
approval satisfactory evidence of having successfully
completed the following since the last taking of the
examination: successful completion of a course of study or
internship designed by a physical therapy program accredited
by the American Physical Therapy Association. An applicant
who has completed these additional requirements may take the
examination on two more occasions. An applicant who has
failed the Department administered examination after five
attempts is no longer eligible to take the examination.

Specific Authority 456.017, 486.025, 486.051 FS. Law Implemented 456.017,
486.051 FS. History–New 8-6-84, Formerly 21M-7.22, Amended 3-16-88,
6-20-89, Formerly 21M-7.022, Amended 6-6-90, 6-3-92, 3-24-93, Formerly
21MM-3.002, 61F11-3.002, Amended 12-22-94, Formerly 59Y-3.002,
Amended ________.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Physical Therapy Practice
RULE TITLE: RULE NO.:
Licensure Examination Subjects and Passing 

Score; Additional Requirements 
After Third Failure 64B17-4.002

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes to provide the
applicant with greater flexibility in preparing to re-take the
examination for the fourth time.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Licensure
Examination Subjects and Passing Score; Additional
Requirements After Third Failure.
SPECIFIC AUTHORITY: 456.017(1)(b), 486.025, 486.104
FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.017, 486.104 FS.
IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED AT
THE TIME, DATE AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
TIME AND DATE: 4:00 p.m., June 30, 2001
PLACE: The Embassy Suites Hotel, 1100 S. E. 17th Street, Ft.
Lauderdale, FL 33316

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT IS: Kaye Howerton, Executive
Director, Board of Physical Therapy Practice, 4052 Bald
Cypress Way, Bin #C05, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3259

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS:

64B17-4.002 Licensure Examination Subjects and Passing
Score; Additional Requirements After Third Failure.

(1) through (2) No change.
(3) An applicant must reapply in order to retake the

examination. If an applicant wishes to take the examination for
the fourth time, the applicant must submit to the Board for
approval satisfactory evidence of having successfully
completed the following since the last taking of the
examination: successful completion of a course of study or
internship designed by a physical therapist or physical therapist
assistant program accredited by the American Physical
Therapy Association. An applicant who has completed these
additional requirements may take the examination on two more
occasions. An applicant who has failed the Department
administered examination after five attempts is no longer
eligible to take the examination.

Specific Authority 456.017(1)(b), 486.025, 486.104 FS. Law Implemented
456.017, 486.104 FS. History–New 8-6-84, Formerly 21M-10.22, Amended
4-12-87, 3-16-88, 6-20-89, Formerly 21M-10.022, Amended 6-3-92, 3-24-93,
Formerly 21MM-4.002, 61F11-4.002, Amended 12-22-94, Formerly
59Y-4.002, Amended ________.

Section II 
Proposed Rules

DEPARTMENT OF BANKING AND FINANCE
Board of Funeral and Cemetery Services
RULE TITLE: RULE NO.:
Application for Certificate of Authority 

Branch Office License 3F-5.0021
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes to update this
rule to adopt an updated version of the form
DBF-COAB-12/00.
SUMMARY: This rule sets forth the necessary procedures for
applying for a license to operate a branch office and the fee for
same.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COST: No Statement of Estimated
Regulatory Cost was prepared.
Any person who wishes to provide information regarding the
statement of estimated costs, or to provide a proposal for a
lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing within
21 days of this notice.


