
Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 102, May 24, 2018 

 

2493 

 

Section I 

Notice of Development of Proposed Rules 

and Negotiated Rulemaking 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

State Board of Education 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

6A-1.099814 Principal Autonomy Pilot Program Initiative 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To update the submission deadlines 

and amend language to reflect new legislation for districts 

participating in the Principal Autonomy Program Initiative. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Principal Autonomy. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1011.6202, FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1011.6202, FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Eileen 

McDaniel, Bureau Chief, Bureau of Educator Recruitment, 

Development and Retention, 325 West Gaines Street, Room 

124, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0400; (850)245-0562; or 

eileen.mcdaniel@fldoe.org. To comment on this rule 

development or to request a rule development workshop, please 

go to https://web02.fldoe.org/rules or contact: Chris Emerson, 

Director, Office of Executive Management, Department of 

Education, (850)245-9601 or email 

Christian.Emerson@fldoe.org. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE FROM 

THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE. 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Finance 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

69V-40.002 Adoption of Forms 

69V-40.0312 Application Procedure for Loan Originator 

License 

69V-40.0313 Loan Originator License Renewal and 

Reactivation 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect is to amend 

existing rules to adopt a form relating to military fee waiver 

procedures for military personnel, veterans, and spouses 

seeking a loan originator license or renewal of a loan originator 

license. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Consumer Finance. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 494.0011, 494.00312(8), 

494.00313(4) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 494.0011, 494.00312(8), 

494.00313(4) FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Sheila 

Harley, (850)410-9716, sheila.harley@flofr.com 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE. 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Securities 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

69W-600.002 Application for Registration as Associated 

Person (FINRA Dealer) 

69W-600.0022 Application for Registration as an 

Associated Person (Non-FINRA Dealer) 

69W-600.0023 Application for Registration as an 

Associated Person (Issuer/Dealer) 

69W-600.0024 Application for Registration as an 

Associated Person (Investment Adviser and 

Federal Covered Advisor) 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect is to amend 

existing rules to adopt a form relating to military fee waiver 

procedures for military personnel, veterans, and spouses 

seeking registration or renewal of registration as any of the 

following: a principal or associated person of dealers who are 

members of the Financial Industry Regulatory Authority 

(FINRA), a principal or associated person of dealers who are 

not members of the Financial Industry Regulatory Authority 

(FINRA), a principal or associated person of an issuer/dealer; 

or an associated person of investment advisers and federal 

covered advisers. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Securities. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 517.03(1), 517.12(10)(b), 

517.12(11)(b) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 517.03, 517.12 FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Ryann 

White, (850)410-9803, ryann.white@flofr.com 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=195
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6A-1.099814
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1011.6202
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1011.6202
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=524
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69V-40.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69V-40.0312
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69V-40.0313
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=494.0011
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20494.00312(8)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20494.00313(4)%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=494.0011
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20494.00312(8)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20494.00313(4)%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=525
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69W-600.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69W-600.0022
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69W-600.0023
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69W-600.0024
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=517.03(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20517.12(10)(b)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20517.12(11)(b)%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=517.03
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20517.12%20FS.


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 102, May 24, 2018 

 

2494 

Section II 

Proposed Rules 

NONE 

Section III 

Notice of Changes, Corrections and 

Withdrawals 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Consumer Services 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

5J-17.011 Disciplinary Guidelines 

5J-17.020 Applications for Licensure: Experience 

5J-17.021 Applications for Licensure: Education 

5J-17.022 Applications for Surveyor and Mapper 

Intern/Surveyor in Training 

5J-17.025 Domestic Equivalency Education Program 

Criteria for Applicants Who Graduated from 

Non-ABET Accredited Surveying and 

Mapping Degree Programs 

5J-17.040 Continuing Education Requirements for 

Reactivation of Inactive License 

5J-17.041 Continuing Education Credit for Biennial 

Renewal 

5J-17.042 Proof of Continuing Education Credit 

Earned 

5J-17.043 Board Approval of Continuing Education 

Providers 

5J-17.044 Obligations of Continuing Education 

Providers 

5J-17.045 Evaluations of Continuing Education 

Providers 

5J-17.047 Approval of Continuing Education Courses 

5J-17.048 Reinstatement of Null and Void License 

5J-17.050 Definitions 

5J-17.052 Boundary Survey Requirements 

5J-17.053 Standards of Practice - Professional Matters 

in Surveying and Mapping 

5J-17.060 Seals Acceptable to the Board 

5J-17.062 Procedures for Signing and Sealing 

Electronically Transmitted Plans, 

Specifications, Reports or Other Documents 

NOTICE OF CORRECTION 

Notice is hereby given that the following correction has been 

made to the proposed rule in Vol. 44 No. 62, March 29, 2018 

issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

In the SUMMARY portion of the notice, Rule 5J-17.041 was 

inadvertently listed as a proposed rule of the Department 

instead of as a proposed rule of the Board. 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Consumer Services 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

5J-17.011 Disciplinary Guidelines 

5J-17.020 Applications for Licensure: Experience 

5J-17.021 Applications for Licensure: Education 

5J-17.022 Applications for Surveyor and Mapper 

Intern/Surveyor in Training 

5J-17.025 Domestic Equivalency Education Program 

Criteria for Applicants Who Graduated from 

Non-ABET Accredited Surveying and 

Mapping Degree Programs 

5J-17.040 Continuing Education Requirements for 

Reactivation of Inactive License 

5J-17.041 Continuing Education Credit for Biennial 

Renewal 

5J-17.042 Proof of Continuing Education Credit 

Earned 

5J-17.043 Board Approval of Continuing Education 

Providers 

5J-17.044 Obligations of Continuing Education 

Providers 

5J-17.045 Evaluations of Continuing Education 

Providers 

5J-17.047 Approval of Continuing Education Courses 

5J-17.048 Reinstatement of Null and Void License 

5J-17.050 Definitions 

5J-17.052 Boundary Survey Requirements 

5J-17.053 Standards of Practice - Professional Matters 

in Surveying and Mapping 

5J-17.060 Seals Acceptable to the Board 

5J-17.062 Procedures for Signing and Sealing 

Electronically Transmitted Plans, 

Specifications, Reports or Other Documents 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 44 No. 62, March 29, 

2018 issue of the Florida Administrative Register.  

5J-17.011 Disciplinary Guidelines. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 472.008 FS. Law Implemented 472.031, 

472.0351 FS. History–New 3-13-03, Amended 3-17-04, 9-19-06, 

Formerly 61G17-2.0015, Amended 11-13-17,              . 

 

5J-17.020 Applications for Licensure: Experience. 

(1) To verify an applicant’s experience the Board will 

accept evidence as to employment from employers or 

supervisors who are registered surveyors and mappers, and if 

such evidence is unavailable, the Board will consider written 

documentation from a registered surveyor and mapper who has 

personal knowledge of the applicant’s experience. Such 

evidence shall set forth the quality and character of the 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=170
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.011
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.020
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.021
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.022
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.025
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.040
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.041
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.042
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.043
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.044
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.045
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.047
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.048
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.050
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.052
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.053
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.060
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.062
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=170
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.011
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.020
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.021
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.022
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.025
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.040
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.041
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.042
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.043
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.044
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.045
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.047
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.048
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.050
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.052
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.053
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.060
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5J-17.062


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 102, May 24, 2018 

 

2495 

 

applicant’s duties and responsibilities.  A National Council of 

Examiners for Engineering and Surveying (NCEES) Record 

will be acceptable as evidence. 

(2) through (3) No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 472.008 FS. Law Implemented 472.013 FS. 

History–New 1-3-80, Amended 6-9-80, 1-11-84, Formerly 21HH-

3.01, Amended 1-16-92, Formerly 21HH-3.001, Amended 5-30-95, 

10-1-97, 5-17-00, 3-25-01, 7-7-09, Formerly 61G17-3.001, Amended 

11-13-17,                   . 

 

5J-17.021 Applications for Licensure: Education. 

(1) To determine whether an applicant for licensure has met 

the educational requirements of Section 472.013(2)(a), F.S., the 

applicant must demonstrate that he/she has: 

(a) No change. 

(b) Completed a bachelor’s degree, its equivalent, or higher 

in surveying and mapping or a similar titled program, including, 

but not limited to, geomatics, geomatics engineering, and land 

surveying from a college or university recognized by the board 

and accredited by the Accreditation Board for Engineering and 

Technology (ABET). 

(2) through (4) No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 472.013 FS. Law Implemented 472.005, 

472.013 FS. History–New 9-7-93, Amended 5-30-95, 10-1-97, 5-17-

00, 11-2-00, 2-5-01, Formerly 61G17-3.0021, Amended 11-13-17,              

. 

 

5J-17.022 Applications for Surveyor and Mapper 

Intern/Surveyor in Training. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 472.013 FS. Law Implemented 472.013 FS. 

History–New 11-13-17,               .  

 

5J-17.025 Domestic Equivalency Education Program 

Criteria for Applicants Who Graduated from Non-ABET 

Accredited Surveying and Mapping Degree Programs. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 472.013 FS. Law Implemented 472.008, 

472.013 FS. History–New 1-29-07, Formerly 61G17-3.0025, 

Amended 11-13-17, Repealed                  . 

 

5J-17.040 Continuing Education Requirements for 

Reactivation of Inactive License. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 472.019(2), 472.027 FS. Law Implemented 

472.019(2), 472.027 FS. History–New 10-29-80, Formerly 21HH-

5.01, Amended 2-7-91, Formerly 21HH-5.001, Amended 3-28-94, 5-

30-95, 10-13-97, 6-29-00, 6-22-03, 6-20-06, 1-29-07, Formerly 

61G17-5.001, Amended 5-11-15, 11-13-17,                  . 

 

5J-17.041 Continuing Education Credit for Biennial 

Renewal. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 472.008, 472.018, 472.027 FS. Law 

Implemented 472.018, 472.027 FS. History–New 3-28-94, Amended 

5-30-95, 9-21-98, 7-27-00, 6-22-03, 6-23-05, 6-20-06, Formerly 

61G17-5.0031, Amended 10-17-12, 5-11-15, 11-13-17,            . 

 

5J-17.042 Proof of Continuing Education Credit Earned. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 472.008, 472.018 FS. Law Implemented 

472.018, 472.033 FS. History–New 3-28-94, Amended 5-30-95, 10-

13-97, 5-31-00, Formerly 61G17-5.0032, Amended 11-13-17,              . 

 

5J-17.043 Board Approval of Continuing Education 

Providers. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 472.008, 472.011, 472.018 FS. Law 

Implemented 472.011, 472.018 FS. History–New 3-28-94, Amended 

5-30-95, 5-31-00, 8-18-03, Formerly 61G17-5.0041, Amended 11-13-

17,               . 

 

5J-17.044 Obligations of Continuing Education Providers. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 472.008, 472.011, 472.018, 472.027 FS. Law 

Implemented 472.018, 472.027 FS. History–New 3-28-94, Amended 

5-30-95, 7-27-00, 8-18-03, 8-18-04, 12-28-05, 1-29-07, Formerly 

61G17-5.0043, Amended 10-17-12, 5-11-15, 11-13-17,                . 

 

5J-17.045 Evaluations of Continuing Education Providers. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 472.008, 472.018 FS. Law Implemented 

472.018 FS. History–New 3-28-94, Amended 5-30-95, 5-31-00, 8-18-

03, Formerly 61G17-5.0044, Amended           . 

 

5J-17.047 Approval of Continuing Education Courses. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 472.008, 472.018 FS. Law Implemented 

472.018 FS. History–New 8-18-03, Amended 6-23-05, 12-28-05, 6-

20-06, Formerly 61G17-5.0051, Amended 10-17-12, Repealed               . 

 

5J-17.048 Reinstatement of Null and Void License. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 472.0202(6)(b), 472.027 FS. Law Implemented 

472.0202(6)(b), 472.027 FS. History–New 6-20-06, Formerly 61G17-

10.001, Amended 5-11-15,                   . 

 

5J-17.050 Definitions. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 472.008, 472.027 FS. Law Implemented 

472.027 FS. History–New 9-1-81, Formerly 21HH-6.02, Amended 12-

18-88, Formerly 21HH-6.002, Amended 12-25-95, 5-25-99, 3-25-01, 

3-13-03, 4-4-06, Formerly 61G17-6.002, Amended 5-11-15, 11-13-17,                 

. 

 

5J-17.052 Standards of Practice - Boundary Survey 

Requirements. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 472.008, 472.027 FS. Law Implemented 

472.027 FS. History–New 9-1-81, Formerly 21HH-6.04, Amended 12-

18-88, Formerly 21HH-6.004, Amended 12-25-95, 5-13-96, 5-25-99, 



Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 102, May 24, 2018 

 

2496 

4-4-06, 8-31-06, 8-18-08, Formerly 61G17-6.004, Amended 5-11-15, 

11-13-17,               . 

 

5J-17.053 Standards of Practice – Professional Matters in 

Surveying and Mapping. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 472.006(5), 472.027 FS. Law Implemented 

472.027, 472.033, 472.0337, 472.0351 FS. History–New 5-11-15, 

Amended 11-13-17,           . 

 

5J-17.060 Seals Acceptable to the Board. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 472.008, 472.025 FS. Law Implemented 

472.025 FS. History–New 1-3-80, Amended 6-9-80, Formerly 21HH-

7.01, 21HH-7.001, Amended 5-30-95, 10-25-95, 12-13-99, 11-18-01, 

10-23-02, Formerly 61G17-7.001, Amended        . 

 

5J-17.062 Procedures for Signing and Sealing 

Electronically Transmitted Surveys or Other Documents. 

No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 472.008, 472.025 FS. Law Implemented 

472.025 FS. History–New 2-1-00, Amended 12-16-07, Formerly 

61G17-7.0025, Amended 11-13-17,                 . 

FISH AND WILDLIFE CONSERVATION 

COMMISSION 

Freshwater Fish and Wildlife 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

68A-15.061 Specific Regulations for Wildlife 

Management Areas - Southwest Region 

NOTICE OF WITHDRAWAL 

Notice is hereby given that the above rule, as noticed in Vol. 44 

No. 27, February 8, 2018 issue of the Florida Administrative 

Register has been withdrawn. 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Division of Funeral, Cemetery, and Consumer Services 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

69K-30.001 Disciplinary Guidelines and Penalties for 

Funeral Directors and Establishments, 

Embalmers, Removal Services, 

Refrigeration Services, Direct Disposers and 

Establishments, and Cinerator Facilities. 

NOTICE OF CORRECTION 

Notice is hereby given that the following correction has been 

made to the proposed rule in Vol. 44 No. 74, April 16, 2018 

issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes the rule 

amendment to clarify disciplinary guidelines. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: 

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse 

impact on small business or likely increase directly or indirectly 

regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the aggregate within 

one year after the implementation of the rule. A SERC has not 

been prepared by the Agency. The Agency has determined that 

the proposed rule is not expected to require legislative 

ratification based on the statement of estimated regulatory costs 

or if no SERC is required, the information expressly relied upon 

and described herein: During discussion of the economic 

impact of this rule at its Board meeting, the Board, based upon 

the expertise and experience of its members, and the substance 

of the rule amendment, determined that a Statement of 

Estimated Regulatory Costs (SERC) was not necessary because 

the rule does not impose additional rights, obligations, or duties 

on any persons or any businesses, and that the rule will not 

require ratification by the Legislature. No person or interested 

party submitted additional information regarding the economic 

impact at that time. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Ellen Simon, Assistant Director, 

Division of Funeral, Cemetery, and Consumer Services, 

Department of Financial Services, 200 East Gaines Street, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0361, (850)413-4985, Ellen 

Simon@MyfloridaCFO.com. 

Section IV 

Emergency Rules 

NONE 

Section V 

Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Rule 

Variance or Waiver 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Board of Accountancy 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61H1-27.001 College or University Requirements 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on May 17, 2018, the Board 

of Accountancy, received a petition for variance or waiver filed 

by Chirag Minenkumar Shah. Petitioner is seeking a variance 

or waiver of paragraph 61H1-27.001(5)(a), Florida 

Administrative Code, that provides that a graduate of a four-

year degree granting institution not accredited at the time the 

applicant’s degree was received or at the time of filing 

application will be deemed to be a graduate of a four-year 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=68
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=68
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=347
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=68A-15.061
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=369
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69K-30.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=280
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61H1-27.001


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 102, May 24, 2018 

 

2497 

 

accredited college or university course provided an accredited 

college or university as defined by subsections 61H1-27.001(1) 

and (2), F.A.C., accepts applicant’s non-accredited 

baccalaureate degree and the applicant satisfactorily completes 

at least 15 semester or 22 quarter hours, or the equivalent, in 

post-baccalaureate education at the accredited institution of 

which at least 9 semester or 13 quarter hours, including at least 

3 semester or 4 quarter hours in taxation; or the equivalent, shall 

be in accounting. 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained 

by contacting: Veloria Kelly, Division Director, Board of 

Accountancy, 240 NW 76th Dr., Suite A, Gainesville, Florida 

32607. Comments on this petition should be filed with the 

Board of Accountancy within 14 days of publication of this 

notice. 

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

62-610.462 Reliability and Operator Staffing 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on May 17, 2018, the 

Department of Environmental Protection, received a petition 

for variance pursuant to Section 120.542, F.S., from Petitioner, 

Marion County Utilities, NW Regional Wastewater Treatment 

Facility. The petition requested a variance from subsection 62-

610.462(3), F.A.C., and Chapter 62-699, F.A.C., to allow 

Marion County Utilities, NW Regional Wastewater Treatment 

Facility to reduce the operator staffing time for weekend days 

from the required 6 hours per day to only 3 hours per day. 

subsection 62-610.462(3), F.A.C., requires that minimum 

staffing at the wastewater treatment facility shall be reduced to 

staffing by a Class C or higher operator 6 hours per day, 7 days 

per week unless Chapter 62-699, F.A.C., requires additional 

operator presence or higher level of operator. The property is 

located at 11800 S. US Hwy 441, Belleview, Florida 34420. 

The petition has been assigned OGC No. 18-0986; DEP Permit 

No. FLA272060. 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained 

by contacting: Judy Dennise, Department of Environmental 

Protection, 3319 Maguire Boulevard, Orlando, Florida 33803, 

telephone: (407)894-4154, Dennise.Judy@dep.state.fl.us, 

during normal business hours, 8:00am-5:00pm., Monday 

through Friday, except legal holidays. Written comments must 

be received by the Department of Environmental Protection no 

later than 14 days from the date of publication of this notice. 

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

62-610.462 Reliability and Operator Staffing 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on May 17, 2018, the 

Department of Environmental Protection, received a petition 

for variance pursuant to section 120.542, F.S., from Petitioner, 

Marion County Utilities, Stonecrest Wastewater Treatment 

Facility. The petition requested a variance from subsection 62-

610.462(3), F.A.C., and Chapter 62-699, F.A.C., to allow 

Marion County Utilities, Stonecrest Wastewater Treatment 

Facility to reduce the operator staffing time for weekend days 

from the required 6 hours per day to only 3 hours per day. 

subsection 62-610.462(3) F.A.C., requires that minimum 

staffing at the wastewater treatment facility shall be reduced to 

staffing by a Class C or higher operator 6 hours per day, 7 days 

per week unless Chapter 62-699, F.A.C., requires additional 

operator presence or higher level of operator. The property is 

located at 11800 S. US Hwy 441, Belleview, Florida 34420. 

The petition has been assigned OGC No. 18-0985; DEP Permit 

No. FLA010741. 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained 

by contacting: Judy Dennise, Department of Environmental 

Protection, 3319 Maguire Boulevard, Orlando, Florida 33803, 

telephone: (407)894-4154, Dennise.Judy@dep.state.fl.us, 

during normal business hours, 8:00am-5:00pm., Monday 

through Friday, except legal holidays. Written comments must 

be received by the Department of Environmental Protection no 

later than 14 days from the date of publication of this notice. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Massage Therapy 

The Board of Massage Therapy hereby gives notice: 

that the Petition for Variance or Waiver, filed February 9, 2018, 

by Kathleen Jansen was withdrawn on April 16, 2018 by 

electronic mail to the board office. The Notice of Petition for 

Waiver or Variance was published in Vol. 44, No. 31, of the 

February 14, 2018 Florida Administrative Register. 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be obtained 

by contacting: Kama Monroe, Executive Director, Board of 

Massage Therapy, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C06, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258, (850)245-4162, or by 

electronic mail - Kama.Monroe@flhealth.gov. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Massage Therapy 

The Board of Massage Therapy hereby gives notice: 

of the issuance of an Order regarding the Petition for Variance 

or Waiver, filed on February 9, 2018, by Jennifer Lynn Stevens. 

The Notice of Petition for Waiver or Variance was published in 

Vol. 44, No. 31, of the February 14, 2018 Florida 

Administrative Register. Petitioner sought a variance or waiver 

of 64B7-32.003, F.A.C., regarding the 500-hour minimum 

requirement for board approved massage schools. The Board 

considered the instant Petition at a duly-noticed public meeting 

held on April 20, 2018, in Tallahassee, Florida. 

The Board’s Order, filed on May 21, 2018, found that the 

petition was in substantial compliance with the provisions of 

Section 120.542, F.S., and Chapter 28-104, F.A.C. The Board 

denies the petition finding that the applicant has not met the 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=62-610.462
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=62-610.462
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=330
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=330


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 102, May 24, 2018 

 

2498 

purpose of the underlying statute and that the application of the 

rule to Petitioner does not violate principles of fairness. 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be obtained 

by contacting: Kama Monroe, Executive Director, Board of 

Massage Therapy, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C06, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258, (850)245-4162 or by 

electronic mail - Kama.Monroe@flhealth.gov. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Division of Environmental Health 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

64E-6.005 Location and Installation 

64E-6.006 Site Evaluation Criteria 

64E-6.014 Construction Standards for Drainfield Systems 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on May 10, 2018, the 

Florida Department of Health, received a petition for variance 

from David Potts, representing Geomatrix Systems, LLC. 

Specifically, the petitioner seeks a variance from subsections 

64E-6.005(4), 64E-6.006(4), and paragraph 64E-6.014(5)(e), 

Florida Administrative Code, which provides the requirements 

for suitable unobstructed area for the installation and function 

of the system; requires that the site not be covered with asphalt 

or concrete or be subject to vehicular traffic; and requires a 

barrier of polyester bonded filament to protect the drainfield 

from soil infiltration. 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained 

by contacting: Agency Clerk, Department of Health, Office of 

the General Counsel, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin A02, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1703. 

FLORIDA HOUSING FINANCE CORPORATION 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

67-21.003 Application and Selection Process for 

Developments 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on May 22, 2018, the 

Florida Housing Finance Corporation, received a petition for 

waiver of paragraph 67-21.003(1)(b), F.A.C., from Melbourne 

Leased Housing Associates II, LLLP, requesting a waiver of the 

NCA's criteria of 15% of the total equity be provided at closing. 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained 

by contacting: Ana McGlamory, Corporation Clerk, Florida 

Housing Finance Corporation, 227 North Bronough Street, 

Suite 5000, Tallahassee, FL 32301-1329. The Petition has also 

been posted on Florida Housing’s website at 

floridahousing.org. Florida Housing will accept comments 

concerning the Petition for 14 days from the date of publication 

of this notice. To be considered, comments must be received on 

or before 5:00 p.m., Eastern Time, on the 14th day after 

publication of this notice at Florida Housing Finance 

Corporation, 227 North Bronough Street, Suite 5000, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32301-1329. 

Section VI 

Notice of Meetings, Workshops and Public 

Hearings 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Fruit and Vegetables 

The Florida Peanut Advisory Council announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 26, 2018, 3:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Florida Department of Agriculture and Consumer 

Services - Doyle Conner Building, 3125 Conner Boulevard, 

Tallahassee, FL 32399 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

General Meeting to discuss research and funding for the current 

year. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Carrie 

Porterfield at (863)578-1918. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Carrie Porterfield at (863)578-1918. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Fruit and Vegetables 

The Citrus Research and Development Foundation, Inc. acting 

as the Advisory Council for the Citrus Research Marketing 

Order announces a public meeting to which all persons are 

invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 13, 2018, 9:30 a.m. 

PLACE: Hyatt Regency Coconut Point, 5001 Coconut Road, 

Bonita Springs, FL 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Discussion and vote on recommendation of box rate to 

Commissioner Putnam. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Brandy 

Brown at (863)956-8817 or brandy.brown@citrusrdf.org. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Brandy Brown at (863)956-8817 or 

brandy.brown@citrusrdf.org. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=335
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64E-6.005
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64E-6.006
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64E-6.014
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=67
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=67-21.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=167
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=167


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 102, May 24, 2018 

 

2499 

 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Brandy Brown at 

(863)956-8817 or brandy.brown@citrusrdf.org. 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

The Florida Rehabilitation Council announces a telephone 

conference call to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: September 13, 2018, 4:00 – 6:30 p.m., ET 

(or until complete) 

PLACE: Conference Call: 1(888)670-3525 and Code: 

7513637441 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Florida Rehabilitation Council - General Business. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Roy 

Cosgrove at (850)245-3317 or at roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Roy Cosgrove at (850)245-3317 or at 

roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Roy Cosgrove at 

(850)245-3317 or at roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org. 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

The Florida Rehabilitation Council announces a telephone 

conference call to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: October 11, 2018, 4:00 – 6:30 p.m., ET (or 

until complete) 

PLACE: Conference Call: 1(888)670-3525 and Code: 

7513637441 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Florida Rehabilitation Council - General Business. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Roy 

Cosgrove at (850)245-3317 or at roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Roy Cosgrove at (850)245-3317 or at 

roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Roy Cosgrove at 

(850)245-3317 or at roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org. 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

The Florida Rehabilitation Council announces a public meeting 

to which all persons are invited. 

DATES AND TIMES: October 23, 2018, 9:00 a.m. – 5:30 p.m., 

ET (or until complete); October 24, 2018, 9:00 a.m. – 1:00 p.m., 

ET (or until complete) 

PLACE: Betty Easley Center, 4075 Esplanade Way, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Florida Rehabilitation Council - General Business 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Roy 

Cosgrove at (850)245-3317 or at roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Roy Cosgrove at (850)245-3317 or at 

roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Roy Cosgrove at 

(850)245-3317 or at roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org. 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

The Florida Department of Transportation announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 6, 2018, 1:00 p.m. – 4:30 p.m. 

PLACE: Florida Department of Transportation, Burns 

Auditorium, 605 Suwannee Street, Tallahassee, FL 32399 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Discuss the charge and role of the Bicycle and Pedestrian 

Partnership Council. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Melanie 

Weaver Carr, (850)414-4817. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Melanie Weaver Carr, (850)414-4817. Public 

participation is solicited without regard to race, color, national 

origin, age, sex, religion, disability or family status. 

Persons who require translation services (free of charge) should 

contact Paula San Gregorio at 850-414-4811 at least 7 days 

prior to the meeting. If you are hearing or speech impaired, 

please contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Melanie Weaver Carr 

at (850)414-4817. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=14


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 102, May 24, 2018 

 

2500 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Driver Licenses 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

15A-5.0010 Definitions 

15A-5.002 Report of Deficit or Disorder to the Department 

15A-5.0021 Medical Review 

15A-5.0022 Administrative Hearing Procedures 

15A-5.004 Seizures 

15A-5.005 Loss of Consciousness 

15A-5.006 Cardiovascular Deficits 

15A-5.008 Deficits of Memory or Judgment 

15A-5.009 Musculoskeletal and Neuromuscular Disorders 

15A-5.010 Severe Mental Disorders 

15A-5.011 Vision Standards 

15A-5.012 Drug Addiction and Alcoholism 

The Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 21, 2018, 11:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

2900 Apalachee Parkway, Room B201, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The 

purpose of this public meeting is to discuss changes made by 

the Notices of Change published in the Florida Administrative 

Register on April 9, 2018 (Volume 44, Number 69), and May 

10, 2018 (Volume 44, Number 92), any subsequently published 

Notice of Change, and all issues raised at any public hearing or 

in comments made by the Joint Administrative Procedures 

Committee after April 6, 2018, regarding Rules 15A-5.0010, 

15A-5.002, 15A-5.0021, 15A-5.0022, 15A-5.004, 15A-5.005, 

15A-5.006, 15A-5.008, 15A-5.009, 15A-5.010, 15A-5.011, 

15A-5.012, F.A.C. (Medical Advisory Board Guidelines). 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Ray 

Graves, Bureau Chief, 2900 Apalachee Parkway, Room A201, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399, raygraves@flhsmv.gov, (850)617-

2529. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Ray Graves, Bureau Chief, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Room A201, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, 

raygraves@flhsmv.gov, (850)617-2529. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION 

Certificate of Need 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

59C-1.005 Certificate of Need Exemption Procedure 

The Agency for Health Care Administration announces a 

hearing to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 15, 2018, 8:00 a.m. – 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Agency for Health Care Administration, 2727 Mahan 

Drive, Conference Room C, Tallahassee, FL 32308 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: A 

rule hearing will be held to discuss revisions that will be made 

to rule section (6)(j) changing the term “subdistrict” to 

“district”. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Marisol 

Fitch at Marisol.Fitch@ahca.myflorida.com or by phone at 

(850)412-4346. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Marisol Fitch at 

Marisol.Fitch@ahca.myflorida.com or by phone at (850)412-

4346. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the 

agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 

(TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Marisol Fitch at 

Marisol.Fitch@ahca.myflorida.com or by phone at (850)412-

4346. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Board of Professional Engineers 

The Joint FBPE-FEMC Committee announces a telephone 

conference call to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 5, 2018, 2:00 p.m. or soon thereafter 

PLACE: Florida Board of Professional Engineers, 2639 North 

Monroe St., Building B-112, Tallahassee, FL 32303 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

general business of the committee. If you would like to 

participate in the call, please contact Rebecca Sammons at 

(850)521-0500, ext. 114 at least 48hours prior to the date of the 

meeting. The call in number is 1(888)392-4560 (you will need 

to contact Ms. Sammons for the participant code). 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Rebecca 

Sammons. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.0010
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.0021
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.0022
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.004
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.005
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.006
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.008
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.009
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.010
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.011
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.012
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=188
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59C-1.005
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=267


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 102, May 24, 2018 

 

2501 

 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Rebecca Sammons. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Rebecca Sammons, 

rsammons@fbpe.org. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted 

The Florida Building Commission, Special Occupancy 

Technical Advisory Committee, announces a public meeting to 

which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 8, 2018, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: The Betty Easley Conference Center, Conference 

Room 180, Capital Circle Office Center, 4075 Esplanade Way, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32311 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

review the 2018 changes to the International Building Codes (I-

Codes) and provide recommendations to the Commission 

regarding those changes that are needed to accommodate the 

specific needs of this state, as applicable. 

To review and accept final draft report for research project titled 

“Evaluation of the Cost Impact and Benefit of the 2018 I-Code 

Changes (Prescriptive Code Changes).” 

To review and accept final draft report for research project titled 

“Webinar Workshops on Evaluation of the Cost Impact of 

Prescriptive Code Changes.” 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Marlita 

Peters, as set forth below or on the Commission website. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Ms. Barbara Bryant, Building Codes and Standards 

Office, Division of Professions, Department of Business and 

Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, fax: (850)414-8436. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Marlita Peters, Special 

Occupancy Technical Advisory Committee , Office of Building 

Codes and Standards, Division of Professions, Department of 

Business and Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, fax: (850)414-

8436 or access information on the Commission’s website: 

https://floridabuilding.org/c/default.aspx. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted 

The Florida Building Commission, Electrical Technical 

Advisory Committee concurrent with the Swimming Pool 

Technical Advisory Committee, announces a public meeting to 

which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 11, 2018, 8:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Embassy Suites by Hilton Orlando North, 225 

Shorecrest Drive, Altamonte Springs, Florida 32701 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

review the 2018 changes to the International Building Codes (I-

Codes) and provide recommendations to the Commission 

regarding those changes that are needed to accommodate the 

specific needs of this state, as applicable. 

To review and accept final draft report for research project titled 

“Webinar Workshops on Evaluation of the Cost Impact of 

Prescriptive Code Changes.” 

To review and accept final draft report for research project titled 

“Evaluation of the Cost Impact and Benefit of the 2018 I-Code 

Changes (Prescriptive Code Changes).” 

Electrical Technical Advisory Committee (separately) 

To review the 2018 changes to the International Building Codes 

(I-Codes) and provide recommendations to the Commission 

regarding those changes that are needed to accommodate the 

specific needs of this state, as applicable. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Joe 

Bigelow or Chip Sellers, as set forth below or on the 

Commission website. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Ms. Barbara Bryant, Building Codes and Standards 

Office, Division of Professions, Department of Business and 

Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-0772, (850)487-1824 or fax: (850)414-8436. If 

you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 102, May 24, 2018 

 

2502 

using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Joe Bigelow, Electrical 

Technical Advisory Committee, or Chip Sellers, Swimming 

Pool Technical Advisory Committee, Office of Building Codes 

and Standards, Division of Professions, Department of Business 

and Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0772, call (850)487-1824 or access 

the Commission website: 

https://floridabuilding.org/c/default.aspx. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted 

The Florida Building Commission, Code Administration 

Technical Advisory Committee, announces a public meeting to 

which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 12, 2018, 1:30 p.m. 

PLACE: Embassy Suites by Hilton Orlando North, 225 

Shorecrest Drive, Altamonte Springs, Florida 32701 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

review the 2018 changes to the International Building Codes (I-

Codes) and provide recommendations to the Commission 

regarding those changes that are needed to accommodate the 

specific needs of this state, as applicable. 

To review and accept final draft report for research project titled 

“Evaluation of the Cost Impact and Benefit of the 2018 I-Code 

Changes (Prescriptive Code Changes).” 

To review and accept final draft report for research project titled 

“Webinar Workshops on Evaluation of the Cost Impact of 

Prescriptive Code Changes.” 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Marlita 

Peters, as set forth below or on the Commission website. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Ms. Barbara Bryant, Building Codes and Standards 

Office, Division of Professions, Department of Business and 

Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, fax: (850)414-8436. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Marlita Peters, Code 

Administration Technical Advisory Committee, Office of 

Building Codes and Standards, Division of Professions, 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 2601 

Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, 

fax: (850)414-8436 or access information on the Commission’s 

website: https://floridabuilding.org/c/default.aspx. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted 

The Florida Building Commission, Structural Technical 

Advisory Committee, announces a public meeting to which all 

persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 13, 2018, 8:00 a.m. and June 14, 

2018, 8:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Embassy Suites by Hilton Orlando North, 225 

Shorecrest Drive, Altamonte Springs, Florida 32701 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

review the 2018 changes to the International Building Codes (I-

Codes) and provide recommendations to the Commission 

regarding those changes that are needed to accommodate the 

specific needs of this state, as applicable. 

To review and accept final draft report for research project titled 

“Evaluation of the Cost Impact and Benefit of the 2018 I-Code 

Changes (Prescriptive Code Changes).” 

To review and accept final draft report for research project titled 

“Webinar Workshops on Evaluation of the Cost Impact of 

Prescriptive Code Changes.” 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Joe 

Bigelow, as set forth below or on the Commission website. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Ms. Barbara Bryant, Building Codes and Standards 

Office, Division of Professions, Department of Business and 

Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, fax: (850)414-8436. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 102, May 24, 2018 

 

2503 

 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Joe Bigelow, 

Structural Technical Advisory Committee, Building Codes and 

Standards Office, Division of Professions, Department of 

Business and Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, fax: (850)414-

8436; or access information on the Commission’s website, 

https://floridabuilding.org/c/default.aspx. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted 

The Florida Building Commission, Roofing Technical 

Advisory Committee, announces a public meeting to which all 

persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 15, 2018, 8:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Embassy Suites by Hilton Orlando North, 225 

Shorecrest Drive, Altamonte Springs, Florida 32701 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

review the 2018 changes to the International Building Codes (I-

Codes) and provide recommendations to the Commission 

regarding those changes that are needed to accommodate the 

specific needs of this state, as applicable. 

To review and accept final draft report for research project titled 

“Evaluation of the Cost Impact and Benefit of the 2018 I-Code 

Changes (Prescriptive Code Changes).” 

To review and accept final draft report for research project titled 

“Webinar Workshops on Evaluation of the Cost Impact of 

Prescriptive Code Changes.” 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Robert 

Benbow, as set forth below or on the Commission website. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Ms. Barbara Bryant, Building Codes and Standards 

Office, Division of Professions, Department of Business and 

Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, fax: (850)414-8436. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Robert Benbow, 

Roofing Technical Advisory Committee, Building Codes and 

Standards Office, Division of Professions, Department of 

Business and Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, fax: (850)414-

8436; or access information on the Commission’s website, 

https://floridabuilding.org/c/default.aspx. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted 

The Florida Building Commission, Energy Technical Advisory 

Committee, announces a public meeting to which all persons 

are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 18, 2018, 8:00 a.m. 

PLACE: The Shores Resort and Spa, 2637 South Atlantic 

Avenue, Daytona Beach Shores, Florida 32118 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

review the 2018 changes to the International Building Codes (I-

Codes) and provide recommendations to the Commission 

regarding those changes that are needed to accommodate the 

specific needs of this state, as applicable. 

To review and accept final draft report for research project titled 

“Investigate Energy Impact of Whole-House Dehumidifier 

Location.” 

To review and accept final draft report for research project titled 

“Residential Air Leakage and Mechanical Ventilation 

Verification.” 

To review and accept final draft report for research project titled 

“Comparison of the 6th Edition (2017) Florida Building Code, 

Energy Conservation with IECC 2018 and ASHRAE 90.1 - 

2016.” 

To review and accept the final draft report for research project 

titled “Webinar Workshops on Evaluation of the Cost Impact of 

Prescriptive Code Changes.” 

To review and accept final draft report for research project titled 

“Evaluation of the Cost Impact and Benefit of the 2018 I-Code 

Changes (Prescriptive Code Changes).” 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Norman 

Bellamy, as set forth below or on the Commission website. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Ms. Barbara Bryant, Building Codes and Standards 

Office, Division of Professions, Department of Business and 

Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, fax: (850)414-8436. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 102, May 24, 2018 

 

2504 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Norman Bellamy, 

Energy Technical Advisory Committee, Office of Building 

Codes and Standards, Division of Professions, Department of 

Business and Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, fax: (850)414-

8436 or access information on the Commission’s website: 

https://floridabuilding.org/c/default.aspx. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted 

The Florida Building Commission, Mechanical Technical 

Advisory Committee, announces a public meeting to which all 

persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 19, 2018, 8:00 a.m. 

PLACE: The Shores Resort and Spa, 2637 South Atlantic 

Avenue, Daytona Beach Shores, Florida 32118 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

review the 2018 changes to the International Building Codes (I-

Codes) and provide recommendations to the Commission 

regarding those changes that are needed to accommodate the 

specific needs of this state, as applicable. 

To review and accept final draft report for research project titled 

“Evaluation of the Cost Impact and Benefit of the 2018 I-Code 

Changes (Prescriptive Code Changes).” 

To review and accept final draft report for research project titled 

“Webinar Workshops on Evaluation of the Cost Impact of 

Prescriptive Code Changes.” 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Norman 

Bellamy, as set forth below or on the Commission website. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Ms. Barbara Bryant, Building Codes and Standards 

Office, Division of Professions, Department of Business and 

Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, fax: (850)414-8436. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Norman Bellamy, 

Mechanical Technical Advisory Committee, Building Codes 

and Standards Office, Division of Professions, Department of 

Business and Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, fax: (850)414-

8436 or access information on the Commission’s website: 

https://floridabuilding.org/c/default.aspx. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted 

The Florida Building Commission, Plumbing Technical 

Advisory Committee, announces a public meeting to which all 

persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 20, 2018, 8:00 a.m. 

PLACE: The Shores Resort and Spa, 2637 South Atlantic 

Avenue, Daytona Beach Shores, Florida 32118 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

review the 2018 changes to the International Building Codes (I-

Codes) and provide recommendations to the Commission 

regarding those changes that are needed to accommodate the 

specific needs of this state, as applicable. 

To review and accept final draft report for research project titled 

“Evaluation of the Cost Impact and Benefit of the 2018 I-Code 

Changes (Prescriptive Code Changes).” 

To review and accept final draft report for research project titled 

“Webinar Workshops on Evaluation of the Cost Impact of 

Prescriptive Code Changes.” 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Chip 

Sellers, as set forth below or on the Commission website. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Ms. Barbara Bryant, Building Codes and Standards 

Office, Division of Professions, Department of Business and 

Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, fax: (850)414-8436. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 102, May 24, 2018 

 

2505 

 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Chip Sellers, Plumbing 

Technical Advisory Committee, Building Codes and Standards 

Office, Division of Professions, Department of Business and 

Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, fax: (850)414-8436 or access 

information on the Commission’s website: 

https://floridabuilding.org/c/default.aspx. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted 

The Florida Building Commission, Fire Technical Advisory 

Committee, announces a public meeting to which all persons 

are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 21, 2018, 8:00 a.m. and June 22, 

2018, 8:00 a.m. 

PLACE: The Shores Resort and Spa, 2637 South Atlantic 

Avenue, Daytona Beach Shores, Florida 32118 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

review the 2018 changes to the International Building Codes (I-

Codes) and provide recommendations to the Commission 

regarding those changes that are needed to accommodate the 

specific needs of this state, as applicable. 

To review and accept final draft report for research project titled 

“Webinar Workshops on Evaluation of the Cost Impact of 

Prescriptive Code Changes.” 

To review and accept final draft report for research project titled 

“Evaluation of the Cost Impact and Benefit of the 2018 I-Code 

Changes (Prescriptive Code Changes).” 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Robert 

Benbow, as set forth below or on the Commission website. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Ms. Barbara Bryant, Building Codes and Standards 

Office, Division of Professions, Department of Business and 

Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, fax: (850)414-8436. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Robert Benbow, Fire 

Technical Advisory Committee, Office of Building Codes and 

Standards, Division of Professions, Department of Business and 

Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, fax: (850)414-8436 or access 

information on the Commission’s website: 

https://floridabuilding.org/c/default.aspx. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Dentistry 

The Board of Dentistry announces a public meeting to which 

all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 5, 2018, 6:00 p.m. ET 

PLACE: 1(888)670-3525 when prompted, enter conference 

code, 4552635641 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

conduct a Rules Committee Meeting. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

www.floridasdentistry.gov. If any person decides to appeal any 

decision made by the Board with respect to any matter 

considered at this meeting, he/she will need to ensure that a 

verbatim record of the proceeding is made, which record 

includes the testimony and evidence upon which the appeal is 

to be made. Those who are hearing impaired, using TDD 

equipment can call the Florida Telephone Relay System at 

1(800)955-8771. Persons requiring special accommodations 

due to disability or physical impairment should contact the 

Board Office at (850)245-4474. 

FLORIDA DEVELOPMENT FINANCE CORPORATION 

The Florida Resiliency and Energy District announces a hearing 

to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, May 30, 2018, 2:00 p.m. – 

2:05 p.m. 

PLACE: Caribe Royale, Governors Room, 8101 World Center 

Drive, Orlando, FL 32821 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

This public hearing will discuss the following: 

Resolution No. F18-01 – Consider adoption of Final 

Assessment 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Ahisha 

Rodriguez, PACE Program Coordinator, (407)712-6352. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=328
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=941


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 102, May 24, 2018 

 

2506 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 1 day before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Ahisha Rodriguez, PACE Program Coordinator, 

(407)712-6352. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please 

contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-

8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Ahisha Rodriguez, 

PACE Program Coordinator, (407)712-6352. 

FLORIDA DEVELOPMENT FINANCE CORPORATION 

The Board of Directors for Florida Resiliency and Energy 

District announces a public meeting to which all persons are 

invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, May 30, 2018, 2:05 p.m. – 

3:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Caribe Royale, Governors Room, 8101 World Center 

Drive, Orlando, FL 32821 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

• Approval of 02/21/2018 Meeting Minutes 

• New Board Member Introduction 

• Ratification of new FRED Members 

• Resolution No. F18-02 – Greenworks Lending 

• Fiscal Year 2018-2019 Budget 

• PACE Update 

• Jurisdiction Update 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Ahisha 

Rodriguez, PACE Program Coordinator, (407)712-6352. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 1 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Ahisha Rodriguez, PACE Program Coordinator, 

(407)712-6352. 

 If you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the 

agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 

(TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Ahisha Rodriguez, 

PACE Program Coordinator, (407)712-6352. 

CITY OF PEMBROKE PINES 

The City of Pembroke Pines announces a public meeting to 

which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, June 6, 2018, 6:30 p.m. 

PLACE: City of Pembroke Pines City Hall, Commission 

Chambers, 601 City Center Way, Pembroke Pines, Florida 

33025 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The 

City of Pembroke Pines gives notice of first reading of a 

proposed ordinance amending Chapter 121, “Communications 

Rights-of-Way” of the City of Pembroke Pines Code of 

Ordinances. The proposed ordinance amends the definitions 

related to communications facilities located in the rights-of-

way, and enacting a new Section 121.35, “Small and Micro 

Wireless Facilities” to provide for the regulation of small and 

micro wireless facilities installed and maintained within public 

rights-of-way within the City of Pembroke Pines. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: The City 

Clerk’s Office at (954)450-1050 or by visiting Pembroke Pines 

City Hall during regular business hours. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: The City Clerk’s Office at (954)450-1050. If you 

are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

FLORIDA IS FOR VETERANS INC. 

The Florida is for Veterans Inc. d/b/a Veterans Florida 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Sunday, June 3, 2018, 10:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Hilton Garden Inn, Tampa Ybor Historic District, 

1700 E. 9th Avenue, Tampa, FL 33605 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: ED, 

Budget, Career Services, Entrepreneurship and Committee 

Reports. Approval of FY18-19 Operating Budget, Approval of 

FY19-20 Legislative Budget Report, Report on Marketing Firm 

Selection, Approval of Committee Recommendations for 

Entrepreneurship Program Network Partner Selection and 

Officer Elections 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

info@veteransflorida.org. 

For more information, you may contact: 

info@veteransflorida.org. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=941
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1138
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1201


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 102, May 24, 2018 

 

2507 

 

Section VII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Declaratory Statements 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61-31.701 Minimum Standards and Practices for Mold 

Assessors 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Department of Business 

and Professional Regulation has declined to rule on the petition 

for declaratory statement filed by Susan E. McDonough on 

March 26, 2018. The following is a summary of the agency's 

declination of the petition:  

Based on the Findings and Conclusions in the Order, the 

Program accordingly finds that the Petition does not meet the 

requirements for a declaratory statement to be issued. 

Therefore, the petition was denied. 

A copy of the Order Declining of the Petition for Declaratory 

Statement may be obtained by contacting: Department of 

Business and Professional Regulation, Agency Clerk's Office, 

2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, FL 32399-2202; (850)717-

1183; AGC.Filing@myfloridalicense.com (DS 2018-022; 

DBPR Ref #2018-017081). 

Please refer all comments to: Kathy Syfrett, Administrative 

Assistant III, Department of Business and Professional 

Regulation, Office of the General Counsel, 2601 Blair Stone 

Road, Tallahassee, FL 32399-2202; (850)717-1231; 

Kathleen.Syfrett@myfloridalicense.com (DS 2018-022; DBPR 

Ref #2018-017081). 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Department of Business 

and Professional Regulation, Division of Alcoholic Beverages 

and Tobacco has received the petition for declaratory statement 

from Robert D. Epstein On Behalf of Arnold's Wines Inc., 

D/B/A Kahn's Fine Wines and SpiritsThe petition seeks the 

agency's opinion as to the applicability of Florida Statutes 

subsections 561.545(1) and (2); 561.54(1) as it applies to the 

petitioner. 

Petitioner seeks a Declaratory Statement from the Department 

with the following questions: Whether an unlicensed, out-of-

state retailer can sell, ship, and deliver wine directly to 

consumers in Florida? If an unlicensed, out-of-state retailer can 

sell, ship, and deliver wine directly to consumers in Florida, 

whether the retailer can do so either by using its own vehicle or 

by common carrier? If an unlicensed, out-of-state retailer may 

not sell, ship, and deliver wine directly to consumers in Florida, 

whether an out-of-state winery or retailer may qualify for any 

type of license that would allow it to do so?  

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be 

obtained by contacting: Department of Business and 

Professional Regulation, Agency Clerk's Office, 2601 

Blairstone Rd., Tallahassee, Fl 32399, (850)717-1183, 

AGC.filing@myfloridalicense.com. 

Please refer all comments to: Daniel McGinn, Deputy Chief 

Attorney, Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 

Division of Alcoholic Beverages and Tobacco, 2601 Blaistone 

Rd., Tallahassee, Florida 32399; DS 2018-038; DBPR 

Reference # 2018-026761 

Except for good cause shown, motions for leave to intervene 

must be filed within 21 days of this notice. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Massage Therapy 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Board of Massage 

Therapy has issued an order disposing of the petition for 

declaratory statement filed by Lynda I. Soto on February 02, 

2018. The following is a summary of the agency's disposition 

of the petition:  

The Notice of Petition for Declaratory Statement was published 

in Volume 44, No. 26, of the February 7, 2018, Florida 

Administrative Register. The petition seeks a declaratory 

statement from the Board as to whether it is within the scope of 

practice of a massage therapist to provide lipo laser treatment 

to clients. The Board’s Order, filed on May 21, 2018, founds 

that the petition filed in this cause is in substantial compliance 

with the provisions of Section 120.565, F.S., and Rule 28-105, 

F.A.C., and that under the specific facts of the petition, lipo 

laser treatment to change the structure of the body of a client is 

not within the scope of the practice of massage therapy in 

Florida. 

A copy of the Order Disposing of the Petition for Declaratory 

Statement may be obtained by contacting: Kama Monroe, 

Executive Director, Board of Massage Therapy, 4052 Bald 

Cypress Way, Bin #C06, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258, 

(850)245-4162, or by electronic mail - 

Kama.Monroe@flhealth.gov. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Massage Therapy 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Board of Massage 

Therapy has issued an order disposing of the petition for 

declaratory statement filed by Elena Gournelos on November 

21, 2017. The following is a summary of the agency's 

disposition of the petition:  

The Notice of Petition for Declaratory Statement was published 

in Volume 43, No. 227, of the November 27, 2017, Florida 

Administrative Register. The petition seeks a declaratory 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61-31.701
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=330
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=330


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 102, May 24, 2018 

 

2508 

statement from the Board as to whether myofascial release of 

the soft tissues of the pelvic floor is within the scope of her 

practice as a massage therapist. The Board’s Order, filed on 

May 21, 2018, founds that the petition filed in this cause is in 

substantial compliance with the provisions of Section 120.565, 

F.S., and Rule 28-105, F.A.C., and that under the specific facts 

of the petition, myofascial release of the pelvic floor is not 

within the scope of Petitioner’s practice as a massage therapist. 

A copy of the Order Disposing of the Petition for Declaratory 

Statement may be obtained by contacting: Kama Monroe, 

Executive Director, Board of Massage Therapy, 4052 Bald 

Cypress Way, Bin #C06, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258, 

(850)245-4162, or by electronic mail - 

Kama.Monroe@flhealth.gov. 

Section VIII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding the Validity of Rules 

Notice of Petition for Administrative Determination has been 

filed with the Division of Administrative Hearings on the 

following rules: 

NONE 

Notice of Disposition of Petition for Administrative 

Determination has been filed with the Division of 

Administrative Hearings on the following rules: 

NONE 

Section IX 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Non-rule Policy Challenges 

NONE 

Section X 

Announcements and Objection Reports of 

the Joint Administrative Procedures 

Committee 

NONE 

Section XI 

Notices Regarding Bids, Proposals and 

Purchasing 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Invitation to Negotiate 

The State Board of Administration of Florida (SBA) is 

soliciting competitive responses from parties interested in 

offering loss reimbursement examination services to the Florida 

Hurricane Catastrophe Fund (FHCF). The Invitation to 

Negotiate (ITN) will be available on June 1, 2018, and may be 

obtained from the FHCF website at www.sbafla.com/fhcf under 

“Announcements.” The deadline for submitting responses is 

2:00 p.m. (ET) on June 22, 2018. A meeting will be held on July 

19, 2018, to discuss and evaluate the responses received. The 

SBA reserves the right to reject any or all competitive responses 

and to cancel any ITNs. 

The meeting is open to the public and shall take place at the 

time and location shown below. 

TIME: 2:00 p.m. (ET) until conclusion of meeting. Persons who 

wish to participate by phone may call 1-888-670-3525, 

conference code 7135858151. 

PLACE: Room 116, Hermitage Conference Room, Hermitage 

Centre, 1801 Hermitage Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida  

32308. 

Any person requiring special accommodations to participate in 

the meeting is asked to advise Linda Guyas, State Board of 

Administration, P.O. Box 13300, Tallahassee, FL 32317-3300; 

(850)413-1336; linda.guyas@sbafla.com; at least seven (7) 

calendar days before the meeting. 

Section XII 

Miscellaneous 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

Index of Administrative Rules Filed with the Secretary of State 

Pursuant to Section 120.55(1)(b)6. – 7., F.S., the below list of 

rules were filed in the Office of the Secretary of State between 

3:00 p.m., Thursday, May 17, 2018 and 3:00 p.m., Wednesday, 

May 23, 2018.  

Rule No. File Date Effective  

Date 

12AER18-01 5/17/2018 5/17/2018 

12AER18-02 5/17/2018 5/17/2018 

12BER18-03 5/17/2018 5/17/2018 

25-30.455 5/23/2018 6/12/2018 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
http://www.sbafla.com/fhcf
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=1


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 102, May 24, 2018 

 

2509 

 

25-30.456 5/23/2018 6/12/2018 

25-30.457 5/23/2018 6/12/2018 

42SS-1.002 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

42QQQ-1.001 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

42QQQ-1.002 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

42QQQ-1.003 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

42RRR-1.001 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

42RRR-1.002 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

42RRR-1.003 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

53ER18-21 5/17/2018 5/17/2018 

53ER18-22 5/17/2018 5/17/2018 

53ER18-23 5/17/2018 5/17/2018 

53ER18-24 5/17/2018 5/17/2018 

59G-13.070 5/21/2018 6/10/2018 

59G-13.081 5/21/2018 6/10/2018 

61J1-2.001 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

61J1-2.002 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.001 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.002 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.003 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.004 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.005 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.006 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.007 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.008 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.009 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.010 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.011 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.012 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.013 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.014 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.015 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

LIST OF RULES AWAITING LEGISLATIVE 

APPROVAL SECTIONS 120.541(3), 373.139(7) 

AND/OR 373.1391(6), FLORIDA STATUTES 

Rule No. File Date Effective  

Date 

60FF1-5.009 7/21/2016 **/**/**** 

64B8-10.003 12/9/2015 **/**/**** 

69L-7.020 12/15/2017 **/**/**** 

69L-7.501 12/15/2017 **/**/**** 

 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Estimated Capacity 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN by the State Board of 

Administration of Florida (the “Board”) of the estimated 

borrowing capacity, estimated claims-paying capacity, and 

projected balance of the Florida Hurricane Catastrophe Fund 

(the “Fund”) as of December 31, 2018, in compliance with the 

requirements of subparagraph 215.555(4)(c)2., Florida 

Statutes. These estimates relate to the 2018-2019 

Reimbursement Contract Year. For May 2018, based on an 

estimated borrowing capacity of $8.2 billion, $14.1 billion 

projected year-end cash balance, and projected $1.0 billion of 

reinsurance, the Fund’s total estimated claims-paying capacity 

over the next 12 months is $23.3 billion, which amount exceeds 

the $17 billion limit on the Fund’s single-season obligations as 

specified by subparagraph 215.555(4)(c)1., Florida Statutes, for 

the contract year. The borrowing capacity estimate is dependent 

on many factors, such as the credit rating of the debt, the amount 

of emergency assessments available for funding the debt, the 

limitations or constraints of the financial markets to absorb 

potential debt issuances, the time necessary to access such 

markets, and the existing level of interest rates at the time of 

issuance. The projected year-end balance available for 

reimbursement of participating insurers on December 31, 2018, 

is estimated to be $14.1 billion, which represents the amount of 

assets available to pay claims resulting from Covered Events 

which may occur during the June 1, 2018 through May 31, 2019 

Contract Year, not including any bond proceeds. The estimated 

claims-paying capacity consists of the estimated borrowing 

capacity, the projected year-end cash balance, and reinsurance. 

Additional liquidity is provided by $2.2 billion of proceeds 

from the outstanding Series 2013A and Series 2016A pre-event 

bonds. Greater detail may be obtained in the May 17, 2018 

Claims-Paying Capacity Estimates Report, which can be found 

on the Fund’s website at www.sbafla.com/fhcf/ under “Bonding 

Program.” The Board recognizes that its good faith estimates 

are being made while volatile global financial market 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
http://www.sbafla.com/fhcf/Bonding


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 102, May 24, 2018 

 

2510 

conditions exist, and therefore, changing market conditions can 

dramatically impact the Fund’s actual claims-paying capacity 

either positively or negatively. Current conditions may or may 

not be the same if and when the Board determines that it is 

necessary to issue revenue bonds. Participating insurers who 

rely on these estimates should recognize the potential impact 

the financial market can have on the Board’s claims-paying 

ability and plan accordingly. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Nursing 

Emergency Action 

On May 23, 2018, the State Surgeon General issued an Order 

of Emergency Restriction Order with regard to the Lori Ann 

Fong-Folden, R.N., License # RN 9267026. This Emergency 

Restriction Order was predicated upon the State Surgeon 

General’s findings of an immediate and serious danger to the 

public health, safety and welfare pursuant to Sections 

456.073(8) and 120.60(6) Florida Statutes (2017). The State 

Surgeon General determined that this summary procedure was 

fair under the circumstances, in that there was no other method 

available to adequately protect the public. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Nursing 

Emergency Action 

On May 23, 2018, the State Surgeon General issued an Order 

of Emergency Restriction Order with regard to the certification 

of Crystiana M. Hunter, C.N.A.,Certificate # CNA 342846. 

This Emergency Restriction Order was predicated upon the 

State Surgeon General’s findings of an immediate and serious 

danger to the public health, safety and welfare pursuant to 

subsections 456.073(8) and 120.60(6) Florida Statutes (2017). 

The State Surgeon General determined that this summary 

procedure was fair under the circumstances, in that there was 

no other method available to adequately protect the public.  

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

Division of Community Development 

Final Order No. DEO-18-036 

In re: A LAND DEVELOPMENT REGULATION  

ADOPTED BY POLK COUNTY, FLORIDA 

ORDINANCE NO. 18-022 

FINAL ORDER 

APPROVING POLK COUNTY ORDINANCE NO. 18-022 

The Department of Economic Opportunity (“Department”) 

hereby issues its Final Order, pursuant to subsection 380.05(6), 

Florida Statutes, approving land development regulations 

adopted by Polk County, Florida, (the “County”) Ordinance No. 

18-022 (the “Ordinance”). 

FINDINGS OF FACT 

1. The Green Swamp Area is designated by section 380.0551, 

Florida Statutes, as an area of critical state concern. The County 

is a local government within the Green Swamp Area of Critical 

State Concern. 

2. The Ordinance was adopted by the County on April 17, 2018, 

and rendered to the Department on April 24, 2018. 

3. The Ordinance amends the County’s Land Development 

Code to amend Section 706 to exempt the collocation of Small 

Wireless Facilities on existing utility poles and residential 

driveways serving four units or less from level 2 review for the 

County’s right-of-way use permits.  The Ordinance also creates 

standards for locating Wireless Support Structures and 

associated Small Wireless Facilities within the County’s rights-

of-way.  The Ordinance amends Chapter 10 of the Land 

Development Code to create definitions for “Collocate” or 

“Collocation,” “Small Wireless Facility,” “Utility Pole,” 

“Wireless Facility,” and “Wireless Support Structure.” 

CONCLUSIONS OF LAW 

4. The Department is required to approve or reject land 

development regulations that are adopted by any local 

government in an area of critical state concern.  See subsection 

380.05(6), Florida Statutes; See also Chapter 28-26, Florida 

Administrative Code.  

5.  “Land development regulations” include local zoning, 

subdivision, building, and other regulations controlling the 

development of land. Subsection 380.031(8), Florida Statutes. 

The regulations adopted by the Ordinance are land development 

regulations.   

6. The Ordinance is consistent with the County’s 

Comprehensive Plan generally, as required by section 

163.3177(1), Florida Statutes, and specifically, Objective 

2.101A and Policy 2.125-D1. 

7. All land development regulations enacted, amended, or 

rescinded within an area of critical state concern must also be 

consistent with the principles for guiding development for that 

area.   See section 380.05(6), Florida Statutes.  The Principles 

for Guiding Development for the Green Swamp Area of Critical 

State Concern are set forth in rule 28-26.003(1), Florida 

Administrative Code.   

8. The Ordinance is consistent with the Principles for Guiding 

Development as a whole, and is not inconsistent with any 

Principles for Guiding Development. 

WHEREFORE, IT IS ORDERED that the Department finds 

that Polk County Ordinance No. 18-022 is consistent with the 

County’s Comprehensive Plan and the Principles for Guiding 

Development for the Green Swamp Area of Critical State 

Concern and is hereby APPROVED.  

This Order becomes effective 21 days after publication in the 

Florida Administrative Register unless a petition is timely filed 

as described in the Notice of Administrative Rights below. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=332
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=332
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1066


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 102, May 24, 2018 

 

2511 

 

DONE AND ORDERED in Tallahassee, Florida. 

James D. Stansbury, Bureau Chief 

Bureau of Community Planning and Growth 

Department of Economic Opportunity 

Notice of administrative rights 

Any person whose substantial interests are affected by this 

order has the opportunity for an administrative proceeding 

pursuant to section 120.569, florida statutes.  

For the required contents of a petition challenging agency 

action, refer to subsections 28-106.104(2), 28-106.201(2), and 

rule 28-106.301, florida administrative code.  

Depending on whether or not material facts are disputed in the 

petition, a hearing will be conducted pursuant to either rule 

120.569 and subsection 120.57(1), florida statutes, or rule 

120.569 and subsection 120.57(2), florida statutes. Mediation is 

not available. 

Any petition must be filed with the agency clerk of the 

department of economic opportunity within 21 calendar days of 

the final order being published in the florida administrative 

register. A petition is filed when it is received by: 

Agency clerk, Department of economic opportunity, Office of 

the general counsel, 107 east madison st., msc 110, Tallahassee, 

florida 32399-4128, Fax 850-921-3230 

You waive the right to any administrative proceeding if you do 

not file a petition with the agency clerk within 21 calendar days 

of the final order being published in the florida administrative 

register. 

CERTIFICATE OF FILING AND SERVICE 

I HEREBY CERTIFY that the original of the foregoing Final 

Order has been filed with the undersigned designated Agency 

Clerk, and that true and correct copies have been furnished to 

the following persons by the methods indicated this 22nd day 

of May, 2018. 

Agency Clerk, Department of Economic Opportunity, 107 East 

Madison Street, MSC 110, Tallahassee, FL  32399-4128 

 

By U.S. Mail: 

Honorable Todd Dantzler  

Chairman, Polk County, Florida 

P.O. Box 9005 

Drawer BC01 

Bartow, FL 33831 

 

John Bohde, Director 

Land Development 

Polk County  

P.O. Box 9005 

Drawer GM03 

Bartow, FL 33831 

Section XIII 

Index to Rules Filed During Preceding 

Week 

NOTE: The above section will be published on Tuesday 

beginning October 2, 2012, unless Monday is a holiday, then it 

will be published on Wednesday of that week. 

 


