
Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

 

5625 

 

Section I 

Notice of Development of Proposed Rules 

and Negotiated Rulemaking 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Agricultural Environmental Services 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

5E-13.031 District or County Use of Funds 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of this rulemaking is 

to eliminate the requirement that state funds be deposited in 

bank accounts separate from local funds. Improved accounting 

software utilized by local governments has proven to provide 

the necessary internal controls. The effect will allow for the 

use of modern accounting software applications to provide 

reasonable assurance of compliance with the provisions of 

laws and rules pertaining to state financial assistance. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Accounting 

practices will be updated to provide continuity of internal 

accounting controls over state aid to local mosquito control. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 388.361 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 388.231, 388.281 FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Ms. 

Kelly Friend, Assistant Director, Division of Agricultural 

Environmental Services, 3125 Conner Boulevard, Ste. E, 

Tallahassee, FL 32399-1650, (850)617-7913, 

Steven.Dwinell@FreshFromFlorida.com 

 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS: 

 

5E-13.031 District or County Use of Funds. 

(1) through (3) No change. 

(4) Upon prior approval from the Department, proceeds 

from sale or rental of property purchased with local funds can 

be deposited and credited to Local funds. 

(5)(4) Insecticide spray material shall not be sold by 

districts or counties without approval from the Department. 

(6)(5) State funds received shall be accounted for 

separately deposited in a separate depository account from 

local funds received. Disbursements shall be made on 

prenumbered checks or warrants drawn on proper depository 

accounts. 

(7)(6) Local and state funds shall be deposited in banks 

designated as depositories of public funds in accordance with 

provisions of Section 658.60, F.S. 

Rulemaking Authority 388.361, F.S. Law Implemented 388.231, 

388.281, F.S. History–New 1-1-77, Formerly 10D-54.31, 10D-

54.031, Amended 3-14-94, 6-10-04, 5-21-14, __________. 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

State Board of Education 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

6A-6.03013 Exceptional Student Educational Eligibility 

for Students Who Are Deaf or Hard-of-

Hearing 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of this rule 

development is to update the language to reflect current 

knowledge in the field. The updates address definitions; 

procedures for referral and student evaluation; and criteria for 

eligibility, re-evaluation and instruction program. The effect of 

these revisions will be consistency with the federal 

requirements and related State Board of Education rules. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: State requirements 

for programs for students with disabilities who are identified 

as deaf and hard-of-hearing. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1003.01, 1003.57, 1003.571 

FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1003.01, 1003.57, 1003.571 FS. 

A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD 

AT THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW: 

DATE AND TIME: December 16, 2015, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Department of Education, 325 West Gaines Street, 

Room 1721, Tallahassee, FL 32399 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Monica 

Verra-Tirado, Ed.D., Chief, Bureau of Exceptional Education 

and Student Services, 325 West Gaines Street, Tallahassee, FL 

32399-0400, (850)245-0475. To comment on this rule 

development, please contact: Cathy Schroeder, Agency Clerk, 

Department of Education, (850)245-9661 or e-mail: 

cathy.schroeder@fldoe.org or go to 

https://app1.fldoe.org/rules/default.aspx 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT: 

https://app1.fldoe.org/rules/default.aspx. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=165
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5E-13.031
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=388.361
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=388.231,%20388.281%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=195
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6A-6.03013
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1003.01
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201003.57
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201003.571
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1003.01
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201003.57
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201003.571
https://app1.fldoe.org/rules/default.aspx


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

5626 

Section II 

Proposed Rules 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Board of Accountancy 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61H1-20.0093 Rules of the Auditor General 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes the rule 

amendment to incorporate by reference the newest version of 

the rules of the Auditor General. 

SUMMARY: The newest version of the rules of the Auditor 

General will be incorporated. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will 

not have an adverse impact on small business or likely 

increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of 

$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the 

implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by 

the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: During discussion of the economic impact of this rule 

at its Board meeting, the Board, based upon the expertise and 

experience of its members, determined that a Statement of 

Estimated Regulatory Costs (SERC) was not necessary and 

that the rule will not require ratification by the Legislature. No 

person or interested party submitted additional information 

regarding the economic impact at that time. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 473.304, 473.315 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 473.315 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Veloria A. Kelly, Division Director, 

Board of Accountancy, 240 NW 76th Drive, Suite A, 

Gainesville, Florida 32607 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

61H1-20.0093 Rules of the Auditor General. 

(1) “Rules of the Auditor General” shall be deemed and 

construed to mean the following Rules of the Auditor General 

of the State of Florida in effect as follows: 
Chapter Title 

10.550 Local Governmental Entity Audits, effective 9/30/2015 9/30/2014 

10.650 Florida Single Audits  Non-profit and For-profit Organizations, 

effective 9/30/2015 9/30/2014 

10.700 Audits of Certain Nonprofit Organizations, effective 6/30/2015 

6/30/2014 

10.800 Audits of District School Boards, effective 6/30/2015 6/30/2014 

10.850 Audits of Charter Schools and Similar Entities, Florida Virtual 

School, and Virtual Instruction Program Providers, effective 

6/30/2015 6/30/2014 

These rules hereby incorporated by reference and are available 

from http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-

04765 or the State of Florida, Auditor General’s Office or 

from its website http://www.myflorida.com/audgen, under the 

Rules and Guidelines section. 

(2) through (6) No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 473.304, 473.315 FS. Law Implemented 

473.315 FS. History–New 10-22-86, Amended 5-22-88, 4-8-90, 4-

21-91, Formerly 21A-20.0093, Amended 9-30-97, 9-29-02, 9-21-10, 

10-9-13, 12-2-14,                                  . 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Board of Accountancy 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Board of Accountancy 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: September 24, 2015 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: October 26, 2015 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=280
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61H1-20.0093
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=473.304
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20473.315%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=473.315%20FS.


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

 

5627 

 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Acupuncture 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

64B1-2.001 Biennial Renewal Fees. 

64B1-2.0015 Delinquent Fee. 

64B1-2.004 Application Fee. 

64B1-2.005 Examination Fee. 

64B1-2.006 Re-examination Fee. 

64B1-2.009 Initial Continuing Education Provider 

Registration Fee. 

64B1-2.0095 Continuing Education Provider Registration 

Renewal Fee. 

64B1-2.010 Fees for Inactive Status and Change to 

Active Status. 

64B1-2.011 Initial Biennial License Fee. 

64B1-2.012 Endorsement Fee. 

64B1-2.014 Fee for Wall Certificate or Duplicate 

License. 

64B1-2.016 Unauthorized Practice Fee. 

64B1-2.018 Retired Status and Reactivation of Retired 

Status License; Fees. 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To update fees; consolidate all fee 

rules into one and repeal resulting obsolete, unnecessary 

and/or duplicative rules. 

SUMMARY: Update fees; consolidate all fee rules into one 

and repeal resulting obsolete, unnecessary and/or duplicative 

rules. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COST AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The agency has determined that this will 

not have an adverse impact on small business or likely 

increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of 

$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the 

implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by 

the agency. The agency has determined that the proposed rule 

is not expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: During discussion of the economic impact of Rule 

64B1-2.001, F.A.C., at its Board meeting and based upon the 

expertise and experience of its members, the Board 

determined that a SERC was not necessary and that the rule 

will not require ratification by the Legislature. Additionally, 

repealing the remaining rules will have no effect, because 

those will become obsolete, unnecessary and/or duplicative. 

No person or interested party submitted additional information 

regarding the economic impact at that time. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 120.53(1), 456. 025(2), (10), 

456.036(3), (4), (8), (15), 456.065, 457.104, 457.105(2)(d) , 

457.107(1), (3) , 457.108(2) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456. 025(2), (7), 456.036(2), (3), (4), 

(8), (12), 457.105(2)(d), 457.107(1), 457.108(2), (3) FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Claudia Kemp, Executive Director, 

Board of Acupuncture, 4030 Esplanade Way, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399, (850)245-4588 

 

THE TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

64B1-2.001 Biennial Renewal Fees. 

(1) The initial application fee is $200. 

(2) The initial license fee is $200. 

(3)(1) The biennial renewal fee for an active license is 

shall be $275.00. 

(4)(2) The biennial renewal fee for an inactive license is 

shall be $150.00. 

(5) The application fee for inactive status is $200. 

(6) The application fee for retired license is $50. 

(7) Change of status fee for any time other than renewal is 

$200. 

(8) The fee for reactivation of a license is $300. 

(9) The deliquency fee is $200. 

(10)  The initial continuing education provider 

registration fee is $100. 

(11) The biennial continuing education provider 

registration fee is $100. 

(12) The fee for a duplicate wall certificate or license is 

$25. 

(13) The fee for certification of a public record is $25.  

Rulemaking Authority 456.025, 456.036(3), 457.104, 457.107(1),(2), 

457.108(2) FS. Law Implemented 456.025, 456.036(3), 457.105, 

457.107(1), 457.108(2) FS. History–New 4-5-84, Amended 11-19-

85, Formerly 21AA-2.01, Amended 12-21-87, 7-16-89, Formerly 

21AA-2.001, 61F1-2.001, Amended 10-25-95, Formerly 59M-2.001, 

Amended 5-8-00, 9-23-03, 4-6-14,            . 

 

64B1-2.0015 Delinquent Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 456.036 FS. Law Implemented 456.036 FS. 

History–New 10-25-95, Amended 2-21-96, Formerly 59M-2.0015, 

Amended 6-8-00, Repealed                    . 

 

64B1-2.004 Application Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 457.104, 457.105(2)(d) FS. Law Implemented 

457.105(2)(d) FS. History–New 8-8-84, Amended 11-19-85, 

Formerly 21AA-2.04, Amended 12-21-87, Formerly 21AA-2.004, 

61F1-2.004, 59M-2.004, Amended 4-6-14, Repealed         . 

 

file://OAGNT53/gateway/department.asp%3fid=64
file://OAGNT53/gateway/organization.asp%3fid=300


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

5628 

64B1-2.005 Examination Fee. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 120.53(1), 457.104, 457.105(2)(d) 

FS. Law Implemented 457.105(2)(d) FS. History–New 8-8-84, 

Amended 11-19-85, Formerly 21AA-2.05, Amended 12-21-87, 6-27-

90, Formerly 21AA-2.005, 61F1-2.005, Amended 9-17-95, 11-21-95, 

Formerly 59M-2.005, Amended 4-5-99. Repealed                    . 

 

64B1-2.006 Re-examination Fee. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 457.104, 457.105(2)(d) FS. Law 

Implemented 457.105(2)(d) FS. History–New 8-8-84, Formerly 

21AA-2.06, Amended 2-2-86, 12-21-87, 3-11-92, Formerly 21AA-

2.006, 61F1-2.006, Amended 9-17-95, 11-21-95, Formerly 59M-

2.006, Amended 4-5-99, 1-1-04, Repealed                    . 

 

64B1-2.009 Initial Continuing Education Provider 

Registration Fee. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 456.025, 457.104, 457.107(3) FS. 

Law Implemented 456.025, 457.107(3) FS. History–New 5-12-87, 

Amended 9-15-92, Formerly 21AA-2.009, 61F1-2.009, 59M-2.009, 

Amended 3-21-04, Repealed                    . 

 

64B1-2.0095 Continuing Education Provider Registration 

Renewal Fee. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 456.025, 457.104, 457.107(3) FS. 

Law Implemented 456.025, 457.107(3) FS. History–New 3-21-04, 

Repealed                    . 

 

64B1-2.010 Fees for Inactive Status and Change to Active 

Status. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 456.036(3), (4), (8), 457.104, 

457.108(2) FS. Law Implemented 456.036(3), (4), (8), 457.108(2) 

FS. History–New 5-12-87, Amended 12-21-87, 8-6-89, Formerly 

21AA-2.010, 61F1-2.010, Amended 10-25-95, Formerly 59M-2.010, 

Amended 5-8-00, 1-26-06, Repealed                    . 

 

64B1-2.011 Initial Biennial License Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 457.104, 457.105(2)(d) FS.  Law 

Implemented 457.105(2)(d) FS. History–New 5-12-87, Amended 12-

21-87, Formerly 21AA-2.011, Amended 10-17-93, Formerly 61F1-

2.011, 59M-2.011, Amended 4-7-98, 4-6-14, Repealed                . 

 

64B1-2.012 Endorsement Fee. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 457.104, 457.105(2)(d) FS. Law 

Implemented 457.105(2)(d) FS. History–New 10-1-89, Formerly 

21AA-2.012, 61F1-2.012, 59M-2.012, Repealed                    . 

 

64B1-2.014 Fee for Wall Certificate or Duplicate License. 

Rulemaking Authority 456.025(2), (10), 457.104 FS. Law 

Implemented 456.025(2), (7) FS. History–New 11-26-90, Amended 

3-22-92, Formerly 21AA-2.014, Amended 10-17-93, Formerly 61F1-

2.014, 59M-2.014, Amended 5-8-00, Repealed                    . 

 

64B1-2.016 Unauthorized Practice Fee. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 456.065 FS. Law Implemented 

456.065 FS. History–New 10-17-93, Formerly 61F1-2.016, 59M-

2.016, Amended 10-15-97, 10-22-02, Repealed                    . 

 

64B1-2.018 Retired Status and Reactivation of Retired 

Status License; Fees. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority  456.036(15), 457.104, 457.108 FS. 

Law Implemented  456.036(2), (4), (12), 457.108 FS. History–New 

1-26-06, Repealed                    . 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Board of Acupuncture 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Board of Acupuncture 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: September 18, 2015 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: October 27, 2015  

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Acupuncture 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

64B1-7.001 Biennial Renewal of License. 

64B1-7.0025 Reactivation of Retired License. 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT:  To adopt new Rule 64B1-7.0025, 

F.A.C., outlining requirements for reactivation of retired 

license by partially incorporating Rule 64B1-2.018, F.A.C. 

(which is being repealed), and repeal remaining rule as it is 

will become partially obsolete and partially duplicative. 

SUMMARY:  Adopt new rule outlining requirements for 

reactivation of retired license. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COST AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The agency has determined that this will 

not have an adverse impact on small business or likely 

increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of 

$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the 

implementation of the rule.  A SERC has not been prepared by 

the agency.  The agency has determined that the proposed rule 

is not expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein:  During discussion of the economic impact of Rule 

64B1-7.0025, F.A.C., at its meeting and based upon the 

expertise and experience of its members, the Board 

determined that a SERC was not necessary and that the rule 

will not require ratification by the Legislature.  Additionally, 

repealing the remaining rule will have no effect, because it 

will become obsolete, unnecessary and/or duplicative.  No 

person or interested party submitted additional information 

regarding the economic impact at that time. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

file://OAGNT53/gateway/department.asp%3fid=64
file://OAGNT53/gateway/organization.asp%3fid=300


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

 

5629 

 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY:  456.013, 456.036, 457.104, 

457.107, 457.108 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED:  456.013, 456.033, 456.036, (12), 

457.107, 457.108 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS:  Claudia Kemp, Executive Director, 

Board of Acupuncture, 4030 Esplanade Way, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399, (850)245-4588 

 

THE TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

64B1-7.001 Biennial Renewal of License. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 456.013, 456.036, 457.104, 457.107, 

457.108 FS. Law Implemented 456.013, 456.033, 456.036, 457.107, 

457.108 FS. History–New 5-24-87, Formerly 21AA-7.001, 61F1-

7.001, Amended 10-25-95, 1-16-97, Formerly 59M-7.001, Amended 

10-15-97, 4-25-00, 1-7-03, 5-30-07, Repealed                    . 

 

64B1-7.0025 Reactivation of Retired License. 

A licensee may reactivate a retired status license subject to the 

following requirements: 

(1) Payment of the reactivation fee, which shall be the 

same amount as the renewal fee for an active status licensee 

under these rules for each biennial licensure period in which 

the licensee was in retired status; 

(2) Demonstrating satisfaction of the continuing education 

requirements of Rule 64B1-7.0015, F.A.C. (effective 5/1/13) – 

which is incorporated herein by reference and may be obtained 

from the Board office or at 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-06173 

– for each licensure biennial period in which the licensee was 

in retired status. 

Rulemaking Authority 457.104 FS. Law Implemented 456.036(12) 

FS. History- New             . 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:  

Board of Acupuncture 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE:  Board of Acupuncture 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD:  September 18, 2015 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR:  October 27, 2015 

 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Nursing 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

64B9-13.001 Purpose 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: This rule is being repealed 

because it is unnecessary. 

SUMMARY: Repeal Rule. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will 

not have an adverse impact on small business or likely 

increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of 

$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the 

implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by 

the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: During discussion of the economic impact of this rule 

at its Board meeting, the Board, based upon the expertise and 

experience of its members and the substance of the repealed 

rule, determined that a Statement of Estimated Regulatory 

Costs (SERC) was not necessary because the rule does not 

impose additional rights, obligations, or duties on any persons 

or businesses, and that the rule will not require ratification by 

the Legislature. No person or interested party submitted 

additional information regarding the economic impact at that 

time. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 464.022(11), 464.006 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 464.022(11) FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Joe R. Baker, Jr., Executive Director, 

Board of Nursing, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C02, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399; Joe.Baker@flhealth.gov 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

64B9-13.001 Purpose. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 464.022(11), 464.006 FS. Law 

Implemented 464.022(11) FS. History–New 1-10-89, Formerly 21O-

20.001, 61F7-13.001, 59S-13.001, Repealed                      . 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Board of Nursing 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=332
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B9-13.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=464.022(11),%20464.006%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=464.022(11)%20FS


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

5630 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Board of Nursing 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: October 9, 2015 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

School Psychology 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

64B21-500.002 Application Form Required for Licensure 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Department has determined 

that this rule amendment is necessary to implement section 

456.0635, F.S. 

SUMMARY: The application will be amended to require 

applicant disclosure of certain criminal background 

information. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will 

not have an adverse impact on small business or likely 

increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of 

$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the 

implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by 

the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: Based on the SERC checklist, this rulemaking will not 

have an adverse impact or regulatory costs in excess of $1 

million within five years as established in s. 120.541(2)(a), 

F.S. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 490.015 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 490.005(2), 490.006 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Allen Hall, Executive Director, Office 

of School Psychology, (850)245-4373, 4052 Bald Cypress 

Way, Bin #C05, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3255 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

64B21-500.002 Application Form Required for 

Licensure. 

Any person desiring a license to practice school psychology 

either through endorsement or by examination shall apply to 

the Department of Health. The application shall be made on 

incorporated by reference form DH-MQA 1067, (07/15 09/11) 

Application for School Psychology Licensure, at 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-

XXXXX, which also can be obtained from the Department of 

Health, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin C05, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-3255 or at 

http://www.doh.state.fl.us/mqa/schoolpsych. 

Rulemaking Authority 490.015 FS. Law Implemented 490.005(2), 

490.006 FS. History–New 4-13-82, Amended 2-11-85, Formerly 

21U-500.02, Amended 6-21-92, Formerly 21U-500.002, 61E9-

500.002, Amended 11-13-02, 5-13-09, 3-2-10, 3-26-12, _________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Allen Hall, Executive Director, Office of School Psychology 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: John H. Armstrong, MD, FACS, Surgeon 

General and Secretary 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: 11/3/2015 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: 9/2/2015 

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES 

Family Safety and Preservation Program 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

65C-14.062 Medical Care in All Runaway Shelters 

65C-14.070 Specific Rules for Maternity Residences 

65C-14.071 Admission and Planning 

65C-14.073 Discharge 

65C-14.076 Orientation 

65C-14.077 Case Record 

65C-14.081 Health Care 

65C-14.082 Apparel and Allowance 

65C-14.083 Personnel 

65C-14.084 Job Functions and Staff Qualifications 

65C-14.085 Staff Development 

65C-14.091 Administrative Organization 

65C-14.092 Course Admission and Planning 

65C-14.093 Medical History 

65C-14.094 Program Orientation 

65C-14.095 Case Record 

65C-14.097 Food Service 

65C-14.098 Health 

65C-14.103 Personnel Practices 

65C-14.105 Training 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect are to 

repeal duplicative rules. 

SUMMARY: Rules 65C-14.062, .070-.071, .073, .076-.077, 

.081-.085, .091-.095, .097-.098, .103, .105, F.A.C., will be 

repealed. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=313
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B21-500.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=490.015
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=490.005(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20490.006%20F.S.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=342
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-14.062
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-14.070
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-14.071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-14.073
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-14.076
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-14.077
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-14.081
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-14.082
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-14.083
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-14.084
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-14.085
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-14.091
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-14.092
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-14.093
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-14.094
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-14.095
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-14.097
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-14.098
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-14.103
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-14.105


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

 

5631 

 

not have an adverse impact on small business or likely 

increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of 

$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the 

implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by 

the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: The Department used a checklist to conduct an 

economic analysis and determine if there is an adverse impact 

or regulatory costs associated with this rule that exceeds the 

criteria in section 120.541(2)(a), F.S. Based upon this analysis, 

the Department has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 409.175 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 409.175 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Jodi Abramowitz. Jodi can be reached 

at (850)717-4189 or Jodi.Abramowitz@myflfamilies.com 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

65C-14.062 Medical Care in All Runaway Shelters. 

Specific Authority 409.175 FS. Law Implemented 409.175 FS. 

History–New 7-1-87, Formerly 10M-9.067, Repealed___.  

 

65C-14.070 Specific Rules for Maternity Residences. 

Specific Authority 409.175 FS. Law Implemented 409.175 FS. 

History–New 7-1-87, Formerly 10M-9.070., Repealed___.   

 

65C-14.071 Admission and Planning. 

Specific Authority 409.175 FS. Law Implemented 409.175 FS. 

History–New 7-1-87, Formerly 10M-9.071, Repealed___.. 

 

65C-14.073 Discharge. 

Specific Authority 409.175 FS. Law Implemented 409.175 FS. 

History–New 7-1-87, Formerly 10M-9.073, Repealed___.  

 

65C-14.076 Orientation. 

Specific Authority 409.175 FS. Law Implemented 409.175 FS. 

History–New 7-1-87, Formerly 10M-9.076., Repealed___.  

 

65C-14.077 Case Record. 

Specific Authority 409.175 FS. Law Implemented 409.175 FS. 

History–New 7-1-87, Formerly 10M-9.077, Repealed___. 

 

65C-14.081 Health Care. 

Specific Authority 409.175 FS. Law Implemented 409.175 FS. 

History–New 7-1-87, Formerly 10M-9.082, Repealed___.  

 

65C-14.082 Apparel and Allowance. 

Specific Authority 409.175 FS. Law Implemented 409.175 FS. 

History–New 7-1-87, Formerly 10M-9.083, Repealed___.  

 

65C-14.083 Personnel. 

Specific Authority 409.175 FS. Law Implemented 409.175 FS. 

History–New 7-1-87, Formerly 10M-9.084, Repealed___.  

 

65C-14.084 Job Functions and Staff Qualifications. 

Specific Authority 409.175 FS. Law Implemented 409.175 FS. 

History–New 7-1-87, Formerly 10M-9.085, Repealed___.  

 

65C-14.085 Staff Development. 

Specific Authority 409.175 FS. Law Implemented 409.175 FS. 

History–New 7-1-87, Formerly 10M-9.086, Repealed___.  

 

65C-14.091 Administrative Organization. 

Specific Authority 409.175 FS. Law Implemented 409.175 FS. 

History–New 7-1-87, Amended 8-3-88, Formerly 10M-9.088, 

Repealed___.  

 

65C-14.092 Course Admission and Planning. 

Specific Authority 409.175 FS. Law Implemented 409.175 FS. 

History–New 7-1-87, Amended 8-3-88, Formerly 10M-9.089. 

Repealed 

 

65C-14.093 Medical History. 

Specific Authority 409.175 FS. Law Implemented 409.175 FS. 

History–New 7-1-87, Formerly 10M-9.090, Repealed___.  

 

65C-14.094 Program Orientation. 

Specific Authority 409.175 FS. Law Implemented 409.175 FS. 

History–New 7-1-87, Formerly 10M-9.091, Repealed___.  

 

65C-14.095 Case Record. 

Specific Authority 409.175 FS. Law Implemented 409.175 FS. 

History–New 7-1-87, Formerly 10M-9.092, Repealed___.  

 

65C-14.097 Food Service. 

Specific Authority 409.175 FS. Law Implemented 409.175 FS. 

History–New 7-1-87, Formerly 10M-9.094, Repealed___.  

 

65C-14.098 Health. 

Specific Authority 409.175 FS. Law Implemented 409.175 FS. 

History–New 7-1-87, Formerly 10M-9.095, Repealed___.  

 

65C-14.103 Personnel Practices. 

Specific Authority 409.175 FS. Law Implemented 409.175 FS. 

History–New 7-1-87, Formerly 10M-9.100, Repealed___.  

 

65C-14.105 Training. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=409.175%20F.S.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=409.175%20F.S.


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

5632 

Specific Authority 409.175 FS. Law Implemented 409.175 FS. 

History–New 7-1-87, Formerly 10M-9.102, Repealed___.  

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Jodi Abramowitz 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Mike Carroll 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: November 14, 2015 

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES 

Family Safety and Preservation Program 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

65C-32.001 Definitions 

65C-32.002 Parenting Course Delivery 

65C-32.003 Required Components of the Parenting 

Course 

65C-32.004 Parenting Course Evaluation 

65C-32.005 Parenting Course Approval 

65C-32.006 Parenting Course Approval Process 

65C-32.007 Complaints 

65C-32.008 Revocation of Course Approval 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: Section 61.21(3)(e), F.S., requires 

the Department to adopt rules to administer the Parent 

Education and Family Stabilization Course. The Department 

intends to amend several rules within Chapter 65C-32, F.A.C. 

to accomplish the following tasks: 1) Require all parenting 

courses to be skills-based and rooted in evidence; 2) Require 

providers to submit to the Department the resumes of all 

instructors; and 3) Clarify the approval process. 

SUMMARY: The amendments to Rules 65C-32.001-.008, 

F.A.C., rename the chapter title; require all courses to be titled 

“Parent Education and Family Stabilization Course”; require 

an end of course test; require a formal course guidebook; limit 

course approval to three years; and require documentation that 

the curriculum is evidence-based or research-informed. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will 

not have an adverse impact on small business or likely 

increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of 

$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the 

implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by 

the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: : The Department used a checklist to conduct an 

economic analysis and determine if there is an adverse impact 

or regulatory costs associated with this rule that exceeds the 

criteria in section 120.541(2)(a), F.S. Based upon this analysis, 

the Department has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 61.21(3)(e) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 61.21(2), (3) FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Jodi Abramowitz. Jodi can be reached 

at (850)717-4189 or Jodi.Abramowitz@myflfamilies.com 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

65C-32.001 Definitions 

(1) “Complaint” means an allegation of a violation of 

Section 61.21(2)-(3), F.S., and the rules adopted pursuant to 

Chapter Rule 65C-32, F.A.C. 

(2) “Department” means the Department of Children and 

Families Family Services. 

(3) “Distance learning” means instruction provided 

through correspondence or via the Internet, pursuant to Rule 

65C-32.002, F.A.C. 

(4) “Evidence-based” means that the curriculum has been 

studied by independent researchers using sound methodology, 

and in peer-reviewed publications consistently found to be 

effective at increasing knowledge or improving parenting or 

child outcomes in multiple studies across a variety of 

populations. 

(5) “Formal Course Guidebook” means a guidebook 

containing the background and objectives of the course, 

instructional methods and lesson plans, materials for 

distribution, and evaluation tools including educational 

outcomes and client satisfaction. 

(6)(4) “Instructor” means the individual(s) qualified to 

provide instruction in a live classroom setting or answer 

participant questions regarding online or correspondence 

course content. 

(7)(5) “Letter of Non-Compliance” means a written 

notification advising the provider of the specified statute or 

rule violation(s). 

(8)(6) “Parenting Course” means the Parent Education 

and Family Stabilization Course designated pursuant to 

Section 61.21(2)(a), F.S., to provide information to parents as 

that information relates to court actions between the parents 

involving custody, care, time-sharing visitation, and support of 

a child or children. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=342
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-32.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-32.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-32.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-32.004
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-32.005
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-32.006
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=61.21(3)(e),%20F.S
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=61.21(2)


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

 

5633 

 

(9)(7) “Provider” means an individual or legal entity 

qualified to develop and implement the Parent Education and 

Family Stabilization Course meeting the qualifications for 

approval pursuant to Chapter 65C-32, F.A.C. 

(10) “Research-informed” means that the curriculum is 

based on a review of research findings related to post-divorce 

adjustment, co-parenting and the effects of divorce on 

children, including abuse and neglect. 

(11)(8) “Revocation” means withdrawal of approval of a 

parenting course. 

(12)(9) “Verified finding” means to substantiate a 

complaint of non-compliance with Section 61.21, F.S., or the 

rules in this chapter. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 61.21(3)(e) FS. Law Implemented 

61.21(2), (3) FS. History–New 11-25-07.  Amended___. 

 

65C-32.002 Parenting Course Delivery. 

(1) A parenting course shall be a minimum of four (4) 

hours of course instruction, including the time required for 

instruction, participant exercises and course evaluation. Online 

and correspondence courses shall have a mechanism that 

prevents participants from completing the course in less than 

four (4) hours. 

(2) The conveyance of the specific live parenting course 

content shall include a variety of teaching methods, such as 

lectures, group discussions, role-plays, videotapes, or other 

instructional activities. 

(3) Each online or correspondence provider offering a 

parenting course shall incorporate a means for participants to 

communicate with the course instructor for questions. 

(4) The provider(s) of a parenting course and the 

instructor of a classroom live parenting course and the 

instructor of an online or correspondence parenting course 

who is designated and available to communicate with 

participants shall possess the following qualifications: 

(a) Bachelor’s degree in counseling, social work, 

psychology, education or related field and have at a minimum 

two (2) years’ experience in dealing with family, parenting, 

and divorce related issues; or 

(b) Has a minimum of four (4) years related work 

experience in dealing with family, parenting, and divorce-

related issues. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 61.21(3)(e) FS. Law Implemented 

61.21(2) FS. History–New 11-25-07. Amended____. 

 

65C-32.003 Required Components of the Parenting 

Course. 

(1) All parenting courses developed pursuant to the 

requirements of Section 61.21, F.S. and Chapter 65C-32, 

F.A.C., shall be named the “Parent Education and Family 

Stabilization Course.” 

(2)(1) The provider of a parenting course shall provide to 

each participant a printed disclaimer in written form which 

states the following: “The components of the parenting course 

are intended for educational purposes only. The presentation 

of this material is not intended to constitute mental health 

therapy, give information on specific mental health disorders 

nor medications to treat mental health disorders. Participants 

are encouraged to discuss specific mental health questions 

with a licensed mental health therapist of their choice.” 

(3)(2) The legal component of the parenting course shall 

provide general Florida family law principles. The 

presentation of this material is not intended to constitute legal 

advice and the course material must direct the participant to 

consult with a licensed attorney for answers to specific legal 

questions. 

(4)(3) The components required for the Parent Education 

and Family Stabilization Course parenting courses for 

divorcing parents in the state of Florida shall include, but are 

not limited to the following: 

(a) Divorce as Loss. This component shall include a 

recognition of divorce as the loss of the current family 

structure and processes experienced by adults and children in 

working through loss. In addition, a distinction shall be made 

between loss of the current family structure and the continuing 

parental role; 

(b) Permanency of Parental Role/Shared Parenting. This 

component shall include information about how children are 

positively impacted by a continuing relationship with both 

parents and the types of support children need from both 

parents; 

(c) Developmental Stages of Childhood. This component 

shall include information on the developmental stages of 

childhood, as well as how a divorce may impact development, 

what parents can do to minimize the impact of the divorce, 

and when to seek additional help for a child experiencing 

problems; 

(d) Communicating with Children iIn a Divorce Situation. 

This component shall include information about discussing 

divorce-related issues with children in reference to the 

developmental stage of the child; 

(e) Communicating with the Other Parent. This 

component shall include the negative impact of a parent 

expressing anger toward the other parent in front of the 

children, the benefits to children of keeping them out of the 

middle of parental conflict, and how to establish a relationship 

with the other parent which shall minimize the children's 

exposure to parental conflict; 

(f) Abuse. This component shall include information on 

the power and control dynamics of domestic violence and the 

statewide toll-free domestic violence hotline telephone 

number where services may be accessed. An explanation of 



Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

5634 

child abuse and neglect and the statutory mandate to report 

such incidences to the Florida Child Abuse Hotline must also 

be included, in addition to the penalties for false reporting; 

(g) Legal Concepts. This component shall include general 

information about Florida family law, including references to 

statutory definitions as they relate to court issues involving 

divorcing parents with minor children and financial 

responsibilities to the child(ren); and 

(h) Parenting Time. This component shall include 

information about the benefits to children of maintaining a 

stable and consistent relationship with both parents, 

suggestions about how to develop a parenting plan, and 

effective communication between the parents about parenting 

time. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 61.21(3)(e) FS. Law Implemented 

61.21(2) FS. History–New 11-25-07.  Amended____. 

 

65C-32.004 Parenting Course Evaluation. 

(1) Each parenting course shall may include an end of 

course test designed to demonstrate a demonstration of the 

level of comprehension of the learning objectives by the 

participants following the conclusion of the training. 

(2) A certificate of completion shall be distributed to each 

participant who completes a four (4) hour minimum Parent 

Education and Family Stabilization Course and receives a 

score of at least 75% on the end of course test. The certificate 

of completion shall include the date the parent began the 

course and the date the parent finished the course. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 61.21(3)(e) FS. Law Implemented 

61.21(2) FS. History–New 11-25-07.  Amended____. 

 

65C-32.005 Parenting Course Approval. 

(1) To ensure the legislative intent is maintained, Eeach 

applicant seeking approval of a Parent Education and Family 

Stabilization parenting course shall submit a formal course 

guidebook and attachments the following documentation to 

the Department of Children and Families, Office of Child 

Welfare, for review.   

(a) The formal course guidebook shall include: 

(a)  Letter of Introduction; 

1.(b) Course components pursuant to Rule 65C-32.003, 

F.A.C.; 

2.(c) Course lLearning oObjectives; 

3.(d) All course materials, including instructor's manuals 

and videos; 

4.(e) Definitions of kKey tTerms. The key terms include 

legal and mental health terms to be introduced in the a 

parenting course;. 

5. End of course test;  

6.(f) References. The provider of a parenting course shall 

include Aa list of resources or a bibliography to reference the 

source(s) of information in of the course content; and a list of 

resource(s) for the divorcing parents and their minor children 

which is beyond the scope of the course. 

(g) Accessibility. The course provider shall provide a 

means for the department to access their course for the 

approval process; 

(h) Communication. Each distance learning provider shall 

submit to the department its means of communicating with the 

participant to answer questions or interact with the participant. 

(i) Instructional Techniques. This requirement requires a 

list of all instructional techniques implemented by a provider 

or instructor; 

(j) Language. This requirement shall include availability 

of different languages in which the course is offered; 

(k) Registration Information. This requirement shall 

include course name, delivery sites of the course, address and 

phone number of the provider, and web-site address if 

available; 

7.(l) Evaluation form. The provider may provide an a 

copy of the evaluation form for participants upon completion 

of the parenting course. If an evaluation form is provided, it 

shall be included in the formal course guidebook; and 

(m) Indigent status fees. This requirement shall include a 

means for indigent divorcing parents to complete their course, 

such as scholarships, acceptance of court waivers, and sliding 

fee scales if available; and 

8.(n) Resource list. A list of available resources in and 

around the community that is furnished to each course 

participant. 

(b) The attachments shall include:  

1. Signed letter of introduction on letterhead; 

2. Documentation that the curriculum is evidence-based 

or research-informed; 

3. Resumes.  The provider shall submit the resumes of all 

instructors.  Providers shall submit to the Department a cover 

letter and the resume of any instructor hired after initial 

approval of the course.  The cover letter and resume shall be 

submitted within seven (7) business days of hire; 

4. Accessibility. For online courses, the course provider 

shall provide a means for the Department to access their 

course for the approval process; 

5. Communication. Each distance learning provider shall 

submit to the Department its means of communicating with 

the participant to answer questions or interact with the 

participant; 

6. Instructional Techniques. A list of all instructional 

techniques used during the presentation of the course by a 

provider or instructor; 

7. Language. Information regarding the availability of 

different languages in which the course is offered; 



Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

 

5635 

 

8. Registration Information. This requirement shall 

include course name, address, phone number, and email 

address of the provider, and website address if available; 

9. Amount charged to participants for taking the course; 

and 

10. Indigent status fees. This requirement shall include a 

means for indigent parents to complete their course, such as 

scholarships, acceptance of court waivers, and sliding fee 

scales if available. 

(2) Currently approved parenting courses must provide 

proof of compliance with Rules 65C-32.003 through 65C-

32.005, F.A.C., within six (6) months of the effective date of 

these rules. Failure to provide proof of compliance within six 

(6) months of the effective date of these rules shall result in 

revocation of course approval. 

(3) Providers shall submit to the Department an updated 

formal course guidebook or updated attachments when any 

information provided to the Department for initial approval 

changes.  An updated formal course guidebook or updated 

attachments shall be submitted within seven (7) business days 

of the change. 

(4) Parenting course approval is valid for three (3) years.   

 (2) The department is under no obligation to accept a 

packet for approval of a parenting course advertised as 

“Approved by the Department” before department approval 

has been granted. 

(3) The provider shall provide documentation of the 

approval requirements pursuant to Rules 65C-32.002 and 65C-

32.003, F.A.C., at each delivery site. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 61.21(3)(e) FS. Law Implemented 

61.21(3) FS. History–New 11-25-07. Amended___. 

 

65C-32.006 Parenting Course Approval Process. 

(1) The approval process: 

(a) The Ddepartment shall notify the provider via letter or 

email within five (5) working days of receipt of the 

application packet, either in writing or personally; 

(b) The Ddepartment shall review the packet within 30 

business working days of notification to the applicant; 

(c) After a review of the packet, the Ddepartment shall 

notify the applicant whether the course is approved or whether 

additional information is needed; of the determination of 

approval or denial of approval of a course or course provider; 

(d) The applicant shall have 90 calendar days to provide 

the additional information make the specified corrections 

necessary for approval of a course; 

(e) If the additional information is provided within 90 

calendar days, the Department shall make a final 

determination on approval of the course.  If the additional 

information is not provided within 90 calendar days, the 

Department shall return the application packet with a letter 

indicating that the course is not approved. The applicant shall 

have the opportunity to resubmit completed packets and begin 

the process over after corrections are completed. 

(2) The Department shall approve all applications that 

meet the criteria set forth in Section 61.21(2), F.S., and rules 

65C-32.002-.005, F.A.C. 

(2) The department shall deem as approved all Parent 

Education and Family Stabilization Courses submitted and 

approved prior to the effective date of Chapter 65C-32, F.A.C. 

The exception is any Parent Education and Family 

Stabilization Course which has had its approval status 

revoked. 

(3) The notification of Department approval shall be 

included in all course materials. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 61.21(3)(e) FS. Law Implemented 

61.21(3) FS. History–New 11-25-07.  Amended____ 

 

65C-32.007 Complaints. 

(1) All complaints shall be in writing to the Ddepartment 

and shall include the following information: 

(a) Date of the alleged violation of Section 61.21, F.S., or 

the rules in this chapter; 

(b) Name of the parenting course; 

(c) Name of the provider or lead instructor of the course; 

and 

(d) Basis and content of the complaint. 

(2) The Ddepartment shall handle the complaints of non-

compliance in the following manner: 

(a) The Ddepartment shall review the rule and designate 

the rule violation(s) as specified in the complaint; 

(b) The Ddepartment shall notify the provider of the 

specified alleged rule violation(s) within five (5) business 

working days of receipt of the complaint; 

(c) The provider shall have the opportunity to respond to 

the alleged rule violation(s) within 15 business days of the 

receipt of notice of the alleged rule violation; and 

(d) The Ddepartment shall determine the validity of the 

alleged rule violation(s) within 45 calendar days of receipt of 

the provider’s response to the complaint. 

(3) A “letter notice of non-compliance” shall be issued to 

the provider of the course if the complaint is founded. 

(4) The provider shall have corrections completed within 

60 calendar days after of the receipt of the “letter notice of 

non-compliance.” to come into compliance. 

(5) Except as otherwise provided in this rule, Pprior to the 

final action of denying, suspending or revoking approval of a 

course, the provider shall have the opportunity to request 

either a formal or informal administrative hearing to show 

cause as to why the action should not be taken. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 61.21(3)(e) FS. Law Implemented 

61.21 FS. History–New 11-25-07. Amended____. 

 



Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

5636 

65C-32.008 Revocation of Course Approval. 

The following shall subject a parenting course to revocation of 

approval: 

(1) A verified finding that course approval or certification 

was obtained by fraudulent means, such as providing 

documentation for approval which was based on false 

documentation; 

(2) A verified finding that a course has been altered in any 

manner, such as course contents or change of course materials, 

that is are contrary to course requirements per Section 

61.21(2), F.S., or rules 65C-32.002-.005, F.A.C. without 

written approval from the department; 

(3) Providing mental health therapy to participants; 

(4) Providing individual legal advice to participants; 

(5) Solicitation of participants from the sessions to 

become private clients or patients; or 

(6) The use of the Department’s Department of Children 

and Family Services past or present logo. 

(7) Failure to comply with Rule 65C-32.005(2)(c), F.A.C. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 61.21(3)(e) FS. Law Implemented 

61.21(3) FS. History–New 11-25-07.  Amended____. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Audrey Ressler 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Mike Carroll 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: November 5, 2015 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: September 29, 2015 

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES 

Agency for Persons with Disabilities 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:  

65G-2.0031 Other Licenses 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of repealing these 

rules is to delete rules that are obsolete, no longer in use and 

written before the Agency’s creation. 

SUMMARY: These obsolete rules are being repealed. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will 

not have an adverse impact on small business or likely 

increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of 

$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the 

implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by 

the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: The information expressly relied upon is the analysis 

conducted by the Agency to determine whether a SERC was 

required and the nature of the rule to be repealed. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 393.067 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 393.067 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 75 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: David De La Paz, Agency Clerk, Agency for 

Persons with Disabilities, 4030 Esplanade Way, Suite 380, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)922-9512 or 

david.delapaz@apdcares.org.. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: David De La Paz, Agency Clerk, 

Agency for Persons with Disabilities, 4030 Esplanade Way, 

Suite 380, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)922-9512 or 

david.delapaz@apdcares.org 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

65G-2.0031 Other Licenses. 

Rulemaking Authority 393.067 FS. Law Implemented 393.067 FS. 
History–New 8-13-78, Amended 4-17-80, Formerly 10F-6.07, 10F-

6.007, 65B-6.007, Repealed _____________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

David De LaPaz, Agency Clerk, Agency for Persons with 

Disabilities, 4030 Esplanade Way, Suite 380, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399, (850)922-9512 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Barbara Palmer 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: November 4, 2015 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=560
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-2.0031
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=393.067
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=393.067


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

 

5637 

 

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES 

Agency for Persons with Disabilities 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

65G-4.0026 Tier Waivers 

65G-4.0027 Tier One Waiver 

65G-4.0028 Tier Two Waiver 

65G-4.0029 Tier Three Waiver 

65G-4.00291 Tier Four Waiver 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of repealing these 

rules is to delete rules that are obsolete and no longer in use 

due to the development and utilization of the iBudget system 

required under s. 393.0662, F.S. These rules are to be repealed 

because they are no longer supported and no funding is 

currently attached to the Tier program. Furthermore, the 

Agency has been directed by the Legislature under Section 21 

of Chapter 2015-222, L.O.F. to continue implementation of 

the iBudget system until the Agency adopts a new allocation 

algorithm and methodology by final rule pursuant to s. 

393.0662, F.S. 

SUMMARY: These obsolete rules are being repealed. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will 

not have an adverse impact on small business or likely 

increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of 

$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the 

implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by 

the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: The information expressly relied upon is the analysis 

conducted by the Agency to determine whether a SERC was 

required and the nature of the rules to be repealed. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 393.0661(3) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 393.0661(3) FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 72 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: David De La Paz, Agency Clerk, Agency for 

Persons with Disabilities, 4030 Esplanade Way, Suite 380, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)922-9512 or 

david.delapaz@apdcares.org.. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: David De La Paz, Agency Clerk, 

Agency for Persons with Disabilities, 4030 Esplanade Way, 

Suite 380, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)922-9512 or 

david.delapaz@apdcares.org 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

65G-4.0026 Tier Waivers. 

Rulemaking Authority 393.0661(3) FS. Law Implemented 

393.0661(3) FS. History–New 3-7-10, Amended 9-28-11, 

Repealed_________. 

 

65G-4.0027 Tier One Waiver. 

Rulemaking Authority 393.0661(3) FS. Law Implemented 

393.0661(3) FS. History–New 3-7-10, Repealed_________. 

 

65G-4.0028 Tier Two Waiver. 

Rulemaking Authority 393.0661(3) FS. Law Implemented 

393.0661(3) FS. History–New 3-7-10, Repealed_________. 

 

65G-4.0029 Tier Three Waiver. 

Rulemaking Authority 393.0661(3) FS. Law Implemented 

393.0661(3) FS. History–New 3-7-10, Repealed_________. 

 

65G-4.00291 Tier Four Waiver. 

Rulemaking Authority 393.0661(3) FS. Law Implemented 

393.0661(3) FS. History–New 3-7-10, Repealed_________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

David De La Paz, Agency Clerk, Agency for Persons with 

Disabilities, 4030 Esplanade Way, Suite 380, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399, (850)922-9512 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Barbara Palmer 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: November 4, 2015 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=560
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.0026
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.0027
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.0028
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.0029
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.00291
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=393.0661(3)%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=393.0661(3)%20FS.
mailto:david.delapaz@apdcares.org


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

5638 

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES 

Agency for Persons with Disabilities 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

65G-4.0210 Definitions 

65G-4.0211 General Provisions 

65G-4.0212 Establishing the Final iBudget Allocation 

Amount 

65G-4.022 iBudget Cost Plan Development and 

Approval 

65G-4.024 Cost Plan Changes 

65G-4.027 Cost Plan Funding and Review 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of repealing these 

rules is to delete rules that were invalidated in G.B. v. Agency 

for Persons with Disabilities, 143 So.3d 454 (1st DCA, 2014). 

SUMMARY: These obsolete rules are being repealed. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will 

not have an adverse impact on small business or likely 

increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of 

$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the 

implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by 

the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: The information expressly relied upon is the analysis 

conducted by the Agency to determine whether a SERC was 

required and the nature of the rules to be repealed. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 393.501(1) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 393.0662 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 72 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: David De La Paz, Agency Clerk, Agency for 

Persons with Disabilities, 4030 Esplanade Way, Suite 380, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)922-9512 or 

david.delapaz@apdcares.org.. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: David De La Paz, Agency Clerk, 

Agency for Persons with Disabilities, 4030 Esplanade Way, 

Suite 380, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)922-9512 or 

david.delapaz@apdcares.org. 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

65G-4.0210 Definitions. 

Rulemaking Authority 393.501(1), 393.0662 FS. Law Implemented 

393.0662 FS. History–New 10-2-13. Repealed _______________. 

 

65G-4.0211 General Provisions. 

Rulemaking Authority 393.501(1), 393.0662 FS. Law Implemented 

393.0662 FS. History–New 10-2-13. Repealed ______________. 

 

65G-4.0212 Establishing the Final iBudget Allocation 

Amount. 

Rulemaking Authority 393.501(1), 393.0662 FS. Law Implemented 

393.0662 FS. History–New 10-2-13. Repealed _____________. 

 

65G-4.022 The iBudget Florida Cost Plan.  

Rulemaking Authority 393.501(1), 393.0662 FS. Law Implemented 

393.0662 FS. History–New 10-2-13. Repealed _ ____________. 

 

65G-4.024 Cost Plan Changes. 

Rulemaking Authority 393.501(1), 393.0662 FS. Law Implemented 

393.0662 FS. History–New 10-2-13. Repealed _____________. 

 

65G-4.027 Supplemental Cost Plan Funding. 

Rulemaking Authority 393.501(1), 393.0662 FS. Law Implemented 

393.0662 FS. History–New 10-2-13. Repealed _____________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

David De LaPaz, Agency Clerk, Agency for Persons with 

Disabilities, 4030 Esplanade Way, Suite 380, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399, (850)922-9512 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Barbara Palmer 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: November 4, 2015 

Section III 

Notice of Changes, Corrections and 

Withdrawals 

DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE 

Sales and Use Tax 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

12A-1.085 Exemption for Qualified Production 

Companies 

NOTICE OF CORRECTION 

Notice is hereby given that the following correction has been 

made to the proposed rule in Vol. 41 No. 211, October 29, 

2015 issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=560
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.0210
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.0211
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.0212
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.022
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.024
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.027
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=393.501(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=393.0662%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=12
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=33
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=12A-1.085


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

 

5639 

 

The reference at the beginning of the Notice of Proposed Rule 

on p. 5085 to Rule 12A-1.087, Exemption for Power Farm 

Equipment; Suggested Exemption Certificate for Items Used 

for Agricultural Purposes; should be a reference to Rule 12A-

1.085, Exemption for Qualified Production Companies, in 

accordance with the rule text published in that notice. 

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION 

Health Facility and Agency Licensing 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

59A-35.060 Licensure Application Process. 

NOTICE OF CORRECTION 

Notice is hereby given that the following correction has been 

made to the proposed rule in Vol. 41 No. 191, October 1, 2015 

issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

The purpose of this notice of correction is to strike changes 

regarding religious affiliation in the assisted living facility 

applications that were reflected in the notice of change 

published in the Vol. 41 No. 217, November 6, 2015, issue of 

the Florida Administrative Register. The religious affiliation 

language will revert back to that in the proposed notice. 

Section IV 

Emergency Rules 

NONE 

Section V 

Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Rule 

Variance or Waiver 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

Division of Elections 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

1S-2.050 Cancellation of Political Party Filings 

The Florida Department of State hereby gives notice: 

Name of Petitioner: Independent Party of Florida 

Date Petition Filed: August 19, 2015 

Rule Number: 1S-2.050(2)(c) 

Nature of Rule: Cancellation of registration for failing to 

comply with the annual public audit requirements of Section 

103.121(2), Florida Statutes. 

Notice of Petition was published on August 19, 2015, in the 

Florida Administrative Register. 

Date of Final Order: November 16, 2015 

General Basis for the Agency Decision: Petitioner did not 

satisfy the annual public audit requirement of Section 

103.121(2). 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be 

obtained by contacting: Brandy Hedges, Agency Clerk, 

(850)245-6536, brandy.hedges@dos.myflorida.com. Mailing 

address: R.A. Gray Building, Suite 100, 500 S. Bronough 

Street, Tallahassee, FL 32399. 

DEPARTMENT OF LAW ENFORCEMENT 

Criminal Justice Standards and Training Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

11B-35.002 Basic Recruit Training Programs for Law 

Enforcement, Correctional, and Correctional Probation 

The Criminal Justice Standards and Training Commission 

hereby gives notice that on November 5, 2015, pursuant to 

notice, at a meeting held in Kissimmee, Florida the 

Commission considered a petition for a temporary waiver of 

subparagraph 11B-35.0024(3)(f)2, F.A.C. and subsection 11B-

21.0005(7), F.A.C., by Director Jay Romine on behalf of the 

Training Center Directors Association. After careful 

consideration of the facts in this matter, the Commission 

found that Petitioner had demonstrated an economic, 

technological, legal, or other type of hardship resulting from 

an application of subparagraph 11B-35.0024(3)(f)2, F.A.C. 

and subsection 11B-21.0005(7), F.A.C., that was particular to 

petitioner, significantly different from the way the rule affects 

other similarly situated persons and issued an order granting 

Petitioner’s petition for a temporary waiver of subparagraph 

11B-35.0024(3)(f)2, F.A.C. and subsection 11B-21.0005(7), 

F.A.C., beginning July 29, 2015 through November 5, 2015. 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be 

obtained by contacting: Linton B. Eason, Assistant General 

Counsel, Florida Department of Law Enforcement, P.O. Box 

1489, Tallahassee, FL 32302, (850)410-7676. 

DEPARTMENT OF LAW ENFORCEMENT 

Criminal Justice Standards and Training Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

11B-35.0010 eLearning Instruction 

The Criminal Justice Standards and Training Commission 

hereby gives notice that on November 5, 2015, pursuant to 

notice, at a meeting held in Kissimmee, Florida the 

Commission considered a petition for a temporary waiver of 

subsection 11B-35.0010(1), F.A.C., by Colonel Gene S. 

Spaulding on behalf of the Florida Highway Patrol. After 

careful consideration of the facts in this matter, the 

Commission found that Petitioner had demonstrated an 

economic, technological, legal, or other type of hardship 

resulting from an application of subsection 11B-35.0010(1), 

F.A.C., that was particular to petitioner, significantly different 

from the way the rule affects other similarly situated persons 

and issued an order granting Petitioner’s petition for a 

temporary waiver of subsection 11B-35.0010(1), F.A.C., for 

one year. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=186
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-35.060
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=1
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=16
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=1S-2.050
mailto:brandy.hedges@dos.myflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=11
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=11B-35.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=11
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=11B-35.0010


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

5640 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be 

obtained by contacting: Linton B. Eason, Assistant General 

Counsel, Florida Department of Law Enforcement, P.O. Box 

1489, Tallahassee, FL 32302, (850)410-7676. 

DEPARTMENT OF LAW ENFORCEMENT 

Criminal Justice Standards and Training Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

11B-27.002 Certification, Employment or Appointment, 

Reactivation, and Terminating Employment or Appointment 

of Officers 

The Criminal Justice Standards and Training Commission 

hereby gives notice that on November 5, 2015 pursuant to 

notice, at a meeting held in Kissimmee, Florida the 

Commission considered a petition for a temporary waiver of 

paragraph 11B-27.002(4)(a), F.A.C., by Chief Daniel Oates of 

the Miami Beach Police Department on behalf of Rigoberto 

Mantecon. After careful consideration of the facts in this 

matter, the Commission found that Petitioner had 

demonstrated an economic, technological, legal, or other type 

of hardship resulting from an application of paragraph 11B-

27.002(4)(a), F.A.C., that was particular to petitioner, 

significantly different from the way the rule affects other 

similarly situated persons and issued an order granting 

Petitioner’s petition for a 180-day temporary waiver of 

paragraph 11B-27.002(4)(a), F.A.C. 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be 

obtained by contacting: Linton B. Eason, Assistant General 

Counsel, Florida Department of Law Enforcement, P.O. Box 

1489, Tallahassee, FL 32302, (850)410-7676. 

DEPARTMENT OF LAW ENFORCEMENT 

Criminal Justice Standards and Training Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

11B-27.002 Certification, Employment or Appointment, 

Reactivation, and Terminating Employment or Appointment 

of Officers 

The Criminal Justice Standards and Training Commission 

hereby gives notice that on November 5, 2015, pursuant to 

notice, at a meeting held in Kissimmee, Florida the 

Commission considered a petition for a temporary waiver of 

paragraph 11B-27.002(4)(a), F.A.C., by Adeel Chaudhry. 

After careful consideration of the facts in this matter, the 

Commission found that Petitioner had not demonstrated an 

economic, technological, legal, or other type of hardship 

resulting from an application of paragraph 11B-27.002(4)(a), 

F.A.C., that was particular to petitioner, significantly different 

from the way the rule affects other similarly situated persons 

and issued an order denying Petitioner’s petition for a 

temporary waiver of paragraph 11B-27.002(4)(a), F.A.C. 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be 

obtained by contacting: Linton B. Eason, Assistant General 

Counsel, Florida Department of Law Enforcement, P.O. Box 

1489, Tallahassee, FL 32302, (850)410-7676. 

DEPARTMENT OF LAW ENFORCEMENT 

Criminal Justice Standards and Training Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

11B-27.002 Certification, Employment or Appointment, 

Reactivation, and Terminating Employment or Appointment 

of Officers 

The Criminal Justice Standards and Training Commission 

hereby gives notice that on November 5, 2015, pursuant to 

notice, at a meeting held in Kissimmee, Florida the 

Commission considered a petition for a temporary waiver of 

paragraph 11B-27.002(4)(a), F.A.C. by Ivan Cruz. After 

careful consideration of the facts in this matter, the 

Commission found that Petitioner had demonstrated an 

economic, technological, legal, or other type of hardship 

resulting from an application of paragraph 11B-27.002(4)(a), 

F.A.C. that was particular to petitioner, significantly different 

from the way the rule affects other similarly situated persons 

and issued an order granting Petitioner’s petition for a 180-day 

temporary waiver of paragraph 11B-27.002(4)(a), F.A.C. 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be 

obtained by contacting: Linton B. Eason, Assistant General 

Counsel, Florida Department of Law Enforcement, P.O. Box 

1489, Tallahassee, FL 32302, (850)410-7676. 

DEPARTMENT OF LAW ENFORCEMENT 

Criminal Justice Standards and Training Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

11B-27.002 Certification, Employment or Appointment, 

Reactivation, and Terminating Employment or Appointment 

of Officers 

The Criminal Justice Standards and Training Commission 

hereby gives notice that on November 5, 2015 pursuant to 

notice, at a meeting held in Kissimmee, Florida the 

Commission considered a petition for a temporary 30-day 

waiver of paragraph 11B-27.002(4)(a), F.A.C., by Detective 

Carlos Grave de Peralta of the Miami Police Department on 

behalf of Gerber G. Vasquez. After careful consideration of 

the facts in this matter, the Commission found that Petitioner 

had demonstrated an economic, technological, legal, or other 

type of hardship resulting from an application of paragraph 

11B-27.002(4)(a), F.A.C., that was particular to petitioner, 

significantly different from the way the rule affects other 

similarly situated persons and issued an order granting 

Petitioner’s petition for a 30-day temporary waiver of 

paragraph 11B-27.002(4)(a), F.A.C. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=11
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=11B-27.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=11
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=11B-27.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=11
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=11B-27.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=11
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=11B-27.002


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

 

5641 

 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be 

obtained by contacting: Linton B. Eason, Assistant General 

Counsel, Florida Department of Law Enforcement, P.O. Box 

1489, Tallahassee, FL 32302, (850)410-7676. 

DEPARTMENT OF LAW ENFORCEMENT 

Criminal Justice Standards and Training Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

11B-35.002 Basic Recruit Training Programs for Law 

Enforcement, Correctional, and Correctional Probation 

The Criminal Justice Standards and Training Commission 

hereby gives notice that on November 5, 2015, pursuant to 

notice, at a meeting held in Kissimmee, Florida the 

Commission considered a petition for a temporary 180 day 

waiver of paragraph 11B-35.002(2)(a), F.A.C., by Chief 

Alexander Casas of the Florida International University Police 

Department on behalf of Carlos Ramos. After careful 

consideration of the facts in this matter, the Commission 

found that Petitioner had demonstrated an economic, 

technological, legal, or other type of hardship resulting from 

an application of paragraph 11B-35.002(2)(a), F.A.C., that 

was particular to petitioner, significantly different from the 

way the rule affects other similarly situated persons and issued 

an order granting Petitioner’s petition for a 180-day temporary 

waiver of paragraph -35.002(2)(a), F.A.C. 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be 

obtained by contacting: Linton B. Eason, Assistant General 

Counsel, Florida Department of Law Enforcement, P.O. Box 

1489, Tallahassee, FL 32302, (850)410-7676. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Board of Accountancy 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61H1-28.0052 Number of Sittings, and Granting of Credit, 

Release of Grades and Completion of Examination, Transition 

Rules 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on November 6, 2015, the 

Board of Accountancy, received a petition for variance or 

waiver filed by Elsa M. Morales, seeking a variance or waiver 

of paragraph 61H1-28.0052(1)(b), F.A.C., that requires 

candidates to pass all four test sections of the CPA 

Examination within a rolling eighteen-month period, which 

begins on the NASBA grade release date for the first test 

section(s) passed. 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be 

obtained by contacting: Veloria Kelly, Division Director, 

Board of Accountancy, 240 NW 76th Dr., Suite A, 

Gainesville, Florida 32607. Comments on this petition should 

be filed with the Board of Accountancy within 14 days of 

publication of this notice. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Osteopathic Medicine 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

64B15-13.001 Continuing Education for Biennial Renewal 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on November 10, 2015, 

the Board of Osteopathic Medicine received a petition for 

waiver or variance filed by Brien N. Grow, D.O., from Rule 

64B15-13.001, F.A.C., with regard to the requirement for 

domestic violence and Florida law CME. Comments on this 

petition should be filed with the Board of Osteopathic 

Medicine, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C06, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-3056, within 14 days of publication of this 

notice. 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be 

obtained by contacting: Claudia Kemp, Executive Director, 

Board of Osteopathic Medicine, at the above address or 

telephone: (850)245-4161. 

Section VI 

Notice of Meetings, Workshops and Public 

Hearings 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

Division of Historical Resources 

The Bureau of Historic Preservation, Florida Folklife Council 

announces a telephone conference call to which all persons are 

invited. 

DATE AND TIME: December 1, 2015, 10:00 a.m. until 

conclusion 

PLACE: R.A. Gray Building, Room 404, 500 South Bronough 

Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0250 or via teleconference: 

dial-in number: 1(888)670-3525, conference code: 

7911101420 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

review and rank nominations for the 2016 Florida Folk 

Heritage Awards. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Amanda 

Hardeman at 1(800)847-7278 or 

Amanda.Hardeman@dos.myflorida.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Amanda Hardeman at 1(800)847-7278 or 

Amanda.Hardeman@dos.myflorida.com. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=11
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=11B-35.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=280
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61H1-28.0052
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=306
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B15-13.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=1
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1
mailto:Amanda.Hardeman@dos.myflorida.com
mailto:Amanda.Hardeman@dos.myflorida.com


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

5642 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Amanda Hardeman at 

1(800)847-7278 or via email: 

Amanda.Hardeman@dos.myflorida.com. 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

The Florida Rehabilitation Council announces public meetings 

to which all persons are invited. 

DATES AND TIMES: January 27, 2016, 9:00 a.m. – 6:00 

p.m. or until completion; January 28, 2016, 9:00 a.m. – 5:00 

p.m. or until completion 

PLACE: Homewood Suites, 2987 Apalachee Parkway, 

Tallahassee, Florida 

You may also attend by conference phone: 1(888)670-3525, 

code: 7513637441 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Florida Rehabilitation Council quarterly meeting (general 

FRC business). 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Roy 

Cosgrove at (850)245-3317 or roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 10 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Roy Cosgrove at (850)245-3317 or 

roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Roy Cosgrove at 

(850)245-3317 or roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org. 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

The Florida Rehabilitation Council announces a telephone 

conference call to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: November 30, 2015, 10:30 a.m. – 12:30 

p.m. 

PLACE: Conference call number: 1(888)670-3525, code: 

7513637441 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Florida Rehabilitation Council Public Awareness Committee; 

General Public Awareness Business, FRC Annual Report. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Roy 

Cosgrove, (850)245-3317, roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Roy Cosgrove, (850)245-3317, 

roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Roy Cosgrove, 

(850)245-3317, roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org. 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

State Board of Education 

The Florida Rehabilitation Council for the Blind and Division 

of Blind Services announce a telephone conference call to 

which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: December 3, 2015, 2:00 p.m. – 3:30 p.m. 

PLACE: Telephone number: 1(888)670-3525, participant 

passcode: 1242528392 then # 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Subcommittee Client Satisfaction Survey Committee meeting. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Sharon 

Scurry, (850)245-0392, Sharon.Scurry@dbs.fldoe.org. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: the Division of Blind Services, 325 West Gaines 

Street, Room 1114, Tallahassee, FL 32399, (850)245-0392. If 

you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency 

using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: The Division of Blind 

Services, 325 West Gaines Street, Room 1114, Tallahassee, 

FL 32399, (850)245-0392. 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

The Florida Prepaid College Board announces a public 

meetings to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIMES: Thursday, December 10, 2015, 8:00 

a.m. until completion, Florida Prepaid College Board Audit 

Committee; 9:00 a.m. until completion, Florida Prepaid 

College Board Investment Committee, followed by Florida 

Prepaid College Board meeting 

PLACE: The Hermitage Centre, 1801 Hermitage Boulevard, 

Tallahassee, Florida, 32308 

The Florida Prepaid College Board Audit Committee meeting 

will be held in the Emerald Coast Room. The Florida Prepaid 

College Board Investment Committee and the Florida Prepaid 

College Board meeting will be held in the Hermitage Room. 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

conduct meetings of the regular business of the Florida 

Prepaid College Board Audit Committee, the Florida Prepaid 

College Board Investment Committee, and the Florida Prepaid 

College Board. 

mailto:Amanda.Hardeman@dos.myflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
mailto:roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org
mailto:roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org
mailto:roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
mailto:roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org
mailto:roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org
mailto:roy.cosgrove@vr.fldoe.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=195
mailto:Sharon.Scurry@dbs.fldoe.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=47


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

 

5643 

 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

http://www.myfloridaprepaid.com/ or by calling (850)488-

8514. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by faxing 

a written request to the Florida Prepaid College Board at 

(850)488-3555. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please 

contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

The Florida Prepaid College Board announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, December 9, 2015, 1:00 p.m. 

until completion 

PLACE: The Hermitage Centre, Hermitage Room, 1801 

Hermitage Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32308 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

conduct a meeting of the regular business of the Florida 

Prepaid College Foundation Board. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

http://www.myfloridaprepaid.com/ or by calling (850)488-

8514. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by faxing 

a written request to the Florida Prepaid College Board at 

(850)488-3555. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please 

contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

The Florida Prepaid College Board announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, December 9, 2015, 2:30 p.m. 

until completion 

PLACE: The Hermitage Centre, Hermitage Room, 1801 

Hermitage Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32308 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

conduct a meeting of the regular business of the Florida ABLE 

Inc. Board. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

http://www.myfloridaprepaid.com/ or by calling (850)488-

8514. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by faxing 

a written request to the Florida Prepaid College Board at 

(850)488-3555. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please 

contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

The Florida Prepaid College Board announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: November 23, 2015, 1:00 p.m., ET 

PLACE: The Hermitage Centre, Treasure Coast Conference 

Room, 1801 Hermitage Blvd., Tallahassee, Florida 32308 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: All 

responses to be publicly opened in regards to the Invitation to 

Negotiate, ITN 15-03, Mutual Fund Family for Florida ABLE, 

Inc. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: The 

Florida Prepaid College Board, ITN Administrator by email: 

ITNinfo.Prepaid@myfloridaprepaid.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: the ITN Administrator at the email address 

provided above. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please 

contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

EXECUTIVE OFFICE OF THE GOVERNOR 

The Florida Commission on Community Service (Volunteer 

Florida) announces a telephone conference call to which all 

persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: November 30, 2015, 1:00 p.m. until all 

business is complete 

PLACE: Conference call: 1(888)670-3525, passcode: 

3360784946# 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

General business. Note: this is a time change from original 

meeting. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Ellen 

Herold at (850)414-7400. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Ellen Herold at (850)414-7400. If you are hearing 

or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

http://www.myfloridaprepaid.com/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=47
http://www.myfloridaprepaid.com/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=47
http://www.myfloridaprepaid.com/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=47
mailto:ITNinfo.Prepaid@myfloridaprepaid.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=27


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

5644 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Ellen Herold at 

(850)414-7400. 

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS 

St. Johns River Water Management District 

The North Florida-Southeast Georgia (NFSEG) regional 

groundwater flow model Steering and Technical Teams are 

made up of area stakeholders, the St. Johns River Water 

Management District staff and the Suwannee River Water 

Management District staff, to work collectively on the 

development of the next generation regional-scale 

groundwater flow model for North Florida. The Steering Team 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, December 2, 2015, 1:30 p.m. 

– 3:30 p.m. 

PLACE: St. Johns River Water Management District 

Headquarters, 4049 Reid Street, Resource Management 

Building, Room 136, Palatka, Florida 32177 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

This is a meeting of the Steering Team described above. The 

purpose of the meeting is to update the steering team on the 

status of model development. An opportunity for public 

comment will be provided near the end of the meeting. 

NOTE: One or more members of the Governing Board from 

each of the water management districts named above may 

attend the meeting. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: St. 

Johns River Water Management District, Attention: Heidi 

Bennett, 4049 Reid Street, Palatka, FL 32177, (386)329-4513, 

hbennett@sjrwmd.com or by visiting the North Florida 

Regional Water Supply Partnership website: 

www.northfloridawater.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: the District Clerk at (386)329-4500. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the District using 

the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS 

St. Johns River Water Management District 

The North Florida-Southeast Georgia (NFSEG) regional 

groundwater flow model Steering and Technical Teams are 

made up of area stakeholders, the St. Johns River Water 

Management District staff and the Suwannee River Water 

Management District staff, to work collectively on the 

development of the next generation regional-scale 

groundwater flow model for North Florida. The Technical 

Team announces a public meeting to which all persons are 

invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, December 2, 2015, 10:00 

a.m. – 12:00 Noon 

PLACE: St. Johns River Water Management District 

Headquarters, 4049 Reid Street, Resource Management 

Building, Room 136, Palatka, Florida 32177 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

This is a meeting of the Technical Team described above. The 

purpose of the meeting is to update the technical team on the 

status of model calibration. An opportunity for public 

comment will be provided near the end of the meeting. 

NOTE: One or more members of the Governing Board from 

each of the water management districts named above may 

attend the meeting. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: St. 

Johns River Water Management District, Attention: Heidi 

Bennett, 4049 Reid Street, Palatka, FL 32177, (386)329-4513, 

hbennett@sjrwmd.com or by visiting the North Florida 

Regional Water Supply Partnership website: 

www.northfloridawater.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: the District Clerk at (386)329-4500. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION 

The Agency for Health Care Administration announces a 

telephone conference call to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, November 19, 2015, 9:00 a.m. 

– 9:30 a.m. 

PLACE: This meeting will be held via teleconference. To join 

the meeting dial: 1(888)339-2688 and enter the participant 

code: 975 296 51#. If you have any difficulty joining the 

meeting, please call the Florida Center’s main number: 

(850)412-3730. 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

This is a meeting of the Commission on Healthcare and 

Hospital Funding. The Commission was created by the 

Governor’s Executive Order Number 15-99, to investigate and 

advise on the role of taxpayer funding for hospitals, insurers, 

and health care providers, and the affordability, access, and 

quality of healthcare services they provide to Florida families 

as a return on taxpayer investment. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=122
mailto:hbennett@sjrwmd.com
http://www.northfloridawater.com/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=122
mailto:hbennett@sjrwmd.com
http://www.northfloridawater.com/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

 

5645 

 

Please note that this meeting will be recorded. 

The agenda will be posted at the Commission on Healthcare 

and Hospital Funding website, at: 

http://healthandhospitalcommission.com. You may also 

contact us at FLHospitalCommission@ahca.myflorida.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 24 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Betty Schmidt, Florida Center for Health 

Information and Policy Analysis at 

Betty.Schmidt@ahca.myflorida.com or (850)412-3770. If you 

are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency 

using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Betty Schmidt, 

Florida Center for Health Information and Policy Analysis at 

Betty.Schmidt@ahca.myflorida.com or (850)412-3770. 

DEPARTMENT OF MANAGEMENT SERVICES 

Division of Purchasing 

The Department of Management Services announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: December 17, 2015, 2:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Department of Management Services, 4050 

Esplanade Way, Suite 101, Tallahassee, FL, 32399 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The Florida Department of Management Services will conduct 

a public meeting for the Request for Proposals No.: DMS 

14/15-049 REBID, entitled “Elevator Preventative 

Maintenance, Inspection and Testing Services.” 

The purpose of the meeting is for the evaluators to meet in a 

public forum to discuss the Proposals and scoring. 

This meeting is subject to cancellation or postponement. 

Further information and future updates regarding this meeting 

schedule or any future meetings will be available via the 

system of record, the Vendor Bid System (VBS), located at 

http://www.myflorida.com/apps/vbs/vbs_www.search_r2.crite

ria_form by searching for DMS 14/15-049. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Lori L. 

Anderson, Procurement Officer at (850)488-0510 or 

dms.purchasing@dms.myflorida.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: the Department’s Americans with Disabilities Act 

(ADA) Coordinator Doug Dickinson, at (850)488-0439. If you 

are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency 

using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Lori. L. Anderson, 

Procurement Officer, (850)488-0510, 

dms.purchasing@dms.myflorida.com. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Board of Pilot Commissioners 

The Board of Pilot Commissioners announces a telephone 

conference call to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: November 30, 2015, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: 1(888)670-3525, participant pass code: 5243947159# 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Deputy Pilot Advancement Committee meeting. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Board of 

Pilot Commissioners, 1940 N. Monroe St., Tallahassee, FL 

32399, (850)717-1982. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Board of Pilot Commissioners, 1940 N. Monroe 

St., Tallahassee, FL 32399, (850)717-1982. If you are hearing 

or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Board of Pilot 

Commissioners, 1940 N. Monroe St., Tallahassee, FL 32399, 

(850)717-1982. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

The Florida Building Commission, “THE COMMISSION”, 

Energy Technical Advisory Committee, announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: December 8, 2015, 1:00 p.m. until 

completion, with corrected agenda items 

PLACE: Meeting to be conducted using teleconference and 

webinar; to join the online meeting, GoToMeeting® Online 

Meetings Made Easy® is a newly contracted vendor. Please 

note the access is different than previous meetings. 

1. Please join the meeting Tuesday, December 8, 2015 at 1:00 

p.m., Eastern Time, 

https://global.gotomeeting.com/join/450366541 

2. Join the conference call: United States (toll-free) 

1(877)309-2073; access code: 450-366-541; audio PIN: shown 

after joining the meeting; meeting ID: 450-366-541 

http://healthandhospitalcommission.com/
mailto:FLHospitalCommission@ahca.myflorida.com
mailto:Betty.Schmidt@ahca.myflorida.com
mailto:Betty.Schmidt@ahca.myflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=60
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=220
http://www.myflorida.com/apps/vbs/vbs_www.search_r2.criteria_form
http://www.myflorida.com/apps/vbs/vbs_www.search_r2.criteria_form
mailto:dms.purchasing@dms.myflorida.com
mailto:dms.purchasing@dms.myflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=266
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://global.gotomeeting.com/join/450366541


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

5646 

Public point of access: Office of Codes and Standards, 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Suite 

90A, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida. 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

WITH CORRECTED AGENDA ITEMS: To review and 

accept draft report for research project titled “Evaluating the 

Economic Impacts of the Legislatively Delayed Provisions of 

the 5th Edition (2014) Florida Building Code: - Mandatory 

blower door testing for residential buildings or dwelling units 

as contained in Section R402.4.1.2 of the Florida Building 

Code, 5th Edition (2014) Energy Conservation Volume; -

Mechanical ventilation for residential buildings or dwelling 

units as contained in Section R303.4 of the Florida Building 

Code, 5th Edition (2014) Residential Volume. Also, to 

consider and discuss the following requests for Declaratory 

Statement: DS2015 - 125 by Gary R. Beaumont of Beaumont 

Electric Co.; and DS 2015 – 134 by Joseph Hetzel of Door & 

Access Systems Manufacturers Association International 

(DASMA), to review and provide recommendation to the 

Commission on possible submittals for approval of energy 

compliance software for the 5th Edition (2014) Florida 

Building Code, Energy Conservation; Discussion regarding 

“Categorizing Mandatory Requirements for Commercial Code 

Compliance”, and other business on behalf of the Commission 

as per agenda. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting Mr. 

Norman Bellamy, Building Codes and Standards Office, 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Suite 

90A, 1940 N. Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399; 

calling (850)487-1824 or visiting our website at: 

http://floridabuilding.org/c/default.aspx. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 10 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Ms. Barbara Bryant, Building Codes and 

Standards Office, Department of Business and Professional 

Regulation, 1940 N. Monroe Street, Tallahassee, FL 32399, 

(850)487-1824, fax: (850)414-8436. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact Mr. Norman Bellamy, 

Building Codes and Standards Office, Department of Business 

and Professional Regulation, Suite 90A, 1940 N. Monroe 

Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399; call (850)487-1824 or visit 

our website at: http://floridabuilding.org/c/default.aspx. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

The Florida Building Commission, “THE COMMISSION”, 

Electrical Technical Advisory Committee, announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: CORRECTED TIME: December 7, 2015, 

2:00 p.m. until completion 

PLACE: Meeting to be conducted using teleconference and 

webinar: You must access both the teleconference number for 

audio only and the webinar for visual only. 

To join the online meeting (now accessible using mobile 

devices) 

1. Please join the meeting: 

https://global.gotomeeting.com/join/225160357 

2. Join the conference call: United States (toll-free), 

1(866)899-4679; access code: 225-160-357; audio PIN: shown 

after joining the meeting; meeting ID: 225-160-357 

Public point of access: Florida Building Commission, 

Northwood Centre, Department of Business and Professional 

Regulation, Suite 90A, 1940 North Monroe Street, 

Tallahassee, Florida 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

Consider and discuss the following Declaratory Statement: DS 

2015 - 125 by Gary R. Beaumont of Beaumont Electric Co., 

and other business for the Commission as reflected on the 

agenda. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting Mr. Joe 

Bigelow, Building Codes and Standards Office, Department of 

Business and Professional Regulation, Suite 90A, 1940 N. 

Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399; calling (850)487-

1824 or visiting our website at: 

http://floridabuilding.org/c/default.aspx. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 10 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Ms. Barbara Bryant, Building Codes and 

Standards Office, Department of Business and Professional 

Regulation, 1940 N. Monroe Street, Tallahassee, FL 32399, 

(850)487-1824, fax: (850)414-8436. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

http://floridabuilding.org/c/default.aspx
http://floridabuilding.org/c/default.aspx
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://global.gotomeeting.com/join/225160357
http://floridabuilding.org/c/default.aspx


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

 

5647 

 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact Mr. Joe Bigelow, 

Building Codes and Standards Office, Department of Business 

and Professional Regulation, Suite 90A, 1940 N. Monroe 

Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399; call (850)487-1824 or visit 

our website at: http://floridabuilding.org/c/default.aspx. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

State Boxing Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61K1-4.001 Amateur Sanctioning Organization Licensure, 

Criteria for Approval and Denial 

The Florida State Boxing Commission announces a telephone 

conference call to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: December 4, 2015, 10:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Conference call: 1(888)670-3525, passcode: 

6740308491, then # 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

conduct a general business meeting, including biennial license 

review and to request to transfer and renumber Rule 61K1-

1.030 to 61K1-3.032, Rule 61K1-1.035 to 61K1-3.033, Rule 

61K1-1.0024 to Rule 61K1-3.034, Rule 61K1-1.0035 to Rule 

61K1-3.015 and to request approval of a Notice of Proposed 

Rulemaking and Statement of Regulatory Cost Worksheets to 

repeal 61K1-1.003, 61K1-1.004, 61K1-1.0043, 61K1-1006, 

61K1-1.007, 61K1-1.008, 61K1-1009, 61K1-1.012, 61K1-

1.037, 61K1-1.040. The Florida State Boxing Commission has 

replaced these rules. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Lina 

Hurtado, (850)488-8500. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 24 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Lina Hurtado, (850)488-8500. If you are hearing 

or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Lina Hurtado, 

(850)488-8500. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Dentistry 

The Board of Dentistry announces a public meeting to which 

all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: December 18, 2015, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Department of Health, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, 

Room #301, Tallahassee, Florida 32399 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Probable Cause Panel where reconsiderations will be heard. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Sue 

Foster, Executive Director, Department of Health, Board of 

Dentistry, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, BIN #C08, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-3258. If any person decides to appeal any 

decision made by the Board with respect to any matter 

considered at this meeting, he/she will need to ensure that a 

verbatim record of the proceeding is made, which record 

includes the testimony and evidence upon which the appeal is 

to be made. Those who are hearing impaired, using TDD 

equipment can call the Florida Telephone Relay System at 

1(800)955-8771. Persons requiring special accommodations 

due to disability or physical impairment should contact Sue 

Foster at (850)245-4474. 

FLORIDA HOUSING FINANCE CORPORATION 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

67-48.040 EHCL General Program Procedures and 

Restrictions 

The Florida Housing Finance Corporation announces a 

workshop to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: November 30, 2015, 2:00 p.m., Eastern 

Time 

PLACE: 227 N. Bronough Street, Seltzer Room, Suite 6000, 

Tallahassee, Florida or by telephone 

The call-in information for the workshop will be posted to: 

http://www.floridahousing.org/Developers/MultiFamilyProgra

ms/Competitive/2015-114/ prior to the workshop. 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The workshop will be held to solicit comments and 

suggestions from interested persons relative to Florida 

Housing’s proposed Request for Application (RFA) 2015-114 

– Elderly Housing Community Loan. Funding under this RFA 

must be used to provide for life-safety, building preservation, 

health, sanitation, or security-related repairs or improvements 

to Developments currently serving Elderly persons pursuant to 

the Federal Housing Act. An estimated $1,800,000 in loan 

funding is expected to be made available in this RFA. The 

maximum loan request amount will be $750,000. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Ken 

Reecy, (850)488-4197. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Jean Salmonsen, (850)488-4197. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

http://floridabuilding.org/c/default.aspx
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=285
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61K1-4.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=328
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=67
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=67-48.040
http://www.floridahousing.org/Developers/MultiFamilyPrograms/Competitive/2015-114/
http://www.floridahousing.org/Developers/MultiFamilyPrograms/Competitive/2015-114/


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

5648 

the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

FISH AND WILDLIFE CONSERVATION COMMISSION 

Freshwater Fish and Wildlife 

The Florida Fish and Wildlife Conservation Commission 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: December 2, 2015, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Conference call; contact Jennifer McGee for details, 

contact info below 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

This is a quarterly meeting of the Steering Committee for the 

Florida Beaches Habitat Conservation Plan. Topics to be 

discussed include staff updates from the last quarter. No votes 

will be taken. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Jennifer 

McGee, Florida Fish and Wildlife Conservation Commission, 

Species Conservation Planning Section, 620 South Meridian 

Street, MS2A, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1600, (850)921-

1023, Jennifer.McGee@myfwc.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: The ADA Coordinator at (850)488-6411. If you 

are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency 

using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact Jennifer McGee, 

Florida Fish and Wildlife Conservation Commission, Species 

Conservation Planning Section, 620 South Meridian Street, 

MS2A, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1600, (850)921-1023, 

Jennifer.McGee@myfwc.com. 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

OIR – Insurance Regulation 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

69O-154.202 Definitions 

69O-154.203 Categories of Reserves 

69O-154.204 Specific Minimum Standards for Morbidity, 

Mortality and Interest 

The Office of Insurance Regulation announces a hearing to 

which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: December 8, 2015, 9:00 a.m. during a 

regular meeting of the Financial Services Commission 

PLACE: Cabinet Meeting Room, Lower Level, The Capitol, 

Tallahassee, Florida 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

This is the Final Public Hearing on the adoption of proposed 

amendments to Rules 69O-154.202, 69O-154.203, 69O-

154.204, Florida Administrative Code, published on October 

12, 2015, in Vol. 41, No. 198, of the Florida Administrative 

Register. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: the 

Governor and Cabinet Website at 

http://www.myflorida.com/myflorida/cabinet/mart.html. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Kerry Krantz, Office of Insurance Regulation, 

Kerry.Krantz@floir.com. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Kerry Krantz, Office 

of Insurance Regulation, Kerry.Krantz@floir.com. 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

Division of Workforce Services 

The Reemployment Assistance Appeals Commission 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: November 25, 2015, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Reemployment Assistance Appeals Commission, 101 

Rhyne Building, 2740 Centerview Drive, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-4151 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Deliberation for cases pending before the Reemployment 

Assistance Appeals Commission that are ready for final 

review and the Chairman’s report. No public testimony will be 

taken. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

Reemployment Assistance Appeals Commission, 101 Rhyne 

Building, 2740 Centerview Drive, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-

4151, (850)487-2685. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 24 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Reemployment Assistance Appeals Commission, 

101 Rhyne Building, 2740 Centerview Drive, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-4151, (850)487-2685. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Reemployment 

Assistance Appeals Commission, 101 Rhyne Building, 2740 

Centerview Drive, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-4151, 

(850)487-2685. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=68
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=347
mailto:Jennifer.McGee@myfwc.com
mailto:Jennifer.McGee@myfwc.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=520
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-154.202
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-154.203
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-154.204
http://www.myflorida.com/myflorida/cabinet/mart.html
mailto:Kerry.Krantz@floir.com
mailto:Kerry.Krantz@floir.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1065


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

 

5649 

 

Section VII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Declaratory Statements 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares and Mobile 

Homes 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Division of Florida 

Condominiums, Timeshares, and Mobile Homes, Department 

of Business and Professional Regulation, State of Florida, has 

received a petition for declaratory statement from Michael R. 

Kassower, Esq., In Re: Coronado at Highland Beach 

Condominium Association, Inc., Docket No. 2015049413, 

filed on November 4, 2015. The petition seeks the agency’s 

opinion as to the applicability of Section 718.113(2)(a), 

Florida Statutes, as it applies to the petitioner. 

Whether the replacement of the pine wood bridge with a 

pressure treated pine wood constitutes a material alteration 

pursuant to Section 718.113(2)(a), Florida Statutes, and 

therefore requires a vote of the membership? Whether the 

replacement of the pine wood bridge with Trex materials 

constitutes a material alteration pursuant to Section 

718.113(2)(a), Florida Statutes, and therefore requires a vote 

of the membership? Whether the addition of wheelchair ramps 

and wheelchair observation areas to the bridge as part of the 

replacement bridge constitutes a material alteration or 

substantial additions pursuant to Section 718.113(2)(a), 

Florida Statutes, and therefore requires a vote of the 

membership? 

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be 

obtained by contacting: Rikki Anderson, Administrative 

Assistant II, at Department of Business and Professional 

Regulation, Division of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares, 

and Mobile Homes, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-2217, (850)717-1415, 

Rikki.Anderson@myfloridalicense.com. 

Please refer all comments to: Robin E. Smith, Chief Attorney, 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division 

of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares, and Mobile Homes, 

1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2202. 

Responses, motions to intervene, or requests for an agency 

hearing, §120.57(2), Fla. Stat., must be filed within 21 days of 

this notice. 

Section VIII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding the Validity of Rules 

Notice of Petition for Administrative Determination has been 

filled with the Division of Administrative Hearings on the 

following rules: 

NONE 

Notice of Disposition of Petition for Administrative 

Determination has been filled with the Division of 

Administrative Hearings on the following rules: 

NONE 

Section IX 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Non-rule Policy Challenges 

NONE 

Section X 

Announcements and Objection Reports of 

the Joint Adminstrative Procedures 

Committee 

NONE 

Section XI 

Notices Regarding Bids, Proposals and 

Purchasing 

NONE 

Section XII 

Miscellaneous 

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 

Clean Water State Revolving Fund Program 

NOTICE OF AVAILABILITY 

FLORIDA REAFFIRMATION NOTICE 

City of Tavares 

The Florida Department of Environmental Protection (DEP) 

has determined that the City of Tavares project involving 

construction of a reclaimed water distribution system is not 

expected to generate controversy over potential environmental 

effects. The total estimated construction cost is $2,000,000. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=248
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=248
mailto:Rikki.Anderson@myfloridalicense.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 224, November 18, 2015 

5650 

The project may qualify for a Clean Water State Revolving 

Fund loan comprised of federal and state funds. DEP will 

consider public comments about the environmental impacts of 

the proposed project that are postmarked or delivered at the 

address below within 30 days of this notice. A full copy of the 

Florida Reaffirmation Notice can be obtained by writing to: 

Bob Ballard, SRF Program, Department of Environmental 

Protection, 3900 Commonwealth Boulevard, MS3505, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3000, calling (850)245-2961 or 

emailing bob.ballard@dep.state.fl.us. 

Section XIII 

Index to Rules Filed During Preceeding 

Week 

NOTE: The above section will be published on Tuesday 

beginning October 2, 2012, unless Monday is a holiday, then it 

will be published on Wednesday of that week. 

_______________________________________________ 

mailto:bob.ballard@dep.state.fl.us

