
Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

 

3209 

 

Section I 

Notice of Development of Proposed Rules 

and Negotiated Rulemaking 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Real Estate Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61J2-3.013 Distance Education Courses for Hardship 

Cases 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Commission proposes to 

review the rule to determine if modification to the language is 

necessary. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: The rule 

amendment will address hardship cases. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 455.2123, 475.05, 475.17(2) 

FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 455.2123, 475.04, 475.17(2), 

475.451(3), (6) FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Juana 

Watkins, Executive Director, Florida Real Estate Commission, 

400 W. Robinson Street, #N801, Orlando, Florida 32801; 

(850)487-1395. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Real Estate Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61J2-5.018 Vacancies of Office 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Commission proposes to 

review the rule to determine if modification to the language is 

necessary to implement the changes made to Section 475.15, 

Florida Statutes. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Vacancies of office 

and the changes made to Section 475.15, Florida Statutes. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 475.05 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 475.01(3), 475.15, 475.31, 475.42 

FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Juana 

Watkins, Executive Director, Florida Real Estate Commission, 

400 W. Robinson Street, #N801, Orlando, Florida 32801, 

(850)487-1395 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Division of Medical Quality Assurance 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

64B-9.006 Massage Establishment Licensure; 

Ownership Information 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To establish required 

documentation for massage establishment corporations 

exceeding $250,000 in business assets. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Licensure of 

massage establishments. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 480.043(2) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 480.043(2) FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Christy 

Robinson, Executive Director at (850)245-4588 or 

Christy.Robinson@flhealth.gov 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE 

FROM THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE. 

Section II 

Proposed Rules 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Real Estate Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61J2-1.011 License Fees and Examination Fees 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=283
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61J2-3.013
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=455.2123
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.05
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.17(2)%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.17(2)%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=455.2123
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.04
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.17(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.451(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=283
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61J2-5.018
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=475.05%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=475.01(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.31
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.42%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.42%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=299
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B-9.006
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=Section%20480.043(2),%20F.S
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=283
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61J2-1.011


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

3210 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Commission proposes the rule 

amendment to delete reference to the duplicate license fee. 

SUMMARY: rule amendment will delete reference to the 

duplicate license fee. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will 

not have an adverse impact on small business or likely 

increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of 

$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the 

implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by 

the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: During discussion of the economic impact of this rule 

at its Commission meeting, the Commission, based upon the 

expertise and experience of its members, determined that a 

Statement of Estimated Regulatory Costs (SERC) was not 

necessary and that the rule will not require ratification by the 

Legislature. 

No person or interested party submitted additional information 

regarding the economic impact at that time. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 475.05 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 68.065(2), 455.217, 455.2281, 

475.04, 475.125, 475.15, 475.182, 475.24, 475.451 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Juana Watkins, Executive Director, 

Division of Real Estate, 400 N. Robinson Street, Suite N801, 

Orlando, Florida 32801 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

61J2-1.011 License Fees and Examination Fees. 

(1) through (4) No change. 

(5) The following fees shall be charged for the following purposes: 

(a) through (c) No change. 

 

(d) Duplicate License 

(6) through (10) No change. 

$ 25.00 

Rulemaking Authority 475.05 FS. Law Implemented 455.217, 

455.2281, 475.04, 475.125, 475.15, 475.182, 475.24, 475.451 FS. 

History–New 10-10-79, Amended 1-1-80, 4-14-81, 9-13-82, 10-19-

83, 8-12-84, 10-13-85, Formerly 21V-1.11, Amended 2-1-87, 1-1-88, 

5-5-88, 10-13-88, 9-10-89, 1-4-90, 2-13-90, 3-27-90, 8-21-90, 10-9-

90, 1-13-91, 8-19-91, 7-1-93, Formerly 21V-1.011, Amended 7-18-

94, 12-17-95, 12-30-97, 1-19-99, 4-18-99, 2-24-00, 11-17-03, 3-8-05, 

12-6-07, 8-18-08, 5-8-13, 6-29-14,______. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Florida Real Estate Commission 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Florida Real Estate Commission 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: June 16, 2015 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: May 14, 2015 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Real Estate Commission 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

61J2-3.008 Pre-licensing Education for Broker and 

Sales Associate Applicants 

61J2-3.009 Continuing Education for Active and 

Inactive Broker and Sales Associate 

Licensees 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Commission proposes the rule 

amendments to delete unnecessary language and to add new 

language to bring the rules into compliance with the statute. 

SUMMARY: The rule amendments will delete unnecessary 

language and to add new language to bring the rules into 

compliance with the statute. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will 

not have an adverse impact on small business or likely 

increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of 

$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the 

implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by 

the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: During discussion of the economic impact of this rule 

at its Commission meeting, the Commission, based upon the 

expertise and experience of its members, determined that a 

Statement of Estimated Regulatory Costs (SERC) was not 

necessary and that the rule will not require ratification by the 

Legislature. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=475.05%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=68.065(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20455.217
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20455.2281
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.04
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.125
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.182
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.24
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.451%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=283
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61J2-3.008
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61J2-3.009


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

 

3211 

 

No person or interested party submitted additional information 

regarding the economic impact at that time. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 475.05, 455.2123, 

471.01(1)(d), (e), (2), 475.05, 475.42(1)(c) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 455.2123, 475.04, 475.17, 475.182, 

475.183, 475.451 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Juana Watkins, Executive Director, 

Division of Real Estate, 400 N. Robinson Street, Suite N801, 

Orlando, Florida 32801 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

61J2-3.008 Pre-licensing Education for Broker and Sales 

Associate Applicants. 

(1) through (3) No change. 

(4)(a) A grade of 70% or higher on the Commission-

prescribed end-of-course examination constitutes satisfactory 

course completion. The school shall administer the 

examination upon completion of the instruction, provided the 

student has not missed in excess of 8 hours of instruction. 

(b) through (i) No change. 

j. The school must require the student to submit a 

statement that includes, “I certify that I personally completed 

all assignments and have not duplicated any portion of the 

end-of-course examination prior to the taking of the final 

examination.” 

Thereafter, it is the responsibility of the school offering 

the Commission-approved courses to keep the course 

materials current and accurate, as changing times and laws 

require, and obtain approval from the Commission at least 60 

days before implementing any significant changes to the 

course during its approval period. 

Approval or denial of a Commission-required pre-

licensing course (Course I or Course II) will be based on the 

extent to which the course content covers the material set forth 

in the appropriate Commission-developed course syllabus, 

effective January 1, 2015 2001 (Course I) and effective 

September 1, 1999 (Course II), incorporated herein by 

reference. The institution or school may resubmit a denied 

course with the mandated changes for reevaluation. 

(c) through (d) No change. 

(5) through (7) No change. 

(8) Any active member in good standing with The Florida 

Bar who is otherwise qualified under the real estate license 

law is exempt from the Commission-prescribed prerequisite 

education course for licensure as a real estate sales associate 

salesperson. 

(9) Any applicant for licensure who has received a 4-year 

degree or higher in real estate from an accredited institution of 

higher education is exempt from the Commission-prescribed 

prerequisite education courses for licensure. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 475.05 FS. Law Implemented 475.04, 

475.17, 475.182, 475.183, 475.451 FS. History–New 1-1-80, 

Amended 8-24-80, 9-16-84, Formerly 21V-3.08, Amended 7-16-86, 

10-13-88, 5-20-90, 1-13-91, 7-20-93, Formerly 21V-3.008, Amended 

12-13-94, 6-14-95, 8-2-95, 12-30-97, 9-1-99, 1-18-00, 11-6-00, 1-12-

04,              . 

 

61J2-3.009 Continuing Education for Active and Inactive 

Broker and Sales Associate Licensees. 

(1)(a) All persons holding active or inactive licenses as 

brokers or sales associates must satisfactorily complete a 

minimum of 14 hours of instruction of 50 minutes each as the 

Commission has prescribed or approved during each license 

renewal period excluding the first renewal period of their 

current license. 

(b) The Commission shall approve any specialty course, 

seminar or conference in the real estate practice area provided 

by a public or private school, firm, association, organization, 

person, corporation or sponsor (“provider”). “Specialty” 

courses on real estate practices shall be approved for no less 

than 2 hours and for not more than 11 hours of instruction of 

50 minutes each. Courses shall not be approved for fractional 

hours. The Commission will approve the course for 24 months 

plus the remaining period of the renewal cycle following the 

end of the 24 month period at which point the course will 

expire. A provider must submit two complete sets, including 

one blind copy, of course materials and end-of-course 

examinations to the Commission for evaluation at least 60 

days prior to use and receive approval before it may offer the 

course examination. Approval or denial of a “specialty” course 

will be based on its compliance with the criteria established in 

Section 475.182(1), F.S. Thereafter, it is the responsibility of 

the provider offering the Commission-approved courses to 

keep the course materials current and accurate, as changing 

times and laws require, and obtain approval from the 

Commission at least 60 days before implementing any 

significant changes to the course during its approval period. 

(2)through (7) No change. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=475.05
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20455.2123
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20471.01(1)(d)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.05
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.42(1)(c)%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=455.2123
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.04
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.17
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.182
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.183
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20475.451%20FS.


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

3212 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 455.2123, 475.01(1)(d), (e), (2), 

475.05, 475.42(1)(c) FS. Law Implemented 455.2123, 475.04, 

475.17, 475.182, 475.183, 475.451 FS. History–New 1-1-80, 

Amended 8-24-80, 10-19-83, 9-16-84, Formerly 21V-3.09, Amended 

10-13-88, 6-17-91, 12-29-91, 12-8-92, 6-28-93, Formerly 21V-3.009, 

Amended 2-2-94, 11-13-94, 5-13-96, 12-30-97, 10-25-98, 3-7-99, 1-

18-00, 9-17-00, 1-12-04, 7-10-06,                     . 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Florida Real Estate Commission 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Florida Real Estate Commission 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: June 16, 2015 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: May 14, 2015 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Vital Statistics 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

64V-1.0131 Certifications of Vital Records; Information 

Required for Release; Applicant 

Identification Requirements 

64V-1.020 Marriage Reporting 

64V-1.021 Dissolution of Marriage Reporting 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of these 

rule amendments is to clarify requirements for requesting vital 

records and monthly reporting. The Department is also 

removing redundant language and updating forms. 

SUMMARY: SUMMARY: Rule 64V-1.0131, F.A.C: Several 

forms that have been updated and forms for various vital 

statistics records requests have been incorporated. 

Requirements for obtaining records clarified and redundant 

language removed. Rule 64V-1.020, F.A.C.: Marriage report 

form updated, a form for affirmation of common children 

incorporated and a form for monthly reports incorporated. 

Rule 64V-1.021: Dissolution of marriage form updated and a 

form for monthly reports incorporated. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will 

not have an adverse impact on small business or likely 

increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of 

$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the 

implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by 

the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: Based on the SERC checklist, this rulemaking will not 

have an adverse impact or regulatory costs in excess of $1 

million within five years as established in Section 

120.541(2)(a), F.S. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 382.025, 382.0085, 

382.0255(1)(a) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 382.0085, 382.021, 382.023, 

741.01(1) FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Ana Goold, Quality Assurance 

Manager, Bureau of Vital Statistics at (904)359-6900 or by 

email: Ana.Goold@flhealth.gov 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

Substantial rewording of Rule 64V-1.0131 follows. See 

Florida Administrative Code for present text. 

64V-1.0131 Certifications of Vital Records; Information 

Required for Release; Applicant Identification Requirements. 

(1) All requests for certifications of vital record events 

listed below shall be submitted on the applications identified 

below or by submitting a request in writing that includes the 

information outlined in subsections (2) through (4) below. 

Applications and forms are available from the Department of 

Health, Bureau of Vital Statistics, P.O. Box 210, Jacksonville, 

Florida 32231-0042 and at    DOS link    .  Commemorative 

Birth and Marriage Certificates and Certificates of Birth 

Resulting in Stillbirth are created and issued only from the 

Bureau of Vital Statistics for purposes of display and are not 

intended to be used as official certifications. 

(a) Application for Florida Birth Record, DH 726, Dec. 

2010, or an Application for Florida Birth Record – County 

Use, DH 1960, June 2013, or tax collector office Application 

for Florida Birth Record, DH 1960TC, May 2014, all of which 

are incorporated by reference.  In the case of a homeless child 

or youth as those terms are defined in 42 U.S.C. section 

11434a of the McKinney-Vento Homeless Education 

Assistance Improvement Act of 2001, a Certified Homeless 

Youth Eligibility Certification, DH 5076, Apr. 2015, 

incorporated by reference, must accompany the application. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=339
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64V-1.0131
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64V-1.020
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64V-1.021
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20382.025
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20382.0085
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20382.0255(1)(a)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20382.0085
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20382.021
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20382.023
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20741.01(1)
http://www.flrules.com/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64V-1.0131


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

 

3213 

 

(b) Application for Florida Death or Fetal Death Record, 

DH 727, Jan. 2015, or an Application for a Florida Death 

Record – County Use, DH 1961, June 2013, both incorporated 

by reference. 

(c) Application for a Marriage Record for Licenses Issued 

in Florida, DH 261, Jan. 2015, incorporated by reference. 

(d) Application for Dissolution of Marriage Report 

Granted in Florida, DH 260, Jan. 2015, incorporated by 

reference. 

(e) Application for Florida Certificate of Birth Resulting 

in Stillbirth, DH 728, Aug. 2006, incorporated by reference. 

(f) Application for Dissolution of Marriage Report 

(Divorce or Annulment) Granted in Florida (Apostile or 

Exemplified), DH 260A, Jan. 2015, incorporated by reference. 

(g) Application for a Marriage Record for Licenses Issued 

in Florida (Apostile or Exemplified), DH 261A, Jan 2015, 

incorporated by reference. 

(h) Application for Florida Commemorative Marriage 

Certificate, DH 261C, Jan. 2015, incorporated by reference. 

(i) Application for a Florida Death or Fetal Death Record 

(Apostile or Exemplified), DH 727A, Jan. 2015, incorporated 

by reference. 

(j) Application for a Florida Birth Record (Apostile or 

Exemplified), DH 726A, Sep. 2010, incorporated by 

reference. 

(k) Application for Florida Commemorative Birth 

Certificate, DH 726C, Jan. 2015, incorporated by reference. 

(2) In the case of a request for a birth record, if the 

applicant is not an eligible person as identified in section 

382.025(1)(a), F.S., an Affidavit to Release a Birth 

Certification, DH 1958, Aug. 2010, or in the case of a death 

record including cause of death information, if the applicant is 

not an eligible person as identified in section 382.025(2), F.S., 

an Affidavit to Release Cause of Death Information, DH 1959, 

Aug 2010, both incorporated by reference, must be completed 

by an eligible person authorizing release of the birth record or 

cause of death information to the applicant. 

(3) If a written request is submitted in lieu of the 

prescribed DH forms, the request shall include the following 

information: 

(a) Name of the person whose record is being requested 

and the relationship between the applicant and the person 

whose record is requested.  

(b) Date of the event or if date of event is unknown, the 

year(s) to be searched; 

(c) County or city where the birth or death occurred, if 

known; 

(d) If birth, the father’s name when father is named on the 

record; and full name of the mother including her maiden 

surname; 

(e) If death, name of surviving spouse, if applicable and 

known and the social security number of decedent, if known. 

(4) A copy of valid photo identification must accompany 

the application or, if presented in person, department 

personnel must view the original accompanying photo 

identification for: 

(a) Birth less than 100 years old; 

(b) Death including cause of death less than 50 years old; 

(c) If requesting marriage record and if the requestor is 

named on the marriage record and the Social Security field for 

that person is also requested, then valid photo identification 

must accompany the request. 

(d) Primary forms of valid photo identification are: state 

driver’s license; military identification; Passport, state issued 

identification card, resident alien card issued by the U.S. 

Department of Justice, Certificate of Naturalization, 

Department of Corrections or U.S. Department of Justice 

inmate identification card, pilot’s license or a concealed 

weapons license. 

(e) If valid unexpired photo identification as indicated in 

subsection (4)(d) is not available, a minimum of three 

secondary types of identification may be submitted. Any 

document submitted must clearly establish the identity of the 

applicant and shall be reviewed for acceptability prior to 

issuance of confidential information.  Examples of secondary 

documents are: vehicle registration, vehicle or health 

insurance cards, life insurance policy, vehicle title, 

employment photo identification card, school photo 

identification, U.S. military discharge papers, veteran’s 

administration card, social security card, marriage license, 

copies of children’s birth records, property tax bill, WIC, 

Medicaid or other social services form of identification, or 

other similar documents if they are helpful in establishing 

identity and are acceptable to the state registrar. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 382.003(7), (10), 382.025, 382.0085, 

382.0255(1)(a), FS. Law Implemented 382.025, 382.0085 FS. 

History–New 11-11-98, Amended 2-29-04, 12-12-06, 5-13-08,        . 

 

64V-1.020 Marriage Reporting. 

Marriages occurring in Florida shall be recorded on an 

electronic system provided by the Department of Health or on 

a Marriage Record, DH Form 743, Jan. 2015, Apr. 98, hereby 

incorporated by reference. Both parties to a marriage may 

affirm they have children in common born in Florida using an 

Affirmation of Common Child(ren) Born in Florida, DH 

743A, Jan. 2015, incorporated by reference. Unless 

transmitted electronically, monthly marriage reports required 

by section 382.021 F.S. shall include the Marriage Monthly 

Report, DH 133, Feb. 2004, incorporated by reference.  Forms 

are and available from the Florida Department of Health, 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64V-1.020


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

3214 

Bureau State Office of Vital Statistics, P. O. Box 210, 

Jacksonville, Florida 32231-0042, and at   DOS link      . or on 

an electronic system provided by the Department of Health.  

Rulemaking Specific Authority 382.003(7), (10) FS. Law 

Implemented 382.021, 741.01(1) 382.023 FS. History-New 2-29-04, 

Amended 5-13-08,                    . 

 

64V-1.021 Dissolution of Marriage Reporting. 

Dissolution of Marriages shall be recorded on an electronic 

system provided by the Department of Health or on a Report 

of Dissolution of Marriage – Annulment of Marriage, DH 

Form 513, Jan. 2015, Oct. 96, hereby incorporated by 

reference. Unless transmitted electronically, monthly reports 

required by section 382.023 F.S. shall include the Dissolution 

of Marriage Monthly Report, DH 730, Feb. 2004, incorporated 

by reference.  and Forms are available from the Florida 

Department of Health, Bureau State Office of Vital Statistics, 

P. O. Box 210, Jacksonville, Florida 32231-0042, and at   

DOS link       . or on an electronic system provided by the 

Department of Health. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 382.003(7), (10) FS. Law 

Implemented 382.023 FS. History-New 2-29-04, Amended 5-13-08, 

___. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Ana Goold, Quality Assurance Manager, Bureau of Vital 

Statistics. 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: John H. Armstrong, MD, FACS, Surgeon 

General and Secretary 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: July 9, 2015 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: April 21, 2015 

Section III 

Notice of Changes, Corrections and 

Withdrawals 

DEPARTMENT OF CITRUS 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

20-3.005 General Provisions 

20-3.007 Post Estimate Price Report 

20-3.010 Fruit Pricing Verification Report 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 41 No. 116, June 16, 

2015 issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

20-3.005 General Provisions. 

(2)(b) 1. c. Fruit contracted for multi-years and/or future 

seasons For multi-year future season (Long Term Contract-

basis). 

2. Fruit contracted with no price Prices in these contracts 

need not be specified at the time the contract is executed; 

written, but however, the price must be calculable at time of 

fruit delivery. 

(2)(j) 1. c. For which Which only the Intermediate Price is 

available during week of delivery/processing.; and 

d. 2. For which the Final Price or pricing basis for the 

'rise' is not known during the week of delivery/processing due 

to This category may also include contracts with ‘floor’ and 

‘rise’ language in the executed contract if the Final Price or 

pricing basis for the ‘rise’ is not known during the week of 

delivery/processing. 

(4) Reports as required under this rule chapter are subject 

to the inspection of records provision of s. 601.70, Fla. Stat. 

 

20-3.007(5) Each entity required to report shall have a 

representative attend reporting training to be held at the 

Florida Department of Citrus building, led by staff, on a date 

to be announced prior to the beginning of each fruit season. 

 

20-3.010 Post Estimate Fruit Pricing Verification Report. 

All licensed citrus fruit dealers engaged in the processing of 

processed citrus products or delivery of fruit for toll pack 

processing, shall file a post estimate fruit pricing verification 

report twice a season, after the end of each facility's 

completing processing of early season fruit and late season 

fruit.  Fruit pricing verification reports shall be submitted on 

forms provided by the Department of Citrus and incorporated 

by reference into Rule 20-100.004, F.A.C., and shall be 

delivered by email to the location designated on the 

aforementioned forms.  The reports are to be utilized by staff 

in preparing the Post-Estimate Price Report. 

DEPARTMENT OF CITRUS 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

20-100.004 Official Forms Used by Agency 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 41 No. 116, June 16, 

2015 issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

(1) Application for License as Citrus Fruit Dealer - 

CIT/LIC/01 Eff. __________ available at (URL to be 

provided at time of adoption). 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64V-1.021
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=20-3.005
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=20-3.007
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=20-3.010
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=20-100.004


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

 

3215 

 

Substantive changes have been made to CIT/LIC/01, Page 4, 

Item 17. 

Business references are required for all new applicants. By 

completing this section, applicant is subject to the 

Department’s authority to investigate applicant's reputation 

pursuant to Chapter 601.57(1), F.S. perform a background 

check pursuant to Chapter 601, F.S. 

(33)(34) Form 4R - Equalization Advertising Assessment 

Return - CIT/REV/04R Eff. ______ 5-15-12 available at 

(URL to be provided at time of adoption). 

(51) Dealer’s Statement and Affidavit for Importing 

Citrus Products - CIT/DSA/8 Eff. _______ 6-07 available at 

(URL to be provided at time of adoption). 

(52) Statement of Trade Secret – CIT/STS/10 Eff. 

________ available at (URL to be provided at time of 

adoption). 

Rulemaking Authority 601.10(1), 601.15(5), 601.155(7), 601.56, 

601.69(9), F.S. Law Implemented 601.10(15), 601.15, 601.155, 

601.55, 601.56, 601.69, F.S. History--New 1-1-75, Amended 8-31-

83, 2-26-84, Formerly 20-102.05, Amended 12-20-95, Formerly 20-

102.005, Amended and Transferred 12-6-98, Amended 5-28-00, 9-

20-07, 7-13-10, 11-28-12,__________. 

DEPARTMENT OF CITRUS 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

20-108.001 General Provisions 

20-108.0041 Bond Exempt Fruit 

20-108.011 Application for Agent Registration 

20-108.012 Examination of Agent Application 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 
Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 41 No. 116, June 16, 

2015 issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

20-108.001 General Provisions. 

(1) Any person desiring to engage in business as a citrus 

fruit dealer in the state shall make application on forms 

provided by the department (CIT/LIC/01 Rev. _________, 

subsection 20-100.004(1) F.A.C.). F.A.C. and CIT/LIC/02 rev. 

6-22-04, subsection 20-100.004(2) F.A.C.). 

Rulemaking Authority 601.10(1), 601.56 FS. Law Implemented 

601.03(8), 601.10(5), 601.55, 601.56, 601.57, 601.58, 601.60, 601.61 

FS. History--Revised 12-18-74, Effective 12-31-74, Formerly 105-

2.02(1), Formerly 20-108.01, Amended 4-23-95, 7-2-03, 1-28-

13,______________. 

 

20-108.0041 Bond Exempt Fruit. 

(4) Fruit handled by the applicant from citrus groves for 

which the applicant provides complete grove management 

services, under direct contract with the owner or producer. 

5.(b) Submit the balance of all payment received, along 

with a full accounting of all expenditures, to the producer. 

(b)(c) The contract shall be properly executed, cover the 

period for which the license is to be issued, and shall include 

show, among other things, the following: 

(c)(d) A copy of all such contracts shall be filed with the 

Department of Citrus.  If the Department finds that the 

contract or contracts conform with all requirements outlined 

above, it shall recommend to the Department of Agriculture 

that the contracting dealer not be required to post bond for that 

volume of fruit covered by such contracts. 

(5) Fruit handled by a corporate or partnership applicant 

that is from citrus groves owned by officers or stockholders of 

the corporation, the parent corporation, a wholly owned 

subsidiary corporation or its corporate officers or 

stockholders, or any partner of a partnership.  To qualify for 

bond exemption, properly executed waivers of right to any 

claim against any citrus fruit dealer's bond which may be 

posted by the applicant for other fruit handled shall be 

attached to and made a part of the application for license.  The 

waivers shall cover the period of time for which the license is 

to be issued and shall include show, among other things, the 

following: 

 

20-108.011 Application for Agent Registration. 

(1) Any citrus fruit dealer desiring to register an agent 

shall make application on form FDACS-07054 Rev. 08/14, 

Application for Registration as Citrus Fruit Dealer's Agent, 

incorporated herein by reference, (http site to be provided) 

furnished by the Department of Agriculture for registration of 

such person as his duly authorized agent. 

 

20-108.012 Examination of Agent Application. 

(2) An application for agent registration from which 

questions arise as to their past history relating to citrus as 

outlined above or by a person, or spouse, parent, or sibling of 

a person, who has previously been denied a citrus fruit dealer 

license by the Florida Citrus Commission shall, prior to 

registration being granted, be referred to the Department of 

Citrus, together with a report detailing the facts and 

circumstances surrounding the application.  Agent registration 

shall not be approved if the Florida Citrus Commission makes 

a finding that such person would not be qualified for license as 

a citrus fruit dealer. 

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION 

Medicaid 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

59G-13.070 Developmental Disabilities Individual 

Budgeting Waiver Services 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=20-108.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=20-108.0041
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=20-108.011
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=20-108.012
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=192
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59G-13.070


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

3216 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 41 No. 52, March 17, 

2015 issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

(2) All providers of Developmental Disabilities Individual 

Budgeting Waiver services who are enrolled in the Florida 

Medicaid program must be in compliance with the provisions 

of the Florida Medicaid Developmental Disabilities Individual 

Budgeting Waiver Services Coverage and Limitations 

Handbook,_________. The handbook is available from the 

Medicaid fiscal agent’s Web site at 

http://portal.flmmis.com/flpublic www.mymedicaid-

florida.com. Select Public Information for Providers, then 

Provider Support, and then Provider Handbooks. 

(3) The following forms are is been included in the 

Florida Medicaid Developmental Disabilities Individual 

Budgeting Waiver Services Coverage and Limitations 

Handbook, in the order these appear in the handbook, and are 

is incorporated by reference:  

(a) Medicaid Waiver Services Agreement, AHCA Form 

5000-3553,____________ 

(b) Incident Reporting Form, APD 10-002, April 1, 2014 

(c) Functional Community Assessment Form, AHCA 

Form 5000-3556, ____________ 

(d) Housing Survey Form, AHCA Form 5000-3552, 

____________ 

(e) Financial Profile, AHCA Form 5000-3557, 

____________ 

(f) Qualifications for Trainers/Trainer Agreement Form, 

AHCA Form 5000-3554, ____________ 

Rulemaking Authority 393.501 409.919 FS. Law Implemented 

393.0662, 409.902, 409.906, 409.907, 409.908, 409.912, 409.913 FS. 

History–New__________. 

 

As substantial changes were made to the Florida Medicaid 

Developmental Disabilities Individual Budgeting Waiver 

Services Coverage and Limitations Handbook, a copy of the 

handbook, with the changes incorporated, is available at 

http://ahca.myflorida.com/Medicaid/review/index.shtml. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Division of Children’s Medical Services 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

64C-11.001 Curriculum for Investigations and Handling 

of Sudden Unexpected Infant Death 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 41 No. 136, July 15, 

2015 issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

64C-11.001 Training Standards for Law Enforcement 

Agencies Investigating First Responders to a Sudden 

Unexpected Infant Death. 

(1) For the purpose of this rule, the term “first 

responders” means a law enforcement officer, firefighter, 

emergency medical technician, paramedic, or other individual 

serving in similar capacity, that is the initial person at the 

scene of a sudden unexpected infant death. 

(2) All law enforcement agencies will provide training in 

first responders will complete a course of instruction that 

includes curriculum on investigating a case of sudden 

unexpected infant death using the and responding to the 

affected parents or caregivers. 

(3) The Sudden Unexpected Infant Death Investigation 

Curriculum Guide (March 2007), is herein incorporated by 

reference and is available at 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-05617, 

or from CMS Headquarters at 4052 Bald Cypress Way Bin 

#A06, Tallahassee, Florida 32399. 

Rulemaking Authority 383.3362(3)(c) FS. Law Implemented 

383.3362(3) FS. History – New________. 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Finance 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

69V-180.002 Adoption of Forms 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 41 No. 65, April 3, 

2015 issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

These changes are made in response to comments made by the 

Joint Administrative Procedures Committee and at a public 

hearing held on the rule on July 6, 2015. 

 

69V-180.002 Adoption of Forms. 

(1) No change. 

(a) No change. 

1. Registration of Commercial Collection Agency – Form 

OFR-COM-101, effective MM/DD/YYYY; 

2. Exhibit A, effective MM/DD/YYYY; and available at 

http://www.flrules.org. 

http://www.mymedicaid-florida.com/
http://www.mymedicaid-florida.com/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=333
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64C-11.001
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-05617
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=524
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69V-180.002


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

 

3217 

 

3. State of Florida Office of Financial Regulation 

Commercial Collection Agency Surety Bond Form – Form 

OFR-CCA-101, effective 05-01-04, available at 

http://www.flrules.org. 

(b) Consumer Collection Agency Forms: 

1. Application for Registration as Consumer Collection 

Agency – Form OFR-559-101, effective ___________, and 

available at http://www.flrules.org; 

2. Florida Consumer Collection Practices Act Complaint 

Form – Form OFR-559-102, effective ___________ , and 

available at http://www.flrules.org. 

(2) Each ultimate equitable owner of 10% or greater 

interest, each chief executive officer, each chief financial 

officer, chief operations officer, chief legal officer, chief 

compliance officer, control person, member, partner, joint 

venturer, and each director of an entity applying for 

registration as a consumer collection agency, shall submit a 

completed Biographical Summary Form OFR-559-101 to the 

Office of Financial Regulation. 

 

The remainder of the rule reads as previously published. 

 

The following changes have been made to incorporated forms: 

 Form OFR-COM-101: 

Page 1 of Form OFR-COM-101 was revised to remove the 

word “certified” from the sentence located below the title of 

the form. The sentence now reads, “This form shall be 

accompanied by payment of a $500.00 non-refundable 

registration fee.” Form OFR-COM-101 was revised to 

reference the rule incorporating the form and a placeholder for 

the effective date was added to the bottom margin of the form. 

 Exhibit A: 

At the bottom of Exhibit A, the Office added in necessary 

language to meet the requirements of section 

119.071(5)(a)2.a., F.S. In the bottom margin of Exhibit A, the 

Office inserted language reflecting an effective date 

placeholder. 

 Form OFR-559-101: 

The citation in the first paragraph of Page 1 on Form OFR-

559-101 was changed to section 559.553(3), F.S. 

On page 1 of Form OFR-559-101, a change was made to 

reflect the correct reference to Rule Chapter 69V-180.  

On page 2 of Form OFR-559-101, in the section explaining 

question 3B, the Office added language specifying which 

applicants must submit a Biographical Summary. 

On page 4 of Form OFR-559-101, Section B, a reference to 

section 559.55(4), F.S. was added. 

On page 4 of Form OFR-559-101, in the second paragraph of 

Section B, the Office added in necessary language to meet the 

requirements of section 119.071(5)(a)2.a., F.S. 

On page 5 of Form OFR-559-101, the signature portion of the 

application requiring a submission of an oath or affirmation 

under penalty of perjury was removed. The Office added in 

language found in section 836.07, F.S. 

On page 10 of Form OFR-559-101, section 12, the Office 

changed the language to read, “In addition to the information 

requested in this DRP, provide documentation relating to the 

disposition of each matter. Such documentation includes 

certified copies of criminal convictions or administrative 

orders entered against you.” 

 FORM OFR-559-102: 

A change to FORM OFR-559-102 was made to remove the 

sentence, “Under penalty of perjury pursuant to Section 

837.06, F.S.,” found in the last paragraph. 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Finance 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

69V-180.020 Commercial Collection Registration Form 

and Procedures 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 41 No. 65, April 3, 

2015 issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

These changes are made in response to comments made by the 

Joint Administrative Procedures Committee and at a public 

hearing held on the rule on July 6, 2015. 

 

69V-180.020 Commercial Collection Registration Form 

and Procedures. 

(1) No change. 

(a) A completed Registration of Commercial Collection 

Agency form, Form OFR-COM-101, effective MM-DD-

YYYY, which is hereby incorporated by reference and 

available by mail from the Office of Financial Regulation, 200 

East Gaines Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0376; 

(b) If a partnership, sole proprietorship or corporation, a 

completed Exhibit A, as incorporated in Rule 69V-

180.002(1)(a)2., F.A.C. 

(c)(b) A non-refundable registration fee of $500 for the 

annual registration period beginning January 1 of each 

calendar year or any part thereof. 

(d)(c) Evidence of a current surety bond in the amount of 

$50,000 as required in Rule 69V-180.010(1), F.A.C. 

(2) Request for Additional Information. An incomplete 

registration form shall not be considered as validly received. A 

request for additional information will be made by the Office 

of Financial Regulation within thirty (30) days after initial 

receipt of the incomplete registration form by the Office of 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=524
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69V-180.020


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

3218 

Financial Regulation. The additional information must be 

received by the Office of Financial Regulation within forty-

five (45) days from the date of request. Failure to respond to 

the request within forty-five (45) days from the date of request 

shall be construed by the Office of Financial Regulation as 

grounds for rejection of the registration for failure to complete 

the registration and the registration shall be rejected pursuant 

to Section 120.60(12), F.S. 

 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: December 17, 2014 2015 

 

The remainder of the rule reads as previously published. 

 

The following changes have been made to incorporated forms: 

Form OFR-COM-101: 

Page 1 of Form OFR-COM-101 was revised to remove the 

word “certified” from the sentence located below the title of 

the form. The sentence now reads, “This form shall be 

accompanied by payment of a $500.00 non-refundable 

registration fee.” Form OFR-COM-101 was revised to 

reference the rule incorporating the form and a placeholder for 

the effective date was added to the bottom margin of the form. 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Finance 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

69V-180.030 Consumer Collection Registration Form and 

Procedures 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 41 No. 65, April 3, 

2015 issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

These changes are made in response to comments made by the 

Joint Administrative Procedures Committee. 

 

69V-180.030 Consumer Collection Registration Form and 

Procedures. 

Rulemaking Authority 559.554, 559.555, 559.5551 FS. Law 

Implemented, 559.551, 559.5551, 559.553, 559.555 FS. History–

New 2-15-94, Formerly 3D-180.030, Amended __________. 

 

The remainder of the rule reads as previously published. 

 

The following changes have been made to incorporated forms: 

Form OFR-559-101: 

The citation in the first paragraph of Page 1 on Form OFR-

559-101 was changed to section 559.553(3), F.S. 

On page 1 of Form OFR-559-101, a change was made to 

reflect the correct reference to Rule Chapter 69V-180.  

On page 2 of Form OFR-559-101, in the section explaining 

question 3B, the Office added language specifying which 

applicants must submit a Biographical Summary. 

On page 4 of Form OFR-559-101, Section B, a reference to 

section 559.55(4), F.S. was added. 

On page 4 of Form OFR-559-101, in the second paragraph of 

Section B, the Office added in necessary language to meet the 

requirements of section 119.071(5)(a)2.a., F.S. 

On page 5 of Form OFR-559-101, the signature portion of the 

application requiring a submission of an oath or affirmation 

under penalty of perjury was removed. The Office added in 

language found in section 836.07, F.S. 

On page 10 of Form OFR-559-101, section 12, the Office 

changed the language to read, “In addition to the information 

requested in this DRP, provide documentation relating to the 

disposition of each matter. Such documentation includes 

certified copies of criminal convictions or administrative 

orders entered against you.” 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Finance 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

69V-180.031 Consumer Collection Agency Electronic 

Filing of Forms and Fees 

NOTICE OF CORRECTION 

Notice is hereby given that the following correction has been 

made to the proposed rule in Vol. 41 No. 65, April 3, 2015 

issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

These changes are made in response to comments made by the 

Joint Administrative Procedures Committee. 

 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: December 17, 2014 2015 

 

The remainder of the rule reads as previously published. 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Finance 

RULE NO.:  RULE TITLE: 

69V-180.032  Effect of Law Enforcement Records on 

Applications for Consumer Collection 

Agency Registration 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 41 No. 65, April 3, 

2015 issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=524
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69V-180.030
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=524
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69V-180.031
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=524
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69V-180.032


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

 

3219 

 

These changes are made in response to comments made by the 

Joint Administrative Procedures Committee and at a public 

hearing held on the rule on July 6, 2015. 

 

69V-180.032 Effect of Law Enforcement Records on 

Applications for Consumer Collection Agency Registration. 

(2) General Procedure Regarding Law Enforcement 

Records. At the time of submitting an Application for 

Registration as a Consumer Collection Agency, Form OFR-

559-101, which is incorporated by reference in Rule 69V-

180.002(1)(b)1, F.A.C., the applicant shall disclose on the 

application form any pending criminal charges and all 

criminal matters in which a control person has pled guilty or 

nolo contendere to, or has been convicted or found guilty, 

regardless of whether adjudication was withheld, of any crime. 

The applicant shall supply the Office with required 

documentation for each control person, as specified in this 

rule, relating to: 1) all criminal matters in which the control 

person has pled guilty or nolo contendere to, or has been 

convicted or found guilty, regardless of whether adjudication 

was withheld, of a class “A”, “B”, or “C” crime as described 

in paragraphs 15, 16, and 17 16, 17, and 18 of this rule, 2) any 

pending criminal charges for a control person relating to a 

class “A”, “B”, or “C” crime as described in this rule, or 3) 

evidence that such documentation cannot be obtained. 

Evidence that documentation cannot be obtained shall consist 

of a written statement on the letterhead of the agency that 

would be the custodian of the documents, signed by a 

representative of that agency, stating that they have no record 

of such matter, or that the record is lost or was damaged or 

destroyed, or otherwise stating why the document cannot be 

produced. The required documentation must be legible. 

Required documentation includes: 

(4) Classification of Crimes. 

(a) The Office makes a general classification of crimes 

into three classes: A, B and C, as listed in subsections (15), 

(16), and (17) (16), (17) and (18) of this rule. 

(7) No change. 

(a) No change. 

1. One year is deducted if the probation officer or 

prosecuting attorney in the most recent crime states in a signed 

writing that the probation officer or prosecuting attorney 

believes the control person of the applicant would pose no 

significant threat to public welfare if registered as a Consumer 

Collection Agency. 

Rulemaking Authority 559.554, 559.555, 559.5551, FS. Law 

Implemented 559.554(2)(b), 559.5551, 559.730 FS. History – New 

________. 

 

The remainder of the rule reads as previously published. 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Finance 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

69V-180.040 Consumer Collection Agency Complaint 

Form and Procedures 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 41 No. 65, April 3, 

2015 issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

 

These changes are made in response to comments made by the 

Joint Administrative Procedures Committee 

 

69V-180.040 Consumer Collection Agency Complaint 

Form and Procedures. 

Each consumer desiring to file a complaint against a consumer 

collection agency shall submit to the Office of Financial 

Regulation a completed Florida Consumer Collection 

Practices Act Complaint form, Form OFR-559-102,  

effective MM-DD-YY, available at 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/reference.asp?NO=Ref-

00640, which is hereby incorporated by reference. Such form 

shall be filed with the Office of Financial Regulation, 200 East 

Gaines Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0376. 

 

The remainder of the rule reads as previously published. 

 

The following changes have been made to incorporated forms: 

FORM OFR-559-102: 

A change to FORM OFR-559-102 was made to remove the 

sentence, “Under penalty of perjury pursuant to Section 

837.06, F.S.,” found in the last paragraph. 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Finance 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

69V-180.100 Guidelines for Imposing Administrative 

Penalties 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 41 No. 65, April 3, 

2015 issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

These changes are made in response to comments made by the 

Joint Administrative Procedures Committee and at a public 

hearing held on the rule on July 6, 2015. 

 

69V-180.100 Disciplinary Guidelines. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=524
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69V-180.040
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/reference.asp?NO=Ref-00640
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/reference.asp?NO=Ref-00640
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=524
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69V-180.100


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

3220 

(1) Pursuant to Section 559.730(7), F.S., guidelines 

applicable to each ground for disciplinary action that may be 

imposed by the Office against a person for a violation of Part 

VI, Chapter 559, F.S. are hereby adopted. The disciplinary 

guidelines are contained in “Office of Financial Regulation, 

Division of Consumer Finance, Disciplinary Guidelines for 

Consumer Collection Agencies”, which is hereby incorporated 

by reference, effective MM/DD/YYYY. A copy of the 

disciplinary guidelines is available on the Office’s website at 

www.flofr.com, and by mail from the Office of Financial 

Regulation, 200 East Gaines Street, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-0376 and at http://www.flrules.org. In determining an 

appropriate penalty within the range of penalties prescribed in 

the guidelines for each violation as based upon the citation 

number, the Office shall consider subsection (2) and (3). For 

the purpose of this rule and the guidelines, the term “citation” 

means any written notice provided to and received by the 

registrant that specifies a violation of Chapter 559, F.S., or any 

rule promulgated under that chapter. 

(3) No change. 

a. No change. 

5. If the consumer collection agency is responsive to the 

Office’s requests or inquiries or made no attempt to impede or 

delay provided substantial assistance to the Office in its 

examination or investigation of the underlying misconduct; or 

 

The remainder of the rule reads as previously published. 

 

The following changes have been made to incorporated forms: 

Office of Financial Regulation, Division of Consumer 

Finance, Disciplinary Guidelines for Consumer Collection 

Agencies: 

The Office revised rows 27-40 of the Disciplinary Guidelines 

to reflect the correct statutory citations. 

The Office revised row 28 of the Disciplinary Guidelines to 

reflect the correct language as found in the cited statute. 

The Office inserted language in the header section of each 

page of the Disciplinary Guidelines indicating a placeholder 

for the effective date. 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

Division of Workforce Services 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

73B-20.004 Filing an Appeal 

73B-20.015 Notice of Hearing 

73B-20.016 Continuances 

73B-20.025 Decision 

NOTICE OF CORRECTION 

Notice is hereby given that the following correction has been 

made to the proposed rule in Vol. 41 No. 137, July 16, 2015 

issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

The correction is in response to a letter received from the Joint 

Administrative Procedures Committee dated July 8, 2015. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will 

not have an adverse impact on small business or likely 

increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of 

$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the 

implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by 

the Agency. 

The Agency has reviewed Section 120.541(2)(a), Florida 

Statutes, and has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification. The proposed rule 

amendments will not likely adversely impact economic 

growth, private-sector job creation or employment, private-

sector investment, or business competitiveness and will not 

likely cause an increase in regulatory costs. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Reemployment Assistance Appeals 

Commission (Frank E. Brown, Chairman; Thomas D. Epsky, 

Member; Joseph D. Finnegan, Member) 

Section IV 

Emergency Rules 

NONE 

Section V 

Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Rule 

Variance or Waiver 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001 Safety Standards 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on July 13, 2015, the 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division 

of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received 

a petition for Covert II. Petitioner seeks an emergency 

variance of the requirements of ASME A17.3, Section 3.11.3, 

as adopted by subsection 61C-5.001(1), F.A.C., that requires 

upgrading the elevators with firefighters’ emergency 

operations which poses a significant economic/financial 

hardship. Any interested person may file comments within 5 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1065
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73B-20.004
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73B-20.015
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73B-20.016
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=73B-20.025
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

 

3221 

 

days of the publication of this notice with Michelle 

Comingore, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940 North Monroe 

Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013 (VW2015-168). 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be 

obtained by contacting: Michelle Comingore, Bureau of 

Elevator Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-1013. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001 Safety Standards 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on July 13, 2015, the 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division 

of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received 

a petition for Vista Bay. Petitioner seeks an emergency 

variance of the requirements of ASME A17.3, Section 3.11.3, 

as adopted by subsection 61C-5.001(1), F.A.C., that requires 

upgrading the elevators with firefighters’ emergency 

operations which poses a significant economic/financial 

hardship. Any interested person may file comments within 5 

days of the publication of this notice with Michelle 

Comingore, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940 North Monroe 

Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013 (VW2015-169). 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be 

obtained by contacting: Michelle Comingore, Bureau of 

Elevator Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-1013. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001 Safety Standards 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on July 13, 2015, the 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division 

of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received 

a petition for Cane Palm Beach Condo. Assn. Petitioner seeks 

a temporary variance of the requirements of ASME A17.3, 

Section 2.7.5(a)(b)(c) and ASME A17.1, Section 3.19.2.3, as 

adopted by subsection 61C-5.001(1), F.A.C., that requires 

upgrading the elevator door restrictors and pipe supports 

which poses a significant economic/financial hardship. Any 

interested person may file comments within 14 days of the 

publication of this notice with Michelle Comingore, Bureau of 

Elevator Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-1013 (VW2015-164). 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be 

obtained by contacting: Michelle Comingore, Bureau of 

Elevator Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-1013. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001 Safety Standards 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on July 13, 2015, the 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division 

of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received 

a petition for The Haven Association, Inc. Petitioner seeks an 

emergency variance of the requirements of ASME A17.3, 

Section 3.11.3, as adopted by subsection 61C-5.001(1), 

F.A.C., that requires upgrading the elevators with firefighters’ 

emergency operations which poses a significant 

economic/financial hardship. Any interested person may file 

comments within 5 days of the publication of this notice with 

Michelle Comingore, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940 North 

Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013 (VW2015-

165). 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be 

obtained by contacting: Michelle Comingore, Bureau of 

Elevator Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-1013. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001 Safety Standards 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on July 13, 2015, the 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division 

of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received 

a petition for UF Government House Building. Petitioner 

seeks an emergency variance of the requirements of ASME 

A17.3, Section 3.4.5, 2.6.3, 3.10.3, as adopted by subsection 

61C-5.001(1), F.A.C., that requires upgrading the elevators 

hoistway door vision panels, car illumination and top-of-car 

operating devices which poses a significant 

economic/financial hardship. Any interested person may file 

comments within 5 days of the publication of this notice with 

Michelle Comingore, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940 North 

Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013 (VW2015-

166). 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be 

obtained by contacting: Michelle Comingore, Bureau of 

Elevator Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-1013. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

3222 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001 Safety Standards 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on July 13, 2015, the 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division 

of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received 

a petition for The Paramount on Lake Eola. Petitioner seeks an 

emergency variance of the requirements of ASME A17.1b, 

Section 5.2.1.2 as adopted by subsection 61C-5.001(1), 

F.A.C., that requires upgrading the elevator pits which poses a 

significant economic/financial hardship. Any interested person 

may file comments within 5 days of the publication of this 

notice with Michelle Comingore, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 

1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013 

(VW2015-167). 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be 

obtained by contacting: Michelle Comingore, Bureau of 

Elevator Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-1013. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Construction Industry Licensing Board 

The Construction Industry Licensing Board hereby gives 

notice: 

Of the issuance of an Order regarding the Petition for 

Variance or Waiver, filed on March 26, 2015, by Mehdi 

Jalayer and Ye Zhou. The Notice of Petition for Waiver or 

Variance was published in Vol. 41, No. 62, of the March 31, 

2015, Florida Administrative Register. Petitioner sought a 

waiver or variance of subsections 61G4-12.011(11), 61G4-

12.011(12), 61G4-15.006(1), and 61G4-15.002(3), F.A.C., 

regarding the requirements for an individual seeking to 

become a financially responsibility officer. The Board 

considered the instant Petition at a duly-noticed public 

meeting held on April 10, 2015, in Tampa, Florida. 

The Board’s Order, filed on June 10, 2015, hereby grants a 

waiver of the subject rules as requested by Petitioner. 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be 

obtained by contacting: Daniel Biggins, Executive Director, 

Construction Industry Licensing Board, Northwood Center, 

1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399 or 

telephone: (850)487-1395 or by electronic mail: 

Amanda.Wynn@myfloridalicense.com. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Construction Industry Licensing Board 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on June 4, 2015, the 

Construction Industry Licensing Board, received a petition for 

variance or waiver filed by Ed Gund. The petitioner is seeking 

a variance or waiver of Rule 61G4-16.005, F.A.C., which 

requires for the purpose of certification, a passing grade shall 

be valid only for a period of four (4) years from the date the 

list of successful candidates is approved by the Board. 

Comments on this petition should be filed with Construction 

Industry Licensing Board, Northwood Center, 1940 North 

Monroe Street, Tallahassee, FL 32399, within 14 days of 

publication of this notice. 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be 

obtained by contacting: Dan Biggins, Executive Director, 

Construction Industry Licensing Board, at the above address 

or telephone: (850)487-1395 or by electronic mail: 

Amanda.Wynn@myfloridalicense.com. 

Section VI 

Notice of Meetings, Workshops and Public 

Hearings 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

State Board of Education 

The State Board of Education announces a public meeting to 

which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: July 23, 2015, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Tampa Airport Marriott, Duval Conference Room, 

4200 George J. Bean Parkway, Tampa, Florida 33607 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The meeting agenda will consist of approval of minutes of the 

State Board meeting held June 24, 2015. Updates will be 

provided by Superintendent Lori White on behalf of the 

Florida Association of District School Superintendents and 

President Eileen Holden on behalf of the Council of 

Presidents. Items for consideration include action relating to 

the following: Amendment to Rule 6A-5.030, District 

Instructional Personnel and School Administrator Evaluation 

Systems; New Rule 6A-5.0411, Calculations of Student 

Learning Growth for Use in School Personnel Evaluations; 

Amendment to Rule 6A-14.095, Site Determined 

Baccalaureate Access; Approval of Performance Funding for 

the Florida College System; Amendment to Rule 6A-10.040, 

Basic Skills Requirements for Postsecondary Career 

Certificate Education; and Amendment to Rule 6M-9.300, 

Child Care Resource and Referral and Consumer Education. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Cathy 

Schroeder at (850)245-9661 or cathy.schroeder@fldoe.org or 

by visiting the Department’s website at: 

http://www.fldoe.org/policy/state-board-of-edu/meetings. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=274
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=274
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=195


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

 

3223 

 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least seven days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Cathy Schroeder at (850)245-9661 or 

cathy.schroeder@fldoe.org. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Cathy Schroeder at 

(850)245-9661 or cathy.schroeder@fldoe.org. 

DEPARTMENT OF LAW ENFORCEMENT 

Criminal Justice Standards and Training Commission 

The Criminal Justice Standards and Training Commission 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATES AND TIMES: August 3-6, 2015 

August 3, 2015 – Open 

August 4, 2015, 8:30 a.m. ‒ 12:00 Noon, Florida Criminal 

Justice Educators Association Meeting 

August 4, 2015, 12:00 Noon ‒ 1:00 p.m., Training Center 

Director Executive Committee Meeting (Board Members 

Only) 

August 4, 2015, 1:00 p.m. ‒ 2:30 p.m., Training Center 

Director Steering Committee Meeting (Steering Committee 

Members Only) 

August 4, 2015, 2:30 p.m. ‒ 4:00 p.m., Training Center 

Director Basic Recruit Committee Meeting 

August 4, 2015, 2:30 p.m. ‒ 4:00 p.m., Training Center 

Advanced/Specialized Training Committee Meeting 

August 4, 2015, 2:30 p.m. ‒ 4:00 p.m., Training Center 

Director High Liability Committee Meeting 

August 4, 2015, 2:30 p.m. ‒ 4:00 p.m., Training Center 

Director Rules Committee Meeting 

August 4, 2015, 2:30 p.m. ‒ 4:00 p.m., Training Center 

Technology Committee Meeting 

August 4, 2015, 2:30 p.m. ‒ 4:00 p.m., Training Center 

Officer Wellness Committee Meeting 

August 4, 2015, 4:00 p.m. ‒ 5:00 p.m., Training Center 

Director Open Forum 

August 5, 2015, 8:30 a.m. ‒ Open, Training Center Directors 

Association Business Meeting 

August 5, 2015, 10:00 a.m. ‒ Open, Probable Cause 

Determination Hearings 

August 5, 2015, 1:00 p.m. ‒ Open, Regional Criminal Justice 

Selection Center Directors Association 

August 5, 2015, 3:00 p.m. ‒ 5:00 p.m., Commission 

Workshops; Topics: 1) Auxiliary Law Enforcement Basic 

Recruit Training Program; and 2) Report on Perishable Skills 

Relative to Four-Year Window for Basic Recruit Students 

August 6, 2015, 8:30 a.m. ‒ Open, Criminal Justice Standards 

and Training Commission Business Meeting 

August 6, 2015, 10:00 a.m. ‒ Open, Criminal Justice 

Standards and Training Commission Officer Disciplinary 

Hearings 

PLACE: Sawgrass Marriott, 1000 PGA Tour Blvd., Ponte 

Vedra Beach, FL 32082 

Reservation Number: 1(800)457-4653 (GOLF), Telephone 

Number: (904)285-7777, Fax Number: (904)285-0906 

$107.00 per night plus applicable taxes, for Single/Double, 

Available from 8/2/2015 – 8/7/2015. Check-in: 4:00 p.m. and 

Check-out: 11:00 a.m. Cancellations made within 24 hours 

prior to arrival will forfeit one night’s room and tax. Group 

Name: FDLE - Criminal Justice Standards & Training 

Commission Meeting; Reservation Deadline: July 17, 2015, 

3:00 p.m., EST; Self-Parking: Complimentary; Valet Parking: 

$24. 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The above meetings are held to discuss issues relating to 

standards, training, examinations, certification, de-

certification, record management for law enforcement, 

correctional, and correctional probation officers, trust fund 

issues, Commission rules, officer discipline penalty 

guidelines, and certification and recertification of criminal 

justice training schools. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Joyce 

Gainous-Harris at (850)410-8615 or e-mail: JoyceGainous-

Harris@fdle.state.fl.us if you have questions about the above 

meetings. 

If you have questions about the Officer Discipline Agenda, 

please contact Anjani Patel at (850)410-8625 or e-mail: 

AnjaniPatel@fdle.state.fl.us 

If you have questions about hotel accommodations, please 

contact Cheryl Taylor at (850)410-8657 or e-mail: 

cheryltaylor@fdle.state.fl.us 

The Commission packet can be viewed or downloaded after 

July 21, 2015, at: 

http://www.fdle.state.fl.us/Content/getdoc/91a75023-5a74-

40ef-814d-8e7e5b622d4d/CJSTC-Home-Page.aspx 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Joyce Gainous-Harris at (850)410-8615 or e-mail 

at JoyceGainous-Harris@fdle.state.fl.us. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=11
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=20


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

3224 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

14-10.0011 General Provisions 

14-10.0022 Outdoor Advertising Sign Inventory 

14-10.003 Licenses 

14-10.004 Permit 

14-10.00401 Administration of Outdoor Advertising Permits 

14-10.0041 Annual Renewal Billing - Licenses and Permits 

14-10.0042 Denial or Revocation of Licenses or Permits 

14-10.0043 Outdoor Advertising License and Permit Fees 

14-10.0052 Zoning Enacted Primarily to Permit Outdoor 

Advertising Signs 

14-10.006 Permitting Criteria 

14-10.007 Maintenance of Nonconforming Signs 

The Department of Transportation announces a hearing to 

which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, August 13, 2015, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Florida Department of Transportation Headquarters, 

Suwannee Room, 2nd floor Burns Building, 605 Suwannee 

Street, Tallahassee, FL 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

receive public comments on proposed changes to Rule 

Chapter 14-10, Florida Administrative Code, Outdoor 

Advertising Regulation and Highway Beautification Program. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Michael 

Green, OAC Operations, Department of Transportation, 605 

Suwannee Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)414-4558, 

michael.green@dot.state.fl.us. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Michael Green, OAC Operations, Department of 

Transportation, 605 Suwannee Street, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399, (850)414-4558, michael.green@dot.state.fl.us. If you 

are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency 

using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

FLORIDA COMMISSION ON OFFENDER REVIEW 

The Florida Commission on Offender Review announces 

public meetings to which all persons are invited. 

DATES AND TIMES: Wednesday, August 5, 2015, 9:00 

a.m.; Thursday, August 6, 2015, 9:00 a.m.; Wednesday, 

August 12, 2015, 9:00 a.m.; Thursday, August 13, 2015, 9:00 

a.m. 

PLACE: Florida Commission on Offender Review, 4070 

Esplanade Way, Tallahassee, FL 32399-2450 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Regularly scheduled meeting for all Parole, Conditional 

Release, Conditional Medical Release, Addiction Recovery, 

Control Release and all other Commission business. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Florida 

Commission on Offender Review, (850)488-1293. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Florida Commission on Offender Review at 

ada@fcor.state.fl.us. If you are hearing or speech impaired, 

please contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

REGIONAL PLANNING COUNCILS 

Treasure Coast Regional Planning Council 

The Treasure Coast Regional Planning Council announces a 

public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: August 6, 2015, 10:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Martin County Public Safety Complex, 2nd Floor, 

800 Monterey Road, Stuart, FL 34994 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

conduct a meeting of Council’s District 10 Local Emergency 

Planning Committee. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Kim 

Koho Vaday, (772)221-4060. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Kim Koho Vaday, (772)221-4060. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Kim Koho Vaday, 

(772)221-4060. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=14
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=14-10.0011
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=14-10.0022
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=14-10.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=14-10.004
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=14-10.00401
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=14-10.0041
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=14-10.0042
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=14-10.0043
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=14-10.0052
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=14-10.006
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=14-10.007
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=23
mailto:ada@fcor.state.fl.us
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=29
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=67


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

 

3225 

 

REGIONAL UTILITY AUTHORITIES 

Tampa Bay Water - A Regional Water Supply Authority 

The Tampa Bay Water - A Regional Water Supply Authority 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Monday, July 13, 2015, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Tampa Bay Water Administrative Offices, 2575 

Enterprise Road, Clearwater, Florida 33763 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Emergency Board Meeting for consideration of settlement of 

BP oil spill litigation. With a vote of 7-0, the Board of 

Directors accepted $1.25 million in settlement and released 

claims against BP Oil and related entitles for economic 

damages incurred by the Deepwater Horizon oil spill. The 

emergency meeting was necessary due to short notice of the 

proposed settlement agreement and the court-imposed 

requirement of approval by July 15, 2015. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Records 

Department, (727)796-2355. 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Records Department, 

(727)796-2355. 

SPACE FLORIDA 

The Space Florida announces a public meeting to which all 

persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Friday, July 24, 2015, 10:00 a.m., EST 

PLACE: Teleconference 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Updated Description: Space Florida Compensation and 

Performance Management Guidelines Workshop. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Emma 

Newsham at enewsham@spaceflorida.gov, (321)730-5301, 

ext. 231. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 2 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Emma Newsham at enewsham@spaceflorida.gov, 

(321)730-5301, ext. 231. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Emma Newsham at 

enewsham@spaceflorida.gov, (321)730-5301, ext. 231. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Board of Architecture and Interior Design 

The Board of Architecture and Interior Design announces 

public meetings to which all persons are invited. 

DATES AND TIMES: July 28, 2015, 9:00 a.m.; July 29, 

2015, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Boca Raton Resort & Club, 501 East Camino Real, 

Boca Raton, Florida 33432, (561)447-3000 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

July 28, 2015: General Business including disciplinary cases 

and rules committee review. If time permits discussion items - 

architecture profession, interior design profession, and reports. 

July 29, 2015: General Business including discussion items - 

architecture profession, interior design profession, rules, 

reports, and review of applications. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Board of 

Architecture and Interior Design, 1940 North Monroe Street, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0751, (850)717-1982. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Board of Architecture and Interior Design, 1940 

North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0751, 

(850)717-1982. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please 

contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Board of Architecture 

and Interior Design, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-0751, (850)717-1982. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Board of Cosmetology 

The Board of Cosmetology announces public meetings to 

which all persons are invited. 

DATES AND TIMES: October 12, 2015, 9:00 a.m.; October 

13, 2015, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Hampton Inn & Suites, 101 SE 1st Avenue, 

Gainesville, Florida 32601, (352)240-9300 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=49
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=158
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=57
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=263
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=275


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

3226 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

General board business. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Board of 

Cosmetology, 1940 N. Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399, (850)487-1395. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Board of Cosmetology, 1940 N. Monroe Street, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)487-1395. If you are hearing 

or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Board of 

Cosmetology, 1940 N. Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399, (850)487-1395. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Chiropractic 

The Board of Chiropractic Medicine announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Friday, August 21, 2015, 8:30 a.m. or 

shortly thereafter 

PLACE: Rosen Plaza Hotel, 9700 International Drive, 

Orlando, FL 32819, (407)996-9700 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

General board business. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Edith 

Rogers at edith.rogers@flhealth.gov or by  

accessing the board's website at: 

http://floridaschiropracticmedicine.gov/meeting-information/ 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Edith Rogers at edith.rogers@flhealth.gov. If you 

are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency 

using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Edith Rogers at 

edith.rogers@flhealth.gov. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Division of Emergency Preparedness and Community Support 

The Bureau of Emergency Medical Oversight/Injury 

Prevention Section announces a telephone conference call to 

which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, July 30, 2015, 10:00 a.m. – 

11:15 a.m., Eastern Time 

PLACE: Bureau of Emergency Medical Oversight/Injury 

Prevention Section, 4042 Bald Cypress Way, Second Floor, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

General Injury Prevention Section updates and data 

presentation by David Wong MPH, Injury Epidemiologist. 

You are invited to register for this webinar by clicking the 

registration link below: 

https://attendee.gotowebinar.com/register/4768370090743756

034. 

After registering, you will receive a confirmation email 

containing information about joining the webinar. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Suzanne 

Kelly at (850)245-4110 or Suzanne.Kelly@flhealth.gov. 

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES 

Refugee Services 

The Department of Children and Families, Refugee Services 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, August 6, 2015, 10:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Florida Department of Children and Families, 1317 

Winewood Blvd., Bldg. 6, Conference Room A, Tallahassee, 

FL 32399-0700 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Title: Debriefing Meeting of the Evaluators and Ranking of 

the Replies for the Unaccompanied Refugee Minor Program in 

Miami-Dade County (ITN# SNR15K02). 

Description: As provided for in Sections 2.5 and 5.2 of this 

ITN which was published to the Vendor Bid System (VBS) on 

March 26, 2015. The VBS can be accessed at: 

http://www.myflorida.com/apps/vbs/vbs_www.main_menu. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=311
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=832
https://attendee.gotowebinar.com/register/4768370090743756034
https://attendee.gotowebinar.com/register/4768370090743756034
mailto:Suzanne.Kelly@flhealth.gov
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=528
http://www.myflorida.com/apps/vbs/vbs_www.main_menu


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

 

3227 

 

The purpose of the Debriefing Meeting of the Evaluators and 

Ranking of the Replies is to receive and record all evaluation 

scores for the ITN and calculate the final scores according to 

the evaluation methodology outlined in Section 5.2. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

David.Draper@myflfamilies.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Pamela Thornton, (850)717-4567, 

Pamela_Thornton@dcf.state.fl.us. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: 

David.Draper@myflfamilies.com. 

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES 

Agency for Persons with Disabilities 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

65G-4.0213 Definitions 

65G-4.0214 Allocation Algorithm 

65G-4.0215 General Provisions 

65G-4.0216 Establishment of the iBudget Amount 

65G-4.0217 iBudget Cost Plan 

65G-4.0218 Significant Additional Needs Funding 

The Agency for Persons with Disabilities announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: August 19, 2015, 2:00 p.m. – 4:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Agency for Persons with Disabilities, 4030 

Esplanade Way, Room 301, Tallahassee, FL 32399-0950; 

conference call also available: 1(888)670 3525, code: 647 721 

2009 then # key 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

This is a correction for Notice ID number 16077379 published 

on June 5, 2015, to include a conference call-in number for the 

Agency for Persons with Disabilities public meeting on 

August 19, 2015, regarding changes made to proposed Rules 

65G-4.0213 through 65G-4.0218, F.A.C., noticed in the 

Florida Administrative Register, Vol. 40, No. 235, published 

on December 5, 2014 regarding the implementation of iBudget 

Florida as required by Section 393.0662, F.S., as these 

proposed rules have been modified by the Notice of Change 

noticed in the Florida Administrative Register Vol 41, No. 84, 

published on April 30, 2015, and as further modified by the 

Notice of Change noticed in the Florida Administrative 

Register Vol 41, No. 98, published on May 20, 2015. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: David 

De La Paz, Esq., Agency for Persons with Disabilities, 4030 

Esplanade Way, Suite 380, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, 

(850)922-9512, david.delapaz@apdcares.org. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 72 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: David De La Paz, Esq., Agency for Persons with 

Disabilities, 4030 Esplanade Way, Suite 380, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399, (850)922-9512, david.delapaz@apdcares.org. 

If you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the 

agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 

(TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: David De La Paz, 

Esq., Agency for Persons with Disabilities, 4030 Esplanade 

Way, Suite 380, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)922-9512, 

david.delapaz@apdcares.org. 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Division of State Fire Marshal 

The Department of Financial Services, Division of State Fire 

Marshal, announces a public meeting to which all persons are 

invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, August 4, 2015, 10:00 a.m. 

PLACE: State Fire Marshal Conference Room, Third Floor, 

Atrium Building, 325 John Knox Road, Tallahassee, Florida 

32303 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Quarterly meeting of the Florida Fire Safety Board. Anyone 

wishing to attend may attend in person or by telephone 

conference call. Those attending by telephone conference call 

should dial (850)413-1558, (Cisco VoIP Internal callers may 

reach the conference call by dialing 11558.) Once you have 

dialed the initial number you will be prompted to enter the 

Conference ID which is 155938. The connection will be 

available 5 to 10 minutes before 10:00 a.m. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Shelia 

Thomas, Division of State Fire Marshal, Bureau of Fire 

Prevention, Regulatory Licensing Section, 200 East Gaines 

Street, Tallahassee, FL 32399-0342 or by calling her at 

(850)413-3610. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Sheila Thomas at the number listed above. If you 

are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency 

using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

MOFFITT CANCER CENTER & RESEARCH INSTITUTE 

The Florida Cancer Control and Research Advisory Council 

announces a telephone conference call to which all persons are 

invited. 

mailto:David.Draper@myflfamilies.com
mailto:Pamela_Thornton@dcf.state.fl.us
mailto:David.Draper@myflfamilies.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=560
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.0213
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.0214
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.0215
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.0216
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.0217
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.0218
mailto:david.delapaz@apdcares.org
mailto:david.delapaz@apdcares.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=359
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=579


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

3228 

DATE AND TIME: August 4, 2015, 4:00 p.m. ‒ 5:00 p.m., 

EST 

PLACE: 1(800)206-6032; passcode: 7451520# 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: A 

teleconference of CCRAB’s FCDS Upgrade Taskforce in 

coordination with DOH. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

laura.lenhart@moffitt.org. 

For more information, you may contact: 

laura.lenhart@moffitt.org. 

FLORIDA WORKERS’ COMPENSATION INSURANCE 

GUARANTY ASSOC., INC. 

The Florida Workers’ Compensation Insurance Guaranty 

Association announces a public meeting to which all persons 

are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: August 7, 2015, 9:30 a.m. 

PLACE: Hyatt Regency Orlando International Airport Hotel 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The Board will discuss general business of the Association. 

The agenda will include, but not be limited to: Minutes, 

Receiver’s Report, Legal Report, Claims and Financial 

Reports. It will also include a discussion on the need for an 

assessment. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Cathy 

Irvin at (850)523-1810. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 4 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Cathy Irvin at (850)523-1810. If you are hearing 

or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

FLORIDA WORKERS’ COMPENSATION INSURANCE 

GUARANTY ASSOC., INC. 

The Audit Committee of the Florida Workers’ Compensation 

Insurance Guaranty Association announces a public meeting 

to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: August 7, 2015, 8:45 a.m. 

PLACE: Hyatt Regency Orlando Airport, Orlando, FL 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The Audit Committee will meet to discuss general business of 

the Committee. The agenda will include, but not be limited to: 

Minutes and 2015-2016 Audit Extension. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Cathy 

Irvin, (850)386-9200. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Cathy Irvin, (850)386-9200. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

QCAUSA 

The Florida Department of Transportation (FDOT) announces 

a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, July 30, 2015, 5:30 p.m. – 6:30 

p.m., EDT 

PLACE: National Guard Armory Drill Hall, 2049 Pat Thomas 

Parkway, Quincy, Florida 32351 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The Florida Department of Transportation will conduct a 

Corridor Workshop concerning the Quincy Bypass Northern 

Loop near State Road (S.R.) 12 and County Road (C.R.) 268 

(Solomon Dairy Road) Corridor Alternatives Study in 

Gadsden County, Florida. 

Financial Project Identification Number: 218946-4-22-01. 

The meeting is being held to provide FDOT an opportunity to 

present corridor findings and to obtain input regarding other 

potential corridors from local governments, affected property 

owners and other members of the public. There will be a brief 

presentation beginning at 6:00 p.m. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Sherry 

Alaghemand, P.E., FDOT Project Manager, 1074 Highway 90, 

Chipley, Florida 32428, toll-free: 1(888)638-0250, ext. 1510, 

sherry.alaghemand@dot.state.fl.us. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Sherry Alaghemand, P.E. at the contact 

information listed above. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

Section VII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Declaratory Statements 

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Agency for Health Care 

Administration has declined to rule on the petition for 

declaratory statement filed by Alternative Outcomes, Inc. on 

April 28, 2015. The following is a summary of the agency’s 

declination of the petition: 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=719
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=719
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=719
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=719
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=991
mailto:sherry.alaghemand@dot.state.fl.us
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

 

3229 

 

The Notice of Petition for Declaratory Statement was 

published in Vol. 41, No. 88, of the Florida Administrative 

Register. The Petition seeks an interpretation of the place of 

service definitions and service limitations for reimbursement 

of Applied Behavior Analysis services provided by 

Developmental Disabilities Waiver providers to Medicaid 

recipients. The Petition fails to identify the statutory provision, 

rule or order that applies to the petitioner’s particular set of 

circumstances as required by Section 120.545, Florida Statutes 

and, therefore, the Petition is denied. 

A copy of the Order Declining of the Petition for Declaratory 

Statement may be obtained by contacting: Richard Shoop, 

Agency Clerk, Agency for Health Care Administration 2727 

Mahan Drive, Building 3, MS 3, Tallahassee, Florida 32308. 

DEPARTMENT OF MANAGEMENT SERVICES 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Public Employees 

Relations Commission has received the petition for 

declaratory statement from Robert Michael Ardis, Case No. 

DS-2015-001. The petition seeks the agency’s opinion as to 

the applicability of Article 1, Sections 21 and 22 of the Florida 

Constitution and Sections 447.205 and 447.207, Florida 

Statutes (2014), as it applies to the petitioner. 

The Petitioner seeks the Commission to hold that he has the 

statutory and constitutional right to bring causes of action in 

court against the Pensacola State College Faculty Association 

(Union), the Union’s officer’s and administrators, and its 

former officers and administrators alleging that they have 

committed tortious actions against him such as, but not limited 

to, invasion of privacy, intentional infliction of emotional 

distress, and conspiracy. The Petitioner also seeks the 

Commission to hold that a determination of whether these 

actions is tortious is outside of the Commission’s jurisdiction 

but which is within the jurisdiction of the Circuit Court of 

Florida and within the jurisdiction of the United States Circuit 

Court of Appeals, Eleventh Circuit. The Petitioner seeks the 

Commission to declare that there is no legal justification for 

the Union defendants’ argument to the courts that the 

Commission’s mere existence precludes the Petitioner from 

suing them. 

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be 

obtained by contacting: The Clerk, Public Employees 

Relations Commission, 4708 Capital Circle NW, Suite 300, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32303-7256. 

Please refer all comments to: The Clerk, Public Employees 

Relations Commission, 4708 Capital Circle NW, Suite 300, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32303-7256. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares and Mobile 

Homes 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Division of Florida 

Condominiums, Timeshares, and Mobile Homes, Department 

of Business and Professional Regulation, State of Florida, has 

received the petition for declaratory statement from Vincent L. 

Castellucci Jr., In Re: Celebration Point Master Association, 

Inc., Docket No. 2015030032, filed on July 8, 2015. The 

petition seeks the agency’s opinion as to the applicability of 

Chapter 718 or 617 of the Florida Statutes, as it applies to the 

petitioner. 

Whether Chapter 718 or 617 of the Florida Statutes can create 

an impairment to the residency requirement outlined in the 

Association’s Articles of Incorporation requiring all members 

serving on the Board of Directors to reside at the 

condominium. 

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be 

obtained by contacting: Rikki Anderson, Administrative 

Assistant II, at Department of Business and Professional 

Regulation, Division of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares, 

and Mobile Homes, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-2217, (850)717-1415, 

Rikki.Anderson@myfloridalicense.com. 

Please refer all comments to: Robin E. Smith, Senior 

Attorney, Department of Business and Professional 

Regulation, Division of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares, 

and Mobile Homes, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-2202. Responses, motions to intervene, or 

requests for an agency hearing, §120.57(2), Fla. Stat., must be 

filed within 21 days of this notice. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Construction Industry Licensing Board 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Construction Industry 

Licensing Board has issued an order disposing of the petition 

for declaratory statement filed by Richard Santelli on January 

27, 2015. The following is a summary of the agency’s 

disposition of the petition: 

The Notice of Petition for Declaratory Statement was 

published in Volume 41, No. 78, of the April 22, 2015, Florida 

Administrative Register. The petition seeks a declaratory 

statement from the Board as to whether general site work, not 

related to construction of a building, is included in the 

building cost under Section 489.103(7), Florida Statutes. The 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=60
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=248
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=248
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=274


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

3230 

Board’s Order, filed on June 25, 2015, declines to issue a 

declaratory statement in this matter because the Petition does 

not state with particularity the Petitioner’s set of 

circumstances as required by Section 120.565(2), Florida 

Statutes, and because Petitioner is not a substantially affected 

person as required by Section 120.565(1), Florida Statutes. 

A copy of the Order Disposing of the Petition for Declaratory 

Statement may be obtained by contacting: Dan Biggins, 

Executive Director, Construction Industry Licensing Board, 

1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, FL 32399-0783, 

telephone: (850)487-1395 or by electronic mail: 

Amanda.Wynn@myfloridalicense.com. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Florida Building 

Commission has received the petition for declaratory 

statement from Shamrock Pool Services, Inc. The petition 

seeks the agency’s opinion as to the applicability of Chapter 1 

and Chapter 4, Florida Building Code 5th Edition (2014), 

Building as it applies to the petitioner. 

Petitioner seeks clarification as to whether a permit is required 

when resurfacing a commercial pool or spa. 

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be 

obtained by contacting: Agency Clerk’s Office, Department of 

Business and Professional Regulation, 1940 North Monroe 

Street, Suite 92, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2203, (850)921-

0342, AGC.Filing@myfloridalicense.com. 

Please refer all comments to: Mo Madani, Building Codes and 

Standards Office, Department of Business and Professional 

Regulation, Suite 90A, 1940 North Monroe,  

Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, 

mo.madani@myfloridalicense.com or April L. Hammonds, 

Office of the General Counsel, Department of Business and 

Professional Regulation, 1940 North Monroe Street, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1000, (850)487-1824, 

april.hammonds@myfloridalicense.com. 

RESPONSES, MOTIONS TO INTERVENE, OR 

REQUESTS FOR A HEARING, §120.57(2), FLA. STAT., 

MUST BE FILED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THIS NOTICE. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Florida Building 

Commission has received the petition for declaratory 

statement from the American Society of Interior Designers’ 

and Lucille McKey. The petition seeks the agency’s opinion 

as to the applicability of Sections 107.1 & 202, Florida 

Building Code 5th Edition (2014), Building as it applies to the 

petitioner. 

Petitioner seeks clarifications as to whether registered interior 

designers are included in the definition of “registered design 

professionals” and may sign & seal interior design plans for 

building permits for interior construction. 

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be 

obtained by contacting: Agency Clerk's Office, Department of 

Business and Professional Regulation, 1940 North Monroe 

Street, Suite 92, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2203, (850)921-

0342, AGC.Filing@myfloridalicense.com. 

Please refer all comments to: Mo Madani, Building Codes and 

Standards Office, Department of Business and Professional 

Regulation, Suite 90A, 1940 North Monroe,  

Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, 

mo.madani@myfloridalicense.com or April L. Hammonds, 

Office of the General Counsel, Department of Business and 

Professional Regulation, 1940 North Monroe Street, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1000, (850)487-1824, 

april.hammonds@myfloridalicense.com. 

RESPONSES, MOTIONS TO INTERVENE, OR 

REQUESTS FOR A HEARING, §120.57(2), FLA. STAT., 

MUST BE FILED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THIS NOTICE. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Dentistry 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Board of Dentistry has 

received the petition for declaratory statement from Richard J. 

Staller, D.D.S., filed on July 2, 2015. The petition seeks the 

agency’s opinion as to the applicability of Section 456.053, 

Florida Statutes, as it applies to the petitioner. 

The Petitioner seeks a Declaratory Statement from the Board 

with regard to Section 456.053, Florida Statutes, regarding 

whether a dentist operating through a professional association 

may form a limited liability company and refer patients of the 

professional association to the limited liability company for 

surgical, endodontic or other specialty care without such 

action constituting a prohibited “referral.” Except for good 

cause shown, motions for leave to intervene must be filed 

within 21 days after the publication of this notice. 

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be 

obtained by contacting: Sue Foster, Executive Director, Board 

of Dentistry, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C08, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-3258 or by email: info@floridasdentistry.gov. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=328


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

 

3231 

 

Section VIII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding the Validity of Rules 

Notice of Petition for Administrative Determination has been 

filled with the Division of Administrative Hearings on the 

following rules: 

NONE 

Notice of Disposition of Petition for Administrative 

Determination has been filled with the Division of 

Administrative Hearings on the following rules: 

NONE 

Section IX 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Non-rule Policy Challenges 

NONE 

Section X 

Announcements and Objection Reports of 

the Joint Adminstrative Procedures 

Committee 

NONE 

Section XI 

Notices Regarding Bids, Proposals and 

Purchasing 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

DFS AC RFP 14/15-20 

The Department of Financial Services, Division of Accounting 

and Auditing is soliciting responses from parties interested in 

printing and delivering blank warrant forms. 

Point of Contact: All questions must be in writing and should 

reference the above solicitation number. Submit all questions 

to Procurement Officer Gloriann McInnis via email at 

gloriann.mcminnis@myfloridacfo.com. 

Response Due Date: On or prior to 3:00 p.m. ET, Monday, 

August 10, 2015, to the Procurement Officer identified to the 

following office location: Department of Financial Services, 

200 East Gaines Street, Larson Building, Purchasing Services, 

Room B24, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0317. 

The Department reserves the right to issue amendments, 

addenda, and changes to the timeline and specifically to any 

public meeting identified within the solicitation. The 

Department will post notice of any changes regarding this 

solicitation or additional meetings within the Vendor Bid 

System (VBS) in accordance with Section 287.042(3), Florida 

Statutes, and will not re-advertise the notice in the Florida 

Administrative Register (FAR). To access the  

VBS go to the following web address: 

http://vbs.dms.state.fl.us/vbs/main_menu. 

ADA Requirements: Pursuant to the provisions of the 

Americans with Disabilities Act, any person requiring special 

accommodations to participate in any meeting is asked to 

advise the agency at least 48 hours before the meeting by 

contacting the Procurement Officer. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

Section XII 

Miscellaneous 

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 

Office of the Secretary 

FLORIDA STATE CLEARINGHOUSE 

The state is coordinating reviews of federal activities and 

federally funded projects as required by Section 403.061(42), 

F.S. This includes Outer Continental Shelf activities and other 

actions subject to federal consistency review under the Florida 

Coastal Management Program. A list of projects, comments 

deadlines and the address for providing comments are 

available at: https://fldep.dep.state.fl.us/clearinghouse/. For 

information, call (850)245-2170. This public notice fulfills the 

requirements of 15 CFR 930. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Nursing 

Notice of Emergency Action 

On July 14, 2015, the State Surgeon General issued an Order 

of Emergency Restriction of License with regard to the license 

of Katherine I. Johnson, R.N., License #: RN 9202126. This 

Emergency Restriction Order was predicated upon the State 

Surgeon General’s findings of an immediate and serious 

danger to the public health, safety and welfare pursuant to 

Sections 456.073(8) and 120.60(6), Florida Statutes (2015). 

The State Surgeon General determined that this summary 

procedure was fair under the circumstances, in that there was 

no other method available to adequately protect the public. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
mailto:gloriann.mcminnis@myfloridacfo.com
http://vbs.dms.state.fl.us/vbs/main_menu
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=294
https://fldep.dep.state.fl.us/clearinghouse/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=332


Florida Administrative Register Volume 41, Number 137, July 16, 2015 

3232 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Nursing 

Notice of Emergency Action 

On July 14, 2015, the State Surgeon General issued an Order 

of Emergency Suspension of License with regard to the 

license of Heather Leigh Dickerson, L.P.N., License #: PN 

5176512. This Emergency Suspension Order was predicated 

upon the State Surgeon General’s findings of an immediate 

and serious danger to the public health, safety and welfare 

pursuant to Sections 456.073(8) and 120.60(6), Florida 

Statutes (2015). The State Surgeon General determined that 

this summary procedure was fair under the circumstances, in 

that there was no other method available to adequately protect 

the public. 

Section XIII 

Index to Rules Filed During Preceeding 

Week 

NOTE: The above section will be published on Tuesday 

beginning October 2, 2012, unless Monday is a holiday, then it 

will be published on Wednesday of that week. 

_______________________________________________ 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=332

