
Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

 

2677 

 

Section I 

Notice of Development of Proposed Rules 

and Negotiated Rulemaking 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

State Board of Education 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

6A-4.0021 Florida Teacher Certification Examinations 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of this rule 

development is to (1) Adopt new Florida Teacher Certification 

Examinations (FTCE) competencies and skills, effective 

November 1, 2014, for the following FTCE subject areas: 

Business Education 6-12 and Spanish K-12; (2) Adopt new 

passing scores effective January 1, 2015, for the following 

examinations: General Knowledge Test (all 4 subtests), 

Computer Science K-12, Elementary Education K-6 (all 4 

subtests), English 6-12, Middle Grades English 5-9, and 

Technology Education 6-12; and (3) Adopt new testing, 

scoring, and reporting formats and fees for the following FTCE 

subject areas: English 6-12 and Middle Grades English 5-9. The 

effect will be changes to the affected FTCE competencies and 

skills; new testing, scoring, and reporting formats and fees for 

English 6-12 and Middle Grades English 5-9; and new passing 

score requirements for the affected examinations. In addition, 

the Department will be updating rule language to provide 

greater specificity in terminology as it relates to standard setting 

and passing scores. Full rule language will be posted on the 

Department of Education website prior to July 7, 2014. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Florida Teacher 

Certification Examinations. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1012.56(9) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1012.56 FS. 

A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD 

AT THE DATES, TIMES AND PLACES SHOWN BELOW: 

DATES AND TIMES: July 21, 2014, 10:00 a.m. – 10:30 a.m.; 

July 23, 2014, 2:00 p.m. – 2:30 p.m.; and August 4, 2014, 2:00 

p.m. – 2:30 p.m. 

PLACES: July 21st – Florida Atlantic University, Ft. 

Lauderdale Campus, HEC Building, Room 1007D, 111 E. Las 

Olas Blvd., Ft. Lauderdale, FL 33301; July 23rd – Florida 

Department of Education, Room 422B, 325 West Gaines St., 

Tallahassee, FL 32299; and August 4th – Stetson University, 

Celebration Campus, Room 126, 800 Celebration Avenue, 

Celebration, FL 34747. The following conference call 

information will be used for all three workshops: Conference 

Call: 1(888)670-3525, Conference Code: 4073661188#. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Phil 

Canto, Bureau Chief, Bureau of Postsecondary Assessment, 

Office of Assessment, Division of Accountability, Research, 

and Measurement, 325 W. Gaines Street, Suite 414, 

Tallahassee, FL 32399, (850)245-0513. To submit a comment 

on this rule development, go to: 

https://app1.fldoe.org/rules/default.aspx 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE. 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

State Board of Education 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

6A-4.00821 Florida Educational Leadership Examination 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of this rule 

development is to adopt new passing scores effective January 

1, 2015, for the Florida Educational Leadership Examination 

(FELE) (all subtests) and adopt a new testing, scoring, and 

reporting format and fees for FELE Subtest 3. The effect will 

be the adoption of a new testing, scoring, and reporting format 

and fees for FELE Subtest 3 and new passing score 

requirements for all three FELE subtests. In addition, the 

Department will be updating rule language to provide greater 

specificity in terminology as it relates to standard setting and 

passing scores for all three subtests. Full rule language will be 

posted on the Department of Education website prior to July 7, 

2014. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Florida Educational 

Leadership Examination. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1012.56(9) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1012.56 FS. 

A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD 

AT THE DATES, TIMES AND PLACES SHOWN BELOW: 

DATES AND TIMES: July 21, 2014, 10:30 a.m. – 11:00 a.m.; 

July 23, 2014, 2:30 p.m. – 3:00 p.m.; and August 4, 2014, 2:30 

p.m. – 3:00 p.m. 

PLACES: July 21st – Florida Atlantic University, Ft. 

Lauderdale Campus, HEC Building, Room 1007D, 111 E. Las 

Olas Blvd., Ft. Lauderdale, FL 33301; July 23rd – Florida 

Department of Education, Room 422B, 325 West Gaines St., 

Tallahassee, Florida 32299; and August 4th – Stetson 

University, Celebration Campus, Room 126, 800 Celebration 

Avenue, Celebration, FL 34747. The following conference call 

information will be used for all three workshops: Conference 

Call: 1(888)670-3525, Conference Code: 4073661188#. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Phil 

Canto, Bureau Chief, Bureau of Postsecondary Assessment, 

Office of Assessment, Division of Accountability, Research, 

and Measurement, 325 W. Gaines Street, Suite 414, 

Tallahassee, FL 32399, (850)245-0513. To submit a comment 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=195
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6A-4.0021
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=1012.56(9),%20Florida%20Statutes.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=1012.56,%20Florida%20Statutes.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=195
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6A-4.00821
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=1012.56(9),%20Florida%20Statutes.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=1012.56,%20Florida%20Statutes.


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

2678 

on this rule development, go to: 

https://app1.fldoe.org/rules/default.aspx. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE. 

Section II 

Proposed Rules 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

19B-4.001 Application 

19B-4.002 Contract Prices 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of this rule 

development is to update the Master Contract, consolidate 

rules, and reflect modifications to the Stanley G. Tate Florida 

Prepaid College Program. 

SUMMARY: The primary purposes of updating the rules and 

incorporated document are to create the new 1-Year Florida 

University Plan; explain how the Plans may be purchased and 

used; and clarify and consolidate existing rules. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will not 

have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase 

directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in 

the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the 

rule. A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: During a discussion of the economic impact of these 

rules at its Board meeting, the Board, based upon the expertise 

and experience of its members, determined that a SERC was not 

necessary and that the rules will not require ratification by the 

Legislature. No person or interested party submitted additional 

information regarding the economic impact. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1009.97(3)(f), 1009.971, 1009.975, 

1009.98 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS 

NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: William Thompson, Deputy Executive Director, 

1801 Hermitage Blvd., Suite 210, Tallahassee, FL, (850)488-

8514, William.Thompson@myfloridaprepaid.com. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: William Thompson, Deputy Executive 

Director, 1801 Hermitage Blvd., Suite 210, Tallahassee, FL, 

(850) 488-8514, William.Thompson@myfloridaprepaid.com 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

19B-4.001 Application. 

(1)(a) Rule Chapters 19B-4 through 19B-13 and 19B-15, 

F.A.C., apply to advance payment contracts for the prepayment 

of the postsecondary Rregistration Fee, Llocal Ffees, Ttuition 

Ddifferential Ffees and/or Ddormitory residency Ffees under 

the Stanley G. Tate Florida Prepaid College Program, the 

“Program.” “Purchaser” means “Account Owner” and “Co-

Purchaser” means “Survivor.” See the Master Contract, which 

is incorporated by reference in subsection (2), for defined terms. 

(b) The application period shall commence and terminate 

on dates set annually by the Board and published in the Florida 

Administrative Register. Applications for advance payment 

contracts purchased through the Board’s direct support 

organization, The Florida Prepaid College Foundation, Inc., for 

Ppurchasers participating in employer participation programs 

or by Ppurchasers pursuant to a court order will be accepted by 

the Board at any time. The Board may permit oOther 

applications for Ppurchasers of advance payment contracts to 

submitted an Application to the Board outside the Open 

Enrollment annual application Pperiod to will be processed for 

data collection and administrative purposes, but the Application 

will not be accepted by the Board until the beginning of the next 

succeeding open enrollment annual application period. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=47
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-4.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-4.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1009.971(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1009.97(3)(f)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201009.971
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201009.975
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201009.98


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

 

2679 

 

(c) The Plan contract prices associated with Aapplications 

submitted to the Board during the Open Enrollment annual 

application Pperiod shall be the Plan contract prices applicable 

to advance payment contracts for the Open Enrollment Period 

annual application period. The Plan contract prices associated 

with Aapplications received by submitted to the Board outside 

the Open Enrollment annual application Pperiod, except for 

those purchased through the Board’s direct support 

organization, The Florida Prepaid College Foundation, Inc., for 

Ppurchasers participating in employer participation programs 

or by Ppurchasers pursuant to a court order, shall be the Plan 

contract prices applicable to advance payment contracts for the 

next succeeding Open Enrollment annual application Pperiod. 

After acceptance by the Board of the purchaser’s application, a 

participation and payment schedule shall be mailed to the 

purchaser. 

(d) The advance payment contract shall be comprised of 

the application, Master Contract, and participation and payment 

schedule. 

(2) The Florida Prepaid College Plan Master Contract, 

Form No. FPCB 20154-02, https://www.flrules.org/ 

Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04374 https://www.flrules. 

org/gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-03230, is hereby 

incorporated by reference. 

(3) The Board may only require that applicants provide the 

following information to enroll in the Program: 

(a) For the Account Owner, Survivor, Parent and 

Beneficiary: 

1. Full legal name and salutation; 

2. Social Security Number; 

3. Date of birth; 

4. Full mailing address; 

5. Two telephone numbers; 

6. Two e-mail addresses. 

(b) Age, grade, and projected enrollment year of the 

Beneficiary. 

(c) The Pplan type and payment option of Florida Prepaid 

College Plan(s) selected for enrollment. 

(d) Proof of, or information used to verify proof of the 

Parent’s or Beneficiary’s Florida residency as defined in the 

Master Contract, which is incorporated by reference in 

subsection (2) Rule 19B-7.002, F.A.C. 

(e) Marketing information: 

1. How did you hear about the Program? 

2. Annual Family Income; 

3. Purchaser’s relationship to the Beneficiary; 

4. Beneficiary gender; 

5. Beneficiary race. 

(f) A Florida 529 Savings Plan Account Number for the 

same Beneficiary to apply a discount on the Application Fee, if 

offered and applicable. 

(g) Information required for the processing of a one-time 

and recurring automatic withdrawal authorization. 

(4) A copy of the Master Contract and Application may be 

obtained from the Board by submitting a request to: P.O. Box 

6448, Tallahassee, Florida 32314-6448. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.98 FS. History–New 3-29-89, Amended 2-6-90, 3-19-92, 

Formerly 4G-4.001, Amended 12-5-93, 5-31-95, 6-20-96, 10-20-96, 

12-16-97, 2-18-99, 6-6-99, 2-8-00, 5-21-00, 1-3-01, 10-9-01, 11-27-

02, 10-1-03, 1-29-04, 12-28-04, 6-2-05, 12-20-05, 1-1-07, 11-27-07, 

12-17-07, 11-18-08, 1-28-09, 4-5-09, 10-26-09, 10-18-10, 12-5-11, 

11-5-12, 10-7-13,__________. 

 

19B-4.002 Contract Prices. 

The Board will approve evaluate Plan prices for each Open 

Enrollment Period revision periodically. The value of the 

projected fees for included within the Florida College System 

or the State University System will be based primarily on 

Florida law and empirical data for national and Florida 

postsecondary tuition, required fees, and housing costs. All Plan 

prices and the interest rate for installment payment plans for the 

current Open Enrollment Period will be published periodically 

on the Board’s website (www.MyFloridaPrepaid.com). 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.98(2) FS. History–New 3-29-89, Amended 2-6-90, 3-19-92, 

Formerly 4G-4.002, Amended 5-31-95, 2-18-99, 2-8-00, 12-28-03, 12-

28-04, 12-20-05, 12-17-07, 11-30-09, 10-18-10, 10-7-

13,____________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Florida Prepaid College Board 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: June 12, 2014 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: June 6, 2014 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

19B-4.003 Payment Options 

19B-4.004 Default 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of this rule 

development is to update and consolidate rules to reflect 

modifications to the Stanley G. Tate Florida Prepaid College 

Program. 

SUMMARY: The primary purpose of updating the rules is to 

reduce redundancy by consolidating relevant rules into the 

Master Contract, which is incorporated by reference in 

subsection 19B-4.001(2), F.A.C. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

https://www.flrules.org/%20Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04374
https://www.flrules.org/%20Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-04374
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=47
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-4.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-4.004


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

2680 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will not 

have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase 

directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in 

the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the 

rule. A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: During a discussion of the economic impact of these 

rules at its Board meeting, the Board, based upon the expertise 

and experience of its members, determined that a SERC was not 

necessary and that the rules will not require ratification by the 

Legislature. No person or interested party submitted additional 

information regarding the economic impact. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1009.97(3)(f), 1009.971, 1009.975, 

1009.98 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS 

NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: William Thompson, Deputy Executive Director, 

1801 Hermitage Blvd., Suite 210, Tallahassee, FL, (850)488-

8514, William.Thompson@myfloridaprepaid.com. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: William Thompson, Deputy Executive 

Director, 1801 Hermitage Blvd., Suite 210, Tallahassee, FL, 

(850)488-8514, William.Thompson@myfloridaprepaid.com 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

19B-4.003 Payment Options. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.975, 1009.98(4) FS. History–New 3-29-89, Amended 2-6-90, 3-

19-92, Formerly 4G-4.003, Amended 6-20-96, 6-6-99, 11-27-02, 12-

28-03, Repealed_________. 

 

19B-4.004 Default. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.98(4) FS. History–New 3-29-89, Amended 2-6-90, 3-19-92, 

Formerly 4G-4.004, Repealed_________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Florida Prepaid College Board 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: June 12, 2014 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

19B-5.001 Plan Types 

19B-5.002 Contract Benefits 

19B-5.004 Contract Purchasers 

19B-5.005 Contract Exclusions 

19B-5.006 Limitations on Plan Option Changes 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of this rule 

development is to update and consolidate rules to reflect 

modifications to the Stanley G. Tate Florida Prepaid College 

Program. 

SUMMARY: The primary purpose of updating the rules is to 

reduce redundancy by consolidating relevant rules into the 

Master Contract, which is incorporated by reference in 

subsection 19B-4.001(2), F.A.C. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will not 

have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase 

directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in 

the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the 

rule. A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: During a discussion of the economic impact of these 

rules at its Board meeting, the Board, based upon the expertise 

and experience of its members, determined that a SERC was not 

necessary and that the rules will not require ratification by the 

Legislature. No person or interested party submitted additional 

information regarding the economic impact. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1009.971(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1009.97(3)(f)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201009.971
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201009.975
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201009.98
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=47
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-5.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-5.004
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-5.005
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-5.006


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

 

2681 

 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1009.98 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS 

NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: William Thompson, Deputy Executive Director, 

1801 Hermitage Blvd., Suite 210, Tallahassee, FL, (850)488-

8514, William.Thompson@myfloridaprepaid.com. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: William Thompson, Deputy Executive 

Director, 1801 Hermitage Blvd., Suite 210, Tallahassee, FL, 

(850)488-8514, William.Thompson@myfloridaprepaid.com 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

19B-5.001 Plan Types. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.98(2), (10) FS. History–New 3-29-89, Amended 5-17-92, 8-23-

92, Formerly 4G-5.001, Amended 5-31-95, 6-20-96, 10-20-96, 8-18-

97, 2-18-99, 2-8-00, 8-27-02, 12-17-07, 11-30-09, 10-18-10, 2-24-13, 

Repealed_________. 

 

19B-5.002 Contract Benefits. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.98 FS. History–New 3-29-89, Amended 2-6-90, 3-19-92, 

Formerly 4G-5.002, Amended 5-31-95, 6-20-96, 2-18-99, 1-1-07, 12-

17-07, 11-30-09, 10-18-10, 10-7-13, Repealed_________. 

 

19B-5.004 Contract Purchasers. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.98 FS. History–New 3-29-89, Amended 3-19-92, Formerly 4G-

5.004, Amended 12-5-93, 6-20-96, 7-28-98, 11-27-02, 1-28-09, 10-18-

10, 10-7-13, Repealed_________. 

 

19B-5.005 Contract Exclusions. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.98 FS. History–New 3-29-89, Formerly 4G-5.005, Amended 6-

20-96, 1-3-01, Repealed_________. 

 

19B-5.006 Limitations on Plan Option Changes. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.98(4) FS. History–New 2-6-90, Formerly 4G-5.006, Amended 6-

20-96, 3-20-97, 2-18-99, 12-17-07, 10-18-10, Repealed_________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Florida Prepaid College Board 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: June 12, 2014 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

19B-5.003 Contract Requirements 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of this rule 

development is to update and consolidate rules to reflect 

modifications to the Stanley G. Tate Florida Prepaid College 

Program. 

SUMMARY: The primary purpose of updating the rules is to 

reduce redundancy by consolidating relevant rules into the 

Master Contract, which is incorporated by reference in 

subsection 19B-4.001(2), F.A.C. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will not 

have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase 

directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in 

the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the 

rule. A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: During a discussion of the economic impact of these 

rules at its Board meeting, the Board, based upon the expertise 

and experience of its members, determined that a SERC was not 

necessary and that the rules will not require ratification by the 

Legislature. No person or interested party submitted additional 

information regarding the economic impact. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1009.98 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS 

NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1009.971(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1009.98
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=47
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-5.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1009.971(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1009.98


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

2682 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: William Thompson, Deputy Executive Director, 

1801 Hermitage Blvd., Suite 210, Tallahassee, FL, (850)488-

8514, William.Thompson@myfloridaprepaid.com. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: William Thompson, Deputy Executive 

Director, 1801 Hermitage Blvd., Suite 210, Tallahassee, FL, 

(850)488-8514, William.Thompson@myfloridaprepaid.com 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

19B-5.003 Contract Requirements. 

(1) Each applicaton submitted to the Board must specify 

the qualified beneficiary, provided however, that 

Notwithstanding the requirement to specify a Beneficary at the 

time of purchase pursuant to the Master Contract, which is 

incorporated by reference in subsection 19B-4.001(2), F.A.C., 

the Bboard’s direct support organization and organizations 

operating scholarship programs pursuant to Rule 19B-5.007, 

F.A.C., shall be permitted to leave the qualified beneficiary’s 

name blank until April 1 of the anticipated enrollment year. 

(2) Only one (1) qualified beneficiary is allowed per 

advanced payment contract, and a specific beneficiary can be 

named in only one (1) advance payment contract, provided 

however, a second advance payment A Ccontract may be 

purchased for a qualified beneficiary by the direct support 

organization or an organization operating a scholarship 

program pursuant to Rule 19B-5.007, F.A.C. If a second 

advance payment contract is purchased for a beneficiary by the 

direct support organization or an organization operating a 

scholarship program pursuant to Rule 19B-5.007, F.A.C., the 

purchaser of the original prepaid contract may receive a refund 

pursuant to paragraph 19B-11.001(2)(a), F.A.C. In the event 

duplicate advance payment contracts for the same beneficiary 

are processed and the second advance payment contract was not 

purchased by the direct support organization or an organization 

operating a scholarship program pursuant to Rule 19B-5.007, 

F.A.C., the advance payment contract processed first shall be 

deemed valid and the remaining advance payment contract shall 

be deemed terminated. 

(3) The purchaser does not have to designate the 

postsecondary institution that the beneficiary will attend. 

(4) The benefits of an advance payment contract may be 

used within three (3) years in advance of the selected 

matriculation date indicated in the application with no penalty 

or additional cost. However, to utilize the benefits prior to the 

selected matriculation date, the purchaser must pay the advance 

payment contract in full before changing such matriculation 

date. 

(3)(5)(a) The benefits of an advance payment contract may 

be received for up to a ten (10) year period after the 

matriculation date. The Account Owner or Benficiary may 

submit a written request for an extension to the Board within 

one year of the benefit period expiring; however the Board does 

not guarantee approval of an extension request. Factors the 

Board considers for granting an extension of benefits for up to 

two years are time spent by the Beneficiary as an active duty 

member of the U.S. Armed Services, prior extensions, prior 

Beneficiary changes, recent plan usage, available alternatives, 

and financial and medical hardships. Any time spent by the 

qualified beneficiary in the military service tolls the time for 

receiving contract benefits under all plans. The matriculation 

date is the projected college enrollment year of the qualified 

beneficiary, based on the information about the qualified 

beneficiary’s age or grade contained in the purchaser’s 

application, or similar information received subsequently by the 

Board from the purchaser. The right to use the benefits of an 

advance payment contract shall expire on December 31, ten 

(10) years after the matriculation date, or any extension thereof. 

(b) When the benefits of an advance payment contract have 

not been used on December 31, nine (9) years after the 

matriculation date or one (1) year prior to the expiration of any 

extension of the expiration date for the use of the advance 

payment contract benefits, the Board shall mail a written notice 

to the Ppurchaser which indicates: 

1. The procedure to extend the time period for the use of 

advance payment contract benefits or to obtain a refund for the 

contract; 

2. That the right to use the advance payment contract 

benefits will expire on December 31, ten (10) years after the 

matriculation date or any extension thereof; and 

3. That such benefits and refund will escheat to the Florida 

Prepaid College Trust Fund on that date. 

Such notice shall be mailed not later than 180 days prior to 

the expiration of the advance payment contract benefits. An 

alphabetical list of the names of Ppurchasers of such advance 

payment contracts shall be posted on the Board’s website on the 

Internet. 

(c) The benefits from and any refund associated with an 

advance payment contract for which the benefits have not been 

used by December 31, ten (10) years after the matriculation 

date, or any extension thereof, shall escheat to the Florida 

Prepaid College Trust Fund. 



Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

 

2683 

 

(6) Contract benefits associated with advance payment 

contracts that are composed of a Tuition Plan, a Local Fee Plan 

and a Tuition Differential Fee Plan will only be paid if the 

Tuition Plan, Local Fee Plan and Tuition Differential Fee Plan 

are in good standing. Payments for the contract benefits 

associated with Local Fee Plans and Tuition Differential Fee 

Plan shall not be remitted to pay the Registration Fees for any 

beneficiary attending a State University or Florida College. 

Payments for the contract benefits associated with Local Fee 

Plans and Tuition Differential Fee Plans may be remitted to pay 

tuition at private and out-of-state colleges for any qualified 

beneficiary. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.98(4) FS. History–New 3-29-89, Amended 2-6-90, 3-19-92, 

Formerly 4G-5.003, Amended 5-31-95, 6-20-96, 2-18-99, 6-6-99, 11-

6-01, 8-27-02, 12-17-07, 1-28-09, 10-18-10, 10-7-13,___________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Florida Prepaid College Board 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: June 12, 2014 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: June 6, 2014 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

19B-7.001 Beneficiary Defined 

19B-7.002 Residency 

19B-7.003 Evidence of Residency 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of this rule 

development is to update and consolidate rules to reflect 

modifications to the Stanley G. Tate Florida Prepaid College 

Program. 

SUMMARY: The primary purpose of updating the rules is to 

reduce redundancy by consolidating relevant rules into the 

Master Contract, which is incorporated by reference in 

subsection 19B-4.001(2), F.A.C. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will not 

have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase 

directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in 

the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the 

rule. A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: During a discussion of the economic impact of these 

rules at its Board meeting, the Board, based upon the expertise 

and experience of its members, determined that a SERC was not 

necessary and that the rules will not require ratification by the 

Legislature. No person or interested party submitted additional 

information regarding the economic impact. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1009.97(3)(f), 1009.971, 1009.98 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS 

NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: William Thompson, Deputy Executive Director, 

1801 Hermitage Blvd., Suite 210, Tallahassee, FL, (850)488-

8514, William.Thompson@myfloridaprepaid.com. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: William Thompson, Deputy Executive 

Director, 1801 Hermitage Blvd., Suite 210, Tallahassee, FL, 

(850)488-8514, William.Thompson@myfloridaprepaid.com 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

19B-7.001 Beneficiary Defined. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.971, 1009.98 FS. History–New 3-29-89, Amended 2-6-90, 

Formerly 4G-7.001, Amended 11-27-02, 1-1-07, Repealed_________. 

 

19B-7.002 Residency. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.97(3)(f), 1009.971, 1009.98 FS. History–New 3-29-89, Formerly 

4G-7.002, Repealed_________. 

 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=47
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-7.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-7.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-7.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1009.971(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1009.97(3)(f)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201009.971
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201009.98


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

2684 

19B-7.003 Evidence of Residency. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.97(3)(f), 1009.971, 1009.98 FS. History–New 3-29-89, Formerly 

4G-7.003, Amended 6-20-96, Repealed_________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Florida Prepaid College Board 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: June 12, 2014 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

19B-8.001 Qualified Individuals 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of this rule 

development is to update and consolidate rules to reflect 

modifications to the Stanley G. Tate Florida Prepaid College 

Program. 

SUMMARY: The primary purpose of updating the rule is to 

reduce redundancy by consolidating relevant rules into the 

Master Contract, which is incorporated by reference in 

subsection 19B-4.001(2), F.A.C. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will not 

have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase 

directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in 

the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the 

rule. A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: During a discussion of the economic impact of these 

rules at its Board meeting, the Board, based upon the expertise 

and experience of its members, determined that a SERC was not 

necessary and that the rules will not require ratification by the 

Legislature. No person or interested party submitted additional 

information regarding the economic impact. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1009.98 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS 

NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: William Thompson, Deputy Executive Director, 

1801 Hermitage Blvd., Suite 210, Tallahassee, FL, (850)488-

8514, William.Thompson@myfloridaprepaid.com. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: William Thompson, Deputy Executive 

Director, 1801 Hermitage Blvd., Suite 210, Tallahassee, FL, 

(850)488-8514, William.Thompson@myfloridaprepaid.com 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

19B-8.001 Qualified Individuals. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.98(4) FS. History–New 3-29-89, Formerly 4G-8.001, Amended 

12-5-93, 6-20-96, 8-18-97, 12-16-97, 3-24-99, 2-8-00, 10-9-01, 12-28-

03, 3-15-06, 1-28-09, Repealed_________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Florida Prepaid College Board 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: June 12, 2014 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

19B-9.001 Flexibility 

19B-9.002 Use of Benefits at In-State Private Colleges 

or Universities, Out-of-State Colleges and 

Universities and Vocational-Technical 

Schools 

19B-9.004 Dormitory Transfer to Florida Colleges and 

State University-Held Residences Other than 

Dormitories 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of this rule 

development is to update and consolidate rules to reflect 

modifications to the Stanley G. Tate Florida Prepaid College 

Program. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=47
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-8.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1009.971(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1009.98
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=47
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-9.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-9.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-9.004


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

 

2685 

 

SUMMARY: The primary purpose of updating the rules is to 

reduce redundancy by consolidating relevant rules into the 

Master Contract, which is incorporated by reference in 

subsection 19B-4.001(2), F.A.C. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will not 

have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase 

directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in 

the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the 

rule. A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: During a discussion of the economic impact of these 

rules at its Board meeting, the Board, based upon the expertise 

and experience of its members, determined that a SERC was not 

necessary and that the rules will not require ratification by the 

Legislature. No person or interested party submitted additional 

information regarding the economic impact. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1009.97, 1009.98 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS 

NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: William Thompson, Deputy Executive Director, 

1801 Hermitage Blvd., Suite 210, Tallahassee, FL, (850)488-

8514, William.Thompson@myfloridaprepaid.com. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: William Thompson, Deputy Executive 

Director, 1801 Hermitage Blvd., Suite 210, Tallahassee, FL, 

(850)488-8514, William.Thompson@myfloridaprepaid.com 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

19B-9.001 Flexibility. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.971, 1009.98(3) FS. History–New 3-29-89, Amended 3-19-92, 

Formerly 4G-9.001, Amended 6-20-96, 8-18-97, 12-17-07, 10-18-10, 

Repealed_________. 

 

19B-9.002 Use of Benefits at In-State Private Colleges or 

Universities, Out-of-State Colleges and Universities and 

Vocational-Technical Schools. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.98 FS. History–New 3-29-89, Formerly 4G-9.002, Amended 2-

6-90, 12-5-93, 6-20-96, 10-20-96, 2-18-99, 10-9-01, 12-17-07, 11-30-

09, 10-18-10, Repealed_________. 

 

19B-9.004 Dormitory Transfer to Florida Colleges and 

State University-Held Residences Other than Dormitories. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.98(3), (10) FS. History–New 10-20-96, Amended 1-28-09, 11-

30-09, 10-18-10, 10-7-13, Repealed_________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Florida Prepaid College Board 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: June 12, 2014 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

19B-10.001 Involuntary Termination 

19B-10.002 Voluntary Termination 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of this rule 

development is to update and consolidate rules to reflect 

modifications to the Stanley G. Tate Florida Prepaid College 

Program. 

SUMMARY: The primary purpose of updating the rules is to 

reduce redundancy by consolidating relevant rules into the 

Master Contract, which is incorporated by reference in 

subsection 19B-4.001(2), F.A.C. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will not 

have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase 

directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in 

the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the 

rule. A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1009.971(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1009.97
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201009.98
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=47
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-10.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-10.002


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

2686 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: During a discussion of the economic impact of these 

rules at its Board meeting, the Board, based upon the expertise 

and experience of its members, determined that a SERC was not 

necessary and that the rules will not require ratification by the 

Legislature. No person or interested party submitted additional 

information regarding the economic impact. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1009.97, 1009.98 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS 

NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: William Thompson, Deputy Executive Director, 

1801 Hermitage Blvd., Suite 210, Tallahassee, FL, (850)488-

8514, William.Thompson@myfloridaprepaid.com. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: William Thompson, Deputy Executive 

Director, 1801 Hermitage Blvd., Suite 210, Tallahassee, FL, 

(850)488-8514, William.Thompson@myfloridaprepaid.com 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

19B-10.001 Involuntary Termination. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) Law 

Implemented 1009.971, 1009.98(4) FS. History–New 3-29-89, 

Formerly 4G-10.001, Amended 6-20-96, Repealed_________. 

 

19B-10.002 Voluntary Termination. 

Rulemaking Specific Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) Law 

Implemented 1009.971, 1009.98(4) FS. History–New 3-29-89, 

Formerly 4G-10.002, Amended 6-20-96, 7-28-98, 1-28-09, 

Repealed_________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Florida Prepaid College Board 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: June 12, 2014 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

19B-11.001 General 

19B-11.002 Conversion of a Plan to Another Plan of 

Lesser Value 

19B-11.003 Conversion/Refund Requests 

19B-11.004 Dormitory Refund 

19B-11.005 Other Refunds 

19B-11.006 Hold Harmless 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of this rule 

development is to update and consolidate rules to reflect 

modifications to the Stanley G. Tate Florida Prepaid College 

Program. 

SUMMARY: The primary purpose of updating the rules is to 

reduce redundancy by consolidating relevant rules into the 

Master Contract, which is incorporated by reference in 

subsection 19B-4.001(2), F.A.C. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will not 

have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase 

directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in 

the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the 

rule. A SERC has not been prepared by the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: During a discussion of the economic impact of these 

rules at its Board meeting, the Board, based upon the expertise 

and experience of its members, determined that a SERC was not 

necessary and that the rules will not require ratification by the 

Legislature. No person or interested party submitted additional 

information regarding the economic impact. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1009.971(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1009.97
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201009.98
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=47
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-11.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-11.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-11.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-11.004
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-11.005
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=19B-11.006


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

 

2687 

 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1009.97, 1009.98 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS 

NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: William Thompson, Deputy Executive Director, 

1801 Hermitage Blvd., Suite 210, Tallahassee, FL, (850)488-

8514, William.Thompson@myfloridaprepaid.com. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: William Thompson, Deputy Executive 

Director, 1801 Hermitage Blvd., Suite 210, Tallahassee, FL, 

(850)488-8514, William.Thompson@myfloridaprepaid.com 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

19B-11.001 General. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.971, 1009.98(5), (10) FS. History–New 3-29-89, Amended 2-6-

90, 3-19-92, Formerly 4G-11.001, Amended 8-18-97, 11-6-01, 12-17-

07, 1-28-09, 11-30-09, 10-18-10, Repealed_________. 

 

19B-11.002 Conversion of a Plan to Another Plan of Lesser 

Value. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.98(5) FS. History–New 3-29-89, Amended 2-6-90, 3-19-92, 

Formerly 4G-11.002, Amended 8-18-97, Repealed_________. 

 

19B-11.003 Conversion/Refund Requests. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.98(5) FS. History–New 3-29-89, Amended 3-19-92, Formerly 

4G-11.003, Repealed_________. 

 

19B-11.004 Dormitory Refund. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.971, 1009.98(5) FS. History–New 3-29-89, Amended 2-6-90, 

Formerly 4G-11.004, Amended 5-31-95, 2-18-99, 10-18-10, 

Repealed_________. 

 

19B-11.005 Other Refunds. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.971, 1009.98(5) FS. History–New 3-29-89, Amended 2-6-90, 3-

19-92, Formerly 4G-11.005, Amended 1-28-09, 10-18-10, 

Repealed_________. 

 

19B-11.006 Hold Harmless. 

Rulemaking Authority 1009.971(1), (4), (6) FS. Law Implemented 

1009.98 FS. History–New 6-20-96, Repealed_________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Florida Prepaid College Board 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: June 12, 2014 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Physical Therapy Practice 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

64B17-3.001 Licensure as a Physical Therapist by 

Examination 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposed this rule 

amendment to update DOH Form DH-MQA 1142 to the August 

2013 revision and to update the Board’s website address. 

SUMMARY: The rule amendment updates incorporated Form 

DH-MQA-1142 to the August 2013 revision and updates the 

Board’s website address. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COST AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The agency has determined that this will not 

have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase 

directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in 

the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the 

rule. A SERC has not been prepared by the agency. The agency 

has determined that the proposed rule is not expected to require 

legislative ratification based on the statement of estimated 

regulatory costs or if no SERC is required, the information 

expressly relied upon and described herein: During discussion 

of the economic impact of this rule at its Board meeting, the 

Board considered that the rule amendment incorporates a 

revised version of the existing application form. The revision 

does not add any additional requirements and will have at most 

a small impact on existing requirements and procedures. 

Therefore, the rule amendments appear to have little or no 

economic impact. No person or interested party submitted 

additional information regarding the economic impact at that 

time. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY:  486.025(1), 486.031(3) FS.  

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.013, 456.017, 486.031, 486.041, 

486.051, 486.061 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS 

NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE ANNOUNCED IN THE 

NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1009.971(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1009.97
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%201009.98


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

2688 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Allen Hall, Executive Director, Board 

of Physical Therapy Practice, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin 

#C05, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3255; (850) 245-4373 

 

THE TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

64B17-3.001 Licensure as a Physical Therapist by 

Examination. 

Every physical therapist who applies for licensure by 

examination shall file DOH Form #DH-MQA 1142 Application 

for Licensure, Revised 08/13 08/12, which is hereby 

incorporated by reference, which is available through 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02042 

or www.floridasphysicaltherapy.gov/resources 

www.doh.state.fl.us/mqa, and demonstrate to the Board that the 

applicant: 

(1) through (3) No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 486.025(1), 486.031(3) FS. Law Implemented 

456.013, 456.017, 486.031, 486.041, 486.051, 486.061 FS. History–

New 8-6-84, Amended 6-2-85, Formerly 21M-7.20, Amended 5-18-

86, Formerly 21M-7.020, 21MM-3.001, Amended 3-1-94, Formerly 

61F11-3.001, Amended 12-22-94, 4-10-96, Formerly 59Y-3.001, 

Amended 12-30-98, 1-23-03, 4-9-06, 9-19-06, 3-13-07, 5-11-08, 5-21-

09, 8-10-09, 7-5-10, 12-17-12,__________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Board of Physical Therapy Practice 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE:  Board of Physical Therapy Practice 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: August 8, 2013 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR:  September 27, 2013 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Physical Therapy Practice 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

64B17-3.003 Licensure by Endorsement 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposed this rule 

amendment to update DOH Form DH-MQA 1142 to the August 

2013 revision, update the Board’s website address, and correct 

a statutory reference. 

SUMMARY: The rule amendment updates incorporated Form 

DH-MQA 1142 to the August 2013 revision, updates the 

Board’s website address, and corrects a statutory reference. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COST AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The agency has determined that this will not 

have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase 

directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in 

the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the 

rule. A SERC has not been prepared by the agency. The agency 

has determined that the proposed rule is not expected to require 

legislative ratification based on the statement of estimated 

regulatory costs or if no SERC is required, the information 

expressly relied upon and described herein: During discussion 

of the economic impact of this rule at its meeting, the Board 

considered that the rule amendment incorporates a revised 

version of the existing application form. The revision does not 

add any additional requirements and will have at most a small 

impact on existing requirements and procedures. Therefore, the 

rule amendments appear to have little or no economic impact. 

No person or interested party submitted additional information 

regarding the economic impact at that time. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 486.025, 486.081 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 486.031, 486.061, 486.081 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS 

NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE ANNOUNCED IN THE 

NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Allen Hall, Executive Director, Board 

of Physical Therapy Practice, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin 

#C05, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3255, (850)245-4373 

 

THE TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

64B17-3.003 Licensure by Endorsement. 

(1) An applicant filing DOH Form #DH-MQA 1142 

Application for Licensure, Revised 08/13 08/12, which is 

hereby incorporated by reference, which is available through 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02042 

or www.floridasphysicaltherapy.gov/resources www.doh.state. 

fl.us/mqa, and demonstrating that he or she meets the 

requirements of Rule 64B17-3.001, F.A.C., may be licensed to 

practice physical therapy by endorsement by presenting 

evidence satisfactory to the Board that the applicant has active 

licensure in another jurisdiction and has passed an examination 

before a similar, lawful, authorized examining board in physical 

therapy in such other jurisdiction if their standards for licensure 

are as high as those maintained in Florida. The standard for 

determining whether the standards of another jurisdiction are as 

high as the standards in Florida shall be whether the written 

examination taken for licensure in such other jurisdiction by 

applicants meeting Florida’s minimum educational 

qualifications was through the national physical therapy 

examination provider certified by the Department. 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02042
http://www.floridasphysicaltherapy.gov/resources
http://www.doh.state.fl.us/mqa
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02042
http://www.floridasphysicaltherapy.gov/resources


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

 

2689 

 

(2) through (3) No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 486.025, 486.081 FS. Law Implemented 

486.031, 486.061, 486.081, 487.031 FS. History–New 8-6-84, 

Formerly 21M-7.26, Amended 5-18-86, Formerly 21M-7.026, 21MM-

3.004, 61F11-3.004, 59Y-3.004, Amended 4-21-02, 11-11-02, 11-1-

04, 4-9-06, 5-21-09, 8-10-09, 6-9-10, 12-17-12, 5-8-13, 5-12-

14,_________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Board of Physical Therapy Practice 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Board of Physical Therapy Practice 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: August 8, 2013 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: June 4, 2014 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Physical Therapy Practice 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

64B17-4.001 Licensure as a Physical Therapist Assistant 

by Examination 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposed this rule 

amendment to update DOH Form DH-MQA-1142 to the 

August 2013 revision, update the Board’s website address, and 

revise the rule language to conform to additional accrediting 

criteria established by Chapter 2013-093, Laws of Florida. 

SUMMARY: The proposed rule amendment updates 

incorporated Form DH-MQA-1142 to the August 2013 

revision, updates the Board’s website address, and amends the 

rule language to conform to additional accrediting criteria 

established by Chapter 2013-093, Laws of Florida. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COST AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The agency has determined that this will not 

have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase 

directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in 

the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the 

rule. A SERC has not been prepared by the agency.  The agency 

has determined that the proposed rule is not expected to require 

legislative ratification based on the statement of estimated 

regulatory costs or if no SERC is required, the information 

expressly relied upon and described herein:  During discussion 

of the economic impact of this rule at its meeting, the Board 

considered that the rule amendment incorporates a revised 

version of the existing application form.  

The revision does not add any additional requirements and will 

have at most a small impact on existing requirements and 

procedures. Further, the rule amendments revise the rule's 

language to comply with the 2013 amendment of Section 

486.102(3), Florida Statutes. Any economic impacts from the 

amended rule language are imposed by the statute, and not the 

Board's rule amendments. Therefore, the rule amendments 

appear to have little or no economic impact. No person or 

interested party submitted additional information regarding the 

economic impact of the rule language. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 486.025, 486.102 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.013, 456.017, 486.102(3), 

486.104, 486.106, 486.107 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS 

NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE ANNOUNCED IN THE 

NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Allen Hall, Executive Director, Board 

of Physical Therapy Practice, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin 

#C05, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3255, (850)245-4373 

 

THE TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

64B17-4.001 Licensure as a Physical Therapist Assistant 

by Examination. 

Every physical therapist who applies for licensure by 

examination shall file DOH Form #DH-MQA 1142 Application 

for Licensure, Revised 08/13 08/12, which is hereby 

incorporated by reference, which is available through 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02042 

or www.floridasphysicaltherapy.gov/resources www.doh.state. 

fl.us/mqa, and demonstrate to the Board that the applicant: 

(1) through (2) No change. 

(3) Education, 

(a) Has received a degree as a physical therapist assistant 

from an institution as specified by the statute, that, has been 

approved for the training of physical therapist assistants by the 

Commission on Accreditation for Physical Therapy Education 

(CAPTE), at the time of graduation, or 

(b) No change. 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02042
http://www.floridasphysicaltherapy.gov/resources


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

2690 

Rulemaking Authority 486.025, 486.102 FS. Law Implemented 

456.013, 456.017, 486.102(3), 486.104, 486.106, 486.107 FS. 

History–New 8-6-84, Amended 6-2-85, Formerly 21M-10.20, 

Amended 5-18-86, Formerly 21M-10.020, 21MM-4.001, Amended 3-

1-94, Formerly 61F11-4.001, Amended 12-22-94, 4-10-96, Formerly 

59Y-4.001, Amended 1-23-03, 4-9-06, 9-19-06, 5-21-09, 9-22-09, 9-

28-09, 6-9-10, 12-17-12,_________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Board of Physical Therapy Practice 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Board of Physical Therapy Practice 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: August 8, 2013 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: June 4, 2014 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Physical Therapy Practice 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE 

64B17-4.003 Licensure by Endorsement 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposed this rule 

amendment to update DOH Form DH-MQA-1142 to the 

August 2013 revision and to update the Board’s website 

address. 

SUMMARY: The rule amendment updates incorporated Form 

DH-MQA-1142 to the August 2013 revision and updates the 

Board’s website address. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COST AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The agency has determined that this will not 

have an adverse impact on small business or likely increase 

directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in 

the aggregate within one year after the implementation of the 

rule. A SERC has not been prepared by the agency. The agency 

has determined that the proposed rule is not expected to require 

legislative ratification based on the statement of estimated 

regulatory costs or if no SERC is required, the information 

expressly relied upon and described herein: During discussion 

of the economic impact of this rule at its meeting, the Board 

considered that the rule amendment incorporates a revised 

version of the existing application form. The revision does not 

add any additional requirements and will have at most a small 

impact on existing requirements and procedures. Therefore, the 

rule amendments appear to have little or no economic impact. 

No person or interested party submitted additional information 

regarding the economic impact at that time. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 486.025, 486.107(1) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 486.106, 486.107 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS 

NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE ANNOUNCED IN THE 

NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Allen Hall, Executive Director, Board 

of Physical Therapy Practice, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin 

#C05, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3255, (850)245-4373 

 

THE TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

64B17-4.003 Licensure by Endorsement. 

(1) An applicant filing DOH Form #DH-MQA 1142 

Application for Licensure, Revised 08/13 08/12, which is 

hereby incorporated by reference, which is available through 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02042 

or www.floridasphysicaltherapy.gov/resources www.doh.state. 

fl.us/mqa, and demonstrating that he or she meets the 

requirements of Rule 64B17-3.001, F.A.C., may be licensed to 

practice physical therapy by endorsement by presenting 

evidence satisfactory to the Board that the applicant has active 

licensure in another jurisdiction and has passed an examination 

before a similar, lawful, authorized examining board in physical 

therapy in such other jurisdiction if their standards for licensure 

are as high as those maintained in Florida. The standard for 

determining whether the standards of another jurisdiction are as 

high as the standards in Florida shall be whether the written 

examination taken for licensure in such other jurisdiction by 

applicants meeting Florida’s minimum educational 

qualifications was through the national physical therapy 

examination provider certified by the Department. 

(2) through (3) No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 486.025, 486.107(1) FS. Law Implemented 

486.106, 486.107 FS. History–New 8-6-84, Formerly 21M-10.26, 

Amended 5-18-86, Formerly 21M-10.026, 21MM-4.004, 61F11-

4.004, 59Y-4.004, Amended 7-11-02, 11-11-02, 12-5-04, 4-9-06, 5-

21-09, 9-28-09, 9-23-10, 12-17-12, 5-8-13,__________. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Board of Physical Therapy Practice 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Board of Physical Therapy Practice 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: August 8, 2013 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: June 4, 2014 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02042
http://www.floridasphysicaltherapy.gov/resources


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

 

2691 

 

Section III 

Notice of Changes, Corrections and 

Withdrawals 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Office of Energy 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

5O-1.002 Definitions 

5O-1.003 Renewable Energy Technologies Grants 

Program 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with Section 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 40, No.67, April 7, 2014, 

issue of the Florida Administrative Register.  

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

5O-1.002 Definitions. 

The words, terms, and phrases used in this chapter, unless 

otherwise indicated, shall have the meaning set forth in Section 

377.803, F.S. In addition, when used in this chapter, the 

following words, phrases, or terms, shall have the following 

meanings: 

(1) through (6) No change. 

(7) “Cost Reimbursement” means payment to grantee of 

reasonable costs incurred in connection with the performance 

of work, not to exceed the amount set forth in the budget. See 

the Department of Financial Services, Reference Guide to State 

Expenditures for guidance. 

(8) No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 377.804(3), 377.806(7), 220.192(3) FS. Law 

Implemented 377.802, 377.804, 377.806, 220.192 FS. History–New 

10-22-07, Formerly 62-16.200, 27N-1.200, Amended___________. 

 

5O-1.003 Renewable Energy and Energy-Efficient 

Technologies Grants Program. 

(1)(a) through (c) No change. 

(d) Indirect Costs are not eligible for grant reimbursement. 

(2) No change. 

(3) APPLICATIONS. Applications for the Grant 

Assistance Pursuant to Renewable Energy and Energy-Efficient 

Technologies Grant Matching Program shall be submitted to 

the Department of Agriculture and Consumer Services, Office 

of Energy, 600 South Calhoun Street, Suite 251, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-0001 as follows: 

(a) Applicants shall complete the form entitled Renewable 

Energy and Energy-Efficient Technologies Grant Matching 

Program Application, FDACS-01990, (Rev. 6/14 3/14), which 

is hereby adopted and incorporated by reference and may be 

obtained online at: http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/ 

reference.asp?No=Ref-XXXXX or by emailing the Office of 

Energy at Energy@FreshFromFlorida.com, and shall submit 

five (5) paper copies and one (1) electronic copy of the 

completed application on a non-rewritable compact disc or 

USB flash drive that will not be returned to the applicant. 

(b) through (d) No change. 

(e) COMPLETENESS. Applicant must use the Renewable 

Energy and Energy-Efficient Technologies Grant Matching 

Program Application form FDACS-01990, (Rev. 6/14 3/14) 

provided by the Department. Within 10 days of receipt of an 

application, the Department will evaluate the application to 

verify that the applicant has met the qualifying statutory and 

rule criteria. If the Department determines that the applicant is 

eligible for funding reservation, the Department will provide a 

letter of reservation. If the Department determines that the 

application is incomplete, the Department will issue a written 

notification to the applicant that the application was determined 

to be incomplete and will include a description of the 

application’s deficiencies. If the Department determines that an 

application is incomplete, the applicant will be allowed to 

submit a corrected application. The corrected application will 

be treated as a new application and reviewed in the order that it 

is received. Supporting documentation will not be returned to 

applicants. 

(f) through (g) No change. 

(4) No change. 

(5) GRANT FUNDING. 

(a) Eligible use of funds. 

1. Grant funds are eligible for use to cover travel, supply, 

equipment, and contractual service expenses if they are directly 

related to the proposed project. 

2. Salaries, fringe benefits, and travel expenses shall be 

claimed for grant reimbursement only by Florida universities 

and colleges. 

(b) Ineligible use of funds. 

1. Indirect Costs are not eligible for grant reimbursement. 

2. Salaries, fringe benefits, and travel expenses are not an 

eligible expense for municipalities and county governments, 

established for-profit companies licensed to do business in the 

state, utilities located and operating within the state, and not-

for-profit organizations. 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

2692 

3. In accordance with Section 216.347, Florida Statutes, 

applicants are prohibited from using funds provided by this 

program for the purpose of lobbying the Legislature, the 

judicial branch, or any state agency. 

(5) through (6) renumbered (6) through (7) No change. 

(8)(7) RESERVATION/AWARD. 

(a) Eligible applicants with a minimum averaged score of 

120 will be provided a letter of reservation with the funding 

amount reserved by the Department. If the eligible applicant is 

successful in receiving Prime Funding as evidenced by a Notice 

of Award from the Prime Funder, the Department will enter into 

an agreement to provide funds towards the proposed project. 

utilizing a Grant Agreement, FDACS-01602, (Rev. 08/11), 

which is hereby adopted and incorporated by reference and a 

sample may be viewed online at: http://www.flrules.org/ 

Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-XXXXX. 

(b) through (i) No change. 

(9)(8) ADMINISTRATION. 

(a) No change. 

(b) Grant agreements shall be limited to no longer than 

three (3) years in duration, unless approved in writing by the 

Department. 

(c) through (f) No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 377.804(3) FS. Law Implemented 377.802, 

377.804 FS. History–New 10-22-07, Formerly 62-16.300, 27N-1.300, 

Amended_________. 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

Florida’s Office of Early Learning 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

6M-8.500 VPK Specialized Instructional Services 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 40, No. 102, May 27, 

2014 issue of the Florida Administrative Register. Following 

comment by the Joint Administrative Procedures Committee, 

Section 1002.75(1), F.S. will be added to the rulemaking 

authority; subsection (2) of Section 1002.53, F.S. will be 

deleted from the law implemented and paragraphs (3)(d)-(e) of 

Section 1002.75, F.S. will be added to the law implemented; the 

date of the Form OEL-VPK 01S, “dated June 2014”, will be 

removed from paragraph (2)(b); and suparagraphs (6)(a)1.-2. 

will be amended to correct the item number and form number 

in the first sentence of each paragraph from Item 8 Form OEL-

VPK 02S, Part B to Item 7 of Form OEL-VPK 01S. 

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION 

Medicaid 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

59G-4.130 Home Health Services 

NOTICE OF ADDITIONAL HEARING 

The Agency for Health Care Administration announces an 

additional hearing regarding the above rule, as noticed in Vol. 

40, No. 46, March 7, 2014 Florida Administrative Register. 

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, July 3, 2014, 10:00 a.m. ‒ 11:00 

a.m. 

PLACE: Agency for Health Care Administration, 2727 Mahan 

Drive, Building 3, Conference Room D, Tallahassee, Florida 

32308-5407 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The 

Agency is scheduling a public hearing in Tallahassee, FL for 

the purpose of discussing the following updates related to 

private duty nursing: 1) rate increase for licensed practice 

nurses and (2) services provided in the home in combination 

with pediatric extended care services. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Claire Anthony-Davis at the Bureau of Medicaid 

Services, (850)412-4266. If you are hearing or speech impaired, 

please contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Opticianry 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

64B12-16.003 Apprenticeship Requirements and Training 

Program 

NOTICE OF CORRECTION 

Notice is hereby given that the following correction has been 

made to the proposed rule in Vol. 40, No. 105, May 30, 2014 

issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

The first paragraph of the Notice of Change should read as: 

“Notice is hereby given that the following change has been 

made to the proposed rule to delete “current and appropriate 

teaching models”, in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 39, No. 236, of the 

December 5, 2013, issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

The change is in response to concerns from the Joint 

Administrative Committee, in a letter dated December 13, 

2013. 

http://www.flrules.org/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1044
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6M-8.500
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=192
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59G-4.130
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=303
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B12-16.003


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

 

2693 

 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Sue Foster, Executive Director, Board 

of Opticianry/MQA, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C08, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

OIR – Insurance Regulation 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

69O-228.010 Purpose 

69O-228.020 Scope 

69O-228.030 Definitions 

69O-228.040 Course Providers 

69O-228.050 School Officials 

69O-228.060 Instructors and Supervising Instructors 

69O-228.080 Course Approval; Requirements; Guidelines 

69O-228.090 Course Offerings and Attendance Records 

69O-228.100 Certification of Students 

69O-228.110 Textbooks 

69O-228.120 Course Fees 

69O-228.130 Facilities 

69O-228.150 Advertising 

69O-228.160 Prohibited Practices 

69O-228.180 Forms 

69O-228.190 Transition Time in the Event of Rule 

Changes 

69O-228.210 Penalties for Course Providers, School 

Officials, Supervising Instructors, 

Instructors, and Monitors 

69O-228.220 Licensee Compliance; Requirements; 

Penalties for Non-Compliance 

69O-228.230 Extensions 

69O-228.240 Applicability of Continuing Education 

Requirement for New Licensees 

69O-228.250 Exempted Licensees 

NOTICE OF CORRECTION 

Notice is hereby given that the following correction has been 

made to the proposed rule in Vol. 40, No. 101, May 23, 2014 

issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

In the summary it states “Towards this end, the Department of 

Financial Services has promulgated Rule Chapter 69O-228. 

This should be corrected to Rule Chapter 69B-228. 

This change is to correct a clerical error, and will have no 

substantive effect. 

Section IV 

Emergency Rules 

NONE 

Section V 

Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Rule 

Variance or Waiver 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001 Safety Standards 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on June 18, 2014, the 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division 

of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received 

a petition for Solaire @ Plaza. Petitioner seeks a variance of the 

requirements of an unspecified Section of A17.3, as adopted by 

subsection 61C-5.001(1), Florida Administrative Code, that 

requires upgrading the elevators operations which poses a 

significant economic/financial hardship. Any interested person 

may file comments within 14 days of the publication of this 

notice with Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940 

North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013 

(VW2014-213). 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained 

by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940 

North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001 Safety Standards 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on June 17, 2014, the 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division 

of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received 

a petition for 851 Trafalgar. Petitioner seeks a temporary 

variance of the requirements of ASME A17.1, Section 212 and 

Florida Building Code, Section 3003, as adopted by subsection 

61C-5.001(1), Florida Administrative Code, that requires 

upgrading the elevators suspension ropes and their connections 

and elevator enclosures operations which poses a significant 

economic/financial hardship. Any interested person may file 

comments within 14 days of the publication of this notice with 

Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940 North Monroe 

Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013 (VW2014-212). 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained 

by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940 

North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=520
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.010
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.020
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.030
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.040
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.050
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.060
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.080
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.090
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.100
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.110
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.120
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.130
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.150
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.160
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.180
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.190
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.210
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.220
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.230
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.240
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-228.250
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

2694 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001 Safety Standards 

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety 

hereby gives notice: 

On June 18, 2014, the Division issued an order. The Final Order 

was in response to a Petition for a Variance from Sundial: 

BEMC Market, filed May 21, 2014, and advertised on May 23, 

2014, in Vol. 40, No. 101, of the Florida Administrative 

Register. No comments were received in response to the 

petition. The Final Order on the Petition for Variance grants the 

Petitioner a variance from Rule 2.20.1, 2.18.5.1 ASME A17.1b, 

2009 edition, as adopted by paragraph 61C-5.001(1)(a), Florida 

Administrative Code, that requires steel ropes of a minimum 

diameter of 9.5 mm because the Petitioner has demonstrated 

that the purpose of the underlying statute has been met and that 

Petitioner would suffer a substantial hardship if required to 

comply with this rule (VW2014-144). 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be obtained 

by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940 

North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001 Safety Standards 

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety 

hereby gives notice: 

On June 18, 2014, the Division issued an order. The Final Order 

was in response to a Petition for a Variance from Kuhn Honda, 

filed June 3, 2014, and advertised on June 10, 2014, in Vol. 40, 

No. 112, of the Florida Administrative Register. No comments 

were received in response to the petition. The Final Order on 

the Petition for Variance grants the Petitioner a variance from 

Rule 2.20.1, 2.18.5.1 ASME A17.1b, 2009 edition, as adopted 

by paragraph 61C-5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative Code, 

that requires steel ropes of a minimum diameter of 9.5 mm 

because the Petitioner has demonstrated that the purpose of the 

underlying statute has been met and that Petitioner would suffer 

a substantial hardship if required to comply with this rule 

(VW2014-161). 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be obtained 

by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940 

North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001 Safety Standards 

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety 

hereby gives notice: 

On June 18, 2014 the Division issued an order. The Final Order 

was in response to a Petition for an emergency Variance from 

Tower Place @ Summit, filed May 20, 2014, and advertised on 

May 23, 2014, in Vol. 40, No. 101, of the Florida 

Administrative Register. No comments were received in 

response to the petition. The Final Order on the Petition for 

Variance grants the Petitioner a variance from Rule 101.3, 

111.10 and 204.5h ASME A17.1b, 1988 edition, and Rule 7C-

5.001(f)1 Florida Administrative Code, as adopted by Chapter 

30, Section 3001.2 Florida Building Code adopted by paragraph 

61C-5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative Code, from the 

requirement from locked doors on the access path because the 

Petitioner has demonstrated that the purpose of the underlying 

statute has been met and that Petitioner would suffer a 

substantial hardship if required to comply with this rule 

(VW2014-143). 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be obtained 

by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940 

North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001 Safety Standards 

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety 

hereby gives notice: 

On June 18, 2014, the Department issued a Final Order that was 

in response to a Petition for Variance from Hilton, filed May 8, 

2014, and advertised on May 14, 2014, in Vol. 40, No. 94, of 

the Florida Administrative Register. No comments were 

received in response to the petition. The Final Order on the 

Petition for Variance denies the Petitioner a variance from Rule 

3.11.3, ASME A17.3, 1996 edition, as adopted by paragraph 

61C-5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative Code, that requires 

upgrading the elevators for firefighters’ emergency operations 

because the Petitioner has not demonstrated that the purpose of 

the underlying statute has been met or that Petitioner would 

suffer a substantial hardship if required to comply with this rule 

(VW2014-125). 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

 

2695 

 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be obtained 

by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940 

North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013, 

(850)488-1133. 

__________________________________________________ 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001 Safety Standards 

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety 

hereby gives notice: 

On June 18, 2014, the Department issued a Final Order that was 

in response to a Petition for Variance from Management Corp. 

of Oceanview, Condo Assoc. Inc., filed May 27, 2014, and 

advertised on May 30, 2014, in Vol. 40, No. 105, of the Florida 

Administrative Register. No comments were received in 

response to the petition. The Final Order on the Petition for 

Variance denies the Petitioner a variance from Rule 211.3b and 

211.3a(7), ASME A17.1, 1987 edition, as adopted by paragraph 

61C-5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative Code, that requires 

upgrading the elevators smoke detectors and visual and audible 

signal system because the Petitioner failed to demonstrate a 

valid hardship (VW2014-154). 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be obtained 

by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940 

North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013, 

(850)488-1133. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001 Safety Standards 

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety 

hereby gives notice: 

On June 18, 2014, the Department issued a Final Order that was 

in response to a Petition for Variance from River Park Place, 

filed March 19, 2014, and advertised on March 24, 2014, in Vol. 

40, No. 57, of the Florida Administrative Register. No 

comments were received in response to the petition. The Final 

Order on the Petition for Variance denies the Petitioner a 

variance, as adopted by Chapter 30, Section 3001.2 Florida 

Building Code adopted by paragraph 61C-5.001(1)(a), Florida 

Administrative Code that requires upgrading the elevators 

because the Petitioner has not provided the necessary 

information to make a decision on the petition (VW2014-070). 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be obtained 

by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940 

North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013, 

(850)488-1133. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Medicine 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

64B8-4.009 Applications 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on June 18, 2014, the Board 

of Medicine, received a petition for waiver or variance filed by 

Boris Spektor, M.D., from Rule 64B8-4.009, F.A.C., with 

regard to the requirement for submission of documentation of 

medical education directly from Petitioner’s medical school. 

Comments on this petition should be filed with the Board of 

Medicine, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C03, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-3053, within 14 days of publication of this 

notice. 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained 

by contacting: Allison M. Dudley, J.D., Executive Director, 

Board of Medicine, at the above address or telephone: 

(850)245-4131. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Medicine 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

64B8-4.009 Applications 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on June 19, 2014, the Board 

of Medicine, received a petition for waiver or variance filed by 

Youssef Shafik Ragheb, M.D., from Rule 64B8-4.009, F.A.C., 

with regard to the requirement for submission of documentation 

of medical education directly from Petitioner’s medical school. 

Comments on this petition should be filed with the Board of 

Medicine, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C03, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-3053, within 14 days of publication of this 

notice. 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained 

by contacting: Allison M. Dudley, J.D., Executive Director, 

Board of Medicine, at the above address or telephone: 

(850)245-4131. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Medicine 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

64B8-4.009 Applications 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on June 19, 2014, the Board 

of Medicine, received a petition for waiver or variance filed by 

Ajitkumar Trivikram, M.D., from Rule 64B8-4.009, F.A.C., 

with regard to the requirement for submission of documentation 

of medical education directly from Petitioner’s medical school. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=331
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B8-4.009
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=331
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B8-4.009
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=331
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B8-4.009


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

2696 

Comments on this petition should be filed with the Board of 

Medicine, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C03, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-3053, within 14 days of publication of this 

notice. 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained 

by contacting: Allison M. Dudley, J.D., Executive Director, 

Board of Medicine, at the above address or telephone: 

(850)245-4131. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Division of Environmental Health 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

64E-11.007 Sanitary Facilities and Controls 

64E-11.008 Other Facilities and Operations 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on June 06, 2014, the 

Department of Health, received a petition for Variance from 

Rules 64E-11.008 and subsection 64E-11.007(5), Florida 

Administrative Code (F.A.C.), from Vero Beach Theatre Guild, 

Incorporated, James A. Schorner, Treasurer, 2020 San Juan 

Avenue, Vero Beach, Florida 32960. 

Rule 64E-11.008, F.A.C., requires all walls and ceilings and 

similar closures to be kept clean and in good repair. The walls 

of all food preparation, utensil washing and handwashing rooms 

or areas must have smooth, easily cleanable surfaces and shall 

be washable up to the highest level reached by splash or spray. 

Subsection 64E-11.007(5), F.A.C., requires handwashing 

facilities lavatories to be adequate, readily accessible, and 

conveniently located with hot and cold running water, soap and 

single use sanitary towels or a heated-air hand drying device. 

At least one employee handwashing facility is to be located 

within each food preparation area. Comments on this petition 

should be filed with Jaime Briggs, Agency Clerk, Department 

of Health, Office of General Counsel, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, 

BIN A02, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1703, within 14 days of 

this notice. 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained 

by contacting: Sharon Saulter, Bureau of Environmental 

Health, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, BIN A08, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-1710 or by calling (850)245-4444, extension 2338. 

Section VI 

Notice of Meetings, Workshops and Public 

Hearings 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Agricultural Environmental Services 

The Pesticide Registration Evaluation Committee announces a 

public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: July 3, 2014, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Florida Department of Agriculture and Consumer 

Services, Bureau of Pesticides Conference Room, 3125 Conner 

Boulevard, Building 6, Room 606, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-

1650, (850)617-7940 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The 

Committee discusses and makes recommendations on pesticide 

registration issues impacting human health and safety and the 

environment. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: the 

Pesticide Registration Section, (850)617-7940 or from the 

PREC Web Site at: 

http://www.freshfromflorida.com/Divisions-

Offices/Agricultural-Environmental-Services/Bureaus-and-

Sections2/Bureau-of-Pesticides/Product-Registration-

Procedures 

For more information, you may contact: Mr. Charlie L. Clark, 

Administrator, Pesticide Registration Section, 3125 Conner 

Boulevard, Building 6, Room 601, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-

1650, (850)617-7940. 

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS 

South Florida Water Management District 

The South Florida Water Management District announces a 

public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 30, 2014, 2:00 p.m. 

Loxahatchee River Management Coordinating Council 

Meeting 

PLACE: The River Center, 805 US Highway 1, Jupiter, FL 

33477 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Meet to discuss the goals and objectives regarding the 

management of the Wild and Scenic portion of the Loxahatchee 

River. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Kathy 

LaMartina, South Florida Water Management District, 3301 

Gun Club Road, West Palm Beach, FL 33406 or 

klamart@sfwmd.gov, www.sfwmd.gov, (561)682-6594. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: the District Clerk, (561)682-2087. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Kathy LaMartina, 

(561)682-6594. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=335
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64E-11.007
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64E-11.008
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=165
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=124


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

 

2697 

 

REGIONAL UTILITY AUTHORITIES 

Tampa Bay Water ‒ A Regional Water Supply Authority 

The Tampa Bay Water announces a public meeting to which all 

persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, July 2, 2014, 9:00 a.m. ‒ 1:00 

p.m. 

PLACE: Tampa Bay Water Administrative Offices, Board 

Room ‒ 1st Floor, 2575 Enterprise Road, Clearwater, FL 33763 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: A 

public meeting of the Selection Committee for The Long-Term 

Master Water Plan Feasibility Program and 2018 Long-Term 

Master Water Plan Update. As a part of the professional 

services selection process, the Selection Committee will meet 

to interview the short-listed respondents and determine the final 

ranking of the interviewed respondents. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Records 

Department at (727)796-2355. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Records Department at (727)796-2355. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Records Department at 

(727)796-2355. 

DEPARTMENT OF THE LOTTERY 

The Department of the Lottery announces a public meeting to 

which all persons are invited.  

DATE AND TIME: Monday, June 30, 2014, 3:00 p.m., Eastern 

Time. This public meeting is a rescheduling of the June 23, 

2014, public meeting that was originally noticed and published 

in the Vol. 40, No. 119 issue of the Florida Administrative 

Register on June 19, 2014. 

PLACE: Florida Lottery Headquarters, 250 Marriott Drive, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32301 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The 

Florida Lottery will open Replies received in response to the 

Invitation to Negotiate – Lottery Gaming System and Related 

Commodities & Services (Project # 001-13/14) and will read 

aloud the names of the responding firms. 

For more information, please visit the vendor bid system at: 

http://www.myflorida.com/apps/vbs/vbs_www.main_menu. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Summer 

Silvestri at (850)487-7710 or by going to the Department of the 

Lottery’s website: www.flalottery.com. 

Any person requiring a special accommodation because of a 

disability at this public meeting should contact the individual 

identified above at (850)487-7710 (voice), or through the 

Florida Relay Service at 1(800)955-8771 (TDD), at least 24 

hours prior to the meeting. 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Lottery with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Construction Industry Licensing Board 

The Construction Industry Licensing Board announces a 

telephone conference call to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, July 8, 2014, 10:00 a.m. or soon 

thereafter 

PLACE: Conference Call: 1(888)670-3525, Conference Code: 

2938723619 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

CE/Exams/Public Awareness committee meeting of the board. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Amanda 

Wynn, Senior Management Analyst Supervisor, 1940 North 

Monroe Street, Tallahassee, FL 32399-1039, (850)487-1395. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Amanda Wynn, Senior Management Analyst 

Supervisor, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, FL 32399-

1039, (850)487-1395. If you are hearing or speech impaired, 

please contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Amanda Wynn, Senior 

Management Analyst Supervisor, 1940 North Monroe Street, 

Tallahassee, FL 32399-1039, (850)487-1395. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Construction Industry Licensing Board 

The Construction Industry Licensing Board announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=49
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=158
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=53
http://www.myflorida.com/apps/vbs/vbs_www.main_menu
http://www.flalottery.com/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=274
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=274


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

2698 

DATES AND TIMES: Wednesday, July 9, 2014, 12:00 Noon; 

Thursday, July 10, 2014, 8:00 a.m.; Friday, July 11, 2014, 8:00 

a.m. or soon thereafter 

PLACE: Hyatt Regency Jacksonville Riverfront, 225 E 

Coastline Drive, Jacksonville, FL 32202 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

General business, disciplinary and committee meetings of the 

board. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Amanda 

Wynn, Senior Management Analyst Supervisor, 1940 North 

Monroe Street, Tallahassee, FL 32399-1039, (850)487-1395. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Amanda Wynn, Senior Management Analyst 

Supervisor, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, FL 32399-

1039, (850)487-1395. If you are hearing or speech impaired, 

please contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Amanda Wynn, Senior 

Management Analyst Supervisor, 1940 North Monroe Street, 

Tallahassee, FL 32399-1039, (850)487-1395. 

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 

The Florida Department of Environmental Protection 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, July 23, 2014, 9:00 a.m. – 

5:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Main Auditorium, Jupiter Community Center, 200 

Military Trail, Jupiter, FL 33458 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The 

Coral Reef Conservation Program is holding the fourth meeting 

of the Our Florida Reefs North Community Working Group for 

working group members to learn about Southeast Florida’s 

coral reef ecosystem, marine habitats, and human uses. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Benjamin 

Wahle, by e-mail: Benjamin.Wahle@dep.state.fl.us or by 

phone: (305)795-1227. The agenda will be posted at 

http://ourfloridareefs.org/events/ one week prior to the meeting 

date. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Benjamin Wahle at (305)795-1227. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 

The Department of Environmental Protection’s Water Quality 

Protection Program Canal Restoration Advisory Subcommittee 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: July 15, 2014, 1:00 p.m. ‒ 4:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Marathon Government Center, Board Meeting Room, 

2798 Overseas Highway, Marathon, FL 33050 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The 

purpose of the meeting is to update the members of the WQPP 

Canal Restoration Advisory Subcommittee on the progress of 

ongoing projects and to discuss future actions. The meeting is 

open to the public. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Gus Rios, 

Environmental Administrator, South District Marathon Office, 

(305)289-7081, gus.rios@dep.state.fl.us 

For more information, you may contact: Gus Rios. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Division of Emergency Medical Operations 

The Emergency Medical Services Advisory Council announces 

a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATES AND TIME: July 15-17, 2014, 8:00 a.m. ‒ 6:00 p.m. 

each day 

PLACE: Caribe Royale, 8101 World Centre Drive, Orlando, FL 

328021 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

General business of the council. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Bonnie 

Newsome, (850)245-4440. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Bonnie Newsome, (850)245-4440. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Bonnie Newsome, 

(850)245-4440. 

FISH AND WILDLIFE CONSERVATION COMMISSION 

Vessel Registration and Boating Safety 

The Fish and Wildlife Conservation Commission announces a 

public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 26, 2014, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Florida Fish and Wildlife Conservation Commission, 

Bryant Building Auditorium, 620 South Meridian Street, 

Tallahassee, FL 32399 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=832
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=68
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=350


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

 

2699 

 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The 

Evaluation Committee for the Florida Boating Improvement 

Program (FBIP) will meet to score applications for fiscal year 

2014-2015 funding. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Florida 

Boating Improvement Program Administrator, 

FBIP@MyFWC.com or (850)488-5600. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least five days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: ADA Coordinator, (850)488-6411. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Division of State Fire Marshal 

The Department of Financial Services, Division of State Fire 

Marshal, announces a public meeting to which all persons are 

invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Saturday, August 2, 2014, 8:00 a.m. – 

10:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Harbor Beach Marriot Resort, Ocean Salon Room, 

3030 Holiday Drive, Fort Lauderdale, Florida 33316 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The 

Department is holding a second workshop for the purpose of 

exploring options with the public for the implementation of new 

programs of study and vocational courses relating to standards 

for Urban Search & Rescue, and Hazardous Materials. The 

workshop may also include a general discussion of a proposed 

Urban Search & Rescue, and Hazardous Materials Program 

including length of programs, content of programs, instructor 

requirements, prerequisite requirements, certification 

requirements, and proposed rule development in that regard. 

This workshop will take input from affected persons as to what 

rule amendments are necessary to implement this statutory 

change. A conference line is available for individuals to 

participate via phone, Phone: (850)413-1558, Conference ID: 

583927. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Bill 

Wentlandt, Assistant Superintendent, Bureau of Fire Standards 

and Training, Division of State Fire Marshal, 11655 NW 

Gainesville Road, Ocala, FL 34482, phone: (352)369-2829 or 

Bill.Wentlandt@MyFloridaCFO.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Bill Wentlandt at the number listed above. If you 

are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

Section VII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Declaratory Statements 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares and Mobile 

Homes 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Division of Florida 

Condominiums, Timeshares, and Mobile Homes, Department 

of Business and Professional Regulation, State of Florida, has 

received the petition for declaratory statement from Beth G. 

Lindie, Esq. & Jeremy M. Zubkoff, Esq., In Re: Mediterranean 

Villas Condominium Association, Inc., Docket No. 

2014025041, filed on June 12, 2014. The petition seeks the 

agency’s opinion as to the applicability of subsection 

718.103(28), Florida Statutes, as it applies to the petitioner. 

Whether individuals who are not unit owners within the 

association, but rather directors of corporations and/or members 

of limited liability companies that are owners within the 

association, can be eligible candidates for the board of directors 

pursuant to subsection 718.103(28), Florida Statutes, and the 

association’s governing documents. 

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be 

obtained by contacting: Danny Brown, Administrative 

Assistant II, at Department of Business and Professional 

Regulation, Division of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares, 

and Mobile Homes, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-2217, (850)717-1486, 

Daniel.Brown@myfloridalicense.com. 

Please refer all comments to: Brittany Finkbeiner, Chief 

Assistant General Counsel, Department of Business and 

Professional Regulation, Division of Florida Condominiums, 

Timeshares, and Mobile Homes, 1940 North Monroe Street, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2202. Responses, motions to 

intervene, or requests for an agency hearing, §120.57(2), Fla. 

Stat., must be filed within 21 days of this notice. 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Division of State Fire Marshal 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Department of Financial 

Services, Division of State Fire Marshal has received the 

petition for declaratory statement from Sarasota Manatee 

Airport Authority on June 16, 2014. The petition seeks the 

agency’s opinion as to the applicability of Section 633.118, 

Florida Statutes, as it applies to the petitioner. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=359
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=248
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=248
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=359


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

2700 

The petition seeks an official determination of its status as a 

“special fire service provider” authorized to enforce Chapter 

633, Florida Statutes, and to function as the “authority having 

jurisdiction to enforce the Florida Fire Prevention Code” under 

section 633.0215, within an enclave of airport lands 

sandwiched between the boundaries of adjacent independent 

fire control districts. 

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be 

obtained by contacting: Melissa E. Dembicer Assistant General 

Counsel, Division of Legal Services, 612 Larson Building, 200 

E. Gaines Street, Tallahassee, FL 32399-0333, (850)413-5829. 

Please refer all comments to: Melissa Dembicer. Responses, 

motions to intervene, or requests for an agency hearing, 

§120.57(2), Fla. Stat., must be filed within 21 days of this 

notice. 

Section VIII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding the Validity of Rules 

Notice of Petition for Administrative Determination has been 

filled with the Division of Administrative Hearings on the 

following rules: 

NONE 

Notice of Disposition of Petition for Administrative 

Determination has been filled with the Division of 

Administrative Hearings on the following rules: 

NONE 

Section IX 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Non-rule Policy Challenges 

NONE 

Section X 

Annoucements and Objection Reports of the 

Joint Adminstrative Procedures Committee 

NONE 

Section XI 

Notices Regarding Bids, Proposals and 

Purchasing 

DAYTONA STATE COLLEGE 

Design Services 

RFQ #14-007 (Request for Qualifications) 

Pursuant to the provisions of Section 287.055, Florida Statutes, 

the “Consultants’ Competitive Negotiations Act”, Daytona 

State College hereby publicly announces it will consider 

qualified professional firms, registered to do work in the State 

of Florida, for a project requiring architectural and engineering 

services. 

The project is to provide design services for the site selection 

and building exterior concept for the future Student Center 

Building that is to be located on the Daytona Campus. The 

design budget is $25,000. 

Firms or individuals desiring to qualify for consideration must 

submit proposals no later than 12:00 p.m. on July 8, 2014, to 

the Facilities Planning Department, Daytona State College, 

Building 540/Room 112, 1200 W. International Speedway 

Blvd., Daytona Beach, FL 32114. Interested parties may obtain 

information by contacting nielseb@daytonastate.edu or by 

visiting our website at 

http://www.daytonastate.edu/fp/proposals.html. 

Section XII 

Miscellaneous 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Motor Vehicles 

Affordable Golf Cars of Venice, Inc. for the establishment of 

EZGO low speed vehicles 

Notice of Publication for a New Point 

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of More 

than 300,000 Population 

Pursuant to Section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is 

given that Textron, Inc., intends to allow the establishment of 

Affordable Golf Cars of Venice, Inc. as a dealership for the sale 

of low-speed vehicles manufactured by Textron, Inc. (line-

make EZGO) at 1590 Tamiami Trail South, Venice, (Sarasota 

County), Florida 34293, on or after July 21, 2014. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=701
mailto:nielseb@daytonastate.edu
http://www.daytonastate.edu/fp/proposals.html
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

 

2701 

 

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and 

principal investor(s) of Affordable Golf Cars of Venice, Inc. are 

dealer operator(s): Jason David Fitchett, 1590 Tamiami Trail 

South, Venice, Florida 34293; principal investor(s): Jason 

David Fitchett, 1590 Tamiami Trail South, Venice, Florida 

34293. 

The notice indicates intent to establish the new point 

location in a county of more than 300,000 population, according 

to the latest population estimates of the University of Florida, 

Bureau of Economic and Business Research. 

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have 

standing, pursuant to Section 320.642, Florida Statutes, to file 

a petition or complaint protesting the application. 

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30 

days of the date of publication of this notice and must be 

submitted to: Nalini Vinayak, Administrator, Dealer License 

Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

Room A-312, MS 65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635. 

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by 

US Mail to: Rusty McGahee, Textron, Inc., 1451 Marvin 

Griffin Road, Augusta, Georgia 30906. 

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days of 

the date of publication, a final order will be issued by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving 

the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant’s 

compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida 

Statutes. 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Motor Vehicles 

Wildar, Inc., d/b/a Golf Carts & Trailers of Ft. Pierce for the 

establishment of EZGO low speed vehicles 

Notice of Publication for a New Point 

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of Less 

than 300,000 Population 

Pursuant to Section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is 

given that Textron, Inc., intends to allow the establishment of 

Wildar, Inc., d/b/a Golf Carts & Trailers of Ft. Pierce as a 

dealership for the sale of low-speed vehicles manufactured by 

Textron, Inc. (EZGO) at 2402-2406 South US Highway 1, Fort 

Pierce, (St Lucie County) Florida, 34982, on or after July 21, 

2014. 

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and 

principal investor(s) of Wildar, Inc., d/b/a Golf Carts & Trailers 

of Ft. Pierce are dealer operator(s): William Joseph Huston, 

2402-2406 South US Highway 1, Fort Pierce, Florida 34982, 

principal investor(s): William Joseph Huston, 2402-2406 South 

US Highway 1, Fort Pierce, Florida 34982. 

The notice indicates intent to establish the new point 

location in a county of less than 300,000 population, according 

to the latest population estimates of the University of Florida, 

Bureau of Economic and Business Research. 

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have 

standing, pursuant to Section 320.642, Florida Statutes, to file 

a petition or complaint protesting the application. 

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30 

days of the date of publication of this notice and must be 

submitted to: Nalini Vinayak, Administrator, Dealer License 

Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

Room A-312, MS 65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635. 

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by 

US Mail to: Rusty McGahee, Textron, Inc., 1451 Marvin 

Griffin Road, Augusta, Georgia 30906. 

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days of 

the date of publication, a final order will be issued by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving 

the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant’s 

compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida 

Statutes. 

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 

State Revolving Fund Program 

NOTICE OF AVAILABILITY 

FLORIDA FINDING OF NO SIGNIFICANT IMPACT 

City of Everglades City 

The Florida Department of Environmental Protection has 

determined that the City of Everglades City’s project involving 

the replacement and upgrade of wastewater treatment facilities 

at the City’s wastewater treatment plant located at Copeland 

Avenue and Kumquat Street will not adversely affect the 

environment. The total cost of the project is estimated at 

$7,122,251. The project may qualify for a State Revolving Fund 

loan, composed of federal funds and state funds, as well as a 

small community wastewater facilities construction grant. A 

full copy of the Florida Finding of No Significant Impact can 

be obtained by writing to: Brian Moody, Department of 

Environmental Protection, State Revolving Fund Program, 

2600 Blair Stone Road, MS#3505, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-

2400 or call (850)245-7546. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Nursing 

Notice of Emergency Action 

On June 19, 2014, State Surgeon General issued an Order of 

Emergency Suspension of License with regard to the license of 

Amber N. Norton, CNA, Certificate No.: CNA 120769. This 

Emergency Suspension Order was predicated upon the State 

Surgeon General’s findings of an immediate and serious danger 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=332


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

2702 

to the public health, safety and welfare pursuant to Sections 

456.073(8) and 120.60(6), Florida Statutes. (2012-2013). The 

State Surgeon General determined that this summary procedure 

was fair under the circumstances, in that there was no other 

method available to adequately protect the public. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Nursing 

Notice of Emergency Action 

On June 19, 2014, State Surgeon General issued an Order of 

Emergency Suspension of License with regard to the license of 

Sarah J. Granger, CNA, Certificate No.: CNA 192546. This 

Emergency Suspension Order was predicated upon the State 

Surgeon General’s findings of an immediate and serious danger 

to the public health, safety and welfare pursuant to Sections 

456.073(8) and 120.60(6), Florida Statutes. (2012-2013). The 

State Surgeon General determined that this summary procedure 

was fair under the circumstances, in that there was no other 

method available to adequately protect the public. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Division of Emergency Medical Operations 

Emergency Medical Services Grants Procedures 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

64J-1.015 Emergency Medical Services Grants Procedures 

NOTICE OF THE POSTING OF INTENDED AWARDS 

FOR RURAL EMERGENCY MEDICAL SERVICES 

MATCHING GRANTS (90% and 75% GRANTS) 

AGENCY: Florida Department of Health, Bureau of 

Emergency Medical Oversight 

GRANT TITLE: Florida Emergency Medical Services Rural 

Matching Grant Program 

The list of intended grant recipients and those not intended for 

awards is posted outside of Conference Room 240P, Second 

Floor, State Office Building, 4042 Bald Cypress Way, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32311 beginning on June 27, 2014, 8:00 

a.m. and also will be posted on the Internet at http://www.fl-

ems.com/Grants/Grants.html, beginning on June 27, 2014. 

The list also will be provided by mail, e-mail, or facsimile (fax) 

by making a request directed to: Department of Health, Bureau 

of Emergency Medical Oversight, State EMS Matching Grant 

Administrator, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin A22, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-1722, (850)245-4440, extension 2734, Fax: 

(850)245-4378 or e-mail: Alan.VanLewen@flhealth.gov. 

Any entity whose substantial interests have been affected by 

this decision may file a petition for an administrative hearing as 

provided in Sections 120.569 and 120.57, F.S. 

The petition must be in writing and conform to the requirements 

of Rule 28-106.201 or 28-106.301, F.A.C., as applicable. 

Mediation pursuant to Section 120.573. F.S. is not available for 

this action. A written petition must be filed within twenty-one 

(21) days of the date of award posting.  The term “filed” means 

received by the Agency Clerk, Department of Health, 4052 

Bald Cypress Way, Bin #A02, Tallahassee, FL 32399-1703. 

Written petitions may be hand-delivered to: Agency Clerk, 

2585 Merchants Row Blvd., Prather Building, Suite 110, 

Tallahassee, FL. Failure to file a written petition within 21 days 

of posting constitutes a waiver of hearing rights. If you have 

any questions regarding the procedure, contact an attorney. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Division of Emergency Medical Operations 

Emergency Medical Services Grants Procedures 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

64J-1.015 Emergency Medical Services Grants Procedures 

NOTICE OF THE POSTING OF INTENDED AWARDS 

FOR EMERGENCY MEDICAL SERVICES 

GENERAL MATCHING GRANTS (75% GRANTS) 

AGENCY: Florida Department of Health, Bureau of 

Emergency Medical Oversight 

GRANT TITLE: Florida Emergency Medical Services 

Matching Grant Program 

The list of intended grant recipients and those not intended for 

awards is posted outside of Conference Room 240P, Second 

Floor of the State Office Building at 4042 Bald Cypress Way, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32311 beginning on June 27, 2014, 8:00 

a.m. and also will be posted on the Internet at http://www.fl-

ems.com/Grants/Grants.html, beginning on June 27, 2014. 

The list also will be provided by mail, e-mail, or facsimile (fax) 

by making a request directed to: Department of Health, 

Emergency Medical Services Program, State EMS Matching 

Grants, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin A22, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-1722, (850)245-4440, extension 2734, Fax: (850)245-

4378 or e-mail: Alan.VanLewen@flhealth.gov. 

Any entity whose substantial interests have been affected by 

this decision may file a petition for an administrative hearing as 

provided in Sections 120.569 and 120.57, F.S. 

The petition must be in writing and conform to the requirements 

of Rule 28-106.201 or 28-106.301, F.A.C., as applicable. 

Mediation pursuant to Section 120.573. F.S. is not available for 

this action. A written petition must be filed within twenty-one 

(21) days of the date of award posting. The term “filed” means 

received by the Agency Clerk, Department of Health, 4052 

Bald Cypress Way, Bin #A02, Tallahassee, FL 32399-1703. 

Written petitions may be hand-delivered to the Agency Clerk, 

2585 Merchants Row Blvd., Prather Building, Suite 110, 

Tallahassee, FL. Failure to file a written petition within 21 days 

of posting constitutes a waiver of hearing rights. If you have 

any questions regarding the procedure, contact an attorney. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=332
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=832
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64J-1.015
mailto:Alan.VanLewen@flhealth.gov
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=832
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64J-1.015
mailto:Alan.VanLewen@flhealth.gov


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

 

2703 

 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY 

Outer Continental Shelf Air Permit OCS-EPA-R4015 

*** PUBLIC NOTICE *** 

U.S. Environmental Protection Agency 

Outer Continental Shelf Air Permit OCS-EPA-R4015 

for Anadarko Petroleum Corporation 

Public Comment Period: June 20, 2014 - July 21, 2014 

The United States Environmental Protection Agency 

(EPA) is seeking public comment on a draft Clean Air Act 

(CAA) Outer Continental Shelf (OCS) air permit for Anadarko 

Petroleum Corporation (Anadarko), 1201 Lake Robbins Drive, 

The Woodlands, Texas 77380. Anadarko has applied for an 

OCS air permit pursuant to section 328 of the Clean Air Act 

(CAA) from EPA Region 4. The proposed air permit will 

regulate air emissions from a proposed exploratory drilling 

operation within the Eastern Gulf of Mexico (EGOM) of the 

OCS. The proposed project will mobilize the Transocean 

Discoverer Spirit, up to two support vessels to transport 

personnel and supplies, and up to three support vessels for well 

completion. The operation will last no more than two years, and 

operate no more than 208 calendar days per year. The proposed 

project is for exploratory drilling and well completion only and 

does not include the establishment of any permanent production 

platforms. 

Anadarko proposes to conduct exploratory drilling at 

multiple sites within the Eastern Gulf of Mexico. The drilling 

area is located on the OCS east of longitude 87.5, west of the 

Military Mission Line (86°41’ west longitude), at least 100 

miles from the Louisiana shoreline, and at least 125 miles from 

the Florida shoreline. 

EPA Region 4 is the agency responsible for implementing 

and enforcing CAA requirements for OCS sources in the Gulf 

of Mexico east of longitude 87.5º. Pursuant to section 328 of 

the CAA (42 U.S.C. § 7627) and the air quality regulations 

applicable to OCS sources set forth in Title 40, Code of Federal 

Regulations (CFR), part 55, this project is required to obtain an 

OCS air quality permit and is subject to Prevention of 

Significant Deterioration (PSD) requirements that apply to 

major sources and also to title V operating permitting 

requirements. Anadarko must apply best available control 

technology (BACT), among other requirements, for emissions 

of NOX, CO, VOC, PM, PM2.5, and PM10. The maximum 

potential annual emissions in tons per year for each drilling 

vessel and its support vessels are detailed in the application 

materials and preliminary determination/statement of basis. 

Potential annual emissions are also summarized in the project 

fact sheet. 

Permit Documents: EPA has prepared a draft permit for 

public comment, as well as a preliminary 

determination/statement of basis document that explains the 

permit conditions. These documents are available on EPA 

Region 4’s website at: http://www.epa.gov/region4/air/ 

permits/ocspermits/ocspermits.html. 

To request a copy of these documents or to be added to our 

Anadarko EGOM permit mailing list, please contact: Ms. Rosa 

Yarbrough, Permit Support Specialist at (404)562-9643 or 

yarbrough.rosa@epa.gov. For questions on the draft permit, 

please contact: Ms. Eva Land at (404)562-9103 or 

land.eva@epa.gov. Ms. Yarbrough and Ms. Land may also be 

reached by mail at USEPA Region 4, Air Permits Section 

APTMD, 61 Forsyth Street, SW, Atlanta, GA 30303. EPA’s 

draft permit and preliminary determination/statement of basis; 

Anadarko’s application and supporting documentation/data; 

and comments received from the public, other government 

agencies, and the applicant during the public comment period 

will become part of the administrative record for the permit. All 

data submitted by the applicant is also available as part of the 

administrative record. The administrative record is available at 

www.regulations.gov (docket # EPA-R04-OAR-2014-0487), 

which can also be accessed through EPA’s website given 

above, and at the EPA Region 4 office (please call in advance 

for available viewing times) at: 61 Forsyth Street, SW, Atlanta, 

GA 30303; Phone: (404)562-9643. The web sites can be 

accessed through free internet services available at local public 

libraries. 

Public Comments: All comments on the draft permit must 

be received by email at R4OCS permits@epa.gov, submitted 

electronically via www.regulations.gov (docket # EPA-R04-

OAR-2014-0487) or postmarked by July 21, 2014. Comments 

sent by mail should be addressed to: USEPA Region 4, Air 

Permits Section APTMD, 61 Forsyth Street, SW, Atlanta, GA 

30303 Attn: Rosa Yarbrough. An extension of the 30-day 

comment period may be granted if the request for an extension 

is submitted during the 30-day public comment period and it 

adequately demonstrates why additional time is required to 

prepare comments. 

Any interested person may submit written comments on the 

draft permit during the public comment period. If you believe 

that any conditions in the permit are inappropriate, you must 

raise all reasonably ascertainable issues and submit all 

reasonably available arguments supporting your position by the 

end of the comment period. Any documents supporting your 

comments must be included in full and may not be incorporated 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=925
http://www.epa.gov/region4/air/%20permits/ocspermits/ocspermits.html
http://www.epa.gov/region4/air/%20permits/ocspermits/ocspermits.html
mailto:yarbrough.rosa@epa.gov
mailto:land.eva@epa.gov
http://www.regulations.gov/
http://www.regulations.gov/


Florida Administrative Register Volume 40, Number 120, June 20, 2014 

2704 

by reference unless they are already part of the administrative 

record for this permit or consist of state or federal statutes or 

regulations, EPA documents of general applicability, or other 

generally available reference materials. Comments should 

focus on the draft air quality permit. If you have comments 

regarding offshore leasing, non-air quality impacts, drilling 

safety, discharge, or other similar issues not subject to this 

public comment period, you should submit them during the 

leasing and approval proceedings of the Bureau of Ocean 

Energy Management, which is the lead agency for offshore 

drilling. 

All comments will be included in the administrative record 

without change and will be made available to the public, 

including any personal information provided, unless the 

comment includes Confidential Business Information or other 

information whose disclosure is restricted by statute. 

Information that you consider Confidential Business 

Information or otherwise protected must be clearly identified as 

such and should not be submitted through email. If you send 

email directly to EPA, your email address will be captured 

automatically and included as part of the public comment. An 

email or postal address must be provided with your comments 

if you wish to receive direct notification of EPA’s final decision 

regarding the permit and response to comments submitted 

during the public comment period. All timely comments on the 

draft permit will be considered in making the final decision. 

EPA will respond to all significant comments on the proposed 

permit and may summarize and group similar comments in our 

response. EPA will not respond to individual commenters 

directly. 

Public Hearing: Requests for a public hearing on the draft 

air permit must be in writing and received by EPA by July 14, 

2014. Requests should be sent by email to 

R4OCSpermits@epa.gov or by mail addressed to: USEPA 

Region 4, Air Permits Section, 61 Forsyth Street, SW, Atlanta, 

GA 30303, Attn: Rosa Yarbrough. EPA will hold a public 

hearing on the draft air permit pursuant to 40 CFR 124.12 if the 

Agency determines that there is a significant degree of public 

interest in the draft permit. Requests for a public hearing must 

state the nature of the issues proposed to be raised in the 

hearing. If a public hearing is held, you may submit oral and/or 

written comments on the proposed permit at the hearing. You 

do not need to attend the public hearing to submit written 

comments. If EPA determines that there is a significant degree 

of public interest, EPA will hold a public hearing from 5:30 to 

7:00 pm on July 31, 2014, at: West Florida Public Library, 239 

North Spring Street, Pensacola, Florida 32502, (850)436-5043. 

If a public hearing is held, the public comment period will 

automatically be extended to the close of the public hearing. If 

no timely requests for a public hearing are received, or if EPA 

determines that there is not a significant degree of public 

interest, a hearing will not be held. Such an announcement will 

be emailed to our OCS public notice list and posted on EPA’s 

website identified above, or you may call EPA at the contact 

number above to determine if the hearing will not be held. 

If a public hearing is held, EPA staff will be available prior 

to the hearing, from 4:00-5:30 pm to answer questions and 

provide information on this proposed action during an informal 

public information session. You are not required to attend the 

information session to comment at the public hearing, and you 

may also obtain additional information about the project at 

EPA’s website listed above. 

Final Determination: EPA will make a final decision to 

issue the permit or to deny the application for the permit after 

the Agency considers all comments on the draft air permit. 

Notice of the final decision shall be sent to each person who has 

submitted written comments or requested notice of the final 

permit decision, provided EPA has adequate contact 

information. 

 

Section XIII 

Index to Rules Filed During Preceeding 

Week 

NOTE: The above section will be published on Tuesday 

beginning October 2, 2012, unless Monday is a holiday, then it 

will be published on Wednesday of that week. 

__________________________________________________ 


