Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 98, May 20, 2013

Section |
Notice of Development of Proposed Rules
and Negotiated Rulemaking

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION

Health Facility and Agency Licensing

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

59A-9.025 Medical Screening and Evaluation of
Patients Receiving Second Trimester
Abortions

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Agency proposes to revise

rules related to abortion clinic standards and licensure.

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Requires that each

abortion clinic comply with Section 390.0111, F.S., relating to

termination of pregnancies. The rule strikes language that

conflicts with Section 390.012, F.S., which requires an

ultrasound of all patients before an abortion procedure is

performed.
RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 390.012, 408.819 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 390.0111, 390.012(3)(d),

390.012(4), 390.013 FS.

A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
DATE AND TIME: Thursday, June 20, 2013, 10:30 a.m. —
11:30 a.m.

PLACE: Agency for Health Care Administration, 2727 Mahan
Drive, Building 3, Conference Room C, Tallahassee, FL
32308-5407

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Kimberly A. Stewart, Division of Health Quality
Assurance, 2727 Mahan Drive, MS# 31, Tallahassee, FL
32308, Phone: (850)412-4362, E-mail:
Kimberly.Stewart@ahca.myflorida.com If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS:
Kimberly A. Stewart, Division of Health Quality Assurance,
2727 Mahan Drive, MS #31, Tallahassee, FL 32308, Phone:
(850)412-4362, E-mail: Kimberly.Stewart@ahca.
myflorida.com

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE
FROM THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Florida Building Commission

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To open the aforementioned rule

for development to address the statutorily required triennial
update process and “glitch” modifications. The Commission
shall conduct a rule development workshop to accept public
input regarding the approved modifications “supplement” to
the selected edition of the model codes and the Commission’s
Technical Advisory Committees review and recommendations
concerning additional proposed “Glitch” modifications. The
combination of the selected model codes (2012 International
Codes) and the approved modification “supplement” comprise
the 2013 Florida Building Code in conformity with the
triennial update process specified in Sections 553.73(3), (6),
Florida Statutes. Local technical amendments to the 2010
Florida Building Code and continuation of previously adopted
Florida-specific amendments will also be considered. The
approved modifications “supplement” and the committee
recommendation with regard to proposed Glitch modifications
are available via  the Commissions website,
www.floridabuilding.org.

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Statutorily required
triennial update process and “glitch” modifications to the 2013
Florida Building Code.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 553.73(1), 553.73(2),
553.73(7), 553.73(8), 553.901 FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 553.72, 553.73(2), 553.73(3),

553.73(7), 553.73(8), 553.73(9), 553.901 FS.

A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD
AT THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:
DATE AND TIME: August 22, 2013, 8:30 a.m. or as soon as
thereafter as the matter comes before the Florida Building
Commission in accordance with its agenda, which may entail
further consideration on subsequent days.

PLACE: Marriott Boca Raton at Boca Center, 5150 Town
Center Circle, Boca Raton, Florida 33486

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Mo Madani, Planning Manager, Department of
Business and Professional Regulation, 1940 North Monroe
Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)717-1825. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using
the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

2663


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=186
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=59A-9.025
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=390.012
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20408.819
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=390.0111
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20390.012(3)(d)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20390.012(4)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20390.013
mailto:Kimberly.Stewart@ahca
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=553.73(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(7)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(8)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.901%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=553.72
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(7)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(8)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(9)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.901%20FS.

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 98, May 20, 2013

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Mo
Madani, Planning Manager, Department of Business and
Professional Regulation, 1940 North Monroe Street,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)717-1825

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Drugs, Devices and Cosmetics

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:

61N-1.001 General Regulations; Definitions
61N-1.012 Records of Drugs, Cosmetics and Devices
61N-1.013 Prescription Drugs; Receipt, Storage and

Security
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Division proposes the rule

amendments to clarify the definitions of terms set forth in
Chapter 499, F.S., and the Division’s rules; set forth the
records which must be created and maintained by entities in
Florida engaging in the possession of limited quantities of
prescription drugs, obtained from non-Florida licensed
sources, for the purpose of research and development; and set
forth the storage requirements for those entities.

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Definitions, records,
storage requirements.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 499.003, 499.01(3), (4), (6),
499.012(12), 499.0121, 499.0122, 499.013, 499.014 FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 499.028 (6), 499.003, 499.004,
499.005, 499.0054, 499.0057, 499.006, 499.007, 499.008,
499.009, 499.01, 499.012, 499.0121, 499.0122, 499.013,
499.014, 499.015, 499.023, 499.024, 499.025, 499.028,
499.03, 499.033, 499.035, 499.039, 499.04, 499.041, 499.05,
499.051, 499.052, 499.06, 499.063, 499.064, 499.066,
499.067, 499.069, 499.61, 499.62, 499.63, 499.64, 499.65,
499.66, 499.67, 499.71, 499.75 FS.

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
REGISTER.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Dinah
Greene, Operations Review Specialist, Division of Drugs,
Devices and Cosmetics, Department of Business and
Professional Regulation, 1940 North Monroe Street, Suite
26A, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1047, (850)488-1802

2664

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE
FROM THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE.

Section Il
Proposed Rules

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS
Northwest Florida Water Management District

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:

40A-44.021 Definitions

40A-44.041 Permits Required

40A-44.052 Authorization for Certain Forestry Projects
40A-44.091 Processing of Permits

40A-44.101 Content of Application

40A-44.142 Headgates, Valves, and Measuring Devices
40A-44.321 Duration of Permit

40A-44.351 Transfer of Permits

40A-44.411 Completion Report

40A-44.451 Emergency Authorization

40A-44.901 Forms

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of making the
identified changes to the rule is to clarify, streamline and
increase user friendlyness. Some of the changes are to address
issues raised by the Joint Administrative Procedures
Committee, such as incorporating forms, and eliminating the
use of "may". The effect of these changes will be to have the
rule in the proper format without increasing the regulatory cost
or burden on the public or the agency

SUMMARY: The changes can be summarized as: changing
may to shall, correcting the permit transfer process, and
incorporating the various forms. Also some of the changes
simply correct rule citations that have changed since the last
rule amendments.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION:

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse
impact on small business or likely increase directly or
indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the
aggregate within one year after the implementation of the rule.
A SERC has not been prepared by the agency.

A SERC is not required since the changes do not increase
regulatory costs to small businesses, the public or the agency.
By the same reasoning, legislative ratification is not required.
Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1057
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61N-1.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61N-1.012
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61N-1.013
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=499.003;499.01(3),(4),(6);499.012(12);499.0121;499.0122;499.013;499.014;
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=499.003;499.01(3),(4),(6);499.012(12);499.0121;499.0122;499.013;499.014;
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=499.028%20(6),%20499.003,%20499.004,%20499.005,%20499.0054,%20499.0057,%20499.006,%20499.007,%20499.008,%20499.009,%20499.01,%20499.012,%20499.0121,%20499.0122,%20499.013,%20499.014,%20499.015,%20499.023,%20499.024,%20499.025,%20499.028,%20499.03,%20499.033,%20499.035,%20499.039,%20499.04,%20499.041,%20499.05,%20499.051,%20499.052,%20499.06,%20499.063,%20499.064,%20499.066,%20499.067,%20499.069,%20499.61,%20499.62,%20499.63,%20499.64,%20499.65,%20499.66,%20499.67,%20499.71,%20499.75.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=499.028%20(6),%20499.003,%20499.004,%20499.005,%20499.0054,%20499.0057,%20499.006,%20499.007,%20499.008,%20499.009,%20499.01,%20499.012,%20499.0121,%20499.0122,%20499.013,%20499.014,%20499.015,%20499.023,%20499.024,%20499.025,%20499.028,%20499.03,%20499.033,%20499.035,%20499.039,%20499.04,%20499.041,%20499.05,%20499.051,%20499.052,%20499.06,%20499.063,%20499.064,%20499.066,%20499.067,%20499.069,%20499.61,%20499.62,%20499.63,%20499.64,%20499.65,%20499.66,%20499.67,%20499.71,%20499.75.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=499.028%20(6),%20499.003,%20499.004,%20499.005,%20499.0054,%20499.0057,%20499.006,%20499.007,%20499.008,%20499.009,%20499.01,%20499.012,%20499.0121,%20499.0122,%20499.013,%20499.014,%20499.015,%20499.023,%20499.024,%20499.025,%20499.028,%20499.03,%20499.033,%20499.035,%20499.039,%20499.04,%20499.041,%20499.05,%20499.051,%20499.052,%20499.06,%20499.063,%20499.064,%20499.066,%20499.067,%20499.069,%20499.61,%20499.62,%20499.63,%20499.64,%20499.65,%20499.66,%20499.67,%20499.71,%20499.75.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=499.028%20(6),%20499.003,%20499.004,%20499.005,%20499.0054,%20499.0057,%20499.006,%20499.007,%20499.008,%20499.009,%20499.01,%20499.012,%20499.0121,%20499.0122,%20499.013,%20499.014,%20499.015,%20499.023,%20499.024,%20499.025,%20499.028,%20499.03,%20499.033,%20499.035,%20499.039,%20499.04,%20499.041,%20499.05,%20499.051,%20499.052,%20499.06,%20499.063,%20499.064,%20499.066,%20499.067,%20499.069,%20499.61,%20499.62,%20499.63,%20499.64,%20499.65,%20499.66,%20499.67,%20499.71,%20499.75.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=499.028%20(6),%20499.003,%20499.004,%20499.005,%20499.0054,%20499.0057,%20499.006,%20499.007,%20499.008,%20499.009,%20499.01,%20499.012,%20499.0121,%20499.0122,%20499.013,%20499.014,%20499.015,%20499.023,%20499.024,%20499.025,%20499.028,%20499.03,%20499.033,%20499.035,%20499.039,%20499.04,%20499.041,%20499.05,%20499.051,%20499.052,%20499.06,%20499.063,%20499.064,%20499.066,%20499.067,%20499.069,%20499.61,%20499.62,%20499.63,%20499.64,%20499.65,%20499.66,%20499.67,%20499.71,%20499.75.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=499.028%20(6),%20499.003,%20499.004,%20499.005,%20499.0054,%20499.0057,%20499.006,%20499.007,%20499.008,%20499.009,%20499.01,%20499.012,%20499.0121,%20499.0122,%20499.013,%20499.014,%20499.015,%20499.023,%20499.024,%20499.025,%20499.028,%20499.03,%20499.033,%20499.035,%20499.039,%20499.04,%20499.041,%20499.05,%20499.051,%20499.052,%20499.06,%20499.063,%20499.064,%20499.066,%20499.067,%20499.069,%20499.61,%20499.62,%20499.63,%20499.64,%20499.65,%20499.66,%20499.67,%20499.71,%20499.75.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=499.028%20(6),%20499.003,%20499.004,%20499.005,%20499.0054,%20499.0057,%20499.006,%20499.007,%20499.008,%20499.009,%20499.01,%20499.012,%20499.0121,%20499.0122,%20499.013,%20499.014,%20499.015,%20499.023,%20499.024,%20499.025,%20499.028,%20499.03,%20499.033,%20499.035,%20499.039,%20499.04,%20499.041,%20499.05,%20499.051,%20499.052,%20499.06,%20499.063,%20499.064,%20499.066,%20499.067,%20499.069,%20499.61,%20499.62,%20499.63,%20499.64,%20499.65,%20499.66,%20499.67,%20499.71,%20499.75.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=499.028%20(6),%20499.003,%20499.004,%20499.005,%20499.0054,%20499.0057,%20499.006,%20499.007,%20499.008,%20499.009,%20499.01,%20499.012,%20499.0121,%20499.0122,%20499.013,%20499.014,%20499.015,%20499.023,%20499.024,%20499.025,%20499.028,%20499.03,%20499.033,%20499.035,%20499.039,%20499.04,%20499.041,%20499.05,%20499.051,%20499.052,%20499.06,%20499.063,%20499.064,%20499.066,%20499.067,%20499.069,%20499.61,%20499.62,%20499.63,%20499.64,%20499.65,%20499.66,%20499.67,%20499.71,%20499.75.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=120
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40A-44.021
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40A-44.041
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40A-44.052
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40A-44.091
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40A-44.101
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40A-44.142
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40A-44.321
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40A-44.351
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40A-44.411
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40A-44.451
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40A-44.901

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 98, May 20, 2013

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 373.044, 373.113, 373.118,
373.4136, 373.418, 373.436, 380.06(9) 380.06(9)(b),
403.0877 FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 373.117, 373.116, 373.118, 373.406,
373.413, 373.4141, 373.416, 373.417, 373.418, 393.419,
373.423, 373.426, 373.429, 374.436, 373.439, 380.06,
403.0877(4), 403.927(3) FS.

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Lance Laird, 180 East Redstone Ave.,
Crestview, Florida 32539

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

40A-44.021 Definitions.

(1) “Best management practices for agriculture” means
those conservation, management and operational practices
identified for agriculture as best for reducing pollution and
identified in the Florida Department of Agriculture and
Consumer Services Best Management Practices adopted under
Title 5M of the Florida Administrative Code; *Best

s . g. . . ,
f ) , pe &

) >+ .EE;E .;5 e OrHAe 58
| ]g!” ig]. “A M | ””;

M Deacti ; cultural vities Florid
Department-of Environmental RegulationNevember1978.

(2) “Best management practices for forestry” means those
conservation, management and operational practices identified
for silviculture as best for reducing pollution and identified in
the Florida Department of Agriculture and Consumer Services
Best Management Practices adopted under Chapter 51-6 of the

Florida Administrative Code. “Best-Management-Practicesfor
99 13 . .
) f roduci Huti ; iicultural_activiti
lied_to_local " borth_in_“Silvicul o

Revised-1993.

(3) “Class 1 Waters” means those surface waters listed
pursuant to Rule 62-302.4600, F.A.C.

(4) “Endangered Species” means those plants, fish and
wildlife listed pursuant to Rules 5B-40.0055(2)(a) and 68A39-
27.003, F.A.C., Section 581.185(2)(b){5}a}, Florida Statutes,
and 50 CFR 17.11, and 50 CFR 17.12.

(5) through (10) No change.

(11) “Species Of Special Concern” means those fish and
wildlife listed pursuant to Rule 68A39-27.005, F.A.C.

(12) “Steephead Ravines” means those highly distinctive
stream valleys as described in “A Ecological Characterization
of the Florida Panhandle”, U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service
Biological Report 88(12), U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service,
1988. Which is hereby incorporated by reference. A copy of
which can be obtained from the District’s website
www.nwfwmd.state.fl.us.

(13) “Threatened Species” means those plants, fish and
wildlife listed pursuant to Rules 5B-40.0055(2)(b) and 68A39-
27.004, F.A.C.,50 CFR 17.11, and 50 CFR 17.12.

(14) No change.

Rulemaking Speecific Authority 373.113, 373.418 FS. Law
Implemented 373.413, 373.416, 373.418, 373.426 FS. History—New
10-1-84, Amended 7-1-92, 3-30-94 .

40A-44.041 Permits Required.

(1) No change.

(2) The District issues four types of agricultural and
forestry surface water management permits: general surface
water management permits, letters of conceptual approval,
individual surface water construction permits, and individual
operation and maintenance permits.

(&) General Surface Water Management Permits. This
permit provides for the construction, maintenance, and
operation of a facility. A general permit is applicable for
projects:

1. No change.

2. Which could impound water by a dam which is less
than ten feet in height from the natural bed of the water course
at the downstream toe of the barrier, as determined by the
District, or which has an impounding capacity of less than
fifty (50) acre-feet, and

3. Has either singly or cumulatively, a minimal adverse
impact on the water resources of the District.

(b) Letters of Conceptual Approval. A letter of conceptual
approval may be issued for surface water management
projects associated with agricultural or forestry projects that
are to be developed in phases. A letter of conceptual approval
does not authorize any construction and requires the submittal
of applications for each development phase of the project.

(c) Individual Surface Water Construction Permits. A
permit is applicable for all projects which are not exempt,
which are not eligible for a general permit, or which are not
otherwise authorized activities pursuant to this Chapter.

(d) Individual Operation and Maintenance Permits. A
permit for operation and maintenance of any dam,
impoundment, reservoir, appurtenant work or works is
required for permitted projects under paragraph 40A-
44.041(2)(c), F.A.C.

2665


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=373.044,%20373.113,%20373.118,%20373.4136,%20373.418,%20373.436,%20380.06(9)%20380.(9)(b),%20403.0877
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=373.044,%20373.113,%20373.118,%20373.4136,%20373.418,%20373.436,%20380.06(9)%20380.(9)(b),%20403.0877
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=373.044,%20373.113,%20373.118,%20373.4136,%20373.418,%20373.436,%20380.06(9)%20380.(9)(b),%20403.0877
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=373.117,%20373.116,%20373.118,%20373.406,%20373.413,%20373.4141,%20373.416,%20373.417,%20373.418,393.419,%20373.423,%20373.426,%20373.429,%20374.436,%20373.439,%20380.06,%20403.0877(4),%20403.927(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=373.117,%20373.116,%20373.118,%20373.406,%20373.413,%20373.4141,%20373.416,%20373.417,%20373.418,393.419,%20373.423,%20373.426,%20373.429,%20374.436,%20373.439,%20380.06,%20403.0877(4),%20403.927(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=373.117,%20373.116,%20373.118,%20373.406,%20373.413,%20373.4141,%20373.416,%20373.417,%20373.418,393.419,%20373.423,%20373.426,%20373.429,%20374.436,%20373.439,%20380.06,%20403.0877(4),%20403.927(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=373.117,%20373.116,%20373.118,%20373.406,%20373.413,%20373.4141,%20373.416,%20373.417,%20373.418,393.419,%20373.423,%20373.426,%20373.429,%20374.436,%20373.439,%20380.06,%20403.0877(4),%20403.927(3)

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 98, May 20, 2013

Rulemaking Speeific Authority 373.044, 373.113, 33.418,
380.06(9)(b) FS. Law Implemented 373.118, 373.406, 373.413,
373.416, 373.418, 373.426, 380.06(9) FS. History—New 10-1-84,
Amended 8-1-89, 7-1-92, 7-1-98 .

40A-44.052 Authorization for Certain Forestry Projects.

(1) No change.

(2) Prior to the construction, replacement, or maintenance
of a minor forestry work authorized under this section, notice
shall be given to the District as follows:

(@ A completed Forestry Authorization Notification
Form, No. A44-F, effective 7-1-92, which is hereby
incorporated by reference, and copies of which can be
obtained from the District office identified below, or by
electronic submittal at the District’s website
www.nwfwmd.state.fl.us, shall be submitted to the District no
less than two (2) working days prior to the commencement of
work. For notification forms mailed to the District, the
postmark date shall be the date of submittal

(b) No change.

(c) All forestry authorization notifications shall be made
to the appropriate District office identified below:

[ [ 7 [ 7

Northwest  Florida  Water District
Headquarters

152 Water Management Drive

Havana, FL 32333-9700

(850) 539-5999

(d) No change.

(3) through (5) No change.
Rulemaking Speeifie Authority 373.044, 373.113, 373.418 FS. Law
Implemented 373.118, 373.406(5), 373.413, 373.416, 373.426 FS.

History—New 10-1-84, Amended 9-15-86, 8-1-89, 7-1-92 .

Management

40A-44.091 Processing of Permits.
(1) Letters of conceptual approval, individual surface
water construction permits, and general surface water

management permits for-impeundments-constructed-in-waters
in-the-State shall be processed according to the provisions of

2666

Chapter 40A-1, F.A.C., and require approval by the Executive
Director or his designee Governing-Board.

(2) However, upon a determination that the District and
its resources would be better served, the Executive Director
may require any application for-general-permit to be referred
to the Governing Board for approval.

(3) Permit application notices shall be processed in
accordance with the provisions of Chapter 40A-1, F.A.C., and
Sections 373.116 and 373.413(3), Florida Statutes.

Rulemaking Specific Authority 373.044, 373.113, 373.418 FS. Law
Implemented 373.116, 373.118, 373.406, 373.413, 373.4141,
373.416, 373.426, 380.06(9) FS. History—New 10-1-84, Amended 7-
1-92, 7-1-98 .

40A-44.101 Content of Application.

(1) Applications for permits required by this Chapter shall
include:

(a) Form No. A44-A, Surface Water Management Permit
Application amended 7-1-98, which is hereby incorporated by
reference. A copy of which can be obtained by contacting the
District or online at  the District’s website
www.nwiwmd.state.fl.us;

(b) No change.

(c) Drawings, calculations, and engineering details
sufficient to define the nature, scope, intent and functioning of
the proposed project. This information shall include the
following:

1. through 2. No change.

3. Flow characteristics;

(d) Information supporting the agricultural status of the
property which shall include:

1. A Soil and Water Conservation District approved
conservation plan, or a notice of intent to participate in the
appropriate Best Management Practices program offered by
the Florida Department of Agriculture and Consumer
Services;

2. through 3. No change.

4. An Affidavit of Agricultural Status, Form A44-E,
effective 7-1-92, which is hereby incorporated by reference,
copies of which can be obtained by contacting the District or
online at the District’s website www.nwfwmd.state.fl.us, may
be substituted for the ASCS farm number and verification of
agricultural classification. In areas of changing land uses, from
agricultural to other uses, an affidavit is required,;

(e) through (f) No change.

(9) An inventory of endangered or threatened species, and
species of special concern known to occur on the site, as listed
pursuant to Rules 5B-40.0055 and 68A39-27.003-005, F.A.C;
Section 581.185(2)(b) & (h){5)(a}, Florida Statutes; and 50
CFR 17.11-12; and




Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 98, May 20, 2013

(h) Other site specific information as necessary to support
the reasonable assurances determination pursuant to
subsection 40A-44.301(2), F.A.C.

(2) No change.

(3) The District shall may require the applicant to submit
other pertinent information deemed necessary for evaluating
the application.

Rulemaking Speeific Authority 373.044, 373.113, 373.418 FS. Law
Implemented 373.116, 373.118, 373.406(5), 373.413, 373.416,
373.426 FS. History—New 10-1-84, Amended 7-1-92, .

40A-44.142 Headgates, Valves, and Measuring Devices.

(1) through (3) No change.

(4) For the purpose of safety and maintenance, any new
dams, impoundments, or appurtenant works meeting the
requirements of Rule 40A-44.041, F.A.C., shall may be
required to have installed and maintained a substantial and
serviceable headgate or valve at the point where the water is
diverted or discharged.

Rulemaking Specific Authority 373.044, 373.113, 373.418, 373.436
FS. Law Implemented 373.409, 373.436 FS. History—New 10-1-84,
Amended .

40A-44.321 Duration of Permit.

(1) Unless revoked or otherwise modified, the duration of
a permit pursuant to this chapter is:

(a) No change.;

(b) Five years Fhree years, for a construction permit;

(c) Perpetual, for an operation and maintenance permit,
except when;

(d) Any operation and maintenance permit on an existing
facility shall automatically expire when a new operation and
maintenance permit or abandonment permit is issued for that
same facility.

(2) No change.

Rulemaking Speeific Authority 373.044, 373.113, 373.418, 380.06(9)
FS. Law Implemented 373.118, 373.406(5), 373.413, 373.416,
373.426, 380.06(9) FS. History—New 10-1-84, Amended

40A-44.351 Transfer of Permits.

(1) Upon timely notice that a permitted project or lands on
which the facility is located has been sold or otherwise
transferred to a new owner, the permit shall be transferred to a
new owner. Until properly transferred the original permittee
shall remain responsible for the proper operation and
maintenance of the facility. A-permittee-mustrequestfrom-the

has-not-beenconstruected.

(2) If not properly transferred within 30 days of the sale
of the facility or lands on which the facility is located, tFhe
permittee shall inform the transferee of the use limitations
associated with the permitted facility. The transferee shall
execute an affidavit acknowledging his awareness of the
conditions and restrictions associated with the permit issued
by the District.

(3) No change.

Rulemaking Specific Authority 373.044, 373.113, 373.418 FS. Law
Implemented 373.413, 373.416(2), 373.418, 373.426 FS. History—
New 10-1-84, Amended 8-1-89, 7-1-92, .

40A-44.411 Completion Report.
Within 30 days after the completion of construction or
alteration of any project for which a permit was granted under
this chapter, the permittee shall file with the District a
completion report prepared and certified in accordance with
the certification requirements of subsection 40A-44.301(7),
F.A.C.

(1) The “As-Built Certification and Completion Report”
Form Nos. A44-B or A44-C amended 7-1-92, which are

40A-44.341 Revocation of Permits.

(1) Certain vWiolations of this Chapter shall may result in
the revocation of the permit authorization in whole or in part.
A permit may also be revoked under any of the following
circumstances:

(@) through b. No change.

(2) through 3. No change.

Rulemaking Speeifie Authority 373.044, 373.113, 373.418 FS. Law
Implemented 373.423, 373.429 403.927(3) FS. History—New 10-1-
84, Amended 8-1-89, 7-1-92, 7-1-98 .

hereby incorporated by reference, shall identify the permit
number and shall certify that the project was completed
according to the specifications and standards identified in the
application and all conditions stipulated by the District. Copies
can be obtained by contacting the District, or online at the
District’s _website www.nwfwmd.state.fl.us. Any minor
deviations not subject to the requirements of Rule 40A-
44.331, F.A.C., for the permitted facility shall be identified in
the report and shall be accompanied by supporting engineering
documentation.

2667


http://www.nwfwmd.state.fl.us/

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 98, May 20, 2013

(2) The project shall not be determined fully complete and
shall not be used to impound or convey water until the
required “As-Built Certification and Completion Report”,
Form Nos. A44-B and A44-C, is submitted to the District.

Rulemaking Specific Authority 373.044, 373.113, 373.418, 403.0877
FS. Law Implemented 373.117, 373.419, 373.423, 403.0877(4) FS.
History—New 10-1-84, Amended 8-1-89, 7-1-92, .

40A-44.451 Emergency Authorization.

(1) The Executive Director shall may grant emergency
authorization in accordance with Sections 373.439 and
120.542, F.S. at-his-discretion. The emergency authorization
shall be presented to the Board for concurrence at its next
meeting. The failure to receive the Board’s concurrence shall
invalidate the emergency authorization.

(2) For projects with pending applications, permission to
begin construction of works prior to the issuance of a permit
may be applied for to the Governing Board, in writing, when
emergency conditions justify. A serious set of unforeseen or

unforeseeable circumstances must exist to create an
emergency.

Rulemaking Specifiec Authority 373.044, 373.113, 373.418 FS. Law
Implemented 373.439 FS. History—New 10-1-84,
Amended

40A-44.901 Forms.
: he followine.f T imol . ‘

O All District Fhese forms are available at the
following District offices:

(@ NWFWMD Headquarters, 152 Water Management
Drive, Havana, FL 32333-9700, (850)539-5999;

(b) Marianna Field Office, 4765 Pelt Street, Marianna, FL
32446-0900, (850)482-9522;

(c) Crestview Field Office, 180 East Redstone Avenue

800 Hospital Drive, Crestview, FL 32539, (850)683-5048.

2668

Rulemaking Speeific Authority 373.044, 373.113, 373.118, 373.418,
373.4136 FS. Law Implemented 373.116, 373.413, 373.416, 373.426,
373.418 FS. History—New 10-1-84, Amended 7-1-92

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Lance Laird, 180 East Redstone Ave., Crestview, Florida
32539

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: George Roberts, Governing Board
chairman

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: April 11, 2013

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAR: March 16, 2013

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Medicine

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

64B8-1.007 List of Approved Forms; Incorporation
PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The proposed rule amendments
are intended to incorporate revised forms into the Board’s
forms rule.

SUMMARY: The proposed rule amendments incorporate
revised forms into the Board’s forms rule.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION:

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse
impact on small business or likely increase directly or
indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the
aggregate within one year after the implementation of the rule.
A SERC has not been prepared by the agency.

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: During discussion of the economic impact of this rule
at its Board meeting, the Board, based upon the expertise and
experience of its members, determined that a Statement of
Estimated Regulatory Costs (SERC) was not necessary and
that the rule will not require ratification by the Legislature. No
person or interested party submitted additional information
regarding the economic impact at that time.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=331
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B8-1.007

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 98, May 20, 2013

RULEMAKING  AUTHORITY:
456.036(5), 456.048(1),

456.013, 456.0276,
458.309, 458.311, 458.3124(6),
458.313(4), 458.3137, 458.3145, 458.315(2), 358.317,
358.319, 458.320(8), 458.321(2), 358.345(3), (8),
458.347(13), 458.3475, 358.348(1)(a), 458.351(6) FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.013, 456.035, 456.036, 456.048,
456.073, 458.309, 458.311, 458.3124, 458.313, 458.3145,
458.315, 458.316, 458.317, 458.319, 458.320, 458.321,
458.345, 458.347, 458.3475, 458.348, 458.351, 465.0276 FS.
IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Allison M. Dudley, J.D., Executive
Director, Board of Medicine/MQA, 4052 Bald Cypress Way,
Bin # CO3, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3253

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

64B8-1.007 List of Approved Forms; Incorporation.
The following forms used by the Board in its dealings with the
public are listed as follows and are hereby adopted and
incorporated by reference, and can be obtained from the Board
office by writing to the Board of Medicine, 4052 Bald Cypress
Way, Bin #CO03, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1753, or by
telephoning (850) 245-4131:

(1) DH-MQA 1000, entitled “Board of Medicine Medical
Doctor  Application  for  Licensure,” (4/13) {8/2)
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?Ne=Ref 02168

(2) DH-MQA 1008, entitled “Board of Medicine Limited
License Application for Allopathic Physicians to be Licensed
Pursuant to Section 458.317, F.S.” (4/13) {842
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?Ne=Ref-02169

(3) DH-MQA 1009, entitled “Board of Medicine
Application For Temporary Certificate for Practice in an Area

of Critical Need,” (4/13) 842
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02170

(4) through (8) No change.

(9) DH-MQA 1072, entitled “Board of Medicine Medical
Faculty Certificate For Allopathic Physicians,” (4/13) {8/2)
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?Ne=Ref-02172

(10) through (17) No change.
Rulemaking Authority 456.013, 456.0276, 456.036(5), 456.048(1),
458.309, 458.311, 458.3124(6), 458.313(4), 458.3137, 458.3145,
458.315(2), 358.317, 358.319, 458.320(8), 458.321(2), 358.345(3),
(8), 458.347(13), 458.3475, 358.348(1)(a), 458.351(6) FS. Law
Implemented 456.013, 456.035, 456.036, 456.048, 456.073, 458.309,
458.311, 458.3124, 458.313, 458.3145, 458.315, 458.316, 458.317,

458.319, 458.320, 458.321, 458.345, 458.347, 458.3475, 458.348,
458.351, 465.0276 FS. History—New 4-17-01, Amended 11-20-01, 8-
13-02, 11-10-02, 3-19-03, 6-4-03, 11-17-03, 4-19-04, 1-31-05, 9-29-
05, 6-29-06, 12-26-06, 4-2-07, 6-25-08, 1-18-09, 3-17-09, 5-20-09,
10-7-09, 1-7-10, 2-2-10, 12-6-10, 12-27-11, 2-28-12, 1-27-
13

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Credentials Committee, Board of Medicine

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: Board of Medicine

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: April 5, 2013

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAR: May 2, 2013

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Medicine

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

64B8-4.009 Applications

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The proposed rule amendments
are intended to address changes in various application forms.
SUMMARY: The proposed rule amendments incorporate
revised forms into the Board’s application rule.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION:

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse
impact on small business or likely increase directly or
indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the
aggregate within one year after the implementation of the rule.
A SERC has not been prepared by the agency.

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: During discussion of the economic impact of this rule
at its Board meeting, the Board, based upon the expertise and
experience of its members, determined that a Statement of
Estimated Regulatory Costs (SERC) was not necessary and
that the rule will not require ratification by the Legislature. No
person or interested party submitted additional information
regarding the economic impact at that time.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 456.031, 456.033, 458.309,
458.311, 458.313 FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.013(7), 456.031, 456.033,
458.311, 458.3124, 458.313, 458.3145, 458.315, 458.316,
458.3165, 458.317 FS.

2669


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=456.013
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.0276
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.036(5)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.048(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.309
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.311
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.3124(6)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.313(4)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.3137
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.3145
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.315(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20358.317
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20358.319
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.320(8)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.321(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20358.345(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.347(13)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.3475
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20358.348(1)(a)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.351(6)%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=456.013
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.035
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.036
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.048
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.073
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.309
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.311
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.3124
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.313
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.3145
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.315
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.316
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.317
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.319
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.320
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.321
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.345
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.347
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.3475
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.348
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.351
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20465.0276%20FS.
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref%2002168
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02167
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02170
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02172
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=331
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B8-4.009
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=456.031
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.033
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.309
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.311
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.313%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=456.013(7)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.031
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.033
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.311
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.3124
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.313
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.3145
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.315
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.316
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.3165
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20458.317%20FS.

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 98, May 20, 2013

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF
THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Allison M. Dudley, J.D., Executive
Director, Board of Medicine/MQA, 4052 Bald Cypress Way,
Bin #CO03, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3253

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

64B8-4.009 Applications.

(1) All persons applying for licensure shall submit an
application to the Department. The application shall be made
on the applicable form set forth below, all of which are hereby
adopted and incorporated by reference and can be obtained
from the website at http://www.doh.state.fl.us/
mga/medical/me_applicant.html. The application must be
accompanied by the application fee.

(a) DH-MQA 1000, entitled “Board of Medicine Medical
Doctor Application for Licensure,” (4/13) (8/2)} available
from http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?Ne=Ref-
02168 or
http://www.doh.state.fl.us/mga/medical/me_applicant.html;

(b) DH-MQA 1008, entitled “Board of Medicine Limited
License Application for Allopathic Physicians to be Licensed
Pursuant to Section 458.317, F.S.,” (4/13) {842} available
from http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?Ne=Ref-
02169 or
http://www.doh.state.fl.us/mga/medical/me_applicant.html;

(c) DH-MQA 1009, entitled “Board of Medicine
Application For Temporary Certificate for Practice in an Area
of Critical Need,” (4/13) {842} available from
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?Ne=Ref-02170

or http://www.doh.state.fl.us/mga/
medical/me_applicant.html;

(d) No change.

(e) DH-MQA 1072, entitled “Board of Medicine Medical
Faculty Certificate For Allopathic Physicians,” (4/13) {8/12)
available from  http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.
asp?Ne=Ref-02172 or http://www.doh.state.fl.us/
mga/medical/me_applicant.html;

(f) No change.

(2) through (6) No change.

Rulemaking Authority 456.031, 456.033, 458.309, 458.311, 458.313
FS. Law Implemented 456.013(7), 456.031, 456.033, 458.311,
458.3124, 458.313, 458.3145, 458.315, 458.316, 458.3165, 458.317
FS. History—New 3-31-80, Amended 12-4-85, Formerly 21M-22.09,
Amended 9-7-88, 3-13-89, 1-1-92, 2-21-93, Formerly 21M-22.009,
Amended 11-4-93, Formerly 61F6-22.009, Amended 11-15-94, 2-15-
96, Formerly 59R-4.009, Amended 7-10-01, 1-31-02, 5-10-04, 5-20-
04, 6-13-06, 12-26-06, 1-18-09, 3-17-09, 10-7-09, 1-7-10, 5-18-10, 2-
28-12,1-27-13 .

2670

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Credentials Committee, Board of Medicine

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: Board of Medicine

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: April 5, 2013

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAR: May 2, 2013

Section 1|
Notice of Changes, Corrections and
Withdrawals

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS
South Florida Water Management District

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:

40E-7.669 Definitions

40E-7.670 Competitive Solicitation Preferences
40E-7.671 District Implementation

40E-7.672 Compliance

40E-7.674 Certification Review Procedures
40E-7.675 Recertification Review Procedures
40E-7.677 Reciprocity

NOTICE OF CORRECTION
Notice is hereby given that the following correction has been
made to the proposed rule in Vol. 39, No. 61, March 28, 2013
issue of the Florida Administrative Register.
The following statement regarding legislative ratification was
inadvertently omitted from the Notice of Proposed Rule:
The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: The agency used a checklist to conduct an economic
analysis and determine if there was an adverse impact or
regulatory costs of the rule that exceeded the criteria in
Section 120.541(2)(a), F.S.. Based upon this analysis, the
agency has determined that the proposed rule is not expected
to require legislative ratification.

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILY
SERVICES

Agency for Persons with Disabilities

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:

65G-4.0210 Definitions

65G-4.0211 General Provisions

65G-4.0212 Transition of Individuals to iBudget Florida

65G-4.022 iBudget Cost Plan Development and
Approval

65G-4.024 Cost Plan Changes

65G-4.027 Cost Plan Funding and Review


http://www.doh.state.fl.us/%20mqa/medical/me_applicant.html
http://www.doh.state.fl.us/%20mqa/medical/me_applicant.html
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02168
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02168
http://www.doh.state.fl.us/mqa/medical/me_applicant.html
http://www.lexis.com/research/buttonTFLink?_m=4b1ac434770c95f055065521ec959044&_xfercite=%3ccite%20cc%3d%22USA%22%3e%3c%21%5bCDATA%5b64B8-1.007%2c%20F.A.C.%5d%5d%3e%3c%2fcite%3e&_butType=4&_butStat=0&_butNum=2&_butInline=1&_butinfo=FLCODE%20458.317&_fmtstr=FULL&docnum=1&_startdoc=1&wchp=dGLbVzW-zSkAb&_md5=a456611762a902a568915b33ebf8d845
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02169
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02169
http://www.doh.state.fl.us/mqa/medical/me_applicant.html
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-02170
http://www.doh.state.fl.us/mqa/%20medical/me_applicant.html
http://www.doh.state.fl.us/mqa/%20medical/me_applicant.html
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.%20asp?No=Ref-02172
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.%20asp?No=Ref-02172
http://www.doh.state.fl.us/%20mqa/medical/me_applicant.html
http://www.doh.state.fl.us/%20mqa/medical/me_applicant.html
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=124
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40E-7.669
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40E-7.670
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40E-7.671
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40E-7.672
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40E-7.674
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40E-7.675
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40E-7.677
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=560
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.0210
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.0211
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.0212
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.022
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.024
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-4.027

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 98, May 20, 2013

NOTICE OF CORRECTION

Notice is hereby given that the following correction has been
made to the proposed rule in VVol. 38, No. 31, August 3, 2012
issue of the Florida Administrative Register.

The Agency inadvertently omitted reference to the information
relied upon to determine that the proposed rule was not
expected to require legislative ratification. The information the
agency relied on was the worksheet called “Proposed Rule: Is
a SERC Required.” The Agency inadvertently omitted
reference to the person originating the rule. The person who
originated the rule is Mike Hansen.

Section IV
Emergency Rules

NONE

Section V
Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Rule
Variance or Waiver

PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Florida Public Service
Commission received a petition from Consolidated Services of
Hendry & Collier, LLC, filed April 29, 2013, in Docket No.
130105-WS, seeking a waiver from paragraphs 25-
30.033(1)(h), (m), (o), (1), (u), (v), and (w), Florida
Administrative Code. The rule provisions requested to be
temporarily varied or waived all require the submittal of
information upon which initial rates may be designed.
Comments on the petition should be filed with the Florida
Public Service Commission Office of Commission Clerk,
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-
0850, within 14 days of publication of this notice.

A copy of the petition may be obtained by contacting: Florida
Public Service Commission, Office of Commission Clerk,
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-
0850 or at (http://www.psc.state.fl.us/).  For additional
information, please contact Caroline Klancke, Office of the
General Counsel, at the above address or telephone (850)413-
6218.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Hotels and Restaurants

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61C-5.001: Safety Standards

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation,
Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety
hereby gives notice:

On May 16, 2013, the Department issued a Final Order that
was in response to a Petition for Variance from Trinity Town
Center, LLLP, filed February 14, 2013 and advertised on
February 18, 2013, in Vol. 39, No. 33, of the Florida
Administrative Register. No comments were received in
response to the petition. The Final Order on the Petition for
Variance denies the Petitioner a variance from Rule 3.1,
3.4.43.45, 34.7, 3.4.8, 3.7, 3.8, 3.16.3, 3.19.2.6, 3.19.4.1,
3.19.4.4, 3.19.45, 3.21, 3.21.2, 3.24.3.1, 3.25.1.2, 3.25.1.3,
3.25.1.4, 3.26.2, 3.26.4.2, 3.27, 3.27.1, 3.27.2, 3.27.3, 3.27.4,
21112, 2225 2331, 27112, 27131, 2781,
2.8.3.3.2, 28334, 211.14, 2.11.15, 21119, 2.12.7.3.2,
2134, 214212, 2147.1.4, 2.21.4, 2.26.1.4.1, 2.26.2.38,
2.26.4.3, 2.26.8.2, 2.26.9.3, 2.26.9.4, 2.26.9.5, 2.26.9.5.2,
2.26.9.5.3, 2.26.9.54, 226.96.1, 2273, 227.3.1.6,
2.27.3.2.2, 2.27.3.2.4, 2.27.3.3.1, 2.27.3.4, 2.27.8, 2.27.9,
27345, 27346, 21334, 2135 2136, 21417,
2.146.21, 2.16.9, 2.16.5.1.2, 2.19.2, 2.19.3.2, 2.26.1.5.5,
2.26.2, 2.26.4.4, 2.26.4.4.1, 2.26.4.4.2, 2.26.9.3, 2.27.3.1.6,

227337, 22742, 2278, 214, 246, 2462, 248,
212737, 21416, 214.16.2, 21417, 214172,
214173, 214174, 214426, 227113, 2.27.3.16,

2.27.3.2.2, 2.27.3.3.1, 2.27.3.3.7, 2.27.3.4, 2.27.4, ASME
Al17.1S, 2005 edition, Al7.1, 2007 edition, Al7.1a 2008
edition, A17.1b 2009 edition, as adopted by paragraph 61C-
5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative Code that requires
upgrading the elevators construction of hoistways, and
hoistway enclosures, maximum upward movement, top of car
clearances, equipment of top of car not permitted to strike
overhead structure, machinery spaces, machine rooms, control
spaces, and control rooms, electrical equipment, wiring pipes,
and ducts in hoistway, machinery spaces, machine room,
control spaces and control rooms, capacity and data plates,
pressure piping, shutoff valve, manual lowering valve,
pressure gauge fittings, counterweights, covers and venting,
location of stopping devices, requirements for stopping
devices on the car or in the hoistway, inspection operation,
electrical protective devices, emergency operation and
signaling devices, phase | emergency recall operations after
device actuation, phase | emergency recall operations prior to
device actuation, device actuation at recall level, device
actuation with phase Il emergency in-car operation in effect,
construction of hoistways and hoistway enclosures, pits,
remote counterweight hoistways, machinery spaces, machine
rooms, control spaces, and control rooms, floors, remote
machine rooms and control rooms, pipes, ducts, tanks and
sprinklers, protection of hoistway openings access openings
for cleaning of car and hoistway enclosures, marking,
gasketing of hoistway entrances, hoistway access switches,
closing limitations for power-operated horizontally sliding
hoistway doors and horizontally sliding car doors or gates,

2671


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=25
http://www.psc.state.fl.us/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 98, May 20, 2013

passenger-car enclosures, illumination of cars and lighting
fixtures, compensation means, inspection operations,
retractable ladder electrical device, electrical equipment and
wiring, release and application of driving-machine brakes,
control and operating circuits, firefighters’ emergency
operation: automatic elevators, phase | emergency recall
operation, phase Il emergency in-car operation, interruption of
power, switch keys, elevator corridor call station pictograph,
control of smoke and gases, maximum upward movement of
the car counterweighted elevators, top of counterweight
clearances, hoistway access switches, car enclosure tops,
passenger and freight car doors and gates, general
requirements, car emergency signaling devices, firefighters
emergency operation automatic elevators-phase | emergency
recall operation, phase | emergency recall operation by fire
alarm initiating devices, phase Il emergency in-car operation,
interruption of power and nonautomatic elevators because the
Petitioner has not demonstrated that the purpose of the rule
will be met or that Petitioner would suffer a substantial
hardship if required to comply with this rule (VW2013-049).
A copy of the Order or additional information may be
obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator
Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-1013, 850-488-1133.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Hotels and Restaurants

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61C-5.001: Safety Standards

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation,
Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety
hereby gives notice:

On May 16, 2013 the Division issued an order. The Final
Order was in response to a Petition for a Variance from 4th
Ave. Apt. Parking Garage, filed April 16, 2013 and advertised
on April 24, 2013 in Vol. 39, No. 80, of the Florida
Administrative Register. No comments were received in
response to the petition. The Final Order on the Petition for
Variance grants the Petitioner a variance from Rule 2.18.5.1
and 2.20.1, ASME Al17.1b, 2009 edition, as adopted by
paragraph 61C-5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative Code that
requires that requires steel ropes of a minimum diameter of 9.5
mm because the Petitioner has demonstrated that the intent of
the rule will be met and that Petitioner would suffer a
substantial hardship if required to comply with this rule
(VW2013-120).

A copy of the Order or additional information may be
obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator
Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-1013.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Hotels and Restaurants

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61C-5.001: Safety Standards

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation,
Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety
hereby gives notice:

On May 16, 2013 the Division issued an order. The Final
Order was in response to a Petition for a Variance from
Science Drive Building, filed March 28, 2013, and advertised
on April 4, 2013 in Vol. 39, No. 66, of the Florida
Administrative Register. No comments were received in
response to the petition. The Final Order on the Petition for
Variance grants the Petitioner a variance from Rule 2.18.5.1,
2.20.4, 8.11.2.1.3(cc)1&3, ASME A17.1b, 2009 edition, as
adopted by paragraph 61C-5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative
Code that requires steel ropes of a minimum diameter of 9.5
mm because the Petitioner has demonstrated that the intent of
the rule will be met and that Petitioner would suffer a
substantial hardship if required to comply with this rule
(VW2013-105).

A copy of the Order or additional information may be
obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator
Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-1013.

2672

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Hotels and Restaurants

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61C-5.001: Safety Standards

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation,
Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety
hereby gives notice:

On May 16, 2013 the Division issued an order. The Final
Order was in response to a Petition for a temporary Variance
from Harbor Point Association Inc., filed April 17, 2013, and
advertised on April 24, 2013 in Vol. 39, No. 80, of the Florida
Administrative Register. No comments were received in
response to the petition. The Final Order on the Petition for
Variance grants the Petitioner a variance from Rule 3.11.3
ASME A17.3, 1996 edition, as adopted by paragraph 61C-
5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative Code that requires
providing fire fighter service because the Petitioner has
demonstrated that the intent of the rule will be met and that
Petitioner would suffer a substantial hardship if required to
comply with this rule (VW2013-121).

A copy of the Order or additional information may be
obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 98, May 20, 2013

Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-1013.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Hotels and Restaurants

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61C-5.001: Safety Standards

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation,
Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety
hereby gives notice:

On May 16, 2013, the Division issued an order. The Final
Order was in response to a Petition for an emergency Variance
from 612 Beach Road Condos (1), filed April 29, 2013, and
advertised on May 2, 2013 in Vol. 39, No. 86 , of the Florida
Administrative Register. No comments were received in
response to the petition. The Final Order on the Petition for
Variance grants the Petitioner a variance from Rule 2.18.5.1,
2.20.4, 8.11.2.1.3(cc)1&3, ASME A17.1b, 2009 edition, as
adopted by paragraph 61C-5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative
Code that requires the steel ropes of a minimum diameter of
9.5 mm because the Petitioner has demonstrated that the intent
of the rule will be met and that Petitioner would suffer a
substantial hardship if required to comply with this rule
(VW2013-125).

A copy of the Order or additional information may be
obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator
Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-1013.

A copy of the Order or additional information may be
obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator
Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-1013.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Hotels and Restaurants

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61C-5.001: Safety Standards

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on May 15, 2013, the
Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division
of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received
a petition for Florida Winery. Petitioner seeks an emergency
variance of the requirements of ASME A17.1, Section 2.2.2.3
and 2.2.2.5, as adopted by subsection 61C-5.001(1), Florida
Administrative Code that requires upgrading the elevators
design and construction of pits which poses a significant
economic/financial hardship. Any interested person may file
comments within 5 days of the publication of this notice with
Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940 North Monroe
Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013 (VW2013-145).

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be
obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator
Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-1013.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Hotels and Restaurants

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61C-5.001: Safety Standards

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation,
Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety
hereby gives notice:

On May 16, 2013 the Division issued an order. The Final
Order was in response to a Petition for a Variance from Surf
Dweller Condo, filed May 6, 2013 and advertised on May 8,
2013 in Vol. 39, No. 90, of the Florida Administrative
Register. No comments were received in response to the
petition. The Final Order on the Petition for Variance grants
the Petitioner a variance from Rule 2.27.3.2, and 2.27.3.3.7,
ASME A17.1b, 2009 edition, as adopted by paragraph 61C-
5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative Code from providing
phase 1 emergency recall operations by fire alarm initiating
devices and phase 2 emergency in car operation because the
Petitioner has demonstrated that the intent of the rule will be
met and that Petitioner would suffer a substantial hardship if
required to comply with this rule (VW2013-133).

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Hotels and Restaurants

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61C-5.001: Safety Standards

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on May 15, 2013, the
Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division
of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received
a petition for Keuper Building at Florida Institute of
Technology (2). Petitioner seeks an emergency variance of the
requirements of ASME A17.1b, Section 2.20.4, 2.18.5.1 and
8.11.2.1.3(cc)(1) & (3) as adopted by paragraph 61C-
5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative Code that requires steel
ropes of a minimum diameter of 9.5 mm which poses a
significant economic/financial hardship. Any interested person
may file comments within 5 days of the publication of this
notice with Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940
North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013
(VW2013-146).

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be
obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator
Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-1013.

2673


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 98, May 20, 2013

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Hotels and Restaurants

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61C-5.001: Safety Standards

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on May 15, 2013, the
Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division
of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received
a petition for Keuper Building at Florida Institute of
Technology (1). Petitioner seeks an emergency variance of the
requirements of ASME A17.1b, Section 2.4.1.5 and 2.15.9.2,
as adopted by subsection 61C-5.001(1), Florida
Administrative Code that allows ability to install retractable
toe guard which poses a significant economic/financial
hardship. Any interested person may file comments within 5
days of the publication of this notice with Mark Boutin,
Bureau of Elevator Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013 (VW2013-147).

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be
obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator
Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-1013.

of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received
a petition for Venetian Walk (2). Petitioner seeks a variance of
the requirements of ASME A17.1b, Section 2.20.1, 2.18.5.1 as
adopted by paragraph 61C-5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative
Code that requires steel ropes of a minimum diameter of 9.5
mm which poses a significant economic/financial hardship.
Any interested person may file comments within 14 days of
the publication of this notice with Mark Boutin, Bureau of
Elevator Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-1013 (VW2013-149).

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be
obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator
Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-1013.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Hotels and Restaurants

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61C-5.001: Safety Standards

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on May 15, 2013, the
Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division
of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received
a petition for Venetian Walk. Petitioner seeks a variance of the
requirements of ASME A17.1b, Section 2.20.1, 2.18.5.1 as
adopted by paragraph 61C-5.001(1)(a), Florida Administrative
Code that requires steel ropes of a minimum diameter of 9.5
mm which poses a significant economic/financial hardship.
Any interested person may file comments within 14 days of
the publication of this notice with Mark Boutin, Bureau of
Elevator Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-1013 (VW2013-148).

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be
obtained by contacting: Mark Boutin, Bureau of Elevator
Safety, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-1013.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Hotels and Restaurants

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61C-5.001: Safety Standards

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on May 15, 2013, the
Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division

2674

Section VI
Notice of Meetings, Workshops and Public
Hearings

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

The Commercial Motor Vehicle Review Board announces a
public meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: June 13, 2013, 8:30 a.m.

PLACE: Embassy Suites, 8250 Jamaican Court, Orlando, FL
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
This is a monthly meeting of the Commercial Motor Vehicle
Review Board for the purpose of reviewing penalties imposed
upon any vehicle or persons under the provisions of Chapter
316, Florida Statutes, relating to weights imposed on the
highway by the axles and wheels of motor vehicles, to special
fuel and motor fuel tax compliance, or to violations of safety
regulations.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting:
Katherine Becker, Executive Assistant, Commercial Vehicle
Review Board, 605 Suwannee Street, MS 90, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting:  Katherine  Becker, Executive  Assistant,
Commercial Vehicle Review Board, 605 Suwannee Street, MS
90, Tallahassee, Florida 32399. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

REGIONAL PLANNING COUNCILS

East Central Florida Regional Planning Council

The Wekiva River Basin Commission announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: June 10, 2013, 10:00 a.m.


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=14
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=29
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=62

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 98, May 20, 2013

PLACE: East Central Florida Regional Planning Council, 309
Cranes Roost Blvd. Suite 2000, Altamonte Springs, FL 32701
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
The quarterly meeting of the Wekiva River Basin
Commission.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Tara
McCue by email at tara@ecfrpc.org or (407)262-7772, ext.
327.

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the
Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or
hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of
the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony
and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: Tara McCue by email
at tara@ecfrpc.org or (407)262-7772, ext. 327.

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS

South Florida Water Management District

The South Florida Water Management District announces a
public meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: May 31, 2013, 10:00 a.m.

PLACE: District Headquarters, B-1, 3rd Floor, Storch Room,
3301 Gun Club Road, West Palm Beach, FL 33406
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Meeting of the Lake Belt Mitigation Committee (LBMC),
created pursuant to Section 373.41492, Florida Statutes, to
discuss a variety of Lake Belt issues.

This meeting will also available on teleconference.
Teleconference information: Local SFWMD (561)682-6700
Nationwide Toll Free 1(866)433-6299

Meeting ID #: 3385

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Lourdes
Elias, (561)682-2706 or http://www.sfwmd.gov/miamidade.
Click on "Task Force and Coordination Teams" in the Related
Links section.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: District Clerk at (561)682-2087. If you are hearing
or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-
8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact: The South Florida
Water Management District, Attention: Lourdes Elias, MSC
4110, 3301 Gun Club Road, P. O. Box 24680, West Palm
Beach, FL 33416-4680.

DATE AND TIME: May 31, 2013, 10:00 a.m.
Kissimmee/Okeechobee Region Land Assessment 2nd
Meeting

PLACE: SFWMD Okeechobee Service Center, 3800 NW 16th
Boulevard, Okeechobee, FL 34972

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
District staff shall provide information regarding the land
assessment process and District lands within the
Kissimmee/Okeechobee Region. The purpose of the land
assessment is to take a comprehensive and detailed look at the
District’s land inventory to ensure that the present and future
use of these lands will be utilized in the most effective manner
to support the District’s core mission requirements, and to
comply with other important state policy objectives. Public
input and comment will be received. More information about
the process is available at www.sfwmd.gov/landassessment.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: District Clerk, (561)682-2087. If you are hearing
or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-
8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Andrea Schluter,
aschlut@sfwmd.gov.

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS

South Florida Water Management District

The South Florida Water Management District announces a
public meeting to which all persons are invited.

DEPARTMENT OF ELDER AFFAIRS

The Department of Elder Affairs announces a public meeting
to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, June 4, 2013, 9:00 a.m. — 11:00
a.m. (EST)

PLACE: (888)670-3525, Conference Code: 2532 8588 95
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
The work of the Purple Ribbon Task Force and its committees
will be discussed.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Danielle
Bist, Department of Elder Affairs, 4040 Esplanade Way,
Tallahassee, FL 32399-7000, (850)414-2140, email:
bistd@elderaffairs.org.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 72 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Danielle Bist, Department of Elder Affairs, 4040
Esplanade Way, Tallahassee, FL 32399-7000, (850)414-2140,
email: bistd@elderaffairs.org. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
For more information, you may contact: Danielle Bist,
Department of Elder Affairs, 4040 Esplanade Way,

2675


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=124
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=124
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=58

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 98, May 20, 2013

Tallahassee, FL 32399-7000, email:

bistd@elderaffairs.org.

(850)414-2140,

DEPARTMENT OF ELDER AFFAIRS

The Department of Elder Affairs announces a public meeting
to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, June 6, 2013, 9:00 a.m. —11:00
a.m. (EST)

PLACE: (888)670-3525, Conference Code: 2532 8588 95
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
The work of the Purple Ribbon Task Force and its committees
will be discussed.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Danielle
Bist, Department of Elder Affairs, 4040 Esplanade Way,
Tallahassee, FL 32399-7000, (850)414-2140, email:
bistd@elderaffairs.org.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 72 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Danielle Bist, Department of Elder Affairs, 4040
Esplanade Way, Tallahassee, FL 32399-7000, (850)414-2140,
email: bistd@elderaffairs.org. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
For more information, you may contact: Danielle Bist,

Department of Elder Affairs, 4040 Esplanade Way,
Tallahassee, FL 32399-7000, (850)414-2140, email:
bistd@elderaffairs.org.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Florida Building Commission

The Florida Building Commission,
PROGRAM OVERSIGHT COMMITTEE,
public meeting to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: June 3, 2013, 10:00 a.m.
PLACE: MEETINGS TO BE CONDUCTED USING
COMMUNICATIONS MEDIA TECHNOLOGY: You must
access WEBINAR for VIDEO ONLY and
TELECONFERENCE number for AUDIO ONLY.

Topic: Education Program Oversight Committee

Date: Monday, June 3, 2013

Time: 10:00 am, Eastern Daylight Time (New York, GMT-
04:00)

Meeting Password:
password.)
WEBINAR ACCESS:

EDUCATION
announces a

(This meeting does not require a

To join the online meeting (Now from mobile devices!)

2676

1. Go to https://suncom.webex.com/suncom/j.php?ED=
181111477&UID=1392516817&RT=MiMxMQ%3D%3D

2. If requested, enter your name and email address.

3. This meeting does not require a password.

4. Click "Join",

TELECONFERENCE ACCESS:

Call-in toll-free number; 1(888)670-3525 (US)

Attendee access code: 606-232-6940

Public point of access: 1940 North Monroe Street, Suite 90,
Tallahassee, Florida.

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Discuss  “accreditor” and “course” applications for
recommendation to the Florida Building Commission and
general subject matters.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Ms. lla
Jones, Building Codes and Standards Office, Division of
Professions, Department of Business and Professional
Regulation Affairs, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-0772 or call (850)487-1824.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 10 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Ms. Barbara Bryant, Building Codes and
Standards Office, Division of Professions, Department of
Business and Professional Regulation, 1940 North Monroe
Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0772, (850)487-1824 or
Fax (850)414-8436. If you are hearing or speech impaired,
please contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service,
1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the
Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or
hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of
the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony
and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: Ms. lla Jones,
Building Codes and Standards Office, Division of Professions,
Department of Business and Professional Regulation Affairs,
1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0772
or call (850)487-1824.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Florida Building Commission

The FLORIDA BUILDING COMMISSION,  “the
COMMISSION”, HURRICANE RESEARCH ADVISORY
COMMITTEE announces a public meeting to which all
persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: May 30, 2013, 1:00 p.m. — HAS BEEN
POSTPONED. RE-SCHEDULED DATE TO BE
DETERMINED.


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=58
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://suncom.webex.com/suncom/j.php?ED
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 98, May 20, 2013

PLACE: POSTPONED RE-SCHEDULED DATE TO BE
DETERMINED

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
This notice is to advise you that the next meeting of the
Hurricane Research  Advisory Committee, originally
scheduled for May 30, 2013, has been temporarily
POSTPONED in order to allow final research reports to be
completed/submitted which is anticipated to occur by June 15,
2013. The meeting will be re-scheduled soon after that date.
Should you have any questions, please contact us.

To discuss technical research needed in support of building
code and standards development.

For more information, you may contact: For more
information, you may contact: Mr. Mo Madani, Building
Codes and Standards Office, Department of Business and
Professional Regulation, 1940 North Monroe Street,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399, Phone (850)487-1824 or Fax
(850)414-8436, Website: www.floridabuilding.org.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Massage Therapy

The Board of Massage Therapy announces a public meeting to
which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: July 25-26, 2013, 9:00 a.m., E.S.T.
PLACE: Orlando World Center Marriott, 8701 World Center
Dr., Orlando, FL 32821, (407)239-4200

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
General business of the Board.

This notice is to replace notice no. 12530186.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Anthony
Jusevitch, Executive Director at (850)245-4161 or 4052 Bald
Cypress Way, #C-06, Tallahassee, FL 32399.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Paula Mask at (850)245-4161. If you are hearing
or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-
8770 (Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the
Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or
hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of
the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony
and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, June 4, 2013, 9:00 a.m. and
Wednesday, June 5, 2013, 8:00 a.m.

PLACE: DoubleTree Miami Airport Convention Center, 711
N.W. 72nd Avenue, Miami, FL 33126, (305)261-3800
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
General Board business.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: The
Board of Pharmacy website:
http://www.doh.state.fl.us/mga/pharmacy/ph_meeting.html
under "Agendas and Notices" 7 days prior to the meeting date.
You may also contact: the Board of Pharmacy, (850)245-
4292,

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 10 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: the Board of Pharmacy at (850)245-4292. If you
are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency
using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the
Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or
hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of
the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony
and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: The Board of
Pharmacy, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin C-04, Tallahassee,
FL 32399-3254 or (850)245-4292.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Pharmacy

The Board of Pharmacy announces a public meeting to which
all persons are invited.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Speech-Language Pathology and Audiology

The Board of Speech-Language Pathology and Audiology
announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: July 24, 2013, 9:00 a.m., EST

PLACE: Orlando World Center Marriott, 8701 World Center
Dr., Orlando, FL 32821, (407)239-4200

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
General business of the Board.

This notice is to replace notice no. 12410876.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Anthony
Jusevitch, Executive Director at (850)245-4161 or 4052 Bald
Cypress Way, #C-06, Tallahassee, FL 32399.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Christy Robinson at (850)245-4161. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using
the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

2677


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=330
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=307
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=312

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 98, May 20, 2013

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the
Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or
hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of
the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony
and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency
using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Jessica McCawley, at
620 S. Meridian, Tallahassee, FL 32399, (850)487-0554.

FISH AND WILDLIFE CONSERVATION COMMISSION
Marine Fisheries

The Florida Fish and Wildlife Conservation Commission
announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: July 29, 2013, 5:00 p.m. — 8:00 p.m.
EDT.

PLACE: International Game Fish Association Fishing Hall of
Fame and Museum, 300 Gulf Stream Way, Dania Beach, FL
33004

DATE AND TIME: July 30, 2013, 5:00 p.m. — 8:00 p.m. EDT
PLACE: Murray E. Nelson Government and Cultural Center,
102050 Overseas Highway, Mile Marker 102, Key Largo, FL
33037

DATE AND TIME: July 31, 2013, 5:00 p.m. — 8:00 p.m. EDT
PLACE: City of Key Colony Beach — City Hall Building, City
Hall Auditorium, Mile Marker 53.5, 600 W. Ocean Drive, Key
Colony Beach, FL 33051-0141

DATE AND TIME: August 1, 2013, 5:00 p.m. — 8:00 p.m.
EDT

PLACE: Harvey Government Center, 1200 Truman Avenue,
2nd Floor, Key West, FL 33040

DATE AND TIME: August 5, 2013, 5:00 p.m. — 8:00 p.m.
EDT

PLACE: Marco Island Marriott Beach Resort, 400 S. Collier
Boulevard, Marco Island, FL 34145

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
The purpose of these workshops is to gather public comments
on marine fisheries regulations and issues in South Florida.
The Florida Fish and Wildlife Conservation Commission is
responsible for managing fisheries in state waters and the
South Atlantic Fishery Management Council and Gulf of
Mexico Fishery Management Council are responsible for
managing fisheries in federal waters in the Atlantic Ocean and
Gulf of Mexico off South Florida. Goals of this meeting are to
identify fishery management issues that are specific to South
Florida and possible ways to better coordinate state and
federal fisheries management in this region.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Jessica
McCawley, at 620 S. Meridian, Tallahassee, FL 32399,
(850)487-0554.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: The ADA Coordinator, at (850)488-6411. If you

2678

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES

OIR — Insurance Regulation

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

690-149.003:  Rate Filing Procedures

The Office of Insurance Regulation announces a hearing to
which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: August 6, 2013, 9:00 a.m., during a
regular meeting of the Financial Services Commission
PLACE: Cabinet Meeting Room, Lower Level, The Capitol,
Tallahassee, Florida

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
The Final Public Hearing on the adoption of proposed
amendment to Rule 690-149.003, Florida Administrative
Code, published on July 20, 2012 in Vol. 38, No. 29, of the
Florida Administrative Register has been changed from June
4, 2013, to August 6, 2013.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: The
Governor and Cabinet Website at
http://www.myflorida.com/myflorida/cabinet/mart.html.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Tom Zutell at E-mail Tom.Zutell@floir.com. If
you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency
using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Tom Zutell at E-mail
Tom.Zutell@floir.com.

CITIZENS PROPERTY INSURANCE CORPORATION

The Information Systems Advisory Committee of Citizens
Property Insurance Corporation announces a telephone
conference call to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: June 7, 2013, 11:00 a.m.

PLACE: Conference Call, 1(866)361-7525

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Business before the Information Systems Advisory
Committee.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: The
Corporate website at https://citizensfla.com/ or Maryann
Kinney at (850)513-3928.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=68
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=348
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=520
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-149.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=591

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 98, May 20, 2013

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Maryann Kinney at (850)513-3928. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using
the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

CITIZENS PROPERTY INSURANCE CORPORATION

The Citizens Property Insurance Corporation Board of
Governors announces a telephone conference call to which all
persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: May 22, 2013, 3:30 p.m.

PLACE: 1-888-942-8686 Conference ID: 5743735657#
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Topics include but are not limited the discussion of a
Depopulation Proposal.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: our
website www.citizensfla.com

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Barbara Walker, at 1(800)807-7647. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using
the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
This public hearing will be a review of comparative findings
regarding the benefit of selling or leasing the county owned
hospital and providing for public comment.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Heather
Guidry at (850)653-8853, ext. 101.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 1 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Heather Guidry at (850)653-8853, ext. 101. If you
are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency
using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the
Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or
hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of
the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony
and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: Heather Guidry at
(850)653-8853, ext. 101.

FLORIDA LOCAL GOVERNMENT FINANCE
COMMISSION
The Florida Local Government Finance Commission

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: Thursday, June 13, 2013, 10:30 a.m.
PLACE: 2502 Rocky Point Drive, Suite 1060, Tampa,
FL33607

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
The meeting of the Commission will be for the purposes of
reviewing the statewide pooled commercial paper loan
program for Florida governmental entities. The Commission is
an unincorporated, nonprofit association whose members are
comprised of Brevard County, Florida, Charlotte County,
Florida, Collier County, Florida, Lee County, Florida, Osceola
County, Florida and Sarasota County, Florida.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Anna
Doughty, Florida Association of Counties, 100 South Monroe
Street, Tallahassee, FL 32301.

GEORGE E. WEEMS MEMORIAL HOSPITAL

The George E. Weems Memorial Hospital announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, May 29, 2013, 9:00 a.m.
PLACE: Hospital Cafeteria

Section VI
Notice of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding Declaratory Statements

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares and Mobile
Homes

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Division of Florida
Condominiums, Timeshares, and Mobile Homes, Department
of Business and Professional Regulation, State of Florida, has
declined to rule on the petition for declaratory statement filed
by Moshe Leib, In Re: The Gardens 106, Inc., Docket No.
2013013513, on March 25, 2013. The following is a summary
of the agency's declination of the petition:

The Division declined to issue a Declaratory Statement
because it may not issue a statement when there is a dispute
regarding an ambiguous provision of the association’s
governing documents; or to determine the rights and duties of
third parties; or if no substantial evidence or governing
documents have been provided.

A copy of the Order Declining of the Petition for Declaratory
Statement may be obtained by contacting: Robin McDaniel,
Division Clerk, at Department of Business and Professional
Regulation, Division of Florida Condominiums, Timeshares,
and Mobile Homes, 1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-2217, (850)717-1424,
robin.mcdaniel@myfloridalicense.com.

2679


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=591
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=769
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=769
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1129
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=248
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=248

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 98, May 20, 2013

Please refer all comments to: Janis Sue Richardson, Chief
Assistant General Counsel, Department of Business and
Professional Regulation, Division of Florida Condominiums,
Timeshares, and Mobile Homes, 1940 North Monroe Street,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2202.

Section VIII
Notice of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding the Validity of Rules

Notice of Petition for Administrative Determination has been
filled with the Division of Administrative Hearings on the
following rules:

NONE

Notice of Disposition of Petition for Administrative
Determination has been filled with the Division of
Administrative Hearings on the following rules:

NONE

Section IX
Notice of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding Non-rule Policy Challenges

NONE

Section X
Annoucements and Objection Reports of the
Joint Adminstrative Procedures Committee

NONE

Section XI
Notices Regarding Bids, Proposals and
Purchasing

NONE

2680

Section XII
Miscellaneous

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR
VEHICLES
Division of Motor Vehicles
Faberge Group, LLC, for the FSTI mcy. line
Notice of Publication for a New Point

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of More

than 300,000 Population

Pursuant to Section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is
given that Puma Cycles, Corporation, intends to allow the
establishment of Faberge Group, LLC, d/b/a Ural of Naples as
a dealership for the sale of motorcycles manufactured by
Foshan City Fosti Motorcycle Manufacturing. Co. Ltd. (line-
make FSTI) at 3485 Domestic Avenue, Unit AB - 9 10,
Naples, (Collier County), Florida 34104, on or after June 19,
2013.

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and
principal investor(s) of Faberge Group, LLC, d/b/a Ural of
Naples are dealer operator(s): Rita Sherman, 557 104™ Avenue
North, Naples, Florida 34108 and Yakov Sherman, 557 104"
Avenue North, Naples, Florida 34108; principal investor(s):
Rita Sherman, 557 104™ Avenue North, Naples, Florida 34108
and Yakov Sherman, 557 104™ Avenue North, Naples, Florida
34108.

The notice indicates intent to establish the new point
location in a county of more than 300,000 population,
according to the latest population estimates of the University
of Florida, Bureau of Economic and Business Research.

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have
standing, pursuant to Section 320.642, Florida Statutes, to file
a petition or complaint protesting the application.

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the
Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30
days of the date of publication of this notice and must be
submitted to: Nalini Vinayak, Administrator, Dealer License
Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles,
Room A-312, MS 65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee
Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635.


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 98, May 20, 2013

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by
US Mail to: Josef Stutz, Puma Cycles, Corporation, 576
Explorer Street, Brea, California 92821.

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days
of the date of publication, a final order will be issued by the
Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving
the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant's
compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida
Statutes.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Massage Therapy
Emergency Action

On May 15, 2013, the State Surgeon General issued an Order of
Emergency Restriction Order with regard to the license of Shu
Yuan Sun, L.M.T., License # MA 70942. This Emergency
Restriction Order was predicated upon the State Surgeon
General’s findings of an immediate and serious danger to the
public health, safety and welfare pursuant to Sections 456.073(8)
and 120.60(6), Florida Statutes (2011). The State Surgeon
General determined that this summary procedure was fair under
the circumstances, in that there was no other method available to
adequately protect the public.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Nursing

Emergency Action
On May 15, 2013, the State Surgeon General issued an Order of
Emergency Suspension Order with regard to the license of
Michelle Lynn Carrico, L.P.N., License # PN 5168548. This
Emergency Suspension Order was predicated upon the State
Surgeon General’s findings of an immediate and serious danger to
the public health, safety and welfare pursuant to Sections
456.073(8) and 120.60(6), Florida Statutes (2011). The State
Surgeon General determined that this summary procedure was
fair under the circumstances, in that there was no other method
available to adequately protect the public.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Nursing

Emergency Action
On May 16, 2013, the State Surgeon General issued an Order of
Emergency Suspension Order with regard to Bianca Louise
Talarico, R.N., License # RN 9328344. This Emergency
Suspension Order was predicated upon the State Surgeon
General’s findings of an immediate and serious danger to the
public health, safety and welfare pursuant to Sections 456.073(8)
and 120.60(6), Florida Statutes (2011). The State Surgeon
General determined that this summary procedure was fair under
the circumstances, in that there was no other method available to
adequately protect the public.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Nursing

Emergency Action
On May 15, 2013, the State Surgeon General issued an Order of
Emergency Suspension Order with regard to the license of Angela
Melissa Cangiolosi, RN, License # RN 9289692. This Emergency
Suspension Order was predicated upon the State Surgeon
General’s findings of an immediate and serious danger to the
public health, safety and welfare pursuant to Sections 456.073(8)
and 120.60(6), Florida Statutes (2011). The State Surgeon
General determined that this summary procedure was fair under
the circumstances, in that there was no other method available to
adequately protect the public.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Board of Nursing

Emergency Action
On May 15, 2013, the State Surgeon General issued an Order of
Emergency Suspension Order with regard to the Qintavia
Hamilton, C.N.A., License #CNA124517. This Emergency
Suspension Order was predicated upon the State Surgeon
General’s findings of an immediate and serious danger to the
public health, safety and welfare pursuant to Sections 456.073(8)
and 120.60(6), Florida Statutes (2011). The State Surgeon
General determined that this summary procedure was fair under
the circumstances, in that there was no other method available to
adequately protect the public.

Section XIII
Index to Rules Filed During Preceeding
Week

NOTE: The above section will be published on Tuesday
beginning October 2, 2012, unless Monday is a holiday, then it
will be published on Wednesday of that week.

2681


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=330
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=332
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=332
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=332
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=332

