
Florida Administrative Register Volume 46, Number 137, July 15, 2020 

 

2743 

 

Section I 

Notice of Development of Proposed Rules 

and Negotiated Rulemaking 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Board of Professional Engineers 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61G15-19.004 Disciplinary Guidelines; Range of Penalties; 

Aggravating and Mitigating Circumstances 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of the amendment is 

to update the rule text. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Rule text. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 455.227, 455.2273, 471.008, 

471.031, 471.033 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 455.227, 455.2273, 455.2277, 

471.031, 471.033 FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Zana 

Raybon, Executive Director, Board of Professional Engineers, 

2639 North Monroe Street, Suite B-112, Tallahassee, FL 

32303; (850)521-0500. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE FROM 

THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE. 

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES 

Agency for Persons with Disabilities 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

65G-14.001 Definitions. 

65G-14.002 Qualifications. 

65G-14.003 Agency Monitoring and Oversight. 

65G-14.004 Qualified Organization Duties and 

Responsibilities – Oversight of Support 

Coordinators. 

65G-14.0041 Qualified Organization Duties and 

Responsibilities – Code of Ethics. 

65G-14.0042 Qualified Organization Duties and 

Responsibilities – Disciplinary Process. 

65G-14.0043 Qualified Organization Duties and 

Responsibilities – Mentoring Program. 

65G-14.005 Violations. 

65G-14.006 Disciplinary Action. 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of these new 

rules is to ensure that waiver support coordinators have the 

knowledge, skills, and abilities necessary to competently 

provide services to persons with developmental disabilities. 

These rules will implement and interpret statutory changes 

pursuant to Chapter 2020-71, Laws of Florida, regarding 

qualified organizations and waiver support coordinators. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: The subject areas to 

be addressed in these new rules include requirements for 

qualified organizations, including minimum requirements for 

each qualified organization’s code of ethics, disciplinary 

process, and mentoring program, as well as what and when 

qualified organizations must report to the Agency. These rules 

also address a qualified organization’s violation(s) of Agency 

rule(s) or statute(s) and the range of actions the Agency may 

take in response. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 393.501, 393.0663(5), FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 393.0663(2), 393.0663(3), 

393.0663(4), FS. 

A RULE DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD 

AT THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW: 

DATE AND TIME: July 30, 2020, 1:30 until 3:00 p.m. EDT 

PLACE: Attendees may register for the hearing at: 

https://attendee.gotowebinar.com/register/1971122390895608

592. After registering, a confirmation email will be received 

containing information about joining the webinar, and 

opportunities to offer comments and questions will be available. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Danielle Thompson at (850)922-4556 or 

Danielle.Thompson@apdcares.org. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Danielle 

Thompson, Senior Attorney, Agency for Persons with 

Disabilities, 4030 Esplanade Way, Suite 335, Tallahassee, FL 

32399, (850)922-4556, Danielle.Thompson@apdcares.org. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=267
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G15-19.004
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=455.227
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20455.2273
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20471.008
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20471.031
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20471.033%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=455.227
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20455.2273
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20455.2277
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20471.031
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20471.033%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=560
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-14.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-14.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-14.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-14.004
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-14.0041
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-14.0042
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-14.0043
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-14.005
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65G-14.006
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=393.501
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20393.0663(5)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=393.0663(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20393.0663(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20393.0663(4)


Florida Administrative Register Volume 46, Number 137, July 15, 2020 

 

2744 

Section II 

Proposed Rules 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Plant Industry 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:  

5B-52.001 Definitions 

5B-52.002 Purpose 

5B-52.003 Declaration of Boll Weevil as a Plant Pest 

5B-52.006 Eradication Zone or Regulated Area 

5B-52.007 Planting Cotton in the Eradication Zone and 

Required Participation 

5B-52.0075 Planting Kenaf in the Regulated Area and 

Required Participation 

5B-52.008 Treatment of Cotton in the Eradication Zone 

5B-52.009 Submission of Reporting Forms, 

Assessments and Penalties for Late 

Payment, and Cotton Destruction 

5B-52.010 Cotton Stalk Destruction 

5B-52.011 Movement of Regulated Articles 

5B-52.012 Issuance of Boll Weevil Certificates and 

Compliance Agreements, Cancellations, and 

Attachments 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of this rule is to 

identify the pink bollworm as a pest of cotton, update and 

clarify the areas that are regulated for cotton pests, prohibit the 

planting of kenaf in specified areas, and to amend the 

procedures pertaining to the submission of reporting forms and 

invoice assessments and penalties. 

SUMMARY: Guidelines for the establishment and 

identification of a regulated area; establish per-acre annual 

assessments to offset program costs and to provide procedures 

of such assessments. Specify conditions under which regulated 

articles may be certified as free of boll weevil when moved 

from a regulated area to a non-regulated area and provide 

penalties for violations for this rule. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION:  

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse 

impact on small business or likely increase directly or indirectly 

regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the aggregate within 

one year after the implementation of the rule. A SERC has not 

been prepared by the Agency.  

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 570.07(23), 581.031(6), (7), 

593.103(1), (2), FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 581.031(7), (26), 593.102, 

593.103(1), (2), (4), (5), (6), (7), (9), (10), (13), 593.105, 

593.106(1), 593.108, 593.109(1), 593.116(2), FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS 

NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Dr. Greg Hodges, Assistant Director, 

P.O. Box 147100, Gainesville, FL, (352)395-4627, 

Greg.Hodges@FDACS.gov 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

5B-52.001 Definitions and Purpose. 

(1) For the purpose of this rule chapter, the following 

definitions shall apply: 

(1) through (2) renumbered (a) through (b) No change.  

(c)(3) Boll weevil. The insect known as boll weevil, 

Anthonomus grandis (Bohman), is a plant pest of cotton, 

classified in the order Coleoptera, family Curculionidae, and all 

of its life stages. 

(d)(4) Boll weevil certificate. An official document issued 

or approved by the Ddepartment stipulating compliance with 

the requirements of this rule. 

(5) renumbered (e) No change  

(6) Compliance agreement. A written agreement between 

the department and a person engaged in the business of 

growing, handling or moving regulated articles, wherein the 

person agrees to comply with the provisions of this rule for the 

purpose of obtaining a boll weevil certificate. 

(7) renumbered (f) No change.  

(g)(8) Department. The Florida Department of Agriculture 

and Consumer Services. 

(9) through (10) renumbered (h) through (i) No change. 

(j)(11) Exposed. Subjected to Plant pests of cotton boll 

weevil infestation because of location to or contact with Plant 

pests of cotton boll weevil. 

(k)(12) Foundation. A nonprofit organization comprised of 

Florida cotton growers known as the Boll Weevil Eradication 

Foundation of Florida, Inc. (BWEFF) which was established to 

provide guidance and assist in policy decisions during an the 

eradication program. 

(l)(13) Infested. Actually harboring Plant pests of cotton 

boll weevil. 

(14) International movement. Movement into Florida from 

any country or area outside the United States. 

(15) through (16) renumbered (m) through (n) No charge.  

(o) Kenaf. The plant known as African Hibiscus, Hibiscus 

cannabinus and including any parts thereof. 

(17) through (18) renumbered as (p) through  (q) No 

change.  

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=162
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5B-52.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5B-52.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5B-52.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5B-52.006
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5B-52.007
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5B-52.008
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5B-52.009
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5B-52.010
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5B-52.011
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=5B-52.012
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=570.07(23)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20581.031(6)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20593.103(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=581.031(7)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20593.102
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20593.103(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20593.105
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20593.106(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20593.108
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20593.109(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20593.116(2)


Florida Administrative Register Volume 46, Number 137, July 15, 2020 

 

2745 

 

(r) Pink Bollworm. The insect known as pink bollworm, 

Pectinophora gossypiella (Saunders), is a Plant pest of cotton, 

classified in the order Lepidoptera, family Gelechiidae, and all 

of its life stages. 

(s) Plant pest of cotton. Any living stage of any insects, 

mites, nematodes, slugs, snails, protozoa, or other invertebrate 

animals, bacteria, fungi, other parasitic plants or their 

reproductive parts, or viruses, or any organisms similar to or 

allied with any of the foregoing, including any genetically 

engineered organisms, or any infectious substances which can 

directly or indirectly injure or cause disease or damage in any 

plants or plant parts or any processed, manufactured, or other 

plant products. 

(t)(19) Regulated area. Florida or any portion thereof 

including any county, precinct, city, and other minor civil 

division designated by order of the Ddepartment as an area 

regulated due to the presence of Plant pests of cotton boll 

weevil. 

(u)(20) Regulated articles. Any article including but not 

limited to cotton plants, Kenaf plants, seed cotton, gin trash, and 

equipment capable of transporting or harboring Plant pests of 

cotton boll weevil or the insect itself. 

(21) renumbered (v) No change.  

(w)(22) Southeastern Boll Weevil Eradication Foundation, 

Inc. A nonprofit organization comprised of cotton growers and 

state plant regulatory officials representing all cotton-growing 

states in the Southeastern United States. The Southeastern Boll 

Weevil Eradication Foundation, Inc. was established to provide 

guidance to the state foundations and conduct the eradication of 

the Bboll weevil throughout the cotton-growing areas of the 

Southeastern United States. 

(x)(23) Ssuppressive area. An area where an attempt is 

being made to contain and control Plant pests of cotton. the 

population of boll weevil. 

(2) The purpose of this rule is to establish procedures for 

the production of Regulated articles within the State of Florida, 

to establish per-acre annual assessments for the offsetting of 

program costs, to provide procedures for the collection of such 

assessments, to specify conditions under which Regulated 

articles may be produced, and to provide penalties for violations 

of this rule. 

Rulemaking Authority 570.07(23), 581.031(4), (5), (6), (7), (8), 

593.103(1), (2) FS. Law Implemented 593.102, 593.103(1), (2) FS. 

History–New 12-21-87, Amended 6-20-00,  . 

 

5B-52.002 Purpose.  

Rulemaking Authority 570.07(23) FS., Section 3(2), Chapter 87-55, 

Laws of Florida. Law Implemented Chapter 87-55, Laws of Florida. 

History–New 12-21-87, Repealed. 

 

5B-52.003 Declaration of Boll Weevil as a Plant Pest.  

Rulemaking Authority 570.07(23), 593.103(2) FS. Law Implemented 

593.103(2), (5) FS. History–New 12-21-87, Amended 7-5-95, 

Repealed. 

 

5B-52.006 Eradication Zone or Regulated Area.  

Rulemaking Authority 570.07(23) FS. Law Implemented 593.103(2), 

(5), (9) FS. History–New 12-21-87, Amended 7-5-95,Repealed. 

 

5B-52.007 Planting Cotton in the Regulated Area 

Eradication Zone and Required Participation. 

(1) Commercial cotton. All Ccommercial cotton growers 

shall be required to participate in the Boll Weevil Eradication 

Program. Participation shall include the timely reporting of 

acreage and field locations, compliance with regulations, and 

payment of fees as prescribed in this rule. In order to prevent 

the spread of the Pink Bollworm (Pectinophora gossypiella 

(Saunders)) from south Florida northward to the state’s 

Commercial cotton-producing areas, the planting of 

Commercial cotton is prohibited in Pinellas, Hillsborough, 

Hardee, Highlands, Okeechobee, and St. Lucie and all counties 

south thereof. This area is hereby desiganted as the Regulated 

area. 

(2) Noncommercial cotton. Noncommercial cotton shall 

not be produced in the Regulated area eradication zone without 

a permit except by written authorization issued by the Ddivision 

Ddirector for research purposes. Persons seeking a permit to 

produce Noncommercial cotton in the Regulated area must 

submit a request letter to the Divison that consists of the 

location and size of the production area and the purpose for 

producing the Cotton. 

(3) Commercial cotton that does not meet the requirements 

for Cotton planted in a Regulated area and that the Department 

has reason to believe jeopardizes the success of the program 

shall be destroyed by the Department. Commercial cotton not 

meeting the requirements for boll weevil eradication. 

Commercial cotton planted in areas where boll weevil 

eradication treatments cannot be effectively or legally applied 

due to factors concerning the public welfare shall be destroyed 

by the department if determined by the department that it 

jeopardizes the success of the program. 

(4) Notice of destruction. The Department may issue an 

order directing any cotton grower to destroy any Cotton that is 

not grown in compliance with ss. 593.101-593.117, F.S. or this 

rule. The department may by oral order require the destruction 

of cotton not meeting the provisions of this rule without 

compensation. Such oral order shall become final 10 days after 

an Immediate Final Order is issued in writing by the department 

and delivered to the owner or representative of publicly- or 

privately-owned property. 



Florida Administrative Register Volume 46, Number 137, July 15, 2020 

 

2746 

Rulemaking Authority 570.07(23), 561.031(6),(7), 581.031(4), (5), 

(6), (7), (8), 593.103(2) FS. Law Implemented 593.103(9), 593.106(1), 

593.109(1) FS. History–New 12-21-87, Amended 6-20-00,  . 

 

5B-52.0075 Planting Kenaf in the Regulated Area and 

Required Participation 

(1) Commercial Kenaf.  In order to prevent the spread of 

the Pink bollworm (Pectinophora gossypiella (Saunders)) from 

south Florida northward to the state’s Commercial cotton-

producing areas, the planting of commercial Kenaf is prohibited 

in Pinellas, Hillsborough, Hardee, Highlands, Okeechobee, and 

St. Lucie and all counties south thereof.  This area is hereby 

desiganted as the Regulated area. 

(2) Noncommercial Kenaf.  Noncommercial Kenaf shall 

not be produced in the Regulated area without a permit issued 

by the Division Director.  Persons seeking a permit to produce 

Noncommercial Kenaf in the Regulated area must submit a 

request letter to the Divison that consists of the location and size 

of the production are, and the purpose for producing the Kenaf. 

(3) Notice of destruction.  The Department may issue an 

order requiring the owner to destroy any Commercial or 

Noncommercial Kenaf that is not grown in compliance with ch. 

581, F.S., ss. 593.101-593.117,  F.S., or this rule.  

Rulemaking Authority 570.07(23), 581.031(4), (5), (6), (7), (8), 

593.103(2) FS. Law Implemented 593.103(9), 593.106(1), 593.109(1) 

FS. New              . 

 

5B-52.008 Treatment of Cotton in the Boll Weevil 

Regulated Area Eradication Zone.  

In the event of a boll weevil eradication program, The treatment 

of Ccotton in the Regulated area eradication zone shall be the 

responsibility of the Southeastern Boll Weevil Eradication 

Foundation, Inc., and shall be accomplished under their 

authority and direction. 

Rulemaking Authority 570.07(23), 593.103(2) FS. Law Implemented 

593.103(6), 593.108 FS. History–New 12-21-87, Amended 6-20-00, 

 . 

 

5B-52.009 Submission of Reporting Forms, Assessments 

and Penalties for Late Payment, and Cotton Destruction. 

(1) Each Ccommercial cotton grower shall submit a 

completed Report of Acreage Form (FSA-578), Cotton Acreage 

Reporting Form (DACS-08193, Revised 10/99) and 

incorporated herein by reference and available online at 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-

XXXXX, to the Ffederal Farm Service Agency (FSA) office 

servicing the county where the Ccotton is grown. A copy of the 

Cotton Acreage Reporting Form may be obtained from the 

Division of Plant Industry, Bureau of Plant and Apiary 

Inspection, Post Office Box 147100, Gainesville, Florida 

32614-7100. The Cotton Acreage Reporting Form This form 

provides the acreage planted by the Commercial cotton grower 

and shall be submitted each year the program remains in effect. 

ASCS will certify to the department the acreage and location of 

cotton for each commercial cotton grower. Form PI-163, Boll 

Weevil Eradication Program Intended Cotton Acreage 

Reporting Form, Revised 4/94, is incorporated into this rule by 

reference and is supplied by the department to ASCS. Copies of 

PI-163 may be obtained from the Division of Plant Industry, 

P.O. Box 147100, Gainesville, Florida 32614-7100, or the 

ASCS. 

(2) The per acre annual assessment for each acre is $5.00 

for 1987, $17.50 for 1988, $25 for 1989, $27 for 1990, $14 for 

1991, $18 for 1992, $10 for 1993, and $6.50 for 1994. 

Thereafter, as long as a program is necessary, containment costs 

shall not exceed $10 per acre. The cotton growers’ share of the 

per acre annual this assessment cost may vary depending on the 

availability of state funding. Commercial cotton growers’ share 

of the total assessment cost shall be due by November 30 June 

15 each year the program is in effect. Assessments will be 

invoiced by the Southeastern Boll Weevil Eradication 

Foundation and payments must be paid to the Florida 

Department of Agriculture and Consumer Services (FDACS) 

no later than December 31 and accompanied by the appropriate 

per acre assessment cost. Assessments that were unpaid as of 

September 1 of 1987-1993 are subject to a penalty fee of $4 per 

acre. Commencing with 1994 and thereafter, Ppayments not 

received by December 31 July 15 shall be subject to a per acre 

a penalty fee of 20 percent of the unpaid assessment. Penalty 

fees shall not to exceed $25 per acre. Assessment payments and 

penalty fees shall be paid at the local Farm Service Agency 

office. 

(3) All assessments and penalty fees collected by the 

federal Farm Service Agency shall be remitted to the 

department and accompanied by a completed Letter of 

Transmittal Form (DACS-08239, revised 10/99) and 

incorporated herein by reference, as prescribed in a cooperative 

agreement between the department and the state federal Farm 

Service Agency office and shall be deposited in the State 

Treasury to the credit of the Plant Industry Fund. A copy of the 

Letter of Transmittal form may be obtained from the Division 

of Plant Industry, Bureau of Plant and Apiary Inspection, Post 

Office Box 147100, Gainesville, Florida 32614-7100. 



Florida Administrative Register Volume 46, Number 137, July 15, 2020 

 

2747 

 

(3)(4) Penalty fees and/or per acre late fees may shall be 

waived by the Ddivision Ddirector only upon recommendation 

of the Foundation.  

Rulemaking Authority 570.07(23), 593.103(2) FS. Law Implemented 

593.103(4), (10), 593.105, 593.109, 593.116(2) FS. History–New 12-

21-87, Amended 4-2-89, 12-24-90, 6-26-94, 6-20-00,   . 

 

5B-52.010 Cotton Stalk Destruction.  

Growers of cotton Each commercial cotton grower, when 

requested by the Department shall destroy all cotton stalks by 

February 1 each year the program is in effect. Verification of 

cotton stalk destruction shall be reported on a Cotton 

Destruction Verification Form (FDACS-08164, revised 10/99), 

and incorporated herein by reference and is available online via 

link http://www.flrules/gateway/reference-no. A copy of the 

Cotton Destruction Verification Form may be obtained from the 

Division of Plant Industry, Bureau of Plant and Apiary 

Inspection, Post Office Box 147100, Gainesville, Florida 

32614-7100. Cotton stalks not destroyed by such date shall be 

deemed a public nuisance and subject to a penalty fee of $10.00 

per acre. The Ddepartment may apply to any court of competent 

jurisdiction, and the court is authorized, in its discretion, to 

issue judgment and order condemnation and destruction of the 

nuisance. The grower is liable for all court costs, fees, and other 

expenses incurred in such action.  

Rulemaking Authority 570.07(23), 593.103(2) FS. Law Implemented 

593.103(13), 593.109, 593.116 FS. History–New 12-21-87, Amended 

4-2-89, 6-20-00,   . 

 

5B-52.011 Movement of Regulated Articles. 

(1) International movement. The movement into Florida of 

boll weevil or any regulated article is prohibited from countries 

or areas outside the United States unless such countries or areas 

meet the provisions of this rule. 

(1)(2) Interstate movement. The movement of boll weevil 

or Rregulated articles into Florida from infested areas is 

prohibited unless such shipments are made in accordance with 

the provisions of this rule. 

(a) Provisions for movement into Florida of Rregulated 

articles associated with Plant pests of cotton boll weevil. 

1. Regulated articles from infested areas may enter Florida 

provided each shipment is accompanied by a certificate issued 

by and bearing the signature of an authorized inspector of the 

state of origin, certifying that Rregulated articles contained in 

the shipment were inspected by an authorized inspector of the 

state of origin and were found to be free of Plant pests of cotton 

boll weevil; or 

2. Rregulated articles from infested areas may enter Florida 

provided each shipment is accompanied by a certificate issued 

by and bearing the signature of an authorized inspector of the 

state of origin, certifying that such Rregulated articles were 

treated as required recommended by the Ddepartment. 

(b) Shipments of Rregulated articles arriving in Florida in 

violation of this chapter shall be refused entry and returned to 

the shipper or destroyed at the discretion of the Ddepartment. 

Shipments destroyed or returned out of state shall be at the 

expense of the shipper. Payment to the department for such 

expense shall be required before shipping can resume. 

(2)(3) Intrastate movement. 

(a) Regulated articles originating in a Ssuppressive area 

shall be authorized to move to an area described as a Rregulated 

area by the Ddepartment when accompanied by an 

authenticated Cotton Bboll Wweevil Ccertificate, (FDACS-

08162, Rev. revised 05/20 11/99) and incorporated herein by 

reference. This form is incorporated herein by reference and is 

available online at 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-

XXXXX. A copy of the Boll Weevil Certificate may be 

obtained from the Division of Plant Industry, Bureau of Plant 

and Apiary Inspection, Post Office Box 147100, Gainesville, 

Florida 32614-7100. 

(b) Record of movement of Rregulated articles. The 

owners, officers, employees, or Agents of any Commercial 

cotton grower that is infested with Plant pests of cotton or has 

been exposed to Plant pests of cotton shall furnish a list of all 

movements of Regulated Articles when requested by the 

Department. Said list must show the names and addresses of all 

consignees and include a complete description of the Regulated 

articles included in each shipment. The owners, officers and 

employees of any commercial cotton grower or agent 

establishment infested, or exposed to infestation, with boll 

weevil or which has heretofore been so infested, shall, on 

demand of the department furnish a list of all movements of 

regulated articles from said commercial cotton grower or agent 

establishment from any date of such demand. Said list shall 

show the names and addresses of all consignees, and a complete 

description of the regulated articles included in each shipment. 

(c) No change. 

(d) Disposition of Rregulated articles. Any article found to 

be infested with Plant pests of cotton boll weevil or moving in 

violation of this rule, shall be subject to treatment, or 

confiscation, or destruction as required by the Ddepartment. 

These actions shall be taken under the supervision of an 

Aauthorized representative. 

Rulemaking Authority 570.07(23), 581.031(4), (5), (6), (7), (8),  

593.103(2) FS. Law Implemented 593.103(5), (7), 593.107 FS. 

History–New 12-21-87, Amended 7-5-95, 6-20-00,   . 

 

5B-52.012 Issuance of Boll Weevil Certificates and 

Compliance Agreements, Cancellations, and Attachments. 

(1) Issuance of Bboll weevil certificates and compliance 

agreements.  Boll weevil certificates (FDACS-08162, Rev. 

05/20) shall be issued for the movement of Regulated articles 



Florida Administrative Register Volume 46, Number 137, July 15, 2020 

 

2748 

under one or all of the following conditions:   

(a) Boll weevil certificates. Boll weevil certificates 

(DACS-08162, revised 11/99) shall be issued for the movement 

of regulated articles. Conditions requiring a certificate for the 

movement of regulated articles are as follows: 

(a)1. When, in the judgment of an Aauthorized 

representative, Rregulated articles have not been exposed to 

infestation by the Boll weevil. 

(b)2. When Rregulated articles have been examined by an 

Aauthorized representative and found to be free of infestation 

by the Boll weevil. 

(c)3. When Rregulated articles have been treated as 

prescribed by the USDA, Animal and Plant Health Inspection 

Services, Plant Protection and Qurantine Treatment Manual, 

Chapter 5, Rev. 12/16 as incorporated in Rule 5B-3.0035, 

F.A.C. or the department under the supervision of the 

Departmentan authorized representative. 

(b) Compliance agreement. As a condition to receiving a 

boll weevil certificate (DACS-08162, revised 11/99) for the 

movement of regulated articles, any person engaged in 

producing, purchasing, exchanging, processing, utilizing, 

treating, or moving regulated articles from a regulated area shall 

be required by the department to sign a compliance agreement 

(DACS-08031, Revised 5/99) and incorporated herein by 

reference, stipulating that he will carry out all conditions, 

treatments, precautions, and sanitary measures deemed 

necessary by the department to prevent dissemination of boll 

weevil, including segregation and maintenance of identity of 

such articles, under supervision of an authorized representative. 

Any violation of such compliance agreement shall result in its 

cancellation.  A copy of the compliance agreement form 

(DACS-08031) may be obtained from the Division of Plant 

Industry, Bureau of Plant and Apiary Inspection, Post Office 

Box 147100, Gainesville, Florida 32614-7100. 

(2) Cancellation. Cotton Boll Wweevil Ccertificates 

(FDACS-08162, Rev. 05/20, incorporated into rule 5B-52.011) 

issued for the movement of Rregulated articles shall be 

withdrawn or cancelled and further issuance of Bboll weevil 

certificates for the movement of such articles shall be refused 

by the Ddepartment when it is determined that further use of 

such certificates could result in the spread of Bboll weevil. 

(3) Attachment. When offered for movement, the container 

of Rregulated articles or, if there is no container, the article 

itself shall be required to have an authenticated Cotton Bboll 

Wweevil Ccertificate (FDACS-08162 Rev. 05/20, incorporated 

into rule 5B-52.011) securely attached. 

Rulemaking Authority 570.07(23), 593.103(2) FS. Law Implemented 

581.031(7), (26), 593.103(7) FS. History–New 12-21-87, Amended 7-

5-95, 6-20-00,                .                     

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: Dr. 

Greg Hodges, Assistant Director, Division of Plant Industry 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Nicole “Nikki” Fried, Commissioner of 

Agriculture 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: June 20, 2020 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: June 23, 2020 

Section III 

Notice of Changes, Corrections and 

Withdrawals 

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

33-601.260 Administrative Management Units 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 46 No. 71, April 10, 

2020 issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

Forms incorporated in paragraph (4)(c) of this rule were 

amended as follows in response to comments received from the 

Joint Administrative Procedures Committee: 

 

The footer on Form DC6-233D was amended to state that the form 

is incorporated by reference in Rule 33-601.260, F.A.C., the first 

checkbox under “Reasons:” was amended to state “institutional 

maladjustment,” and the third checkbox under “Reasons:” was 

amended to read, “Two or more disciplinary reports for drug-

related behavior as described in Rule 33-601.314, F.A.C.” 

 

The footer on Form DC6-265D was amended to state that the form 

is incorporated by reference in Rule 33-601.260, F.A.C., and all 

attestation language was removed from the form. 

 

In addition to the foregoing, a number of technical changes 

relating to formatting, grammar, and clarity were made to both 

forms. 

Section IV 

Emergency Rules 

NONE 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=33
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=33-601.260


Florida Administrative Register Volume 46, Number 137, July 15, 2020 

 

2749 

 

Section V 

Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Rule 

Variance or Waiver 

DEPARTMENT OF LAW ENFORCEMENT 

Criminal Justice Standards and Training Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

11B-35.0024 Student Performance in Commission-approved 

High-Liability Basic Recruit Training Courses and Instructor 

Training Courses Requiring Proficiency Demonstration 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on July 10, 2020, the 

Department of Law Enforcement, received a petition for 

permanent waiver of paragraph 11B-35.0024(2)(a), F.A.C., 

from C. Nicole Taylor, Training Center Director for the Florida 

Corrections Academy (School #66, Florida Department of 

Corrections. Petitioner wishes to permanently waive that 

portion of the Rule that states: A basic recruit student shall be 

given the opportunity for one additional attempt at the required 

demonstration of proficiency skill(s), or one re-examination of 

required written end-of-course examination in DUI Traffic 

Stops and each of the four high-liability topics of firearms, 

vehicle operations, defensive tactics, and first aid. A basic 

recruit student, who has failed to pass the written end-of-course 

examination or the required demonstration of the proficiency 

skill(s) after a second attempt, shall be deemed to have failed 

the training course. 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained 

by contacting: Dana Kelly, Agency Clerk, Florida Department 

of Law Enforcement, P.O. Box 1489 Tallahassee, FL, 32302 or 

by telephone at (850)410-7676. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Clinical Laboratory Personnel 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

64B3-5.002 Supervisor 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on June 23, 2020, the Board 

of Clinical Laboratory Personnel, received a petition for 

variance and waiver submitted by Ahmad Al-Attar. Petitioner 

is seeking a variance or waiver of Rule 64B3-5.002, F.A.C., 

which sets forth the education, training/experience and 

examination requirements for a licensure as a supervisor. 

Comments on the petition should be filed with the Board of 

Clinical Laboratory Personnel, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin # 

C07, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3257, telephone: (850)488-

0595, or by electronic mail – Anthony.Spivey@flhealth.gov, 

within 14 days of publication of this notice. 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained 

by contacting: Anthony B. Spivey, Executive Director, Board 

of Clinical Laboratory Personnel, at the above address. 

Section VI 

Notice of Meetings, Workshops and Public 

Hearings 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Licensing 

The Private Investigation, Recovery and Security Advisory 

Council announces a public meeting to which all persons are 

invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Friday, August 7, 2020, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Call-in: 1(877)568-4106, Access Code 350-548-509 

Join from a video-conferencing room or system. 

Dial in or type: 67.217.95.2 or inroomlink.goto.com. 

Meeting ID: 350 548 509 or dial directly: 

350548509@67.217.95.2 or 67.217.95.2##350548509 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: This 

notice is to move the physical meeting noticed on 10/1/2019, 

Vol. 45/191, Notice #22438154 to a conference call. This is the 

quarterly meeting of the Council pursuant to the requirement of 

subsection 493.6104(4), Florida Statutes. The Council will 

conduct a general business meeting. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Stefannie 

Corbett at Stefannie.Corbett@FDACS.gov. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Stefannie Corbett at 

Stefannie.Corbett@FDACS.gov. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Stefannie Corbett at 

Stefannie.Corbett@FDACS.gov or by phone at (850)245-5443. 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

Florida School for the Deaf and the Blind 

The Florida School for the Deaf and the Blind (FSDB) 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Friday, July 24, 2020, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: This will be a virtual meeting of which details on 

public access to the meeting will be shared on the FSDB 

website www.fsdbk12.org. 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The 

Board will consider applications of individuals who have met 

the minimum qualifications for the position of the President at 

the Florida School for the Deaf and the Blind. The Board will 

determine which applicants will be considered to move forward 

in the process. The Board will also discuss interview questions 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=11
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=20
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=11B-35.0024
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=322
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B3-5.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=756
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=208


Florida Administrative Register Volume 46, Number 137, July 15, 2020 

 

2750 

and possible dates that interviews will take scheduled. 

PLEASE NOTE: This meeting will be a VIRTUAL (online) 

meeting, and details for public access will be made available on 

the FSDB website www.fsdbk12.org by Thursday, July 23, 

2020. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Cindy 

Brueckner, Executive Assistant to the President and the Board 

of Trustees, by email at bruecknerc@fsdbk12.org or by phone 

at (904)827-2210. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 72 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Cindy Brueckner, Executive Assistant to the 

President, by email at bruecknerc@fsdbk12.org. Please Note: 

American Sign Language Interpreters will be present during the 

virtual meeting, and Communication Access Real-time services 

(CART) will be provided to assist with the communication 

needs for the Deaf Community. Please remember to turn on 

Closed captions while watching the online meeting. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Cindy Brueckner, 

Executive Assistant to the President and the Board of Trustees, 

by email at bruecknerc@fsdbk12.org or by phone at (904)827-

2210. 

DEPARTMENT OF MANAGEMENT SERVICES 

The Florida E911 Board announces a telephone conference call 

to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: August 12, 2020, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Teleconference number: 1(877)309-2073, Conference 

room: 931-659-037 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

General Business 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Leon 

Simmonds, (850)921-0041. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Leon Simmonds, (850)921-0041. If you are hearing 

or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Leon Simmonds, 

(850)921-0041. 

DEPARTMENT OF MANAGEMENT SERVICES 

The Florida E911 Board announces a telephone conference call 

to which all persons are invited. 

DATES AND TIMES: September 16, 2020, 9:00 a.m.; 

September 17, 2020, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Teleconference number: 1(877)309-2073, Conference 

room: 931-659-037 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

General Business, State Grants 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Leon 

Simmonds, (850)921-0041. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Leon Simmonds, (850)921-0041. If you are hearing 

or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Leon Simmonds, 

(850)921-0041. 

DEPARTMENT OF MANAGEMENT SERVICES 

Division of Purchasing 

The Department of Management Services announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: July 28, 2020, 10:01 a.m. Eastern Time 

PLACE: Public Opening, Members of the public to dial in: 

Conference call number: 888-585-9008, Conference room 

number: 582-904-411 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: In 

accordance with section 120.525, Florida Statutes, a bid 

opening is hereby noticed for the Clothing: Purchase, Rental 

and Cleaning Request for Proposals, No. 08-53100000-F. 

The Department reserves the right to issue amendments, 

addenda, and changes to the timeline and specifically to the 

meeting notice listed above. The Department will post notice of 

any changes or additional meetings within the Vendor Bid 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=60
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=60
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=60
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=220


Florida Administrative Register Volume 46, Number 137, July 15, 2020 

 

2751 

 

System (VBS) in accordance with subsection 287.042(3), 

Florida Statutes, and will not re-advertise notice in the Florida 

Administrative Register (FAR). Access the VBS at: 

http://vbs.dms.state.fl.us/vbs/main_menu.  

To obtain a copy of the RFP timeline you may contact the 

Procurement Officer, Catherine Sanders at 

Catherine.Sanders@mydms.fl.gov. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: To obtain 

a copy of the agenda you may contact the Procurement Officer, 

Catherine Sanders at Catherine.Sanders@mydms.fl.gov. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Department of Management Services' ADA 

coordinator at: ada.coordinator@mydms.fl.gov. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: You may contact the 

Procurement Officer, Catherine Sanders at 

Catherine.Sanders@mydms.fl.gov. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Pharmacy 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

64B16-31.007 Collaborative Practice Certification: Chronic 

Health Conditions. 

64B16-31.039 Test and Treat Certification: Formulary of 

Medicinal Drugs. 

The Board of Pharmacy Rules Committee announces a 

workshop to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, July 29, 9:00 a.m. ET, or as 

soon thereafter as can be heard. 

PLACE: 1(888)585-9008, Participant Code: 599-196-982. 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The 

purpose of the workshop is to discuss the implementation of 

Chapter 2020-7 (House Bill 389) and the proposed text of Rules 

64B16-31.007 and 64B16-31.039, F.A.C. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Jessica 

Sapp, Executive Director, Board of Pharmacy, 4052 Bald 

Cypress Way, Bin #C08, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3254 or 

(850)245-4474. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least five days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Jessica Sapp, Executive Director, Board of 

Pharmacy, at the address/telephone number listed above. If you 

are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES 

The Department of Children & Families announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: July 16, 2020, 10:00 a.m. – 11:30 a.m. ET 

PLACE: Via Teams, Email Shalunda Turo at 

Shalunda.Turo@myflfamilies.com 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The 

Department of Children and Families, Circuit 2 Community 

Alliance provides a forum for providers and the Community to 

identify needs and gaps in services in order to improve the lives 

of children and families in the Big Bend area which covers 

Franklin, Gadsden, Jefferson, Leon, Liberty and Wakulla 

Counties. Agenda: Department of Children and Families 

Update, Big Bend Community Based Care Update, Mental 

Health Governing Council Update, Assisted Living Facilities 

Update. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: A copy 

of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Jeanna Olson, 

Circuit 2 & 14 Community Development Administrator, at 

(850)921-8269 or at jeanna.olson@myflfamilies.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Jeanna Olson, Circuit 2 & 14 Community 

Development Administrator, at (850)921-8269 or at 

jeanna.olson@myflfamilies.com. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Jeanna Olson, Circuit 

2 & 14 Community Development Administrator, at (850)921-

8269 or at jeanna.olson@myflfamilies.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Jeanna Olson, Circuit 2 & 14 Community 

Development Administrator, at (850)921-8269 or at 

jeanna.olson@myflfamilies.com. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Jeanna Olson, Circuit 

2 & 14 Community Development Administrator, at (850)921-

8269 or at jeanna.olson@myflfamilies.com. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=307
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B16-31.007
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B16-31.039
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65


Florida Administrative Register Volume 46, Number 137, July 15, 2020 

 

2752 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

Division of Strategic Business Development 

The Florida Department of Economic Opportunity announces a 

public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: July 21, 2020, 2:00 p.m. – 4:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Conference Call Information: US (Toll Free): 

1(866)899-4679 or (not toll free) (224)501-3318, Access Code: 

155-563-757. Using GoToMeeting from a computer, tablet or 

smartphone: New to GoToMeeting? Get the app now and be 

ready when your first meeting starts: 

https://global.gotomeeting.com/install/155563757 Use this link 

to join the meeting from your computer, tablet or smartphone 

at: https://global.gotomeeting.com/join/155563757. Or, join 

from a video-conferencing room or system. Type in your web 

browser: 67.217.95.2or inroomlink.goto.com; meeting ID: 155 

563 757. Or dial directly: 155563757@67.217.95.2 or 

67.217.95.2##155563757. *Note: One may need to create an 

account or login. 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The 

Florida Talent Development Council. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Nicole 

Duque (850)717-8980. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Nicole Duque (850)717-8980. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Nicole Duque 

(850)717-8980. 

MOFFITT CANCER CENTER & RESEARCH INSTITUTE 

The H. Lee Moffitt Cancer Center & Research Institute 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: July 15, 2020, 3:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Clinical Support Building, 8th floor, 8112 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

conduct the general business of the Joint Finance & Planning 

Committee. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Kathy 

McKinley, Administration, Moffitt Cancer Center, 12902 

Magnolia Drive, CSB-8th Floor, Tampa, FL 33612. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 24 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Kathy McKinley. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

HANSON PROFESSIONAL SERVICES, INC. 

The Florida Department of Transportation (FDOT), District 

Four announces a workshop to which all persons are invited. 

DATES AND TIMES: Online Alternatives Public Workshop, 

Wednesday, July 22, 2020, 5:00 p.m. – 6:30 p.m.; Virtual Open 

House, Monday, July 20, 2020 – Friday, July 31, 2020 

PLACE: Online Alternatives Public Workshop, July 22, 2020, 

5:00 p.m., https://bit.ly/2VfYi0R 

Virtual Open House, July 20, 2020 – July 31, 2020, 

www.fdot.gov/projects/95atWoolbright 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The 

Florida Department of Transportation (FDOT), District Four, 

will conduct an Online Alternatives Public Workshop for SR 

9/I-95 from South of Woolbright Road to North of Woolbright 

Road in Palm Beach County, Florida. The purpose of this study 

is to address traffic spillback onto I-95 and improve interchange 

operations and safety through the 2045 design year horizon. 

The purpose of this workshop is to give interested persons an 

opportunity to comment and provide input on the transportation 

improvement alternatives the Department has developed at this 

point in the study. Maps, drawings, and other project 

information will be available for review. Comments can be 

submitted on the project website, by mail sending them to 

Humberto Arrieta, PE, FDOT Project Manager, 3400 West 

Commercial Boulevard, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309, or by 

email at humberto.arrieta@dot.state.fl.us. 

Due to the State of Emergency declared by Governor DeSantis 

in Executive Order 20-52 as a result of the COVID-19 

pandemic, this meeting is authorized to be held virtually and not 

in-person. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Humberto 

Arrieta, PE, Project Manager, Florida Department of 

Transportation, District Four, 3400 West Commercial 

Boulevard, Fort Lauderdale, Florida 33309, or 

humberto.arrieta@dot.state.fl.us. 

Public participation is solicited without regard to race, color, 

national origin, age, sex, religion, disability or family status. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Humberto Arrieta, PE at (954)777-4152 or toll free 

at 1(866)336-8435, ext. 4152 or by email at 

humberto.arrieta@dot.state.fl.us. Any persons who require 

translation services (free of charge) should also contact Mr. 

Humberto Arrieta, PE seven (7) days before the meeting. If you 

are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1064
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=579
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1252


Florida Administrative Register Volume 46, Number 137, July 15, 2020 

 

2753 

 

For more information, you may contact: Humberto Arrieta, PE, 

Florida Department of Transportation, District Four, 3400 West 

Commercial Boulevard, Fort Lauderdale, Florida 33309, by 

telephone (954)777-4152 or toll free at 1(866)336-8435, ext. 

4152 or by email at humberto.arrieta@dot.state.fl.us. You may 

also visit the project website at 

www.fdot.gov/projects/95atwoolbright.com. 

Section VII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Declaratory Statements 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Nursing 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Board of Nursing has 

received the petition for declaratory statement from Ivonne 

Johnson, DNP, APRN, ANP-C, PNP-C, filed on July 14, 

2020.The petition seeks the agency's opinion as to the 

applicability of Section 456.51, F.S. as it applies to the 

petitioner. 

The Petitioner seeks a Declaratory Statement from the Board. 

Petitioner is seeking a more detailed definition of a “pelvic 

examination” and whether furnishing advanced practice 

nursing care or treatment involving any of the referenced body 

parts constitutes a “pelvic examination.” Except for good cause 

shown, motions for leave to intervene must be filed within 21 

days after the publication of this notice. 

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be 

obtained by contacting: Joe R. Baker, Jr., Executive Director, 

Board of Nursing, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C02, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399, info@floridasnursing.gov, or by 

telephone at (850)245-4125.  

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Nursing 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Board of Nursing has 

received the petition for declaratory statement from Lisa J. 

Brown, D.N.P., Allison Mott, B.S.N., and Emmylou Urian, 

M.S.N., filed on July 14, 2020.The petition seeks the agency's 

opinion as to the applicability of Section 456.51, F.S. as it 

applies to the petitioner. 

The Petitioner seeks a Declaratory Statement from the Board. 

Petitioners are seeking a more detailed definition of a “pelvic 

examination” and whether furnishing nursing care or treatment 

involving any of the referenced body parts constitutes a “pelvic 

examination.” Except for good cause shown, motions for leave 

to intervene must be filed within 21 days after the publication 

of this notice. 

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be 

obtained by contacting: Joe R. Baker, Jr., Executive Director, 

Board of Nursing, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C02, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399, info@floridasnursing.gov, or by 

telephone at (850)245-4125. 

Section VIII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding the Validity of Rules 

Notice of Petition for Administrative Determination has been 

filed with the Division of Administrative Hearings on the 

following rules: 

NONE 

Notice of Disposition of Petition for Administrative 

Determination has been filed with the Division of 

Administrative Hearings on the following rules: 

NONE 

Section IX 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Non-rule Policy Challenges 

NONE 

Section X 

Announcements and Objection Reports of 

the Joint Administrative Procedures 

Committee 

NONE 

Section XI 

Notices Regarding Bids, Proposals and 

Purchasing 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER 

SERVICES 

Division of Agricultural Water Policy 

Solicitation for Agricultural Best Management Practices 

Research Projects 

The advertisement below is an update to that which was 

published in the FAR on July 9, 2020. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=332
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=332
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=173


Florida Administrative Register Volume 46, Number 137, July 15, 2020 

 

2754 

The Florida Department of Agriculture and Consumer Services 

(FDACS), Office of Agricultural Water Policy (OAWP) 

announces a general solicitation to obtain fiscal year 2021/2022 

proposals for agricultural best management practices (BMP) 

research projects related to the OAWP BMP program to further 

reduce nutrient loadings to surface and ground waters and to 

conserve water used for irrigation. A guide for Principal 

Investigators who are submitting proposals can be obtained at 

https://www.fdacs.gov/Agriculture-

Industry/Water/Agricultural-Best-Management-

Practices/BMP-Research. 

 Proposals should include a water quality monitoring 

component. There is no funding cap; however, proposals must 

be a prudent expenditure of state funding, and funding is subject 

to annual appropriations by the Legislature. A detailed budget 

must be included with the proposal. All proposals are due to 

OAWP by August 1, 2020. Projects submitted by August 1, 

2020 and approved by OAWP will receive funding for fiscal 

year 2021/2022 (starting July 1, 2021). 

OAWP research priorities include: 

·       Controlled release fertilizer (CRF) – Evaluate CRF use 

efficiency related to seasonality, rainfall, and heat units in 

Florida for various commodities.  

·       Fertilizer rates (agronomic rates) – Current application 

rate recommendations require regular re-evaluation and 

updating. Proposals should identify opportunities to improve 

rate recommendations that balance production with water 

resource protection and, where possible, integrate rate 

recommendations with the implementation of other best 

management practices.  

·       Demonstrations of water quality improvements – Conduct 

demonstration projects that provide information on BMP 

benefits to water resources. 

·       Multiple cropping systems cover crops (in coordination 

with Southern Sustainable Agriculture Research and Education, 

or alternative crops – Evaluate use to reduce nitrogen leaching 

in high-recharge and excessively drained springs recharge 

areas. 

·       Legacy phosphorus – Evaluate impacts of legacy 

phosphorus on water quality. Evaluate opportunities to address 

legacy phosphorus impacts. 

·       Evaluate Mehlich-3 (M-3) – Evaluate M-3 soil test 

requirement. M-3 may indicate that there is plenty of P in the 

soil, but tissue analyses show plant P deficiency. P may be in a 

form that is not available to the plant. 

·       Organic production – Identify use and impacts on irrigated 

lands.  

·       On-farm water treatment technologies – Evaluate and pilot 

nutrient reduction technologies and practices for on-farm or 

edge-of-farm application. 

This solicitation is in response to Senate Bill (SB) 712 which 

was passed during the 2020 legislative session. Funding is 

limited to universities and state colleges with established 

agricultural programs. Any external party must partner with one 

of those institutions on a project to be eligible for funding 

consideration. OAWP will evaluate, analyze and utilize 

accepted proposals to develop a research plan and legislative 

budget request as required by SB 712. The research plan will 

help guide OAWP in decisions related to critical research work 

in furtherance of the OAWP BMP program. Research proposals 

outside of OAWP’s statutory authority will not be eligible for 

funding related to this solicitation. 

CONDITIONS AND SPECIFICATIONS 

Prospective contractors must be registered in the 

MyFloridaMarketPlace (MFMP) system and where required, 

the Sunbiz system prior to submittal. Business entities which 

must be on file with Sunbiz include the following:  

Corporations for and not for profit, Limited Liability 

Companies (LLC), Limited Partnerships (LP) including 

Limited Liability Limited Partnerships (LLLP), and 

organizations doing business under a fictitious name (DBA). 

Prospective contractors may not be considered for an award if 

they are not associated with a land grant university, or a 

qualified entity registered in the MFMP and Sunbiz system. The 

registration address and federal employer identification (FEID) 

number must match that registered with the State of Florida. 

QUALIFICATIONS OF PROJECT PERSONNEL AND 

PROJECT MANAGEMENT  

Prospective contractors must be able to demonstrate the 

following: 

1) Academic credentials, performance record, and potential for 

completing the project; 

2) Understanding of the OAWP agricultural BMP program and 

purpose; 

3) Institutional experience and competence in the proposed 

study area; 

4) Ability to obtain support personnel, facilities, and 

instrumentation; 

5) Planning and administration skills needed to complete the 

proposed project, including the dissemination of information 

over the duration of the project; and 

6) Each prospective contractor must provide a minimum of 

three (3) references for similar projects completed. 

QUESTIONS AND PROPOSALS 

Direct questions and proposals to: Kathryn Holland 

(Kathryn.Holland@FDACS.gov), Environmental Consultant, 

Office of Agricultural Water Policy, Florida Department of 

Agriculture and Consumer Services, Elliot Building, 401 S. 

Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)617-1736. 

https://www.fdacs.gov/Agriculture-Industry/Water/Agricultural-Best-Management-Practices/BMP-Research
https://www.fdacs.gov/Agriculture-Industry/Water/Agricultural-Best-Management-Practices/BMP-Research
https://www.fdacs.gov/Agriculture-Industry/Water/Agricultural-Best-Management-Practices/BMP-Research


Florida Administrative Register Volume 46, Number 137, July 15, 2020 

 

2755 

 

Section XII 

Miscellaneous 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

Index of Administrative Rules Filed with the Secretary of State 

Pursuant to subparagraph 120.55(1)(b)6. – 7., F.S., the below 

list of rules were filed in the Office of the Secretary of State 

between 3:00 p.m., Wednesday, July 8, 2020 and 3:00 p.m., 

Tuesday, July 14, 2020.  

Rule No. File Date Effective  

Date 

33-208.101 7/14/2020 8/3/2020 

53ER20-60 7/9/2020 7/9/2020 

61G1ER20-8 7/13/2020 7/13/2020 

61G1ER20-9 7/13/2020 7/13/2020 

61G3-21.009 7/10/2020 7/30/2020 

62B-33.002 7/9/2020 7/29/2020 

64B12-16.003 7/10/2020 7/30/2020 

LIST OF RULES AWAITING  

EPA APPROVAL PURSUANT TO  

SECTION 373.4146 (2), FLORIDA STATUTES 

Rule No. File Date Effective  

Date 

62-330.050 6/26/2020 **/**/**** 

62-330.060 6/26/2020 **/**/**** 

62-330.090 6/26/2020 **/**/**** 

62-330.201 6/26/2020 **/**/**** 

62-330.340 6/26/2020 **/**/**** 

62-330.402 6/26/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.020 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.030 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.040 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.050 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.070 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.100 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.130 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.140 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.211 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.212 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.213 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.214 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.218 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.219 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.220 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.221 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.222 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.223 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.224 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.227 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.228 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.233 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.234 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.235 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.236 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.237 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.238 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.239 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.241 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.243 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.244 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.245 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.246 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

62-331.247 6/11/2020 **/**/**** 

LIST OF RULES AWAITING LEGISLATIVE 

APPROVAL SECTIONS 120.541(3), 373.139(7) 

AND/OR 373.1391(6), FLORIDA STATUTES 

Rule No. File Date Effective  

Date 

60FF1-5.009 7/21/2016 **/**/**** 

60P-1.003 11/5/2019 **/**/**** 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=1


Florida Administrative Register Volume 46, Number 137, July 15, 2020 

 

2756 

60P-2.002 11/5/2019 **/**/**** 

60P-2.003 11/5/2019 **/**/**** 

64B8-10.003 12/9/2015 **/**/**** 

 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

Notice of Florida Building Code Binding Interpretation 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT the Binding 

Interpretation Panel has issued a binding interpretation pursuant 

to Section 553.775, Florida Statutes, submitted by George 

Miles, and accepted by BOAF on June 23, 2020. The following 

is a summary of the interpretation: 

Questions: 

1. For the reroofing project described in the petition, is 

recovering an existing shingle roof as noted section 706.3, 

Florida Building Code, Existing Building, 6th Edition (2017) 

an acceptable method? 

2. Does the code restrict the ability of a homeowner to recover 

an existing shingle roof even when section 1504 is not met, due 

to the roof not being removed? 

3. Since the existing shingles are not being removed, is 

recovering allowed? 

Answers: 

1. Yes. 

2. No, subject to the criteria listed in paragraphs 1-5 in section 

706.3, Florida Building Code, Existing Building, 6th Edition 

(2017). 

3. Yes. 

A copy of the Interpretation may be obtained 

from https://floridabuilding.org/bi/bi_bind_interp_srch.aspx, o

r by contacting the Codes and Standards section at (850)487-

1824. 

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 

Office of the Secretary 

Florida State Clearinghouse 

The state is coordinating reviews of federal activities and 

federally funded projects as required by subsection 

403.061(42), F.S. This includes Outer Continental Shelf 

activities and other actions subject to federal consistency 

review under the Florida Coastal Management Program. A list 

of projects, comments and deadlines, and the address for 

providing comments, are available at: 

https://fldep.dep.state.fl.us/clearinghouse/. For information, 

call (850)717-9076. This public notice fulfills the requirements 

of 15 CFR 930. 

Section XIII 

Index to Rules Filed During Preceding 

Week 

NOTE: The above section will be published on Tuesday 

beginning October 2, 2012, unless Monday is a holiday, then it 

will be published on Wednesday of that week. 

 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001
https://floridabuilding.org/bi/bi_bind_interp_srch.aspx
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=294
https://fldep.dep.state.fl.us/clearinghouse/

