
Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 101, May 23, 2018 

 

2475 

 

Section I 

Notice of Development of Proposed Rules 

and Negotiated Rulemaking 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To open the aforementioned rule 

for development to address the statutorily required triennial 

update process. The Commission shall conduct rule 

development workshops to accept public input regarding the 

incorporation of changes to the specified model codes into the 

Florida Building Code.  

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Statutorily-mandated 

triennial update process for the Florida Building Code, 7th 

Edition (2020). 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 553.73(1), 553.73(2), 

553.73(7), 553.73(8), 553.76(1), 553.77(1), 553.901 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 553.72, 553.73(2), 553.73(3), 

553.73(7), 553.73(8), 553.73(9), 553.901 FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Mo 

Madani, Planning Manager, Department of Business and 

Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399, (850)717-1825 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Speech-Language Pathology and Audiology 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

64B20-3.0001 Fees 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The proposed new rule establishes 

the definition and criteria for fees. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: This is a new rule 

setting forth the definition and criteria for fees. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 456.025(4), 456.025(7), 

456.025(10), 456.025(11), 456.036(7), 456.036(8), 468.1145, 

468.1145(1), 468.1195(1), (2), FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.025(4), 456.025(7), 456.025(10), 

456.025(11), 456.036, 456.036(3), 456.036(4), 456.036(7), 

456.036(8), 456.065, 468.1145, 468.1195(1), 468.1145(2), 

468.1145(5), 468.1145(6), 468.1145(7), 468.1145(8), 

468.1145(9), FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Kama 

Monroe, Executive Director, Board of Speech-Language 

Pathology and Audiology, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C06, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3256, 

Kama.Monroe@flhealth.gov. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE FROM 

THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Division of Disease Control 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

64D-3.028 Definitions 

64D-3.040 Procedures for Control of Specific 

Communicable Diseases 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose and effect of amending 

these rules is to amend rule language and implement revised 

statutes. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Reporting of 

communicable diseases. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 381.0011(2), 381.003(2), 

381.0031(8), 384.33, 392.66 FS., 381.0011, 381.003(2), 

381.006(16), 384.25(2), 384.33 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 381.0011(3), 381.003(1), 381.0031, 

384.23, 392.52, 384.25, 384.27 FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Janet 

Hamilton, MPH, Bureau of Epidemiology, Florida Department 

of Health, Bin A12, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Tallahassee, FL 

32399-1720; (850)245-4401 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE FROM 

THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=553.73(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(7)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(8)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.901%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=553.72
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(7)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(8)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.73(9)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20553.901%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=312
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.0001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=456.025(4)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.025(7)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.025(10)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.025(11)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.036(7)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.036(8)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1145
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1145(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1195(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=456.025(4)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.025(7)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.025(10)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.025(11)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.036
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.036(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.036(4)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.036(7)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.036(8)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.065
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1145
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1195(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1145(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1145(5)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1145(6)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1145(7)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1145(8)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1145(9)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=334
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64D-3.028
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64D-3.040
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=381.0011(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20381.003(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20381.0031(8)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20384.33
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20392.66%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20381.0011
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20381.003(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20381.006(16)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20384.25(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20384.33%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=381.0011(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20381.003(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20381.0031
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20384.23
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20392.52
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20384.25
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20384.27%20FS.


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 101, May 23, 2018 

 

2476 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Division of Funeral, Cemetery, and Consumer Services 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

69K-5.0016 Preneed License; Financial Requirements 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The proposed rule amendment is 

intended to modify, clarify and update the language regarding 

preneed license; financial requirements. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Update rule language 

regarding preneed license; financial requirements. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 497.103 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 497.452, 497.453 FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Ellen 

Simon, Assistant Director, Division of Funeral, Cemetery, and 

Consumer Services, Department of Financial Services, 200 East 

Gaines Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0361, (850)413-

4985, Ellen.Simon@myfloridacfo.com. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE FROM 

THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE. 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Division of Funeral, Cemetery, and Consumer Services 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

69K-7.009 Reporting Requirements for Preneed 

Licensees Filing an Initial Application to 

Utilize a Letter of Credit or Surety Bond in 

Lieu of Maintaining a Trust Fund 

69K-7.010 Reporting Requirements for Preneed 

Licensees Utilizing a Surety Bond or Letter 

of Credit in Lieu of Trusting 

69K-7.012 Criteria for Filing a Surety Bond in Lieu of 

Maintaining a Trust Fund 

69K-7.0125 Alternative Form of Security for Permanent 

Outer Burial Receptacle Manufacturers 

69K-7.017 Trust Fund Deposits; Funeral and Burial 

Services and Merchandise Preneed Contract 

Payments 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The proposed rule amendments are 

intended to modify, clarify and update the language as needed 

and remove obsolete statutory references. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Rule 69K-7.009, 

F.A.C.-The amendment modifies and updates rule language as 

needed and removes the reference to a letter of credit. Rule 

69K-7.010, F.A.C.-The amendment modifies and updates rule 

language as needed and removes the reference to a letter of 

credit. Rule 69K-7.012, F.A.C.-The amendment modifies and 

updates rule language as needed and removes the reference to a 

letter of credit. Rule 69K-7.0125, F.A.C.-The amendment 

updates rule language removes statutory reference no longer in 

effect. Rule 69K-7.017, F.A.C.- The amendment updates rule 

language removes statutory reference no longer in effect. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 497.103, 497.283(2)(c), 

497.462 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 497.282(8)(d), 497.283, 

497.283(2)(c), 497.458, 497.458(1), 497.459, 497.460, 

497.462, 497.464 FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Ellen 

Simon, Assistant Director, Division of Funeral, Cemetery, and 

Consumer Services, Department of Financial Services, 200 East 

Gaines Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0361, (850)413-

4985, Ellen.Simon@myfloridacfo.com. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE FROM 

THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE. 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Division of Funeral, Cemetery, and Consumer Services 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

69K-7.0095 Preneed Trust fund; financial reports 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The proposed new rule establishes 

the criteria for the preneed trust fund financial reports required 

by paragraph 497.458(1)(k), F.S. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: This is a new rule 

setting forth the criteria for preneed trust fund financial reports. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 497.103, 497.458(1)(k) FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 497.458 FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=369
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69K-5.0016
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=497.103%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=497.452
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.453%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=369
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69K-7.009
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69K-7.010
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69K-7.012
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69K-7.0125
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69K-7.017
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=497.103
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.283(2)(c)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.462%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=497.282(8)(d)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.283
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.283(2)(c)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.458
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.458(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.459
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.460
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.462
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.464%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=369
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69K-7.0095
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=497.103
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.458(1)(k)%20%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=497.458%20FS.


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 101, May 23, 2018 

 

2477 

 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Ellen 

Simon, Assistant Director, Division of Funeral, Cemetery, and 

Consumer Services, Department of Financial Services, 200 East 

Gaines Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0361, (850)413-

4985, Ellen.Simon@myfloridacfo.com. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE FROM 

THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE. 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Division of Funeral, Cemetery, and Consumer Services 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

69K-10.003 Remittances to the Preneed Funeral Contract 

Consumer Protection Trust Fund 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The proposed rule amendment is 

intended to modify, clarify and update language regarding 

remittances to the preneed funeral contract consumer protection 

trust fund. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Update rule language 

regarding remittances to the preneed funeral contract consumer 

protection trust fund. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 497.103, 497.462(10), 

497.464 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 497.456, 497.458, 497.462, 497.464 

FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Ellen 

Simon, Assistant Director, Division of Funeral, Cemetery, and 

Consumer Services, Department of Financial Services, 200 East 

Gaines Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0361, (850)413-

4985, Ellen.Simon@myfloridacfo.com. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE FROM 

THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE. 

Section II 

Proposed Rules 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Speech-Language Pathology and Audiology 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

64B20-3.002 Application Fee 

64B20-3.004 Initial Active Status License Fee 

64B20-3.0045 Initial Active Status Assistant Certificate 

Fee 

64B20-3.005 Provisional License Fee 

64B20-3.006 Licensure by Endorsement Application Fee 

64B20-3.007 Active Status License Fee 

64B20-3.008 Active Status Assistant Certificate Fee 

64B20-3.009 Inactive Status License Fee 

64B20-3.0091 Inactive Status Assistant Certificate Fee 

64B20-3.0095 Delinquent Status License Fee 

64B20-3.0096 Delinquent Status Assistant Certificate Fee 

64B20-3.010 Inactive Status License Reactivation Fee 

64B20-3.0101 Inactive Status Assistant Certificate 

Reactivation Fee 

64B20-3.0105 Change of Status Fee 

64B20-3.011 Duplicate License Fee 

64B20-3.012 Certification of Public Record Fee 

64B20-3.013 Provider Application Fee 

64B20-3.014 Provider Renewal Fee 

64B20-3.016 Licensee or Certified Assistant Biennial 

Application Fee for Prior Approval of 

Continuing Education Activities 

64B20-3.017 Provider Biennial Application Fee for Prior 

Approval of a Continuing Education 

Activity 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The proposed rule repeal is 

intended to remove language no longer in use. 

SUMMARY: The current rules are obsolete and are being 

repealed 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION:  

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse 

impact on small business or likely increase directly or indirectly 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=369
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69K-10.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=497.103
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.462(10)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.464%20%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=497.456
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.458
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.462
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.464%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20497.464%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=312
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.004
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.0045
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.005
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.006
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.007
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.008
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.009
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.0091
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.0095
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.0096
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.010
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.0101
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.0105
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.011
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.012
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.013
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.014
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.016
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B20-3.017


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 101, May 23, 2018 

 

2478 

regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the aggregate within 

one year after the implementation of the rule. A SERC has not 

been prepared by the Agency.  

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: During discussion of the economic impact of this rule at 

its Board meeting, the Board, based upon the expertise and 

experience of its members, and the substance of the rule 

amendment, determined that a Statement of Estimated 

Regulatory Costs (SERC) was not necessary because the rule 

does not impose additional rights, obligations, or duties on any 

persons or any businesses, and that the rule will not require 

ratification by the Legislature. No person or interested party 

submitted additional information regarding the economic 

impact at that time. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 456.025(4), 456.025(7), 

456.025(10), 456.025(11), 456.036(7), 456.036(8), 468.1145, 

468.1145(1), 468.1195(1), (2), FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.025(4), 456.025(7), 456.025(10), 

456.025(11), 456.036, 456.036(3), 456.036(4), 456.036(7), 

456.036(8), 456.065, 468.1145, 468.1195(1), 468.1145(2), 

468.1145(5), 468.1145(6), 468.1145(7), 468.1145(8), 

468.1145(9), FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS 

NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Kama Monroe, Executive Director, 

Board of Speech-Language Pathology and Audiology, 4052 

Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C06, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-

3256, Kama.Monroe@flhealth.gov. 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

64B20-3.002 Application Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 468.1145(1) FS. Law Implemented 

468.1145(2) FS. History–New 3-14-91, Amended 8-21-91, 12-4-91, 5-

20-92, Formerly 21LL-3.002, 61F14-3.002, Amended 2-13-95, 

Formerly 59BB-3.002, Repealed   . 

 

64B20-3.004 Initial Active Status License Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 468.1145(1) FS. Law Implemented 456.036, 

468.1145, 456.065 FS. History–New 3-14-91, Amended 8-21-91, 

Formerly 21LL-3.004, 61F14-3.004, Amended 2-13-95, Formerly 

59BB-3.004, Amended 8-9-04, Repealed   . 

 

64B20-3.0045 Initial Active Status Assistant Certificate 

Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 468.1145 FS. Law Implemented 456.036, 

468.1145 FS. History–New 2-13-95, Formerly 59BB-3.0045, 

Repealed                  . 

 

64B20-3.005 Provisional License Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 468.1145(1) FS. Law Implemented 

468.1145(5) FS. History–New 3-14-91, Amended 8-21-91, Formerly 

21LL-3.005, 61F14-3.005, 59BB-3.005, Repealed                  . 

 

64B20-3.006 Licensure by Endorsement Application Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 468.1145(1) FS. Law Implemented 

468.1145(6) FS. History–New 3-14-91, Amended 12-4-91, Formerly 

21LL-3.006, 61F14-3.006, Amended 2-13-95, Formerly 59BB-3.006, 

Repealed                  . 

 

64B20-3.007 Active Status License Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 468.1145(1) FS. Law Implemented 456.036, 

468.1145(8) FS. History–New 3-14-91, Amended 8-21-91, Formerly 

21LL-3.007, 61F14-3.007, Amended 2-13-95, 8-17-95, Formerly 

59BB-3.007, 3-20-13, Amended 5-5-14, Repealed                  

______________. 

 

64B20-3.008 Active Status Assistant Certificate Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 468.1145(1), 468.1195(1), (2) FS. Law 

Implemented 456.036, 468.1145(7), 468.1195(1), (2) FS. History–

New 3-14-91, Amended 12-4-91, Formerly 21LL-3.008, 61F14-3.008, 

Amended 2-13-95, Formerly 59BB-3.008, Repealed 

                  . 

 

64B20-3.009 Inactive Status License Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 468.1145(1) FS. Law Implemented 456.036(3), 

468.1145(9) FS. History–New 3-14-91, Amended 12-4-91, Formerly 

21LL-3.009, 61F14-3.009, Amended 2-13-95, Formerly 59BB-3.009, 

Amended 5-5-14, Repealed                  ___. 

 

64B20-3.0091 Inactive Status Assistant Certificate Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 468.1145(1) FS. Law Implemented 456.036(3), 

468.1145(9) FS. History–New 2-13-95, Formerly 59BB-3.0091, 

Repealed                  . 

 

64B20-3.0095 Delinquent Status License Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 456.036(7) FS. Law Implemented 456.036(7) 

FS. History–New 2-13-95, Amended 8-17-95, Formerly 59BB-3.0095, 

Repealed                  . 

 

64B20-3.0096 Delinquent Status Assistant Certificate Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 456.036(7) FS. Law Implemented 456.036(7) 

FS. History–New 2-13-95, Formerly 59BB-3.0096, Repealed                  . 

 

64B20-3.010 Inactive Status License Reactivation Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 468.1145(1) FS. Law Implemented 456.036(4), 

468.1145(9) FS. History–New 3-14-91, Formerly 21LL-3.010, 61F14-

3.010, Amended 2-13-95, Formerly 59BB-3.010, Repealed                  . 

 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=456.025(4)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.025(7)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.025(10)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.025(11)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.036(7)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.036(8)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1145
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1145(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1195(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=456.025(4)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.025(7)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.025(10)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.025(11)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.036
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.036(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.036(4)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.036(7)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.036(8)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.065
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1145
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1195(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1145(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1145(5)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1145(6)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1145(7)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1145(8)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.1145(9)


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 101, May 23, 2018 

 

2479 

 

64B20-3.0101 Inactive Status Assistant Certificate 

Reactivation Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 468.1145(1) FS. Law Implemented 456.036(4), 

468.1145(9) FS. History–New 2-13-95, Formerly 59BB-3.0101, 

Repealed                  . 

 

64B20-3.0105 Change of Status Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 456.036(8) FS. Law Implemented 456.036(8) 

FS. History–New 2-13-95, Formerly 59BB-3.0105, Repealed                  . 

 

64B20-3.011 Duplicate License Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 456.025(4), (10), 468.1145(1) FS. Law 

Implemented 456.025(4), (10) FS. History–New 8-21-91, Formerly 

21LL-3.011, 61F14-3.011, 59BB-3.011, Amended 1-6-00, Repealed                  

. 

 

64B20-3.012 Certification of Public Record Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 456.025(11) FS. Law Implemented 

456.025(11) FS. History–New 8-21-91, Formerly 21LL-3.012, 61F14-

3.012, 59BB-3.012, Repealed                  . 

 

64B20-3.013 Provider Application Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 456.025(7) FS. Law Implemented 456.025(7) 

FS. History–New 2-16-92, Formerly 21LL-3.013, 61F14-3.013, 

59BB-3.013, Repealed                  . 

 

64B20-3.014 Provider Renewal Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 456.025(7) FS. Law Implemented 456.025(7) 

FS. History–New 2-16-92, Formerly 21LL-3.014, 61F14-3.014, 

59BB-3.014, Repealed                  . 

 

64B20-3.016 Licensee or Certified Assistant Biennial 

Application Fee for Prior Approval of Continuing Education 

Activities. 

Rulemaking Authority 468.1145(1) FS. Law Implemented 468.1145 

FS. History–New 11-4-93, Formerly 61F14-3.016, Amended 3-20-95, 

Formerly 59BB-3.016, Repealed                  . 

 

64B20-3.017 Provider Biennial Application Fee for Prior 

Approval of a Continuing Education Activity. 

Rulemaking Authority 456.025(7), 468.1145 FS. Law Implemented 

456.025(7), 468.1145 FS. History–New 2-13-95, Formerly 59BB-

3.017, Repealed                  . 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Board of Speech-Language Pathology and Audiology 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Board of Speech-Language Pathology and 

Audiology 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: April 18, 2018 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: November 17, 2017 

Section III 

Notice of Changes, Corrections and 

Withdrawals 

NONE 

Section IV 

Emergency Rules 

NONE 

Section V 

Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Rule 

Variance or Waiver 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-1.004 General Sanitation and Safety Requirements 

The Florida Department of Business and Professional 

Regulation, Division of Hotels and Restaurants hereby gives 

notice: 

On May 11, 2018, the Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

received a Petition for an Emergency Variance for paragraph 

61C-1.004(1)(a), Florida Administrative Code and Paragraph 

5-202.11(A), 2009 FDA Food Code from SVRK Enterprises 

LLC located in Panama City Beach. The above referenced 

F.A.C. addresses the requirement that each establishment have 

an approved plumbing system installed to transport potable 

water and wastewater. They are requesting to utilize holding 

tanks to provide potable water and to collect wastewater at the 

handwash sink and the three compartment sink. 

The Petition for this variance was published in Vol. 44/94 on 

May 14, 2018. The Order for this Petition was signed and 

approved on May 21, 2018. After a complete review of the 

variance request, the Division finds that the application of this 

Rule will create a financial hardship to the food service 

establishment. Furthermore, the Division finds that the 

Petitioner meets the burden of demonstrating that the 

underlying statute has been achieved by the Petitioner ensuring 

the wastewater holding tank for the handwash sink and the three 

compartment sink is emptied at a frequency as to not create a 

sanitary nuisance; and potable water provided must come from 

an approved source and be protected from contamination during 

handling. The Petitioner shall also ensure that the handwash 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-1.004


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 101, May 23, 2018 

 

2480 

sink and the three compartment sink is provided with hot and 

cold running water under pressure, and that the handwash sink 

is provided with soap, an approved hand drying device and a 

handwashing sign. 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be obtained 

by contacting: Daisy.Aleman@myfloridalicense.com, Division 

of Hotels and Restaurants, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-1011. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-1.004 General Sanitation and Safety Requirements 

The Florida Department of Business and Professional 

Regulation, Division of Hotels and Restaurants hereby gives 

notice: 

On May 14, 2018, the Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

received a Petition for an Emergency Variance for paragraph 

61C-1.004(1)(a), Florida Administrative Code and Paragraph 

5-202.11(A), 2009 FDA Food Code from SVRK Enterprises 

LLC located in Pier Park, Panama City Beach. The above 

referenced F.A.C. addresses the requirement that each 

establishment have an approved plumbing system installed to 

transport potable water and wastewater. They are requesting to 

utilize holding tanks to provide potable water and to collect 

wastewater at the handwash sink and the three compartment 

sink. 

The Petition for this variance was published in Vol. 44/95 on 

May 15, 2018. The Order for this Petition was signed and 

approved on May 21, 2018. After a complete review of the 

variance request, the Division finds that the application of this 

Rule will create a financial hardship to the food service 

establishment. Furthermore, the Division finds that the 

Petitioner meets the burden of demonstrating that the 

underlying statute has been achieved by the Petitioner ensuring 

the wastewater holding tank for the handwash sink and the three 

compartment sink is emptied at a frequency as to not create a 

sanitary nuisance; and potable water provided must come from 

an approved source and be protected from contamination during 

handling. The Petitioner shall also ensure that the handwash 

sink and the three compartment sink is provided with hot and 

cold running water under pressure, and that the handwash sink 

is provided with soap, an approved hand drying device and a 

handwashing sign. 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be obtained 

by contacting: Daisy.Aleman@myfloridalicense.com, Division 

of Hotels and Restaurants, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-1011. 

FLORIDA HOUSING FINANCE CORPORATION 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

67-21.003 Application and Selection Process for 

Developments 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on May 21, 2018, the 

Florida Housing Finance Corporation, received a petition for 

waiver of paragraph 67-21.003(8)(j), F.A.C., from Phoenix 

Apartments Venture, LP, requesting a permanent waiver to 

permit Petitioner to decrease the total set-aside percentage from 

100% to 95% (156 units of 164 units). 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained 

by contacting: Ana McGlamory, Corporation Clerk, Florida 

Housing Finance Corporation, 227 North Bronough Street, 

Suite 5000, Tallahassee, FL 32301-1329. The Petition has also 

been posted on Florida Housing’s website at 

floridahousing.org. Florida Housing will accept comments 

concerning the Petition for 14 days from the date of publication 

of this notice. To be considered, comments must be received on 

or before 5:00 p.m., Eastern Time, on the 14th day after 

publication of this notice at Florida Housing Finance 

Corporation, 227 North Bronough Street, Suite 5000, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32301-1329. 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

OIR – Insurance Regulation 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

69O-125.003 Unfair Discrimination Because of Travel Plans 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on May 08, 2018, the 

Florida Office of Insurance Regulation (Office), received a 

petition for from Transamerica Premier Life Insurance 

Company to extend a variance from Rule 69O-125.003, Florida 

Administrative Code. This Rule addresses the consideration of 

past and future lawful foreign travel in the issuance of certain 

types of insurance policies, including life insurance policies. 

Transamerica Premier Life Insurance Company seeks to have 

the Office issue an order extending a previously granted 

variance from Rule 69O-125.003, Florida Administrative Code, 

for an additional two years to allow it to consider future lawful 

travel to Iraq and Afghanistan. 

The Office will accept comments concerning the Petition for 14 

days after the date of publication of this notice. To be 

considered, comments must be received before 5:00 p.m. EST 

on that date. 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained 

by contacting: Jenifer Fortenberry, 

jenifer.fortenberry@floir.com, 200 East Gaines Street, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)413-4170. 

mailto:Daisy.Aleman@myfloridalicense.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-1.004
mailto:Daisy.Aleman@myfloridalicense.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=67
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=67-21.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=520
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-125.003


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 101, May 23, 2018 

 

2481 

 

Section VI 

Notice of Meetings, Workshops and Public 

Hearings 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

Division of Florida Colleges 

The Indian River State College announces a public meeting to 

which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, June 27, 2018, 10:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Treasure Coast Public Safety Training Complex, 4600 

Kirby Loop Road, Fort Pierce, FL 34981 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: This 

public meeting for the Region XI Council will provide updates 

on training classes and any other issues involving the Region. 

DEPARTMENT OF LAW ENFORCEMENT 

The Department of Law Enforcement announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, May 23, 2018, 1:00 p.m. – 

4:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Conference Call Dial In Number: Toll Free: 

1(877)309-2073, 1(571)317-3129, Access Code: 136-789-733 

Meeting Link: https://global.gotomeeting.com/join/136789733 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Items related to ongoing projects of the Missing and 

Endangered Persons Information Clearinghouse Advisory 

Board. Committees will convene on conference call at the 

following times: 

Awareness and Prevention Committee: 1:00 p.m. – 2:00 p.m. 

Response and Recovery Committee: 2:00 p.m. – 3:00 p.m. 

Communication and Technology Committee: 3:00 p.m. – 4:00 

p.m. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Craig 

Schroeder at 1(888)356-4774. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 1 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Craig Schroeder at 1(888)356-4774. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Craig Schroeder at 

1(888)356-4774. 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Driver Licenses 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

15A-5.0010 Definitions 

15A-5.002 Report of Deficit or Disorder to the Department 

15A-5.0021 Medical Review 

15A-5.0022 Administrative Hearing Procedures 

15A-5.004 Seizures 

15A-5.005 Loss of Consciousness 

15A-5.006 Cardiovascular Deficits 

15A-5.008 Deficits of Memory or Judgment 

15A-5.009 Musculoskeletal and Neuromuscular Disorders 

15A-5.010 Severe Mental Disorders 

15A-5.011 Vision Standards 

15A-5.012 Drug Addiction and Alcoholism 

The Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 13, 2018, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Cabinet Meeting Room, The Capitol, Lower Level, 

Tallahassee, Florida 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: This 

is a public meeting of the Governor and Cabinet at which the 

Executive Director of the Department of Highway Safety and 

Motor Vehicles will request approval to file for adoption Rules 

15A-5.0010, 15A.002, 15A.0021, 15A.0022, 15A.004, 

15A.005, 15A.006, 15A.008, 15A.009, 15A.010, 15A.011, 

15A.012, F.A.C. A Notice of Proposed Rule regarding the rules 

was published in the Florida Administrative Register on 

December 8, 2017 (Volume 43, Number 236), and Notices of 

Change were published on March 8, 2017 (Volume 44, Number 

47), April 9, 2018 (Volume 44, Number 69), and May 10, 2018 

(Volume 44, Number 92). The Executive Director will also 

request approval to repeal Rule 15A-5.001, F.A.C. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: the 

website of the Governor and Cabinet at 

http://www.myflorida.com/myflorida/cabinet/. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: the Governor’s Cabinet Affairs Office, (850)488-

5152. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the 

agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 

(TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

EXECUTIVE OFFICE OF THE GOVERNOR 

The Volunteer Florida Foundation announces a public meeting 

to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, June 19, 2018, 2:00 p.m. (ET) 

until all business is complete 

PLACE: Grand Hyatt Tampa Bay 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

General business. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Savannah 

Kelly, savannah@volunteerflorida.org, (850)508-1021. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=212
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=11
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.0010
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.0021
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.0022
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.004
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.005
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.006
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.008
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.009
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.010
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.011
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=15A-5.012
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=27


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 101, May 23, 2018 

 

2482 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Savannah Kelly, savannah@volunteerflorida.org, 

(850)508-1021. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please 

contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-

8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Savannah Kelly, 

savannah@volunteerflorida.org, (850)508-1021. 

EXECUTIVE OFFICE OF THE GOVERNOR 

The Volunteer Florida announces a public meeting to which all 

persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, June 20, 2018, 12:00 Noon 

(ET) until all business is complete. 

PLACE: Grand Hyatt Tampa Bay 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

General business. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Savannah 

Kelly, savannah@volunteerflorida.org, (850)508-1021. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Savannah Kelly, savannah@volunteerflorida.org, 

(850)508-1021. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please 

contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-

8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Savannah Kelly, 

savannah@volunteerflorida.org, (850)508-1021. 

EXECUTIVE OFFICE OF THE GOVERNOR 

The Volunteer Florida announces a public meeting to which all 

persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, June 21, 2018, 9:00 a.m. (ET) 

until all business is complete 

PLACE: Grand Hyatt Tampa Bay 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

General business. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Savannah 

Kelly, savannah@volunteerflorida.org, (850)508-1021. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Savannah Kelly, savannah@volunteerflorida.org, 

(850)508-1021. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please 

contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-

8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Savannah Kelly, 

savannah@volunteerflorida.org, (850)508-1021. 

METROPOLITAN PLANNING ORGANIZATIONS 

The FL Metropolitan Planning Organization Advisory Council 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 7, 2018, 9:00 a.m. – 10:30 a.m., 

Freight Committee; 10:30 a.m. – 11:30 a.m., Best Practices 

Working Group; 12:00 Noon – 2:30 p.m., Staff Directors’ 

Advisory Committee and 3:00 p.m. – 5:30 p.m., Governing 

Board 

PLACE: Hyatt Place Orlando/Lake Buena Vista, Conference 

Room, 8688 Palm Parkway, Orlando, FL 32836 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Activities related to transportation planning within and adjacent 

to metropolitan areas in Florida. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Brigitte 

Messina, (850)414-4037 or brigitte.messina@mpoac.org. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 2 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Brigitte Messina, (850)414-4037 or 

brigitte.messina@mpoac.org. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Brigitte Messina, 

(850)414-4037 or brigitte.messina@mpoac.org. 

REGIONAL UTILITY AUTHORITIES 

Tampa Bay Water - A Regional Water Supply Authority 

The Tampa Bay Water, A Regional Water Supply Authority, 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=27
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=27
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=35
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=49
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=158


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 101, May 23, 2018 

 

2483 

 

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, May 29, 2018, 9:30 a.m. 

(previously noticed for 10:00 a.m.) 

PLACE: Tampa Bay Water Administrative Offices, 2575 

Enterprise Road, Clearwater, Florida 33763 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Executive Committee Meeting. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Records 

Department, (727)796-2355. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Records Department, (727)796-2355. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Records Department, 

(727)796-2355. 

DEPARTMENT OF ELDER AFFAIRS 

Division of Volunteer and Community Services 

The Department of Elder Affairs announces a telephone 

conference call to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: May 29, 2018, 9:30 a.m. – 10:30 a.m. 

PLACE: Conference Call 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The 

Alzheimer’s Disease Advisory Committee, composed of 10 

members to be selected by the Governor, advises the 

Department of Elder Affairs in the performance of its duties 

regarding legislative, programmatic, and administrative matters 

that relate to Alzheimer’s disease victims and their caretakers. 

Conference call in number 1(888)670-3525, The participant 

pass code is 64999 27145 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Pete 

Cohen cohenp@elderaffairs.org. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Pete Cohen cohenp@elderaffairs.org. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the 

Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-

8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Pete Cohen 

cohenp@elderaffairs.org. 

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 

The Florida Department of Environmental Protection, Florida 

Coastal Office announces a public meeting to which all persons 

are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, June 20, 2018, 6:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Guana Tolomato Matanzas National Estuarine 

Research Reserve (GTMNERR), Marineland Office, 9741 

Ocean Shore Blvd, St. Augustine, FL 32080 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The 

Management Advisory Group for GTMNERR will hold a 

meeting to provide advisory input for the management of 

GTMNERR. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Brooke 

Ellis by email: Brooke.L.Ellis@FloridaDEP.gov or by phone: 

(904)823-4500. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Brooke Ellis at (904)823-4500. If you are hearing 

or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Dentistry 

The Board of Dentistry announces a public meeting to which 

all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: August 23, 2018, 3:30 p.m., ET 

PLACE: Crown Plaza Tampa Westshore, 5303 West Kennedy 

Boulevard, Tampa, FL 33609, 1(813)289-1950 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Anesthesia Committee Meeting. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

www.floridasdentistry.gov. If any person decides to appeal any 

decision made by the Board with respect to any matter 

considered at this meeting, he/she will need to ensure that a 

verbatim record of the proceeding is made, which record 

includes the testimony and evidence upon which the appeal is 

to be made. Those who are hearing impaired, using TDD 

equipment can call the Florida Telephone Relay System at 

1(800)955-8771. Persons requiring special accommodations 

due to disability or physical impairment should contact the 

Board Office at (850)245-4474. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Dentistry 

The Board of Dentistry announces a public meeting to which 

all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: August 23, 2018, 1:00 p.m., ET 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=58
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=530
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=328
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=328


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 101, May 23, 2018 

 

2484 

PLACE: Crown Plaza Tampa Westshore, 5303 West Kennedy 

Boulevard, Tampa, FL 33609, 1(813) 289-1950 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

conduct a Rules Committee Meeting. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

www.floridasdentistry.gov. If any person decides to appeal any 

decision made by the Board with respect to any matter 

considered at this meeting, he/she will need to ensure that a 

verbatim record of the proceeding is made, which record 

includes the testimony and evidence upon which the appeal is 

to be made. Those who are hearing impaired, using TDD 

equipment can call the Florida Telephone Relay System at 

1(800)955-8771. Persons requiring special accommodations 

due to disability or physical impairment should contact the 

Board Office at (850)245-4474. 

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES 

The Department of Children and Families announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 5, 2018, 10:00 a.m. 

PLACE: 400 W. Robinson St., Suite S-1106F, Orlando, FL 

32801-1782, Conference Line: 1(888)670-3525, Participant 

code: 7027-6008-29 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Solicitation conference for ITB 07RA1801, Record Storage and 

Management Services. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Ben 

Nwigwe, (407)317-7537, 

Benjamin.Nwigwe@myflfamilies.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Ben Nwigwe, (407)317-7537, 

Benjamin.Nwigwe@myflfamilies.com. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board 

with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing, 

he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the 

proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and 

evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Ben Nwigwe, 

(407)317-7537, Benjamin.Nwigwe@myflfamilies.com. 

FLORIDA HOUSING FINANCE CORPORATION 

The Florida Housing Finance Corporation announces a 

workshop to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: June 14, 2018, 1:00 p.m. (Eastern) 

PLACE: The workshop will be held at the Tallahassee City Hall 

Commission Chambers, 300 S. Adams Street, Tallahassee, 

Florida 

The workshop will be accessible via telephone. 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: This 

workshop is intended to provide information on anticipated 

changes to the RFA process for the upcoming RFA cycle, as 

well as to solicit ideas and feedback on how Florida Housing 

can best implement its RFA process. Florida Housing’s goal is 

to fund the best affordable housing developments possible, 

while maintaining scoring integrity and improving efficiencies 

in the scoring process. This workshop will facilitate discussion 

and interaction with the objective that together we continue to 

improve on the application and scoring process as we identify 

and fund the best affordable housing developments in Florida. 

The workshop agenda and call-in instructions will be available 

prior to the workshop. An announcement will be issued via the 

Florida Housing ListServ when this information is available. 

For more information, you may contact: Marisa Button, 

(850)488-4197. 

Section VII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Declaratory Statements 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Division of Workers’ Compensation 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Department of Financial 

Services, Division of Workers’ Compensation, has issued an 

order disposing of the petition for declaratory statement filed by 

Jessup, Inc. on May 21, 2018.  The following is a summary of 

the agency’s disposition of the petition: 

On May 21, 2018, the Department issued a Final Order on the 

Petition for Declaratory Statement.  The Department 

determined the Petitioner may deem providers that comply with 

the provisions of paragraphs 5.A., 5.B., 5.C., 5.D., and 5.E. of 

the Petition to be independent contractors and not employees 

under Chapter 440, Florida Statutes. 

A copy of the Final Order on Petition for Declaratory Statement 

may be obtained by contacting: Thomas Nemecek, Supervising 

Attorney, Office of the General Counsel, 200 E. Gaines Street, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0333, (850)413-1606, 

email:Thomas.Nemecek@myfloridacfo.com. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=67
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=370
mailto:Thomas.Nemecek@myfloridacfo.com


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 101, May 23, 2018 

 

2485 

 

Section VIII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding the Validity of Rules 

Notice of Petition for Administrative Determination has been 

filed with the Division of Administrative Hearings on the 

following rules: 

NONE 

Notice of Disposition of Petition for Administrative 

Determination has been filed with the Division of 

Administrative Hearings on the following rules: 

NONE 

Section IX 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Non-rule Policy Challenges 

NONE 

Section X 

Announcements and Objection Reports of 

the Joint Administrative Procedures 

Committee 

NONE 

Section XI 

Notices Regarding Bids, Proposals and 

Purchasing 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

University of Central Florida 

Building Systems Commissioning 

NOTICE TO PROFESSIONALS 

The University of Central Florida has a need for several firms 

to provide building systems commissioning professional 

services for utility operations, maintenance, improvement, 

renovation, and construction project interconnection of 

$2,000,000, or studies for which the fee for professional 

services is less than $200,000.  

The University of Central Florida wishes to enter into an open-

ended contract with multiple companies for a period of one 

year, with an option to renew for three additional one-year 

periods.  The University has the right to amend the terms of the 

contract at each annual renewal. All firms applying must be 

licensed in the State of Florida by the Florida Department of 

Business and Professional Regulation at the time of application 

and, if a Corporation, registered to operate in the State of 

Florida by the Department of State, Division of Corporations.  

Blanket professional liability insurance will be required in the 

amount of $2,000,000 and will be provided as a part of Basic 

Services. 

New construction, expansion and renovation projects will take 

place in research, academic, office, public assembly, stadium, 

and industrial utility generation environments, often requiring 

commissioning activities to take place during weekends, after 

hours, or through multiple shifts to minimize impact to the 

campus operations. 

Carefully review the Professional Services Contract posted on 

our website with this advertisement at www.fp.ucf.edu. 

Submitting a proposal for this project constitutes complete 

agreement with, and acceptance of, the terms and conditions 

contained within these documents.  

Instructions for submitting a proposal can be found on the 

Project Fact Sheet. The Project Fact Sheet and PQS Form may 

be obtained on our website www.fp.ucf.edu or by contacting:  

Gina Seabrook, Email: gina.seabrook@ucf.edu, Phone: 

(407)823-5894. 

We are accepting only electronic submissions, to be uploaded 

at: 

https://ucf.bonfirehub.com/opportunities/8431 

Submittals must be received by 5:00 p.m. local time June 22, 

2018. Late submissions or additional documentation will not be 

accepted. 

Section XII 

Miscellaneous 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

Index of Administrative Rules Filed with the Secretary of State 

Pursuant to Section 120.55(1)(b)6. – 7., F.S., the below list of 

rules were filed in the Office of the Secretary of State between 

3:00 p.m., Wednesday, May 16, 2018 and 3:00 p.m., Tuesday, 

May 22, 2018.  

Rule No. File Date Effective  

Date 

1T-1.036 5/16/2018 6/5/2018 

1T-1.040 5/16/2018 6/5/2018 

12AER18-01 5/17/2018 5/17/2018 

12AER18-02 5/17/2018 5/17/2018 

12BER18-03 5/17/2018 5/17/2018 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=205
https://ucf.bonfirehub.com/opportunities/8431
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=1


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 101, May 23, 2018 

 

2486 

42SS-1.002 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

42QQQ-1.001 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

42QQQ-1.002 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

42QQQ-1.003 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

42RRR-1.001 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

42RRR-1.002 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

42RRR-1.003 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

53ER18-21 5/17/2018 5/17/2018 

53ER18-22 5/17/2018 5/17/2018 

53ER18-23 5/17/2018 5/17/2018 

53ER18-24 5/17/2018 5/17/2018 

59G-13.070 5/21/2018 6/10/2018 

59G-13.081 5/21/2018 6/10/2018 

61J1-2.001 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

61J1-2.002 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

64B16-27.450 5/16/2018 6/5/2018 

64B16-28.100 5/16/2018 6/5/2018 

64B16-28.501 5/16/2018 6/5/2018 

64B33-2.001 5/16/2018 6/5/2018 

73A-1.001 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.002 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.003 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.004 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.005 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.006 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.007 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.008 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.009 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.010 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.011 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.012 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.013 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.014 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

73A-1.015 5/22/2018 6/11/2018 

LIST OF RULES AWAITING LEGISLATIVE 

APPROVAL SECTIONS 120.541(3), 373.139(7) 

AND/OR 373.1391(6), FLORIDA STATUTES 

Rule No. File Date Effective  

Date 

60FF1-5.009 7/21/2016 **/**/**** 

64B8-10.003 12/9/2015 **/**/**** 

69L-7.020 12/15/2017 **/**/**** 

69L-7.501 12/15/2017 **/**/**** 

 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Motor Vehicles 

Clifton Warning d/b/a Scooter King Motorsports for the 

establishment of GEEL motorcycles 

Notice of Publication for a New Point 

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of Less 

than 300,000 Population 

Pursuant to Section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is given 

that Peace Industry Group (USA), Inc., intends to allow the 

establishment of Clifton Warning d/b/a Scooter King 

Motorsports, as a dealership for the sale of motorcycle 

manufactured by Geely Group Zhejiang Motorcycle Co., Ltd. 

(line-make GEEL) at 602 S State Street, Bunnell, (Flagler 

County), Florida 32110, on or after June 22, 2018. 

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and principal 

investor(s) of Clifton Warning d/b/a Scooter King Motorsports, 

are dealer operator(s): Cliff Warning, 602 South State Street, 

Bunnell, Florida 32164, principal investor(s): Cliff Warning, 

602 South State Street, Bunnell, Florida 32164. 

The notice indicates intent to establish the new point location in 

a county of less than 300,000 population, according to the latest 

population estimates of the University of Florida, Bureau of 

Economic and Business Research. 

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have standing, 

pursuant to Section 320.642, Florida Statutes, to file a petition 

or complaint protesting the application. 

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30 

days of the date of publication of this notice and must be 

submitted to: Jaime Williams, Administrator, Dealer License 

Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

Room A-312, MS65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 101, May 23, 2018 

 

2487 

 

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by US 

Mail to: Meiredith Huang, Peace Industry Group (USA), Inc., 

2885 Pacific Drive, Suite B, Norcross, Georgia 30071. 

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days of the 

date of publication, a final order will be issued by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving 

the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant’s 

compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida 

Statutes. 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Motor Vehicles 

Gulfside Motorsports LLC for the establishment of MOTV 

motorcycles 

Notice of Publication for a New Point 

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of More 

than 300,000 Population 

Pursuant to Section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is given 

that Genuine Scooters LLC, intends to allow the establishment 

of Gulfside Motorsports LLC, as a dealership for the sale of 

motorcycles manufactured by Motive Power Industry Co., Ltd. 

(line-make MOTV) at 4237 US Highway 19, New Port Richey, 

(Pasco County), Florida 34652, on or after June 22, 2018. 

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and principal 

investor(s) of Gulfside Motorsports LLC are dealer operator(s): 

Beth Tarchis, 4237 US Highway 19, New Port Richey, Florida 

34652; principal investor(s): Beth Tarchis, 4237 US Highway 

19, New Port Richey, Florida 34652. 

The notice indicates intent to establish the new point location in 

a county of more than 300,000 population, according to the 

latest population estimates of the University of Florida, Bureau 

of Economic and Business Research. 

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have standing, 

pursuant to Section 320.642, Florida Statutes, to file a petition 

or complaint protesting the application. 

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30 

days of the date of publication of this notice and must be 

submitted to: Jaime Williams, Administrator, Dealer License 

Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

Room A-312, MS65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635. 

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by US 

Mail to: Trey Duren, Genuine Scooters LLC, 2700 West Grand 

Avenue, Chicago, Illinois 60612. 

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days of the 

date of publication, a final order will be issued by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving 

the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant’s 

compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida 

Statutes. 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Motor Vehicles 

Gulfside Motorsports LLC for the establishment of NGBO 

motorcycles 

Notice of Publication for a New Point 

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of More 

than 300,000 Population 

Pursuant to Section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is given 

that Genuine Scooters, LLC, intends to allow the establishment 

of Gulfside Motorsports LLC, as a dealership for the sale of 

motorcycles manufactured by Ningbo Longjia Motorcycle Co., 

Ltd. (line-make NGBO) at 4237 US Highway 19, New Port 

Richey, (Pasco County), Florida 34652, on or after June 22, 

2018. 

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and principal 

investor(s) of Gulfside Motorsports LLC, are dealer 

operator(s): Beth Tarchis, 4237 US Highway 19, New Port 

Richey, Florida 34652; principal investor(s): Beth Tarchis, 

4237 US Highway 19, New Port Richey, Florida 34652. 

The notice indicates intent to establish the new point location in 

a county of more than 300,000 population, according to the 

latest population estimates of the University of Florida, Bureau 

of Economic and Business Research. 

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have standing, 

pursuant to Section 320.642, Florida Statutes, to file a petition 

or complaint protesting the application. 

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30 

days of the date of publication of this notice and must be 

submitted to: Jaime Williams, Administrator, Dealer License 

Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

Room A-312, MS65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635. 

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by US 

Mail to: Trey Duren, Genuine Scooters, LLC, 2700 West Grand 

Avenue, Chicago, Illinois 60612. 

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days of the 

date of publication, a final order will be issued by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving 

the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant’s 

compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida 

Statutes. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 101, May 23, 2018 

 

2488 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Motor Vehicles 

Harbor Scooters, LLC for the establishment of KYMC 

motorcycles 

Notice of Publication for a New Point 

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of Less 

than 300,000 Population 

Pursuant to Section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is given 

that Kymco USA, Inc., intends to allow the establishment of 

Harbor Scooters, LLC, as a dealership for the sale and service 

of motorcycles manufactured by Kwang Yang Motor Co., Ltd 

(line-make KYMC) at 3315 Tamiami Trail, Unit A, Punta 

Gorda, (Charlotte County), Florida 33950, on or after June 22, 

2018. 

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and principal 

investor(s) of Harbor Scooters, LLC, are dealer operator(s): 

Michael Neisser, 1035 Beckley Circle, Venice, Florida 34292, 

principal investor(s): Michael Neisser, 1035 Beckley Circle, 

Venice, Florida 34292. 

The notice indicates intent to establish the new point location in 

a county of less than 300,000 population, according to the latest 

population estimates of the University of Florida, Bureau of 

Economic and Business Research. 

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have standing, 

pursuant to Section 320.642, Florida Statutes, to file a petition 

or complaint protesting the application. 

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30 

days of the date of publication of this notice and must be 

submitted to: Jaime Williams, Administrator, Dealer License 

Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

Room A-312, MS65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635. 

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by US 

Mail to: Joe Wofford, Kymco USA, Inc., 5 Stan Perkins Road, 

Spartanburg, South Carolina, 29307. 

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days of the 

date of publication, a final order will be issued by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving 

the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant’s 

compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida 

Statutes. 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Motor Vehicles 

Jacobs Automotive Group, Inc., d/b/a Wesley Chapel 

Mitsubishi for the establishment of MITS vehicles 

Notice of Publication for a New Point 

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of More 

than 300,000 Population 

Pursuant to Section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is given 

that Mitsubishi Motors North America, Inc., intends to allow 

the establishment of Jacobs Automotive Group, Inc., d/b/a 

Wesley Chapel Mitsubishi as a dealership for the sale and 

service of Mitsubishi vehicles (line-make MITS) at See legal 

description attached as Exhibit A,  5305 Eagleston Boulevard, 

Wesley Chapel, Florida 33544. The parcel is located on the 

southwest corner of Eagleston Boulevard and Bruce B Downs 

Boulevard.  EXHIBIT A Legal Description 

A parcel of property located in unincorporated Wesley Chapel, 

Pasco County and is part of the Seven Oaks Planned 

Development identified IN OR 6178 PG 760 

THAT PORTION OF FOLLOWING DESCRIBED PARCEL 

LYING SOUTH OF ACCESS PARCEL DESCRIBED IN OR 

6178 PG 760: COM SW COR OF SW1/4 OF SECT-ION 7 TH 

N01DEG 02'29"W 1218.51 FT FOR POB TH CONT N01DEG 

02'29"W 481.09 FT TH S81DEG 27'06"E 803.44 FT TO WLY 

R/W LINE SR 581 TH ALGSAID R/W LN S13DEG 15'40"W 

186.22 FT TH S89DEG 03'19"W 315.62 FT TH S08DEG 

24'45"W 170.33 FT TH S89DEG 03'19"W 402.60 FT TO 

WEST BDY OF SW1/4OF SECTION 7 TO POB SUBJ TO & 

TOGETHER WITH ESMTS PER OR 6682 PG 1824 OR 6107 

PG Tax Parcel ID Number  07-26-20-0000-00300-0060, on or 

after April 1, 2019. 

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and principal 

investor(s) of Jacobs Automotive Group, Inc., d/b/a Wesley 

Chapel Mitsubishi are dealer operator(s): Daniel Jacobs, 355 

Coco Plum Court, Oldsmar, Florida 34677; principal 

investor(s): Daniel Jacobs, 355 Coco Plum Court, Oldsmar, 

Florida 34677. 

The notice indicates intent to establish the new point location in 

a county of more than 300,000 population, according to the 

latest population estimates of the University of Florida, Bureau 

of Economic and Business Research. 

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have standing, 

pursuant to Section 320.642, Florida Statutes, to file a petition 

or complaint protesting the application. 

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30 

days of the date of publication of this notice and must be 

submitted to: Jaime Williams, Administrator, Dealer License 

Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

Room A-312, MS65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635. 

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by US 

Mail to: Kimberly A. Mckee, Mitsubishi Motors North 

America, Inc., 8100 Mesquite Bend Drive, Irving, Texas 75063. 

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days of the 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 101, May 23, 2018 

 

2489 

 

date of publication, a final order will be issued by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving 

the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant’s 

compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida 

Statutes. 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Motor Vehicles 

K and G Cycles LLC d/b/a K and G Cycles for the 

establishment of ROEN motorcycles 

Notice of Publication for a New Point 

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of More 

than 300,000 Population 

Pursuant to Section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is given 

that Royal Enfield North America Limited Corp., intends to 

allow the establishment of K and G Cycles LLC, d/b/a K and G 

Cycles, as a dealership for the sale of motorcycles 

manufactured by Royal Enfield Motors (line-make ROEN) at 

127 North Krome Avenue, Florida City, (Miami-Dade County), 

Florida 33034, on or after June 22, 2018. 

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and principal 

investor(s) of K and G Cycles LLC, d/b/a K and G Cycles are 

dealer operator(s): George M. Marakas, 31415 Southwest 193rd 

Avenue, Homestead, Florida 33030-5306; principal investor(s): 

George M. Marakas, 31415 Southwest 193rd Avenue, 

Homestead, Florida 33030-5306. 

The notice indicates intent to establish the new point location in 

a county of more than 300,000 population, according to the 

latest population estimates of the University of Florida, Bureau 

of Economic and Business Research. 

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have standing, 

pursuant to Section 320.642, Florida Statutes, to file a petition 

or complaint protesting the application. 

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30 

days of the date of publication of this notice and must be 

submitted to: Jaime Williams, Administrator, Dealer License 

Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

Room A-312, MS65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635. 

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by US 

Mail to: Michael Smith, Royal Enfield North America Limited 

Corp., 226 North Water Street, Milwaukee, Wisconsin, 53202. 

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days of the 

date of publication, a final order will be issued by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving 

the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant’s 

compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida 

Statutes. 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Motor Vehicles 

Nice Scooters We Buy Scooters, Inc. for the establishment of 

GEEL motorcycles 

Notice of Publication for a New Point 

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of More 

than 300,000 Population 

Pursuant to Section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is given 

that Peace Industry Group (USA), Inc., intends to allow the 

establishment of Nice Scooters We Buy Scooters, Inc., as a 

dealership for the sale of motorcycles manufactured by Geely 

Group Zhejiang Motorcycle Co., Ltd. (line-make GEEL) at 622 

North State Road 7, Hollywood, (Broward County), Florida 

33024, on or after June 22, 2018. 

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and principal 

investor(s) of Nice Scooters We Buy Scooters, Inc., are dealer 

operator(s): Olga Lucia Solano, 622 North State Road 7, 

Hollywood, Florida 33021; principal investor(s): Olga Lucia 

Solano, 622 North State Road 7, Hollywood, Florida 33021. 

The notice indicates intent to establish the new point location in 

a county of more than 300,000 population, according to the 

latest population estimates of the University of Florida, Bureau 

of Economic and Business Research. 

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have standing, 

pursuant to Section 320.642, Florida Statutes, to file a petition 

or complaint protesting the application. 

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30 

days of the date of publication of this notice and must be 

submitted to: Jaime Williams, Administrator, Dealer License 

Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

Room A-312, MS65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635. 

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by US 

Mail to: Meiredith Huang, Peace Industry Group (USA), Inc., 

2885 Pacific Drive, Suite B, Norcross, Georgia 30071. 

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days of the 

date of publication, a final order will be issued by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving 

the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant’s 

compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida 

Statutes. 

DEPARTMENT OF HIGHWAY SAFETY AND MOTOR 

VEHICLES 

Division of Motor Vehicles 

Relocation for SAG FL LLC, d/b/a Smith KIA selling KIA 

vehicles 

Notice of Publication for the Relocation of a 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=15
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=42


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 101, May 23, 2018 

 

2490 

Franchise Motor Vehicle Dealer in a County of More 

than 300,000 Population 

Pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, notice is given 

that KIA Motors America, Inc., intends to allow the relocation 

of SAG FL LLC, d/b/a Smith KIA a dealership for the sale of 

KIA automobiles (line-make KIA) from its present location at 

1700 East Merritt Island Causeway, Merritt Island, (Brevard 

County), Florida 32952, to a proposed location at 3660 West 

King Street, Cocoa, (Brevard County), Florida 32926, on or 

after June 22, 2018. 

The name and address of the dealer operator(s) and principal 

investor(s) of SAG FL LLC, d/b/a Smith KIA are dealer 

operator(s): John Smith, 555 Old School Road, Gulf Stream, 

Florida 33483, principal investor(s): John Smith, 555 Old 

School Road, Gulf Stream, Florida 33483. 

The notice indicates intent to relocate the franchise in a county 

of more than 300,000 population, according to the latest 

population estimates of the University of Florida, Bureau of 

Economic and Business Research. 

Certain dealerships of the same line-make may have standing, 

pursuant to section 320.642, Florida Statutes, as amended by 

Chapter 88-395, Laws of Florida, to file a petition or complaint 

protesting the application. 

Written petitions or complaints must be received by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles within 30 

days of the date of publication of this notice and must be 

submitted to: Jaime Williams, Administrator, Dealer License 

Section, Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles, 

Room A-312 MS65, Neil Kirkman Building, 2900 Apalachee 

Parkway, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0635. 

A copy of such petition or complaint must also be sent by US 

Mail to: Percy Vaughn, KIA Motors America, Inc., 100 Galleria 

Parkway, Suite 1550, Atlanta, Georgia 30039-5959. 

If no petitions or complaints are received within 30 days of the 

date of publication, a final order will be issued by the 

Department of Highway Safety and Motor Vehicles approving 

the establishment of the dealership, subject to the applicant's 

compliance with the provisions of Chapter 320, Florida 

Statutes. 

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION 

Certificate of Need 

NOTICE OF BATCHED APPLICATION RECEIPT AND 

NOTICE OF TENTATIVE PUBLIC HEARINGS 

The Agency for Health Care Administration has received and 

accepted the following Certificate of Need applications for 

review in the batched Other Beds and Programs review cycle 

with an application due date of May 16, 2018. 

 

County: Escambia  District: 1-1 

CON #10527 Application Receipt Date: 05/16/2018 

Facility/Project: PruittHealth – Escambia County, LLC 

Applicant: PruittHealth – Escambia County, LLC 

Project Description: Add up to 45 community nursing home 

beds 

 

County: Bay District: 2-2 

CON #10528 Application Receipt Date: 05/16/2018 

Facility/Project: PruittHealth – Bay County, LLC 

Applicant: PruittHealth – Bay County, LLC 

Project Description: Add up to 24 community nursing home 

beds 

 

County: Leon District: 2-4 

CON #10529 Application Receipt Date: 05/16/2018 

Facility/Project: PruittHealth – Leon, LLC 

Applicant: PruittHealth – Leon County, LLC 

Project Description: Add up to 15 community nursing home 

beds 

 

County: Orange District: 7-2 

CON #10530 Application Receipt Date: 05/16/2018 

Facility/Project: Conway Lakes Health and Rehabilitation 

Center 

Applicant: Conway Lakes NC, LLC 

Project Description: Add 18 community nursing home beds 

 

County: Seminole District: 7-4 

CON #10531 Application Receipt Date: 05/16/2018 

Facility/Project: Premier Living Centers, Inc. 

Applicant: Premier Living Centers, Inc. 

Project Description: Add 39 community nursing home beds 

 

County: Miami-Dade District: 11-1 

CON #10532 Application Receipt Date: 05/16/2018 

Facility/Project: Miami-Dade SNF, LLC 

Applicant: Miami-Dade SNF, LLC 

Project Description: Establish a new 70-bed community nursing 

home 

 

County: Pasco District: 5A 

CON #10533 Application Receipt Date: 05/16/2018 

Facility/Project: Compassionate Care Hospice of Pasco, Inc. 

Applicant: Compassionate Care Hospice of Pasco, Inc. 

Project Description: Establish a new hospice program  

 

County: Pasco District: 5A 

CON #10534 Application Receipt Date: 05/16/2018 

Facility/Project: Cornerstone Hospice & Palliative Care, Inc. 

Applicant: Cornerstone Hospice & Palliative Care, Inc. 

Project Description: Establish a new hospice program  

 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=188


Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 101, May 23, 2018 

 

2491 

 

County: Pasco District: 5A 

CON #10535 Application Receipt Date: 05/16/2018 

Facility/Project: Haven Hospice of Pasco County 

Applicant: North Central Florida Hospice, Inc. 

Project Description: Establish a new hospice program  

 

County: Pasco District: 5A 

CON #10536 Application Receipt Date: 05/16/2018 

Facility/Project: PruittHealth Hospice – 5A 

Applicant: PruittHealth Hospice – 5A, LLC 

Project Description: Establish a new hospice program  

 

County: Pasco District: 5A 

CON #10537 Application Receipt Date: 05/16/2018 

Facility/Project: Seasons Hospice & Palliative Care of Pasco 

County, LLC 

Applicant: Seasons Hospice & Palliative Care of Pasco County, 

LLC 

Project Description: Establish a new hospice program  

 

County: Pasco District: 5A 

CON #10538 Application Receipt Date: 05/16/2018 

Facility/Project: Suncoast Hospice - Pasco 

Applicant: The Hospice of the Florida Suncoast, Inc. 

Project Description: Establish a new hospice program  

 

County: Pasco District: 5A 

CON #10539 Application Receipt Date: 05/16/2018 

Facility/Project: Tidewell Hospice, Inc. 

Applicant: Tidewell Florida Hospice, Inc. 

Project Description: Establish a new hospice program  

 

County: Pasco District: 5A 

CON #10540 Application Receipt Date: 05/16/2018 

Facility/Project: VITAS Healthcare Corporation of Florida 

Applicant: VITAS Healthcare Corporation of Florida 

Project Description: Establish a new hospice program  

 

County: Hardee District: 6 

CON #10541 Application Receipt Date: 05/16/2018 

Facility/Project: Sunrise Community, Inc. 

Applicant: Sunrise Community, Inc. 

Project Description: Establish a new 24-bed ICF-DD  

 

 Also, IF REQUESTED, tentative public hearings have 

been scheduled as follows: 

 

PROPOSALS: CON #10527     District:  1-1 

DATE/TIME: Tuesday, July 10, 2018, 10:00 a.m. – 12:00 

p.m. CST/11:00 a.m. – 1:00 p.m. EST 

PLACE:  Meeting Room, Courtyard By Marriott 

  905 East 23rd PL 

  Panama City, Florida 32405 

 

PROPOSALS: CON #10528     District:  2-2 

DATE/TIME: Tuesday, July 10, 2018, 2:10 p.m. – 3:30 p.m. 

CST/3:10 p.m. – 4:30 p.m. EST 

PLACE:  Meeting Room, Courtyard By Marriott 

  905 East 23rd PL 

  Panama City, Florida 32405 

 

PROPOSALS: CON #10529     District:  2-4 

DATE/TIME:  Tuesday, July 10, 2018, 12:30 p.m. – 2:00 

p.m. CST/1:30 p.m. – 3:00 p.m. EST 

PLACE:  Meeting Room, Courtyard By Marriott 

  905 East 23rd PL 

  Panama City, Florida 32405 

 

PROPOSALS: CON #s 10533, 10534, 10535, 10536, 10537,

 District:  5A 

  10538, 10539 & 10540 

DATE/TIME: Monday, July 2, 2018, 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m. 

PLACE:  Pasco Building – Conference Room A 

  805 Executive Center Drive West 

  St. Petersburg, Florida 33702 

 

PROPOSALS: CON #10541     District:  6 

DATE/TIME:  Monday, July 9, 2018, 10:00 a.m. – 12:00 

p.m. 

PLACE:  Health Council of West Central Florida, Inc. 

  550 N. Reo Street, Suite 300 

  Tampa, Florida 33609 

 

PROPOSALS: CON #10530     District:  7-2 

DATE/TIME:  Friday, July 6, 2018, 10:00 a.m. – 12:00 p.m. 

PLACE:  Health Council of East Central Florida, Inc. 

  5931 Brick Court 

  Winter Park, Florida 32792 

 

PROPOSALS: CON #10531     District:  7-4 

DATE/TIME:  Friday, July 6, 2018, 1:00 p.m. – 3:00 p.m. 

PLACE:  Health Council of East Central Florida, Inc. 

  5931 Brick Court 

  Winter Park, Florida 32792 

 

PROPOSALS: CON #10532     District:  11-1 

DATE/TIME:  Tuesday, July 10, 2018, 1:00 p.m. – 3:00 

p.m.  

PLACE:  Health Council of South Florida, Inc. 

  7875 NW 12th Street, Suite 118 

  Doral, Florida 33126 

 



Florida Administrative Register Volume 44, Number 101, May 23, 2018 

 

2492 

Public hearing requests must be in writing and be received at 

the Agency for Health Care Administration, CON Office, 2727 

Mahan Drive, Mail Stop 28, Tallahassee, Florida, 32308, 

attention Marisol Fitch, by 5:00 p.m., June 6, 2018. In lieu of 

requesting and attending a public hearing, written comments 

submitted to the department relative to the merits of these 

applications will become part of the official project application 

file. Pursuant to subsection 59C-1.010(3), F.A.C., written 

comments must be received by June 27, 2018. 

Section XIII 

Index to Rules Filed During Preceding 

Week 

NOTE: The above section will be published on Tuesday 

beginning October 2, 2012, unless Monday is a holiday, then it 

will be published on Wednesday of that week. 

 


