Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

Section |
Notice of Development of Proposed Rules
and Negotiated Rulemaking

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Board of Professional Geologists

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61G16-3.001 Schedule of Fees

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of the amendment is
to bring the rule into compliance with HB 0741.

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Bring rule into
compliance.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 455.213(2),
455.219, 455.271, 492.104, 492.1101 FS.

LAW [IMPLEMENTED: 455.213(2), 455.217, 455.219,
455.271, 492.104, 492.105, 492.106, 492.1051, 492.1101,
492.111 FS.

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
REGISTER.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Richard
Morrison, Executive Director, Board of Professional
Geologists, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, FL 32399-
0767, N11, or by electronic mail -
Richard.Morrison@myfloridalicense.com.

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE FROM
THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE.

455.217,

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Athletic Training

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

64B33-5.001 Disciplinary Guidelines

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes the rule
amendment to add disciplinary guidelines for violations.
SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Disciplinary
Guidelines.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 456.079, 468.705, 468.719
FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.072, 456.079, 468.719 FS.

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
REGISTER.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Jennifer
Wenhold, Executive Director, Board of Athletic Training, 4052
Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C08, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3258
THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS NOT AVAILABLE.

Section Il
Proposed Rules

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

Florida’s Office of Early Learning

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

6M-4.700 Child Performance Standards

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of the rule revision is
to update the minimum student performance standards for
children participating in the School Readiness Program.
SUMMARY: The student performance standards for children
participating in the School Readiness Program. The public
hearing will be held simultaneously with the rule development
workshop for Rule 6M-8.602, F.A.C. Performance Standards
for Children Participating in the Voluntary (VPK) Education

Program.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION:

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse
impact on small business or likely increase directly or indirectly
regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the aggregate within
one year after the implementation of the rule. A SERC has not
been prepared by the Agency.

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: The office's economic analysis of the adverse impact or
potential regulatory costs of the proposed rule does not exceed
any of the criteria established in s. 120.541(2)(a), F.S. This rule
updates the performance standards for children participating in
the School Readiness Program.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1001.213(2), FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1002.82(2)(j), FS.

IFREQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS
NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE
DATE,TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW(IF NOT
REQUESTED, THIS HEARING WILL NOT BE HELD):

3635


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=268
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G16-3.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=455.213(2),%20455.217,%20455.219,%20455.271,%20492.104,%20492.1101%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=455.213(2),%20455.217,%20455.219,%20455.271,%20492.104,%20492.1101%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=455.213(2),%20455.217,%20455.219,%20455.271,%20492.104,%20492.105,%20492.106,%20492.1051,%20492.1101,%20492.111%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=455.213(2),%20455.217,%20455.219,%20455.271,%20492.104,%20492.105,%20492.106,%20492.1051,%20492.1101,%20492.111%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=455.213(2),%20455.217,%20455.219,%20455.271,%20492.104,%20492.105,%20492.106,%20492.1051,%20492.1101,%20492.111%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=326
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B33-5.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=456.079
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.705
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.719%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.719%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=456.072
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.079
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.719%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1044
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6M-4.700
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1001.213(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1002.82(2)(j)

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, September 12, 2017, 2:00 p.m. —
3:30 p.m. ET, or at the conclusion of business whichever is
earlier

PLACE: via GoToWebinar only. To register for the webinar,
please visit;
http://www.floridaearlylearning.com/statewide_initiatives/law
s_and_rules/proposed_rules.aspx

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Katerina Maroney (850)717-8614;
Katerina.maroney@oel.myflorida.com. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Katerina Maroney, School Readiness
Policy Supervisor, Office of Early Learning, 250 Marriott Dr.,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)717-8614;
Katerina.maroney@oel.myflorida.com

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

6M-4.700 Child Performance Standards for the School
Readiness (SR) Program

(1) Florida’s Office of Early Learning hereby adopts the
Florida Early Learning and Developmental Standards: Birth to
Kindergarten Five, Form OEL-SR 15 ( October 2017) Ferm
OEL-SR30 dated—August-—2012, as the child performance
standards for use in the School Readiness program.

(2) The standards incorporated in the Florida Early
Learning and Developmental Standards: Birth to Five
Kindergarten, Form OEL-SR 15 (October 2017) Form-OEL-
SR 30dated——August——2012,

01652 is hereby incorporated by reference For-Four-Year-Old
Standards._t lori | . | |

efaranca Nn2No=Reaf-0104

- Documents incorporated
by reference may be obtained from Florida’s Office of Early
Learning at the following address: 250 Marriott Drive,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (866)357-3239, TTY/Florida Relay

711, and at the Internet website:
http://www.floridaearlylearning.com.
Rulemaking Authority 1001.213(2) FS. Law Implemented

1002.82(2)(j), 1002.83(13), 1002.84(1) FS. History—New 11-15-12,
Amended .

3636

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Katerina Maroney, School Readiness Policy Supervisor
NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: Rodney J. MacKinnon, Executive
Director

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: August 18, 2017

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAR: July 5, 2017

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

Florida’s Office of Early Learning

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

6M-8.602 Performance Standards for Children
Participating in the Voluntary
Prekindergarten (VPK) Education Program

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of the rule revision is

to update the minimum student performance standards for

children participating in VPK.

SUMMARY:: The student performance standards for children

participating in VPK. The public hearing will be held

simultaneously with the rule development workshop for Rule

6M-4.700, F.A.C. Child Performance Standards, which

addresses the performance standards for children birth through

five years old so that participants have the opportunity to see

the continuum of the early learning standards.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION:

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse
impact on small business or likely increase directly or indirectly
regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the aggregate within
one year after the implementation of the rule. A SERC has not
been prepared by the Agency.

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: The office's economic analysis of the adverse impact or
potential regulatory costs of the proposed rule does not exceed
any of the criteria established in s. 120.541(2)(a), F.S. This rule
updates the performance standards for children participating in
VPK.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 1002.79, F.S.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 1002.67(1), F.S.


https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01652
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01652
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-01943
http://www.floridaearlylearning.com/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1044
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6M-8.602
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1002.79
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=1002.67(1)

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

IFREQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS
NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE DATE,
TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW (IF NOT
REQUESTED, THIS HEARING WILL NOT BE HELD):
DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, September 12, 2017, 2:00 p.m. —
3:30 p.m. ET, or at the conclusion of business whichever is
earlier

PLACE: via GoToWebinar only. To register for the webinar,
please visit:
http://www.floridaearlylearning.com/statewide_initiatives/law
s_and_rules/proposed_rules.aspx

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Tara Huls (850)717-8635;
Tara.Huls@oel.myflorida.com. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE 1S: Tara Huls, Director, Voluntary
Prekindergarten (VPK) Education Program, Office of Early
Learning, 250 Marriott Dr., Tallahassee, Florida 32399,
(850)717-8635; Tara.Huls@oel.myflorida.com

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

6M-8.602 Child Performance Standards for GChildren
Participating—in  the Voluntary Prekindergarten (VPK)
Education Program
Minimum student performance standards developed and
adopted by the Office of Early Learning State—Board—of
Education for children participating in the Voluntary
Prekindergarten (VPK) Education Program are contained in the
publication Form OEL-VPK 15 (October 2017) titled, “Florida
Early Learning and Developmental Standards: forFeur 4-Year-
Olds to Kindergarten 2011);
005892 The standards incorporated in Form OEL-VPK 15 this
document are hereby incorporated by reference in-thisrule-and
made-a-part-of-therules-of the State Board-of Education-and
may be obtained as described in Rule 6M-8.900, F.A.C., by
lucation, . ive_Tal Flori or at

Rulemaking Authority 1002.79 FS. Law Implemented 1002.67(1) FS.
History—New 7-25-07, Amended 9-22-08, 11-22-11, Formerly 6A-
1.099823, Amended .

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Tara Huls, Director, Voluntary Prekindergarten (VPK)
Education Program

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: Rodney J. MacKinnon, Executive
Director

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: August 18, 2017

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAR: July 5, 2017

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Board of Professional Engineers

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:
61G15-33.001  General Responsibility
61G15-33.002  Definitions

61G15-33.003
61G15-33.004
61G15-33.005
61G15-33.006
61G15-33.007
61G15-33.008
61G15-33.010

Design of Power Systems

Design of Lighting Systems

Design of Communications Systems

Design of Alarm and Signaling Systems
Design of Lightning Protection Systems
Design of Grounding Systems

Certification of Electrical Systems of Public
Interest

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of the amendment is
to update and modernize the rules, eliminate unnecessary or
outdated requirements, and ensure the rules enable modern
professional practice.

SUMMARY:: To update and modernize the responsibility rules
relating to design of electrical systems.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION:

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse
impact on small business or likely increase directly or indirectly
regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the aggregate within
one year after the implementation of the rule. A SERC has not
been prepared by the Agency.

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: During discussion of the economic impact of this rule at
its Board meeting, the Board, based upon the expertise and
experience of its members, determined that a Statement of
Estimated Regulatory Costs (SERC) was not necessary and that
the rule will not require ratification by the Legislature. No
person or interested party submitted additional information
regarding the economic impact at that time.

3637


http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-00589
http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-00589
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=267
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G15-33.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G15-33.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G15-33.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G15-33.004
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G15-33.005
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G15-33.006
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G15-33.007
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G15-33.008
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G15-33.010

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 471.008, 471.033(2) FS.
LAW IMPLEMENTED: 471.033 FS.

IFREQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS
NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Zana Raybon, Executive Director,
Board of Professional Engineers, 2639 North Monroe Street,
Suite B-112, Tallahassee, FL 32303; (850)521-0500.

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

61G15-33.001 General Responsibility.

Electrical Engineering Ddocuments shall be prepared in
accordance with generally accepted engineering standards
licabl | - . -
autthority—having—jurisdiction. The Electrical Engineering
Ddocuments shall identify the Engineer of Rrecord for—the
eleetneal—systems—p#e}eet Electrical Engineering Ddocuments
shall comply demenstrate-comphiance with the requirements of

the applicable codes and standards as defined herein. The
Engineer of Record is responsible for determining the
applicability of appropriate codes and standards to a given
project. In the event the codes and standards fail to ceveror
address a specific requirement or situation, alternative research,
test results, engineering data, and engineering calculations shall

be utilized. New-teehnelegy—may—be—hmhzed—when—sald

mpreved—pe#ermane& Electrlcal Enqmeermq Documents for

cConstruction decuments shall indicate the nature and character
of the electrical work and shall describe, label and define the
required electrical systems components, processes, equipment
and material and its structural utihity support systems. Both the
Engineer of Record for the electrical system and the delegated
engineer, if utilized, shall comply with the requirements of the
general responsibility rules, Chapter 61G15-30, F.A.C., and
with the requirements of the more specific rules contained
herein. The Engineer of Record for the Electrical System(s)
shall provide design requirements in writing to the delegated
engineer if one is used and shall review the design documents
of the delegated engineer for conformance to his written
instructions in accordance with Rule 61G15-30.005, F.A.C.
Any-Electrical Delegated-Engineering Documents prepared by
a delegated engineer and so reviewed must be included in the
final set of documents filed for permit unless required by the

Rulemaking Speeific Authority 471.008, 471.033(2) FS. Law
Implemented 471.033 FS. History—New 5-19-93, Formerly 21H-
33.001, Amended 11-13-08,

61G15-33.002 Definitions.

(1) Engineer of Record for the Electrical Systems. The
Florida Pprofessional Engineer who develops the electrical
system design criteria or performs the analysis and is
responsible for the preparation of the Electrical Ddocuments for
the project.

(2) through (4) No change.

(5) Electrical Engineering Documents. All electrical
drawings, specifications, reports, calculations, data and other
documents utilized to establish the overall design and
requirements for the construction, alteration, modernization,
repair, demolition, arrangement, andfor use of the electrical
system, or analysis or recommendations, as prepared by the
Engineer of Record for the Electrical System. Electrical
Engineering Documents shall additionally meet the
requirements of Rule 61G15-30.003, F.A.C., Engineering
Documents.

(6) Electrical Submittals. Submittals; Ceatalog information
on standard products or drawings prepared solely to serve as a
guide for fabrication and installation and requiring no
engineering input. Such Fhese submittals are not Engineering
Documents or Delegated Engineering Documents and do not
require the seal of a Florida Pprofessional Eengineer.

(7) Codes and Standards. Those nationally recognized
Codes and Standards adopted directly or by reference in the
Florida Building Code, {including-Florida—Energy-Efficiency
Code;Chapter-13) adopted in its entirety by reference in Rule
61G15-18.011(6), F.A.C., and the Florida Fire Prevention
Code, adopted in its entirety by reference in Rule 61G15-
18.011(7), in-Chapter 89A-60, F.A.C.

(8) No change.

Rulemaking Speeific Authority 471.008, 471.033(2) FS. Law
Implemented 471.033 FS. History—New 5-19-93, Formerly 21H-
33.002, Amended 11-13-08 .

61G15-33.003 Design of Power Systems.

(1) Power systems convey or distribute electrical energy.
Items to be considered included in the design and analysis of
power these systems are, as applicable to the particular project:
steady state and transient loads characteristics, short circuit
availability, arc flash potential, aralysis-and-protection{design
and-analysis); load flow, voltage drop, effects of harmonics,
power factor, and protective device coordination.

(2) Electrical Engineering Documents for applicable—te
power systems must include the following information, if
applicable to the particular project shall-ata-minimum-indicate

permitting entity to be submitted independently.

3638

the-following:


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=471.008
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20471.033(2)%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=471.033%20FS.

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

(a) Power dBistribution rRiser dBiagram with-shert-cireuit
values.

(b) Conductor Ampacities{sizes} (AWG or kcmil) and
insulation type, or cable assemblies characteristics.

(c) Circuit interrupting devices, ratings and fault current
interrupting capability.

(d) Location and characteristics of any surge protective
devices, if included in the engineering design.

(e) Main and distribution equipment, control devices,
locations and ratings sizes.

(f){g) No change.
(9){r) Feeder and service capacity calculations. Lead

computations:

(h)YtH No change.

(D){H Grounding and bonding requirements.

(D€ Instrumentation and control when necessary for safe
operation or to show intended function where-reguired.

(K)H Engineering Recerd Ddocuments applicable to
power systems filed for public record shall; also at-a-mirimum;
contain information as required by the Florida Building Code,
incorporated by reference in Rule 61G15-18.001(6), F.A.C.

(m) Engineers performing arc flash hazard analysis must
determine arc flash approach distance, assess and convey the
incident energy levels, and identify appropriate PPE class. Any
such verification shall constitute an Engineering Certification
as that term is defined in Rule 61G15-18.011(4), F.A.C., and
must _comply with the Responsibility Rules, including Rule

61G15-29.001, F.A.C. Instalation-and-testing-requirements-of
reguired-emergency-and-standby-powersystems-

Rulemaking Speecific Authority 471.008, 471.033(2) FS. Law
Implemented 471.033 FS. History—New 5-19-93, Formerly 21H-
33.003, Amended 11-13-08

61G15-33.004 Design of Lighting Systems.

(1) Lighting systems convert electrical energy into light.
Items to be considered included in the lighting design and
analysis of lighting systems are, as applicable to the particular
project: aAverage and minimum illuminance, eEquivalent
spherical illuminance, ubniformity rations, vMisual comfort
probability, special purpose lighting, impacts of light intrusion,
light trespass, security and safety, and the requirements of the
Florida-Energy-Efficiency-Code-Chapter-13; Florida Building
Code, Energy Conservation, which is incorporated by reference
in Rule 61G15-18.011, F.A.C.

(2) Electrical Engineering Ddocuments for lighting
systems must include the following information, if applicable

to the particular project shall—ata minimum—indicatethe
folowing:

(a) No change.

(b) Emergency lkighting, egress and—exit lighting, and
illuminated exit markings and their ancillary equipment such as
inverters and batteries.

(c) Equipment legend Exit-Lighting.

(d) No change.

. .
FI'HE - for Building C ion.
Rulemaking  Speeific Authority 471.008, 471.033(2) FS. Law

Implemented 471.033 FS. History—New 5-19-93, Formerly 21H-
33.004, Amended 11-13-08

61G15-33.005 Design of Communications Systems.

(1) Communications systems are utilized to convey voice
and data. Items to be considered included in the design and
decuments-or analysis of communication these systems are, as
applicable to the particular project: Human-factors-engineering;
cabling requirements, installation requirements, performance
requirements, backup power requirements, the interrelationship
of the various systems and applicable standards and regulatory
requirements.

(2) Electrical Engineering  Ddocuments  for
communications systems must include the following
information, if applicable to the particular project shal—at-a

- indi collowing:

(a) through (f) No change.

(g) Characteristics and locations of surge protective
devices, if included in the engineering design.

Rulmaking Speeific Authority 471.008, 471.033(2) FS. Law
Implemented 471.033 FS. History—New 5-19-93, Formerly 21H-
33.005, Amended 11-13-08,

61G15-33.006 Design of Alarm, Control, and Signaling
Systems.

(1) Alarm_control, and signaling systems include motor
control systems, emergency alarm circuits, activation of life
safety system controls and remote signaling of emergency
conditions (See Rule 61G15-32.008, F.A.C., for Fire Alarm
Systems), surveillance and access control systems, temperature
control, and systems related to energy conservation and facility
management systems. Items to be considered in the design or
analysis of alarm, control, and signaling systems include:
cabling requirements; installation requirements; performance
requirements; and interoperability. The design documents shall
be based on standards set forth in NFPA 72, the Florida
Building Code, the Florida Fire Prevention Code, or as required
by the local authority having jurisdiction. The Florida Building
Code and the Florida Fire Prevention Code are incorporated by
reference in Rule 61G15-18.011, F.A.C.

3639



Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

(2) The Electrical Engineering Documents for alarm,
control, and signaling systems eonstruction-documents must

(1) The Engineer of Record shall, when be required by
applicable codes or ordinances, as—+required-by-the-Authority

include the following information, if applicable to the particular
project shal-at-a-minimum-indicate-the-following:

(@) through (f) No change.

(9) Location and characteristics of surge protective
devices, if included in the engineering design.

(h) through (i) No change.
Rulemaking Speecific Authority 471.008, 471.033(2) FS. Law

Implemented 471.033 FS. History—New 5-19-93, Formerly 21H-
33.006, Amended 11-13-08,

61G15-33.007 Design of Lightning Protection Systems.

(1) Lightning Protection Systems are passive systems used
to protect building and structures from damage caused by
lightning and static discharges. Items to be considered in the
design or analysis of these this systems include risks to persons
or property, environmental factors, geological factors, building
or_structure characteristics, and materials performance the
reguirements-of NFPA-780.

(2) Electrical Engineering Ddocuments for lightning
protection systems must include the following information, if
applicable to the particular project shat-indicate:

(@) through (d) No change.

(e) Grounding Terminals peints and spacing.

() No change.

(9) Equipment Legend.

(h) Testing requirements ef-grounds.

Rulemaking Speeific Authority 471.008, 471.033(2) FS. Law

Implemented 471.033 FS. History—New 5-19-93, Formerly 21H-
33.007, Amended 11-13-08 .

61G15-33.008 Design of Grounding Systems.

(1) Grounding Systems are passive systems used to
establish an electrical potential reference point in an electrical
system, a common return path for fault current, or a direct
connection to earth for the proper dissipation of energy in case
of abnormal or transient conditions.

(2) Electrical Engineering Documents for grounding
systems must include the following information, if applicable
to the particular project shal—indicate—at—a—minimum—the
following:

(@) through (d) No change.
and-use-reguirements.

Rulemaking Speeific Authority 471.008, 471.033(2) FS. Law

Implemented 471.033 FS. History—New 5-19-93, Formerly 21H-
33.008, Amended 11-13-08,

61G15-33.010 Certification of Electrical Systems of Public
Interest.

3640

Having-Jurisdiction-to demonstrate verification of compliance.
2) Verlflcatlons

compliance #em—EleetHeal

must include the followmq mformatlon if appllcable to the
particular project shalHneclude-when-apphicable:

(a) No change.

(b) Lighting tevels performance criteria included in the
design that show illuminated levels, intrusion, trespass, dark
sky, safety or that show/preserve natural habitat tendencies.

(c) Lighting, sound pressure, or other /reise—/product or
installation specifications that indicate conformance with
community, county, or state standards, codes or ordinances.

(3) Any such verification shall constitute an Engineering
Certification as that term is defined in Rule 61G15-18.011(4),
F.A.C., and must comply with all Responsibility Rules,
including Rule 61G15-29.001, F.A.C.

Rulemaking Speeific—Authority 471.008, 471.033(2) FS. Law
Implemented 471.033 FS. History—New 11-13-08,

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: :
Board of Professional Engineers

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: : Board of Professional Engineers

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: June 21, 2017

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAR: August 4, 2017

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Medicine

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

64B8-55.005 Notice of Noncompliance; Rules Designated
as Minor Violations for First Time Offense.

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The proposed new rule establishes

rules designated as minor violations for first time offense, in

compliance with recent statutory changes to Section 120.695,

F.S.

SUMMARY: Discipline and licensure restrictions; notice of

noncompliance.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION:

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse
impact on small business or likely increase directly or indirectly
regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the aggregate within
one year after the implementation of the rule. A SERC has not
been prepared by the Agency.


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=331
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B8-55.005

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: During discussion of the economic impact of this rule at
its Board meeting, the Board concluded that this rule change
will not have any impact on licensees and their businesses or
the businesses that employ them. The rule will not increase any
fees, business costs, personnel costs, will not decrease profit
opportunities, and will not require any specialized knowledge
to comply. This change will not increase any direct or indirect
regulatory costs. Hence, the Board determined that a Statement
of Estimated Regulatory Costs (SERC) was not necessary and
that the rule will not require ratification by the Legislature. No
person or interested party submitted additional information
regarding the economic impact at that time.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 120.695, 456.073(3), 478.43
FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 120.695, 456.073(3) FS.
IFREQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS
NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Allen Hall, Executive Director, Board
of Medicine; Electrolysis Council, 4052 Bald Cypress Way,
Bin # CO03, Tallahassee, Florida  32399-3253,
Allen.Hall@flhealth.gov.

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

64B8-55.005 Notice of Noncompliance; Rules Designated
as Minor Violations for First Time Offense.

(1) In accordance with Sections 456.073(3) and 120.695,
F.S., the Department is authorized to issue a notice of
noncompliance as a first response to a minor rule violation that
does not result in economic or physical harm to a person or
adversely affect the public health, safety, and welfare, when it
is reasonable to assume that the violator was unaware of the rule
or unclear as to how to comply with it. Failure of a licensee to
take action to correct the minor rule violation within 15 days of
receipt of the noncompliance notice shall result in either the
issuance of a citation pursuant to Rule 64B8-55.002, F.A.C.,
when appropriate, or the initiation of regular disciplinary
proceedings pursuant to Chapters 456 and 478, Florida Statutes.
A timely and successful response to a notice of noncompliance
is not a first offense for purposes of a citation or regular

discipline.

(2) The minor rule violations for which the Board
authorizes the Department to issue a notice of noncompliance
for a first offense are:

(a) Failure to maintain on file with the Council the current
address at which any notice required by law may be served by
the Department, the Board, the Council, or its agents, as
required by Rule 64B8-50.008, F.A.C.

(b) Failure to comply with any one of the display or record-
keeping provisions required by Rule 64B8-51.006(4), F.A.C.
Failure to comply with more than one of said provisions shall
render the licensee not eligible for a notice of noncompliance.

Rulemaking Authority 120.695, 456.073(3), 486.025 FS. Law
Implemented 120.695, 456.073(3) FS. History—New

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Electrolysis Council

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: Board of Medicine

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: August 4, 2017

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAR: June 30, 2017

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Respiratory Care

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

64B32-6.007 Continuing Education Requirements for
Reactivation of License

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Board proposes the

development of a rule amendment to update the language
regarding continuing education requirements for reactivation of
license.

SUMMARY: Update rule language regarding continuing
education requirements for reactivation of license.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION:

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse
impact on small business or likely increase directly or indirectly
regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the aggregate within
one year after the implementation of the rule. A SERC has not
been prepared by the Agency.

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: During discussion of the economic impact of this rule at
its Board meeting, the Board concluded that this rule change
will not have any impact on licensees and their businesses or
the businesses that employ them. The rule will not increase any
fees, business costs, personnel costs, will not decrease profit
opportunities, and will not require any specialized knowledge

3641


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=120.695
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.073(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20478.43%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20478.43%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=120.695
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20456.073(3)%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=325
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B32-6.007

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

to comply. This change will not increase any direct or indirect
regulatory costs. Hence, the Board determined that a Statement
of Estimated Regulatory Costs (SERC) was not necessary and
that the rule will not require ratification by the Legislature. No
person or interested party submitted additional information
regarding the economic impact at that time.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 456.036, 468.363 FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 468.363 FS.

IFREQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS
NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND
ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Allen Hall, Executive Director, Board
of Respiratory Care, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin # CO05,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0797, Allen.Hall@flhealth.gov.

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

64B32-6.007 Continuing Education Requirements for
Reactivation of License.
The continuing education requirements for reactivation of a
license shall be:

(1) Those requirements
456.036(11){16y, F.S.; and

(2) Documented proof of completion of 24 hours of
approved continuing education as provided in this rule chapter
and medical error prevention, for the preceding biennium
during which the license was inactive; ticensee-held-an-active
ticense and documented proof of 12 hours of approved
continuing education as provided in this rule chapter for each
year the license was inactive.

Rulemaking Authority 456.036, 468.363 FS. Law Implemented
468.363 FS. History—New 10-11-04, Amended 6-21-07

specified in  Section

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Board of Respiratory Care

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: Board of Respiratory Care

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: July 14, 2017

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAR: August 4, 2017

3642

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES

OIR - Insurance Regulation

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

690-149.204 Outline of Coverage

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The rule is repealed due to a change
in the governing statute.

SUMMARY:: Rule 690-149.204, F.A.C. provides guidelines
for the Outline of Coverage previously required for Standard
Health Benefit Plans. Due to statutory changes, insurers are no
longer required to offer a Standard Health Benefit Plan.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION:

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse
impact on small business or likely increase directly or indirectly
regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the aggregate within
one year after the implementation of the rule. A SERC has not
been prepared by the Agency.

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: Agency personnel familiar with the subject matter of the
rule amendment have performed an economic analysis of the
rule amendment that shows that the rule amendment is unlikely
to have an adverse impact on the State economy in excess of the
criteria established in Section 120.541(2)(a), Florida Statutes.
Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 624.308, 627.6675(3)(c), FS.
LAW  IMPLEMENTED:  624.307(1), 627.6498(4),
627.6675(3), 641.3922(3), FS.

IFREQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS
NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE DATE,
TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW (IF NOT
REQUESTED, THIS HEARING WILL NOT BE HELD):
DATE AND TIME: September 12, 2017, 9:30 a.m.

PLACE: 116 Larson Building, 200 East Gaines Street,
Tallahassee, Florida.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Christopher Struk, Office of Insurance Regulation,
E-mail Christopher.Struk@floir.com.. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=456.036
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20468.363%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=468.363%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=520
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-149.204
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=624.308
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20627.6675(3)(c)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=624.307(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20627.6498(4)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20627.6675(3)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20641.3922(3)

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Christopher Struk, Office of Insurance
Regulation, E-mail Christopher.Struk@floir.com.

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

690-149.204 Outline of Coverage.
Rulemaking Authority 624.308, 627.6675(3)(c) FS. Law Implemented
624.307(1), 627.6498(4), 627.6675(3), 641.3922(3) FS. History—New
3-2-00, Amended 4-2-01, 4-17-02, Formerly 4-149.204, Amended 5-
18-04, Repealed .

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Christopher Struk, Office of Insurance Regulation, E-mail
Christopher.Struk@floir.com.

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: THE FINANCIAL SERVICES
COMMISSION

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: August 16, 2017

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES
OIR - Insurance Regulation

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:
690-154.110 Certificate of Creditable Coverage
690-154.111 Demonstration of Creditable Coverage If

Certificate is not Provided

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The rules are repealed due to a
change in the governing statutes.

SUMMARY: Rules 690-154.110 and 690-154.111, F.A.C.
provided guidelines for issuance of certificates of creditable
coverage. Due to a change in statute, a certificate of creditable
coverage is no longer required. Therefore, the 2 rules are no
longer necessary.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION:

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse
impact on small business or likely increase directly or indirectly
regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the aggregate within
one year after the implementation of the rule. A SERC has not
been prepared by the Agency.

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: Agency personnel familiar with the subject matter of the
rule amendment have performed an economic analysis of the
rule amendment that shows that the rule amendment is unlikely
to have an adverse impact on the State economy in excess of the
criteria established in Section 120.541(2)(a), Florida Statutes.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 624.308, 627.6561(5)(b),
(7)(b),(8)(a)(e), (9)(b), 641.31071(8)(a), (e), (10)(b), FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 624.307(1), 627.64871, 627.6561(8),
641.31071, FS.

IFREQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS
NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE DATE,
TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW (IF NOT
REQUESTED, THIS HEARING WILL NOT BE HELD):
DATE AND TIME: September 12, 2017 at 9:30 a.m.

PLACE: 116 Larson Building, 200 East Gaines Street,
Tallahassee, Florida.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Christopher Struk, Office of Insurance Regulation,
E-mail Christopher.Struk@floir.com.. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Christopher Struk, Office of Insurance
Regulation, E-mail Christopher.Struk@floir.com.

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

690-154.110 Certificate of Creditable Coverage.
Rulemaking Authority 624.308, 627.6561(8)(e), 641.31071(8)(a), (e),
(10)(b) FS. Law Implemented 624.307(1), 627.64871, 627.6561(8),
641.31071 FS. History—New 9-19-00, Formerly 4-154.110,
Repealed .

690-154.111 Demonstration of Creditable Coverage If
Certificate is not Provided.
Rulemaking Authority 624.308, 627.6561(5)(b), (7)(b), (8)(a), (e),
(9)(b), 641.31071(8)(a), (), (10)(b) FS. Law Implemented 624.307(1),
627.64871, 641.31071 FS. History—-New 9-19-00, Formerly 4-
154.111, Repealed .

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Christopher Struk, Office of Insurance Regulation, E-mail
Christopher.Struk@floir.com.

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: THE FINANCIAL SERVICES
COMMISSION

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD: August 16, 2017

3643


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=520
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-154.110
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-154.111
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=624.308
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20627.6561(5)(b)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20641.31071(8)(a)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=624.307(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20627.64871
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20627.6561(8)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20641.31071

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES
OIR - Insurance Regulation

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:

690-162.008 Contract Provision; Expense, Mortality and
Investment Increment Factor

690-162.012 Valuation of Account Assets; Reserve

Liability

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: Amend rules to refer to updated
Annuity Mortality Tables for individual and group annuity
contracts.

SUMMARY: The rules are amended to cross reference the
Annuity Mortality Tables listed in rule 690-162.108, F.A.C. for
policies issued prior to December 31, 2016 and reference the
NAIC Valuation Manual adopted by s. 625.1212 F.S. for
policies issued on or after January 1, 2017.

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION:

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse
impact on small business or likely increase directly or indirectly
regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the aggregate within
one year after the implementation of the rule. A SERC has not
been prepared by the Agency.

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legislative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: Agency personnel familiar with the subject matter of the
rule amendment have performed an economic analysis of the
rule amendment that shows that the rule amendment is unlikely
to have an adverse impact on the State economy in excess of the
criteria established in Section 120.541(2)(a), Florida Statutes.
Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal
for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 624.308(1), 627.805, FS.
LAW [IMPLEMENTED: 624.307(1), 625.121, 627.802,
627.803, 627.804, 627.413, FS.

IFREQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF THIS
NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE DATE,
TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW (IF NOT
REQUESTED, THIS HEARING WILL NOT BE HELD):
DATE AND TIME: September 12, 2017, 9:30 a.m.

PLACE: 116 Larson Building, 200 East Gaines Street,
Tallahassee, Florida.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Christopher Struk, Office of Insurance Regulation,

3644

E-mail Christopher.Struk@floir.com.. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Christopher Struk, Office of Insurance
Regulation, E-mail Christopher.Struk@floir.com.

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

690-162.008 Contract Provision; Expense, Mortality and
Investment Increment Factor.
Any individual or group variable annuity contract delivered or
issued for delivery in this state shall stipulate the expense,
mortality, and investment increment factors to be used in
computing the dollar amount of variable benefits or other
contractual payments or values thereunder, and shall guarantee
that expense and mortality results shall not adversely affect
such dollar amounts. The mortality and investment increment
factors used in computing the dollar amount of variable benefits
or other contractual payments or values under an individual
variable contract shall not produce a large initial payment than
would be produced by the use of annuity mortality tables in rule
690-162.108 for policies issued on or before December 31,
2016 and the-1937 Standard aAnnuity mMortality tFables for
use in determining reserve liabilities in accordance with the
NAIC Valuation Manual as adopted by s. 625.1212, F.S. for
policies issued on or after January 1, 2017 and an annual
investment increment assumption of 3 %:%. “Expense” as used
in this subsection may exclude some or all taxes as stipulated in
the contract.

Rulemaking Speecific Authority 624.308(1), 627.805 FS. Law
Implemented 624.307(1), 627.803, 627.804, 627.413 FS. History—
Repromulgated 12-24-74, Formerly 4-10.08, 4-10.008, 4-162.008,
Amended .

690-162.012 Valuation of Account Assets;
Liability.

(1) No change.

(2) The reserve liability for variable annuity contracts shall
be established by the Office Birector pursuant to the
requirements of the—1937 Standard aAnnuity mMortality
tFables for use in determining reserve liabilities listed in rule
690-162.108 for policies issued prior to December 31, 2016
and for use in determining reserve liabilities in accordance with
the NAIC Valuation Manual as adopted by s. 625.1212, F.S. for
policies issued on or after January 1, 2017 and in-Appendix
VM-M—of-the-NAICValuation—Manual in accordance with
actuarial procedures that recognize the variable nature of the
benefits provided.

Reserve



https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=520
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-162.008
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69O-162.012
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=624.308(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20627.805
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=624.307(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20625.121
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20627.802
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20627.803
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20627.804
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20627.413

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

Rulemaking Authority 627.805 FS. Law Implemented 625.121,
627.802, 627.804 FS. History—Repromulgated 12-24-74, Formerly 4-
10.12, 4-10.012, 4-162.012, Amended .

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE:
Christopher Struk, Office of Insurance Regulation, E-mail
Christopher.Struk@floir.com.

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE
PROPOSED RULE: THE FINANCIAL SERVICES
COMMISSION

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY
HEAD:

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT
PUBLISHED IN FAR: July 12, 2017.

Section 11l
Notice of Changes, Corrections and
Withdrawals

NONE

Section IV
Emergency Rules

NONE

Section V
Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Rule
Variance or Waiver

PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

25-30.030  Notice of Application and of Customer Meeting
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Florida Public Service
Commission has received a petition from Utilities, Inc. of
Florida in Docket No. 20170174-SU, filed August 9, 2017,
seeking a partial waiver of paragraph 25-30.030(5)(b), Florida
Administrative Code. This rule addresses the customer noticing
provisions for an application to amend a utility’s service
territory. A copy of the petition can be obtained from the Office
of Commission Clerk. Comments on the petition should be filed
with the Office of Commission Clerk, Florida Public Service
Commission, 2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Tallahassee, FL
32399-0850, within 14 days of publication of this notice. For
additional information, please contact: Kyesha Mapp, Office of
the General Counsel, at the above address or telephone:
(850)413-6230.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Hotels and Restaurants

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61C-4.010 Sanitation and Safety Requirements

The Florida Department of Business and Professional
Regulation, Division of Hotels and Restaurants hereby gives
notice:

On July 31, 2017 the Division of Hotels and Restaurants
received a Petition for a Routine Variance for subsection 61C-
4.010(7), Florida Administrative Code, and subsection 61C-
4.010(6), Florida Administrative Code, from Lila Catering
Corp. located in Miami. The above referenced F.A.C. addresses
the requirement that at least one accessible bathroom be
provided for use by customers. They are requesting to share the
bathrooms located within a nearby establishment under a
different ownership for use by customers only.

The Petition for this variance was published in VVol. 43, No. 148,
F.A.R., on August 1, 2017. The Order for this Petition was
signed and approved on August 17, 2017. After a complete
review of the variance request, the Division finds that the
application of this Rule will create a financial hardship to the
food service establishment. Furthermore, the Division finds that
the Petitioner meets the burden of demonstrating that the
underlying statute has been achieved by the Petitioner ensuring
the bathrooms located within Alani Café Corp. (4315 NW 7 St
Suite 30 Miami, FL 33126), are maintained in a clean and
sanitary manner and are provided with cold running water under
pressure, soap, approved hand drying devices, and are available
during all hours of operation. The Petitioner shall also ensure
that directional signage is installed within or outside the
establishment clearly stating the location of the bathrooms. If
the ownership of Lila Catering Corp. and/or Alani Café Corp.
changes, an updated signed agreement for use of the bathroom
facilities will be required immediately.

A copy of the Order or additional information may be obtained
by contacting: Daisy.Aleman@myfloridalicense.com, Division
of Hotels and Restaurants, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-1011.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Hotels and Restaurants

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61C-1.004 General Sanitation and Safety Requirements

The Florida Department of Business and Professional
Regulation, Division of Hotels and Restaurants hereby gives
notice:

3645


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=25
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=25-30.030
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-4.010
mailto:Daisy.Aleman@myfloridalicense.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-1.004

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

On August 4, 2017 the Division of Hotels and Restaurants
received a Petition for an Emergency Variance for paragraph
61C-1.004(1)(a), Florida Administrative Code, and Paragraph
5-202.11(A), 2009 FDA Food Code from Point Pizza LLC
located in Coral Springs. The above referenced F.A.C.
addresses the requirement that each establishment have an
approved plumbing system installed to transport potable water
and wastewater. They are requesting to utilize holding tanks to
provide potable water and to collect wastewater at the
handwash sink and the three-compartment sink.

The Petition for this variance was published in VVol. 43, No. 152,
F.A.R., on August 7, 2017. The Order for this Petition was
signed and approved on August 17, 2017. After a complete
review of the variance request, the Division finds that the
application of this Rule will create a financial hardship to the
food service establishment. Furthermore, the Division finds that
the Petitioner meets the burden of demonstrating that the
underlying statute has been achieved by the Petitioner ensuring
the wastewater holding tank for the handwash sink and the three
compartment sink is emptied at a frequency as to not create a
sanitary nuisance; and potable water provided must come from
an approved source and be protected from contamination during
handling. The Petitioner shall also ensure that the handwash
sink and the three-compartment sink are provided with hot and
cold running water under pressure, and that the handwash sink
is provided with soap, an approved hand drying device and a
handwashing sign.

A copy of the Order or additional information may be obtained
by contacting: Daisy.Aleman@myfloridalicense.com, Division
of Hotels and Restaurants, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-1011.

to the elevators being manufactured to a newer code, which
poses a significant economic/financial hardship.

Notice of Correction to Notice of Petition:

On June 29, 2017, a Notice of Petition was advertised for
Regency Palms Condominiums (VW2017-102) and incorrectly
identified the petition as VW2017-101. The Notice of Petition
intended to address both petitions VW2017-101 and VW2017-
102.

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained
by contacting: Michelle Comingore, Division of Hotels and
Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 2601 Blair Stone Road,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013,
dhr.elevators@myfloridalicense.com.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Division of Hotels and Restaurants

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

61C-5.001 Safety Standards

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on June 26, 2017, the
Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division
of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received
a petition for Regency Palms Condominium, license number
104087, located at 5065 Royal Palms Way, New Port Richey,
FL 34652 (VW2017-102) and a petition for Regency Palms
Condominiums, license number 105584, located at 5089 Royal
Palms Way, New Port Richey, FL 34652 (VW2017-101).
License number 105584 is issued to Royal Palms Way, not
Regency Palm Condominiums and will herein be referred to as
Royal Palms Way. For both petitions, Petitioner sought an
emergency variance of the requirements of ASME Al17.1b-
20009, Sections 2.2.2.5, 3.27.4,5.2.1.2, and 5.2.2.14, as adopted
by subsection 61C-5.001(1), Florida Administrative Code, due

3646

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Division of Environmental Health

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

64E-11.004 Food Protection

The Department of Health hereby gives notice:

On July 5, 2017, the Department of Health issued an order in
response to a petition for a variance filed on March 10, 2017,
by Johnny Velasco, REHS, CP-FS, representing Advanced
Fresh Concepts Franchise Corp., regarding the “Sushi Rice and
Raw Animal Products”. Petitioner sought a variance from Rule
subsections 64E-11.004(2) and (8), Florida Administrative
Code, which require all potentially hazardous foods to be kept
at 41 degrees Fahrenheit or below or 140 degrees Fahrenheit or
above, except during necessary periods of preparation and
storage, as well as, raw fish and seafood products be cooked to
an internal temperature of 145 degrees Fahrenheit or above for
at least 15 seconds. Notice of the petition was published in the
March 24, 2017, edition of the Florida Administrative Register.
The Department found that the Petitioner demonstrated that the
underlying intent of the statute could be achieved by alternative
means and that strict application of the rules would create a
substantial hardship in the Petitioner's particular circumstance.
Therefore, pursuant to the requirements of Section 120.542(2),
Florida Statutes, the Department GRANTED
W/CONDITIONS Petitioner’s request for a variance.

A copy of the Order or additional information may be obtained
by contacting: Agency Clerk, Department of Health, Office of
the General Counsel, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin A02,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1703.



mailto:Daisy.Aleman@myfloridalicense.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
mailto:dhr.elevators@myfloridalicense.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=335
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64E-11.004

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

Section VI
Notice of Meetings, Workshops and Public
Hearings

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE AND CONSUMER
SERVICES

Florida Forest Service

The Department of Agriculture and Consumer Services, Florida
Forest Service announces a public meeting to which all persons
are invited.

DATE AND TIME: August 29, 2017, 1:00 p.m., CT

PLACE: Sandestin Golf and Beach Resort, Baytowne
Conference Center, 9300 Emerald Coast Parkway West, Destin,
Florida 32550-7268

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Florida Forest Service Programs.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Jim
Karels, Director, Florida Forest Service, 3125 Conner
Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1650, (850)681-5800.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Jim Karels, Director, Florida Forest Service, 3125
Conner Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1650, (850)681-
5800. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the
agency using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771
(TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: Jim Karels, Director,
Florida Forest Service, 3125 Conner Boulevard, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-1650, (850)681-5800.

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

University of South Florida

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

6C4-2.0021 University of South Florida Student Records
Policy (Repealed)

The Center for Urban Transportation Research announces a
public meeting to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: September 20, 2017, 10:00 a.m.
PLACE: Big Bend Transit, 2201 Eisenhower
Tallahassee, FL 32305

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Center for Urban Transportation Research.

Street,

REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL

Transit Research Inspection Procurement Services (TRIPS)
CONTRACT TRIPS-MD-17-RFP

MEDIUM DUTY TYPE TRANSIT VEHICLES

Notice is hereby given that the University of South Florida,
Center for Urban Transportation Research, representing the
Florida Department of Transportation, will receive sealed
proposals for the manufacture and delivery of the following
2017 model year vehicle type:

MEDIUM DUTY

TYPE TRANSIT VEHICLES

Minimum  Maximum

0 500

The quantities reflect the immediate and foreseeable needs of
transit agencies within Florida and were determined by using
the most recent State of Florida Program of Projects, historical
data from previous Florida Department of Transportation
contracts, Agency(s) requests, and Agency(s) vehicle
replacement schedules. All or part of the quantity of vehicles
stated herein may be assigned to other public transit agencies
desiring to purchase the same equipment specified in Part 2 of
this solicitation. The TRIPS program reserves the right to reject
any and all proposals, or any part of any or all proposals.

A pre-proposal meeting will be held September 20, 2017, 10:00
a.m., at Big Bend Transit, 2201 Eisenhower Street, Tallahassee,
FL 32305. Although optional, it is highly recommended
prospective proposers attend, due to the known complexities of
this solicitation. The meeting will be held in the conference
room. A conference line will be available for those unable to
attend; 1(800)832-0736: PIN/Room Number #8915826.
Primary distribution of this Request For Proposal is digital: RFP
may be downloaded from the TRIPS website, Upcoming RFP’s
tab, at http://tripsflorida.org/rfps.html Copies of the RFP may
also be obtained from: William Mayer, TRIPS Program
Manager, University of South Florida, Center for Urban
Transportation Research, 4202 E. Fowler Ave., CUT 100,
Tampa, Florida 33620, (813)974-6693, wmayer@cutr.usf.edu.
Sealed proposals, an original, eight (8) copies and an electronic,
must be received at the above address (Attn: William Mayer)
not later than 3:30 p.m. ET, November 1, 2017.

The successful proposer will be required to comply with all
Equal Opportunity Laws and Regulations, Buy America Laws,
Chapter 287 of the Florida Statutes and all other applicable
Federal and State regulations.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Bill
Mayer, TRIPS Program  Manager, (813)974-2646,
wmayer@cutr.usf.edu.

3647


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=5
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=169
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=202
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6C4-2.0021
mailto:wmayer@cutr.usf.edu
mailto:wmayer@cutr.usf.edu

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 2 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Bill Mayer, TRIPS Program Manager, (813)974-
2646, wmayer@cutr.usf.edu. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
For more information, you may contact: Bill Mayer, TRIPS
Program Manager, (813)974-2646, wmayer@cutr.usf.edu.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least two (2) days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Pegge Parker, (407)245-0300, ext. 300 or
pparker@ecfrpc.org. If you are hearing or speech impaired,
please contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service,
1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Pegge Parker,
(407)245-0300, ext. 300 or pparker@ecfrpc.org.

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION

The Participant Local Government Advisory Council (PLGAC)
announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: Thursday, September 21, 2017, 11:00 a.m.
PLACE: 1801 Hermitage Boulevard, Emerald Coast Room,
Tallahassee, Florida 32308

Check in at the reception desk; on-site parking available.
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Regularly scheduled meeting of the Participant Local
Government Advisory Council. The PLGAC is a six-member
advisory council, which reviews the administration of the Local
Government Surplus Funds Trust Fund (aka Florida PRIME)
and makes recommendations regarding such administration to
the Trustees. The Council operates under S. 218.409 (10)(a) of
the Florida Statutes.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Amy
Walker, State Board of Administration, (850)413-1253 or
amy.walker@sbafla.com.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Eddie McEwen, (850)413-1104 or
eddie.mcewen@sbafla.com. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

REGIONAL PLANNING COUNCILS

East Central Florida Regional Planning Council

The East Central Florida Regional Planning Council announces
a public meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, September 20, 2017, 10:00
a.m.

PLACE: 455 N. Garland Avenue, 2nd Floor Conference Room,
Orlando, FL 32801

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Regular bi-monthly meeting of the East Central Florida
Regional Planning Council.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Pegge
Parker, (407)245-0300, ext. 300 or pparker@ecfrpc.org.
Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least two (2) days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Pegge Parker, (407)245-0300, ext. 300 or
pparker@ecfrpc.org. If you are hearing or speech impaired,
please contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service,
1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Pegge Parker,
(407)245-0300, ext. 300 or pparker@ecfrpc.org.

REGIONAL PLANNING COUNCILS

East Central Florida Regional Planning Council

The East Central Florida Regional Planning Council announces
a public meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, September 20, 2017, 9:00
a.m.

PLACE: 455 N. Garland Avenue, 2nd Floor Conference Room,
Orlando, FL 32801

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Regular bi-monthly meeting of the Executive Committee.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Pegge
Parker, (407)245-0300, ext. 300 or pparker@ecfrpc.org.

3648

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS

St. Johns River Water Management District

The St. Johns River Water Management District announces a
public meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, August 30, 2017, 10:30 a.m.
PLACE: Vulcan Grandin Sand Plant, 1451 State Road 100,
Melrose, FL

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Ribbon-cutting ceremony to mark the completion of a Lower
Floridan aquifer well construction project. Optional facility
tours will follow for all who are interested. To RSVP and for
additional information use the contact information listed below.
Note: This event may be attended by one or more members of
the St. Johns River Water Management Governing Board.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: St. Johns
River Water Management District, Attention Teresa Monson at
tmonson@sjrwmd.com or (904)730-6258.


mailto:wmayer@cutr.usf.edu
mailto:wmayer@cutr.usf.edu
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
mailto:amy.walker@sbafla.com
mailto:eddie.mcewen@sbafla.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=29
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=62
mailto:pparker@ecfrpc.org
mailto:pparker@ecfrpc.org
mailto:pparker@ecfrpc.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=29
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=62
mailto:pparker@ecfrpc.org
mailto:pparker@ecfrpc.org
mailto:pparker@ecfrpc.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=122
mailto:tmonson@sjrwmd.com

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: District Clerk at (386)329-4500. If you are hearing
or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(\Voice).

COMMISSION FOR
DISADVANTAGED
The Commission for the Transportation Disadvantaged
announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: August 31, 2017, 9:00 a.m. until
completion

PLACE: Renaissance Orlando, 6677 Sea Harbor Drive,
Orlando, FL 3282; dial-in number: 1(888)670-3525, participant
code: 1383090556

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Regular Commission Business.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Julia
Blanchard, 605 Suwannee Street, MS 49, Tallahassee Florida
32399, (850)410-5700 or 1(800)983-2435.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Julia Blanchard, 605 Suwannee Street, MS 49,
Tallahassee Florida 32399, (850)410-5700 or 1(800)983-2435.
If you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency
using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Julia Blanchard, 605
Suwannee Street, MS 49, Tallahassee Florida 32399, (850)410-
5700 or 1(800)983-2435.

THE TRANSPORTATION

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Leon
Simmonds, (850)921-0041.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Leon Simmonds, (850)921-0041. If you are hearing
or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: Leon Simmonds,
(850)921-0041.

DEPARTMENT OF MANAGEMENT SERVICES

E911 Board

The Florida E911 Board announces a public meeting to which
all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: September 13, 2017, 9:00 a.m. to
conclusion of business

PLACE: Betty Easley Conference Center, Room 180,
Tallahassee, FL; join the meeting with Cintix GoTo Meeting
using your computer, tablet or smart phone at
http://global.gotomeeting.com/join/802085821;  join by
conference call at: 1(888)670-3525, participant code:
2323004133

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Matters relating to the Florida E911 Board.

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Board of Employee Leasing Companies

The Board of Employee Leasing Companies announces a
telephone conference call to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: Wednesday, August 30, 2017, 10:00 a.m.
PLACE: Telephone conference dial: 1(888)670-3525, enter
participant code: 2295006118

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
General Board Meeting.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Board of
Employee Leasing Companies, 2601 Blair Stone Road,
Tallahassee, FL 32399, (850)717-1984.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Board of Employee Leasing Companies, 2601 Blair
Stone Road, Tallahassee, FL 32399, (850)717-1984. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-
8770 (Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: Board of Employee
Leasing Companies, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, FL
32399, (850)717-1984.

3649


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=41
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=41
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=60
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=958
http://global.gotomeeting.com/join/802085821
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=277

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

Florida Real Estate Appraisal Board

The Florida Real Estate Appraisal Board announces a telephone
conference call to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, August 29, 2017, 9:30 a.m.,
Eastern Time

PLACE: Teleconference meeting to be facilitated from Zora
Neale Hurston Building, North Tower, Suite N901, 400 W.
Robinson St., Orlando, FL 32801. Teleconference number:
1(888)670-3525; participant code: 680-556-1481.

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Official business of the Appraisal Board - topics include, but
are not limited to, proposed legislation affecting Chapter 475,
Part Il, F.S., Chapter 61J1, F.A.C. rule amendments, budget
discussions, education issues, summary of applicants, petitions
for declaratory statement, petitions for rule variance/waiver,
and disciplinary actions. All or part of this meeting will be
conducted as a teleconference in order to permit maximum
participation of the Board members or Board counsel.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting:
DREAppraisalSection@myfloridalicense.com.

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (\Voice).
For more information, you may contact: Mary Paulic,
Watershed Planning and Coordination Section, Florida
Department of Environmental Protection, 2600 Blair Stone
Road, MS 3565, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400,
Mary.Paulic@dep.state.fl.us.

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
The Department of Environmental Protection announces a
public meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, August 31, 2017, 9:00 a.m.
PLACE: Marion County Growth Management, 2710 East
Silver Springs Boulevard, Ocala, FL 34470

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: This
is a meeting of the OSTDS advisory committee associated with
the Silver Springs and Rainbow Springs Basin Management
Action Plans (BMAP). Meeting items will include technical
discussions on possible approaches for addressing onsite
sewage treatment disposal system loadings to the Silver and
Rainbow Springs basins. The Department will present revised
results for the Nitrogen Source Inventory Loading Tool.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Mary
Paulic, Watershed Planning and Coordination Section, Florida
Department of Environmental Protection, 2600 Blair Stone
Road, MS 3565, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400,
Mary.Paulic@dep.state.fl.us.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Mary Paulic, Watershed Planning and Coordination
Section, Florida Department of Environmental Protection, 2600
Blair Stone Road, MS 3565, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400,
Mary.Paulic@dep.state.fl.us. If you are hearing or speech

3650

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
The Department of Environmental Protection announces a
public meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: August 31, 2017, 1:30 p.m.

PLACE: Marion County Growth Management, 2710 East
Silver Springs Boulevard, Ocala, FL 34470

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: This
is a meeting for the Silver Springs and Rainbow Springs Basin
Management Action Plans. The department will present revised
nitrogen source results and proposed reductions in nitrogen
loading for both the Silver Springs and Rainbow Springs basins.
The St. Johns River Water Management District will present a
modeling technique for predicting areas of spring’s basins with
elevated ground water nitrate levels. The meeting is open to the
public.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Ms. Mary
Paulic, Department of Environmental Protection, 2600 Blair
Stone Road, MS 3565, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400,
(850)245-8560.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Ms. Mary Paulic, Department of Environmental
Protection, 2600 Blair Stone Road, MS 3565, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-2400, (850)245-8560. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Ms. Mary Paulic,
Department of Environmental Protection, 2600 Blair Stone
Road, MS 3565, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400, (850)245-
8560.

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION
The Department of Environmental Protection announces a
public meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: August 31, 2017, 10:00 a.m.

PLACE: County Council Chambers, Room 204, Thomas C.
Kelly Administration Center, 123 West Indiana Avenue,
Deland, Florida 32720


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=282
mailto:DREAppraisalSection@myfloridalicense.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62
mailto:Mary.Paulic@dep.state.fl.us
mailto:Mary.Paulic@dep.state.fl.us
mailto:Mary.Paulic@dep.state.fl.us
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=62

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: This
is a public meeting to discuss and receive comments on the
Volusia Blue Spring Basin Management Action Plan (BMAP).
The BMAP is the means for implementation of the adopted
Total Maximum Daily Loads (TMDLSs). The primary purpose
of this meeting is to discuss and receive comments on the draft
BMAP document prior to submission for adoption.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Moira
Homann, Watershed Planning and Coordination Section,
Florida Department of Environmental Protection, 2600 Blair
Stone Road, MS 3565, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400,
moira.homann@dep.state.fl.us.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Moira Homann, Watershed Planning and
Coordination Section, Florida Department of Environmental
Protection, 2600 Blair Stone Road, MS 3565, Tallahassee,
Florida 32399-2400, moira.homann@dep.state.fl.us. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-
8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Moira Homann,
Watershed Planning and Coordination Section, Florida
Department of Environmental Protection, 2600 Blair Stone
Road, MS 3565, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2400,
moira.homann@dep.state.fl.us.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Dentistry

The Department of Health announces a telephone conference
call to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: September 14, 2017, 10:00 am., ET
PLACE: Dial conference number: 1(888)670-3525; when
prompted, enter conference code: 455263564 1#

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Probable Cause Panel with a reconsideration case.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting:
www.floridasdentistry.gov. If any person decides to appeal any
decision made by the Board with respect to any matter
considered at this meeting, he/she will need to ensure that a
verbatim record of the proceeding is made, which record
includes the testimony and evidence upon which the appeal is
to be made. Those who are hearing impaired, using TDD
equipment can call the Florida Telephone Relay System at
1(800)955-8771. Persons requiring special accommodations
due to disability or physical impairment should contact: the
Board Office at (850)245-4474.

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Division of Environmental Health

The Florida Department of Health (DOH) announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: September 13, 2017, 9:30 a.m. —2:30 p.m.,
ET or when completed, whichever is first

PLACE: DOH-Orange County Health Dept. auditorium, 6101
Lake Ellenor Drive, Orlando, 32809. Recorded teleconference
attendance call-in phone number is: 1(888)670-3525,
participant passcode: 770-804-4610, then#

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
DOH Public Swimming Pool Advisory Board will review,
discuss and make recommendations to the department
regarding applications submitted by owners/agents for variance
from the state’s public swimming pool codes.
A copy of the agenda may be
http://www.floridahealth.gov/environmental -
health/swimming-pools/index.html; by contacting: Mr. August
Ursin, (850)901-6517, august.ursin@flhealth.gov or by writing
to DOH, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin A08, Tallahassee, FL
32399-1710.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: August Ursin as listed above. If you are hearing or
speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida
Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770
(Voice).

For more information, you may contact: August Ursin as listed
above.

obtained at

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES

Family Safety and Preservation Program

The Department of Children and Families announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Friday, September 29, 2017, 10:00 a.m. —
1:00 p.m. Eastern

PLACE: 4001 Pelee St., Orlando, FL, 32817, Hope Room;
conference call number: 1(888)670-3525, participant code: 671
5356 658#

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The
purpose of the meeting is for the Independent Living Services
Advisory Council to conduct general Council business and
continue their efforts of reviewing the implementation and
operation of the Road-to-Independence Program.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting Brandie
McCabe, Department of Children and Families, (850)717-
4218, brandie.mccabe@myflfamilies.com.

3651


mailto:moira.homann@dep.state.fl.us
mailto:moira.homann@dep.state.fl.us
mailto:moira.homann@dep.state.fl.us
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=328
http://www.floridasdentistry.gov/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=335
http://www.floridahealth.gov/environmental-health/swimming-pools/index.html
http://www.floridahealth.gov/environmental-health/swimming-pools/index.html
mailto:august.ursin@flhealth.gov
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=342
mailto:brandie.mccabe@myflfamilies.com

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 1 day before the workshop/meeting by
contacting Brandie McCabe, Department of Children and
Families, (850)717-4218, brandie.mccabe@myflfamilies.com.
If you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency
using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or
1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

FISH AND WILDLIFE CONSERVATION COMMISSION
The Fish & Wildlife Foundation of Florida announces a public
meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: September 6, 2017, 2:00 p.m. — 4:00 p.m.
PLACE: The public may participate in the call in Suite 100,
Marathon Building, 2574 Seagate Dr., Tallahassee. Please call
(850)921-1144 for admittance into the Marathon Building.
GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The
Board of Directors of the Fish & Wildlife Foundation of Florida
will conduct an advisory meeting of the Foundation including
the President update, Marketing update and Financial update.
A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Mr. Will
Bradford, P.O. Box 11010, Tallahassee, Florida 32302,
(850)921-1144.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: the ADA Coordinator, at (850)488-6411. If you are
hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using the
Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-
8770 (Voice).

For more information, you may contact: Mr. Will Bradford,
P.O. Box 11010, Tallahassee, Florida 32302, (850)921-1144.

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Vikki Shirley, Corporate Secretary, Board of
Governors, 325 W. Gaines St., Suite 1614, Tallahassee, FL
32399-0400, (850)245-0466. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: Vikki Shirley,
Corporate Secretary, Board of Governors, 325 W. Gaines St.,
Suite 1614, Tallahassee, FL 32399-0400.

FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COURT CLERKS

The Florida Local Government Investment Trust announces a
public meeting to which all persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: August 25, 2017, 10:00 a.m.

PLACE: Hollywood Beach Marriott, 2501 North Ocean Drive
Hollywood, FL 33019 USA

The meeting will also be held online - JOIN WEBEX
MEETING
https://flclerks.webex.com/flclerks/j.php?MTID=mc8053d1df
25bff0d2979d5533b1b857b

Meeting number (access code): 736 152 775 Meeting password:
trustl

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
General Operations issues.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Kurt
Rodney at (850)577-4525.

For more information, you may contact: Bryant Gries at
(850)284-7471.

BOARD OF GOVERNORS

The Board of Governors, State University System of Florida,
announces public meetings to which all persons are invited.
DATES AND TIMES: August 30, 2017, 1:30 p.m.; August 31,
2017, 8:30 a.m.

PLACE: University of Florida, Emerson Alumni Hall,
President’s Ballroom B, 1938 W. University Ave., Gainesville,
FL 32611

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: The
Board and its committees will meet to conduct the regular
business of the Board.

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Vikki
Shirley, Corporate Secretary, Board of Governors, 325 W.
Gaines St., Suite 1614, Tallahassee, FL 32399-0400, and will
be available at www.flbog.edu.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to

3652

FLORIDA DEVELOPMENT FINANCE CORPORATION
The Board of Directors for the Florida Development Finance
Corporation announces a public meeting to which all persons
are invited.

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, August 24, 2017, 2:00 p.m. —
3:00 p.m.

PLACE: Enterprise Florida, Inc., South Conference Room, 800
N. Magnolia Avenue, Suite 1100, Orlando, FL 32803; dial-in
number: 1(800)501-8979, access code: 9565695

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
This meeting will discuss the following:

* Meeting Minutes: 5/2/17, 5/3/17, 7/27/17

* Resolution No. 17-08 — R-PACE Final Documents

* Nomination for Treasurer of the Board

* Other Business / Project Updates

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Jennifer
Jenkins, FDFC Administrative Coordinator, (407)956-5658.


mailto:brandie.mccabe@myflfamilies.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=68
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=72
http://www.flbog.edu/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=713
https://flclerks.webex.com/flclerks/j.php?MTID=mc8053d1df25bff0d2979d5533b1b857b
https://flclerks.webex.com/flclerks/j.php?MTID=mc8053d1df25bff0d2979d5533b1b857b
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=941

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 1 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting:  Jennifer  Jenkins, FDFC  Administrative
Coordinator, (407)956-5658. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the Board
with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or hearing,
he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony and
evidence from which the appeal is to be issued.

For more information, you may contact: Jennifer Jenkins,
FDFC Administrative Coordinator, (407)956-5658.

QUEST CORPORATION OF AMERICA, INC.

The Florida Department of Transportation (FDOT), District
Four, announces a hearing to which all persons are invited.
DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, August 29, 2017, 5:30 p.m.,
Open House; 6:00 p.m., Formal Presentation

PLACE: Boynton Beach Civic Center, 128 E. Ocean Avenue,
Boynton Beach, FL 33435

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Financial Project ID Numbers: 435804-1-22-01 and 231932-1-
22-01

Efficient Transportation Decision Making (ETDM) Numbers:
14180 and 14181

Project Description: Project Development and Environment
(PD&E) Studies

[-95 at SR 804/Boynton Beach Boulevard Interchange and 1-95
at Gateway Boulevard Interchange in Palm Beach County

A PD&E study is FDOT’s process to evaluate the social,
economic and environmental impacts associated with a planned
transportation improvement project. The purpose of this project
is to enhance overall traffic operations at the existing
interchanges of 1-95 at Boynton Beach Boulevard and 1-95 at
Gateway Boulevard, by providing improvements to achieve
acceptable traffic levels in the future, within the study limits.
The environmental review, consultation, and other actions
required by applicable federal environmental laws for this
project are being, or have been, carried out by the Florida
Department of Transportation (FDOT) pursuant to 23 U.S.C.
327 and a Memorandum of Understanding dated December 14,
2016 and executed by the Federal Highway Administration and
FDOT.

The Public Hearing will begin at 5:30 p.m. as an open house. A
formal presentation will begin at 6:00 p.m., followed by a
comment period. Persons wishing to submit written statements
or other exhibits, in place of or in addition to oral statements,
may do so at the hearing or by sending them to Mr. Thuc H. Le,
PE, FDOT Project Manager, 3400 West Commercial
Boulevard, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309. All exhibits or
statements postmarked on or before September 8, 2017, will
become part of the Public Hearing record. In the event the
Public Hearing cannot be held on August 29, 2017, due to
severe weather or other unforeseen conditions, it will be held
on the alternate date of Tuesday, September 5, 2017, at the same
time and place.

The project documents will be available to the public for review
beginning on Tuesday, August 8, 2017, at the Literacy
Coalition of Palm Beach County, 3651 Quantum Boulevard,
Boynton Beach, FL 33426 (Monday through Friday, 9 a.m. to
5 p.m.), and the Boynton Beach City Library, 208 Seacrest
Boulevard, Boynton Beach, FL 33435 (Monday through
Thursday, 9 a.m. to 8:30 p.m.; Saturday, 9 a.m. to 5 p.m., closed
on Friday and Sunday). The documents will remain on display
through Friday, September 8, 2017. The documents will also be
available for review on the website at
www.95gatewayboynton.com.

Public participation is solicited without regard to race, color,
national origin, age, sex, religion, disability, or family status.
A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Mr. Thuc
H. Le, PE, FDOT Project Manager, at (954)777-4552 or by
email at thuc.le@dot.state.fl.us.

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least seven (7) days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Mr. Thuc H. Le, PE, FDOT Project Manager, at
(954)777-4552, by email at thuc.le@dot.state.fl.us or toll-free
at 1(866)336-8435, ext. 4552. If you are hearing or speech
impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay
Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).
For more information, you may contact: Mr. Thuc H. Le, PE,
FDOT Project Manager, (954)777-4552,
thuc.le@dot.state.fl.us. Additional information is available on
the project website at www.95gatewayboynton.com.

3653


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1102
http://www.95gatewayboynton.com/
mailto:thuc.le@dot.state.fl.us
mailto:thuc.le@dot.state.fl.us
mailto:thuc.le@dot.state.fl.us
http://www.95gatewayboynton.com/

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

Section VII
Notice of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding Declaratory Statements

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Board of Optometry

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Board of Optometry has
issued an order disposing of the petition for declaratory
statement filed by Kenneth W. Lawson, O.D., on June 21, 2017.
The following is a summary of the agency's disposition of the
petition:

The Notice of Petition for Declaratory Statement was published
June 27, 2017 in Volume 40, No. 123 of the Florida
Administrative Register. The Petitioner sought the Board’s
opinion on whether the following activities would be deemed
to be in violation of cited optometry statutes and rule: (a)
becoming an owner of a vision care network company co-
owned by laypersons; and (b) contracting with a vision care
network company not owned by a licensed optometrist to render
optometry covered services to members of HMOs contracted
with the network. The Board considered the Petition at its
meeting held on July 19, 2017, in Lake Buena Vista, Florida.
The Board’s Order was filed on August 4, 2017. The Petition
filed in this cause is in substantial compliance with the
provisions of Section 120.565, F.S., and Rule 28-105.0022,
F.A.C. Based upon the facts contained in the Petition and the
testimony of Petitioner, the Board has determined that the
operation of a vision care network company does not constitute
the practice of optometry, and there is no prohibition on a
licensed optometrist taking an ownership interest in a vision
care network company co-owned with persons not licensed to
practice optometry.

A copy of the Order Disposing of the Petition for Declaratory
Statement may be obtained by contacting: Dr. Anthony Spivey,
Executive Director, Board of Optometry, 4052 Bald Cypress
Way, Bin CO7, Tallahassee, FL 32399-3255, (850)488-0595,
Anthony.Spivey@flhealth.gov.

Notice of Disposition of Petition for Administrative
Determination has been filed with the Division of
Administrative Hearings on the following rules:

NONE

Section IX
Notice of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding Non-rule Policy Challenges

Susan Rosenberg vs. Calusa Point Association, Inc., and
Department of Economic Opportunity; Case No.: 17-4514RU;
Settled and/or Dismissed prior to entry of RO/FO

Section X
Announcements and Objection Reports of
the Joint Administrative Procedures
Committee

NONE

Section VIII
Notice of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding the Validity of Rules

Notice of Petition for Administrative Determination has been
filed with the Division of Administrative Hearings on the
following rules:

Susan Rosenberg vs. Calusa Point Association, Inc., and
Department of Economic Opportunity; Case No.: 17-4514RU;
Settled and/or Dismissed prior to entry of RO/FO

3654

Section XI
Notices Regarding Bids, Proposals and
Purchasing

FLORIDA POLYTECHNIC UNIVERSITY

Addendum #1 to Construction Manager Services Applied
Research Center

PQS 17-005 CM SERVICES

APPLIED RESEARCH CENTER

ADDENDUM #1

RESPONSE DEADLINE REMAINS OCTOBER 13, 2017 BY
2:00 P.M. EASTERN

ISSUE DATE: THURSDAY, AUGUST 17, 2017
Procurement Department

Phone: (863)874-8429

4700 Research Way

Lakeland, FL 33805-8531

dobrien@floridapoly.edu

David O’Brien, Director

ALL RESPONDENTS MUST ACKNOWLEDGE RECEIPT
OF THIS ADDENDUM BY SIGNING BELOW AND
SUBMITTING THIS EXECUTED DOCUMENT WITH
YOUR RESPONSE. FAILURE TO EXECUTE AND
RETURN THIS ADDENDUM FORM MAY DISQUALIFY
YOUR FIRM’S RESPONSE.

This Addendum shall become part of your firm’s response and
the subsequent documents if applicable.


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=304
mailto:Anthony.Spivey@flhealth.gov
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1182
mailto:dobrien@floridapoly.edu

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

The following items are issued to, add to, delete from, modify
and clarify the RFQ and all associated documents. These items
shall have full force and effect as the RFQ and all associated
documents. Responses to be submitted on the specified
response due date shall conform to the additions and revisions
listed.

Vendor Name:

Address:

Phone Number:

Email:

Signature:

PQS 17-005 CM SERVICES “ARC”

Addendum No. 1

NOTICE OF CHANGE

MANDATORY PRE-SUBMITTAL MEETING

The original mandatory pre-submittal meeting date and time
has been changed as follows:

Original Date and Time: Tuesday, September 12, 2017 at 9:00
a.m., Eastern

New Date and Time: Friday, September 15, 2017 at 10:00 a.m.,
Eastern

Location remains the same as follows:

Aula Magna of the Innovation, Science & Technology Building
(IST 1000-1001) on the Florida Polytechnic University — JD
Alexander Campus in Lakeland, Florida.

Please be advised of the following with regards to Parking and
your attendance.

Parking will be available in lots 2, 4, and 5. Please note: if you
park in lot 5, you will need to get your parking pass from the
kiosk located in lot 4. We do not have a kiosk located in lot 5.
All parking passes must be displayed in your vehicle, vehicles
without a parking pass are subject to parking tickets issued by
campus security.

Important: Please change any and all old email references in the
solicitation documents.

The University email domain and extension has recently
changed as follows:
@floridapoly.edu

David O’Brien,
dobrien@floridapoly.edu
Treasa McLean, Associate Director tmclean@floridapoly.edu
Laura Marrone, Admin Support Imarrone@floridapoly.edu
Important Note: Any and all other information (not changed by
this addendum) contained in the original PQS 17-005 document
remains the same and unchanged.

END

Director of Procurement

Section XII
Miscellaneous

DEPARTMENT OF STATE

Index of Administrative Rules Filed with the Secretary
of State

Pursuant to Section 120.55(1)(b)6. — 7., F.S., the below list of
rules were filed in the Office of the Secretary of State between
8:00 a.m., Monday, August 14, 2017 and 3:00 p.m., Friday,
August 18, 2017. An improved electronic publication system is
forthcoming on the Florida Administrative Rules website,
FLRules.org, which will accommodate complete publication of
rules filed for adoption in the previous 7 days, including rules
awaiting legislative action.

Rule No. File Date Effective

Date
61G15-20.100 8/18/2017 9/7/12017
61G15-23.004 8/18/2017 9/7/2017
61G15-23.005 8/18/2017 9/7/2017
64B8-9.009 8/15/2017 9/4/2017
64B8-11.001 8/15/2017 9/4/2017
64B13-4.001 8/18/2017 9/7/2017
64J-2.006 8/14/2017 9/3/2017
68B-15.0035 8/18/2017 9/7/2017
68B-15.00355 8/18/2017 9/7/2017
68B-15.0036 8/18/2017 9/7/12017
68B-15.0042 8/18/2017 9/7/2017

LIST OF RULES AWAITING LEGISLATIVE
APPROVAL SECTIONS 120.541(3), 373.139(7)
AND/OR 373.1391(6), FLORIDA STATUTES

Rule No. File Date Effective

Date
40C-2.101 8/2/2017 ok [k [k
60FF1-5.009 7/21/2016 el ek hedadeded
64B8-10.003 12/9/2015 el ek hedadeded
69L-7.100 12/19/2016 ok [k [k
69L-7.501 12/19/2016 oY ek edadeded

3655


mailto:dobrien@floridapoly.edu
mailto:tmclean@floridapoly.edu
mailto:lmarrone@floridapoly.edu
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=1

Florida Administrative Register

Volume 43, Number 162, August 18, 2017

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION
Certificate of Need

DECISION ON EXPEDITED APPLICATION

The Agency for Health Care Administration made the
following decision on Certificate of Need application for
expedited review:

County: Pasco  Service District: 5-1

CON #10492Decision Date: 8/16/2017 Decision: A
Facility/Project: Blue Heron Health and Rehabilitation, LLC
Applicant: Blue Heron Health and Rehabilitation, LLC

Project Description: Transfer CON #10403 from Pasco SNF
Operations, LLC for the establishment of a 64-bed community
nursing facility

A request for administrative hearing, if any, must be made in
writing and must be actually received by this department within
21 days of the first day of publication of this notice in the
Florida Administrative Register pursuant to Chapter 120,
Florida Statutes, and Chapter 59C-1, Florida Administrative
Code.

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION
Certificate of Need

EXEMPTION

The Agency for Health Care Administration approved the
following exemption on August 17, 2017 pursuant to Section
408.036(3), Florida Statutes:

ID # E170020  District: 1-1 (Escambia County)
Facility/Project; PruittHealth - Santa Rosa

Applicant: PruittHealth - Santa Rosa, LLC

Project Description: Add 12 community nursing home beds
Proposed Project Cost: $6,070,000

AGENCY FOR HEALTH CARE ADMINISTRATION
Certificate of Need

DECISIONS ON BATCHED APPLICATIONS

The Agency for Health Care Administration made the
following decisions on Certificate of Need applications for the
Other Beds and Programs batching cycle with an application
due date of May 17, 2017:

County: Orange District: 7 — SA3

CON #10488  Decision Date: 08/18/2017

Decision: A

Facility/Project: Florida Hospital

Applicant: Adventist Health System/Sunbelt, Inc.

Project Description: Establish a pediatric liver transplantation
program

County: Miami-Dade District: 11 — SA4

CON #10490  Decision Date: 08/18/2017

Decision: A

Facility/Project: Baptist Hospital of Miami

Applicant: Baptist Hospital of Miami, Inc.

Project Description: Establish an adult autologous and
allogeneic bone marrow transplantation program

A request for administrative hearing, if any, must be made in
writing and must be actually received by this department within
21 days of the first day of publication of this notice in the
Florida Administrative Register pursuant to Chapter 120,
Florida Statutes, and Chapter 59C-1, Florida Administrative
Code.

Section XIlI
Index to Rules Filed During Preceding
Week

NOTE: The above section will be published on Tuesday
beginning October 2, 2012, unless Monday is a holiday, then it
will be published on Wednesday of that week.

3656


https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=188
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=188
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=59
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=188

