Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 39, February 26, 2013

Section |
Notices of Development of Proposed Rules
and Negotiated Rulemaking

DEPARTMENT OF MANAGEMENT SERVICES

Commission on Human Relations

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:

60Y-7.001 Complaints

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The proposed rule amendment
seeks to clarify that a person need not exhaust their
administrative remedies before commencing a civil action
alleging housing discrimination.

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: The proposed rule
clarifies the information regarding housing discrimination
complaints and time for filing a housing discrimination
complaint with the Florida Commission on Human Relations.
RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 760.31(5) FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 760.34 FS.

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED
UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE
DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN
THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE
REGISTER.

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF
THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT IS: Cheyanne Costilla, Florida
Commission on Human Relations, 2009 Apalachee Parkway,
Suite 100, Tallahassee, FL 32301, (850)488-7082,
Cheyanne.Costilla@fchr.myflorida.com

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE
DEVELOPMENT IS:

60Y-7.001 Complaints.

(1) Who may file. An agarieved person may, but is not
required to, file a complaint with the Commission alleging a
discriminatory housing practice. Whether or not a complaint
has been filed with the Commission, an aggrieved person may

(2) Time for Filing. A complaint may, not later than one
year after an alleged discriminatory housing practice has

occurred or terminated, be filed with the Commission. at-any

time—within—one—year—of —the—oceurrence—of —the—alleged
diseriminatery-heusing-practice: If the alleged discriminatory

housing practice is of a continuing nature, the date of the
occurrence may be any date subsequent to the commencement
of the discriminatory housing practice up to and including the
date on which it shall have ceased.

Rulemaking Speeifie Authority 760.31(5) FS. Law Implemented
760.34 FS. History-New 1-25-90, Amended 11-20-91, Formerly
22T-21.001, Amended 9-17-98, 12-31-03

Section ||
Proposed Rules

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
Division of Environmental Health

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES:

64E-9.001 General

64E-9.002 Definitions

64E-9.003 Forms

64E-9.0035 Exemptions

64E-9.004 Operational Requirements

64E-9.005 Construction Plan or Modification
Plan Approval

64E-9.006 Construction Plan Approval
Standards

64E-9.007 Recirculation and Treatment System
Requirements

64E-9.008 Supervision and Safety

64E-9.009 Wading Pools

64E-9.010 Spa Pools

64E-9.011 Water Recreation Attractions and
Specialized Pools

64E-9.013 Bathing Places

64E-9.015 Fee Schedule

64E-9.016 Variances

64E-9.017 Enforcement

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: Revision will alow for
implementation of statutory changes made to Chapter 514,
F.S., by Laws of Florida 2011-222 and 2012-184. To revise
and clarify sanitation and safety topics for public pools and
bathing places via technical & definition changes,
reorganization, glitch repair, reference updates, forms updates,
fee updates, and repeal / revise language to harmonize rules
with the Florida Building Code.

SUMMARY: All listed rule chapters under 64E-9, F.A.C., will
be revised or repealed to assure compliance with the statutory
changes, assure consistency with other state rules, to update
references, and to clarify statutory requirements and rule
language.

SUMMARY: : All listed rule chapters under 64E-9, FA.C.,
will be revised or repealed to assure compliance with the
statutory changes, assure consistency with other state rules, to
update references, and to clarify statutory requirements and

rule language.
SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED
REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE
RATIFICATION:

Section | - Notices of Development of Proposed Rules and Negotiated Rulemaking 1017



Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 39, February 26, 2013

The Agency has determined that this will not have an adverse
impact on small business or likely increase directly or
indirectly regulatory costs in excess of $200,000 in the
aggregate within one year after the implementation of the rule.
A SERC has not been prepared by the agency.

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not
expected to require legidative ratification based on the
statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is
required, the information expressly relied upon and described
herein: The proposed changes remove construction standards
for public swimming pools from the rule and permitting
requirements for public bathing places reducing department
regulation and cost to client.

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a
statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposa
for a lower cost regulatory aternative must do so in writing
within 21 days of this notice.

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 381.006, 514.0115, 514.021,
514.023(2), 514.033, 514.05, 514.071, 514.075 FS.

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 381.006, 386.01, 386.03, 386.041,
386.051, 514.011-514.075 FS.

A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE DATE, TIME AND
PLACE SHOWN BELOW:

DATE AND TIME: March 7, 2013, 10:00 am.

PLACE: Bureau of Environmental Health, Conference Room
130L, Capital Circle Office Center, 4025 Esplanade Way,
Tallahassee, Florida

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities
Act, any person requiring special accommodations to
participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the
agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by
contacting: Bob Vincent, Bureau of Environmental Health,
4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin AO08, Tallahassee, FL
32399-1713. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please
contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service,
1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice).

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE
PROPOSED RULE IS: Baob Vincent, same address and phone
number as above, or email bob_vincent@doh.state.fl.us

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS:

64E-9.001 General.

(1) Regulation of public swimming pools and bathing
places is considered by the department as significant in the
prevention of disease, sanitary nuisances, and accidents by
which the health or safety of an individua(s) may be
threatened or impaired.

(a) Any change medifieation resulting in the operation of
the pool in a manner unsanitary or dangerous to public health
or safety shall subject the state operating permit to suspension
or revocation.

1018 Section Il - Proposed Rules

(b) Failure to comply with any of the requirements of
these rules shall constitute a public nuisance dangerous to
health.

(2) This chapter prescribes incorporated references,
department forms, safety and sanitation for operation and
maintenance, miRLmM desigr-censtruetion; and retrofitting of

existing pools eperation requirements.

poeolpatrens.

(3) All pools which do not meet the definition of private
pools are public pools.

(4) As of April 29, 2012 per the Laws of Florida

2012-184, a public pool owner shall first have the plans
reviewed and permit issued for the construction or
modification of a public pool by the jurisdictional Building
Official and these shall be accomplished in accordance with
the Florida Building Code, Building, Chapter 4, Section 424.1.

(a) The pool owner / operator, or their agent shall provide
the department a copy of the building department permit issued
for construction or modification within 10 days of issuance.

(b) There shall be no changes to the pool equipment,
recirculation system, structure, markings, access, or
appurtenances for the life of the pool without first obtaining a
modification approval from the jurisdictional Building
Official, except where changes are alowed by the Florida
Building Code, or by this Chapter.

(c) Upon completion of initial construction, the pool shall
not be opened by the owner / operator for public use until an
operational permit is issued by the department. For
modifications, the completion must be certified to the
department by the design professional before the pool is
reopened.

(d) Annually, the pool owner / operator shall apply for an
operating permit from the department, and their determination
of approval for the permit shall be based upon the pool’'s
compliance with this Chapter, with the previous operating




Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 39, February 26, 2013

permit, and the maintenance of the pool in the same functional,
safety, and sanitation conditions as approved by the
jurisdictional Building department or the department. For the
purposes of this determination, department staff shall refer to
and use the Florida Building Code (FBC), Building Chapter 4,
public swimming pool section 424.1 that was in effect at the
time of the pool’ s construction permitting.

(5)4) The FBC 424.1 code is hereby incorporated by

reference. Ihe—Ameneans—w&h—D&aba%—Aet—ef—lgge—may

Rulemaking Authority 381.006, 514.021 FS. Law Implemented
381.006, 514.021, 514.03, 514.031, 514.05, 514.06 FS. History—New
10-5-93, Formerly 10D-5.130, Amended 12-27-98, 5-27-04,
5-24-09

64E-9.002 Definitions.

Words and phrases used in this chapter shall have the same
meaning as in Chapters 381, 386, 514, ES., and the FBC
424.1, unless defined below:

(1) “Advanced Level Swimmer”
unassisted for five minutes or more.

(2) “Bathing Load” — The maximum number of persons
allowed in the pool or bathing place at one time.

(3) “Closed Pool” — A pool which is not to be used by
bathers and is posted with a pool closed sign that is visible
from the pool deck, or isinaccessible for use.

(4)“Collector Tank” — A reservoir, with a minimum of
2.25 sguare feet water surface area open to the atmosphere
from which the recirculation or feature pump takes suction,
which receives the gravity flow from the main drain line,
surface overflow system or feature water source line, and that
is cleanable.

(5) “D.E.” —is the Diatomaceous Earth that is used as a
filter aid in DE type filters. For the purpose of thisrule, it also
includes aternative filter aids that have been approved under
NSF/ANSI Standard 50-2012 2067, and accepted by the filter
manufacturer.

(6) “Department” — The Department of Health (DOH),
specifically, including the Bureau Bivisien of Environmental
Health and county health departments unless specified
otherwise.

(7) “Dua Main Drain” — means two or more main drains,
their sumps and their covers in the deepest areas of the pool
that are connected to each other and connected to the pump by
properly sized pipes, at least as large as a gravity pipe required
for_a collector tank, that are hydraulically balanced such that
flow is nominally the same from both drains, and the drain
edges are no more than 20 feet apart and edges are no closer
than 3 feet together, and are connected to a single pump
producing direct suction on the two or more drains equally.

— A person able to swim

(8) “Flow Through” — Continuous verifiable inflow and
outflow or in the case of spring fed lakes shall be verifiable by
continuous outflow.

(9) “Inaccessible” — Enclosed by an effective barrier.

(102 “Living Unit” — Room(s) or spaces capable of
being occupied by an individual or group for temporary or
permanent lodging purposes. This includes motel and hotel
rooms, apartment units, boarding house rooms, condominium
units, travel trailers, recreational vehicles, mobile homes,
single family homes, and individual units in multiple unit
housing complexes.

“ H ” “ H )

( 11) “Nationally Recoqmzed Aquatic Training Proqram -

A training and certification program for swimming instructors
and lifequards equivalent to the programs offered by the
American Red Cross or the Y.M.C.A.

(12)(25) “NTU” — Nephelometric Turbidity Unit which is
ameans of measuring water clarity.

(13) “Owner / Operator” — The person, public body or
entity who legally owns the pool and is issued the operating
permit from the department.

Section |1 - Proposed Rules 1019



Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 39, February 26, 2013

(14)21) “Precoat Pot” — A container with a vaved
connection to the suction side of the recirculation pump of a
pressure diatomaceous earth (D.E.) type filter system used for
coating the filter with D.E. powder or NSF/ANSI Standard
50-2012 2067 and manufacturer approved substitute filter aid.

(15)23) “Public Bathing Place” — See Section 514.011(4),
F.S. The bathingw cas-of publicbathi ces-Helude

Hrpeundments:

(16)24) “Public Swimming Pool” or “Public Pool” — See
Section 514.011(2), F.S.

i I _

(17) “Sefety Attendant” — an able individual whose
primary function is to ensure the safety of pool patrons on the
pool deck, on pool dides, and on other play structures that are
outside of the pool proper, and who is not a certified lifeguard.

(18)(27) “ Sanitary Survey” — A professional assessment of
any existing and potential sources of pollution of a specific
land or water area.

[1] H ”

(19)3%) “Swimming Instructor” — Person who offers
progressive swimming instruction.

1020 Section Il - Proposed Rules

(20) “Unblockable drain” — a main drain sump with
dimensions greater than 18 inches wide x 23 inches long, or for
channel drains. dimensions more than 3 inches wide x 32
inches long, and this term includes the drain cover/grate. US
Consumer Product Safety Commission has defined this term

nationaly to implement the Virginia Graeme Baker Pool and

(21)€39) “Water Therapy Facilities’ as that term is used in
Section 514.0115(1), F.S., are pools used exclusively for water
therapy to treat a diagnosed injury, illness, or medical
condition, wherein the therapy is provided under the direct
supervision of a Florida licensed physical therapist,
occupational therapist, or athletic trainer; pursuant to a
prescription by a physician or a physician's assistant (PA)
licensed pursuant to Chapter 458 or 459, F.S., a podiatrist
licensed pursuant to Chapter 461, FS., or an advanced
registered nurse practitioner (ARNP) licensed pursuant to
Chapter 464, F.S.; and the prescribing physician, PA, podiatrist
or ARNP, authorizes a plan of treatment justifying use of the
pool for health care purposes. Direct supervision shall mean
therapy provided in the presence of a Florida licensed physical
therapist, occupational therapist, or athletic trainer who is
assuring patient activity comports with the physician's
prescription.




Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 39, February 26, 2013

1] Ul

Rulemaking Authority 381.006, 514.021 FS. Law Implemented
514.021, 514.03, 514.031, 514.0315, 514.05, 514.06, 514.071 FS.

History—New 10-5-93, Formerly 10D-5.131, Amended 12-27-98,
5-27-04, 5-24-09

64E-9.003 Forms.

(2) All forms listed in this chapter are herein incorporated
by reference and may be obtained from the department, at:
www.myfloridaeh.com, _or _a https://www.flrules.org,

i i - , or write to DOH,
Bureau of Environmental Health WaterPrograms, mail bin
A-08 €22, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Tallahassee 32399-1710
1742, or at the local county health department. The following
forms are for use by the department or the public:

(@) DH 1350, 2/13 #98, Public Swimming Pool Initial
Operating Permit Ergineering Inspection Report.

(b) DH Ferm 920, 2/13 Jan-—04, Public Pool and Bathing
Place I nspection Report.

(c) DH 921, 3/98, Monthly Swimming Pool Report.

(d) DH 4157, 2/13, Owner / Operator Verification of
Entrapment Safety Features.

(€) DH 4158, 2/13 Bathing Place Public Health Advisory
Sign — Poor Water Quality.

(2) Upon receipt of the following properly completed
forms, the department shall approve or deny the following
applications in accordance with the provisions of Chapters 120
and 514, ES.:

() DH 4065, 3/98, Application for A Swimming Pool
Exemption Status 32 units or less.

(b) DH 1704, 3/98, Application for A Swimming Pool
Exemption Status More Than 32 Units.

(cd) DH_ 4159

2/13, 916; #68, Application for

Swimming Pool Operating Permit/Autherization.

Permit:

(d)fgy DH 4080, 7/08, Application for Variance from
Chapter 64E-9, FA.C.

(e}hy DH 4144 1/09, Application for Swimming Pool
Exemption Status- Water Therapy Facilities.

Rulemaking Authority 381.006, 514.021 FS. Law Implemented
381.006, 514.0115, 514.021, 514.025, 514.03, 514.031, 514.0315
514.033 FS. History—New 10-5-93, Formerly 10D-5.132, Amended
12-27-98, 3-30-00, 5-27-04, 5-24-09 .

64E-9.0035 Exemptions.

(1) A person seeking an initial exemption, or an existing
facility claiming to be exempt from department regulation
pursuant to the provisions of section 514.0115, F.S., shall
apply to the department on forms listed in Rule 64E-9.003,
F.A.C. Each such application shall be renewed every five years
following 2010 bi-aprually, by July 1% of the each—even
nAumbered year 2015, 2020, etc.

(a) Applicants for a swimming pool exemption pursuant to
(2)(a) or (2)(b) or (1), of Section 514.0115, F.S., shall submit
the following information along with the applicable
department form listed for their initial exemption in electronic
or_paper format, and then shall provide only the swimming
pool related and ownership changes to these documents for any
subsequent submittals, and if no changes, only the completed
form:

1. For condominiums. the recorded declaration of
condominium; the condominium’s articles of incorporation;
bylaws, and all duly adopted and recorded amendments;
supplements, and recorded exhibits thereto; a copy of a plot
plan diagram for the proposed property; and form DH 4065 for
32 unitsor less, or DH 1704 for more than 32 units, or

2. For cooperatives: the articles of incorporation of the
association; bylaws, and the ground lease or other underlying
lease, if any; the document evidencing a unit owner’'s
membership or share in the association; and the document
recognizing a unit owner’s title or right of possession to his or
her unit; a copy of a plot plan diagram for the proposed
property; and a completed form DH 4065 for 32 units or less,
or DH 1704 for more than 32 units.

3. For exemption as a water therapy facility pool: along
with a completed form DH4144; a written statement signed by
a medical professiona that they have aready, or intend to
prescribe medical water therapy for a patient in the pool. This
medical professional shall be a physician or a physician's
assistant (PA) licensed pursuant to Chapters 458 or 459, F.S., a
podiatrist licensed pursuant to Chapter 461, FS., or an
advanced registered nurse practitioner (ARNP) licensed
pursuant to Chapter 464, FS. For subsequent biannual
exemption renewals, in addition to the signed written statement
from a medical professional as required above, each water
therapy facility shall provide a list of the Florida licensed
physical therapist(s), occupational therapist(s), and athletic
trainer(s) providing therapy in the pool.

(b) For purposes of Section 514.0115, F.S., the term
condominium shall be as defined in Chapter 718, F.S., and the
term cooperative shall be as defined in Chapter 719, FS.

Section |1 - Proposed Rules 1021



Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 39, February 26, 2013

(2) A person who sought and received an exemption from
public swimming pool regulation, shall contact the department
if the conditions upon which the exemption was granted
change so as to eliminate the exemption status. Under such
circumstances, the pool must be modified in order to comply
with the provisions of this chapter and Chapter 514, F.S.

(3) An exemption from department rules does not exempt
the pool from other federal, state, and local requirements.

orid e I -
Rulemaking Authority 381.006, 514.021 FS. Law Implemented,
514.0115 FS. History—New 5-24-09, Amended .

64E-9.004 Operational Requirements.

(1) Water Quality — The water supply for all pools shall be
an approved potable water system or shal meet the
requirements for potable water systems by the submission from
the operator of annual bacteriological and chemical laboratory
reports to the county health department. Salt water sources are
exempt from the potable water chemical standards except for
iron and color requirements.

(a) Cross-connection prevention — Ar-atrmespherie-break
or-appreved-back-flowprevention Ddevices or systems shall be

operational and maintained in their original functional

condition preweled—m—eaeh—peel—mm%pply—#ne—that—rs

(b) Bacteriological quality — The pool water shall be free
of coliform bacteria contamination.

(c) Clarity — The pool water shall be 0.5 or lessNTU and
the main drain grate must be readily visible from the pool deck.

(d) Chemical quality — Chemicals used in controlling the
quality of the pool water shall be tested and approved using the
NSF/ANSI Nationa—Sanitatien—Feundatior—INSF-ANSH
Standard 60-2011 2005, Drinking Water Treatment
Chemicals-Health Effects dated September, 2011 2005, which
is incorporated by reference in these rules, and shal be
compatible with other accepted chemicals used in pools. The
following parameters shall be adhered to for pool water
treatment:

1.pH-72t07.8.

2. Disinfection — Free chlorine residual shal be 1
milligram per liter (mg/L) to 10 mg/L, inclusive, in
conventional swimming pools and 2 mg/L to 10 mg/L,
inclusive, in al other type pools such as spa-type pools and
interactive water fountains; bromine residual shall be 1.5 mg/L
to 10 mg/L, inclusive, in conventional swimming pools and 3
mg/L to 10 mg/L, inclusive, in al other type pools. Except that,
the following maximum disinfectant levels shall apply to
indoor conventional swimming pools: 5 mg/L free chlorine or
6 mg/L bromine.

1022 Section Il - Proposed Rules

3. When oxidation-reduction potential (ORP) controllers
are required, the water potential shall be kept between 700 and
850 millivolts. Use of these units does not negate the manual
daily testing requirement of subsection 64E-9.004(13), FA.C.

4. Cyanuric acid — 100 mg/L maximum in pools, with 40
mg/L as the recommended maximum, and 40 mg/L maximum
in spapools

5. Quaternary ammonium — 5 mg/L maximum

6. Copper — 1 mg/L maximum

7. Silver — 0.1 mg/L maximum

(e) Landscape irrigation water that wets the wet deck area
of the pool, the pool itself, enters the collector tank, or wets an
interactive water feature must be potable water from a public
water system or shall meet the bacteriological quality of
potable water as evidenced by annua laboratory analysis
submitted to the department. Reclaimed water may not be used
in these areas. If reclaimed water is used in the vicinity of the
pool (inside of the poal fence or within 100 feet of the pool
water’s edge) it must employ drip irrigation or soaker hoses.
Signs shall be posted notifying pool patrons that reclaimed
water isin use, and is not to be consumed.

(2) Manual addition of chemicals will be allowed under
special conditions and requires that the pool be closed prior to
addition and for at least 1 hour period after addition or alonger
period as necessary for sufficient and safe distribution of the
chemical. After treatment for breakpoint chlorination and algae
prevention, use of the pool can be resumed when the free
chlorine levelsdrop to 10 mg/L.

(3) Cleanliness — The pool and pool deck shall be kept free
from sediment, floating debris, visible dirt and algae. Pools
shall be refinished when the pool surfaces cannot be
maintained in a safe and sanitary condition.

(4) Food and beverages are prohibited in the pool and on
the pool wet deck area; animals and glass containers are
prohibited within the fenced pool area, or 50 feet from pool
edge when no fence exists. Individuals with a disability and
service animal trainers may be accompanied by a service
animal, as defined in Chapter 413.08, F.S., into the fenced poal
area, and on the pool wet deck area; but the service animal is
not allowed to enter the pool water nor onto the drained area of
an interactive water feature (IWF) in order to prevent a direct
threat to the health of pool patrons.

(5) The pooal recirculation system must be operated at all
times when the pool is open for use. The recirculation system
may be shut off three hours after the pool closes but must
resume operation three hours before opening the pool. Shut
down time must be controlled by atime clock. When avariable
speed pump is used, the recirculation system shall be operated
such that it achieves the equivalent of 6 hours of treatment at
100% design flowrate during the daily closed period, or at least
one complete water volume turnover, whichever is greater.
Exception: vacuum DE systems are excluded from this
alowance.




Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 39, February 26, 2013

(6) The pool water level must be maintained at an
elevation suitable for continuous skimming without flooding
during periods of non-use.

(7) All equipment and appurtenances shall be kept in good
repair.

(8) When use of a public swimming pool requires an
admission or a membership fee, the most recent pool
inspection report shall be posted in plain view of existing and
potential members and patrons.

(9) Sanitary facilities shall be maintained in a clean and
sanitary condition and sanitary supplies such as toilet paper,
paper towels or blow dryer, soap and waste baskets shall be
provided.

(10) Footbaths are prohibited.

(11) Test kits are required to be on the premises of all
pools to determine free active chlorine and total chlorine using
N,N-Diethyl-p-Phenylenediamine (DPD), or bromine level,
total alkalinity, calcium hardness, and pH. NSF/ANSI Standard
50-2012 certified water quality test devicegkits or specific
laboratory analysis methods identified by the chemical product
manufacturer must be available to determine the concentration
in pool water of all NSF/ANSI Standard 60-2011 approved
chemicals that are fed or added to a public pool, or the
chemical cannot be used.

(& The following test kits shall be provided if the
corresponding chemicals are used: cyanuric acid, sodium
chloride, quaternary ammonium, ozone and copper.

(12) Activity accessories such as volleyball and basketball
nets may be used for designated times provided a clear four
foot deck area is maintained behind the structures. When the
pool isopen for general use such accessories must be removed.

(13) The keeping of a daily record of information
regarding pool operation, using the Monthly Swimming Pool
Report — DH 921 3/98, shall be the responsibility of the pool
owner or operator. Customized report forms may be substituted
provided they contain the appropriate information and are
made available aeeeptable to the department. The completed
report shall reflect manually conducted pool water tests for pH
and disinfectant levels at least once every 24 hours, and weekly
testing for cyanuric acid when chlorinated isocyanurates are
used at spas and pools, and shall be retained at the pool or
submitted monthly as required by the local health department.
DH 921, 3/98, may be obtained at the local county health
department or on the department’s internet web site. For the
purposes of daily testing of the pool water and keeping of the
Monthly Swimming Pool Log, the requirements of Rule
64E-9.018, FA.C., are not applicable, therefore any able
person can test the pool water and record it on the pool 1og.

(24) Should a human fecal accident occur, the pool
operator or owner shall comply with al recommendations
found in the Centers for Disease Control and Prevention’s
(CDC) “Feca accident response recommendations for
Aquatics Staff” dated February 15, 2008, found on the

department’s internet web site:. http:Hwww-floridashealth-orgl
Envirenmentiwater/swirrfindechtml. Alternative emergency

disinfection methods developed by industry, or by the
application of new disinfection technology, or by the use of
chemical disinfectants that are effective, safe and appropriate
for public bathing facilities, and are approved by the CDC,
may also be used.

(15) Poal and deck lighting for Fer pools used at night or
when adequate natural lighting is not available, shall be
maintained and operational at all times, except when the pool
is closed the—tlghting—reguirements—of—paragraph
B64E-9:006(){e}-shal-be-met.

(16) Annual operating permits are valid from July 1, or
from the date of issuance, until June 30.

Rulemaking Authority 381.006, 514.021 FS. Law Implemented
381.006, 514.021, 514.03, 514.031, 514.0315, 514.05, 514.06 FS.
History—New 10-5-93, Formerly 10D-5.133, Amended 12-27-98,
5-27-04, 5-24-09

64E-9.005 Construction Plan or Modification Plan

Approval.

Rulemaking Authority 381.006, 514.021 FS. Law Implemented
381.006, 514.021, 514.025, 514.03, 514.031, 514.05, 514.06 FS.
History—New 10-5-93, Formerly 10D-5.134, Amended 12-27-98,

5-27-04, 5-24-09, Repedled .

64E-9.006 Construction Plan Approva Standards.

Rulemaking Authority 381.006, 514.021 FS. Law Implemented
381.006, 514.021, 514.03, 514.031, 514.05, 514.06 FS. History—New
10-5-93, Formerly 10D-5.135, Amended 12-27-98, 5-27-04,5-24-09,
Repealed .

64E-9.007
Requirements.

Rulemaking Authority 381.006, 514.021 FS. Law Implemented
381.006, 514.021, 514.03, 514.031, 514.05, 514.06 FS. History—New
10-5-93, Formerly 10D-5.136, Amended 12-27-98, 5-27-04, 5-24-09,
Repealed .

Recirculation and Treatment System

64E-9.008 Supervision and Safety.

(1) All owners, managers, lifeguards or swimming
instructors in charge of, or working at, public swimming pools
shall be responsible for the supervision and safety of the pool.

(a) Lifeguards or swimming instructors, if provided, shall
be in full charge of persons using the pool and shall have
authority to enforce al rules. Lifeguards and swimming
instructors shall be certified in lifeguarding or swimming
instruction, respectively, by the American Red Cross, the
YMCA or other equivalent national aquatic training agencies
which meet the established standards, objectives and standards
of care provided in the American Red Cross or YMCA
programs. For the purpose of this rule, the standards found in
the 2007 edition of the American Red Cross Lifeguarding
Instructors Manual, the 2009 2004 edition of the American
Red Cross Water Safety Instructors Manual, the On the Guard

Section |1 - Proposed Rules 1023



Florida Administrative Register

Volume 39, Number 39, February 26, 2013

II, The YMCA Lifeguard Manual, (2011) {2001) Fifth Fourth
Edition, (YMCA), The Youth and Adult Aquatic Program
Manual (1999), and (YMCA) The Parent/Child and Preschool
Aquatic Program Manua (1999), are hereby adopted by
reference. Swimming instructors of developmentally disabled
students shall also be certified in accordance with Chapter
514.072, FS.

(b) Lifeguards and swimming instructors shall aso be
currently certified in first aid and in adult, child and infant
cardiopulmonary resuscitation through the American Red
Cross, or the American Heart Association, or the National
Safety Council, or the American Academy of Orthopaedic
Surgeons, or by Medic First Aid International, Inc., or by
American Safety and Health Institute.

(c) Swim coaches are exempted from the swimming
instructor certification requirement when training advanced
level swimmers for competition.

(d) Verification of equivalence, as required above, shall be
the responsibility of the department Bivision—DBirecter for
Envirenmental-Health-orhis-designee. The department shall
form an ad hoc advisory group composed of professionals in
the field of aquatics. This group shall consist of five members
and shall make recommendations to the department regarding
the equivalence of lifeguard or swimming instructor
certification programs submitted to the department under
paragraph 64E-9.008(1)(a), F.A.C. Members shal be
appointed for a period of 3 years with such appointments being
staggered so that the terms of no more than two members
expirein any one year.

(e) Lifeguard, swimming instructor, cardiopulmonary
resuscitation and first aid certificates or photocopies thereof
shall be maintained at the pool location and be available for
inspection by department personnel at any reasonable hour.

(2) Safety Equipment — All pools shall be equipped with
the following:

(a) Safety drain outlet cover(s)/grate(s) and allowable
secondary anti-entrapment devices in the time frame listed as
described in this Chapter.

(b) A AH-—swimming—peels—shalbeprovided—with—a
shepherd’ s hook securely attached to a one piece pole not less
than 16 feet in length, and for pools over 50 feet in length shall
have a second unit with one on each of the longer sides of the
pool.

(c) At at least one 18 inch diameter lifesaving ring with
sufficient rope attached to reach all parts of the pool from the
pool deck, and for pools over 50 feet in length shall have a
second unit with one on each of the longer sides of the poal.

(d) Safety equipment shall be mounted in a conspicuous
place and be readily available for use. Peels—greaterthan-50

1024 Section |1 - Proposed Rules

(€) Spa pools under 200 sguare feet of surface area, and
interactive water features or wading pools with two feet or less
of water depth are exempt from this shepard’'s hook and life
ring requirement.

(3) Safety Lines — All pools with a slope transition shall
maintain safety line anchors and have a safety line asrequired

tire—shalt—be in place at al times. upless—atifeguard—or
thstruetor-ispresent: A safety line may be temporarily removed
from the pool for patrons to swim laps only when there is a
safety attendant or lifeguard present, and it must be reinstalled
to 