Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 34, August 24, 2007

Additional information may be obtained from: Lisa
Stoutamire, 1425 Piedmont Drive, East, #201A, Tallahassee,
FL, (850)681-2003, istoutamire@fajua.org.

ABLE TRUST

The Able Trust (Florida Endowment Foundation for
Vocational Rehabilitation) will hold a Board Meeting to which
all interested persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: September 15, 2007, 9:00 am. — 12:00
Noon

PLACE: The Governor's Inn, 209 S. Adams Street,
Tallahassee, FL 32301, (850)681-6855

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To
review and approve grants to assist persons with disabilitiesin
securing employment and reviewing committee reports.

Please contact The Able Trust a (850)224-4493 or
1(888)838-2253 by September 12, 2007 if you need additional
information or accommodations.

NATIONAL COUNCIL ON COMPENSATION
INSURANCE, INC.

The Florida Workers Compensation Appeals Board
announces a meeting to which al persons are invited.

DATE AND TIME: September 18, 2007, 9:00 am. — 12:00
Noon

PLACE: Hyatt Regency Hotel at the Orlando International
Airport, 9300 Airport Blvd.,, Orlando, Florida 32827,
(407)825-1234

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To
provide a mechanism by which aggrieved parties may obtain a
review of the application of rules of the workers compensation
system to their individual workers compensation policy.
Contact: Maureen Longanacre, National Council on
Compensation Insurance, Inc., 901 Peninsula Corporate Circle,
Boca Raton, Florida 33487, (337)462-3328.

CITIZENS PROPERTY INSURANCE CORPORATION

The Citizens Property Insurance Corporation announces a
FMAP Board of Governors Meeting to which al interested
persons areinvited.

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, September 20, 2007, 8:00 a.m.
(EDT)

PLACE: The DoubleTree Hotel, Tallahassee, FL

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Item of discussion includes, but is not limited to, the Annual
Report.

For additional information, please call Barbara Walker at
1(800)807-7647, extension 3744.

Special Accommodations. In accordance with the Americans
with Disabilities Act, people with disabilities or physica
impairments who require assistance to participate in this
meeting are requested to contact Barbara Walker at least five
days prior to the meeting.

The Citizens Property Insurance Corporation announces a
Board of Governors Meeting to which all interested persons
areinvited.

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, September 20, 2007, 9:00 a.m.
(EDT)

PLACE: The DoubleTree Hotel, Tallahassee, FL

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED:
Items of discussion include, but are not limited to, key
performance indicators and committee reports.

For additional information, please call Barbara Walker at
1(800)807-7647, extension 3744.

Special Accommodations: In accordance with the Americans
with Disabilities Act, people with disabilities or physical
impairments who require assistance to participate in this
meeting are requested to contact Barbara Walker at least five
days prior to the meeting.

Section VI
Notices of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding Declaratory Statements

DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT The Florida Building
Commission has received the petition for declaratory statement
from Kelly Carman of Leo A. Daly, on behalf of Embassy
Suites-Jacksonville, Florida, on June 25, 2007, regarding
whether section 13-415.1.ABC.1, Florida Building Code,
Building Volume (2004 as amended 12/05 and 12/06) requires
the master lighting control at the main entry to motel and hotel
guest rooms to include the bathroom lights. It has been
assigned the number DCAQ7-DEC-115.

A copy of the request may be obtained by writing to: Paula P
Ford, Commission Clerk, Department of Community Affairs,
2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-2100.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT The Florida Building
Commission has received the petition for declaratory statement
from Andy Charnoubi, on behalf of Neil Melick, City of West
Palm Beach Building Official, and Kenco Communities at I bis,
Inc., on June 8, 2007, regarding whether a solid gunnite barrier
60 inches above the grade of the vanishing edge basin feature
meets the requirements for swimming pool barriers contained

Section VI - Notices of Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Declaratory Statements 3965



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 34, August 24, 2007

in section R4101.17.1, Florida Building Code, Residential
Volume (2004 as amended 12/05 and 12/06). It has been signed
the number DCA07-DEC-110.

A copy of the request may be obtained by writing to: Paula P
Ford, Commission Clerk, Department of Community Affairs,
2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-2100.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT The Florida Building
Commission has issued an order disposing of the petition for
declaratory statement filed by Billy Tyson, on behaf of
Clemons-Rutherford & Associates (Petitioner) on January 11,
2007. The following is a summary of the agency’s disposition
of the petition:

It was assigned the number DCAOQ7-DEC-011. The
Commission determined that section 703.4.1, Florida Building
Code, Building Volume (2004, as amended 12/05 and 12/06)
and ASTM E 136, adopted by reference therein, require
cement based particle board (CBPB) used as a flooring
material in a Type I|I-B Construction classroom to be
non-combustible, and the duration of the ASTM E 136
combustibility test cannot be reduced to ten minutes.

A copy of the Order Disposing of the Petition for Declaratory
Statement may be obtained by contacting: Paula P. Ford,
Commission Clerk, Department of Community Affairs, 2555
Shumard Oak Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT The Florida Building
Commission has issued an order disposing of the petition for
declaratory statement filed by Bert Kolodzigj, PE., on behalf
of ITW Buildex on November 23, 2006. The following is a
summary of the agency’s disposition of the petition:

It was assigned the number DCAO06-DEC-282. The
Commission determined that petitioner’s product, a pin
designed to attach exterior sheathing to light gauge steel
framing, is not covered by Chapter 9B-72, Florida
Administrative Code.

A copy of the Order Disposing of the Petition for Declaratory
Statement may be obtained by contacting: Paula P. Ford,
Commission Clerk, Department of Community Affairs, 2555
Shumard Oak Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT The Florida Building
Commission has issued an order disposing of the petition for
declaratory statement filed by James Losier, on behalf of
Hurricane Harness Corporation on November 6, 2006. The
following is a summary of the agency’s disposition of the
petition:

It was assigned the number DCAO06-DEC-283. The
Commission determined that petitioner’s product, tie-down
straps that are secured to the foundation and placed over the
roof to increase wind resistance, is an aftermarket retrofit not
covered by Chapter 9B-72, Florida Administrative Code.

A copy of the Order Disposing of the Petition for Declaratory
Statement may be obtained by contacting: Paula P. Ford,
Commission Clerk, Department of Community Affairs, 2555
Shumard Oak Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT The Florida Building
Commission has issued an order disposing of the petition for
declaratory statement filed by Jack McLaughlin, on behalf of
Oriolum Corp. on October 21, 2006. The following is a
summary of the agency’s disposition of the petition:

It was assigned the number DCAQ06-DEC-273. The
Commission determined that the petitioner’s product, a clip
designed to secure plywood to window openings for storm
protection, is covered by Chapter 9B-72, Florida
Administrative Code.

A copy of the Order Disposing of the Petition for Declaratory
Statement may be obtained by contacting: Paula P. Ford,
Commission Clerk, Department of Community Affairs, 2555
Shumard Oak Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT The Florida Building
Commission has issued an order disposing of the petition for
declaratory statement filed by Steve Munnell, on behalf of the
Florida Roofing, Sheet Metal & Air Conditioning Contractors
Association, Inc. on November 14, 2006. The following is a
summary of the agency’s disposition of the petition:

It was assigned the number DCAO06-DEC-284. The
Commission determined that adhesive is still an acceptable
means of securing the first course of roof tile in the High
Velocity Hurricane Zone under sections 102.4 and 1518.8.4.1,
Florida Building Code, Building Volume (2004 as amended
12/05 and 12/06) as long as it is part of an approved roofing
system and meets the requirements of chapter 16, FBC
Building Volume (2004 as amended 12/05 and 12/06) for wind
resistance.

A copy of the Order Disposing of the Petition for Declaratory
Statement may be obtained by contacting: Paula P. Ford,
Commission Clerk, Department of Community Affairs, 2555
Shumard Oak Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT The Florida Building
Commission has issued an order disposing of the petition for
declaratory statement filed by Cindy Poltrock, on behalf of
CSP Roof Consultants (Petitioner) on August 8, 2007. The
following is a summary of the agency's disposition of the
petition:

It was assigned the number DCAQ6-DEC-270. The
Commission determined that section 507.2.2, Florida Building
Code, Existing Building Volume (2004, as amended 12/05 and
12/06) requires that the wood roof deck attachments be
checked when 50% of the roof or of an area of roof is removed
and that additional fastening be installed if the roof deck
attachments are found to be deficient.

3966 Section VII - Notices of Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Declaratory Statements



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 34, August 24, 2007

A copy of the Order Disposing of the Petition for Declaratory
Statement may be obtained by contacting: Paula P. Ford,
Commission Clerk, Department of Community Affairs, 2555
Shumard Oak Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT The Florida Building
Commission has received a petition for declaratory statement
from Grant E. Tolbert, on behalf of the Hernando County
Board of County Commissioners, on January 2, 2007,
regarding whether, under section 13-104.4.1 of the Florida
Building Code, Building Volume (2004 as amended 12/05 and
12/06) an agent may sign the Energy Performance Level (EPL)
display card and certify it as accurate on behalf of the builder.
It has been signed the number DCAQ7-DEC-157.

A copy of the request may be obtained by writing to Paula P
Ford, Commission Clerk, Department of Community Affairs,
2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-2100.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT The Forida Building
Commission has received the petition for declaratory statement
from Billy Tyson, on behaf of Clemons, Rutherford &
Associates, Inc., on July 18, 2007. This request asks for
clarification of a previous declaratory statement,
DCAO07-DEC-011. The question presented in this request is
whether cement based particleboard (CBPB) material used asa
sleeper/underlayment for floor finish material, on a structural
floor assembly, where the CBPB is not a part of the structural
floor assembly or structural diaphragm, must be
non-combustible. A Petition for Leave to Intervene was
received on August 3, 2007, from McGrath Rent Corp., d/b/a
Mobile Modular Management Corporation. It has been
assigned the number DCAQ7-DEC-136.

A copy of the request may be obtained by writing to Paula P.
Ford, Commission Clerk, Department of Community Affairs,
2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-2100.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT The Florida Building
Commission has received the petition for declaratory statement
from Emil Veksenfeld, PE., on July 17, 2007, regarding
whether the definition of “Threshold Building” contained in
section 202, Florida Building Code, Building Volume (2004 as
amended 12/05 and 12/06) includes existing, new, residential,
commercial, school, and medical buildings. It has been
assigned the number DCAQ7-DEC-135.

A copy of the request may be obtained by writing to: Paula P
Ford, Commission Clerk, Department of Community Affairs,
2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Tallahassee, Florida
32399-2100.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT the Department of
Community Affairs has issued an order disposing of the
petition for declaratory statement filed by John R. Herin, Jr., on
behalf of Coral Pointe Homes, LLC on April 18, 2007. It was
assigned the number DCAO7-DEC-084. The Department
determined that the City of St. Pete Beach referendum vote
repealing the Amendment/Resort Area Master Plan does not
constitute an amendment to the comprehensive plan.

A copy of the Declaratory Statement may be obtained by
writing to Paula P. Ford, Agency Clerk, Department of
Community Affairs, 2555 Shumard Oak Boulevard,
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2100.

DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Florida Department of
Revenue has issued an Order Dismissing Petition for
Declaratory Statement in response to the Petition for
Declaratory Statement filed with the Department by Alec F.
Redfearn and Margaret A. Redfearn, pursuant to Section
120.565, Florida Statutes. The Department declines to issue a
declaratory statement because the Petition fails to meet the
requirement that there be a demonstration within the Petition of
an actual, present and practical need for the declaration, and
that the requested declaration deals with a present controversy
asto a state of facts.

A copy of the Order Dismissing Petition for Declaratory
Statement may be obtained by contacting Nancy Purvis,
Agency Clerk, Department of Revenue, Office of General
Counsel, P O. Box 6668, Tallahassee, Florida 32314-6668,
(850)488-0712.

BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE INTERNAL
IMPROVEMENT TRUST FUND

Notices for the Board of Trustees of the Internal Improvement
Trust Fund between December 28, 2001 and June 30, 2006, go
to http://www.dep.state.fl.us/ under the link or button titled
“Official Notices.”

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL
REGULATION

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT The Building Code
Administrators and Inspectors Board has received the petition
for declaratory statement from David Hodges. The petition
seeks the agency’s opinion as to the applicability of Section
468.609(7)(a), Florida Statutes. asit applies to the petitioner.

The Building Code Administrators and Inspectors Board
hereby gives notice that it has received a Petition for
Declaratory Statement filed on June 25, 2007 on behalf of
David Hodges. The Petitioner seeks the Board's interpretation
of Section 468.609(7)(a), Florida Statutes. Specificaly, the
Petitioner requests that the Board issue a Declaratory

Section VI - Notices of Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Declaratory Statements 3967



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 34, August 24, 2007

Statement as to the description of the “newly employed or
promoted” may or does affect the standards of provisional
certification.

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be
obtained by contacting: Robyn Barineau, Executive Director,
Building Code Administrators and Inspectors Board, 1940
North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0750.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT the Department of
Business and Professional Regulation, Division of Florida
Land Sales Condominiums and Mobile Homes has issued an
order disposing of the petition for declaratory statement filed
by Prentiss Pointe, Ltd., Docket No. 2007035326 on June 13,
2007. The following is a summary of the agency’s disposition
of the petition:

An Order Closing File has been issued because the Petition
was withdrawn.

A copy of the Order Disposing of the Petition for Declaratory
Statement may be obtained by contacting: the Division Clerk,
Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division
of Florida Land Sales, Condominiums, and Mobile Homes,
1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2217.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT the Division of Florida
Land Sales, Condominiums, and Mobile Homes, Department
of Business and Professional Regulation, State of Florida, has
received the petition for declaratory statement from Altamira at
North Hutchinson Island Condominium Association, Inc.;
Docket No. 2007042090. The petition seeks the agency’s
opinion as to the applicability of Sections 718.110(4) and
718.112(2)(f), Florida Statutes. asit appliesto the petitioner.
Whether Altamira at North Hutchinson Island Condominium
Association, Inc. may amend the declaration of its two
condominiums to change the alocation of the common
expenses assessed for the limited common elements assigned
to each separately with a two-thirds vote under Section
718.110(4), F.S., and combine the reserves for these expenses
under Section 718.112(2)(f), Florida Statutes.

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be
obtained by contacting: the Division Clerk, Department of
Business and Professional Regulation, Division of Florida
Land Sales, Condominiums, and Mobile Homes, 1940 North
Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2217.

Please refer al comments to: Janis Sue Richardson, Chief
Assistant General Counsel, Department of Business and
Professional Regulation, Division of Florida Land Sales,
Condominiums, and Mobile Homes, 1940 North Monroe
Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2202.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT the Division of Florida
Land Sales, Condominiums, and Mobile Homes, Department
of Business and Professional Regulation, State of Florida, has
received the petition for declaratory statement from Galt Mile

Apartments, Inc., d/b/a Coral Ridge Towers, Docket No.
2007043749. The petition seeks the agency’s opinion as to the
applicability of Section 719.1055(4)(a), Florida Statutes as it
applies to the petitioner.

Whether Galt Mile Apartments, Inc., a cooperative association,
may properly amend the terms and provisions of the
Occupancy Agreement under Section 719.1055(4)(a), Florida
Statutes.

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be
obtained by contacting: the Division Clerk, Department of
Business and Professional Regulation, Division of Florida
Land Sales, Condominiums, and Maobile Homes, 1940 North
Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2217.

Please refer al comments to: Janis Sue Richardson, Chief
Assistant General Counsel, Department of Business and
Professional Regulation, Division of Forida Land Sales,
Condominiums, and Mobile Homes, 1940 North Monroe
Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-2202.

NOTICE ISHEREBY GIVEN THAT on August 8, 2007, the
Construction Industry Licensing Board has issued an order
disposing of the petition for declaratory statement filed by
George Garner on March 12, 2007. The following is a
summary of the agency's disposition of the petition:

The Notice of Petition for Declaratory Statement was
published in Vol. 33, No. 14, of the April 6, 2007, FA.W. The
Petitioner sought the Board’'s interpretation of Section
489.105(3)(m), Florida Statutes, entitled “Definitions’ and
whether the activities described in the petition constitute
“plumbing contracting” and whether petitioner would be
required to be licensed as a plumbing contractor. The Board
considered the instant Petition a a duly-noticed public
meeting, held May 11, 2007, in Tampa, Florida. The Board's
Order denied to answer the petition for declaratory statement
because the question posed is the subject of pending litigation.
A declaratory statement is not an appropriate remedy where
there is pending litigation.

A copy of the Order Disposing of the Petition for Declaratory
Statement may be obtained by contacting: G W. Harrell,
Executive Director, Construction Industry Licensing Board,
1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0750.

NOTICE ISHEREBY GIVEN THAT on January 20, 2006, the
Construction Industry Licensing Board has issued an order
disposing of the petition for declaratory statement filed by
Dannie S. Johnson on October 4, 2005. The following is a
summary of the agency's disposition of the petition:

The Notice of Petition for Declaratory Statement was
published in Vol. 31, No. 43, of the October 28, 2005, FA.W.
The Petitioner sought the Board's interpretation of Section
489.113(9), Florida Statutes, entitled “Qualifications for
practice; restrictions’ and whether a licensed Residentia or
Commercial Swimming Pool Contractor, in accordance with

3968 Section VII - Notices of Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Declaratory Statements



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 34, August 24, 2007

Section 489.113(9), F.S., include in his contract the sale of a
screen enclosure which will be subcontracted to an
appropriately licensed contractor for installation. The Board
considered the instant Petition a a duly-noticed public
meeting, held November 9-11, 2005, in Naples, Florida. The
Board’s Order answered that if the majority of the work within
the contract is within the scope of the Residential or
Commercial Swimming Pool contractor, the contractor may
include in his contract the sale of a screen enclosure, which
will be subcontracted to an appropriately licensed contractor
for installation.

A copy of the Order Disposing of the Petition for Declaratory
Statement may be obtained by contacting: G- W. Harrell,
Executive Director, Construction Industry Licensing Board,
1940 North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0750.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT The Building Code
Administrators and Inspectors Board has received the petition
for declaratory statement from David Hodges. The petition
seeks the agency’s opinion as to the applicability of Section
468.609(7)(a), Florida Statutes, asit applies to the petitioner.
The Building Code Administrators and Inspectors Board
hereby gives notice that it has received a Petition for
Declaratory Statement 2007-035, filed on June 26, 2007 on
behalf of David Hodges. The Petitioner seeks the Board's
interpretation of Section 468.13, Florida Statutes. Specifically,
the Petitioner requests that the Board issue a Declaratory
Statement as to the description of unlicensed persons
(“runners’) that may or does affect the statutory provision of
therule.

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be
obtained by contacting: Robyn Barineau, Executive Director,
Building Code Administrators and Inspectors Board, 1940
North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0750.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT The Building Code
Administrators and Inspectors Board has received the petition
for declaratory statement from David Hodges. The petition
seeks the agency’s opinion as to the applicability of Section
468.609(7)(a), Florida Statutes, asit applies to the petitioner.

The Building Code Administrators and Inspectors Board
hereby gives notice that it has received a Petition for
Declaratory Statement 2007-036, filed on July 26, 2007 on
behalf of David Hodges. The Petitioner seeks the Board's
interpretation of Section 489.13, Florida Statutes. Specifically,
the Petitioner reguests that the Board issue a Declaratory
Statement clarifying whether Section 489.13 applies to
Building Code Administrators and Inspectors Board licensees.

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be
obtained by contacting: Robyn Barineau, Executive Director,
Building Code Administrators and Inspectors Board, 1940
North Monroe Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0750.

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION

Notices for the Department of Environmental Protection
between December 28, 2001 and June 30, 2006, go to
http://www.dep.state.fl.ug under the link or button titled
“Official Notices.”

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT the Department of
Financial Services, Division of State Fire Marshal has issued
an order disposing of the petition for declaratory statement
filed by Petition for Declaratory Statement, Lee County,
Florida, Case #90308, on August 9, 2007. The following is a
summary of the agency’s disposition of the petition:

The Declaratory Statement concludes that the Department’s
pre-emption under Section 552.30(1), Florida Statutes, is
limited to the manner in which explosives are used in
construction materials mining activities, not the location of
mines.

A copy of the Order Disposing of the Petition for Declaratory
Statement may be obtained by contacting: Lesley Mendelson,
Assistant General Counsel, 200 East Gaines Street,
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0340 or by e-mailing your request to
Ledey.Mende son@fldfs.com.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT the Department of
Financia Services, Division of State Fire Marshal, has
received a Petition for Declaratory Statement filed on or about
August 10, 2007, from Mark Cavinee, Petitioner. The Petition
requests a declaratory statement regarding the Florida Building
Code Section 423.8.1.1., in conflict the Florida Fire Prevention
Code, specifically states that “the support spaces such as media
centers, administrative offices, and cafeterias and kitchens
located within educational facilities are not separate
occupancies.”

A copy of the Petition may be obtained by writing to, calling,
or faxing: Lesley Mendelson, Assistant General Counsel, 200
East Gaines Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0340, phone
(850)413-3604, or (850)413-4238; Fax (850)922-1235 or
(850)488-0697 (please advise if you would like it mailed or
faxed to you and please include your phone number on your
request in case any question arises), or by e-mailing your
request to L esley.Mendel son@fldfs.com.

Section VI - Notices of Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Declaratory Statements 3969



Florida Administrative Weekly

Volume 33, Number 34, August 24, 2007

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT the Office of Financia
Regulation received a petition for declaratory statement on
July 17, 2007, from Craig A. Waltzer, President and Chairman
of Aventura Holdings, Inc. The petition seeks the Office's
opinion as to the application of Chapter 559, Florida Statutes
and Chapter 687, Florida Statutes and specifically Section
559.565(1), Florida Statutes and Section 687.071, Florida
Statutes to the activities of Ohio Funding Group, Inc. and
National Automobile Finance, Inc.

A copy of the petition for declaratory statement may be
obtained by writing: Agency Clerk, Office of Financial
Regulation, Fletcher Building, Suite #526, 200 E. Gaines
Street, Tallahassee, FL 32399-0379.

Section VIII
Notices of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding the Validity of Rules

Notice of Petition for Administrative Determination has
been filed with the Division of Administrative Hearings on
the following rules:

NONE

Notice of Disposition of Petition for Administrative
Determination have been filed by the Division of
Administrative Hearings on the following rules:

NONE

Section IX
Notices of Petitions and Dispositions
Regarding Non-rule Policy Challenges

NONE

Section X
Announcements and Objection Reports of
the Joint Administrative Procedures
Committee

NONE

Section XI
Notices Regarding Bids, Proposals and
Purchasing

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

Invitation To Bid (ITB)

For a Roofing Contractor
Sealed bids will be received by Duval County Public Schools,
Division of Facilities, Room 535, 1701 Prudential Drive,
Jacksonville, FL 32207 until the time and date(s) recorded
below and immediately thereafter publicly opened and
recorded in the Duval County Public Schools, School Board
Building, 5th Floor, Room 513D, 1701 Prudentia Drive,
Jacksonville, Florida
BIDS ARE DUE ON OR BEFORE September 25, 2007
AND WILL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL 2:00 p.m.
Districtwide Roof Replacement at Various Schools, DCPS
PROJECT NO. M-84890, Stage |1
SCOPE OF WORK: Replace all deteriorated roofing at Alden
Road Exceptional Center No. 252, Atlantic Beach Elementary
School No. 65, Pam Avenue Exceptional Student Center No.
170, Lone Star Elementary School No. 233, Mayport
Elementary School No. 227, and Southside Administration
Building No. 275. The estimated construction cost Budgeted
Not to Exceed $1,286,692.
All contractors that are interested in bidding are required to
attend amandatory pre-bid conference to be held on September
12, 2007, 9:00 am. at 129 King Street, Room 37, Jacksonville,
Florida 32204. Failure to attend the pre-bid conference shall
result in disqualification of that firm's proposal. Attendees
will be required to sign an attendance register.
All bidders and subcontractors shall be licensed Contractors
and registered corporations as required by the laws of the State
of Florida
Contract documents for bidding may be obtained for a
refundable fee of $75.00 at the office of:
Akel, Logan & Shafer, PA., 704 Rosselle Street, Jacksonville,
Florida 32204
DCSB Point of Contact: Dale Hughes, (904)858-6308
Contract documents for bidding may be examined at:

F.W. Dodge McGraw Hill Plan Room  Construction Bulletin
Construction Market Data, Inc. National Association of Minority
Contractors

MBE Participation Goal: 10% Overall

The Duva County Public Schools has begun prequalifying all
contractors who intend to submit bids for all construction
projects exceeding $200,000 and electrical projects exceeding
$50,000. Effective May 31, 2003, al Contractors submitting
bids must be prequalified with Duval County Public Schools.
No bids will be accepted from Contractors who are not
prequalified with Duval County Public Schools.

3970 Section VIII - Notices of Petitions and Dispositions Regarding the Validity of Rules



