
Florida Administrative Register Volume 42, Number 218, November 8, 2016 

 

4975 

 

Section I 

Notice of Development of Proposed Rules 

and Negotiated Rulemaking 

DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE 

Corporate, Estate and Intangible Tax 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

12C-1.0196 Research and Development Tax Credit 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The purpose of the proposed 

amendments to Rule 12C-1.0196, F.A.C. (Research and 

Development Tax Credit), are to clarify the application 

process for eligible corporate partners, provide guidance to 

businesses that have timely challenged a Department of 

Economic Opportunity (“DEO”) refusal to issue a certification 

letter, clarify the Department’s review and allocation process 

for applications which require appeal to DEO, and provide an 

explanation of the impact on the allocated credit amount when 

the credit applied for is understated or overstated. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: The subject area of 

the rule development workshop is the proposed changes to 

Rule 12C-1.0196, F.A.C. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 213.06(1), 220.196(4), 

220.51 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 220.196 FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE HELD AT THE 

DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW: 

DATE AND TIME: November 22, 2016, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: 2450 Shumard Oak Boulevard, Building One, Room 

1220, Tallahassee, Florida 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Becky Nall at (850)617-8346. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Jennifer 

Ensley, Technical Assistance and Dispute Resolution, 

Department of Revenue, P.O. Box 7443, Tallahassee, Florida 

32314-7443, telephone: (850)617-8346. 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS: Published on the Department’s Internet 

site at myflorida.com/dor/rules. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-1.005 Disciplinary Guidelines 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To amend the guidelines which 

just read 3rd offense to read 3rd and any subsequent offenses. 

This will make all of the guidelines use the correct 

terminology. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: The Disciplinary 

Guidelines. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 455.2273, 509.032 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 213.50(3), 386.207, 500.451, 

509.032, 509.092, 509.215(5), 509.261, 509.281, 509.292 FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

REGISTER. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Cindy 

Ross, Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Department of 

Business and Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Rd. 

Tallahassee, FL 32399-1001, 

DHR.Rules@myfloridalicense.com, (850)488-1133 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE 

FROM THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

School Psychology 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

64B21-501.003 Biennial Renewal Fee. 

64B21-501.005 Application Fees. 

64B21-501.006 Reactivation Fee. 

64B21-501.0065 Change of Status Fee. 

64B21-501.007 Inactive Renewal Fee. 

64B21-501.009 Initial Licensure Fee. 

64B21-501.010 Continuing Education Provider Fee. 

64B21-501.011 Delinquency Fee. 

64B21-501.013 Duplicate License Fee. 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT:  To clarify and update school 

psychology licensure fees by repealing unnecessary rules.      

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Fees for school 

psychologist licensure and school psychologist continuing 

education providers. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 456.013, 456.025(10), 

456.036, 490.007(1), 490.0085(2), (4), 490.015, (2) FS.  

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 456.013, 456.025(10), 456.036, (4), 

490.005, 490.006, 490.007(1)  490.0085(4) FS. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=12
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=35
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=12C-1.0196
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=213.06(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20220.196(4)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20220.51%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=220.196%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-1.005
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=455.2273
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20509.032%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=213.50(3),%20386.207,%20500.451,%20509.032,%20509.092,%20509.215(5),%20509.261,%20509.281,%20509.292
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=213.50(3),%20386.207,%20500.451,%20509.032,%20509.092,%20509.215(5),%20509.261,%20509.281,%20509.292
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=313


Florida Administrative Register Volume 42, Number 218, November 8, 2016 

 

4976 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

WEEKLY. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Allen 

Hall, Executive Director, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin #C-05, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399; Allen.Hall@FlHealth.gov 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE 

FROM THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Certified Master Social Workers 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

64B25-28.002 Application Fee. 

64B25-28.004 Endorsement Fee. 

64B25-28.006 Initial Certification Fee. 

64B25-28.007 Biennial Certification Renewal Fee. 

64B25-28.008 Reactivation Fee. 

64B25-28.009 Biennial Inactive Status Renewal Fee. 

64B25-28.011 Continuing Education Provider Application 

Fee. 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT:  To update fee schedule for 

certified master social workers by repealing unnecessary rules. 

SUBJECT AREA TO BE ADDRESSED: Fees for certified 

master social worker licensure and continuing education 

providers. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 456.017, 491.007, 491.0085, 

491.0145, 491.015 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED:  456.017, 491.006, 491.007, 

491.008, 491.0085, (2), 491.0145 FS. 

IF REQUESTED IN WRITING AND NOT DEEMED 

UNNECESSARY BY THE AGENCY HEAD, A RULE 

DEVELOPMENT WORKSHOP WILL BE NOTICED IN 

THE NEXT AVAILABLE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE 

WEEKLY. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT AND A COPY OF 

THE PRELIMINARY DRAFT, IF AVAILABLE, IS: Jennifer 

Wenhold, Executive Director, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin 

#C-08, Tallahassee, Florida 32399 or 

Jennifer.Wenhold@FlHealth.gov 

THE PRELIMINARY TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE 

DEVELOPMENT IS AVAILABLE AT NO CHARGE 

FROM THE CONTACT PERSON LISTED ABOVE. 

Section II 

Proposed Rules 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE:  

14-46.001 Utilities Installation or Adjustment 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: To update material incorporated 

by reference. 

SUMMARY: The proposed rule incorporates the most recent 

version of the Utility Accommodations Manual, providing 

permitting conditions for utilities in state right of way. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will 

not have an adverse impact on small business or likely 

increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of 

$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the 

implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by 

the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: changes to the incorporated materials do not have an 

adverse impact on economic growth, job creation or 

employment, private sector investment, or business 

competitiveness. A SERC was prepared on a prior similar 

version of the rule and found the costs associated with 

compliance were not regulatory, but based on the Department 

of Transportation’s proprietary interest. The 2017 proposed 

rule version also imposes no regulatory cost. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 334.044(2), 337.401, 

337.405, FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 337.401, 337.402, 337.403, 337.405, 

FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE 

DATE, TIME AND PLACE SHOWN BELOW:  

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, November 29, 2016, 1:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Florida Department of Transportation Auditorium, 

605 Suwannee Street, Tallahassee, FL 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Susan Schwartz, Assistant General Counsel, 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=317
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=14
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=14-46.001
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=334.044(2)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20337.401
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20337.405
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=337.401
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20337.402
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20337.403
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20337.405


Florida Administrative Register Volume 42, Number 218, November 8, 2016 

 

4977 

 

Florida Department of Transportation, 605 Suwannee Street, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0458, (850)414-5392, 

susan.schwartz@dot.state.fl.us.. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Susan Schwartz, Assistant General 

Counsel, Florida Department of Transportation, 605 

Suwannee Street, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0458, (850)414-

5392, susan.schwartz@dot.state.fl.us 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

14-46.001 Utilities Installation or Adjustment 

(1) No change. 

(2) Permits. 

(a) FDOT will issue permits for the construction, 

alteration, operation, relocation, removal, and maintenance of 

utilities upon the right of way in conformity with the FDOT 

Utility Accommodation Manual (UAM), 2017 edition August 

2010 edition,  FDOT Document No. 710-020-001-g, which is 

hereby incorporated by reference at _______________ and 

made part of this rule.  The UAM also incorporates by 

reference additional documents contained in the UAM Section 

6.1, Incorporated References.  Copies of the UAM are 

available from the FDOT Maps and Publications Office at 605 

Suwannee Street, MS 12, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0450, or 

the FDOT Utility Web Site: 

www.fdot.gov/programmanagement/utilities/ 

http://www.dot.state.fl.us/rddesign/utilities. The following 

documents are hereby incorporated by reference and made a 

part of this rule: 

(a)(b) The Utility Permit, Rev. 10/16 08/10, is 

incorporated herein by reference at 

________________________ and available from 

www.fdot.gov/programmanagement/utilities; the FDOT 

Utility Web Site listed above. 

(b) Utility Work Schedule, Rev. 10/16, incorporated 

herein by reference at                 and available from 

www.fdot.gov/programmanagement/utilities; 

(c) Utility Work Estimate, 10/16, incorporated herein by 

reference at                     and available from 

www.fdot.gov/programmanagement/utilities; 

(d) American Petroleum (API) Standard 1104 – Welding 

of Pipelines and Related Facilities, 20th Edition, October 2005, 

available at www.techstreet.com/api/products/1237425. 

Posting of this manual for public inspection would violate 

federal copyright law. A copy is available for public 

inspection during regular business hours at the Florida 

Department of Transportation, Program Management Office, 

605 Suwannee Street, Tallahassee, Florida. 

(e) Grades and Standards for Nursery Plants, Florida 

Department of Agriculture and Consumer Services, Division 

of Plant Industry, 2015 incorporated herein at 

https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-

06046 and available from 

www.fdot.gov/programmanagement/utilities.  

(f) FDOT 2016 Design Standards, Indexes 546, 600, 601, 

602, 603, 604, 605, 611, 612, 613, 615, 616, and 660, 

incorporated herein at 

https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-

06045 and available from 

www.fdot.gov/programmanagement/utilities.  

(g) FDOT South Florida Rail Policy, Topic No. 000-725-

003-j, effective 9/20/2007, incorporated herein at 

https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-

06031and available from 

www.fdot.gov/programmanagement/utilities; 

(h) American Society for Testing and Materials (ASTM) 

D1586-11 Standard Test Method for Standard Penetration Test 

(SPT) and Split-Barrel Sampling of Soils (2011) available at 

astm.org/standards/D1586.htm.  Posting of this manual for 

public inspection would violate federal copyright law. A copy 

is available for public inspection during regular business hours 

at the Florida Department of Transportation, Program 

Management Office, 605 Suwannee Street, Tallahassee, 

Florida. 

(i) American National Standards for Tree Care Operations 

– Tree, Shrub, and Other Woody Plant Management- Standard 

Practices (Pruning), ANSI A300 (Part 1) – 2008 Pruning, 

available at www.tcia.org.  Posting of this manual for public 

inspection would violate federal copyright law. A copy is 

available for public inspection during regular business hours at 

the Florida Department of Transportation, Program 

Management Office, 605 Suwannee Street, Tallahassee, 

Florida. 

Rulemaking Authority 334.044(2), 337.401, 337.405,  FS. Law 

Implemented  337.401, 337.402, 337.403, 337.405, FS. History–New 

5-13-70, Amended 8-10-78, 7-22-82, Formerly 14-46.01, Amended 

7-5-90, 6-8-93, 10-15-96, 8-30-99, 11-10-05, 1-24-08, 1-30-11,  

_________ . 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Thomas Bane, State Utilities Engineer 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Jim Boxold, Secretary 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: November 2, 2016 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: September 23, 2014 

http://www.dot.state.fl.us/rddesign/utilities
http://www.fdot.gov/programmanagement/utilities
http://www.fdot.gov/programmanagement/utilities
http://www.fdot.gov/programmanagement/utilities
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-06046
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-06046
http://www.fdot.gov/programmanagement/utilities
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-06045
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-06045
http://www.fdot.gov/programmanagement/utilities
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-06031
https://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-06031
http://www.fdot.gov/programmanagement/utilities
http://www.tcia.org/


Florida Administrative Register Volume 42, Number 218, November 8, 2016 

 

4978 

COMMISSION ON ETHICS 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

34-7.010 List of Forms and Instructions 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The rule is being amended to 

update a form which is incorporated by reference in subsection 

(1)(b) of the rule. CE Form 50 is being amended for greater 

clarity and to incorporate certain stylistic changes. 

SUMMARY: This rulemaking affects CE Form 50, which is 

the Commission's complaint form. In particular, the amended 

complaint form: (1) expands the instructions included with the 

form by detailing the purpose for each of the form's sections, 

explaining the Commission's jurisdiction, describing the 

applicable statute of limitations, and discussing more fully the 

circumstances in which a complaint could trigger an award of 

costs and attorney's fees; (2) shortens language about filing 

one complaint per respondent; (3) eliminates specific 

references to the Sunshine Amendment and Code of Ethics, 

substituting instead the phrase "ethics law"; (4) rephrases 

language concerning the submission of media materials; and 

(5) asks that the complaint not include voluminous exhibits or 

copies of statutes. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will 

not have an adverse impact on small business or likely 

increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of 

$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the 

implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by 

the Agency.  

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: based on past experiences with rules of this nature, the 

adverse impact or regulatory cost, if any, do not exceed and 

would not be expected to exceed any one of the economic 

criteria set forth in Section 120.541(2)(a), F.S. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 112.322(9), FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: Art. II, Section 8, Fla. Const., 

112.324, FS. 

A HEARING WILL BE HELD AT THE DATE, TIME AND 

PLACE SHOWN BELOW:  

DATE AND TIME: December 9, 2016, 8:30 a.m. 

PLACE: First District Court of Appeal, Third Floor 

Courtroom, 2000 Drayton Drive, Tallahassee, Florida 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Diana Westberry, Executive Secretary, 

Commission on Ethics, (850)488-7864. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Grayden Schafer, Senior Attorney, 

Commission on Ethics, (850)488-7864 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

34-7.010 List of Forms and Instructions. 

(1) The following forms and instructions are incorporated 

by reference and are used by the Commission in its dealings 

with the public: 

(a) No change 

(b) Form 50, Complaint. To be utilized by persons 

wishing to file a complaint against any public officer, public 

employee or candidate for public office alleging a violation of 

any provision of Part III, Chapter 112, F.S. or to be utilized by 

persons wishing to file a complaint which alleges any other 

breach of public trust on the part of a public officer or 

employee who is not within the jurisdiction of the Judicial 

Qualifications Commission.  

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-    .  

Revised       .  Effective 1/2002. 

(c) through (j) No change. 

(2) No change. 

Rulemaking Authority Art. II, Section 8(i), Fla. Const., 112.31425, 

112.3144, 112.3145, 112.3147, 112.3215(14), 112.322(9) FS. Law 

Implemented Art. II, Section 8(a), (f), (h), Fla. Const., 112.313(9), 

(12), 112.31425, 112.3143, 112.3144, 112.3145, 112.3148, 

112.31485, 112.3149, 112.3215 FS. History–New 4-11-76, Formerly 

34-7.10-7.22, 8.10, Amended 2-23-77, 4-7-77, 5-17-77, 10-20-77, 2-

25-79, 1-29-80, 4-29-81, 1-12-82, 3-25-82, 2-21-83, Formerly 34-

7.10, Amended 7-10-88, 3-4-91, 10-6-91, 10-29-91, 12-22-91, 7-5-

92, 10-15-92, 12-6-92, 11-10-93, 12-27-93, 11-21-94, 2-16-95, 12-

26-95, 1-27-97, 1-1-98, 1-1-99, 1-1-00, 12-4-00, 12-21-00, 10-14-01, 

11-22-01, 1-1-02, 1-1-03, 1-1-04, 1-1-05, 1-1-06, 6-15-06, 1-1-07, 1-

1-10, 8-18-10, 1-1-11, 1-19-11, 11-4-13, 1-1-15, 11-24-15, 7-5-16,            

. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Grayden Schafer, Senior Attorney, Commission on Ethics, 

(850)488-7864 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Virlindia Doss, Executive Director, 

Commission on Ethics 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: November 4, 2016 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=34
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=34-7.010
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=112.322(9)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/flconstitution.asp?id=Art.%20II,%20Section%208,%20Fla.%20Const.,
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/flconstitution.asp?id=Art.%20II,%20Section%208,%20Fla.%20Const.,
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20112.324


Florida Administrative Register Volume 42, Number 218, November 8, 2016 

 

4979 

 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: August 4, 2016 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

State Boxing Commission 

RULE NOS.: RULE TITLES: 

61K1-1.003 Licenses, Permits; Requirement, Procedure 

and Period, Fee 

61K1-1.004 Weight Classes; Weigh-In; Pre-Match 

Physical of Participant and Referee 

61K1-1.0043 Drugs and Foreign Substances; Penalties 

61K1-1.006 Arena Equipment; Ring Requirements; 

Fenced Area Requirements for Mixed 

Martial Arts; Other Fight Mediums; Floor 

Plan and Apron Seating; Emergency 

Medical and Other Equipment and Services 

61K1-1.007 Participants’ Apparel and Appearance 

61K1-1.008 Bandages and Handwraps 

61K1-1.009 Gloves and Mouthpieces 

61K1-1.012 Participant; License; Conduct and Other 

Requirements 

61K1-1.037 Post-Match Physical Requirements; 

Suspensions 

61K1-1.040 Post-Match Reports Required to be Filed; 

Penalty for Late Filing 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The rules are being repealed 

because they are duplicative of 61K1-3. 

SUMMARY: Repeal rules. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will 

not have an adverse impact on small business or likely 

increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of 

$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the 

implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by 

the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: During discussion of the economic impact of this rule 

at its meeting, the Commission, based upon the expertise and 

experience of its members and the substance of the repealed 

rules, determined that a Statement of Estimated Regulatory 

Costs (SERC) was not necessary because the rule does not 

impose additional rights, obligations, or duties on any persons 

or businesses, and that the rule will not require ratification by 

the Legislature. No person or interested party submitted 

additional information regarding the economic impact at that 

time. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 548.003, 548.041 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 548.003(2), 548.006, 548.011, 

548.012, 548.013, 548.014, 548.017, 548.021, 548.025, 

548.026, 548.028, 548.032, 548.035,548.041, 548.43, 

548.046, 548.047, 548.053, 548.054, 548.056, 

548.057,548.058, 548.066, 548.071, 548.075, 548.079 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Paul Waters, Executive Director, 

Florida State Boxing Commission, 2601 Blair Stone Road, 

Tallahassee, FL 32399-1016 or telephone: (850)488-8500 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

61K1-1.003 Licenses, Permits; Requirement, Procedure 

and Period, Fee. 

Rulemaking Authority 548.003 FS. Law Implemented 548.006, 

548.011, 548.012, 548.013, 548.014, 548.017, 548.021, 548.025, 

548.026, 548.028, 548.032, 548.035, 548.046, 548.057, 548.066 FS. 

History–New 2-7-85, Amended 11-24-85, Formerly 7F-1.03, 

Amended 4-6-89, 8-28-89, 5-13-90, Formerly 7F-1.003, Amended 9-

10-95, 4-3-00, 6-21-04, 3-15-10, Repealed                  . 

 

61K1-1.004 Weight Classes; Weigh-In; Pre-Match 

Physical of Participant and Referee. 

Rulemaking Authority 548.003 FS. Law Implemented 548.006, 

548.043, 548.046, 548.071, 548.075 FS. History–New 2-7-85, 

Amended 11-24-85, Formerly 7F-1.04, Amended 4-6-89, 8-28-89, 1-

1-90, 5-13-90, 1-9-91, Formerly 7F-1.004, Amended 9-10-95, 4-3-00 

6-21-04, 3-15-10, Repealed                  . 

 

61K1-1.0043 Drugs and Foreign Substances; Penalties. 

Rulemaking Authority 548.003 FS. Law Implemented 548.006, 

548.046, 548.047, 548.053, 548.054, 548.058, 548.071, 548.075, 

548.079 FS. History–New 4-6-89, Amended 8-28-89, Formerly 7F-

1.0043, Amended 4-3-00, 6-21-04, Repealed 

                  . 
 

61K1-1.006 Arena Equipment; Ring Requirements; 

Fenced Area Requirements for Mixed Martial Arts; Other 

Fight Mediums; Floor Plan and Apron Seating; Emergency 

Medical and Other Equipment and Services. 

Rulemaking Authority 548.003 FS. Law Implemented 548.003(2), 

548.006, 548.032, 548.046, 548.057 FS. History–New 2-7-85, 

Amended 11-24-85, Formerly 7F-1.06, Amended 4-6-89, 1-1-90, 

Formerly 7F-1.006, Amended 4-3-00, 6-1-04, Repealed_________  

 

61K1-1.007 Participants’ Apparel and Appearance. 

Rulemaking Authority 548.003 FS. Law Implemented 548.003(2), 

548.006, 548.046, 548.071 FS. History–New 2-7-85, Amended 11-

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=285
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61K1-1.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61K1-1.004
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61K1-1.0043
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61K1-1.006
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61K1-1.007
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61K1-1.008
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61K1-1.009
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61K1-1.012
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61K1-1.037
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61K1-1.040
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=548.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%20548.041%20FS.
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=548.003(2),%20548.006,%20548.011,%20548.012,%20548.013,%20548.014,%20548.017,%20548.021,%20548.025,%20548.026,%20548.028,%20548.032,%20548.035,548.041,%20548.43,%20548.046,%20548.047,%20548.053,%20548.054,%20548.056,%20548.057,548.058,%20548.066,%20%20548.071,%20548.075,%20548.079
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=548.003(2),%20548.006,%20548.011,%20548.012,%20548.013,%20548.014,%20548.017,%20548.021,%20548.025,%20548.026,%20548.028,%20548.032,%20548.035,548.041,%20548.43,%20548.046,%20548.047,%20548.053,%20548.054,%20548.056,%20548.057,548.058,%20548.066,%20%20548.071,%20548.075,%20548.079
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=548.003(2),%20548.006,%20548.011,%20548.012,%20548.013,%20548.014,%20548.017,%20548.021,%20548.025,%20548.026,%20548.028,%20548.032,%20548.035,548.041,%20548.43,%20548.046,%20548.047,%20548.053,%20548.054,%20548.056,%20548.057,548.058,%20548.066,%20%20548.071,%20548.075,%20548.079
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=548.003(2),%20548.006,%20548.011,%20548.012,%20548.013,%20548.014,%20548.017,%20548.021,%20548.025,%20548.026,%20548.028,%20548.032,%20548.035,548.041,%20548.43,%20548.046,%20548.047,%20548.053,%20548.054,%20548.056,%20548.057,548.058,%20548.066,%20%20548.071,%20548.075,%20548.079
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=548.003(2),%20548.006,%20548.011,%20548.012,%20548.013,%20548.014,%20548.017,%20548.021,%20548.025,%20548.026,%20548.028,%20548.032,%20548.035,548.041,%20548.43,%20548.046,%20548.047,%20548.053,%20548.054,%20548.056,%20548.057,548.058,%20548.066,%20%20548.071,%20548.075,%20548.079


Florida Administrative Register Volume 42, Number 218, November 8, 2016 

 

4980 

24-85, Formerly 7F-1.07, Amended 4-6-89, 1-1-90, Formerly 7F-

1.007, Amended 9-10-95, 4-3-00, 6-1-04, Repealed_____________. 

 

61K1-1.008 Bandages and Handwraps. 

Rulemaking Authority 548.003 FS. Law Implemented 548.003(2), 

548.006, 548.043, 548.046 FS. History–New 2-7-85, Formerly 7F-

1.08, Amended 4-6-89, 1-1-90, Formerly 7F-1.008, Amended 4-3-00, 

6-1-04, Repealed                  . 

 

61K1-1.009 Gloves and Mouthpieces. 

Rulemaking Authority 548.003 FS. Law Implemented 548.003(2), 

548.006, 548.043 FS. History–New 2-7-85, Amended 11-24-85, 

Formerly 7F-1.09, Amended 4-6-89, 1-1-90, 5-13-90, Formerly 7F-

1.009, Amended 4-3-00, 6-1-04, Repealed                  . 

 

61K1-1.012 Participant; License; Conduct and Other 

Requirements. 

Rulemaking Authority 548.003, 548.041 FS. Law Implemented 

548.003(2), 548.006, 548.011, 548.017, 548.041, 548.046, 548.056, 

548.071 FS. History–New 2-7-85, Amended 11-24-85, Formerly 7F-

1.12, Amended 4-6-89, 8-28-89, 1-1-90, 1-9-91, Formerly 7F-1.012, 

Amended 9-10-95, 4-3-00, 6-1-04, Repealed                  . 

 

61K1-1.037 Post-Match Physical Requirements; 

Suspensions. 

Rulemaking Authority 548.003 FS. Law Implemented 548.006, 

548.046, 548.071 FS. History–New 4-6-89, Amended 1-1-90, 

Formerly 7F-1.037, Amended 9-10-95, 4-3-00, Repromulgated 6-1-

04, Repealed                  . 

 

61K1-1.040 Post-Match Reports Required to be Filed; 

Penalty for Late Filing. 

Rulemaking Authority 548.003 FS. Law Implemented 548.053, 

548.06, 548.075 FS. History–New 4-6-89, Amended 8-28-89, 5-13-

90, Formerly 7F-1.040, Amended 9-10-95, 4-3-00, 6-1-04, 11-21-10, 

Repealed                  . 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Paul Waters, Executive Director, Florida State Boxing 

Commission, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, FL 32399-

1016 or telephone (850) 488-8500. 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Paul Waters, Executive Director, Florida 

State Boxing Commission, 2601 Blair Stone Road, 

Tallahassee, FL 32399-1016 or telephone: (850)488-8500. 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: December 4, 2015 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

State Boxing Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61K1-3.0007 Forms 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The rule is being repealed because 

it is duplicative and unnecessary. 

SUMMARY: Repeal rule. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will 

not have an adverse impact on small business or likely 

increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of 

$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the 

implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by 

the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: During discussion of the economic impact of this rule 

at its meeting, the Commission, based upon the expertise and 

experience of its members and the substance of the repealed 

rule, determined that a Statement of Estimated Regulatory 

Costs (SERC) was not necessary because the rule does not 

impose additional rights, obligations, or duties on any persons 

or businesses, and that the rule will not require ratification by 

the Legislature. No person or interested party submitted 

additional information regarding the economic impact at that 

time. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 548.003 FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 548.006, 548.011, 548.05 FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Paul Waters, Executive Director, 

Florida State Boxing Commission, 2601 Blair Stone Road, 

Tallahassee, FL 32399-1016 or telephone (850) 488-8500. 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

61K1-3.0007 Forms. 

Rulemaking Authority 548.003 FS. Law Implemented 548.006, 

548.011, 548.05 FS. History–New 4-6-89, Amended 8-28-89, 5-13-

90, Formerly 7F-1.080, Amended 9-10-95, 4-3-00, 6-1-04, Formerly 

61K1-1.080, Repealed                   . 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Florida State Boxing Commission 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Florida State Boxing Commission 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: December 4, 2015 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=285
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61K1-3.0007
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=548.003%20FS
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/cfr.asp?id=548.006,%20548.011,%20548.05%20FS


Florida Administrative Register Volume 42, Number 218, November 8, 2016 

 

4981 

 

DEPARTMENT OF CHILDREN AND FAMILIES 

Family Safety and Preservation Program 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

65C-30.020 Child Deaths 

PURPOSE AND EFFECT: The Department intends to amend 

Rule 65C-30.020, F.A.C, Child Deaths, to accomplish the 

following: (1) Clarify when the regional child fatality 

prevention specialist must be notified of a child death and 

when he or she must convene a case review; and (2) Add 

language regarding drug screens. 

SUMMARY: The amendments will require: (1) A child 

protective investigator to notify the regional child fatality 

prevention specialist whenever it appears that a child died as a 

result of abuse, neglect or abandonment, or when a child dies 

for reasons unrelated to abuse, neglect or abandonment during 

the course of an active child protective investigation; (2) The 

regional child fatality prevention specialist to conduct a case 

review of such deaths; and (3) The results of any completed 

drug screens to be considered in the investigation of the child 

death. 

SUMMARY OF STATEMENT OF ESTIMATED 

REGULATORY COSTS AND LEGISLATIVE 

RATIFICATION: The Agency has determined that this will 

not have an adverse impact on small business or likely 

increase directly or indirectly regulatory costs in excess of 

$200,000 in the aggregate within one year after the 

implementation of the rule. A SERC has not been prepared by 

the Agency. 

The Agency has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification based on the 

statement of estimated regulatory costs or if no SERC is 

required, the information expressly relied upon and described 

herein: The Department used a checklist to conduct an 

economic analysis and determine if there is an adverse impact 

or regulatory costs associated with this rule that exceeds the 

criteria in section 120.541(2)(a), F.S. Based upon this analysis, 

the Department has determined that the proposed rule is not 

expected to require legislative ratification. 

Any person who wishes to provide information regarding a 

statement of estimated regulatory costs, or provide a proposal 

for a lower cost regulatory alternative must do so in writing 

within 21 days of this notice. 

RULEMAKING AUTHORITY: 39.012, 39.0121(13), FS. 

LAW IMPLEMENTED: 39.201(2)(a), 39.2015(1), (6), 

39.301(9)(a), (11), (16), (17), FS. 

IF REQUESTED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THE DATE OF 

THIS NOTICE, A HEARING WILL BE SCHEDULED AND 

ANNOUNCED IN THE FAR. 

THE PERSON TO BE CONTACTED REGARDING THE 

PROPOSED RULE IS: Jodi Abramowitz. Jodi can be reached 

at (850)717-4189 or Jodi.abramowitz@myflfamilies.com 

 

THE FULL TEXT OF THE PROPOSED RULE IS: 

 

65C-30.020 Child Fatalities Deaths. 

(1) No change. 

(2) Whenever a case manager learns that a child under 

supervision has died, that case manager shall ensure that the 

regional managing director, regional child fatality prevention 

specialist and or lead agency executive director or designee is 

orally notified immediately upon learning of the that a death 

may be due to abuse, neglect or abandonment and in writing 

within 24 hours of the death. 

(3) The Hotline Director or designee shall provide written 

notification of all child deaths alleged to have occurred in 

Florida as a result of abuse, neglect or abandonment or of the 

deaths of children who are the subjects of an open abuse, 

neglect or abandonment investigation or currently ongoing 

services, regardless of whether there are allegations of death 

due to abuse, neglect or abandonment, to the following 

individuals within two (2) hours of the oral notification: 

(a) through (k) No change. 

(4) No change. 

(5) Whenever it appears that a child died as a result of 

abuse, neglect or abandonment, or when a child dies for 

reasons unrelated to abuse, neglect or abandonment during the 

course of an active child protective investigation, a child 

protective investigator (CPI) shall notify the regional child 

fatality prevention specialist and conduct a thorough 

investigation of the circumstances surrounding the death. The 

investigation shall consist of:  

(a) Gathering all information necessary to determine 

whether the death was due to abuse, neglect or abandonment, 

including: 

1. through 5. No change.  

6. The results of any drug screens completed. The CPI 

will ask the alleged maltreating caregiver to voluntarily submit 

to a drug screen during the investigation of all child deaths 

related to inadequate supervision, unsafe sleep and drowning. 

This does not preclude the CPI asking the alleged maltreating 

caregiver for a drug screen during other investigations when 

substance misuse is suspected and may be a contributing cause 

to a child’s death. Exceptions to this requirement will be made 

when law enforcement has already obtained the drug screen. 

(b) No change. 

(c) Entering the maltreatment finding “Death Due to 

Abuse or Neglect” and for the maltreatment type or 

description (e.g., Abandonment) that best describes the cause 

of death; 

(d) through (e) are relettered (c) through (d) No change. 

(e)(f) Ensuring that the report is not closed until it the 

death has been reviewed by the regional Child Fatality 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=65
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=342
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=65C-30.020
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=39.012
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%2039.0121(13)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=39.201(2)(a)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%2039.2015(1)
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/statute.asp?id=%2039.301(9)(a)


Florida Administrative Register Volume 42, Number 218, November 8, 2016 

 

4982 

Prevention Specialist and he or she has advised the supervisor 

that the death report has been approved for closure; and, 

(f)(g) No change. 

(6) The Department or any contracted service provider 

shall cooperate with any law enforcement requests related to 

an investigation of the child’s death. 

(7) No change.  

(8) The Department shall convene a Critical Incident 

Rapid Response Team when there is a child fatality that meets 

criteria in accordance with Section 39.2015, F.S. The regional 

Child Fatality Prevention Specialist shall conduct a case 

review on all child fatalities in which it is alleged that abuse, 

neglect or abandonment was or may have been a factor in the 

child’s death, and in situations where a child died while a 

participant on an active investigation or while receiving 

ongoing services without concerns of abuse, neglect or 

abandonment. 

Rulemaking Authority 39.012, 39.0121(13), F.S. Law Implemented 

39.201(2)(a), 39.2015(1), (6), 39.301(9)(a), (11), (16), (17), F.S. 

History–New 5-4-06, Amended 2-25-16,______. 

 

NAME OF PERSON ORIGINATING PROPOSED RULE: 

Alissa Cross 

NAME OF AGENCY HEAD WHO APPROVED THE 

PROPOSED RULE: Mike Carroll 

DATE PROPOSED RULE APPROVED BY AGENCY 

HEAD: October 28, 2016 

DATE NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULE DEVELOPMENT 

PUBLISHED IN FAR: November 7, 2016 

Section III 

Notice of Changes, Corrections and 

Withdrawals 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Medicine 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

64B8-55.002 Citations 

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING 

The Board of Medicine announces a hearing regarding the 

above rule, as noticed in Vol. 42 No. 167, August 26, 2016 

Florida Administrative Register. 

DATE AND TIME: To be held during the Board of Medicine 

meeting on Friday, December 2, 2016, beginning at 8:00 a.m. 

This hearing is rescheduled from December 1, 2016, so that 

this matter can be heard by the full Board of Medicine. 

PLACE: Embassy Suites Lake Buena Vista South, 4955 

Kyngs Heath Road, Kissimmee, FL 34746. 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The proposed rule, as requested by the Society for Clinical and 

Medical Hair Removal. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least five days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Allen Hall, Executive Director, Electrolysis 

Council/MQA, 4052 Bald Cypress Way, Bin# C05, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3255. A copy of the meeting 

agenda and/or additional information may be obtained by 

contacting: Rebecca Hewett at Rebecca.Hewett@flhealth.gov 

or call (850)245-4137. If you are hearing or speech impaired, 

please contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Division of Worker’s Compensation 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

69L-7.020 Florida Workers’ Compensation Health Care 

Provider Reimbursement Manual 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 42 No. 191, September 

30, 2016 issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

These changes are being made to address comments expressed 

by the Joint Administrative Procedures Committee in a letter 

dated October 20, 2016. 

The following changes are made to the content of the Florida 

Workers’ Compensation Health Care Provider Manual, 2016 

Edition: 

Chapter 1: Introduction and Overview 

Health Care Provider Use of Codes, Descriptors and 

Modifiers: The references to Rule Chapter 69L-8, F.A.C., on 

page 12 is replaced with specific references to Rules 69L-

8.071 and 69L-8.074, F.A.C. 

Chapter 2: Medical Services 

Special Billing Requirements for Anesthesia: The reference to 

Rule Chapter 69L-7, F.A.C., in the note at the bottom of page 

26 has been changed to a specific reference to Rule 69L-

7.730(2), F.A.C. 

Codes and Descriptions for Medications: The reference to 

Rule Chapter 69L-8, F.A.C., on page 35 is replaced with 

specific references to Rules 69L-8.071 and 69L-8.074, F.A.C. 

Appendix A: Workers’ Compensation Unique Procedure 

Codes 

DSPNS and COMPD: The reference to Rule Chapter 69L-7, 

F.A.C., on page 415 is changed to a specific reference to Rule 

69L-7.720(1), F.A.C. 

69L-7.020 Florida Workers’ Compensation Health Care 

Provider Reimbursement Manual. 

(1) The Florida Workers’ Compensation Health Care 

Provider Reimbursement Manual, 2016 2015 Edition, to 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=331
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B8-55.002
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=370
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69L-7.020


Florida Administrative Register Volume 42, Number 218, November 8, 2016 

 

4983 

 

become effective on July 1, 2017 

http://www.flrules.org/Gateway/reference.asp?No=Ref-05618, 

is adopted by reference as part of this rule. The manual 

contains the Maximum Reimbursement Allowances 

determined by the Three-Member Panel, pursuant to 

subsection 440.13(12), F.S., and establishes reimbursement 

policies, guidelines, codes, and maximum reimbursement 

allowances for services and supplies provided by health care 

providers. Also, the manual includes reimbursement policies 

and payment methodologies for pharmacists and medical 

suppliers. 

(2) and (3) No change. 

Rulemaking Authority 440.13(13)(b), 440.591 FS. Law Implemented 

440.13(7), (12), (13)(b) FS. History–New 10-1-82, Amended 3-16-

83, 11-6-83, 5-21-85, Formerly 38F-7.20, Amended 4-1-88, 7-20-88, 

6-1-91, 4-29-92, 2-18-96, 9-1-97, 12-15-97, 9-17-98, 9-30-01, 7-7-

02, Formerly 38F-7.020, 4L-7.020, Amended 12-4-03, 1-1-04, 7-4-

04, 5-9-05, 9-4-05, 11-16-06, 10-18-07, 2-4-09, 7-1-16,        . 

 

TO BECOME EFFECTIVE ON JULY 1, 2017. 

The remainder of the proposed rule reads as previously 

published. 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Division of Worker’s Compensation 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

69L-7.100 Florida Worker’ Compensation 

Reimbursement Manual for Ambulatory 

Surgical Centers (ASCs) 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 42 No. 191, September 

30, 2016 issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

These changes are being made to address comments expressed 

by the Joint Administrative Procedures Committee in a letter 

dated October 20, 2016, and in response to public comments 

on the proposed rule. 

The “preliminary SERC analysis” referenced in the proposed 

rule was intended as the summary of the Department’s SERC, 

which also consists of a detailed analysis and report prepared 

by the National Council on Compensation Insurance, Inc. 

The following changes have been made to the contents of the 

Florida Workers’ Compensation Reimbursement Manual for 

Ambulatory Surgical Centers (ASCs), 2016 Edition. 

Chapter 3: Description of ASC Facility Services 

Services Included in ASC Fee(s): Bullet 3 on page 15 is edited 

to remove references to sutures, staples, drill material and 

sterile and non-sterile supplies.  

Request for Surgical Implant Reimbursement: Bullet 2 on 

page 22 is edited to remove the reference to the word 

“Manufacturer’s,” when referring to manufacturer’s 

acquisition invoices. 

Certification of Surgical Implant Reimbursement Amount: 

Page 24 is edited to remove references to the word 

“manufacturer’s,” from the first paragraph. 

Chapter 5: Billing Instructions and Forms 

Surgical Implant Billing: Page 34 is edited to remove the 

reference to the word “Manufacturer’s,” contained in the first 

bullet point. 

Chapter 7: Definitions 

Associated Disposable Instrumentation: The definition on 

page 37 is edited to remove the reference to “or sutures.” 

Appendix A: Page 40 is edited to remove three references to 

“the manufacturer’s,” used in reference to “acquisition invoice 

cost.” 

69L-7.100 Florida Workers’ Compensation 

Reimbursement Manual for Ambulatory Surgical Centers 

(ASCs). 

(1) through (4) No change.  

Rulemaking Authority 440.13(4), (13), 440.591 FS. Law 

Implemented 440.13(7), (12), (13) FS. History–New 8-7-91, 

Amended 12-31-92, Formerly 38F-7.100, 4L-7.100, Amended 9-4-

05, 8-19-07, 11-13-11, 9-28-15,        . 

 

TO BECOME EFFECTIVE JULY 1, 2017, OR UPON THE 

PROPOSED RULE’S RATIFYING LEGISLATION 

BECOMING LAW, WHICHEVER DATE OCCURS 

LATER. 

 

The remainder of the proposed rule reads as previously 

published. 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Division of Worker's Compensation 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

69L-7.501 Florida Workers' Compensation 

Reimbursement Manual for Hospitals 

NOTICE OF CHANGE 

Notice is hereby given that the following changes have been 

made to the proposed rule in accordance with subparagraph 

120.54(3)(d)1., F.S., published in Vol. 42 No. 191, September 

30, 2016 issue of the Florida Administrative Register. 

These changes are being made to address comments expressed 

by the Joint Administrative Procedures Committee. The 

“preliminary SERC analysis” referenced in the proposed rule 

was intended as the summary of the Department’s SERC, 

which also consists of a detailed analysis and report prepared 

by the National Council on Compensation Insurance, Inc. 

69L-7.501 Florida Workers’ Compensation 

Reimbursement Manual for Hospitals. 

(1) and (2) No change. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=370
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69L-7.100
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=69
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=370
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=69L-7.501


Florida Administrative Register Volume 42, Number 218, November 8, 2016 

 

4984 

Rulemaking Authority 440.13(12), (14), 440.591 FS. Law 

Implemented 440.13(7), (12), (14) FS. History–New 6-9-87, 

Amended 6-1-92, 10-27-99, 7-3-01, Formerly 38F-7.501, 4L-7.501, 

Amended 12-4-03, 1-1-04, 7-4-04, 10-1-07, 1-1-15,________. 

 

TO BECOME EFFECTIVE ON JULY1, 2017, OR UPON 

THE PROPOSED RULE’S RATIFYING LEGISLATION 

BECOMING LAW, WHICHEVER DATE OCCURS 

LATER. 

 

The remainder of the proposed rule reads as previously 

published. 

Section IV 

Emergency Rules 

NONE 

Section V 

Petitions and Dispositions Regarding Rule 

Variance or Waiver 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

Florida's Office of Early Learning 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

6M-8.620 Voluntary Prekindergarten (VPK) Pre- and Post 

Assessments 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on or about November 4, 

2016, the Office of Early Learning received a petition from the 

Early Learning Coalition of the Big Bend. Petitioner seeks a 

temporary variance from paragraphs 6M-8.620(3)(a) and (c), 

F.A.C., as they relate to the requirement that Voluntary 

Prekindergarten (VPK) providers administer the Florida VPK 

Assessment during Assessment Period One (AP1) and 

electronically report assessment data within a specified time 

frame. Petitioner is requesting a variance extending the time 

deadlines for the Florida VPK Assessment AP1 to be 

administered as well as a variance extending the time to 

submit electronic assessment data. The Office will accept 

comments concerning the Petition for fourteen (14) days from 

the date of publication of this notice. To be considered, 

comments must be received before 5:00 p.m. A copy of the 

Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained by 

contacting: Margaret O’Sullivan Parker, General Counsel, 

Office of Early Learning, 250 Marriott Drive, Tallahassee, FL 

32399, Maggi.Parker@oel.myflorida.com. 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

Florida's Office of Early Learning 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

6M-8.620 Voluntary Prekindergarten (VPK) Pre- and Post-

Assessments 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on or about November 4, 

2016, the Office of Early Learning received a petition from the 

Early Learning Coalition of Sarasota County. Petitioner seeks 

a temporary variance from paragraphs 6M-8.620(3)(a) and (c), 

F.A.C., as they relate to the requirement that Voluntary 

Prekindergarten (VPK) providers administer the Florida VPK 

Assessment during Assessment Period One (AP1) and 

electronically report assessment data within a specified time 

frame. Petitioner is requesting a variance extending the time 

deadlines for the Florida VPK Assessment AP1 to be 

administered as well as a variance extending the time to 

submit electronic assessment data. The Office will accept 

comments concerning the Petition for fourteen (14) days from 

the date of publication of this notice. To be considered, 

comments must be received before 5:00 p.m. A copy of the 

Petition for Variance or Waiver may be obtained by 

contacting: Margaret O’Sullivan Parker, General Counsel, 

Office of Early Learning, 250 Marriott Drive, Tallahassee, FL 

32399, Maggi.Parker@oel.myflorida.com. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001 Safety Standards 

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety 

hereby gives notice: 

The Final Order was in response to a Petition for emergency 

temporary from The Palace, filed September 13, 2016, and 

advertised in Vol. 42, No 180, of the Florida Administrative 

Register. No comments were received in response to the 

petition. The Final Order on the Petition for Variance denies 

the Petitioner a variance from Rule 3.10.3 and 3.10.4(q), 

ASME A17.3, as adopted by paragraph 61C-5.001(1)(a), 

Florida Administrative Code, because the Petitioner has not 

demonstrated that the purpose of the statute underlying the 

rule will be met or that Petitioner would suffer a substantial 

hardship if required to comply with this rule (VW 2016-215). 

A copy of the Order or additional information may be 

obtained by contacting: Michelle Comingore, Division of 

Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 2601 Blair 

Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, 

dhr.elevators@myfloridalicense.com. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1044
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6M-8.620
mailto:Maggi.Parker@oel.myflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=6
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1044
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=6M-8.620
mailto:Maggi.Parker@oel.myflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
mailto:dhr.elevators@myfloridalicense.com


Florida Administrative Register Volume 42, Number 218, November 8, 2016 

 

4985 

 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-5.001 Safety Standards 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on November 3, 2016, the 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, Division 

of Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, received 

a petition for Katie Manor Apartments located at 639 

Brookmeade Drive, Crestview, FL. Petitioner seeks an 

emergency variance of the requirements of NEC110.26(A)(1), 

as adopted by subsection 61C-5.001(1), Florida 

Administrative Code, that references working clearances for 

elevator controllers which poses a significant 

economic/financial hardship. Any interested person may file 

comments within 5 days of the publication of this notice with 

Michelle Comingore, Division of Hotels and Restaurants, 

Bureau of Elevator Safety, 2601 Blair Stone Road, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013 (VW2016-250). 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be 

obtained by contacting: Michelle Comingore, Division of 

Hotels and Restaurants, Bureau of Elevator Safety, 2601 Blair 

Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-1013, 

dhr.elevators@myfloridalicense.com. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61C-4.010 Sanitation and Safety Requirements 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on November 7, 2016, the 

Florida Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants, received a petition for a 

Routine Variance for subsection 61C-4.010(7), Florida 

Administrative Code, and subsection 61C-4.010(6), Florida 

Administrative Code, from Quality Neighborhood Groceries 

Inc. located in Pensacola. The above referenced F.A.C. 

addresses the requirement that at least one accessible 

bathroom be provided for use by customers. They are 

requesting to share the bathrooms located within a nearby 

establishment under a different ownership for use by 

customers only. 

The Division of Hotels and Restaurants will accept comments 

concerning the Petition for 14 days from the date of 

publication of this notice. To be considered, comments must 

be received before 5:00 p.m. 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be 

obtained by contacting: 

Daisy.Aleman@myfloridalicense.com, Division of Hotels and 

Restaurants, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-1011. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Clinical Laboratory Personnel 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

64B3-5.003 Technologist 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that on November 4, 2016, the 

Board of Clinical Laboratory Personnel received a petition for 

variance or waiver filed by Miguel Herman Estevez. Petitioner 

is seeking a variance or waiver of paragraph 64B3-

5.003(3)(a), Option 3, Florida Administrative Code, which 

sets forth the education, training/experience and certification 

requirements for licensure as a technologist. 

A copy of the Petition for Variance or Waiver may be 

obtained by contacting: Anthony B. Spivey, Executive 

Director, Board of Clinical Laboratory Personnel, 4052 Bald 

Cypress Way, Bin # C07, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-3257. 

Comments on the petition should be filed with the Board of 

Clinical Laboratory Personnel within 14 days of publication of 

this notice. 

Section VI 

Notice of Meetings, Workshops and Public 

Hearings 

DEPARTMENT OF LEGAL AFFAIRS 

Florida Elections Commission 

The Florida Elections Commission announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: November 16, 2016, 8:30 a.m. until 

adjourned 

PLACE: Senate Office Building, 404 South Monroe Street, 

Room 110-S, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-6526 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Agency matters. Review and adjudication of cases relating to 

alleged violations of Chapters 104 and 106, Florida Statutes, 

and to the late filing of campaign treasurer's reports. Rules 

Review. Portions of this meeting are confidential and closed to 

the public. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: the 

Agency Clerk at (850)922-4539; by email: 

FEC@myfloridalegal.com; by writing to 107 West Gaines 

Street, Suite 224, Collins Building, Tallahassee, FL 32399-

1050 or by viewing the Commission’s website: 

www.fec.state.fl.us. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: the Agency Clerk, Donna Ann Malphurs, at 

(850)922-4539 or by email: FEC@myfloridalegal.com. If you 

are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-5.001
mailto:dhr.elevators@myfloridalicense.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61C-4.010
mailto:Daisy.Aleman@myfloridalicense.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=322
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=64B3-5.003
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=2
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=49
mailto:FEC@myfloridalegal.com
http://www.fec.state.fl.us/
mailto:FEC@myfloridalegal.com


Florida Administrative Register Volume 42, Number 218, November 8, 2016 

 

4986 

using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: the Agency Clerk, 

Donna Ann Malphurs, at (850)922-4539 or by email: 

FEC@myfloridalegal.com. 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

The Florida Prepaid College Board announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, December 6, 2016, 12:00 Noon 

PLACE: Hotel Duval, Opal Room, 415 North Monroe Street, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32301 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

conduct a regular business meeting of the Florida Prepaid 

College Foundation Board. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained at 

http://www.myfloridaprepaid.com/ or by calling (850)488-

8514. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by faxing 

a written request to: the Florida Prepaid College Board at 

(850)488-3555. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please 

contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

The Florida Prepaid College Board announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, December 6, 2016, 1:00 p.m. 

until completion 

PLACE: Hotel Duval, Opal Room, 415 North Monroe Street, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32301 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

conduct a regular business meeting of the Florida ABLE, Inc. 

Board. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained at 

http://www.myfloridaprepaid.com/ or by calling (850)488-

8514. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by faxing 

a written request to: the Florida Prepaid College Board at 

(850)488-3555. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please 

contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

The Florida Prepaid College Board announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Tuesday, December 6, 2016, 2:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Hotel Duval, Opal Room, 415 North Monroe Street, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32301 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

conduct a Financial Workshop for the Florida Prepaid College 

Board. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained at 

http://www.myfloridaprepaid.com/ or by calling (850)488-

8514. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by faxing 

a written request to: the Florida Prepaid College Board at 

(850)488-3555. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please 

contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

STATE BOARD OF ADMINISTRATION 

Florida Prepaid College Board 

The Florida Prepaid College Board announces public meetings 

to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIMES: Wednesday, December 7, 2016, 8:30 

a.m. until completion, Florida Prepaid College Board Audit 

Committee; 9:30 a.m. until completion Florida Prepaid 

College Board Investment Committee, followed by the Florida 

Prepaid College Board meeting 

PLACE: Hotel Duval, Opal Room, 415 North Monroe Street, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32301 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

conduct meetings of the regular business of the Florida 

Prepaid College Board Audit Committee, the Florida Prepaid 

College Board Investment Committee, and the Florida Prepaid 

College Board. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained at 

http://www.myfloridaprepaid.com/ or by calling (850)488-

8514. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by faxing 

a written request to: the Florida Prepaid College Board at 

mailto:FEC@myfloridalegal.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=47
http://www.myfloridaprepaid.com/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=47
http://www.myfloridaprepaid.com/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=47
http://www.myfloridaprepaid.com/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=19
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=47
http://www.myfloridaprepaid.com/


Florida Administrative Register Volume 42, Number 218, November 8, 2016 

 

4987 

 

(850)488-3555. If you are hearing or speech impaired, please 

contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICTS 

Southwest Florida Water Management District 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

40D-8.041 Minimum Flows 

The Southwest Florida Water Management District announces 

a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: November 15, 2016, 1:00 p.m. – 5:00 

p.m. 

PLACE: Southwest Florida Water Management District 

Headquarters, 2379 Broad Street, Brooksville, FL 34604-

6899; teleconference: call-in number: 1(888)670-3525, 

participant code: 1372920332#; WebEx: 

https://swfwmd.webex.com/swfwmd/j.php?MTID=m978b3a1

755597aeb1749823d806b8bcd, meeting number: 735 358 320 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Meeting with the scientific peer review panelists for the 

proposed Minimum Flow for the Crystal River/Kings Bay 

System. Peer reviewers are working together with the goal of 

collectively developing a single peer review report. 

Information reviewed, supporting documents, and comments 

and documents produced by the peer review panel, as well as 

comments from stakeholders, are accessible using the 

following link: 

https://swfwmd.discussion.community/categories. Minutes of 

the meeting will be available no later than one week following 

the meeting. 

NOTE: One or more members of the District’s Governing 

Board may attend this meeting. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: the 

Southwest Florida Water Management District, Attention: 

Doug Leeper, 2379 Broad Street, Brooksville, Florida 34604, 

(352)796-7211 or Doug.Leeper@swfwmd.state.fl.us. The 

agenda will also be accessible at 

https://swfwmd.discussion.community/categories. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: District’s Human Resources Bureau Chief at 2379 

Broad Street, Brooksville, FL 34604-6899; telephone: 

(352)796-7211 or 1(800)423-1476 (FL only), ext. 4703 or 

email: ADACoordinator@WaterMatters.org. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: District’s Human 

Resources Bureau Chief at 2379 Broad Street, Brooksville, FL 

34604-6899; telephone: (352)796-7211 or 1(800)423-1476 

(FL only), ext. 4703 or email: 

ADACoordinator@WaterMatters.org. 

REGIONAL UTILITY AUTHORITIES 

Tampa Bay Water - A Regional Water Supply Authority 

Tampa Bay Water - A Regional Water Supply Authority 

announces public meetings to which all persons are invited. 

DATES AND TIMES: February 20, 2017, 9:30 a.m.; April 17, 

2017, 9:00 a.m.; June 19, 2017, 9:00 a.m.; August 21, 2017, 

9:30 a.m.; October 16, 2017, 9:30 a.m.; December 18, 2017, 

9:30 a.m. 

PLACE: Tampa Bay Water Administrative Offices, 2575 

Enterprise Road, Clearwater, Florida 33763 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Adopted meeting schedule for the Tampa Bay Water Board of 

Directors. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Records 

Department, (727)796-2355. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 3 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Records Department, (727)796-2355. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Records Department, 

(727)796-2355. 

DEPARTMENT OF ELDER AFFAIRS 

The Department of Elder Affairs, Division of Elder Rights 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, December 8, 2016, 9:00 a.m. – 

12:00 Noon 

PLACE: Bayview Senior Citizens Center, 2000 E. Lloyd 

Street, Pensacola, FL 32503 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The presenters will discuss fraud prevention and the 

importance of increasing awareness of elder exploitation and 

abuse in the community. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Allison 

Bryant, Statewide Elder Abuse Prevention Coordinator, 

Florida Department of Elder Affairs, 4040 Esplanade Way, 

Tallahassee, FL 32399-7000, 1(850)414-2072, 

bryanta@elderaffairs.org. 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=40
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=123
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=40D-8.041
https://swfwmd.webex.com/swfwmd/j.php?MTID=m978b3a1755597aeb1749823d806b8bcd
https://swfwmd.webex.com/swfwmd/j.php?MTID=m978b3a1755597aeb1749823d806b8bcd
https://swfwmd.discussion.community/categories
mailto:Doug.Leeper@swfwmd.state.fl.us
https://swfwmd.discussion.community/categories
mailto:ADACoordinator@WaterMatters.org
mailto:ADACoordinator@WaterMatters.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=49
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=158
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=58
mailto:bryanta@elderaffairs.org


Florida Administrative Register Volume 42, Number 218, November 8, 2016 

 

4988 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 72 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Allison Bryant, Statewide Elder Abuse Prevention 

Coordinator, Florida Department of Elder Affairs, 4040 

Esplanade Way, Tallahassee, FL 32399-7000, 1(850)414-

2072, bryanta@elderaffairs.org. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: Allison Bryant, 

Statewide Elder Abuse Prevention Coordinator, Florida 

Department of Elder Affairs, 4040 Esplanade Way, 

Tallahassee, FL 32399-7000, 1(850)414-2072, 

bryanta@elderaffairs.org. 

DEPARTMENT OF MANAGEMENT SERVICES 

Commission on Human Relations 

The Florida Commission on Human Relations announces a 

public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: Thursday, December 8, 2016, 10:00 a.m., 

ET 

PLACE: Telephone conference: 1(888)670-3525; when 

prompted enter participant code: 1760507820, then # key 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The purpose of the meeting is for the Commission to vote on 

the disposition of cases pending before it for decision. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Jim 

Mallue, (850)907-6805, Jim.Mallue@fchr.myflorida.com. 

ACCESS POINT: The FCHR office at 4075 Esplanade Way, 

Room 110, Tallahassee, FL 32399, will serve as an access 

point for this meeting. Interested persons wishing to attend 

this meeting may also do so by appearing in person at this 

designated access point, at which location telephonic access to 

the meeting will be provided. 

For more information, you may contact: Jim Mallue, 

(850)907-6805, Jim.Mallue@fchr.myflorida.com. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Division of Hotels and Restaurants 

The Department of Business and Professional Regulation 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: November 15, 2016, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Conference Center at Corporate Center I, 2202 N. 

Westshore Blvd., Suite 122, Tampa, Florida 33607; telephone 

conference: 1(888)670-3525, participant code: 2152927883# 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The Elevator Safety Technical Advisory Council will meet to 

discuss issues pertaining to elevator safety within the State of 

Florida. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

latosha.jones@myfloridalicense.com. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 10 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: latosha.jones@myfloridalicense.com. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: 

latosha.jones@myfloridalicense.com. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Board of Professional Geologists 

The Board of Professional Geologists announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: November 17, 2016, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Embassy Suites - Tampa/USF, 3705 Spectrum Blvd., 

Tampa, FL 33612 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

General Business meeting. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: the 

Board of Professional Geologists, PO Box 5377, Tallahassee, 

FL 32314-5377, (850)717-1984. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: the Board of Professional Geologists, PO Box 

5377, Tallahassee, FL 32314-5377, (850)717-1984. If you are 

hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency using 

the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: the Board of 

Professional Geologists, PO Box 5377, Tallahassee, FL 

32314-5377, (850)717-1984. 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Nursing 

The Board of Nursing announces a telephone conference call 

to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: November 15, 2016, 10:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Toll-free conference number: 1(888)670-3525, 

participant code: 2681213003 (public) 

mailto:bryanta@elderaffairs.org
mailto:bryanta@elderaffairs.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=60
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=245
mailto:Jim.Mallue@fchr.myflorida.com
mailto:Jim.Mallue@fchr.myflorida.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=249
mailto:latosha.jones@myfloridalicense.com
mailto:latosha.jones@myfloridalicense.com
mailto:latosha.jones@myfloridalicense.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=268
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=64
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=332


Florida Administrative Register Volume 42, Number 218, November 8, 2016 

 

4989 

 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: To 

consider cases where Probable Cause has previously been 

found. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

http://floridasnursing.gov/meeting-information/. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 48 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: the Board of Nursing. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

FLORIDA HOUSING FINANCE CORPORATION 

The Florida Housing Finance Corporation announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: November 29, 2016, 2:00 p.m., ET 

PLACE: Rick Seltzer Conference Room, Suite 6000, Florida 

Housing Finance Corporation, 227 North Bronough Street, 

Tallahassee, Florida 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The Review Committee Meeting will be to give the scores for 

the Applications submitted in response to Florida Housing 

Finance Corporation’s Request for Applications No. 2016-108 

for Elderly Housing Community Loan and to submit a 

recommendation to Florida Housing’s Board of Directors. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Ken 

Reecy, Director of Multifamily Programs, at 

Ken.Reecy@floridahousing.org or (850)488-4197. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 5 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Jean Salmonsen, (850)488-4197, 

Jean.Salmonsen@floridahousing.org. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY 

Division of Workforce Services 

The Reemployment Assistance Appeals Commission 

announces a public meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: November 16, 2016, 9:30 a.m. 

PLACE: Reemployment Assistance Appeals Commission, 101 

Rhyne Building, 2740 Centerview Drive, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399-4151 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Deliberation for cases pending before the Reemployment 

Assistance Appeals Commission that are ready for final 

review and the Chairman’s report. No public testimony will be 

taken. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: 

Reemployment Assistance Appeals Commission, 101 Rhyne 

Building, 2740 Centerview Drive, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-

4151, (850)487-2685. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 24 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Reemployment Assistance Appeals Commission, 

101 Rhyne Building, 2740 Centerview Drive, Tallahassee, 

Florida 32399-4151, (850)487-2685. If you are hearing or 

speech impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida 

Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 

(Voice). 

For more information, you may contact: the Reemployment 

Assistance Appeals Commission, 101 Rhyne Building, 2740 

Centerview Drive, Tallahassee, Florida 32399-4151, 

(850)487-2685. 

AFRICAN AMERICAN HISTORY TASK FORCE 

The African American History Task Force announces public 

meetings to which all persons are invited. 

DATES AND TIMES: November 17, 2016, 9:00 a.m.; 

November 18, 2016, 9:00 a.m. 

PLACE: Shingle Creek Hotel Meeting Room, Orlando, 

Florida 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Annual meeting of the Commissioner of Education’s African 

American History Task Force. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Dr. 

Bernadette Kelley, Bernadette.kelley@famu.edu or Lakeisha 

Eiland, lakechia.eiland@famu.edu. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Lakekechia Eiland, lakechia.eiland@famu.edu. If 

you are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency 

using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

http://floridasnursing.gov/meeting-information/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=67
mailto:Ken.Reecy@floridahousing.org
mailto:Jean.Salmonsen@floridahousing.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=73
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1065
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1108
mailto:Bernadette.kelley@famu.edu
mailto:lakechia.eiland@famu.edu
mailto:lakechia.eiland@famu.edu


Florida Administrative Register Volume 42, Number 218, November 8, 2016 

 

4990 

For more information, you may contact: Dr. Bernadette 

Kelley, Bernadette.kelley@famu.edu. 

WALTON COUNTY HEALTH DEPARTMENT 

The Walton County Health Department announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: November 17, 2016, 11:30 a.m. 

PLACE: Walton County Health Department 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Various Board information. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Patricia 

Hall at (850)892-80440, ext. 1174. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 7 days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Patricia Hall at (850)892-80440, ext. 1174. If you 

are hearing or speech impaired, please contact the agency 

using the Florida Relay Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 

1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: Patricia Hall at 

(850)892-80440, ext. 1174. 

FLORIDA TELECOMMUNICATIONS RELAY, INC. 

Florida Telecommunications Relay, Inc. announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: November 22, 2016, 10:00 a.m. 

PLACE: 1820 E. Park Avenue, Suite 101, Tallahassee, FL 

32301 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Annual Corporate meeting. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: James 

Forstall, Executive Director, (850)270-2641, 

jforstall@ftri.org. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least 24 hours before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: James Forstall, Executive Director, (850)270-

2641, jforstall@ftri.org. If you are hearing or speech impaired, 

please contact the agency using the Florida Relay Service, 

1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

If any person decides to appeal any decision made by the 

Board with respect to any matter considered at this meeting or 

hearing, he/she will need to ensure that a verbatim record of 

the proceeding is made, which record includes the testimony 

and evidence from which the appeal is to be issued. 

For more information, you may contact: James Forstall, 

Executive Director, (850)270-2641, jforstall@ftri.org. 

FLORIDA WORKERS' COMPENSATION JOINT 

UNDERWRITING ASSOCIATION, INC 

The FWCJUA Executive Compensation Committee 

announces a telephone conference call to which all persons are 

invited. 

DATE AND TIME: December 5, 2016, 11:00 a.m. (Eastern 

Time) 

PLACE: Contact Kathy Coyne at (941) 378-7408 to 

participate in the teleconference meeting. 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The agenda shall cover executive compensation plan matters. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting Kathy 

Coyne, or at www.fwcjua.com. 

QCAUSA 

The Central Florida Expressway Authority announces a public 

meeting to which all persons are invited. 

DATE AND TIME: November 15, 2016, 5:00 p.m. 

PLACE: Legacy Middle School, Cafeteria, 11398 Lake 

Underhill Road, Orlando, Florida 32825 

GENERAL SUBJECT MATTER TO BE CONSIDERED: 

The Central Florida Expressway Authority (CFX) is planning 

to widen State Road 408 (Spessard L. Holland Expressway) 

from east of State Road SR 417 (Central Florida GreeneWay) 

to east of Alafaya Trail. This project will include new travel 

lanes and proposed sound walls parallel to SR 408 along 

sections of the project area. The meeting will be an open-

house format where the public will be able to obtain project 

information and speak with members of the project team. 

The Central Florida Expressway Authority performs noise 

studies during the design phase of capacity improvement 

projects. During the design phase for this project, a noise 

analysis was conducted and locations were identified where a 

sound wall would be a viable measure to reduce traffic noise. 

The Central Florida Expressway Authority is now trying to 

determine the level of support from nearby property owners 

and residents for the construction of these sound walls. The 

proposed sound wall concepts will be presented at the October 

6 meeting. 

A copy of the agenda may be obtained by contacting: Kelda 

Senior, Public Information Officer, Central Florida 

Expressway Authority, 4974 ORL Tower Road, FL 32807, 

(407)223-6567. 

Pursuant to the provisions of the Americans with Disabilities 

Act, any person requiring special accommodations to 

participate in this workshop/meeting is asked to advise the 

agency at least seven days before the workshop/meeting by 

contacting: Ms. Kelda Senior at (407)223-6567 or by email at 

mailto:Bernadette.kelley@famu.edu
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1154
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=693
mailto:jforstall@ftri.org
mailto:jforstall@ftri.org
mailto:jforstall@ftri.org
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=757
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=757
http://www.fwcjua.com/
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=991


Florida Administrative Register Volume 42, Number 218, November 8, 2016 

 

4991 

 

construction@CFXway.com. If you are hearing or speech 

impaired, please contact the agency using the Florida Relay 

Service, 1(800)955-8771 (TDD) or 1(800)955-8770 (Voice). 

Section VII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Declaratory Statements 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Florida Building 

Commission has received the petition for declaratory 

statement from Feasterco Construction, Inc. The petition seeks 

the agency’s opinion as to the applicability of Chapter 5, 

Florida Building Code, 5th edition (2014), Building as it 

applies to the petitioner. 

Petitioner seeks clarification as to if an NFPA 13R system in a 

transient lodging facility with interior corridors in compliance 

with the above-referenced chapter is also protected under 

903.3.1.2 NFPA 13R. 

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be 

obtained by contacting: the Agency Clerk’s Office, 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 2601 

Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)921-0342, 

AGC.Filing@myfloridalicense.com. 

Please refer all comments to Mo Madani, Building Codes and 

Standards Office, Department of Business and Professional 

Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399, (850)487-1824, mo.madani@myfloridalicense.com; or 

April L. Hammonds, Office of the General Counsel, 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 2601 

Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, 

april.hammonds@myfloridalicense.com. RESPONSES, 

MOTIONS TO INTERVENE, OR REQUESTS FOR A 

HEARING MUST BE FILED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THIS 

NOTICE. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Florida Building 

Commission has received the petition for declaratory 

statement from GL Homes & the Florida Home Builders 

Association. The petition seeks the agency’s opinion as to the 

applicability of Sections R202 & R302.1, Florida Building 

Code 5th edition (2014), Residential & Section 481.203(7), 

F.S. as they apply to the petitioner. 

Petitioner seeks clarification of whether the definition of 

“townhouse” is contradictory with regard to zero lot line 

provisions & fire separation distance with regard to the above-

referenced sections. 

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be 

obtained by contacting: Agency Clerk’s Office, Department of 

Business and Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)921-0342, 

AGC.Filing@myfloridalicense.com. 

Please refer all comments to Mo Madani, Building Codes and 

Standards Office, Department of Business and Professional 

Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399, (850)487-1824, mo.madani@myfloridalicense.com; or 

April L. Hammonds, Office of the General Counsel, 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 2601 

Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, 

april.hammonds@myfloridalicense.com. RESPONSES, 

MOTIONS TO INTERVENE, OR REQUESTS FOR A 

HEARING MUST BE FILED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THIS 

NOTICE. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Florida Building 

Commission has received a petition for declaratory statement 

from Palmwood Construction, Hernando County, & the 

Florida Home Builders Association. The petition seeks the 

agency’s opinion as to the applicability of Sections 310.6 & 

903.2.8.1, Florida Building Code 5th edition (2014), Building 

& Chapter 419, F.S., as they apply to the petitioner. 

Petitioner seeks clarification as to whether the project at issue 

is classified as a single-family non-commercial unit for 

permitting purposes. 

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be 

obtained by contacting: Agency Clerk’s Office, Department of 

Business and Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)921-0342, 

AGC.Filing@myfloridalicense.com. 

Please refer all comments to Mo Madani, Building Codes and 

Standards Office, Department of Business and Professional 

Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399, (850)487-1824, mo.madani@myfloridalicense.com, or 

April L. Hammonds, Office of the General Counsel, 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 2601 

Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, 

april.hammonds@myfloridalicense.com. RESPONSES, 

mailto:construction@CFXway.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001
mailto:AGC.Filing@myfloridalicense.com
mailto:mo.madani@myfloridalicense.com
mailto:april.hammonds@myfloridalicense.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001
mailto:AGC.Filing@myfloridalicense.com
mailto:mo.madani@myfloridalicense.com
mailto:april.hammonds@myfloridalicense.com
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001
mailto:AGC.Filing@myfloridalicense.com
mailto:mo.madani@myfloridalicense.com
mailto:april.hammonds@myfloridalicense.com


Florida Administrative Register Volume 42, Number 218, November 8, 2016 

 

4992 

MOTIONS TO INTERVENE, OR REQUESTS FOR A 

HEARING MUST BE FILED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THIS 

NOTICE. 

DEPARTMENT OF BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

REGULATION 

Florida Building Commission 

RULE NO.: RULE TITLE: 

61G20-1.001 Florida Building Code Adopted 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Florida Building 

Commission has received a petition for declaratory statement 

from Bliss & Nyitray, Inc. The petition seeks the agency’s 

opinion as to the applicability of Chapters 2 & 16, Florida 

Building Code 5th (2014), Building as it applies to the 

petitioner. 

Petitioner seeks clarification as to the proper live load for an 

upper-level hotel corridor that also serves as exit access to the 

exit stairways. 

A copy of the Petition for Declaratory Statement may be 

obtained by contacting: Agency Clerk’s Office, Department of 

Business and Professional Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)921-0342, 

AGC.Filing@myfloridalicense.com. 

Please refer all comments to Mo Madani, Building Codes and 

Standards Office, Department of Business and Professional 

Regulation, 2601 Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 

32399, (850)487-1824, mo.madani@myfloridalicense.com, or 

April L. Hammonds, Office of the General Counsel, 

Department of Business and Professional Regulation, 2601 

Blair Stone Road, Tallahassee, Florida 32399, (850)487-1824, 

april.hammonds@myfloridalicense.com. RESPONSES, 

MOTIONS TO INTERVENE, OR REQUESTS FOR A 

HEARING MUST BE FILED WITHIN 21 DAYS OF THIS 

NOTICE. 

Section VIII 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding the Validity of Rules 

Notice of Petition for Administrative Determination has been 

filed with the Division of Administrative Hearings on the 

following rules: 

NONE 

Notice of Disposition of Petition for Administrative 

Determination has been filed with the Division of 

Administrative Hearings on the following rules: 

NONE 

Section IX 

Notice of Petitions and Dispositions 

Regarding Non-rule Policy Challenges 

NONE 

Section X 

Announcements and Objection Reports of 

the Joint Administrative Procedures 

Committee 

NONE 

Section XI 

Notices Regarding Bids, Proposals and 

Purchasing 

NONE 

Section XII 

Miscellaneous 

NONE 

Section XIII 

Index to Rules Filed During Preceeding 

Week 

INDEX TO RULES FILED BETWEEN  

OCTOBER 31, 2016 AND NOVEMBER 4, 2016 

 
Rule No.  File Date  Effective  Proposed  Amended 

      Date   Vol./No . Vol./No. 

 

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS 

33-210.201  10/31/2016 11/20/2016 42/135  42/189 

 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Podiatric Medicine 

64B18-24.001 11/3/2016 11/23/2016 42/123  42/183 

 

FISH AND WILDLIFE CONSERVATION 

COMMISSION 

Marine Resources 

68E-1.002  11/3/2016 11/23/2016 42/89 

68E-1.004  11/3/2016 11/23/2016 42/89 

https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/department.asp?id=61
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/organization.asp?id=1071
https://www.flrules.org/gateway/ruleNo.asp?id=61G20-1.001
mailto:AGC.Filing@myfloridalicense.com
mailto:mo.madani@myfloridalicense.com
mailto:april.hammonds@myfloridalicense.com


Florida Administrative Register Volume 42, Number 218, November 8, 2016 

 

4993 

 

68E-1.0041 11/3/2016 11/23/2016 42/89 

68E-1.005  11/3/2016 11/23/2016 42/89 

68E-1.0061 11/3/2016 11/23/2016 42/89 

 

DEPARTMENT OF FINANCIAL SERVICES 

Division of State Fire Marshal 

69A-64.005 11/1/2016 11/21/2016 42/183 

 

Finance 

69V-40.0312 11/4/2016 11/24/2016 42/153 

69V-40.0313 11/4/2016 11/24/2016 42/153 

69V-180.070 11/4/2016 11/24/2016 42/153 

 

LIST OF RULES AWAITING LEGISLATIVE 

APPROVAL PURSUANT TO SECTION 120.541(3), 

FLORIDA STATUTES 

 

DEPARTMENT OF MANAGEMENT SERVICES 

E911 Board 

60FF1-5.009 7/21/2016 **/**/**** 42/105 

 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

Board of Medicine 

64B8-9.009  6/15/2016 **/**/**** 42/89 

64B8-10.003 12/9/2015 **/**/**** 39/95  41/49 

 
NOTE: The above section will be published on Tuesday 

beginning October 2, 2012, unless Monday is a holiday, then it 

will be published on Wednesday of that week.  


